

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
HOUSTON DIVISION**

| | | |
|---|---|------------------------|
| In re: |) | Chapter 11 |
| ZACHRY HOLDINGS, INC., <i>et al.</i> ¹ |) | Case No. 24-90377 (MI) |
| Debtors. |) | (Jointly Administered) |

**COMPLEX CASE FEE APPLICATION COVER SHEET FOR
SUSMAN GODFREY L.L.P.’S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FOR
ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF
EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM MAY 21, 2024 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2024**

| | | |
|--|--|-----------------|
| Name of Applicant: | Susman Godfrey L.L.P. | |
| Applicant’s Role in Case: | Special Litigation Counsel | |
| Docket No. of Employment Order(s): | 442 | |
| Interim Application (X) No. <u>1st</u> Final Application () | Indicate whether this is an interim or final Application. If interim, indicate the number (1 st , 2 nd , 3 rd , etc.) | |
| | Beginning Date | End Date |
| Time period covered by this Application for which interim compensation has not previously been awarded: | 05/21/2024 | 08/31/2024 |
| Were the services provided necessary to the administration of or beneficial at the time rendered toward the completion of the case? (Y) Y/N | | |
| Were the services performed in a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance and nature of the issues addressed? (Y) Y/N | | |
| Is the requested compensation reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in other non-bankruptcy cases? (Y) Y/N | | |
| Do expense reimbursements represent actual and necessary expenses incurred? (Y) Y/N | | |
| Compensation Breakdown for Time Period Covered by this Application | | |
| Total professional fees requested in this Application: | \$951,730.00 | |

¹ The last four digits of Zachry Holdings, Inc.’s tax identification number are 6814. A complete list of each of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers may be obtained on the website of the Debtors’ proposed claims and noticing agent at www.veritaglobal.net/ZHI. The location of the Debtors’ service address in these chapter 11 cases is: P.O. Box 240130, San Antonio, Texas 78224.



| | |
|---|--------------|
| Total professional hours covered by this Application: | 1,059.1 |
| Average hourly rate for professionals: | \$680.56 |
| Total paraprofessional fees requested in this Application: | \$4,480 |
| Total paraprofessional hours covered by this Application: | 11.2 |
| Average hourly rate for paraprofessionals: | \$400 |
| Total fees requested in this Application: | \$956,210.00 |
| Total expense reimbursements requested in this Application: | \$7,649.50 |
| Total fees and expenses requested in this Application: | \$963,859.50 |
| Total fees and expenses awarded in all prior Applications: | \$0 |
| Plan Status: Debtors have not yet filed a chapter 11 plan with the Court. On September 10, 2024, the Debtors filed a motion requesting a 90-day extension of their exclusive period to file and solicit a plan. [ECF 933]. The motion has not yet been heard. | |
| Primary Benefits: Susman Godfrey L.L.P. served as special litigation counsel to Debtors in connection with the adversary proceeding, <i>Zachry Industrial, Inc. v. Golden Pass LNG Terminal LLC</i> , Adv. Pro. No. 24-03105 (MI). Susman Godfrey L.L.P.'s counsel during the application period enabled Debtors to achieve a complete settlement of the adversary proceeding, Golden Pass's Emergency Motion for an Order Compelling Rejection of EPC Contract [ECF 299], and Chiyoda International Corporation's and CB&I LLC's Joint Emergency Motion for an Order Granting Relief from the Automatic Stay [ECF 350]. | |

In accordance with the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals* (“Compensation Procedures Order”) [Docket No. 342], each Notice Party receiving notice of this Application will have until noon (prevailing Central Time) on the 21st day after the filing of this Application, i.e., October 11, 2024, to object to the requested fees and expenses. Upon the expiration of such 21-day period, the Court, in its discretion, may approve an interim fee application without the need for a hearing if no objections are filed.

Susman Godfrey L.L.P. (“Susman Godfrey”), special litigation counsel for the above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (“Debtors”) in these chapter 11 cases, files this first interim fee application (“Application”) for the period from May 21, 2024, to and including August 31, 2024 (the “Interim Period”) requesting (i) interim allowance of a total award of \$963,859.50 for the Interim Period representing (a) compensation for professional services to Debtors in the amount of \$956,210.00 for fees Susman Godfrey has earned for professional services to Debtors during the Interim Period, and (b) reimbursement of the actual and necessary expenses in the amount of \$7,649.50 that Susman Godfrey has incurred during the Interim Period in connection with such services; and (ii) payment of any unpaid amounts of such allowance. A proposed order in the form located on the Court’s website is attached to this Application.

1. In support of this Application, Susman Godfrey submits the following:
 - a. A summary, by timekeeper, and detailed statement of Susman Godfrey’s hours expended and fees earned during the Interim Period, attached as **Exhibit A**.
 - b. A summary, by category, and detailed statement of expenses for which Susman Godfrey requests reimbursement, attached as **Exhibit B**.

2. Susman Godfrey attorneys and paraprofessionals expended, and Susman Godfrey billed, a total of 1,059.1 hours in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Interim Period. Susman Godfrey seeks compensation only for services the firm rendered to or on behalf of Debtors.

Susman Godfrey has not received any payments from any source other than Debtors for services rendered or to be rendered in connection with these chapter 11 cases.

3. Pursuant to the Compensation Procedures Order, any Noticing Party objecting to this Application must do so by noon (prevailing Central time) on the twenty-first day after service. If no objections are timely filed, the Court, in its discretion, may approve this Application without a hearing. When the Court allows Susman Godfrey's Application, Debtors will be authorized to pay promptly Susman Godfrey all requested fees (including the 20% fee holdback) and expenses not paid previously.

4. Although Susman Godfrey has made every effort to include all fees earned and expenses incurred during the Interim Period, some fees and expenses might not be included in this Application due to delays caused by accounting and processing during the Interim Period. Susman Godfrey reserves the right to make further statements to this Court for allowance of such fees and expenses not included in this Application. Susman Godfrey will file any subsequent fee statements in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Bankruptcy Local Rules, and the Compensation Procedures Order.

In sum, Susman Godfrey requests interim allowance and payment of any unpaid portion of (a) compensation for Susman Godfrey's professional services to Debtors during the Interim Period in the amount of \$956,210.00, and (b) reimbursement of 100% of the actual and necessary expenses Susman Godfrey incurred during the Interim Period in connection with such services in the amount of \$7,649.50, for a total award of \$963,859.50 for the Interim Period.

{intentionally blank}

Dated: September 20, 2024

Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Jesse-Justin Cuevas

Geoffrey L. Harrison
S.D. Admissions No. 16690
gharrison@susmangodfrey.com
Richard W. Hess
S.D. Admissions No. 605712
rhess@susmangodfrey.com
Adam Carlis
S.D. Admissions No. 1618804
acarlis@susmangodfrey.com
Hunter Vance
S.D. Admissions No. 3124867
hvance@susmangodfrey.com
SUSMAN GODFREY L.L.P.
1000 Louisiana St., Suite 5100
Houston, Texas 77002
Tel: (713) 651-9366
Fax: (713) 654-6666

Jesse-Justin Cuevas
Admitted Pro Hac Vice
jcuevas@susmangodfrey.com
SUSMAN GODFREY L.L.P.
1900 Avenue of the Stars, Suite 1400
Los Angeles, California 90067
Tel: (310) 789-3100
Fax: (310) 789-3150

Special Litigation Counsel to Debtors

Certificate of Service

I certify that on September 20, 2024, I caused a copy of the foregoing document to be served via the Electronic Case Filing System for the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas.

/s/ Charles R. Koster

Charles R. Koster

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
HOUSTON DIVISION

| | | |
|---|---|----------------------------------|
| |) | |
| In re: |) | Chapter 11 |
| |) | |
| ZACHRY HOLDINGS, INC., <i>et al.</i> ¹ |) | Case No. 24-90377 (MI) |
| |) | |
| Debtors. |) | (Joint Administration Requested) |
| |) | |

**ORDER ALLOWING INTERIM COMPENSATION
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
(Docket No. ____)**

The Court has considered the first Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses filed by Susman Godfrey L.L.P. (the “Applicant”). The Court orders:

1. The Applicant is allowed interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$963,859.50 for the period set forth in the application.

2. The Debtors are authorized to disburse any unpaid amounts allowed by paragraph 1 of this Order.

MARVIN ISGUR
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

¹ The last four digits of Zachry Holdings, Inc.’s tax identification number are 6814. A complete list of each of the Debtors in these chapter 11 cases and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers may be obtained on the website of the Debtors’ proposed claims and noticing agent at <https://www.kccllc.net/zhi>. The location of the Debtors’ service address in these chapter 11 cases is: P.O. Box 240130, San Antonio, Texas 78224.

Exhibit A

Summary of Hours Expended and Fees Earned During Interim Period

| Timekeeper | Hourly Rate | Total Hours Expended | Total Fee Earned |
|--|--------------------|-----------------------------|-------------------------|
| Geoffrey Harrison | \$1,600 | 160.40 | \$256,640.00 |
| Richard Hess | \$850 | 224.9 | \$191,165.00 |
| Adam Carlis | \$850 | 16.20 | \$13,770.00 |
| Hunter Vance | \$850 | 222.1 | \$188,785.00 |
| Jesse-Justin Cuevas | \$800 | 362.9 | \$290,320.00 |
| Anna Coll | \$725 | 3.2 | \$2,320.00 |
| Jeff McClaren (Paralegal) | \$400 | 11.2 | \$4,480.00 |
| Charlie Bernstein (Summer Associate) | \$150 | 36.1 | \$5,415.00 |
| Katie Grace Frisbee (Summer Associate) | \$150 | 3 | \$450.00 |
| Bernard Kessler (Summer Associate) | \$150 | 19.1 | \$2,865.00 |

Total

\$956,210.00

Detailed Statement of Hours Expended and Fees Earned During Interim Period

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 5/21/24 | Coll, Anna | 725 | 0.20 | \$ 145.00 | Speaking with J. Cuevas re bankruptcy discovery issues. |
| 5/21/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 6.60 | \$ 5,280.00 | Reviewing and responding to email from Susman Godfrey trial team re pleadings (0.2). Updating weekly task list (1.0). Preparing discovery requests to serve on Golden Pass LNG Terminal LLC (0.7). Researching pro hac vice application form and procedures (0.7). Reviewing bankruptcy dockets in Zachry Industrial Inc. matter and lead case (0.3). Preparing written chronology and cast of characters (3.6). Monitoring news and media alerts re client, bankruptcy proceedings (0.1). |
| 5/21/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.80 | \$ 4,480.00 | Conferring by email re status and strategy and filing of adversary complaint and reviewing same (0.7). Attending by videoconference (part of) first day hearings in bankruptcy court and reviewing various first day filings (1.7). Conferring by email re potential experts (0.1). Conferring by email re discovery (0.3). |
| 5/21/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 4.50 | \$ 3,825.00 | Reviewing bankruptcy filing (0.2). Reviewing creditor list and entity list (0.6). Conferring by email with trial team re discovery (0.2). Reviewing Judge Isgur procedures (0.2). Conferring by email with J. Cuevas re summons (0.2). Reviewing first day motion list (0.3). Conferring by email with trial team re upcoming hearing (0.2). Reviewing first day motions and attending hearing on first day motions (2.6). |
| 5/21/24 | McLaren, Jeffrey W. | 400 | 0.60 | \$ 240.00 | Reviewing incoming correspondence and pleadings and routing to appropriate case files. |
| 5/21/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 2.50 | \$ 2,125.00 | Reviewing bankruptcy filings (2.5). |
| 5/22/24 | Coll, Anna | 725 | 0.40 | \$ 290.00 | Calling J. Cuevas re Rule 2004 procedures in bankruptcy court. |
| 5/22/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 10.90 | \$ 8,720.00 | Reviewing and responding to email from Susman Godfrey trial team re status conference and related client meeting, claims against non parties, discovery (0.7). Preparing draft discovery to Golden Pass LNG Terminal LLC (4.9). Updating weekly task list (0.6). Reviewing client documents (2.7). Researching Rule 2004 discovery in Southern District of Texas (2.0). |
| 5/22/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.60 | \$ 2,560.00 | Conferring by Zoom with J. Old, J. Thomas, B. Guzina, D. Mancini, A. O'Neill, R. Hess, and H. Vance re debrief, next steps, status and strategy, and potential experts (1.4). Reviewing certain documents. Reviewing file (0.1). Conferring by email re summary of bankruptcy status conference call and re mediation (0.1). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 5/22/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 2.50 | \$ 2,125.00 | Attending meeting of trial team re first day motions, task list and mediation (1.4). Attending status conference (0.6). Confering with H. Vance re same (0.2). Preparing summary and confering by email with trial team re same (0.3). |
| 5/22/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.50 | \$ 2,975.00 | Preparing for call with potential insolvency expert (0.5); Reviewing bankruptcy filings (0.5); Attending hearing on status conference with Judge M. Isgur (1.1); Confering by Zoom with J. Old, G. Harrison, R. Hess and co-counsel re bankruptcy updates and case strategy (1.4). |
| 5/23/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.60 | \$ 510.00 | Confering with K. Malek re expert work. |
| 5/23/24 | Coll, Anna | 725 | 0.20 | \$ 145.00 | Speaking with J. Cuevas re third-party Rule 2004 examinations and notice formats. |
| 5/23/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 8.00 | \$ 6,400.00 | Researching issues re discovery devices in bankruptcy and adversary proceedings (1.4). Reviewing and responding to emails with Susman Godfrey trial team re calls with client and trial team, litigation tasks, potential consulting expert, discovery, and upcoming mediation (0.3). Updating weekly task list (0.5). Preparing draft discovery to Golden Pass LNG Terminal LLC and third-parties ExxonMobil and QatarEnergy (4.5). Reviewing and revising pro hac vice application (0.1). Confering re discovery with H. Vance and co-counsel J. Deis (0.7). Confering re discovery with H. Vance (0.2). Confering with G. Harrison re case status (0.2). Confering with co counsel B. Guzina re discovery in bankruptcy and adversary proceedings (0.1). |
| 5/23/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.40 | \$ 3,840.00 | Confering by Zoom with experts K. Malek, K. Durgan, R. Peterson, and SG team and J. Deis and reviewing K. Malek data request and confering by email re same (1.0). Confering by Zoom with SG team re experts, expert work, and next steps (0.3). Confering by Zoom with M. Meghji, B. Guzina, J. Old, J. Deis, R. Hess, and H. Vance re mediation planning (0.8). Reviewing and revising task list (0.3). |
| 5/23/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 3.50 | \$ 2,975.00 | Reviewing expert report from potential expert (0.5). Attending meeting of J. Old, B. Guzina, M. Meji, J. Deis, G. Harrison and H. Vance (0.8). Preparing for mediation and confering by email with G. Harrison re schedules (0.1). Reviewing news article re adversary petition (0.1). Confering by email with trial team (0.1). Interviewing proposed insolvency expert (0.7) and confering with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.3). Reviewing task list and sample expert report (0.3). Reviewing proposed orders (0.6). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 5/23/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 6.50 | \$ 5,525.00 | Reviewing bankruptcy filings (0.5); Reviewing documents sent by J. Old re mediation strategy (1.0); Preparing notes for mediation strategy (1.0); Conferring by Zoom with J. Cuevas re discovery issues (1.1); Conferring by Zoom with J. Cuevas and J. Deis re document collection (0.6); Conferring by Zoom with G. Harrison, R. Hess, J. Old, and M. Meghji re mediation strategy (0.8); Conferring by Zoom with potential insolvency and construction experts and conferring with Susman Godfrey team re expert work (0.5); Reviewing document request from potential expert, reviewing materials provided by same expert (1.0). |
| 5/24/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 6.10 | \$ 4,880.00 | Preparing draft discovery to Golden Pass LNG Terminal LLC and third parties ExxonMobil and QatarEnergy (5.0) Reviewing and responding to email with Susman Godfrey trial team re mediator, calls with client and trial team (0.3). Conferring by email with J. Lewis re personnel interviews (0.5). Monitoring news and media alerts re client, bankruptcy proceedings (0.2). Reviewing and revising pro hac vice application (0.1). |
| 5/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.20 | \$ 1,920.00 | Conferring by email re status and strategy, mediation, and discovery (0.4). Reviewing certain documents and reviewing various materials (0.8). |
| 5/24/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 2.60 | \$ 2,210.00 | Reviewing email from J. Old and J. Cuevas re mediation and discovery efforts (0.3). Reviewing press coverage and signed orders (0.2). Reviewing mediation order (0.2). Researching points of law re fraudulent transfer cases (1.9). |
| 5/24/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 2.80 | \$ 2,380.00 | Reviewing documents sent by J. Old re mediation strategy (1.2); Reviewing draft discovery requests (1.2); Reviewing materials from insolvency expert re potential expert work (0.4). |
| 5/25/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.10 | \$ 3,360.00 | Preparing for mediation and litigation and reviewing documents re same and conferring by email re same (2.1). |
| 5/26/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.10 | \$ 935.00 | Reviewing bankruptcy filings (0.5). Reviewing power point for mediation (0.6). |
| 5/27/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.20 | \$ 160.00 | Conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team re case tasks. |
| 5/27/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.10 | \$ 3,360.00 | Reviewing and revising draft discovery on GPX, XOM, QE and conferring by email re same (1.7). Conferring by email re draft discovery on other third parties (0.2). Conferring by email re scheduling interviews of various Zachry personnel and reviewing file and certain documents re same (0.2). |
| 5/27/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.10 | \$ 935.00 | Reviewing draft discovery requests in adversary proceeding (1.1). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|--------------|---|
| 5/28/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 15.60 | \$ 12,480.00 | Conferring by email with trial team re discovery and task list (0.5); R. Hess interviews of field personnel (0.3). Updating weekly task list (0.9). Updating written chronology and cast of characters (1.4). Preparing draft Rule 2004 notices to Chiyoda International Corp. and CB&I/McDermott International (0.5). Preparing litigation hold notices to serve on Golden Pass, ExxonMobil, QatarEnergy, Chiyoda International Corp., and CB&I/McDermott International (8.7). Conferring with G. Harrison re mediation (0.2) Conferring with R. Hess re personnel interviews (0.3). Reviewing orders issued in bankruptcy and adversary proceeding dockets (0.5). Preparing for interview of B. Beall and J. McAllister (1.3). Reviewing and revising draft document requests to serve on Golden Pass (0.3). Attending weekly trial team call (0.6). Updating trial team call calendar entries (0.1). |
| 5/28/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.10 | \$ 3,360.00 | Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess and H. Vance re status and strategy (0.4). Conferring by email re mediation preparation and reviewing materials re same, and conferring by Zoom with J. Cuevas re witness interviews and draft discovery (0.8). Reviewing task list and conferring by Zoom with team re status and strategy and reviewing file and certain documents re same (0.9). |
| 5/28/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 5.80 | \$ 4,930.00 | Attending meeting of trial team and conferring with Susman trial team re mediation (1.1). Conferring by email with client re task list and meeting (0.6). Reviewing task list (0.3). Conferring with G. Harrison and H. Vance re schedule (0.4). Reviewing draft discovery requests (0.6). Conferring by email with J. Cuevas re interviews of field personnel (0.3). Revising draft discovery requests (1.5). Conferring with J. Cuevas via Zoom (0.3). Conferring by email with trial team re discovery (0.3). Conferring by email with H. Vance re motive for XOM (0.1). Conferring by email with J. Cuevas re discovery requests (0.1). Reviewing and revising same (0.1). Conferring by email with J. Cuevas re same (0.1). |
| 5/28/24 | McLaren, Jeffrey W. | 400 | 3.30 | \$ 1,320.00 | Downloading document productions (1.8). Conferring with trial team and vendor re document production (0.6). Conferring with database vendor re transfer of files (0.9). |
| 5/28/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 4.00 | \$ 3,400.00 | Conferring by Zoom with trial team for weekly call, preparing for same (1.1); Reviewing draft written discovery requests (0.9); Conferring by Zoom with G. Harrison and R. Hess re mediation strategy (0.2); Reviewing materials provided by potential insolvency expert (0.3); Reviewing mediation background documents (1.5). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 5/29/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 2.20 | \$ 1,870.00 | Conferring with full team re mediation (1.0). Conferring with SG team re mediation and claims (0.4). Revising discovery and conferring with J. Cuevas re same (0.8). |
| 5/29/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 8.60 | \$ 6,880.00 | Preparing for and coordinating personnel interviews (1.4). Compiling Judge Lopez precedent (0.3). Updating weekly task list (0.2). Discussing mediation with G. Harrison, R. Hess, A. Carlis, and H. Vance (0.2). Interviewing B. Beall (1.2). Researching contractual issues re change orders (0.5). Revising litigation hold notices to serve on Golden Pass, ExxonMobil, QatarEnergy, Chiyoda International Corp., and CB&I/McDermott International (1.1) interview and relevant documents and summarizing same for team (2.8). Reviewing and revising draft document requests to serve on Golden Pass and Rule 2004 notices to serve on ExxonMobil, QatarEnergy, Chiyoda International Corp., and CB&I/McDermott International (1.1) |
| 5/29/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 3.70 | \$ 5,920.00 | Conferring by Zoom with SG team re status, strategy, and mediation (0.8). Conferring by Zoom with J. Old, R. Frames, J. Thomas, M. Mohsin, B. Guzina, and M. Andolina and reviewing materials in connection with same (1.2). Reviewing draft discovery papers and conferring by email re same and reviewing comments on lawsuit and discovery (0.6). Conferring by email re mediation preparation and reviewing materials re same (0.7). Reviewing GPX price comparison to other projects and reviewing GPX force majeure events (0.4). |
| 5/29/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 6.30 | \$ 5,355.00 | Conferring with A. Carlis in office and H. Vance via Zoom re mediation strategy (0.1). Reviewing BCG slide decks (0.6). Reviewing email from J. Old (0.2). Conferring in office with A. Carlis re same (0.6). Attending meeting of trial team re mediation goals (0.6). Conferring by email with J. Cuevas re interviews (0.3). Interviewing B. Beall and preparing summary of same (1.7). Reviewing interview summaries (0.4). Interviewing J. McAllister (0.5). Revising litigation hold notices (0.3). Attending mediation strategy meeting (0.8) and revising litigation hold notices and conferring by email with trial team re same (0.2). |
| 5/29/24 | McLaren, Jeffrey W. | 400 | 0.90 | \$ 360.00 | Conferring with trial team and document vendor re document database. |
| 5/29/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 5.00 | \$ 4,250.00 | Conferring by Zoom with J. Old, and B. Guzina re mediation strategy and preparing emails to Susman Godfrey team re same (2.0); Reviewing documents re mediation preparation, preparing notes re mediation statement (1.8). Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess, G. Harrison, J. Cuevas, and A. Carlis re mediation issues and discovery (1.0); Researching re potential construction and insolvency experts (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 5/30/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 6.30 | \$ 5,040.00 | Reviewing and responding to emails from Susman Godfrey trial team re case status (0.7). Reviewing and revising draft discovery to Golden Pass, third parties (0.8). Reviewing and revising draft mediation statement (1.0). Preparing for interview of A.P. Fagan (0.8). Confering with J. Deis re discovery database (0.2). Researching contractual issues re change orders and summarizing same for team (2.5). Confering with J. Lewis re potential claims against third parties (0.3). |
| 5/30/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.70 | \$ 4,320.00 | Reviewing interview summary re B. Beall (0.1). Reviewing and revising draft mediation statement and reviewing file re same, confering by email re same, and reviewing certain documents and preparing for mediation (2.1). Reviewing and confering by email re suggestions on draft discovery (0.3). Confering by email re status and strategy and several matters including in connection with mediation (0.2). |
| 5/30/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 7.80 | \$ 6,630.00 | Reviewing and revising mediation statement (3.8). Reviewing draft mediation statement (1.5). Reviewing BCG slide decks (1.6). Reviewing draft power point for mediation (0.5). Reviewing PPI list (0.4). |
| 5/30/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.90 | \$ 3,315.00 | Reviewing notes on draft complaint from client (0.5); Confering by Zoom with potential expert (0.6); Reviewing draft mediation statement preparing revisions (1.0); Preparing notes re mediation, revising materials (1.5); Researching potential construction experts (0.3). |
| 5/31/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 10.50 | \$ 8,400.00 | Preparing for mediation (7.0). Interviewing A.P. Fagan (1.6). Attending meeting with trial team re mediation (0.6). Reviewing and revising draft discovery (0.8). Reviewing and revising litigation hold notices based on A.P. Fagan interview (0.5). |
| 5/31/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 5.60 | \$ 8,960.00 | Confering by email re mediation and mediation planning, confering by phone with J. Thomas re status and strategy, and reviewing file and certain documents re same, and preparing for mediation (5.2). Reviewing draft mediation slide deck and confering by email revisions and additions to same and confering by Zoom with LMI's P. Radford, J. Thomas, J. Deis, R. Hess, H. Vance, and J. Cuevas re mediation presentation (0.4). |
| 5/31/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 7.80 | \$ 6,630.00 | Preparing for and attending pre mediation preparation session at White & Case (2.4). Preparing for A.P. Fagan interview; Attending same and confering by email with trial team re rescheduling (0.4). Confering with trial team and graphic designer re mediation presentation (0.4). Confering with H. Vance re slide edits (0.3). Reviewing contract change order language (0.7). Attending dinner and strategy meeting with Zachry executives, bankruptcy counsel and litigation counsel (3.6). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 5/31/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 6.70 | \$ 5,695.00 | Reviewing interview summary of B. Beall (0.6); Confering by Zoom with Susman Godfrey team, cocounsel, and J. Old re mediation strategy (0.6); Confering by Zoom with Susman Godfrey and cocounsel re mediation and presentation preparation (2.5); Researching re fraudulent conveyance claim (1.8); Reviewing new bankruptcy filings (1.2). |
| 6/1/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 5.20 | \$ 8,320.00 | Reviewing mediation materials (0.2). Preparing for and attending mediation (3.8). Confering with trial team re same (0.5). Confering by email with trial team re status and strategy (0.2). Reviewing draft bankruptcy filing and confering by email re same (0.5). |
| 6/1/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 2.50 | \$ 2,125.00 | Attending mediation (2.5). |
| 6/1/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 0.70 | \$ 595.00 | Reviewing updates re mediation (0.7). |
| 6/2/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.80 | \$ 1,280.00 | Confering by phone with J. Old re mediation, status and strategy, and next steps (0.2). Confering by email re same (0.1). Confering by email re mediation, potential discovery, and status and strategy (0.3). Reviewing draft discovery (0.1). Reviewing file and certain documents (0.1). |
| 6/2/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 0.20 | \$ 170.00 | Confering with SG trial team re mediation update (0.2). |
| 6/3/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.80 | \$ 680.00 | Reviewing correspondence re case strategy and confering with team during strategy call (0.8). |
| 6/3/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 12.10 | \$ 9,680.00 | Updating weekly task list (2.3). Reviewing and responding to emails (0.2). Attending trial team call re case status and mediation (0.8). Preparing discovery (0.7). Updating written chronology and cast of characters (5.8). Summarizing interview with AP Fagan (1.3). Confering with client re solicitation of employees and confering with SG team re same (1.0). |
| 6/3/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.60 | \$ 2,560.00 | Reviewing Court order setting pretrial conference and confering by email re schedule (0.2). Reviewing draft stipulation and order (0.1). Reviewing draft discovery and confering by email re same (0.5). Confering by Zoom with team re mediation debrief, potential motion practice, next steps, and strategy (0.5). Reviewing documents (0.3). |
| 6/3/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 2.80 | \$ 2,380.00 | Reviewing and revising mediation notes (1.4). Confering by email with trial team re strategy (0.3). Researching factual matters re update from J. Old (1.1). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|--------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/3/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 8.60 | \$ 7,310.00 | Reviewing updates re mediation (0.7). Reviewing bankruptcy filings re adversary petition (0.3). Reviewing contracts re claims against GPX (1.5). Confering by Zoom with J. Old, co-counsel, G. Harrison, R. Hess, and J. Cuevas re mediation updates, litigation strategy, and preparing follow-up emails to SG team re same (0.7). Reviewing emails from J. Old re litigation strategy (1.0). Reviewing summary notes from mediation (0.5). Reviewing potential insolvency expert prior report (1.4). Reviewing emails from J. Old re mediation updates and financials (1.1). Reviewing interview summary of J. McAllister (1.4). |
| 6/4/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.50 | \$ 425.00 | Confering with SG team during weekly call (0.5). |
| 6/4/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 7.90 | \$ 6,320.00 | Updating weekly task list (1.1). Reviewing and responding to emails (0.6). Updating email distribution lists for interested parties, co-counsel, and trial team (0.6). Updating written chronology and cast of characters (4.4). Attending weekly trial team call (0.5). Confering with co-counsel at White & Case re discovery (0.2). Updating draft litigation hold notices (0.5). |
| 6/4/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.60 | \$ 2,560.00 | Confering by email re potential GPX motion to expedite accept/rejection decision (0.5). Confering by email re AP Fagan interview summary (0.2). Confering by email re temporary power (0.1). Reviewing task list and confering by Zoom with team (0.5). Confering by email re experts and reviewing certain documents (0.2). Confering by email re standstill stipulation (0.1). |
| 6/4/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 5.00 | \$ 4,250.00 | Reviewing potential parties in interest report (4.0). Confering by email with trial team and reviewing emails from trial team (1.0). |
| 6/4/24 | McLaren, Jeffrey W. | 400 | 2.20 | \$ 880.00 | Reviewing database pricing sheets and confering with trial team and co-counsel re transfer of database (2.2). |
| 6/4/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 1.00 | \$ 850.00 | Reviewing summary of interview with AP Fagan (0.5). Confering by Zoom with trial team for weekly status call and preparing for same (0.5). |
| 6/5/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 1.30 | \$ 1,105.00 | Confering with H. Vance via email re fraudulent conveyance theory (0.5). Reviewing correspondence re fraudulent conveyance theory (0.3). Researching factual matters re fraudulent conveyance (0.5). |
| 6/5/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 2.90 | \$ 2,320.00 | Reviewing and responding to trial team emails (0.4). Updating written chronology and cast of characters (2.5). |
| 6/5/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.10 | \$ 1,760.00 | Reviewing corrected standstill stipulation and confering by email re same (0.4). Confering by email re potential experts (0.3). Reviewing witness interview summaries (0.2). Reviewing EPC agreement and certain contract rights and parties (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|--------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 6/5/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 4.30 | \$ 3,655.00 | Reviewing potential parties in interest report (4.0). Reviewing and revising draft retention application motion and affidavit (0.3). |
| 6/5/24 | McLaren, Jeffrey W. | 400 | 1.80 | \$ 720.00 | Downloading and organizing case documents for trial team (1.8). |
| 6/6/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 2.10 | \$ 1,680.00 | Reviewing and responding to emails (0.9). Reviewing information re potential consulting expert (0.4). Monitoring news for Zachry and case related press (0.3). Confering with J. Deis re potential consulting expert (0.2). Reviewing documents re damages (0.3). |
| 6/6/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.40 | \$ 640.00 | Confering by email re experts (0.2). Confering by email re damages (0.2). |
| 6/6/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.40 | \$ 1,190.00 | Revising retention motion and affidavit (0.6). Revising potential parties in interest report and reviewing same (0.8). |
| 6/6/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.90 | \$ 3,315.00 | Reviewing research memorandum re assumption of the EPC contract (1.3). Reviewing information re potential construction and financial experts (0.6). Researching re fraudulent transfer claims (2.0). |
| 6/7/24 | Carlisle, Adam | 850 | 0.60 | \$ 510.00 | Confering by Zoom with R. Hess, G. Harrison, H. Vance, and J. Cuevas re Zachry executive strategy call and tasks (0.6). |
| 6/7/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 6.00 | \$ 4,800.00 | Updating written chronology and cast of characters (5.7). Reviewing and responding to emails (0.3). |
| 6/7/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 3.80 | \$ 6,080.00 | Confering by email re potential damages for claims and counterclaims (0.4). Reviewing credentials package from Delta Consulting Group (0.4). Confering by email re J. McAllister deposition summary re CSA and change orders (0.4). Confering by email re scheduling interviews of D. Hurley and J. Charles re project safety and other matters (0.3). Reviewing suggested revisions to draft discovery (0.5). Confering by email re J. Frank (0.3). Confering by phone with executive committee (0.6). Confering by phone with J. Old (0.3). Confering by email re legal research (0.6). |
| 6/7/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.90 | \$ 1,615.00 | Confering with H. Vance, A. Carlisle, J. Cuevas and G. Harrison re executive committee meeting (0.6). Revising retention motion and affidavit (0.2). Revising potential parties in interest report and reviewing same (0.3). Attending Zachry executive committee meeting by phone (0.8). |
| 6/7/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 4.00 | \$ 3,400.00 | Confering by Zoom with R. Hess, G. Harrison, J. Cuevas, and A. Carlisle re Zachry executive strategy call and litigation tasks (0.6). Reviewing materials re potential construction experts (1.1). Reviewing White and Case memoranda re assumption of the EPC contract, reviewing cases re same (2.3). |
| 6/8/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.20 | \$ 320.00 | Confering by email re status and strategy. |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/8/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.10 | \$ 935.00 | Reviewing update on bankruptcy mediation and conferring by email with trial team re same (0.5). Reviewing filings and reports on potential experts (0.3). Reviewing draft discovery requests (0.3). |
| 6/9/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.30 | \$ 480.00 | Conferring by email re mediation and status and strategy (0.3). |
| 6/9/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 1.10 | \$ 935.00 | Reviewing emails re negotiation status, updates, litigation strategy and preparing notes re same (1.1). |
| 6/10/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 9.90 | \$ 7,920.00 | Interviewing Don Hurley (1.0) and Jose Charles (0.7). Discussing with H. Vance memorandum assignment from G. Harrison re Claims Settlement Agreement and fraudulent transfer (0.4). Reviewing and responding to emails from client (0.2). Researching fraudulent transfer claim and preparing memorandum re same (7.6). |
| 6/10/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.40 | \$ 640.00 | Conferring by email with trial team re status and strategy (0.1). Conferring with J. Cuevas re legal research (0.1). Reviewing file (0.1). Reviewing documents re March 2024 presentation slides (0.1). |
| 6/10/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.60 | \$ 1,360.00 | Reviewing bankruptcy filings (0.8). Reviewing documents re potential discovery areas (0.8). |
| 6/10/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.00 | \$ 2,550.00 | Conferring by Zoom with J. Cuevas re claims analysis memorandum (0.5). Reviewing emails from J. Old re case strategy and preparing response to team re same (2.5). |
| 6/11/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.50 | \$ 425.00 | Conferring with trial team during weekly call (0.5). |
| 6/11/24 | Coll, Anna | 725 | 0.50 | \$ 362.50 | Conferring with J. Cuevas re settlement significance with respect to avoidance action. |
| 6/11/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 10.00 | \$ 8,000.00 | Updating weekly task list (0.5). Reviewing and responding to emails (0.5). Researching issues re fraudulent transfer claim and preparing memorandum re same (8.2). Attending weekly trial team call (0.5). Revising litigation hold notices (0.3). |
| 6/11/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.80 | \$ 1,280.00 | Conferring by phone and email re interview summaries re D. Hurley and J. Charles (0.3). Conferring by phone and email re status and strategy, reviewing file and certain documents, and attending weekly trial team call (0.5). |
| 6/11/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 0.80 | \$ 680.00 | Reviewing bankruptcy filings (0.1). Reviewing documents re potential discovery areas (0.2). Attending weekly trial team call (0.5). |
| 6/11/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 2.40 | \$ 2,040.00 | Conferring by Zoom with trial team for weekly status call and preparing for same (0.7). Reviewing summaries of interviews with D. Hurley and J. Charles (0.6). Reviewing materials sent by J. Old re safety issues (0.5). Conferring by Zoom with J. Cuevas re claims analysis memorandum (0.4). Conferring by Zoom with A. Carlis re adversary complaint (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/12/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 1.40 | \$ 1,190.00 | Conferring with creditors committee counsel re claims (0.7). Interviewing potential experts (0.7). |
| 6/12/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 9.10 | \$ 7,280.00 | Attending call with Creditors Committee attorneys (1.2). Researching issues re fraudulent transfer claim and preparing memorandum re same (7.6). Updating weekly task list (0.1). Reviewing and responding to emails (0.2). |
| 6/12/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.20 | \$ 1,920.00 | Conferring with creditors' committee and others and conferring by email re same (0.7). Conferring by email re mediation status (0.3). Conferring by email re litigation status and strategy (0.2). |
| 6/12/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 0.70 | \$ 595.00 | Reviewing bankruptcy filings (0.3). Reviewing documents re potential discovery areas (0.4). |
| 6/12/24 | Kessler, Bernard | 150 | 3.20 | \$ 480.00 | Researching for memorandum (3.2). |
| 6/12/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 4.10 | \$ 3,485.00 | Conferring by Zoom with creditors committee counsel and preparing for same (1.8). Conferring by Zoom with potential expert J. Fuchs and Milburn (0.7). Conferring in office with A. Carlis re case strategy (0.5). Reviewing bankruptcy filings (1.1). |
| 6/13/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.70 | \$ 595.00 | Conferring with team re hearing update and tasks (0.7). |
| 6/13/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 10.70 | \$ 8,560.00 | Reviewing and responding to emails (0.5). Researching issues re fraudulent transfer claim and preparing memorandum re same (1.2). Working on issues re service to QatarEnergy (0.2). Attending litigation strategy call with client and co-counsel (0.8). Conferring with G. Harrison, R. Hess, A. Carlis, and H. Vance re litigation tasks and strategy (0.5). Preparing Rule 2004 notice directed to ExxonMobil Corp. (7.5). |
| 6/13/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.80 | \$ 4,480.00 | Conferring by email re discovery and revised Bankruptcy Rule 2004 request with narrative (0.5). Conferring by email re status and strategy (0.2). Conferring by email re potential experts and researching factual matters re same (0.4). Conferring by Zoom with trial team (0.3). Reviewing draft discovery and potential revisions re same (0.5). Reviewing documents re media attention (0.3). Conferring by email re narrative and reviewing certain documents re same (0.3). Reviewing file and certain documents (0.3). |
| 6/13/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.10 | \$ 935.00 | Attending case update meeting (0.7). Reviewing task list (0.2). Attending trial team meeting (0.2). |
| 6/13/24 | Kessler, Bernard | 150 | 7.10 | \$ 1,065.00 | Researching memorandum (7.1). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/13/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 2.30 | \$ 1,955.00 | Conferring by Zoom with A. Carlis, G. Harrison, J. Cuevas, and R. Hess re discovery issues (0.2). Conferring by Zoom with SG team, J. Old, and counsel re case updates and strategy (0.7). Reviewing White & Case revisions to draft discovery (1.1). Reviewing materials from potential expert J. Fuchs (0.3). |
| 6/14/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.50 | \$ 425.00 | Conferring by Zoom with H. Vance re potential filings re EPC contract (0.5). |
| 6/14/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 10.40 | \$ 8,320.00 | Strategizing with G. Harrison re Rule 2004 notices (0.5). Revising Rule 2004 notice directed to ExxonMobil Corp. (9.2). Researching issues re fraudulent transfer claim and preparing memorandum re same (0.1). Conferring with J. Deis re FERC reports (0.3). Conferring with B. Kessler re memorandum re liability of Golden Pass (0.3). |
| 6/14/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.90 | \$ 4,640.00 | Conferring by Zoom with J. Cuevas re document requests, narrative, document review, and other matters and materials (0.5). Conferring with J. Thomas re status and strategy, HJVA claims, and fraudulent conveyance (0.6). Conferring by Zoom with J. Old, J. Trefzer, K. McDonald, R. Frame, J. Zachry, R. Biediger, T. Mallaise, B. Guzma, M. Andolina, M. Meghji, and BCG's K. Kurtzman re status and strategy and conferring by email re same (0.6). Conferring by email re discovery, document collection, potential depositions, and related matters (0.4). Conferring by phone with R. Hess re same (0.2). Reviewing file and certain documents re SEC investigation (0.3). Reviewing file re certain underlying documents (0.3). |
| 6/14/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 4.40 | \$ 3,740.00 | Reviewing email from trial team and revising letter from SEC (0.5). Reviewing cash collateral order, hearing agenda and limited objection (1.5). Conferring with H. Vance via Zoom re mediation settlement strategy (0.4). Conferring by phone with G. Harrison re discovery strategy (0.2). Reviewing pleadings (1.1). Conferring with trial team re discovery strategy (0.3). Reviewing pleadings (0.3). Conferring by email with trial team re discovery (0.1). |
| 6/14/24 | Kessler, Bernard | 150 | 3.90 | \$ 585.00 | Writing memorandum (3.9). |
| 6/14/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.50 | \$ 2,975.00 | Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess re potential discovery issues (0.7). Reviewing SEC request to Zachry Holdings re Exxon investigation (0.5). Reviewing draft discovery to GPX (0.7). Reviewing emails from G. Harrison re meeting with Zachry Holdings executive team (0.5). Conferring by Zoom with A. Carlis re potential filings re EPC contract (0.5). Reviewing factual matters re adversary complaint (0.6). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|--------------|---|
| 6/15/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 2.50 | \$ 2,000.00 | Revising Rule 2004 notice directed to ExxonMobil Corp. (2.0). Confering with White & Case re Rule 2004 procedures (0.5). |
| 6/15/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.50 | \$ 4,000.00 | Reviewing and revising draft document requests and narrative and conferring by email re same (1.4). Reviewing file and certain documents re same (0.6). Confering by email re draft discovery (0.5). |
| 6/15/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 3.30 | \$ 2,805.00 | Confering by email with J. Cuevas re Rule 2004 discovery meeting (0.1). Attending meeting of trial team and co-counsel re Rule 2004 discovery (0.4). Reviewing and revising draft document requests and conferring by email with SG trial team re same (2.8). |
| 6/16/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.70 | \$ 560.00 | Working on Rule 2004 issues and reviewing and responding to emails re same (0.7). |
| 6/16/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 3.80 | \$ 6,080.00 | Reviewing suggested revisions to discovery and draft narrative and conferring by email re same (1.2). Reviewing draft media statement in connection with potential GPX motion and revising same (0.7). Confering by email re same (0.2). Confering by email re potential claims and project owners (0.4). Reviewing file and certain documents (0.3). Preparing for hearing and conferring by email re same (0.5). Reviewing factual and status information and talking points and revisions (0.5). |
| 6/17/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 1.50 | \$ 1,275.00 | Confering with team re hearing recap (0.5). Preparing correspondence to SG team re disclosures to PR firms (0.2). Researching factual matters re disclosures to PR firms (0.8). |
| 6/17/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 13.60 | \$ 10,880.00 | Reviewing and revising discovery requests to ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, CB&I, and QatarEnergy, and conferring by email with trial team re same (7.3). Reviewing adversary complaint v. Zachry Industrial, Inc. under the WARN Act, and conferring with SG trial team re same (0.2). Preparing exhibits in support of discovery requests to ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, CB&I, and Qatar Energy (0.5). Confering with SG trial team via Zoom (0.6). Attending strategy discussion with trial team (0.9). Reviewing and revising litigation hold notices to Golden Pass, ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, CB&I, and QatarEnergy (3.5). Confering with R. Hess re discovery (0.4). Reviewing and responding to trial team emails re case status (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/17/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 5.20 | \$ 8,320.00 | Attending hearing on various bankruptcy matters and conferring by email re same (1.8). Conferring with J. Thomas re same (0.2). Conferring by Zoom with SG team re debrief, discovery, and next steps (0.5). Conferring by Zoom with executive team re hearing and next steps (0.5). Reviewing discovery and litigation hold letters and revising same (0.5). Conferring by email and by Zoom with SG team re same (0.5). Conferring by email re various privilege and confidentiality considerations (0.5). Reviewing file (0.2). Conferring by phone with J. Trefzer re narrative, PR, and related matters (0.5). |
| 6/17/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 3.90 | \$ 3,315.00 | Attending Executive Committee meeting (0.9). Conferring with J. Cuevas re discovery (0.4). Researching points of law re privilege and conferring by email with trial team re same (0.8). Reviewing briefs in Southern District of Texas re same (0.4). Conferring by email with SG trial team and attending bankruptcy court hearing (0.3). Conferring with SG trial team via Zoom (1.0). Reviewing WARN Act complaint and hearing minutes (0.1). |
| 6/17/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.50 | \$ 2,975.00 | Reviewing research re privileged communications and conferring with A. Carlis re same (0.3). Attending SG team meeting re discovery strategy (0.4). Conferring in office with G. Harrison re status conference and follow-up tasks (0.4). Reviewing EPC and HJVA agreements and preparing notes re same (1.5). Reviewing draft discovery requests for service (0.9). |
| 6/18/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.50 | \$ 425.00 | Conferring with trial team during weekly call (0.5). |
| 6/18/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 9.90 | \$ 7,920.00 | Reviewing and revising litigation hold notices to Golden Pass, ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, CB&I, and QatarEnergy, and corresponding with counsel for and re same (0.9). Conferring by email with client re discovery (0.2). Strategizing re discovery (1.5). Reviewing and revising discovery requests to ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, CB&I, and QatarEnergy, and conferring by email with trial team re same (3.9). Updating weekly task list (0.6). Corresponding with counsel for ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, CB&I, and QatarEnergy re Rule 2004 meet and confer (0.3). Attending weekly trial team call (0.5). Corresponding with M. Andolina re discovery (0.3). Preparing pro hac vice application for main chapter 11 proceeding and conferring with J. Belvin re same (0.2). Reviewing Golden Pass's emergency motion to compel rejection of the EPC Contract (1.0). Reviewing Golden Pass's motion to modify the automatic stay re letter of credit (0.3). Conferring by phone with J. Deis re discovery (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/18/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 5.10 | \$ 8,160.00 | Conferring by email re scaffolds (0.4). Conferring by email re discovery and next steps (0.5). Reviewing revised discovery and litigation hold letters and revising same (0.5). Conferring by email with team re same (0.4). Reviewing task list and conferring by Zoom with team (0.5). Conferring by Zoom with executive steering committee re status and strategy (0.4). Conferring by email re meet and confers re Rule 2004 requests (0.8). Reviewing GPX's emergency motions and conferring by email re same (0.5). Reviewing file and certain documents re discovery (0.6). Conferring by email re various discovery and status and strategy matters (0.5). |
| 6/18/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 4.00 | \$ 3,400.00 | Attending trial team meeting (0.1). Reviewing task list with team and preparing same (0.5). Conferring with H. Vance re joint and several liability issues (0.4). Reviewing email to opposing counsel (0.2). Conferring by email with trial team re meet and confer schedule and deposition document topics (0.2). Reviewing final version of hold notices and conferring by email with J. Cuevas re same (0.2). Reviewing final versions of Rule 2004 notices and conferring by email with J. Cuevas re same (0.3). Reviewing motion to compel rejection (2.1). |
| 6/18/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 4.50 | \$ 3,825.00 | Reviewing GPX motions to compel rejection and draw letters of credit, preparing notes re same (3.1). Conferring by Zoom with trial team re task list (0.7). Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess re case strategy and likely defenses (0.3). Reviewing materials provided by potential construction expert (0.4). |
| 6/19/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.90 | \$ 765.00 | Conferring with potential expert B. Pulliam (0.4). Conferring with SG team re pending tasks (0.5). |
| 6/19/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 5.00 | \$ 4,000.00 | Conferring by email with counsel for ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, CB&I, and QatarEnergy re Rule 2004 meet and confer, and coordinating the same (0.7). Reviewing emails from client and trial team re contested matter (0.4). Conferring by email with A. Carlis and potential consulting expert B. Pulliam re conflicts (0.5). Revising weekly task list (0.3). Conferring by email with J. Thomas re potential consulting expert (0.1). Researching issues re bankruptcy jurisdiction and discovery (0.7). Conferring by email with M. Andolina and B. Guzina re discovery (0.3). Preparing discovery to Golden Pass (0.3). Conferring by email with client, trial team re discovery (0.2). Reviewing Exxon's public statements re LNG, the Golden Pass project (0.3). Attending Zoom call with SG trial team (0.8). Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess, H. Vance, and A. Carlis re contested matter (0.4). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/19/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 5.20 | \$ 8,320.00 | Reviewing GPX's emergency motions and conferring by email re same, reviewing file and certain documents re same and conferring with H. Vance re same (1.3). Researching factual matters re GPX's emergency motion (0.7). Conferring by email with J. Old and others re meet and confers re Rule 2004 requests and status of requests and reviewing various draft Rule 2004 requests (0.4). Conferring by email with counsel for other parties re meet and confers re Rule 2004 requests (0.1). Conferring by Zoom with executive steering committee re GPX's emergency motions and then continuing the discussion with counsel only re next steps (1.5). Preparing for above-referenced conference (0.4). Conferring by Zoom and by email with SG team re same (0.8). |
| 6/19/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 5.40 | \$ 4,590.00 | Reviewing co-counsel comments to motion to reject (0.3). Reviewing emails to GPX and JV counsel re discovery (0.2). Conferring by email with trial team re same (0.2). Reviewing photos of site (0.1). Conferring by Zoom with H. Vance, A. Carlis and J. Cuevas re motion to reject (0.4). Reviewing motion for relief from stay (0.9). Reviewing correspondence with JV counsel re Zachry future role (0.4). Researching factual matters re media reports of bankruptcy filings (0.6). Researching points of law re cases cited in motion to reject (0.5). Attending meeting with G. Harrison, J. Cuevas, H. Vance and A. Carlis re motion to reject (0.8). Conferring by email with SG trial team re mediation update (0.3). Conferring with SG trial team re discovery meet and confer (0.2). Reviewing summary of points in response to motion to reject (0.5). |
| 6/19/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 6.90 | \$ 5,865.00 | Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess, G. Harrison, A. Carlis, and J. Cuevas re GPX motions to compel and to modify stay re discovery (0.8). Researching GPX motion to compel issues (0.3). Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess, A. Carlis, and J. Cuevas re GPX motion to compel and response issues (0.4). Reviewing GPX motions to compel rejection and draw letters of credit, preparing notes re same, and reviewing research re same (2.8). Reviewing emails from J. Old re adversary complaint claims (0.8). Conferring by Zoom with G. Harrison re case strategy and motion to compel filing, preparing follow-up notes to team re same and re issues to evaluate for motion opposition (1.4). Conferring by phone with B. Guzina re GPX motion to compel and preparing summary email re same (0.4). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/20/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 10.50 | \$ 8,400.00 | <p>Conferring by email with trial team re discovery (0.1). Conferring by email with counsel for CB&I re Rule 2004 meet and confer (0.1). Conferring by email with M. Andolina, C. Koster, SG trial team re discovery (0.5).</p> <p>Conferring by email with B. Guzina and SG trial team re letter of credit (0.1). Conferring by email with J. Trefzer re discovery (1.8). Conferring with M. Andolina, G. Harrison, R. Hess, and H. Vance re discovery (0.4). Conferring with G. Harrison re Rule 2004 meet and confers (0.2).</p> <p>Conferring with client, B. Guzina, M. Andolina, J. Thomas, G. Harrison, R. Hess, H. Vance, and M. Meghji re discovery (0.4). Conferring with C. Miller re Rule 2004 meet and confers (0.2). Preparing for Rule 2004 meet and confers (0.4). Meeting and conferring with counsel for QatarEnergy (0.1). Meeting and conferring with counsel for CB&I (0.4). Meeting and conferring with counsel for ExxonMobil (0.1). Meeting and conferring with counsel for Chiyoda (0.4). Preparing subpoenas to third parties (0.4).</p> <p>Revising discovery requests to QatarEnergy, ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, and CB&I (3.3). Researching discovery service and conferring with SG trial team re same (1.5). Updating weekly task list (0.1).</p> |
| 6/20/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 4.80 | \$ 7,680.00 | <p>Conferring by email re prior TRO papers and reviewing same (0.3).</p> <p>Conferring by email re meet and confers re Rule 2004 requests and participating in multiple meet and confers with co-counsel and counsel for other entities (0.4). Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess, J. Cuevas, and H. Vance re preparing for meet and confers with certain partners (0.5).</p> <p>Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess, J. Cuevas, and H. Vance re debrief from their meet and confer with Quinn Emmanuel's counsel and discussion of next steps (0.3). Preparing for meet and confer with CB&I, ExxonMobil, and Chiyoda (0.2). Conferring by Zoom re preparing for meet and confer (0.1). Conferring by email and by Zoom with SG team after meet and confers, and conferring by Zoom with M. Andolina and SG team re same (1.0). Conferring with R. Hess re discovery and meet and confers (0.2).</p> <p>Conferring by Zoom with client steering committee, B. Guzina, M. Andolina, R. Hess, H. Vance, and J. Cuevas re meet and confers and next steps (0.3). Reviewing and revising Rule 2004 requests to ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, and QatarEnergy, and reviewing file and conferring by email re same (1.4). Reviewing task list and conferring by email re same (0.1).</p> |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/20/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 6.20 | \$ 5,270.00 | <p>Preparing for and attending meet and confer with CB&I counsel (0.5). Preparing for and attending meet and confer with Chiyoda counsel (0.4). Preparing for and attending meet and confer with Exxon counsel (0.2). Reviewing and preparing draft of response to email from J. Cuevas re meet and confer with QatarEnergy (0.2). Attending client executive committee meeting (0.3). Reviewing draft filings re Rule 2004 requests (0.5). Reviewing email from G. Harrison re request for draft document (0.2). Conferring in office with G. Harrison re discovery meet and confer (0.2). Conferring with G. Harrison, H. Vance, J. Cuevas and M. Andolina re Chiyoda discovery (0.2). Reviewing media reports of bankruptcy filings (0.2). Preparing for QatarEnergy meet and confer (0.2). Attending QatarEnergy counsel meet and confer (0.1). Conferring with G. Harrison, H. Vance, and J. Cuevas via Zoom re same (0.4). Researching factual matters re QatarEnergy discovery (0.1). Conferring with SG trial team re meet and confer conference with JV partners, Exxon and QatarEnergy (0.5). Reviewing time records and conforming to decimal hour per task and conferring with trial team re same (2.0).</p> |
| 6/20/24 | Kessler, Bernard | 150 | 4.00 | \$ 600.00 | <p>Writing memorandum (4.0).</p> |
| 6/20/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 5.90 | \$ 5,015.00 | <p>Attending meet and confer with Chiyoda counsel re Rule 2004 discovery and conferring with SG team re same (0.7). Attending steering committee meeting and reviewing emails from J. Old re same (0.5). Attending meet and confer with Exxon counsel re Rule 2004 discovery and conference with SG team re same (0.3). Attending meet and confer with CB&I counsel re Rule 2004 discovery and conferring with SG team re same (0.5). Attending meet and confer with QE counsel re Rule 2004 discovery and conferring with SG team re same (0.4) Conferring by Zoom with SG trial team re discovery meet and confers (0.5). Reviewing revisions to draft discovery requests (0.6). Reviewing White & Case research memoranda re GPX motion to compel (0.3). Researching factual matters for adversary complaint and re 2004 discovery issues (2.0).</p> |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 6/21/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 6.60 | \$ 5,280.00 | <p>Researching pleading deadlines and conferring by email with SG trial team re same (0.2). Reviewing and responding to emails with SG trial team re discovery and contested matter (0.6). Reviewing news media re Golden Pass, Zachry, Exxon, and QatarEnergy (0.3). Reviewing M. Andolina and C. Koster's discovery comments and conferring with team re same (1.0). Reviewing and revising discovery to ExxonMobil, QatarEnergy, CB&I, and Chiyoda and conferring by email with trial team re same (1.5). Conferring with M. Andolina re discovery (0.2). Conferring with R. Hess re discovery (0.3). Corresponding with counsel for CB&I re service of discovery (0.1). Corresponding with counsel for Chiyoda re discovery and discovery deadlines (0.2). Updating weekly task list (0.4). Conferring by email with J. Trefzner and trial team re discovery (0.2). Conferring by email with J. Belvin re discovery (1.0). Conferring by email with C. Oxley re contact groups (0.2). Conferring by email with counsel for CB&I, QatarEnergy, Chiyoda, and Exxon re discovery and service of discovery (0.4).</p> |
| 6/21/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 4.30 | \$ 6,880.00 | <p>Reviewing near final and final versions of Rule 2004 requests to be filed and served on CB&I and ExxonMobil, Chiyoda, and QatarEnergy (0.3). Conferring by email re revisions to same and re multiple related matters including re service and filing and conferring by phone with J. Cuevas re same (1.0). Conferring by Zoom with team re GPX's motion, GPX's misstatements and misrepresentations of fact, the factual and evidentiary record and related matters (2.2). Reviewing analysis of GPX's misstatements and misrepresentations of fact and conferring by email re same (0.3). Reviewing Zachry/XOM ESA contract amendment six, and conferring by email re same (0.1). Reviewing documents re various matters raised in GPX's motion and conferring by email re same (0.3). Reviewing Chiyoda's updated statement and conferring by email re same (0.1).</p> |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/21/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 5.30 | \$ 4,505.00 | Reviewing chart of alleged health and safety deficiencies and responses and media coverage of GPX motion to reject (1.6). Reviewing email from H. Vance re preparation for hearing and chart of alleged health and safety deficiencies and responses (0.6). Reviewing email reports from J. Old re compliance with FERC inspections (0.3). Reviewing final as filed versions of Rule 2004 motions, Rule 2004 request to Zachry and conferring by email with trial team re same (0.5). Conferring by voicemail with J. Cuevas and conferring by phone with same re exhibits to Rule 2004 motion (0.2). Conferring with J. Cuevas via Zoom re Rule 2004 discovery (0.5). Revising discovery (0.4). Conferring by email with trial team (0.4). Reviewing Judge Isgur procedures re electronic appearances (0.2). Conferring by email with SG trial team re Rule 2004 requests (0.4). Reviewing updated chart of health and safety deficiency responses (0.2). |
| 6/21/24 | Kessler, Bernard | 150 | 0.90 | \$ 135.00 | Writing memorandum (0.9). |
| 6/21/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 6.70 | \$ 5,695.00 | Reviewing revisions to draft 2004 discovery requests (0.8). Researching factual matters for adversary complaint and preparing email to SG R. Hess re same (1.1). Attending meeting with co-counsel, J. Old, R. Biediger and R. Frames re GPX motion to compel response and preparing emails to SG team re same (2.6). Reviewing factual matters for GPX motion to compel (0.5). Researching re potential claims and defenses in adversary case (1.7). |
| 6/22/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.50 | \$ 400.00 | Conferring with SG trial team re client call and case status (0.2). Updating weekly task list (0.3). |
| 6/22/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.20 | \$ 1,920.00 | Conferring by Zoom with J. Old, M. Andolina, J. Thomas, R. Hess, and B. Guzina re bankruptcy and litigation strategy (0.7). Conferring by email and reviewing documents re GPX's motion (0.4). Conferring by email re potential experts (0.1). |
| 6/22/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.10 | \$ 935.00 | Reviewing ECF filings and email from H. Vance re discovery response deadlines (0.2). Conferring with J. Old, M. Andolina, J. Thomas and B. Guzina re bankruptcy and litigation strategy (0.7). Preparing summary to team re same (0.2). |
| 6/22/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 0.70 | \$ 595.00 | Reviewing factual matters for GPX motion to compel (0.7). |
| 6/23/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.70 | \$ 560.00 | Conferring by email with SG trial team re contested matter (0.1). Reviewing correspondence from White & Case trial team re contested matter and discovery (0.1). Updating weekly task list (0.4). Conferring by email with G. Harrison re tasks (0.1). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 6/23/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.80 | \$ 4,480.00 | Reviewing draft preliminary response to GPX's motion, conferring by email re same, and reviewing file re same (1.8). Reviewing draft AP Fagan declaration re response to GPX's motion and conferring by email re same (0.2). Reviewing draft discovery re GPX's motion and conferring by email re same and re categories of discovery (0.7). Conferring by email re site visit (0.1). |
| 6/23/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 5.40 | \$ 4,590.00 | Revising and incorporating G. Harrison's edits to response to emergency motion and conferring by email with trial team and client re same (0.4). Revising response to emergency motion and conferring by email with trial team re same (1.8). Reviewing response to emergency motion (0.4). Revising response to emergency motion (0.4). Conferring by email with trial team re site visit (0.2). |
| 6/23/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 0.80 | \$ 680.00 | Reviewing draft preliminary response to GPX motion to compel and conferring by email with SG team re same (0.8). |
| 6/24/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 9.90 | \$ 7,920.00 | Conferring by email with SG trial team re motion to redact and restrict public access (0.5), case tasks (0.1), and Golden Pass emergency motion to compel (0.1). Conferring with A. Carlis re tasks (0.1). Conferring with H. Vance re stipulated services orders (0.1). Conferring with client, SG trial team, J. Thomas, B. Guzina, M. Andolina, E. Rosenberg, C. Koster re motion to redact and restrict public access (0.9). Conferring with H. Danielson re motion to redact and restrict public access (0.5). Conferring with counsel for QatarEnergy, ExxonMobil, CB&I, Chiyoda re Rule 2004 notices (0.5). Conferring with client re motion to redact and restrict public access (0.2). Conferring with E. Rosenberg re same (0.2). Conferring with J. Belvin re same (0.1). Conferring with ECF Help Desk re filing of unredacted documents (0.3). Drafting motion to redact and restrict public access and proposed order (1.9). Researching procedure re motion to redact and restrict public access (1.0). Preparing discovery re Golden Pass emergency motion (2.1). Serving motion to redact and restrict public access (0.2). Updating weekly task list (0.6). Updating written chronology (0.3). Reviewing case related news (0.2). |
| 6/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.20 | \$ 3,520.00 | Conferring by email re preliminary response to GPX motion and reviewing revisions and conferring by email re related proposed discovery schedule (0.8). Reviewing and revising motion to substitute redacted exhibits and conferring by email re same (0.2). Conferring by Zoom with J. Thomas and potential expert and researching factual matters re experts (0.5). Conferring by email re various discovery matters (0.7). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/24/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 6.50 | \$ 5,525.00 | Reviewing and revising draft and subsequent revisions to response to emergency motion (0.5). Conferring with B. Guzina, M. Andolina, C. Koster, H. Vance and S. Barrick re discovery scheduling (0.5). Conferring by email with client re site visit (0.1). Reviewing time entries (0.1). Reviewing media report re LNG pause (0.3). Reviewing edits to draft response and corresponding by email with trial team re same (0.3). Conferring with H. Vance re response (0.5). Reviewing revised version of preliminary response and emails re same (1.0). Preparing for site visit (1.2). Conferring by email with trial team re expert interview (0.1). Conferring by email with trial team re motion to reject discovery (0.3). Conferring by phone with J. Deis re same (0.1). Conferring by email with SG trial team re potential schedule (0.3). Conferring by voicemail with J. Deis re same (0.1). Reviewing edits to draft response (0.9). Reviewing W&C redline and revised version of preliminary response to motion to reject (0.1). Reviewing client edits to same (0.1). |
| 6/24/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.60 | \$ 3,060.00 | Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess and B. Guzina re response to GPX motion to compel and preparing emails to SG team re same (1.0). Reviewing draft AP Fagan declaration (0.4). Reviewing draft preliminary response to GPX motion to compel and conferring by email with SG team and by Zoom with R. Hess re same (1.9). Preparing revisions to task list (0.3). |
| 6/25/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.30 | \$ 255.00 | Conferring with R. Hess re case strategy (0.3). |
| 6/25/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 2.80 | \$ 2,240.00 | Conferring by email with SG trial team re preliminary response to Golden Pass emergency motion and discovery re same (0.3) and Rule 2004 notice to debtors (0.1). Conferring with counsel for Chiyoda (0.1) and CB&I (0.1) re Rule 2004 notices. Conferring with trial team and client re case status and team call (0.1). Conferring with E. Rosenberg re Rule 2004 notice to debtor (0.1). Preparing discovery re Golden Pass emergency motion (1.8). Updating weekly task list (0.2). |
| 6/25/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.90 | \$ 1,440.00 | Reviewing task list (0.1). Reviewing various filings in advance of court status conference and conferring by email re same (0.8). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|--------------|--|
| 6/25/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 12.70 | \$ 10,795.00 | Reviewing and revising response to motion to compel (1.3). Reviewing and responding to emails re response (0.3). Confering by email with H. Vance re site visit (0.1). Reviewing affidavit (0.1). Traveling to Golden Pass LNG facility for site visit, preparing for same, and touring site (7.1). Reviewing draft discovery requests and confering with H. Vance re same (0.9). Reviewing motion to lift stay from JV partners (1.2). Reviewing revised AP Fagan declaration (0.2) and reviewing email from B. Guzina re edits (0.2). Confering email by with trial team re same (0.1). Preparing for site visit (0.3) and confering in office with A. Carlis re discovery and motion response (0.4). Preparing for site visit (0.5). |
| 6/25/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 10.70 | \$ 9,095.00 | Attending Golden Pass site visit, traveling from and to Houston for same, and confering with R. Hess re same (7.5). Reviewing Chiyoda and McDermott motion for relief from stay (1.1). Preparing for status conference (1.0). Preparing revisions to draft Zachry preliminary objection to GPX motion to compel and confering with R. Hess re same (0.6). Reviewing draft discovery re GPX motion to compel (0.5). |
| 6/26/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.40 | \$ 340.00 | Confering with team re hearing and next steps (0.4). |
| 6/26/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 7.90 | \$ 6,320.00 | Revising discovery to Golden Pass and confering with trial team re same (0.3). Attending status conference re Golden Pass emergency motion (2.0). Confering with E. Rosenberg re discovery (0.3). Confering with SG trial team re status conference, Golden Pass emergency motion, and discovery (0.8). Confering with trial team re status conference, Golden Pass emergency motion, and discovery (2.6). Confering with R. Hess re status conference and discovery (0.1). Confering with client re discovery (0.2). Confering by email with R. Hess re discovery (0.2). Confering with trial team re discovery (0.7). Confering with SG trial team re case-related media (0.1). Confering with J. Trefzer re case-related media (0.1). Preparing discovery re contested matters (0.5). |
| 6/26/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.10 | \$ 3,360.00 | Attending part of the status conference (0.5). Confering by email re status conference, discovery related to GPX's motions, discussions with co-counsel and other parties' counsel re same, and reviewing drafts of discovery re documents and depositions (0.8). Confering by Zoom with SG team re debrief on today's status conference and subsequent events, discovery, next steps, and confering by email re internal updates and communications during the hearing and during the day as matters developed (0.6). Reviewing revised motion to redact and related correspondence and confering by email re same (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 6/26/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 9.70 | \$ 8,245.00 | Preparing for and attending hearing on motion to reject and lift stay (2.5). Conferring by email with J. Cuevas re documents for depositions (0.1). Conferring by email with J. Cuevas, H. Vance and J. Deis re discovery (0.1). Conferring by email with J. Cuevas, H. Vance and J. Deis re email addresses for service (0.2). Preparing for deposition of McDermott witnesses and conferring with SG and Hicks Thomas trial team re same (2.3). Conferring with SG team re hearing update (0.6). Conferring in office with H. Vance re discovery (0.4). Conferring by phone with H. Vance re discovery (0.2). Conferring by email with trial team re emergency hearing and preparing for discovery in advance of potential hearing (1.2). Conferring in office with J. Cuevas, H. Vance, J. Deis, AP Fagan, B. Guzina, and M. Andolina re emergency hearing and discovery re same (2.1). |
| 6/26/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 10.70 | \$ 9,095.00 | Conferring by Zoom with SG team re hearing update and follow-up tasks (0.5). Conferring by Zoom with J. Deis, J. Thomas and R. Hess re Chiyoda, GPX and McDermott deposition preparation (0.8). Preparing for McDermott and Chiyoda depositions for evidentiary hearing (3.2). Attending hearing on status conference, preparing for same and conferring with SG, Hicks Thomas, and White & Case trial teams re same (5.1). Conferring by Zoom with SG, Hicks Thomas, and White & Case re Court proposal, case strategy, and discovery (1.1). |
| 6/27/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.80 | \$ 680.00 | Conferring with R. Hess re discovery (0.3). Conferring with SG trial team re hearing strategy (0.5). |
| 6/27/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 8.90 | \$ 7,120.00 | Conferring with SG trial team re emergency hearing strategy (0.2) and bankruptcy status conference (0.1). Conferring by email with client re discovery (0.4). Conferring with trial team re discovery (0.2). Updating written chronology (1.0). Attending continued status conference (0.4). Updating task list (0.2). Preparing discovery re Golden Pass emergency motion and CB&I and Chiyoda motion for relief from stay (4.5). Reviewing and revising draft protective order and conferring with SG trial team, C. Miller, and M. Andolina re same (1.9). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/27/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.50 | \$ 2,400.00 | Conferring with J. Thomas re yesterday's status conference and subsequent events including document and deposition discovery related to GPX's motions, and discussions with co-counsel and other parties' counsel (0.2). Conferring with J. Old re yesterday's status conference, status update, and next steps (0.2). Conferring by Zoom for part of call with SG team re status, document and deposition discovery, schedule, and discussions among the parties and counsel (0.5). Reviewing GPX demonstrative from yesterday's status conference and conferring by email re same (0.1). Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess re discovery (0.3). Reviewing revisions to draft protective order (0.2). |
| 6/27/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 8.40 | \$ 7,140.00 | Preparing for and attending status conference (2.1). Conferring with W&C, Hicks Thomas and SG trial teams re same (1.4). Reviewing email from Chiyoda counsel re discovery (0.1). Reviewing documents for potential depositions (0.8). Reviewing settlement proposal and response (0.1). Reviewing documents for potential depositions (2.0). Conferring via Zoom with G. Harrison re discovery (0.3). Conferring by email with Hicks Thomas and SG trial teams re discovery (0.2). Conferring by phone with H. Vance re emergency hearing strategy (0.5). Conferring in office with H. Vance re update on emergency hearing and conferring by email with trial team re same (0.2). Conferring with SG trial team (H. Vance and J. McLaren attended in part by A. Carlis, G. Harrison and J. Cuevas) via Zoom re emergency hearing strategy (0.7). |
| 6/27/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 6.80 | \$ 5,780.00 | Conferring with R. Hess re status conference and hearing preparation (0.4). Attending hearing on status conference, conferring with SG, Hicks Thomas and White & Case trial team re same (2.3). Conferring with trial team via email re settlement proposal (0.4). Conferring by Zoom with SG trial team re preparation for hearing (0.7). Preparing for Chiyoda depositions (3.0). |
| 6/28/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 5.60 | \$ 4,480.00 | Conferring with SG trial team and J. Deis re discovery (0.3). Conferring with R. Hess and H. Vance re discovery (0.2). Conferring with client re discovery (0.1). Conferring with trial team and client re discovery (0.5). Preparing discovery to CB&I and Chiyoda (1.4). Updating task list and conferring with trial team re same (0.6). Preparing discovery to Golden Pass (1.4). Conferring by email with R. Hess re discovery (0.4). Conferring with R. Shuba, C. Miller re Rule 2004 notices (0.5). Researching issues re motion to compel rejection of executory contract (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 6/28/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.10 | \$ 3,360.00 | Conferring by Zoom with J. Old, J. Thomas, J. Deis, B. Guzina, M. Andolina, R. Hess, and H. Vance re status and strategy, negotiations, and next steps (0.8). Conferring by Zoom with SG team and J. Deis re pending motions and related discovery and strategy and next steps (0.3). Conferring by email re various factual matters re vendors, equipment, and valuations (0.2). Reviewing and revising revisions to discovery re GPX and CBI/Chiyoda motions and conferring by email re same (0.7). Conferring by email re potential deponents (0.1). |
| 6/28/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 7.50 | \$ 6,375.00 | Reviewing memorandum from W&C and email from Hicks Thomas re discovery for motion to reject (2.3). Conferring with G. Harrison, J. Deis, H. Vance, J. Cuevas, and A. Carlis via Zoom re motion related discovery (0.3). Conferring with H. Vance and J. Cuevas via Zoom re motion related discovery (0.2). Conferring with J. Old, J. Thomas, J. Deis, B. Guzina, M. Andolina, G. Harrison, and H. Vance re strategy, negotiations, next steps and discovery (0.8). Conferring by email with J. Cuevas re discovery (0.1) and reviewing draft discovery to CB&I (0.4). Reviewing documents re April letter of intent and negotiations surrounding same (0.4). Reviewing documents re discovery for motion to reject (0.2). Reviewing documents re Freeport explosion lawsuit (0.2). Reviewing documents re health and safety inspections (0.2). Conferring by email with SG trial team re extension requests (0.3). Reviewing draft discovery (1.2). Reviewing and responding to client requests (0.2). Conferring by email with QatarEnergy counsel re extension (0.1). Conferring by email with W&C attorneys re extension and mediator request (0.4). Conferring by Zoom with H. Vance re email to Vinson & Elkins (0.1) and conferring by email with J. Cuevas re same (0.1). |
| 6/28/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.70 | \$ 3,145.00 | Reviewing draft discovery to GPX, Chiyoda, and McDermott (0.7). Conferring with J. Old and G. Harrison via re email settlement proposals (0.2). Conferring by video conference with R. Hess and J. Cuevas re discovery drafting (0.2). Conferring by video conference with J. Cuevas, R. Hess, G. Harrison and A. Carlis re motion-related discovery and 2004 discovery (0.3). Conferring by videoconference with R. Hess, G. Harrison, A. Carlis, White & Case and Hicks Thomas trial teams and J. Old re discovery strategy, settlement discussions and August hearing (0.8). Reviewing research re issues for motion to compel rejection and preparing emails to SG trial team re same (1.5). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 6/29/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.60 | \$ 2,560.00 | Conferring with Zachry executive team and counsel re settlement, next steps, and status and strategy (1.2). Conferring by email re research (0.1). Reviewing draft discovery and conferring by email re timing of W&C revisions to same (0.3). |
| 6/29/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 0.30 | \$ 255.00 | Reviewing revisions to draft discovery to GPX, Chiyoda, and McDermott (0.3). |
| 6/30/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 2.00 | \$ 1,600.00 | Reviewing trial team correspondence re Golden Pass motion re letter of credit and discovery (0.2). Revising discovery to Golden Pass, CB&I, Chiyoda and conferring with trial team re same (1.1). Conferring with J. Deis re discovery (0.2). Finalizing and serving discovery to Golden Pass, CB&I, and Chiyoda (0.4). Conferring by email with C. Oxley re counsel contact information (0.1). |
| 6/30/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.50 | \$ 800.00 | Conferring by email re letters of credit (0.1). Reviewing and revising draft discovery and conferring by email re same (0.4). |
| 6/30/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 1.20 | \$ 1,020.00 | Reviewing White & Case research re GPX motion to lift stay motion and emails from J. Old re factual research of same (0.5). Reviewing White & Case revisions to draft discovery re pending motions for August hearing and preparing revisions to same (0.7). |
| 7/1/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 3.10 | \$ 2,480.00 | Conferring by email with G. Harrison re consulting expert, client call (0.4); C. Koster re discovery (0.2); counsel for Chiyoda re discovery (0.1); SG trial team re discovery (0.8), Lamotte adversary proceeding (0.1); counsel for unsecured claimholders' committee, Bank of America re discovery (0.1); trial team and client re discovery (0.1); E. Rosenberg re discovery (0.2). Conferring with G. Harrison re correspondence with client, trial team (0.1). Reviewing draft protective order and revisions from R. Hess re same (0.2). Revising draft protective order (0.1). Conferring with R. Hess re protective order (0.2). Revising discovery requests to Chiyoda (0.3). Reviewing draft protective order and revisions from R. Hess re same (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|--------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/1/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 3.60 | \$ 5,760.00 | Conferring by Zoom with Judge Lopez, B. Guzina, M. Andolina, J. Zachry, J. Old, K. McDonald, R. Biediger, T. Mallaise, J. Trefzer, and J. Meghji (1.2). Conferring by email with SG team re same (0.1). Conferring by Zoom with B. Guzina, M. Andolina, J. Zachry., J. Old, K. McDonald, R. Biediger, T. Mallaise, J. Trefzer, M. Meghji, and K. Kurtzman re settlement discussions (0.9). Conferring by phone with J. Old re settlement discussions and related research (0.1). Reviewing GPX's most recent settlement offer and reviewing potential counter-proposal scenarios and conferring by email re same (0.2). Conferring by email re discovery and communications with UCC and Banks (0.1). Reviewing draft protective order and conferring by email re same (0.1). Conferring by email re settlement discussions and feedback (0.2). Conferring by email re Zachry's litigation consultants and conferring by phone with J. Old re same and reviewing file re same (0.4). Conferring by email with team re discovery and other matters in advance of August hearing and reviewing file re same (0.3). |
| 7/1/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 4.40 | \$ 3,740.00 | Reviewing draft protective order and conferring by email with trial team re same (1.2). Reviewing and revising revised draft protective order and conferring by Zoom with J. Cuevas re same (0.4). Reviewing email from J. Cuevas re task list (0.7). Reviewing email from trial team re discovery (0.2). Reviewing slide deck re mediation/settlement discussion (0.7). Conferring by email with trial team re same (0.1). Reviewing pretrial order in WARN Act lawsuit (0.1). Reviewing update from G. Harrison re settlement analysis (0.2). Reviewing documents and conferring by email with trial team re same (0.8). |
| 7/1/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.70 | \$ 3,145.00 | Conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team via email re settlement discussions (0.5). Reviewing revisions to draft protective order (0.3). Preparing notes for depositions of McDermott and GPX (2.9). |
| 7/2/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.90 | \$ 765.00 | Conferring with J. Deis re experts (0.4). Conferring with trial team during weekly call (0.5). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|--------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 7/2/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 9.90 | \$ 7,920.00 | Conferring with: E. Rosenberg re discovery (0.3); G. Harrison re tasks and team call (0.1); Hicks Thomas and Susman Godfrey trial team re discovery and schedule (1.5); H. Vance, G. Harrison, R. Hess re case status (0.7). Conferring by email with: Susman Godfrey trial team re discovery (0.2), case tasks and team call (0.2), schedule (0.2); H. Vance re discovery (0.7); J. Deis re case tasks (0.1); S. Burnett and J. Deis re discovery (0.3). Reviewing client documents (0.1). Updating weekly task list (0.7). Reviewing correspondence from C. Koster and client re discovery and team call (0.2). Conducting research re Golden Pass liability and reviewing memorandum from B. Kessler re same (1.8). Conducting research re motion to compel rejection of EPC contract (2.8). |
| 7/2/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 4.00 | \$ 6,400.00 | Conferring by Zoom with SG and HT teams re discovery and preparation for August hearing, reviewing file re same, and conferring by email re same (1.5). Reviewing and revising task list and conferring by email re same (0.2). Conferring by Zoom with team re discovery, settlement, task list items, and status and strategy (1.1). Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess, H. Vance, and J. Cuevas re discovery, potential depositions, document organization and review, and planning and assignments for August 12 hearing (0.7). Conferring by email re protective order and reviewing same (0.3). Conferring by email re document and deposition discovery from GPX, CB&I, and Chiyoda, and schedule (0.2). |
| 7/2/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 2.70 | \$ 2,295.00 | Attending meeting of trial team (H. Vance, G. Harrison, J. Cuevas) re assignments of new tasks (0.7). Attending meeting of trial teams Susman Godfrey (H. Vance, A. Carlis, J. Cuevas, G. Harrison) and HT (J. Deis, J. Thomas) re discovery for motion hearing, scheduling and document review (0.5). Conferring by Zoom with A. Carlis re letter of credit research (0.4). Attending meeting of trial team and client and W&C team re task list, document and deposition discovery, response to contested motion and update on mediation (1.1). |
| 7/2/24 | McLaren, Jeffrey W. | 400 | 1.10 | \$ 440.00 | Participating in trial team conference call re discovery and schedule (1.1). |
| 7/2/24 | McLaren, Jeffrey W. | 400 | 1.00 | \$ 400.00 | Participating in weekly trial team conference call (1.0). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|--------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 7/2/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 5.80 | \$ 4,930.00 | Preparing correspondence to GPX, CB&I, Chiyoda and Exxon re discovery and conferring by email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.4). Conferring by videoconference with trial team re discovery tasks and schedule (0.7). Conferring by videoconference with Susman Godfrey, Hicks Thomas, White & Case trial teams and J. Old re settlement discussions, discovery status and strategy, and response planning for GPX motion to compel (1.2). Conferring by videoconference with Susman Godfrey and Hicks Thomas trial teams re discovery planning (1.0). Preparing notes for offensive deposition strategy (1.5). Reviewing documents provided by J. Old re deposition issues (0.8). Preparing revisions to task list and discovery status list (0.2). |
| 7/3/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.20 | \$ 170.00 | Conferring with SG team via email re potential experts (0.2). |
| 7/3/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.70 | \$ 560.00 | Conferring by email with: Susman Godfrey trial team re discovery, schedule, expert work (0.2); counsel for QatarEnergy and ExxonMobil re discovery (0.1). Updating task list (0.3). Conferring with C. Oxley re case schedule and deadlines (0.1). |
| 7/3/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.10 | \$ 3,360.00 | Conferring by email re communications to GPX, CB&I, and Chiyoda re proposed discovery schedule and depositions, conferring by email re call summary with T. Sales and D. Anaipakos, conferring by Zoom with H. Vance re same (0.4). Reviewing GPX's requests for production of documents to debtors and conferring by email re same (0.4). Conferring by email re settlement communications and reviewing related scenarios (0.3). Reviewing file and conferring by email re letters of credit and conferring by email re same (0.2). Reviewing documents in connection with depositions and response to EPC motion (0.6). Reviewing attorney impressions re witness interviews (0.2). |
| 7/3/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 0.80 | \$ 680.00 | Conferring by email with H. Vance re discovery schedule (0.1) and conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team re proposed protective order (0.1). Reviewing email from G. Harrison re schedule (0.1) and reviewing email from team re proposed discovery (0.1). Preparing deposition assignments (0.4). |
| 7/3/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 2.30 | \$ 1,955.00 | Preparing correspondence to GPX, CB&I, Chiyoda and Exxon re discovery, conferring by email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same and preparing email to Hick Thomas and White & Case trial teams re same (0.7). Preparing notes re offensive deposition planning (1.1). Reviewing GPX document requests and conferring by email with Susman Godfrey and Hick Thomas trial teams (0.5). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|--------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 7/4/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.20 | \$ 160.00 | Conferring with Susman Godfrey by email re discovery and evidentiary hearing (0.2). |
| 7/4/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.70 | \$ 1,120.00 | Conferring by email with SG team re deposition assignments and discovery and reviewing same (0.3). Conferring by email re proposed schedule (0.1). Conferring by email re settlement communications and reviewing related scenarios (0.2). Reviewing attorney impressions re witness interviews (0.1). |
| 7/4/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 3.20 | \$ 2,720.00 | Preparing deposition and trial assignments (3.2). |
| 7/4/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 1.70 | \$ 1,445.00 | Reviewing email correspondence from J. Old re settlement discussions (0.3). Preparing notes re discovery tasks (0.7). Reviewing research re potential construction experts (0.7). |
| 7/5/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 3.60 | \$ 2,880.00 | Preparing subpoenas to ExxonMobil and related notices (2.1). Reviewing Golden Pass emergency motion for protective order and conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (1.0). Conferring by email with: Susman Godfrey trial team re discovery (0.4); counsel for Chiyoda re discovery (0.1). |
| 7/5/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 5.40 | \$ 8,640.00 | Reviewing AP balances and other financial information re settlement offers and discussions, conferring by email with team re same, and reviewing file re same (0.8). Reviewing draft protective order and conferring by email re same (0.2). Conferring by Zoom with J. Old, J. Thomas, and B. Guzina re settlement discussions and global resolution (0.3). Conferring by Zoom with executive team re status and strategy, settlement discussions, and reviewing file and certain documents re same (0.9). Reviewing file re affirmative and defensive/responsive discovery and conferring by team re same and re proposals and objections re same (2.4). Conferring by email with team re preparation for August 12 hearing and management of discovery in advance of same (0.8). |
| 7/5/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.50 | \$ 1,275.00 | Preparing deposition assignment email and conferring by email with Susman Godfrey and HT trial team re same (0.6). Reviewing discovery correspondence from opposing counsel (0.4). Reviewing discovery responses (0.5). |
| 7/5/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 6.10 | \$ 5,185.00 | Reviewing GPX document requests to Zachry (0.5). Reviewing research memorandum re potential additional claims to adversary proceeding and researching re same (1.6). Preparing for Chiyoda deposition (2.2). Conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team via email re settlement discussions (0.3). Conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team via email re discovery tasks (0.3). Reviewing new filings in bankruptcy matter (1.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|--------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/6/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 1.20 | \$ 960.00 | Conferring with H. Vance, R. Hess, G. Harrison re discovery, settlement discussions (0.7). Preparing notices of deposition to Leon Bishop and Tatsuya Hishinuma (0.4). Conferring by email with trial team re discovery (0.1). |
| 7/6/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.80 | \$ 2,880.00 | Reviewing GPX's emergency motion for protective order re discovery requests, and conferring by email re same (0.8). Conferring by Zoom with SG team re GPX discovery and depositions, XOM and Chiyoda discovery and depositions, and document chronology (0.7). Conferring by email and reviewing file re schedule, settlement discussions, and document collection and production (0.3). |
| 7/6/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.00 | \$ 850.00 | Preparing email to Hicks Thomas litigation team re discovery and conferring by email with trial team re same (0.3). Conferring by Zoom with G. Harrison, J. Cuevas, H. Vance and A. Carlis re discovery (0.7). |
| 7/6/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 4.10 | \$ 3,485.00 | Preparing notes for offensive deposition issues and reviewing discovery requests re same (1.8). Preparing status list of discovery issues and tasks for status conference on 7/10 (0.6). Conferring by videoconference with G. Harrison, R. Hess, J. Cuevas and A. Carlis re discovery tasks (0.7). Reviewing correspondence with GPX, CB&I and Chiyoda re discovery issues and conferring via email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.8). Reviewing draft subpoenas to Exxon (0.2). |
| 7/7/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 1.60 | \$ 1,280.00 | Conferring by email with: Susman Godfrey trial team re discovery (0.4), tasks (0.1); trial team re discovery (0.2); J. Belvin re discovery (0.3). Revising discovery requests to Exxon (0.3). Revising notices of deposition and conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.3). |
| 7/7/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.10 | \$ 3,360.00 | Conferring by email re various discovery matters including document and deposition discovery (0.5). Reviewing and revising drafts of deposition notices and conferring by email re same (1.2). Reviewing file re GPX's motion for protection and conferring by email re same (0.4). |
| 7/7/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 2.70 | \$ 2,295.00 | Preparing opposition to Motion for Protection (2.7). |
| 7/7/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 0.80 | \$ 680.00 | Preparing correspondence to GPX, Exxon, CB&I, and Chiyoda re discovery issues and conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team via email re same (0.8) |
| 7/8/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.30 | \$ 240.00 | Serving notices of subpoena, depositions and conferring by email with trial team re same (0.3). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|--------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/8/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.90 | \$ 4,640.00 | Conferring by Zoom with executive team and White & Case re settlement litigation, discovery, and other matters (1.2). Conferring by email re various discovery matters including document and deposition discovery, reviewing and revising drafts of deposition notices and conferring by email re same (0.9). Reviewing GPX's motion for protection, conferring by email re same, and conferring by phone with R. Hess re response to same (0.8). |
| 7/8/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 10.70 | \$ 9,095.00 | Preparing opposition to Motion for Protection (10.7). |
| 7/8/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 6.00 | \$ 5,100.00 | Reviewing GPX motion for protective order and preparing notes re response points (1.2). Conferring by videoconference with Chiyoda counsel and R. Hess re briefing schedule and discovery and preparing for same (1.2). Preparing notes for depositions (2.9). Preparing notes for Wednesday status conference issues (0.4). Reviewing emails from J. Old re settlement discussions (0.3). |
| 7/9/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 1.20 | \$ 1,020.00 | Conferring with R. Hess re response brief (0.2). Conferring with UCC re discovery (0.3). Revising response brief (0.7). |
| 7/9/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 2.50 | \$ 2,000.00 | Reviewing draft response to Golden Pass's motion for protective order and conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (1.4); conferring by email with Susman Godfrey trial team re discovery (0.5); reviewing client documents (0.4); conferring by email with C. Oxley re UCC contact distribution (0.1); conferring by email with H. Vance re meet and confer with CB&I (0.1). |
| 7/9/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 5.10 | \$ 8,160.00 | Conferring by email with various members of the litigation team re multiple discovery matters including document and deposition discovery (0.4). Reviewing and revising response to GPX's motion for protection, reviewing file re same, and conferring by email re same (3.3). Conferring twice by Zoom with executive team re status and strategy, reviewing file re schedule, status conference, and conferring by email re same (0.9). Conferring by email re settlement (0.1). Conferring by email re summary of call with UCC counsel and conferring by email re involvement in discovery (0.2). Conferring by email re call summary and discovery matters re JV partners (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|--------|------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 7/9/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 11.60 | \$ 9,860.00 | <p>Preparing opposition to Motion for Protection (3.8). Confering by Zoom and confering by phone with CB&I re discovery meet and confer (0.5). Confering in office with A. Carlis re Motion for Protection (0.2); Revising same (1.6). Reviewing edits and revising response to motion for protection (0.4). Confering by Zoom with WT trial team, W&C trial team and client re tasks and upcoming status conference/hearing (0.5). Preparing for oral argument re motion for protection (0.2). Reviewing summary of meet and confer with JV partners (0.1). Reviewing summary call with UCC counsel (0.1). Confering in office re edits to response (0.1). Reviewing edits from co counsel and revising objections to motion (0.4). Confering with A. Carlis re objection to motion for protection (0.3). Revising objection to motion for protection (1.2); Reviewing additional edits and confering by email with co counsel re same (0.5); Confering by phone with C. Koster re edits to objection (0.1); Confering by email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.3); Reviewing and revising further edits (1.0); Reviewing Chiyoda motion for protection (0.3).</p> |
| 7/9/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 8.20 | \$ 6,970.00 | <p>Preparing notes for depositions (4.0). Preparing emails to UCC counsel re depositions (0.2). Preparing correspondence to CB&I and Chiyoda re discovery issues and confering with Susman Godfrey trial team via email re same (0.3). Preparing emails to Susman Godfrey and Hick Thomas trial teams re meet and confers with JV members (0.4). Confering by videoconference with trial team for status and strategy call (0.5). Confering by videoconference with A. Carlis re discussion with UCC counsel (0.2). Confering by videoconference with R. Hess re GPX motion for protection opposition brief (0.2); Confering by videoconference with CB&I counsel re pending discovery, deposition requests and briefing schedule (0.7). Preparing revisions to draft opposition to GPX motion for protection and confering with R. Hess re same (1.2). Confering by email with Susman Godfrey and Hick Thomas trial teams re discovery issues and tasks (0.5).</p> |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/10/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 3.80 | \$ 3,040.00 | Reviewing Chiyoda's emergency motion for protective order and conferring by email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (2.5). conferring by email with: C. Langham re deposition schedule (0.1); Susman Godfrey trial team re ExxonMobil motion for protective order (0.1); J. Deis re Chiyoda discovery (0.1); counsel for Chiyoda, Golden Pass, CB&I re protective order (0.2); trial team re protective order (0.1). Conferring with: H. Vance re emergency motions and discovery (0.2); R. Hess re hearing, discovery, and Chiyoda motion for protective order (0.3). Reviewing document requests to CB&I and proposing compromise to resolve disputes (0.2). |
| 7/10/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.40 | \$ 3,840.00 | Reviewing file and conferring by email re preparation for hearing on GPX's motion for protection and status conference and conferring by phone with R. Hess re same and attending (by phone) status conference (0.6). Conferring by email re settlement and involvement of JV partners (0.2). Conferring by email re Rule 2004 discovery and extension of time (0.2). Conferring by email re depositions and scheduling re August 12th hearing and conferring by email re communications with UCC re same (0.3). Reviewing XOM and Chiyoda motions for protection and conferring by email re same, response to same, and potential resolution re same (1.1). |
| 7/10/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 7.00 | \$ 5,950.00 | Preparing for hearing on motion for protection (4.2). Attending meeting of trial team and client re discovery requests (1.8); Attending court hearing (0.3); and conferring with H. Vance re same (0.3). Conferring by phone with J. Cuevas re discovery hearing and requests (0.2). Reviewing email and order re fee and expense reimbursement and conferring by email with G. Harrison re same (0.2). |
| 7/10/24 | McLaren, Jeffrey W. | 400 | 0.30 | \$ 120.00 | Conferring with court reporter re deposition logistics (0.3). |
| 7/10/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 9.20 | \$ 7,820.00 | Attending hearing and conferring with Susman Godfrey, White & Case and Hick Thomas trial teams re same (0.7); Preparing for argument on disputed Chiyoda and Golden Pass motions and conferring with R. Hess re same (3.1); Attending meeting with J. Old, Susman Godfrey and Hick Thomas trial teams re discovery preparation, settlement discussions, and case strategy (1.7); Reviewing Exxon motion to quash and conferring via email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.7); Conferring via email with UCC counsel re discovery issues (0.5); Preparing notes for depositions (2.5). |
| 7/10/24 | Frisbee, Katie Grace | 150 | 3.00 | \$ 450.00 | Attending meeting re potential settlement (1.0). Attending bankruptcy hearing (2.0). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/11/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 8.50 | \$ 6,800.00 | Reviewing discovery requests to Chiyoda and conferring by email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.8). Conferring by email with: G. Harrison re Rule 26(f) conference (0.1); trial team re Chiyoda and CB&I discovery (0.4), ExxonMobil motion for protective order (0.1); Susman Godfrey trial team re Chiyoda and CB&I discovery (0.5); Chiyoda counsel re discovery (0.1). Updating written chronology (0.2). Updating weekly task list (0.1). Conferring with R. Hess re ExxonMobil motion for protective order (0.1). Drafting response to ExxonMobil motion for protective order (6.1). |
| 7/11/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 3.10 | \$ 4,960.00 | Reviewing file re Rule 2004 discovery and conferring by email re same (0.2). Reviewing file re document and deposition discovery related to August 12th hearing, objections and responses re same, resolution with respect to certain discovery targets, and conferring by email with SG and broader team re same and related matters (1.3). Conferring by email re settlement negotiations and status and potential impact on litigation (0.3). Conferring by email re discovery on McDermott and Chiyoda, summaries of communications with counsel for these entities, and negotiation and potential resolution (0.4). Conferring by email re deposition scheduling (0.1). Conferring by email with team re July 15th hearing (0.1). Conferring by email with and re UCC participation in discovery and attendance at depositions, and preparing for tomorrow's update call with UCC and reviewing file re same (0.6). Conferring by email with SG team re Rule 26(f) conference and reviewing file re same (0.1). |
| 7/11/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.60 | \$ 1,360.00 | Conferring with G. Harrison re client meeting (0.1); Reviewing email from UCC counsel re discovery requests (0.2); Conferring by email with H. Vance re Chiyoda discovery (0.1). Reviewing proposed compromise re same (0.2); Conferring with G. Harrison re hearing assignment (0.1); Reviewing email from Chiyoda counsel (0.1); and reviewing email from McDermott counsel (0.1). Conferring by email with H. Vance re Chiyoda discovery (0.2) and reviewing motion to quash Exxon depositions (0.2). Reviewing memorandum from J. Cuevas re response to Chiyoda motion for protection (0.3) |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|--------------|---|
| 7/11/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 5.00 | \$ 4,250.00 | Reviewing Exxon motion to quash and conferring via email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.4); Reviewing Chiyoda motion for protective order, conferring via email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same and preparing for hearing on same (0.9); Preparing correspondence with CB&I and Chiyoda re discovery issues (0.3); Conferring with B. Guzina re discovery deadlines (0.1); Preparing notes re hearing and deposition (2.9); Conferring by phone with CB&I counsel re discovery issues, document production requests and preparing summary re same (0.4). |
| 7/12/24 | Carlis, Adam | 850 | 0.40 | \$ 340.00 | Conferring with SG team re case strategy (0.4). |
| 7/12/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 15.80 | \$ 12,640.00 | Drafting response to ExxonMobil motion for protective order (13.0). Conferring with CB&I and Chiyoda's counsel and H. Vance re discovery and briefing schedule (0.7); H. Vance re meet and confer with Chiyoda and CB&I (0.3); J. Deis, S. Burnett, and H. Vance re document production (0.8). Conferring by email with Susman Godfrey re meet and confer with Chiyoda and CB&I (0.8). Reviewing documents (0.2). |
| 7/12/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 4.60 | \$ 7,360.00 | Conferring by Zoom with H. Vance, B. Guzina, and UCC re settlement and litigation status update and preparing for same (0.8). Conferring by phone multiple times with H. Vance re UCC call and re meet/confers with other entities on discovery and conferring by email re same, and reviewing file re same (0.6). Conferring by Zoom with SG team re status and strategy, August 12th hearing and related discovery, Adversary Rule 26(f) conference and pre-trial conference and schedule, and reviewing file re same (0.5). Conferring by Zoom with executive committee re settlement, litigation, and status and strategy and conferring by email re same and reviewing file re same and conferring by phone with H. Vance immediately after re July 15th hearing and related matters (0.8). Conferring by phone with J. Old re litigation status and impending hearings and conference and conferring by email re same (0.3). Conferring by email with J. Tillotson re XOM motion for protection and conferring by email re response to XOM's motion (0.7). Reviewing CIC's motion to quash and conferring by email re same, and reviewing transcript that C. Jones sent in connection with meeting and conferring (0.4). Conferring by email re adversary pleading and reviewing file re same and conferring by email re GPX's response date (0.5). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|----------------------|-------------|----------------|--------------|---|
| 7/12/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 3.90 | \$ 3,315.00 | Conferring by phone with H. Vance re discovery call (0.1). Conferring by phone re Chiyoda meet and confer (0.2). Conferring by email with H. Vance and trial team re mediation privileges (0.2). Conferring by phone with Chiyoda counsel re discovery requests (0.4). Reviewing email from H. Vance re update from steering committee (0.1). Reviewing update from client (0.1); update from J. Cuevas re Exxon motion (0.1); update from H. Vance re discovery hit counts (0.1); update from H. Vance re client discovery communication (0.1); update from G. Harrison re settlement discussions (0.1). Conferring by phone with G. Harrison, H. Vance, A. Carlis, and J. Cuevas re update on Monday hearing and contested motion discovery (all attended via video except R. Hess via telephone) (2.4). |
| 7/12/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 8.80 | \$ 7,480.00 | Conferring by videoconference with UCC counsel, G. Harrison and B. Guzina re litigation status and preparing summary re same to Susman Godfrey (0.9); Conferring by phone with G. Harrison re settlement issues (0.1); Conferring by videoconference with McDermott and Chiyoda counsel re discovery issues and conferring with J. Cuevas re same (1.0); Conferring by phone with McDermott counsel re discovery issues (0.4); Conferring by videoconference with J. Cuevas and J. Deis re Zachry document production (0.9); Conferring by phone with R. Hess re Chiyoda discovery positions (0.2); Preparing correspondence to McDermott and Chiyoda re discovery issues, reviewing requests re same and preparing email to Susman Godfrey trial team re follow-up tasks (1.2); Conferring by phone with G. Harrison re settlement and discovery issues (0.2); Conferring by videoconference with Susman Godfrey trial team re discovery tasks, settlement status, and preparation for 7/15 hearing (0.5); Conferring by videoconference with G. Harrison and Zachry steering committee re settlement and strategy issues, and preparing summary to Susman Godfrey trial team re same (1.3); Conferring by phone with Exxon counsel re motion to quash hearing (0.1); Reviewing documents provided by J. Old re deposition issues (2.0). |
| 7/13/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 13.20 | \$ 10,560.00 | Drafting response to ExxonMobil motion for protective order (9.9). Conferring by email with: client re discovery (0.1); H. Vance re research re motions to compel rejection of executory contracts, motion for relief from automatic stay (0.7). Reviewing documents (0.2). Researching motions to compel rejection of executory contracts, motion for relief from automatic stay (2.3). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/13/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 5.70 | \$ 9,120.00 | Reviewing and revising response to XOM's motion for protection, reviewing file and certain documents re same, conferring by email re same, and reviewing potential exhibits re same (5.2). Conferring by email with team re discovery, schedule, and other matters (0.4). Reviewing CIC's additional revisions to draft protective order and conferring by email re same (0.1). |
| 7/13/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 2.60 | \$ 2,210.00 | Reviewing and revising draft objection to motion to quash (1.0). Conferring by email with client and trial team re update from Chiyoda counsel (0.1). Reviewing email from opposing counsel re discovery, proposed protective order and schedule and conferring with trial team re same (0.6). Reviewing settlement emails (0.1); emails from team re Exxon motion (0.2) and emails from team re 26(f) conference (0.1). Conferring by video with H. Vance (0.5). |
| 7/13/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 4.10 | \$ 3,485.00 | Conferring by videoconference with R. Hess re Chiyoda and McDermott discovery issues and conferring via email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.7); Reviewing draft opposition to Exxon motion to quash subpoenas (2.2); Conferring by phone with J. Cuevas re motion to quash opposition (0.4); Preparing notes re deposition issues (0.8). |
| 7/14/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 11.00 | \$ 8,800.00 | Conferring by email with: client re discovery and schedule, contested matters and adversary proceeding (0.4), mediation (0.2); Susman Godfrey trial team re ExxonMobil motion and hearing (0.3), Chiyoda motion and hearing (0.2), Rule 26(f) conference (0.1); C. Jones re Chiyoda motion for protective order (0.2). Conferring with R. Hess re case status and July 15 hearing (0.3). Conferring with H. Vance re ExxonMobil motion (0.1). Conferring with J. Deis re ExxonMobil motion response and exhibits (0.1). Updating notice of deposition of Leon Bishop (0.2). Reviewing documents re Chiyoda executives (1.1). Reviewing and revising response to ExxonMobil motion for protective order (6.0). Reviewing and revising protective order (1.8). |
| 7/14/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.50 | \$ 4,000.00 | Reviewing suggested revisions to response to XOM's motion for protection and conferring by email and by Zoom with SG team re same (0.9). Conferring by email with SG team and full team re CIC motion for protection, conferring by Zoom with SG team re same, and reviewing file and certain documents re same (0.8). Conferring by email re settlement communications and status and reviewing file re same (0.2). Reviewing revised draft protective order and conferring by email re same (0.2). Conferring by email re discovery and reviewing file re same (0.4). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/14/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 3.20 | \$ 2,720.00 | Conferring by email with client and trial team re mediation agreements (0.1) and reviewing emails and agreements re same (0.2). Conferring by Zoom with G. Harrison, H. Vance and J. Cuevas re discovery and upcoming hearing (0.5). Preparing draft of response to Chiyoda motion for protection (2.4). |
| 7/14/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 4.80 | \$ 4,080.00 | Conferring by phone with Exxon counsel re motion to quash hearing (0.3); Conferring by videoconference with Susman Godfrey trial team re Chiyoda and XOM motions and hearing preparation (0.6); Reviewing revisions to draft opposition to Exxon motion to quash subpoenas (0.4); Preparing notes re deposition issues (3.0); Conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team via email re document production (0.5). |
| 7/15/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 4.60 | \$ 3,680.00 | Attending hearing before Judge Isgur (0.4). Conferring with: J. Lewis re response to ExxonMobil's emergency motion (0.1); E. Rosenberg re protective order (0.2), R. Hess re protective order (0.1). Reviewing and revising response to ExxonMobil's emergency motion (1.6). Conferring by email with: client re mediation agreements (0.1); E. Rosenberg re protective order (0.1); C. Oxford re hearing schedule (0.1); Susman Godfrey trial team re protective order (0.2), hearing schedule (0.1), Rule 25(f) conference (0.1); trial team re protective order (0.2), notice of deposition of Leon Bishop (0.1); G. Harrison re response to ExxonMobil's emergency motion (0.1); CB&I and Unsecured Creditors Committee and Chiyoda and Golden Pass counsel re notice of deposition of Leon Bishop (0.2), protective order (0.3); counsel for Unsecured Creditors Committee re deposition of Leon Bishop (0.1); Golden Pass counsel re Rule 26(f) conference (0.1). Revising time entries for public submission (0.4). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/15/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 4.60 | \$ 7,360.00 | <p>Reviewing additional suggested revisions to response to XOM's motion for protection and conferring by email re same (0.7). Conferring by email with SG team and full team re CIC motion for protection, conferring by Zoom with SG team re same, and reviewing file re same (0.8). Conferring by email re settlement communications and status and reviewing file re same (0.2). Conferring by email re protective order and document production schedule (0.2). Reviewing settlement and mediation communications including with mediator S. Nelson and conferring by email re same and related matters (0.2). Conferring by email re Chiyoda custodians and document production (0.1). Preparing for and attending court status conference and conferring by email re same (0.6). Reviewing portions of FERC report and conferring by email re same and certain other materials (0.4). Reviewing draft order of proof table and conferring by email re same (0.3). Reviewing letters of credit and conferring by email re same (0.2). Reviewing news items re QatarEnergy and global LNG market (0.3). Conferring by Zoom with executive team re settlement, update, and status and strategy, and reviewing draft settlement term sheet and proposed redline (0.6).</p> |
| 7/15/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 6.10 | \$ 5,185.00 | <p>Preparing and attending hearing on motion for protection (3.2); conferring by Zoom with H. Vance re motion for protection (0.3); reviewing agenda, motion for protection and email compromise (0.3); conferring by email with Susman Godfrey trial team re update on settlement (0.3); reviewing update on settlement from client (0.2). Preparing for potential mediation privilege issue and researching factual matters and researching points of law re mediation agreements, local rules and document requests (0.9). Conferring by phone with J. Cuevas (0.2); conferring by email with M. Andolina re protective order (0.2); conferring by email with J. Cuevas re same (0.1); and reviewing bankruptcy court proposed protective order (0.4).</p> |
| 7/15/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 3.90 | \$ 3,315.00 | <p>Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess re hearing preparation (0.3). Attending status conference (0.5). Reviewing revisions to draft opposition to Exxon motion to quash subpoenas (0.8). Reviewing documents re Chiyoda and CB&I custodians (1.0). Reviewing revisions to draft protective order (0.2). Conferring by Zoom with Chiyoda and McDermott counsel re discovery issues. Conferring by email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.7). Reviewing emails from J. Old, and C. Koster re settlement status and discovery (0.4).</p> |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/15/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 1.70 | \$ 255.00 | Researching assignment and adversary complaint (0.7). Researching fraudulent transfer standards (0.9). Discussing assignment with J. Cuevas (0.1). |
| 7/16/24 | Coll, Anna | 725 | 1.90 | \$ 1,377.50 | Reading briefing to prepare for moot (1.9). |
| 7/16/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 6.10 | \$ 4,880.00 | Conferring by email with: client re ExxonMobil response (0.1); Susman Godfrey trial team re ExxonMobil response (0.1); trial team re team call (0.1), order to redact and restrict (0.3). Reviewing and revising response to ExxonMobil emergency motion and supporting exhibits (1.7). Updating weekly task list (0.5). Revising time entries for public submission (0.7). Preparing oral argument re response to ExxonMobil emergency motion (2.3). Reviewing order to redact and restrict and related docket entries (0.3). |
| 7/16/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.50 | \$ 2,400.00 | Conferring by email re settlement and reviewing draft and revised term sheet (0.7). Conferring by email re Rule 26(f) conference and postponement of same (0.2). Conferring by email with C. Bernstein re legal research on avoidance of November 2022 CSA and reviewing file and conferring by email re same (0.3). Conferring by email re response to XOM's motion and potential exhibit redactions, and postponement of filing and potential argument and preparing for same and conferring by phone with J. Cuevas re same (0.2). Reviewing revised task list and conferring by email re same (0.1). |
| 7/16/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 2.50 | \$ 2,125.00 | Reviewing emails from J. Old re settlement status, discovery, and draft motion to quash (1.3). Reviewing revised opposition to Exxon motion to quash (1.2). |
| 7/16/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 7.90 | \$ 1,185.00 | Corresponding with G. Harrison re fraudulent transfer research requirements (0.4). Researching key southern district of Texas fraudulent conveyance decisions on standards of insolvency (3.4). Researching key southern district of Texas fraudulent conveyance decisions on reasonably equivalent value (4.1). |
| 7/17/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 1.40 | \$ 1,120.00 | Reviewing correspondence from G. Harrison re settlement negotiations (0.1). Preparing oral argument re response to ExxonMobil emergency motion (0.7). Reviewing and revising response to ExxonMobil emergency motion (0.6). |
| 7/17/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.70 | \$ 2,720.00 | Conferring by Zoom with executive team re status, strategy, and settlement (0.7). Conferring by email with SG team re status and strategy (0.1). Reviewing multiple revised draft term sheets and conferring by email re same and various insurance and other considerations (0.9). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 7/17/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.70 | \$ 1,445.00 | Reviewing and revising draft objection and response to XOM motion for protection (1.1) and conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.1). Conferring by email with trial team re schedules and deadlines (0.1) and reviewing draft term sheet (0.4). |
| 7/17/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 1.10 | \$ 935.00 | Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess re Exxon motion scheduling and discovery tasks (0.3). Reviewing trial team emails re settlement discussions (0.5). Conferring with Exxon counsel re motion to quash hearing (0.3). |
| 7/17/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 1.30 | \$ 195.00 | Researching fifth circuit fraudulent transfer decisions frequently cited by southern district of Texas (1.3). |
| 7/18/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 1.10 | \$ 880.00 | Updating weekly task list (0.4). Conferring by email with G. Harrison re deadlines (0.1); Susman Godfrey trial team re hearing on ExxonMobil emergency motion (0.1); trial team re tasks and team call (0.1); C. Oxley re case deadlines (0.2). Attending weekly trial team call (0.2). |
| 7/18/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.00 | \$ 1,600.00 | Conferring by Zoom with J. Old, J. Lewis, J. Deis, M. Andolina, and SG team re status and strategy, reviewing draft settlement term sheets, and conferring by email re same (0.7). Reviewing file re adversary and Rule 2004 discovery and conferring by email re various deadlines for Zachry and other parties to the proceedings (0.3). |
| 7/18/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 2.70 | \$ 2,295.00 | Attending meeting of trial team (J. Old, J. Lewis, M. Andolina, J. Deis, H. Vance, R. Hess, G. Harrison, J. Cuevas) re task list and upcoming deadlines (0.2). Conferring in office with A. Carlis (0.1) and reviewing proposed deadlines in light of settlement discussions (0.2). Reviewing correspondence re resetting of XOM hearing and reviewing docket filings (0.5). Reviewing draft term sheet (0.7). Researching points of law re letter of credit transactions and reviewing email from bankruptcy counsel re same (0.2). Reviewing settlement communications between client and counsel including revised term sheet (0.6). Reviewing supplemental PPI list and conferring by email with accounting and conflicts team re same (0.2). |
| 7/18/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 0.20 | \$ 170.00 | Conferring by Zoom with trial team re task list, settlement, and discovery (0.2). |
| 7/18/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 0.60 | \$ 90.00 | Researching fifth circuit fraudulent transfer decisions frequently cited by southern district of Texas (0.6). |
| 7/19/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.20 | \$ 160.00 | Corresponding with trial team re settlement progress and case status (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 7/19/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.70 | \$ 1,120.00 | Conferring by email re Rule 26(f) conference and scheduling or postponement (0.1). Reviewing file re notice of settlement, reviewing term sheet, and conferring by email re same and litigation status (0.6). |
| 7/19/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 0.30 | \$ 45.00 | Reviewing case correspondence and draft emails to G. Harrison re scheduling oral presentation week of July 22 (0.3). |
| 7/20/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.20 | \$ 320.00 | Reviewing unredacted stipulation and settlement term sheet and conferring by email re same (0.2). |
| 7/20/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 0.30 | \$ 255.00 | Reviewing email from B. Guzina re preliminary settlement (0.2). Reviewing motion to set claims bar date (0.1). |
| 7/22/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.20 | \$ 160.00 | Conferring by email with client re team call (0.1). Scheduling team call (0.1). |
| 7/22/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.20 | \$ 320.00 | Conferring by email re status and strategy, discovery abatement, and next status conference (0.2). |
| 7/22/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 3.00 | \$ 2,550.00 | Reviewing declaration in support of emergency motion (0.2) and motion to set claims bar date (0.3) and conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team re same. Reviewing email from CIC counsel re discovery (0.1); motion to reject lease (0.1); conferring by email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.1). Reviewing emergency motion for interim and final approval of settlement (redacted and unredacted) (0.6). Reviewing final unredacted version of term sheet and motion to seal (0.4). Reviewing statement in support of settlement by Unsecured Creditors Committee (0.2). Researching factual matters re documents collected by litigation cocounsel (1.0). |
| 7/22/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 1.70 | \$ 1,445.00 | Reviewing bankruptcy filings re settlement, contract acceptance and rejection, and discovery. Conferring via email with Susman Godfrey trial team re same. Preparing emails to opposing counsel, and UCC re discovery status (1.7). |
| 7/22/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 1.10 | \$ 165.00 | Drafting demonstrative for oral discussion on fraudulent transfers (1.1). |
| 7/23/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.30 | \$ 240.00 | Conferring by email with: J. McLaren re Bishop deposition (0.1); Susman Godfrey trial team re Bishop deposition (0.1). Reviewing agenda for 7/24/24 interim approval hearing and conferring with Susman Godfrey trial team re same (0.1). |
| 7/23/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 3.20 | \$ 480.00 | Reviewing fraudulent transfer cases and drafting demonstrative for presentation (3.2). |
| 7/24/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 2.70 | \$ 2,160.00 | Preparing C. Bernstein for oral presentation re fraudulent transfer claim (0.8). Attending interim approval hearing (1.5). Corresponding with: J. McLaren re Bishop deposition (0.1); C. Oxley re case schedule (0.2); Susman Godfrey trial team re deposition cancellation (0.1). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|--|
| 7/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.80 | \$ 2,880.00 | Attending Bankruptcy Court settlement interim approval hearing, reviewing file, unredacted settlement term sheet, and related filings in advance of hearing, and conferring by email re same (1.7). Conferring by email re cancellation of discovery and depositions (0.1). |
| 7/24/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 1.40 | \$ 1,190.00 | Attending hearing on emergency motion to approve settlement (1.3). Reviewing docket re adversary proceeding hearing (0.1). |
| 7/24/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 1.60 | \$ 1,360.00 | Attending hearing on preliminary approval of settlement (1.6). |
| 7/24/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 5.00 | \$ 750.00 | Meeting with J. Cuevas to discuss fraudulent transfer caselaw in advance of scheduled presentation (0.7). Attending hearing on universal settlement agreement (1.5). Editing demonstrative for scheduled presentation (2.6). Corresponding with case team to reschedule presentation (0.2). |
| 7/25/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 1.70 | \$ 1,360.00 | Updating task list (0.4). Corresponding with G. Harrison re deposition cancellation (0.1), J. McLaren re deposition cancellation (0.1). Attending presentation re fraudulent transfer claim (0.8). Attending team call with M. Andolina, client, R. Hess, H. Vance, G. Harrison, J. Deis (0.3). |
| 7/25/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.20 | \$ 1,920.00 | Conferring by Zoom with R. Hess, H. Vance, J. Cuevas, and C. Bernstein re fraudulent transfer research (0.8). Reviewing task list and conferring by Zoom with team re status and strategy (0.3). Reviewing interim approval order (0.1). |
| 7/25/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 0.80 | \$ 680.00 | Conferring by video conference with G. Harrison, H. Vance, J. Cuevas and C. Bernstein re fraudulent transfer research (attended .5 of .8 hour meeting) (0.5). Conferring by video conference with G. Harrison, H. Vance, J. Cuevas, M. Andolina, J. Old, and J. Deis re task list (0.3). |
| 7/25/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 1.70 | \$ 1,445.00 | Conferring by video conference with G. Harrison, R. Hess, J. Cuevas, and C. Bernstein re fraudulent transfer research (0.8). Conferring by video conference with Susman Godfrey trial team, M. Andolina, and J. Old re case next steps and settlement approval (0.3). Reviewing unredacted term sheet (0.6). |
| 7/25/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 5.00 | \$ 750.00 | Conducting legal research re Judge Isgur fraudulent transfer holdings (2.0). Editing presentation and consolidating printed cases re fraudulent transfers (2.3). Meeting with G. Harrison, H. Vance, R. Hess, J. Cuevas (0.7). |
| 7/26/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.20 | \$ 320.00 | Conferring by email re confirmation of discovery and Rule 2004 responses abatement pending court's final confirmation of settlement and reviewing file re same (0.2). |
| 7/28/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 1.00 | \$ 150.00 | Editing presentation re Judge Isgur fraudulent transfer decisions (1.0). |
| 7/29/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.40 | \$ 320.00 | Reviewing presentation re fraudulent transfer claim and conferring with C. Bernstein re same (0.4). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 7/29/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 1.10 | \$ 165.00 | Practicing presentation re Judge Isgur fraudulent transfer decisions (0.5). Editing presentation re Judge Isgur fraudulent transfer decisions (0.6). |
| 7/30/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 1.40 | \$ 1,120.00 | Corresponding with Susman Godfrey trial team re deposition cancellation (0.2). Preparing notice of voluntary dismissal and proposed order and judgment (1.2). |
| 7/31/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.40 | \$ 320.00 | Preparing notice of voluntary dismissal and proposed order and judgment (0.3). Conferring by email with C. Oxley and R. Hess re schedule (0.1). |
| 7/31/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 1.10 | \$ 1,760.00 | Reviewing court's interim approval order and conferring by email re same (0.6). Reviewing draft voluntary dismissal in connection with settlement and interim approval order and conferring by email re same (0.3). Reviewing legal research powerpoint and conferring by email re same (0.2). |
| 7/31/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 0.90 | \$ 135.00 | Editing demonstration for presentation (0.9). |
| 8/1/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 1.20 | \$ 960.00 | Conferring with G. Harrison re team call re presentation on fraudulent transfer claim (0.1). Reviewing docket filings in main case (0.4). Conferring with G. Harrison and C. Bernstein re fraudulent transfer presentation (0.2). Conferring with C. Bernstein re presentation re fraudulent transfer claim (0.1). Reviewing slide deck re fraudulent transfer claim and conferring with C. Bernstein re same (0.4). |
| 8/1/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 3.90 | \$ 585.00 | Corresponding with G. Harrison and J. Cuevas re presentation (0.6). Editing fraudulent transfer presentation (3.3). |
| 8/1/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.30 | \$ 480.00 | Conferring by Zoom with C. Bernstein re legal research and presentation and reviewing file re same (0.3). |
| 8/2/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.70 | \$ 560.00 | Attending team call with R. Hess, G. Harrison, C. Bernstein, client, and J. Thomas re fraudulent transfer claim (0.7). |
| 8/2/24 | Bernstein, Charlie | 150 | 3.10 | \$ 465.00 | Reviewing fraudulent transfer case law and presentation (2.4). Corresponding with J. Old, G. Harrison, and J. Cuevas re fraudulent transfer case law (0.7). |
| 8/2/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.40 | \$ 640.00 | Conferring by Zoom with team re legal research presentation (0.4). |
| 8/2/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 0.70 | \$ 595.00 | Conferring by video conference with J. Old and law department re legal research presentation on fraudulent transfer, reasonably equivalent value and insolvency (0.7). |
| 8/5/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 0.50 | \$ 425.00 | Reviewing final presentation re Judge Isgur fraud case research (0.5). |
| 8/5/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.50 | \$ 400.00 | Conferring with M. Andolina and C. Koster re final judgment in adversary proceeding (0.3). Listening to voicemail from non-party vendor re case and conferring with SG trial team re same (0.2). |

| Date | Name | Hourly Rate | Hours Expended | Fee Earned | Narrative |
|---------|-----------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|---|
| 8/6/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.70 | \$ 1,120.00 | Reviewing draft settlement agreement implementing term sheet and reflecting additional matters and conferring by email re same (0.6). Conferring by email re status and timing re settlement (0.1). |
| 8/6/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 0.20 | \$ 170.00 | Conferring by video with trial team and client re adversary next steps and settlement documentation (0.2). |
| 8/6/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 0.40 | \$ 340.00 | Conferring by Zoom with trial team re litigation update and settlement status (0.4). |
| 8/6/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.60 | \$ 480.00 | Updating weekly task list (0.3). Attending team call with H. Vance, R. Hess, M. Andolina, C. Koster, client, and J. Deis (0.2). Conferring by email with SG trial team re 8/12 final approval hearing (0.1). |
| 8/7/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.10 | \$ 160.00 | Conferring by email re August 12 hearing status (0.1). |
| 8/7/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 0.10 | \$ 80.00 | Conferring by email with client re 8/12 final approval hearing (0.1). |
| 8/9/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.10 | \$ 160.00 | Conferring by email re schedule and status (0.1). |
| 8/11/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 9.60 | \$ 7,680.00 | Traveling to Houston for final approval hearing, and reviewing materials during transit (9.6). |
| 8/11/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.40 | \$ 640.00 | Reviewing file and documents re hearing on final approval of settlement and conferring by email re same (0.4). |
| 8/12/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 2.50 | \$ 4,000.00 | Conferring with team and preparing for and attending settlement approval hearing and conferring by email re same (2.1). Reviewing draft notice of dismissal and reviewing interim approval order and proposed order at dkt #739 re same and conferring by email re same (0.4). |
| 8/12/24 | Vance, Hunter | 850 | 2.40 | \$ 2,040.00 | Attending final settlement approval hearing (0.7). Reviewing proposed order re final settlement approval, motion for contract rejection and settlement agreement (1.6). Reviewing draft adversary dismissal order (0.1). |
| 8/12/24 | Hess, Richard W. | 850 | 0.90 | \$ 765.00 | Preparing for hearing on motion to approve settlement (0.6). Reviewing proposed order approving settlement (0.3). |
| 8/12/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | 800 | 2.60 | \$ 2,080.00 | Reviewing application and order for retention of SG and procedures for compensation (0.3). Traveling to Hicks Thomas office for pre-hearing meeting (0.3). Attending meeting with client, G. Harrison, J. Deis, C. Koster, M. Andolina, A. O'Neal re final approval hearing (0.8). Attending final approval hearing (0.5). Traveling to SG's offices after hearing (0.2). Revising notice of voluntary dismissal (0.4). Conferring by email with trial team re notice of voluntary dismissal (0.1). |
| 8/13/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | 1,600 | 0.30 | \$ 480.00 | Reviewing voluntary dismissal, filing and courtesy service, and conferring by email re same (0.3). |

Exhibit B

Summary of Expenses During Interim Period

| Cost Category | Amount (\$) |
|--|--------------------|
| Air Travel | 534.96 |
| Black & White (B/W) Prints | 4.15 |
| Court Document Alerts | 138.30 |
| Filing Fees | 200.00 |
| Ground Transportation (Taxis, car service) | 103.30 |
| Hotels (Travel) | 641.76 |
| Meals | 3,431.34 |
| Outside Photocopy Services | 285.82 |
| Research Charges | 2,309.87 |

Total 7,649.50

Detailed Statement of Expenses During Interim Period

| Date | Name | Cost Category | Cost Narrative | Amount |
|---------|-----------------------|-----------------------|--|----------|
| 5/21/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 5/21/2024 | \$17.19 |
| 5/21/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/21/2024 | \$37.90 |
| 5/22/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 5/22/2024 | \$201.42 |
| 5/22/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/22/2024 | \$0.80 |
| 5/23/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 5/23/2024 | \$34.39 |
| 5/23/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/23/2024 | \$0.70 |
| 5/24/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Filing Fees | Motion to appear PHV filing fee for J. Cuevas | \$100.00 |
| 5/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 5/24/2024 | \$68.78 |
| 5/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/24/2024 | \$0.90 |
| 5/24/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Air Travel | In-flight WiFi for Jesse-Justin Cuevas on 05/24/24 | \$8.00 |
| 5/25/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/25/2024 | \$1.00 |
| 5/26/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/26/2024 | \$1.00 |
| 5/27/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/27/2024 | \$0.40 |
| 5/28/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 5/28/2024 | \$103.17 |
| 5/28/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/28/2024 | \$2.30 |
| 5/29/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/29/2024 | \$1.10 |
| 5/30/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/30/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 5/30/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Air Travel | In-flight WiFi for Jesse-Justin Cuevas on 05/30/24 | \$8.00 |
| 5/31/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 5/31/2024 | \$34.39 |
| 5/31/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 5/31/2024 | \$0.30 |

| Date | Name | Cost Category | Cost Narrative | Amount |
|-------------|-----------------------|----------------------------|--|---------------|
| 5/31/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Meals | Dinner on 05/31/24 with John Zachry; Jay Old; Mohsin Meghji; Bojan Guzina; Ralph Biediger; Kirk McDonald; Charles Koster; Andrew O'Neill; Michael Andolina; John Thomas; Barrett Lingle; Brian Griffith; Richard W. Hess | \$3,411.16 |
| 6/1/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/1/2024 | \$0.10 |
| 6/2/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/2/2024 | \$0.10 |
| 6/3/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Outside Photocopy Services | Document download and flash drive | \$121.78 |
| 6/3/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/3/2024 | \$0.10 |
| 6/4/24 | Hess, Richard W. | Air Travel | In-flight WiFi for Richard W. Hess on 06/04/24 | \$8.00 |
| 6/4/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/4/2024 | \$2.10 |
| 6/5/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/5/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 6/6/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/6/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/7/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/7/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/8/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/8/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 6/9/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/9/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/10/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/10/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/10/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 6/10/2024 | \$144.90 |
| 6/11/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/11/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/12/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/12/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 6/12/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 6/12/2024 | \$43.47 |
| 6/13/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/13/2024 | \$2.30 |
| 6/13/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 6/13/2024 | \$15.45 |
| 6/14/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/14/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/15/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/15/2024 | \$0.30 |

| Date | Name | Cost Category | Cost Narrative | Amount |
|-------------|-----------------------|----------------------------|---|---------------|
| 6/16/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/16/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/17/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/17/2024 | \$2.40 |
| 6/17/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 6/17/2024 | \$15.45 |
| 6/18/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Filing Fees | Filing fees for Pro Hac Vice application for J. Cuevas | \$100.00 |
| 6/18/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/18/2024 | \$2.40 |
| 6/18/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 6/18/2024 | \$374.85 |
| 6/19/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/19/2024 | \$0.10 |
| 6/19/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/19/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/19/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 6/19/2024 | \$88.65 |
| 6/20/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/20/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/20/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 6/20/2024 | \$14.49 |
| 6/20/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 6/20/2024 | \$637.44 |
| 6/20/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Outside Photocopy Services | Expense for obtaining entity information from Delaware Department of Corporations on 06/20/24 | \$20.00 |
| 6/21/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/21/2024 | \$8.20 |
| 6/22/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/22/2024 | \$2.90 |
| 6/23/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/23/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 6/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/24/2024 | \$3.10 |
| 6/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Outside Photocopy Services | Printing services on 6/24/24 | \$144.04 |
| 6/25/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/25/2024 | \$3.00 |
| 6/26/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/26/2024 | \$3.10 |
| 6/27/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/27/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 6/28/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/28/2024 | \$0.30 |

| Date | Name | Cost Category | Cost Narrative | Amount |
|-------------|-----------------------|-----------------------|--|---------------|
| 6/29/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/29/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 6/30/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 6/30/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 6/30/24 | | Research charges | LexisNexis - Research charges, 06/01/2024 - 06/30/2024 | \$42.81 |
| 7/1/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/1/2024 | \$0.60 |
| 7/2/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 7/2/2024 | \$45.37 |
| 7/2/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/2/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/3/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/3/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/4/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/4/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/5/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/5/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/6/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/6/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/7/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/7/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/8/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/8/2024 | \$3.30 |
| 7/9/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/9/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/10/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/10/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/11/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 7/11/2024 | \$30.25 |
| 7/11/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/11/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/12/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/12/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/13/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 7/13/2024 | \$30.25 |
| 7/13/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/13/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/14/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 7/14/2024 | \$30.25 |
| 7/14/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/14/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/15/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 7/15/2024 | \$43.89 |
| 7/15/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/15/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/16/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | B/W Prints | Reproduction Copy Charges | \$4.15 |
| 7/16/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 7/16/2024 | \$75.62 |

| Date | Name | Cost Category | Cost Narrative | Amount |
|-------------|-----------------------|-----------------------|--|---------------|
| 7/16/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/16/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/17/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 7/17/2024 | \$105.87 |
| 7/17/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/17/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 7/18/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/18/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/19/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/19/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/20/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/20/2024 | \$3.30 |
| 7/21/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/21/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 7/22/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/22/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/23/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 7/23/2024 | \$90.75 |
| 7/23/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/23/2024 | \$0.50 |
| 7/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Research charges | WESTLAW - Research charges; 7/24/2024 | \$15.12 |
| 7/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/24/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/25/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/25/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/26/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/26/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/27/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/27/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/28/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/28/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/29/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/29/2024 | \$0.30 |
| 7/30/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/30/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 7/31/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 7/31/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/1/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/1/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/2/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/2/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/3/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/3/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/4/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/4/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 8/5/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/5/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/6/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/6/2024 | \$0.20 |

| Date | Name | Cost Category | Cost Narrative | Amount |
|-------------|-----------------------|--|--|---------------|
| 8/7/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/7/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/9/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/9/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/10/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/10/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/11/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Ground Transportation (Taxis, car service) | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Taxi for Jesse-Justin Cuevas on 08/11/24 | \$33.59 |
| 8/11/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Hotels (Travel) | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Hotel - Lodging for Jesse-Justin Cuevas on 08/11/24 | \$538.00 |
| 8/11/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Hotels (Travel) | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Hotel - Room Tax for Jesse-Justin Cuevas on 08/11/24 | \$103.76 |
| 8/11/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Air Travel | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Airfare for Jesse-Justin Cuevas on 08/11/24 | \$291.98 |
| 8/11/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/11/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/12/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Ground Transportation (Taxis, car service) | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Taxi for Jesse-Justin Cuevas on 08/12/24 | \$36.49 |
| 8/12/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Meals | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Breakfast on 08/12/24 | \$3.78 |
| 8/12/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/12/2024 | \$6.20 |
| 8/13/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Air Travel | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Airfare for Jesse-Justin Cuevas on 08/13/24 | \$218.98 |
| 8/13/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Ground Transportation (Taxis, car service) | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Taxi for Jesse-Justin Cuevas on 08/13/24 | \$33.22 |
| 8/13/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Meals | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Breakfast on 08/13/24 | \$12.50 |

| Date | Name | Cost Category | Cost Narrative | Amount |
|-------------|-----------------------|-----------------------|--|---------------|
| 8/13/24 | Cuevas, Jesse-Justin | Meals | Travel expense for Zachry Final Approval hearing. - Meal - Other on 08/13/24 | \$3.90 |
| 8/13/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/13/2024 | \$0.90 |
| 8/14/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/14/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/15/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/15/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 8/16/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/16/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/17/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/17/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 8/18/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/18/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/19/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/19/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/20/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/20/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/21/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/21/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 8/22/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/22/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 8/23/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/23/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/24/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/24/2024 | \$3.20 |
| 8/25/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/25/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/26/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/26/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/27/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/27/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/28/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/28/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/29/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/29/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/30/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/30/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/31/24 | Harrison, Geoffrey L. | Court Document Alerts | Pacer - Court Document Alerts; 8/31/2024 | \$0.20 |
| 8/31/24 | | Research charges | LexisNexis - Research charges 08/01/2024 - 08/31/2024 | \$5.65 |

Total \$7,649.50