

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

TRICIDA, INC.,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 23-10024 (JTD)

Objection Deadline: July 11, 2023 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)
Hearing Date: July 18, 2023 at 3:00 p.m. (ET)

**SUMMARY SHEET TO THE FIFTH MONTHLY AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF
KURTZMAN CARSON CONSULTANTS LLC, AS ADMINISTRATIVE
ADVISOR TO THE DEBTOR, FOR THE PERIOD FROM
JANUARY 11, 2023 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 12, 2023**

General Information

Name of Applicant:	Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
Authorized to Provide Services to:	The above-captioned debtor
Petition Date:	January 11, 2023
Date of Retention Order:	February 6, 2023, effective as of January 11, 2023
Type of Application:	Final

Summary of Fees and Expenses Sought in the Fee Application

Period for Which Compensation and Reimbursement is Sought in the Fee Application:	January 11, 2023 through June 12, 2023
Amount of Monthly Compensation Sought as Actual, Reasonable, and Necessary for the Fee Period:	\$20,604.44
Amount of Monthly Expense Reimbursement Sought as Actual, Reasonable, and Necessary for the Fee Period:	\$0.00
Amount of Final Compensation and Expense Reimbursement Request for the Fee Period:	\$105,945.09

¹ The Debtor in this chapter 11 case, together with the last four digits of the Debtor's federal tax identification number, is Tricida, Inc. (2526). The Debtor's service address is 2108 N Street, Suite 4935, Sacramento, CA 95816.



Prior Applications Filed:

<i>Type of Application</i>	<i>Date Filed/ Docket No.</i>	<i>Period Covered</i>	<i>Requested</i>		<i>Amount Paid</i>		<i>Amount Outstanding</i>	
			<i>Fees</i>	<i>Expenses</i>	<i>Fees</i>	<i>Expenses</i>	<i>Fees</i>	<i>Expenses</i>
Monthly	3/8/2023; 280	1/11/2023 – 1/31/2023	\$41,339.15 (80% of \$51,673.94)	\$0.00	\$41,339.15	\$0.00	\$10,334.79	\$0.00
Monthly	3/27/2023; 333	2/1/2023 – 2/28/2023	\$6,171.69 (80% of \$7,714.61)	\$0.00	\$6,171.69	\$0.00	\$1,542.92	\$0.00
Monthly	4/28/2023; 417	3/1/2023 – 3/31/2023	\$15,458.05 (80% of \$19,322.56)	\$0.00	\$15,458.05	\$0.00	\$3,864.51	\$0.00
Monthly	5/16/2023; 469	4/1/2023 – 4/30/2023	\$5,303.63 (80% of \$6,629.54)	\$0.00	\$5,303.63	\$0.00	\$1,325.91	\$0.00

Amounts Not Previously Requested:

<i>Period Covered</i>	<i>Fees</i>	<i>Expenses</i>
5/1/2023 – 5/31/2023	\$20,604.44	\$0.00

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Contract Review	93	\$15,097.17
Schedules & Statements	176.4	\$31,016.49
Solicitation	333.4	\$59,831.43
Totals	602.8	\$105,945.09

COMPENSATION BY INDIVIDUAL

Initials	Name	Position	Hours	Rate	Total
AAE	Andres Estrada	Solicitation Consultant	1.3	\$ 182.75	\$ 237.58
AGN	Adam Gorman	Solicitation Consultant	150.0	\$ 182.75	\$ 27,412.52
ASK	Ashley Kuarasingh	Solicitation Consultant	32.0	\$ 174.25	\$ 5,575.87
BIF	Bianca Barrera	Consultant	6.6	\$ 158.25	\$ 1,044.46
CJI	Cooper Ide	Technical Programming Consultant	5.0	\$ 80.75	\$ 403.75
DIM	Diana Mauricio	Consultant	3.1	\$ 158.25	\$ 490.58
DPM	Dan McSwigan	Solicitation Consultant	58.4	\$ 174.25	\$ 10,176.28
EAG	Esmeralda Aguayo	Consultant	1.5	\$ 158.25	\$ 237.38
HBU	Hannah Bussey	Consultant	7.1	\$ 158.25	\$ 1,123.57
IPA	Isabel Padilla	Consultant	5.0	\$ 158.25	\$ 791.24
JEE	James Lee	Securities Consultant	51.0	\$ 182.75	\$ 9,320.23
JNG	Jennifer Ngo	Solicitation Consultant	28.4	\$ 182.75	\$ 5,190.09
JTN	Jonathan Thomson	Solicitation Consultant	26.5	\$ 174.25	\$ 4,617.63
KVR	Kevin Martin	Solicitation Consultant	26.9	\$ 182.75	\$ 4,915.98
LRA	Luis Rios	Consultant	6.0	\$ 158.25	\$ 949.50
LYP	Lydia Do	Solicitation Consultant	1.0	\$ 174.25	\$ 174.25
MCL	Mikayla Cleary	Consultant	7.5	\$ 158.25	\$ 1,186.88
MWC	Matthew Canty	Consultant	5.2	\$ 158.25	\$ 822.90
PJM	Patrick Morrow	Solicitation Consultant	1.2	\$ 182.75	\$ 219.30
SMZ	Stanley Martinez	Solicitation Consultant	91.3	\$ 174.25	\$ 15,909.03
SUS	Sumesh Srivastava	Senior Consultant	37.8	\$ 163.25	\$ 6,209.36
SZA	Sonia Zapien	Consultant	3.4	\$ 158.25	\$ 538.06
TPE	Thomas Peterson	Consultant	4.1	\$ 158.25	\$ 648.83
VRQ	Vanessa Triana	Senior Managing Consultant	1.0	\$ 165.75	\$ 165.75
WRG	William Gruber	Solicitation Consultant	41.5	\$ 182.75	\$ 7,584.07
	TOTALS		602.8		\$105,945.09

Total Incurred:	\$105,945.09
Blended Rate:	\$175.75

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

TRICIDA, INC.,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 23-10024 (JTD)

Objection Deadline: July 11, 2023 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)
Hearing Date: July 18, 2023 at 3:00 p.m. (ET)

**FIFTH MONTHLY AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF KURTZMAN
CARSON CONSULTANTS LLC, AS ADMINISTRATIVE
ADVISOR TO THE DEBTOR, FOR THE PERIOD FROM
JANUARY 11, 2023 THROUGH AND INCLUDING JUNE 12, 2023**

Pursuant to Sections 330 and 331 of Title 11 of the United States Code, §§ 101-1532 (the “Bankruptcy Code”), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules”), Rule 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “Local Rules”), and the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals*, dated February 6, 2023 [Docket No. 152] (the “Interim Compensation Order”), Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC (“KCC”), administrative advisor for the above-captioned debtor (the “Debtor”), hereby submits its final fee application (this “Fee Application”) for allowance of compensation for professional services provided in the amount of \$105,945.09 and authorization of any amounts outstanding for the period from January 11, 2023 through and including June 12, 2023 (the “Fee Period”). In support of this Fee Application, KCC represents as follows:

¹ The Debtor in this chapter 11 case, together with the last four digits of the Debtor’s federal tax identification number, is Tricida, Inc. (2526). The Debtor’s service address is 2108 N Street, Suite 4935, Sacramento, CA 95816.

JURISDICTION

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the “Court”) has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334 and the *Amended Standing Order of Reference* from the United States District Court for the District of Delaware, dated February 29, 2012. This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2), and KCC confirms its consent pursuant to Local Rule 9013-1(f) to the entry of a final order by the Court in connection with this Fee Application to the extent that it is later determined that the Court, absent consent of the parties, cannot enter final orders or judgments in connection herewith consistent with Article III of the United States Constitution.

2. Venue in this Court is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

3. The statutory bases for the relief requested herein are section 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2016, and Local Rules 2016-1 and 2016-2.

BACKGROUND

4. On January 11, 2023 (the “Petition Date”), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code.

5. On the Petition Date, the Debtor filed an application to employ KCC as its claims and noticing agent (in such capacity, the “Claims and Noticing Agent”) pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 156(c) and Local Rule 2002-1(f) [Docket No. 3] (the “Section 156(c) Application”), which was approved by the Court on January 13, 2023 [Docket No. 42] (the “Section 156(c) Order”).

6. Given that the administration of these chapter 11 cases would require KCC to perform duties outside the scope of 28 U.S.C. § 156(c), the Debtor supplemented the Section 156(c) Application with the application to retain KCC to perform certain services as the Debtor’s administrative advisor in these chapter 11 cases (in such capacity, the “Administrative Advisor”). Accordingly, on January 19, 2023, the Debtor filed the *Debtor’s Application for Entry of Order*

(I) Authorizing the Retention and Employment of Kurtzman Consultants LLC as Administrative Advisor, Effective as of the Petition Date; and (II) Granting Related Relief [Docket No. 83]. On February 6, 2023, the Court entered the *Order (I) Authorizing the Retention and Employment of Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC as Administrative Advisor, Effective as of the Petition Date; and (II) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 155] (the “Retention Order”). The Retention Order authorized the Debtor to compensate KCC in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, the United States Trustee Fee Guidelines and any orders entered in these cases governing professional compensation and reimbursement for services rendered and charges and disbursements incurred.

7. The Retention Order authorizes KCC to provide the following services:
 - (a) assisting with, among other things, the preparation of the Debtor’s schedules of assets and liabilities, schedules of executory contracts and unexpired leases and statements of financial affairs;
 - (b) assisting with, among other things, solicitation, balloting, tabulation and calculation of votes, as well as preparing any appropriate reports required in furtherance of confirmation of any chapter 11 plan;
 - (c) generating an official ballot certification and testifying, if necessary, in support of the ballot tabulation results for any chapter 11 plan(s) in the chapter 11 cases;
 - (d) generating, providing and assisting with claims objections, exhibits, claims reconciliation and related matters;
 - (e) providing such other claims processing, noticing, solicitation, balloting and administrative services, but not those included in the Section 156(c) Application, as may be requested by the Debtor from time to time.

8. The amounts sought in this Application do not include any fees that may be payable by the Debtor for services provided by KCC under the Section 156(c) Order. Procedures for the payment of such fees and disbursements are separately addressed in the Section 156(c) Order.

Additionally, no fees and disbursements for services provided to the Debtor under the Retention Order are or will be sought to be paid under the Section 156(c) Order.

9. All services for which compensation is requested by KCC were performed on behalf of the Debtor.

SUMMARY AND VALUATION OF SERVICES

10. The amount of time spent by each employee providing services to the Debtor for the Fee Period is detailed in line item listings of time entries and descriptive detail set forth herein and in the invoice attached hereto as Exhibit A. These are KCC's normal hourly rates of compensation for work of this character. The reasonable value of the services rendered by KCC for the Fee Period as Administrative Advisor to the Debtor in these chapter 11 cases is \$105,945.09 due for fees. KCC is not seeking reimbursement for any expenses in this Application.

11. During the Fee Period, KCC's professionals spent 93 hours assisting the Debtor and its professionals with the review of contracts for inclusion in the Schedules of Assets and Liabilities and Statements of Financial Affairs (the "Schedules and Statements").

12. KCC professionals additionally performed 176.4 hours of work related to assisting the Debtor with preparing the Schedules and Statements. This included frequent communication with the Debtor and its professionals regarding data, timelines, preparation status, and updates. Additionally, KCC gathered, organized, and tracked the Schedule and Statement data, prepared and updated multiple drafts of the Schedules and Statements, and performed quality assurance related thereto.

13. KCC professionals also performed 333.4 of hours of work related to the Debtor's solicitation, including reviewing and commenting on solicitation documents and procedures, preparing and updating the voting amount spreadsheet, communicating with external parties

regarding the solicitation mailing, and communicating with the Debtor regarding the solicitation process and status. Additionally KCC professionals completed the setup of internal systems for ballot processing, prepared email service, and communicated with the Debtor regarding the solicitation process and status. KCC further reviewed and processed ballots and performed quality assurance related thereto, responded to inquiries regarding the solicitation, tabulated ballots and prepared voting status reports, prepared the voting certification, and attended the confirmation hearing.

14. KCC believes that the time entries included in Exhibit A are in compliance with the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2.

15. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, KCC submits that the amount requested is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of these cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Left Blank]

CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, KCC respectfully requests that the Court enter an Order: (i) granting the Fee Application and allowing compensation in the amount of \$105,945.09; (ii) directing payment by the Debtor of any amounts outstanding; and (iii) granting such other and further relief as the Court deems just and proper.

Dated: June 20, 2023
El Segundo, California

/s/ Sarah Harbuck

KURTZMAN CARSON CONSULTANTS LLC

Sarah Harbuck

Drake D. Foster

222 N. Pacific Coast Highway, 3rd Floor

El Segundo, California 90245

Tel: 310.751.1539

Administrative Advisor to the Debtor

CERTIFICATION

I, Sarah Harbuck, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, state as follows:

- a) I am Assistant General Counsel of the applicant firm, Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC.
- b) I am familiar with the work performed by Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC on behalf of the Debtor.
- c) I have reviewed the foregoing Fee Application and the facts set forth therein are true and correct to the best of my knowledge, information and belief. Moreover, I have reviewed Local Rule 2016-2, and submit that the Fee Application substantially complies with such order.

I certify, under penalty of perjury, that the foregoing statements are true to the best of my knowledge, information, and belief.

Dated: June 20, 2023
El Segundo, California

/s/ Sarah Harbuck

Sarah Harbuck

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

TRICIDA, INC.,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 23-10024 (JTD)

Objection Deadline: July 11, 2023 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

Hearing Date: July 18, 2023 at 3:00 p.m. (ET)

NOTICE OF MONTHLY AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that the *Fifth Monthly and Final Fee Application of Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC, as Administrative Advisor to the Debtor, for the Period from January 11, 2023 Through and Including June 12, 2023* (the "Application") has been filed with the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware (the "Court"). The Application seeks monthly allowance of fees in the amount of \$20,604.44, monthly expenses in the amount of \$0.00, and final compensation and expense reimbursement in the amount of \$105,945.09.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections to the Application, if any, are required to be filed on or before **July 11, 2023 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)** (the "Objection Deadline") with the Clerk of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware, 3rd Floor, 824 N. Market Street, Wilmington, Delaware 19801. You must also serve any such objection so as to be received by the following on or before the Objection Deadline: (i) counsel to the Debtor: (a) Sidley Austin LLP, 555 W. 5th Street, Los Angeles, CA 90013, Attn: Julia Phillips Roth (julia.roth@sidley.com), and (b) Young Conway Stargatt & Taylor, LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Sean M. Beach (sbeach@ycst.com) and Allison S. Mielke (amielke@ycst.com); and (ii) the U.S. Trustee, J. Caleb Boggs Building, 844 King Street, Suite 2207, Lockbox 35, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Timothy J. Fox Jr., (timothy.fox@usdoj.gov).

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT, PURSUANT TO THE ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF PROFESSIONALS [DOCKET NO. 152], IF NO OBJECTIONS ARE FILED AND SERVED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE PROCEDURES, THE DEBTOR WILL BE AUTHORIZED TO PAY 80% OF THE REQUESTED FEES AND 100% OF THE REQUESTED EXPENSES WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER OF THE COURT.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT A HEARING TO CONSIDER APPROVAL OF THE FINAL FEE APPLICATION WILL BE HELD ON JULY 18, 2023 AT 3:00 P.M. (ET) BEFORE THE HONORABLE JOHN T. DORSEY, IN THE UNITED STATES

¹ The Debtor in this chapter 11 case, together with the last four digits of the Debtor's federal tax identification number, is Tricida, Inc. (2526). The Debtor's service address is 2108 N Street, Suite 4935, Sacramento, CA 95816.

BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE, 824 N. MARKET STREET,
5TH FLOOR, COURTROOM NO. 5, WILIMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801.

Dated: June 20, 2023
Wilmington, Delaware

/s/ Allison S. Mielke

**YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT &
TAYLOR, LLP**

Sean M. Beach (No. 4070)
Allison S. Mielke (No. 5934)
Andrew A. Mark (No. 6861)
Carol E. Cox (No. 6936)

Rodney Square
1000 North King Street
Wilmington, Delaware 19801
Telephone: (302) 571-6600
Facsimile: (302) 571-1253
Emails: sbeach@ycst.com
amielke@ycst.com
amark@ycst.com
ccox@ycst.com

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Samuel A. Newman (admitted *pro hac vice*)
555 West Fifth Street
Los Angeles, California 90013
Telephone: (213) 896-6000
Facsimile: (213) 896-6600
Email: sam.newman@sidley.com

Charles M. Persons (admitted *pro hac vice*)
Jeri Leigh Miller (admitted *pro hac vice*)
Chelsea McManus (admitted *pro hac vice*)
2021 McKinney Avenue, Suite 2000
Dallas, Texas 75201
Telephone: (214) 981-3300
Facsimile: (213) 981-3400
Email: cpersons@sidley.com
jeri.miller@sidley.com
cmcmanus@sidley.com

Michael Sabino (admitted *pro hac vice*)
787 7th Avenue
New York, New York 10019
Telephone: (212) 839-5300
Facsimile: (212) 839-5599
Email: msabino@sidley.com

Counsel to the Debtor, Tricida, Inc.

EXHIBIT A



February 24, 2023

Tricida, Inc.
Tricida, Inc.
7000 Shoreline Court, Suite 201
South San Francisco CA 94080

Re: Tricida, Inc.
USBC Case No. 23-10024

Dear Tricida, Inc.:

Enclosed please find Kurtzman Carson Consultants' ("KCC") invoice for the period January 1, 2023 to January 31, 2023 in the amount of \$51,673.94 for the above referenced matter. Pursuant to our services agreement, KCC's invoice is due upon receipt.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (310) 751-1803 or egershbein@kccllc.com.

Sincerely,
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Evan Gershbein".

Evan Gershbein
EVP Restructuring

Enclosures

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

Account Number	70956FA	Invoice Date	February 24, 2023
Invoice Number	US_KCC2438691	Due Date	Due upon receipt

Tricida, Inc.
Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>Hourly Fees</u>	
Hourly Fees Charged	\$51,673.94
Total of Hourly Fees	\$51,673.94
<u>Expenses</u>	
Expenses	\$0.00
Total Expenses	\$0.00
Invoice Subtotal	\$51,673.94
Sales and Use Tax	0.00
Total Invoice	\$51,673.94

Please detach and return this portion of the statement with your check to KCC.
Please reference your Account Number and Invoice Number on your Remittance.

Account Number 70956FA
Invoice Number US_KCC2438691
Total Amount Due \$51,673.94

Check Payments to:
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
Dept CH 16639
Palatine, IL 60055-6639

Wire Payments to:
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
HSBC Bank, NA
452 Fifth Avenue, New York, NY 10018
Account # 000183571
FED ABA # 021001088
ACH Routing # 022000020

Amount Paid \$

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Total Hourly Fees by Employee

<u>Initial</u>	<u>Employee Name</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
AGN	Adam Gorman	SOL	64.30	\$182.75	\$11,750.81
BIF	Bianca Barrera	CON	6.60	\$158.25	\$1,044.46
CJI	Cooper Ide	TPC	5.00	\$80.75	\$403.75
DIM	Diana Mauricio	CON	3.10	\$158.25	\$490.58
DPM	Dan McSwigan	SOL	57.90	\$174.25	\$10,089.16
EAG	Esmeralda Aguayo	CON	1.50	\$158.25	\$237.38
HBU	Hannah Bussey	CON	7.10	\$158.25	\$1,123.57
IPA	Isabel Padilla	CON	5.00	\$158.25	\$791.24
JEE	James Lee	SEC	10.30	\$182.75	\$1,882.31
JNG	Jennifer Ngo	SOL	1.00	\$182.75	\$182.75
JTN	Jonathan Thomson	SOL	7.10	\$174.25	\$1,237.17
KVR	Kevin Martin	SOL	3.70	\$182.75	\$676.18
LRA	Luis Rios	CON	6.00	\$158.25	\$949.50
MCL	Mikayla Cleary	CON	7.50	\$158.25	\$1,186.88
MWC	Matthew Canty	CON	5.20	\$158.25	\$822.90
SMZ	Stanley Martinez	SOL	24.50	\$174.25	\$4,269.11
SUS	Sumesh Srivastava	SC	34.30	\$163.25	\$5,599.48
SZA	Sonia Zapien	CON	3.40	\$158.25	\$538.06
TPE	Thomas Peterson	CON	4.10	\$158.25	\$648.83
VRQ	Vanessa Triana	SMC	1.00	\$165.75	\$165.75
WRG	William Gruber	SOL	41.50	\$182.75	\$7,584.07
			Total		\$51,673.94

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/11/2023	LRA	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	4.00
1/11/2023	TPE	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	1.80
1/11/2023	HBU	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	3.60
1/11/2023	BIF	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	4.70
1/11/2023	DIM	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	1.50
1/11/2023	IPA	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	2.50
1/11/2023	SZA	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	1.10
1/11/2023	VRQ	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	SMC	Contract Review	1.00
1/11/2023	SUS	Administrative review of active executory contracts for corresponding data and noticing information for inclusion in SOAL G and contract cure schedule; update and revise master tracking file re same; correspondence with KCC Team re same	SC	Contract Review	4.30
1/11/2023	SUS	Coordinate and oversee quality control review of contracts reviewed for inclusion in SOAL G	SC	Contract Review	3.40
1/11/2023	MWC	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	4.30
1/11/2023	SUS	Update and revise master tracking file re active executory contracts for corresponding data and noticing information; correspondence with KCC Team re same	SC	Contract Review	3.70
1/11/2023	SUS	Update and revise master tracking file re active executory contracts for corresponding data and noticing information; correspondence with KCC Team re same	SC	Contract Review	3.70
1/11/2023	AGN	Review contract detail re contract cures and SOAL G	SOL	Contract Review	1.60
Total for 1/11/2023					41.20
1/12/2023	AGN	Prepare for and attend SOFA/SOAL kick-off call	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.50
1/12/2023	AGN	Prepare draft templates and forms for SOFA/SOAL	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.90
1/12/2023	LRA	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	2.00
1/12/2023	TPE	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	2.30
1/12/2023	HBU	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	2.50
1/12/2023	BIF	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	1.90
1/12/2023	DIM	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	1.60
1/12/2023	EAG	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	0.30
1/12/2023	IPA	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	2.50
1/12/2023	MCL	Quality control review of contracts reviewed for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	2.30
1/12/2023	SZA	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	2.30
1/12/2023	DPM	Prepare master tracking sheets in preparation for data to be received	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/12/2023	DPM	Review several emails pertaining to schedule preparation	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/12/2023	DPM	Prepare and review blank forms requested from counsel	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/12/2023	DPM	Attend teleconference call with company, SierraCapital Partners re: schedule preparation	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.00
1/12/2023	DPM	Discussion with KCC team re: follow-up to schedule preparation call	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.10
1/12/2023	WRG	Review internal correspondence re case status	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/12/2023	WRG	Review correspondence re certain SOFA and SOAL issues; prepare correspondence re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/12/2023	WRG	Update SOFA and SOAL templates; prepare master files	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/12/2023	SUS	Administrative review of active executory contracts for corresponding data and noticing information for inclusion in SOAL G and contract cure schedule; update and revise master tracking file re same; correspondence with KCC Team re same	SC	Contract Review	1.40
1/12/2023	SUS	Coordinate and oversee quality control review of contracts reviewed for inclusion in SOAL G	SC	Contract Review	2.20
1/12/2023	MWC	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	0.90
1/12/2023	SUS	Administrative review of contract data and noticing information; correspondence with KCC Team re same	SC	Contract Review	2.70
1/12/2023	SUS	Review contracts for inclusion in SOAL G	SC	Contract Review	2.60
Total for 1/12/2023					34.10
1/13/2023	AGN	Update and revise DS Motion re solicitation details	SOL	Solicitation	2.80
1/13/2023	AGN	Prepare draft and template materials for SOFA/SOALs	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.10
1/13/2023	AGN	Research DE precedent materials re rolling record date for solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	2.00
1/13/2023	DPM	Discussion with KCC scheduling team re: follow-up to preparation call, preparation for receiving data	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/13/2023	DPM	Review precedent on schedules prepared on similar project	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/13/2023	WRG	Update Status Tracker; discussion with KCC team re certain SOFA and SOAL issues	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/13/2023	WRG	Research treatment of certain SOFA questions for precedent case	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/13/2023	WRG	Discussion with KCC Team re status	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/13/2023	SUS	Administrative review of active executory contracts for corresponding data and noticing information for inclusion in SOAL G and contract cure schedule; update and revise master tracking file re same; correspondence with KCC Team re same	SC	Contract Review	1.40
Total for 1/13/2023					10.20
1/16/2023	AGN	Update and revise draft, template, and tacking materials for SOFA/SOALs; update various SOFA questions 11-32 re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.40
1/16/2023	AGN	Review and update DS Motion	SOL	Solicitation	2.20
1/16/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to master tracking sheet per correspondence from Company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
Total for 1/16/2023					5.00
1/17/2023	AGN	Prepare draft and template materials for SOFA/SOALs; update various SOFA/SOAL questions re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.50
1/17/2023	MCL	Coordinate and oversee quality control review of contracts reviewed for inclusion in SOAL G	CON	Contract Review	3.00
1/17/2023	DPM	Review several emails re: schedule data received from company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/17/2023	DPM	Prepare SOFA 4 data for input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.00
1/17/2023	DPM	Prepare SOFA 7 data for input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.00
1/17/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 9 data per correspondence from Company; input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/17/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 26d data per correspondence from Company; input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/17/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 28 data per correspondence from Company; input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/17/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to Schedule AB3 data per correspondence from Company; input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/17/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to master tracking sheet per correspondence from Company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/17/2023	DPM	Prepare global updates to Schedules data in KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/17/2023	DPM	Prepare Schedule A/B 60 data for input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.40
1/17/2023	DPM	Perform quality review of Schedules and SOFAs data in KCC CaseView to ensure accuracy and completeness	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.50
1/17/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)re comments on recent updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/17/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)re SOFA updates and prepare same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/17/2023	WRG	Update SOFA Question 4	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.10
1/17/2023	WRG	Update Status Tracker	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/17/2023	WRG	Update SOFA 28	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/17/2023	WRG	QC SOFA and SOAL updates per 1/17 correspondence	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	3.70
1/17/2023	SUS	Administrative review of active executory contracts for corresponding data and noticing information for inclusion in SOAL G and contract cure schedule; correspondence with KCC Team re same	SC	Contract Review	3.50
1/17/2023	JNG	Review draft solicitation materials; team meeting to discuss any comments re the same	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
1/17/2023	JNG	Review draft ballots and opt out forms	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
1/17/2023	KVR	Review of draft Equity beneficial and master Opt Out Forms	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
1/17/2023	KVR	Review of draft Disclosure Statement Motion, provided comments	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
1/17/2023	KVR	Reviewed draft Class 3 Ballot re beneficial holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
1/17/2023	KVR	Review of draft Solicitation Procedures, provided comments to securities team	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
1/17/2023	KVR	Review of draft Class 3 beneficial and master ballot, provided comments to securities team	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
1/17/2023	KVR	Review of J Lee Class 3 beneficial and master ballot redline documents, confirmed all securities team comments incorporate for forwarding to counsel	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
1/17/2023	KVR	Communication with team re equity eligibility to participate in Opt Out election	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
1/17/2023	MCL	Quality control review of contracts reviewed for inclusion in SOAL G	CON	Contract Review	2.20
1/17/2023	SUS	Update and revise master tracking file re active executory contracts for corresponding data and noticing information; correspondence with KCC Team re same	SC	Contract Review	2.10
1/17/2023	JEE	Review plan provisions for class 3 noteholder treatment	SEC	Solicitation	0.80
1/17/2023	JEE	Review and comment on draft ballots and opt out forms	SEC	Solicitation	2.30
1/17/2023	JEE	Emails w/ counsel re: comments to non-voting notice and opt out forms for equity	SEC	Solicitation	0.30
1/17/2023	JEE	Research precedent documents for master/bene ballots and opt out forms	SEC	Solicitation	0.70
1/17/2023	JEE	Office conferences w/ case team re: upcoming solicitation and mailing timings	SEC	Solicitation	0.40
1/17/2023	JEE	Coordinate w/ case team and production re: upcoming services	SEC	Solicitation	0.50
1/17/2023	JEE	Emails w/ counsel re: comments to solicitation procedures and documents	SEC	Solicitation	0.50
1/17/2023	JEE	Review draft solicitation procedures, ballots and notices	SEC	Solicitation	1.50
1/17/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: draft solicitation procedures	SEC	Solicitation	0.30
1/17/2023	JEE	Review draft disclosure statement motion	SEC	Solicitation	1.30
Total for 1/17/2023					41.80

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/18/2023	AGN	Review and update DS motion; correspondence with counsel re same	SOL	Solicitation	1.80
1/18/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with case professionals regarding preparation of schedules and statements and status of same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/18/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of Motion to Approve DS [Docket No. 74] in preparation for upcoming solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	1.10
1/18/2023	HBU	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	1.00
1/18/2023	EAG	Review contracts for inclusion in Schedule G	CON	Contract Review	1.20
1/18/2023	DPM	Review Status report in preparation for status update call	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/18/2023	DPM	Attend teleconference call with Sidley Austin, Young Conaway, SierraCapital Partners, Company re: Schedule And SOFA preparation and additional work needed to complete	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/18/2023	DPM	Correspondence with KCC Case Team re SOFA/SOAL master tracking sheet updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.10
1/18/2023	DPM	Discussion with KCC Case Team re: necessity for backend work need to prepare schedules	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.10
1/18/2023	DPM	Coordinate schedule detail update with case team	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/18/2023	WRG	Review recent updates to ensure properly recorded in KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.70
1/18/2023	WRG	Update Status Tracker for recent updates in preparation for teleconference	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/18/2023	WRG	Teleconference with company, Sidley & Austin, Young Conaway, SierraCapital Partners and KCC personnel re SOFA and SOAL preparation status and timing	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/18/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to SOFA and SOAL working group re status	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/18/2023	WRG	Revise correspondence to SOFA and SOAL working group	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/18/2023	SUS	Administrative review of contract data and noticing information; correspondence with KCC Team re same	SC	Contract Review	2.60
1/18/2023	SUS	Coordinate and oversee quality control review of contracts reviewed for inclusion in Schedule G	SC	Contract Review	0.70
1/18/2023	JTN	Review documents, prepare for and finalize Plan and Disclosure Statement materials for solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	1.00
1/18/2023	JEE	Review filed Plan, Disclosure Statement and DS Approval Motion	SEC	Solicitation	1.00
1/18/2023	JEE	Emails w/ counsel re: mechanics of solicitation to class 3 noteholders	SEC	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 1/18/2023					15.90
1/19/2023	AGN	Review plan details re De Minimis class	SOL	Solicitation	1.40
1/19/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of solicitation materials and prepare solicitation service overview for KCC case team review	SOL	Solicitation	1.60
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare SOFA 2 data for input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare SOFA 3 data for input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.80
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare SOFA 11 data for input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare SOFA 20 data for input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare SOFA 26 data for input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to master tracking sheet per correspondence with Company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare address redactions per correspondence from counsel	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare email correspondence regarding schedule preparation progress and status of updates received to date	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare SOFA summary reports to perform quality control of all SOFA data received to date	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/19/2023	DPM	Prepare Schedule summary reports to perform quality control of all SOFA data received to date	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/19/2023	DPM	Teleconference discussion with company re: schedule and SOFA preparation	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.90
1/19/2023	DPM	Attention to several emails related to schedule and SOFA preparation	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/19/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A Yoshiyama (Tricida) re new SOFA and SOAL updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/19/2023	WRG	Update SOAL A/B 3, Part 1 for recent updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/19/2023	WRG	Update SOAL A/B 39, Part 7 for recent updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/19/2023	WRG	Update SOAL A/B 40, Part 7 for recent updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/19/2023	WRG	Update Status Tracker for updates received 1/18	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/19/2023	WRG	Review updates to SOFA to ensure properly reflected in KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/19/2023	WRG	Review updates to SOAL to ensure properly reflected in KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/19/2023	WRG	Teleconference with A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) re open issues with SOFA and SOAL	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.90
1/19/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to A Yoshiyama (Tricida) re SOFA 7 plaintiff information	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/19/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to A Yoshiyama (Tricida) re SOAL E/F Part 1 potential creditors	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/19/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from C Jayasekera (Tricida) re certain E/F Part 2 creditors	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/19/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from C Jayasekera (Tricida) re E/F Part 2 litigation parties	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/19/2023	JTN	Review documents, prepare for and finalize Plan and Disclosure Statement materials for solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	2.70
Total for 1/19/2023					16.30
1/20/2023	AGN	Review draft SOFA	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.50
1/20/2023	AGN	Update draft and template materials for SOFA/SOALs; update various SOFA/SOAL questions re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.70
1/20/2023	SMZ	Perform quality review of draft SOFA for Debtor to ensure accuracy and completeness	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.90
1/20/2023	DPM	Attention to several emails related to schedule and SOFA preparation	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to master email tracking sheet per correspondence with Company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare Schedule EF2 - Litigation data for input into KCC CaseView per correspondence from Counsel	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 3 data per correspondence from Counsel re: individual redactions	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 11 per correspondence from company re: updated amounts	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 4 per correspondence from Company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to master tracking sheet per correspondence with Company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare Schedule AB73 data for input into KCC CaseView per correspondence from Company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.10
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to various Schedules per correspondence from Company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/20/2023	DPM	Perform quality review of SOFAs data in KCC CaseView to ensure accuracy and completeness	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.00
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare cover pages and Global Notes placeholders	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/20/2023	DPM	Generate and review SOFA drafts	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/20/2023	DPM	Prepare comments and updates re SOFA Drafts and missing data to date	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/20/2023	WRG	Review correspondence with A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) re certain disputed tax issues	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/20/2023	WRG	Update SOAL question A/B 3 per correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/20/2023	WRG	Update SOAL question A/B 8 per correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/20/2023	WRG	Update SOAL question A/B 55 per correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/20/2023	WRG	Update SOAL Part 10 per correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/20/2023	WRG	Update SOAL Part 11 per correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/20/2023	WRG	Update SOAL question A/B 75 per correspondence from C. Jayasekera (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/20/2023	WRG	Update SOAL question A/B 72 per correspondence re A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/20/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to C. Jayasekera re SOAL A/B 75 and E/F Part 2	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/20/2023	WRG	Update SOAL question A/B 72 per correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/20/2023	WRG	Verify recent updates to KCC CaseView for recent SOFA updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.00
1/20/2023	WRG	Review draft SOFA to templates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/20/2023	WRG	Update Status Tracker for recent updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/20/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to SOFA and SOAL preparation team re SOFA and SOAL open issues and comments	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/20/2023	AGN	Review contract detail re contract cures and SOAL G	SOL	Contract Review	2.30
Total for 1/20/2023					19.90
1/21/2023	AGN	Update and revise draft, template, and tacking materials for SOFA/SOALs; update various SOLA D - E/F Part 2 questions re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.50
Total for 1/21/2023					2.50
1/22/2023	AGN	Update and revise draft, template, and tacking materials for SOFA/SOALs; update SOAL G re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	3.10
Total for 1/22/2023					3.10
1/23/2023	AGN	Update and revise draft, template, and tacking materials for SOFA/SOALs; update SFOA 3 & 9 questions re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.60
1/23/2023	AGN	Prepare for and attend SOFA/SOAL call	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.00
1/23/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding status of schedules and SOFA for debtor and remaining open items	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/23/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of SOAL G data and prepare for schedule template as well as KCC case team review	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.90
1/23/2023	SMZ	Perform quality review of draft Schedules and SOFA for Debtor to ensure accuracy and completeness	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.70
1/23/2023	SMZ	Review and compare SOAL G parties without an address against the current creditor matrix as well as list of all vendors with disbursements paid for relevant noticing information to be included in draft schedule	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.60
1/23/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding updates to schedule G noticing information	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/23/2023	SMZ	Review and update draft schedule G file and exhibit	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/23/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of schedule G counterparties without an address and prepare correspondence to Sierra Constellation regarding contact information for same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/23/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 3 data per correspondence received from company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.10
1/23/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 11 data in KCC CaseView per correspondence received from company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.90
1/23/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 4 payment dates in KCC CaseView per correspondence received from company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/23/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to KCC Master tracking sheets per information received and reviewed from Company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/23/2023	DPM	Generate and review SOFA drafts; prepare comments and updates re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/23/2023	DPM	Generate and review Schedule drafts; prepare comments and updates re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/23/2023	DPM	Teleconference call with KCC Case Team, KCC Scheduling team re: final AP data, timing for Schedule and SOFA preparation	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/23/2023	DPM	Generate and review Schedule drafts; prepare correspondence with comments re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/23/2023	DPM	Generate and review SOFA drafts; prepare correspondence with comments re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/23/2023	WRG	Update SOAL questions A/B 19, 20 and 22 per correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/23/2023	WRG	Update SOAL A/B 72 per correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/23/2023	WRG	Review SOFA data summary to templates to ensure all updates accurately stated	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/23/2023	WRG	Review SOAL data summary to templates to ensure all updates accurately stated	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/23/2023	WRG	Prepare SOFA and SOAL cover pages	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/23/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to J. Miller (Sidley Austin) re certain SOAL issue	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/23/2023	WRG	Teleconference with KCC Team re SOFA and SOAL status and open issues	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/23/2023	WRG	Review draft of SOAL for recent updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/23/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A. Yoshiyama(Tricida) re SOFA question 3 open questions	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/23/2023	WRG	Update Status Tracker for recent updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/23/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to SOFA and SOAL preparation team re open issues and comments	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/23/2023	JTN	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding status of schedules and SOFA for debtor and remaining open items	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/23/2023	JTN	Administrative quality control review of schedules and SOFA	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.30
1/23/2023	AGN	Review contract detail re contract cures and SOAL G	SOL	Contract Review	2.00
Total for 1/23/2023					22.40
1/24/2023	AGN	Update and revise draft, template, and tacking materials for SOFA/SOALs; update SOAL G and SOAL E/F Part 1 & 3 questions re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	3.00
1/24/2023	SMZ	Attend telephonic meeting with counsel, company and SierraConstellation team to discuss current schedule/SOFA drafts as well as various pending open items	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.40
1/24/2023	SMZ	Administrative review insurance policies and insurance carriers identified in Insurance Motion [Docket No. 5] for inclusion in schedule G	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.50
1/24/2023	SMZ	Prepare and format insurance policy data for inclusion on Schedule G	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.30
1/24/2023	SMZ	Review and compare updated schedule G data against current creditor matrix for inclusion of all relevant noticing information	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/24/2023	SMZ	Perform web research of noticing information for no address schedule G parties	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/24/2023	DPM	Prepare for hosting of teleconference call by reviewing status of information received to date and preparing questions to review	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/24/2023	DPM	Host teleconference call with Company, Sidley Austin, Young Conaway, SierraCapital Partners re Schedules & SOFA updates and review data and forms received to date; prepare updates to master tracking sheet re meeting notes and updates to tracking sheets	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.50
1/24/2023	DPM	Follow-up discussion with KCC Scheduling team re updated teleconference notes and updates to Schedules and SOFA	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/24/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to A. Mielke (Young Conaway) re conference call	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/24/2023	WRG	Discussion with KCC Team re SOFA and SOAL preparation status	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/24/2023	WRG	Attention to correspondence from R. Gorog (SierraCapital) re SOFA and SOAL open items	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/24/2023	WRG	Teleconference with company, Sidley Austin, Young Conaway, SierraCapital Partners and KCC personnel re SOFA and SOAL open issues	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.40
Total for 1/24/2023					12.60
1/25/2023	AGN	Update draft and template materials for SOFA/SOALs; update various SOFA/SOAL questions re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.00
1/25/2023	AGN	Prepare E/F part 1 & 2	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.50
1/25/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of updated AP aging report received from SierraConstellation team and prepare schedule EF Part 2 for KCC case team review	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.30
1/25/2023	SMZ	Format and import new schedule EF Part 1 and 2 parties into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/25/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding supplemental updates to schedule G	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/25/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of Employee Wage Motion [Docket No. 8] for referenced insurance plans to be included in schedule G and correspond with KCC case team re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/25/2023	SMZ	Format and import new schedule G parties into KCC CaseView	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.60
1/25/2023	CJI	Uploaded Schedule EF_Part1 records under dm request 19951	TPC	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/25/2023	CJI	Imported Schedule EF Part2 records under dm request 19951	TPC	Schedules & SOFA	1.00
1/25/2023	CJI	Updates to EF Parts 1 and 2 under DM request 19951	TPC	Schedules & SOFA	1.50
1/25/2023	CJI	Imported Schedule G under dm request 19951	TPC	Schedules & SOFA	2.00
1/25/2023	DPM	Attention to several emails relating to schedule preparation	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/25/2023	DPM	Added several emails to schedule email tracking system	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/25/2023	DPM	Discussion with KCC Scheduling team re: additional SOFA and schedule information received	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/25/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 3 per correspondence from company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/25/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 11 data in KCC CaseView per correspondence from company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/25/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 9 data in KCC CaseView per correspondence from company; balanced to original data sent	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/25/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 4 data in KCC CaseView per correspondence from company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/25/2023	DPM	Review and applied updates to KCC Master tracking sheets for correspondence received from company and applied to schedule data	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/25/2023	DPM	Prepare EF1 data for loading into KCC CaseView, confirmed data loaded correctly	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/25/2023	DPM	Prepare EF2 data for loading into KCC CaseView, confirmed data loaded correctly	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.20
1/25/2023	DPM	Prepare Schedule G data for loading into KCC CaseView, confirmed data loaded correctly	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.40
1/25/2023	DPM	Prepare quality review of schedule data in KCC CaseView for accuracy and completeness	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.80
1/25/2023	WRG	Update SOFA and SOAL per discussion on 1/24 conference call including SOFA questions 3,4,7,9,11,20,28 and SOAL questions A/B 3, 8, 55, 72,73,75, Schedules D, E/F Part 2 and G	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.30
1/25/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) re certain SOAL updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/25/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) re SOAL Schedule E/F Part 2	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/25/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from J. Miller (Sidley Austin) re SOAL question A/B 72	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/25/2023	WRG	Review draft SOAL Schedule G for certain contracts	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/25/2023	AGN	Finalize contract detail re contract cures and SOAL G	SOL	Contract Review	2.30
Total for 1/25/2023					29.60
1/26/2023	AGN	Update draft and template materials for SOFA/SOALs; update various SOFA/SOAL questions re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.60
1/26/2023	AGN	Review draft SOFA/SOAL	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.80
1/26/2023	SMZ	Perform quality review of updated draft Schedule and SOFA and correspond with KCC case team re update to same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.60
1/26/2023	SMZ	Attend telephonic meeting with counsel, company and SierraConstellation team regarding review of updated schedule/SOFA drafts as well as various pending open items	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/26/2023	SMZ	Review and respond to inquiry from KCC case team regarding updates to schedule G creditor redactions	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/26/2023	DPM	Review updates to SOFA and Schedules received and applied to date	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/26/2023	DPM	Review Schedule and SOFA attachments in KCC CaseView for accuracy and completeness	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/26/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to Schedule EF 2 per request from Counsel	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/26/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to Schedule EF 2 per request from Counsel	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/26/2023	DPM	Prepare for upcoming teleconference call, review status, schedules, and templates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/26/2023	DPM	Prepare for and host teleconference call with Sidley Austin, Young Conaway, SierraCapital Partners, company re Schedules & SOFA updates, review data received to date, and schedule hard copies	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/26/2023	DPM	Prepare additional updates to address to be redacted on Schedule EF 2, G	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/26/2023	WRG	Review recent updates to SOFA and SOAL to data summaries from KCC CaseView for accuracy and completeness	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.80
1/26/2023	WRG	Review updated draft SOFA and SOAL	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/26/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) re SOFA 4 open items	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/26/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) re SOFA 28	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/26/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence with KCC Team re open issues	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/26/2023	WRG	Update SOFA question 28 for correspondence from C. Jayaskera (Tricida)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/26/2023	WRG	Correspondence with A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) re meeting of creditors	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/26/2023	WRG	Teleconference with company, Sidley Austin, Young Conaway, SierraCapital Partners and KCC personnel re SOFA and SOAL preparation status and open issues	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/26/2023	WRG	Update SOAL A/B 72 and redact certain Schedule G records per teleconference	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/26/2023	JTN	Conference with Sidley Austin LLP re Schedule Prep check-in	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
Total for 1/26/2023					15.50
1/27/2023	AGN	Update draft and template materials for SOFA/SOALs; update various SOFA/SOAL questions re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.60
1/27/2023	AGN	Review draft SOFA/SOAL	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.40
1/27/2023	AGN	Finalize SOAL G	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.80
1/27/2023	AGN	Finalize SOAL E/F Part 1 & 2	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.00
1/27/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to Schedule EF 2 per correspondence from Counsel	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/27/2023	DPM	Generate and review Schedules and SOFA drafts	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/27/2023	DPM	Review global note drafts provided from Counsel; prepared comments re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/27/2023	DPM	Running and reviewing schedule drafts, prepared correspondence re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/27/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from J Miller (Sidley) re open Schedule G issues	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/27/2023	WRG	Redact additional Schedule G records	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/27/2023	WRG	Review draft Global Notes and prepare correspondence to C McManus (Sidley) re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/27/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to SOFA and SOAL preparation team re updated draft SOFA and SOAL	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
Total for 1/27/2023					11.50
1/29/2023	AGN	Update draft and template materials for SOFA/SOALs; update various SOFA/SOAL questions re same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	2.40
Total for 1/29/2023					2.40
1/30/2023	SMZ	Attend telephonic meeting with counsel, company and SierraConstellation team regarding final review of updated schedule/SOFA drafts and filing of same	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.90
1/30/2023	SMZ	Preform quality checks of various Schedule G noticing updates input into KCC CaseView and correspond with KCC case team re same in preparation for upcoming service of bar date notice	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/30/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding service of schedules to schedule D, EF Part1 and Part 2 parties	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/30/2023	DPM	Review status and provided forms in preparation for upcoming conference call	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/30/2023	DPM	Prepare for and host teleconference call with Sidley Austin, Young Conaway, SierraCapital Partners re: page turn of latest draft schedules produced and review status of case	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.10
1/30/2023	DPM	Discussion with KCC Scheduling team re: follow-up to teleconference call and how to proceed	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/30/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to KCC master tracking sheets with updated necessary from discussion	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/30/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to Schedule G per information received on conference call	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/30/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to Schedule EF 2 per information received on teleconference call	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.60
1/30/2023	DPM	Generate and review Schedule drafts	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.00
1/30/2023	DPM	Generate and review SOFA drafts	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/30/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to SOFA 4 per request from Company removing STD/LTD payroll information	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.10

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
1/30/2023	DPM	Generate and review SOFA Drafts	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/30/2023	DPM	Prepare additional updates to SOFA 4 per correspondence from company	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/30/2023	WRG	Teleconference with company, Sidley Austin, Young Conaway, SierraCapital Partners and KCC personnel re latest draft SOFA and SOAL	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
1/30/2023	WRG	Update SOAL A/B 55, 73, E/F Part 2, G for issues raised on 1/30 conference call	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.80
1/30/2023	WRG	Perform quality review to ensure that SOFA and SOAL drafts reflect recent changes and are in agreement with Status Tracker and Master Templates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	1.00
1/30/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) re SOFA question 4	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/30/2023	WRG	Revie correspondence from S. Corwen (SierraCapital)re certain Schedule G additions	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/30/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A. Mielke (Young Conaway)re certain issues to SOFA 4	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/30/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to A. Yoshiyama (Tricida)re resolution of SOFA 4 issues	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/30/2023	WRG	Update SOAL E/F Part 2 and G per correspondence from S. Corwen (SierraCapital)	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/30/2023	WRG	Review correspondence from A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) re SOFA 4	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.20
1/30/2023	WRG	Review recent updates to SOFA and SOAL to ensure they reflect recent updates	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
1/30/2023	WRG	Prepare correspondence to Tricida SOFA and SOAL preparation team	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/30/2023	WRG	Review correspondences from J. Miller (Sidley), A. Mielke (Young Conaway) and A. Yoshiyama (Tricida) approval of file-ready versions of SOFA and SOAL	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.30
1/30/2023	JTN	Conference with Sidley Austin LLP re Schedules Final Review	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.90
Total for 1/30/2023					15.00
1/31/2023	JEE	Review draft schedules and SOFA for equity and notes issues	SEC	Schedules & SOFA	0.40
1/31/2023	DPM	Update and revise SOFA/SOAL master tracking sheet	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.70
Total for 1/31/2023					1.10
Total Hours					300.10

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Expenses

Description

Units

Rate

Amount

Total Expenses



March 23, 2023

Tricida, Inc.
Tricida, Inc.
7000 Shoreline Court, Suite 201
South San Francisco CA 94080

Re: Tricida, Inc.
USBC Case No. 23-10024

Dear Tricida, Inc.:

Enclosed please find Kurtzman Carson Consultants' ("KCC") invoice for the period February 1, 2023 to February 28, 2023 in the amount of \$7,714.61 for the above referenced matter. Pursuant to our services agreement, KCC's invoice is due upon receipt.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (310) 751-1803 or egershbein@kccllc.com.

Sincerely,
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Evan Gershbein".

Evan Gershbein
EVP Restructuring

Enclosures

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

Account Number	70956FA	Invoice Date	March 23, 2023
Invoice Number	US_KCC2439046	Due Date	Due upon receipt

Tricida, Inc.
Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>Hourly Fees</u>	
Hourly Fees Charged	\$7,714.61
Total of Hourly Fees	\$7,714.61
<u>Expenses</u>	
Expenses	\$0.00
Total Expenses	\$0.00
Invoice Subtotal	\$7,714.61
Sales and Use Tax	0.00
Total Invoice	\$7,714.61

Please detach and return this portion of the statement with your check to KCC.
Please reference your Account Number and Invoice Number on your Remittance.

Account Number 70956FA
Invoice Number US_KCC2439046
Total Amount Due \$7,714.61

Check Payments to:
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
Dept CH 16639
Palatine, IL 60055-6639

Wire Payments to:
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
HSBC Bank, NA
452 Fifth Avenue, New York, NY 10018
Account # 000183571
FED ABA # 021001088
ACH Routing # 022000020

Amount Paid \$

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

02/01/2023 - 02/28/2023

Total Hourly Fees by Employee

<u>Initial</u>	<u>Employee Name</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
AGN	Adam Gorman	SOL	21.00	\$182.75	\$3,837.75
ASK	Ashley Kuarasingh	SOL	2.20	\$174.25	\$383.34
DPM	Dan McSwigan	SOL	0.50	\$174.25	\$87.12
JEE	James Lee	SOL	1.70	\$182.75	\$310.68
JTN	Jonathan Thomson	SOL	3.00	\$174.25	\$522.76
KVR	Kevin Martin	SOL	3.40	\$182.75	\$621.36
SMZ	Stanley Martinez	SOL	11.20	\$174.25	\$1,951.60
			Total		\$7,714.61

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

02/01/2023 - 02/28/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
2/2/2023	DPM	Prepare updates to final SOAL and SOFA templates per request from Sierra Constellation Partners	SOL	Schedules & SOFA	0.50
Total for 2/2/2023					0.50
2/14/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: upcoming solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 2/14/2023					0.20
2/15/2023	AGN	Prepare draft voting amount spreadsheet for solicitation (1.6); review claims re same (.5); update class structure re class 5 & 6 (.3)	SOL	Solicitation	2.40
Total for 2/15/2023					2.40
2/17/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
Total for 2/17/2023					0.10
2/21/2023	AGN	Prepare for and attend case status conference re solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	1.00
2/21/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding upcoming solicitation and preparation of draft voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
Total for 2/21/2023					1.40
2/22/2023	AGN	Prepare draft voting amount spreadsheet for solicitation (1.9); update and revise solicitation documents re same (.8)	SOL	Solicitation	2.70
2/22/2023	AGN	Prepare custom merge draft ballot documents re Classes 1, 2, 4 & 5; quality control review re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.80
2/22/2023	SMZ	Correspond with counsel regarding upcoming solicitation and preparation for same	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
2/22/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated solicitation service overview and coordinate with KCC production regarding upcoming service of same	SOL	Solicitation	1.10
2/22/2023	SMZ	Prepare draft voting amount spreadsheet and correspond with KCC case team re potential updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	2.90
2/22/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of solicitation procedures in preparation for upcoming case solicitation and preparation of draft voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
2/22/2023	SMZ	Perform review of claims register for claims to be aggregated as part of solicitation voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	0.90
2/22/2023	KVR	Review of DS Motion, Plan and DS in preparation of DS Hearing and solicitation service	SOL	Solicitation	0.90
2/22/2023	JTN	Assist with setup of plan, voting classes, and ballot questions in KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	1.10
Total for 2/22/2023					13.00
2/23/2023	AGN	Prepare draft voting amount spreadsheet for solicitation (1.8); review claims re same (.7)	SOL	Solicitation	2.50
2/23/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of Proposed Revised Order on DS Motion [Docket No. 240] in preparation for upcoming case solicitation to ensure inclusion of all relevant procedures	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
2/23/2023	SMZ	Update draft voting amount spreadsheet and prepare correspondence to counsel for review of same	SOL	Solicitation	1.10
2/23/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding status of voting amount spreadsheet and updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	0.40

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

02/01/2023 - 02/28/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
2/23/2023	SMZ	Correspond and coordinate with securities team regarding upcoming solicitation to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
2/23/2023	JTN	Assist with setup of plan, voting classes, and ballot questions in KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	1.50
Total for 2/23/2023					6.40
2/24/2023	AGN	Prepare custom merge draft opt out forms re Classes 1 & 2; quality control review re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.50
2/24/2023	AGN	Prepare draft voting amount spreadsheet for solicitation (1.5); review claims re same (1.2)	SOL	Solicitation	2.70
2/24/2023	ASK	Coordinate with Mediant re solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
2/24/2023	ASK	Coordinate with Broadridge re solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
2/24/2023	ASK	Prepare Broadridge JEF re solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
2/24/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated draft voting amount spreadsheet and correspond with counsel re same	SOL	Solicitation	1.60
2/24/2023	JTN	Assist with setup of plan, voting classes, and ballot questions in KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
Total for 2/24/2023					8.10
2/27/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: prep for solicitation launch	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
2/27/2023	JEE	Email w/ counsel and case team re: adjournment of DS hearing and solicitation timeline	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
2/27/2023	AGN	Prepare draft voting amount spreadsheet for solicitation; quality control review against plan and solicitation procedures re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.10
2/27/2023	ASK	Prepare DTC request letter re Solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
2/27/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
2/27/2023	KVR	Review of email request for shareholder registered file from J Ngo to R Booth at Computershare	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
2/27/2023	KVR	Review of case team emails regarding DS Hearing adjournment and anticipated change to Voting Record Date	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
2/27/2023	KVR	Review of SPR email request from A Kuarsingh to DTC SPR, confirmed CUSIPs and record date	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
Total for 2/27/2023					4.70
2/28/2023	JEE	Call w/ class action re: service of opt out on historical equity holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
2/28/2023	JEE	Call w/ counsel and class action team re: service of opt out form on historical equity holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
2/28/2023	AGN	Prepare custom merge draft ballot and solicitation documents re Classes 1, 2, 4 & 5; quality control review re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.30
2/28/2023	ASK	Phone conference with case team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
2/28/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
2/28/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated draft voting amount spreadsheet and correspond with counsel re same	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
2/28/2023	KVR	Call w/ securities and L Cavallo on Class Action team to discuss Opt Out notice mailing to shareholders in a class period instead of record date in preparation of call with counsel	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
2/28/2023	KVR	Call w/ counsel re: Opt Out notice service to shareholder class period	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
2/28/2023	KVR	Call w/ J Lee re: review Opt Out Notice shareholder class period call with counsel	SOL	Solicitation	0.30

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

02/01/2023 - 02/28/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
				<i>Total for 2/28/2023</i>	6.20
				<i>Total Hours</i>	43.00

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

02/01/2023 - 02/28/2023

Expenses

Description

Units

Rate

Amount

Total Expenses



April 20, 2023

Tricida, Inc.
Tricida, Inc.
7000 Shoreline Court, Suite 201
South San Francisco CA 94080

Re: Tricida, Inc.
USBC Case No. 23-10024

Dear Tricida, Inc.:

Enclosed please find Kurtzman Carson Consultants' ("KCC") invoice for the period March 1, 2023 to March 31, 2023 in the amount of \$19,322.56 for the above referenced matter. Pursuant to our services agreement, KCC's invoice is due upon receipt.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (310) 751-1803 or egershbein@kccllc.com.

Sincerely,
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Evan Gershbein".

Evan Gershbein
EVP Restructuring

Enclosures

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

Account Number	70956FA	Invoice Date	April 20, 2023
Invoice Number	US_KCC2475738	Due Date	Due upon receipt

Tricida, Inc.
Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>Hourly Fees</u>	
Hourly Fees Charged	\$19,322.56
Total of Hourly Fees	\$19,322.56
<u>Expenses</u>	
Expenses	\$0.00
Total Expenses	\$0.00
Invoice Subtotal	\$19,322.56
Sales and Use Tax	0.00
Total Invoice	\$19,322.56

Please detach and return this portion of the statement with your check to KCC.
Please reference your Account Number and Invoice Number on your Remittance.

Account Number 70956FA
Invoice Number US_KCC2475738
Total Amount Due \$19,322.56

Check Payments to:
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
Dept CH 16639
Palatine, IL 60055-6639

Wire Payments to:
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
HSBC Bank, NA
452 Fifth Avenue, New York, NY 10018
Account # 000183571
FED ABA # 021001088
ACH Routing # 022000020

Amount Paid

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

03/01/2023 - 03/31/2023

Total Hourly Fees by Employee

<u>Initial</u>	<u>Employee Name</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
AAE	Andres Estrada	SOL	1.30	\$182.75	\$237.58
AGN	Adam Gorman	SOL	27.90	\$182.75	\$5,098.72
ASK	Ashley Kuarasingh	SOL	17.10	\$174.25	\$2,979.62
JEE	James Lee	SOL	6.60	\$182.75	\$1,206.14
JNG	Jennifer Ngo	SOL	14.10	\$182.75	\$2,576.77
JTN	Jonathan Thomson	SOL	16.40	\$174.25	\$2,857.70
KVR	Kevin Martin	SOL	3.20	\$182.75	\$584.80
LYP	Lydia Do	SOL	1.00	\$174.25	\$174.25
SMZ	Stanley Martinez	SOL	20.70	\$174.25	\$3,606.98
			Total		\$19,322.56

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

03/01/2023 - 03/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
3/1/2023	JEE	Review updated draft of opt out form for equity holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
3/1/2023	JEE	Emails w/ counsel re: comments to equity opt out form	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
3/1/2023	JEE	Call w/ case team re: establishing e-ballot site for registered holders' opt out form	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/1/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting amount spreadsheet re potential rolling bar date and stub bar date; research DE precedent re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.60
3/1/2023	KVR	Review of J Ngo opt out form comments and confirmed need to include beneficial and master opt out forms for equity holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
Total for 3/1/2023					3.90
3/2/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	1.60
Total for 3/2/2023					1.60
3/3/2023	JEE	Cancel solicitation jobs w/ nominee agents	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
3/3/2023	ASK	Prepare Broadridge JEF re solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/3/2023	ASK	Coordinate with Broadridge re solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/3/2023	ASK	Coordinate with Mediant re solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 3/3/2023					1.20
3/5/2023	JEE	Call w/ class action team and securities team re: opt out noticing for equity holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
3/5/2023	JEE	Call w/ counsel re: equity notice for opt outs	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
Total for 3/5/2023					0.90
3/6/2023	AGN	Revise voting amount spreadsheet re updated superseding claims	SOL	Solicitation	1.40
Total for 3/6/2023					1.40
3/8/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting amount spreadsheet re new timely filed claims; review amended and superseding claims re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.40
Total for 3/8/2023					2.40
3/9/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting amount spreadsheet re new timely filed claims; review amended and superseding claims re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.60
3/9/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated voting amount spreadsheet and correspond with KCC case team re updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	2.80
Total for 3/9/2023					5.40
3/10/2023	AAE	Admin review voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/10/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
3/10/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding potential updates to voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
3/10/2023	SMZ	Perform quality checks of updated voting amount spreadsheet and correspond with KCC case team re updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
3/10/2023	SMZ	Prepare draft correspondence to counsel and voting amount spreadsheet for review and preliminary approval in preparation for upcoming solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	1.10
3/10/2023	JTN	Assist with setup of plan, voting classes, and ballot questions in KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.70

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

03/01/2023 - 03/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Total for 3/10/2023					4.90
3/13/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting amount spreadsset	SOL	Solicitation	2.40
3/13/2023	SMZ	Prepare follow up correspondence to counsel regarding approval of updated voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/13/2023	KVR	Review of DS Motion for securities solicitation service	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
Total for 3/13/2023					3.00
3/14/2023	AAE	Review revisions to voting amount spreadsheet from counsel	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/14/2023	SMZ	Correspond with counsel regarding proposed changes to voting amount spreadsheet per Notice of Transfer [Docket No. 288]	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 3/14/2023					0.40
3/15/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	2.10
3/15/2023	JNG	Team meeting re solicitation draft materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
3/15/2023	JNG	Review and audit tax forms for name and tax id match	SOL	Solicitation	1.70
Total for 3/15/2023					4.10
3/17/2023	SMZ	Correspond and coordinate with KCC publications team regarding upcoming publication of Confirmation Hearing Notice	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
3/17/2023	SMZ	Prepare draft correspondence to counsel with pricing and deadline estimates for upcoming publication of Confirmation Hearing Notice in the San Jose Mercury News and New York Time	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
3/17/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	1.10
3/17/2023	JNG	Process master ballots for class 4 votes and update tabulation file accordingly	SOL	Solicitation	2.60
Total for 3/17/2023					4.40
3/20/2023	AAE	Review revised solicitation materials; coordinate with KCC team re same	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/20/2023	AAE	Coordinate with KCC team regarding record date and updating voting amount spreadsheet; admin review of same	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
3/20/2023	ASK	Phone conference with Broadridge re solicitation job set up	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
3/20/2023	ASK	Phone conference with Mediant re solicitation job set up	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
3/20/2023	ASK	Prepare Broadridge JEF re 3-21-23 solicitation record date	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/20/2023	ASK	Coordinate with Broadridge re solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/20/2023	ASK	Coordinate with Mediant re solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/20/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of received revised solicitation materials and correspond with KCC case team re potential updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	1.10
3/20/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding updated solicitation materials and upcoming case solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/20/2023	SMZ	Update solicitation mailing overview and coordinate with KCC production team regarding upcoming solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
3/20/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	0.90
3/20/2023	KVR	Review of revised draft solicitation documents; provided comments to securities team	SOL	Solicitation	0.90
3/20/2023	JTN	Quality Control and Review of Pre-Filing Drafts for Solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.80

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

03/01/2023 - 03/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Total for 3/20/2023					6.70
3/21/2023	ASK	Prepare DTC request letter re 3-21-23 solicitation record date	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/21/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
Total for 3/21/2023					0.60
3/22/2023	ASK	Coordinate with Mediant re updated solicitation record date	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 3/22/2023					0.20
3/23/2023	JEE	Prep for DS hearing, review pleadings related to DS issues	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
3/23/2023	AGN	Finalize ballot data for solicitation mailing	SOL	Solicitation	1.50
3/23/2023	ASK	Prepare Broadridge JEF re updated solicitation record date	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/23/2023	ASK	Coordinate with Broadridge re updated solicitation record date	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 3/23/2023					3.40
3/24/2023	JEE	Attend Disclosure Statement Hearing	SOL	Solicitation	1.50
3/24/2023	AGN	Finalize voting amount spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	2.00
3/24/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding upcoming case solicitation and preparation for same	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
3/24/2023	KVR	Communication w/ counsel re: DS Order anticipated to be entered on Monday, March 27 and confirmation voting record date will remain March 24	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
3/24/2023	JTN	Draft memo cover page for solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 3/24/2023					4.30
3/26/2023	AGN	Prepare balloting and noticing custom merge data for class 4	SOL	Solicitation	1.00
3/26/2023	AGN	Prepare balloting and noticing custom merge data for class 5	SOL	Solicitation	2.30
3/26/2023	AGN	Prepare balloting and noticing custom merge data for class 6	SOL	Solicitation	2.70
3/26/2023	AGN	Prepare balloting and noticing custom merge data for impaired class	SOL	Solicitation	2.10
3/26/2023	AGN	Prepare balloting and noticing custom merge data for unimpaired class	SOL	Solicitation	1.40
3/26/2023	SMZ	Update and review voting amount spreadsheet; correspond with KCC case team re same	SOL	Solicitation	0.90
3/26/2023	SMZ	Prepare and format Class 3, 5, 6 ballot mailing lists for import into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	2.90
3/26/2023	SMZ	Prepare and format customized Class 3 ballot mailing list for KCC production team review	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
3/26/2023	SMZ	Prepare and format customized Class 5 ballot mailing list for KCC production team review	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
3/26/2023	SMZ	Prepare and format customized Class 6 ballot mailing list for KCC production team review	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
3/26/2023	SMZ	Prepare and format customized unimpaired and impaired parties mailing list for KCC production team review	SOL	Solicitation	2.00
Total for 3/26/2023					17.00
3/27/2023	ASK	Prepare DTC request letter re 3-24-23 solicitation record date	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
3/27/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

03/01/2023 - 03/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
3/27/2023	JTN	Assist with Solicitation mailing, including preparing service lists, reviewing document, and performing quality checks	SOL	Solicitation	4.40
3/27/2023	JTN	Setup plan, voting classes, and ballot questions in KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
Total for 3/27/2023					6.40
3/28/2023	JEE	Follow up w/ case team re: solicitation issues	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare service lists re Class 3 solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
3/28/2023	ASK	Create Url re class 3 solicitation materials broadridge edelivery	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare Broadridge JEF re class 8 equity opt-out mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/28/2023	ASK	Create Url re class 8 equity opt-out materials broadridge edelivery	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare broadridge final JEF re class 8 equity opt-out mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare email service to banks and brokers re class 8 equity opt-out materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/28/2023	ASK	Submit first class PRF re class 8 equity opt-out mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/28/2023	ASK	Submit overnight PRF re class 8 equity opt-out mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare pack slip re class 8 equity opt-out mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare service lists re class 8 equity opt-out mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
3/28/2023	ASK	Format registered holder file re solicitation mailing to equity holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare broadridge final JEF re Class 3 solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare email service to banks and brokers re Class 3 solicitation materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
3/28/2023	ASK	Submit first class PRF re Class 3 Solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/28/2023	ASK	Submit overnight PRF re Class 3 Solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare pack slip re Class 3 solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare cover memo re Class 3 solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/28/2023	ASK	Review and approve samples re class 3 solicitation materials mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
3/28/2023	ASK	Prepare cover memo re class 8 equity opt-out mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
3/28/2023	JNG	Conference call with team re Tricida solicitation mailing	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
3/28/2023	JNG	Review service list and solicitation documents; team meetings re opt out forms to equity holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
3/28/2023	JNG	Review solicitation PRFs and drafted JEFs for accuracy	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
3/28/2023	JTN	Assist with Solicitation mailing of Class 4, 5, and 6 classes, including preparing service lists, reviewing document, and performing quality checks	SOL	Solicitation	2.80
Total for 3/28/2023					18.00
3/29/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: review of solicitation mailing	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/29/2023	JNG	Follow up with DTC re a previously requested SPR	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
3/29/2023	JNG	Conference call with team re Tricida solicitation mailing	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
3/29/2023	JNG	Review service list and solicitation documents; team meetings re opt out forms to equity holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
3/29/2023	JTN	Assist with Solicitation mailing, including preparing service lists, reviewing document, and performing quality checks	SOL	Solicitation	1.40
3/29/2023	JTN	Setup plan, voting classes, and ballot questions in KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	2.00
Total for 3/29/2023					5.10

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

03/01/2023 - 03/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
3/30/2023	AGN	Quality control review of proofs for class 4 ballots	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
3/30/2023	LYP	Review prepared eballots	SOL	Solicitation	1.00
3/30/2023	SMZ	Correspond with KCC case team regearing preparation of electronic ballots for voting classes	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
3/30/2023	JNG	Prepare email service to class 8 equity holders with opt-out materials and provide final JEF to Broadridge	SOL	Solicitation	1.70
3/30/2023	JNG	Review and audit email service list for all record date holders in class 3 and class 8	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
3/30/2023	JNG	Prepare email service to class 3 noteholders with voting materials and provide final JEF to Broadridge	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
3/30/2023	KVR	Review draft Class 3 and 8 email text for DTC participants, provided comments to securities team	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
3/30/2023	KVR	Review of draft Class 3 & 8 email text for Broadridge, confirmed documents titles and link correct	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
3/30/2023	JTN	Setup plan in KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	1.40
3/30/2023	JTN	Assist with Solicitation mailing, including preparing service lists, reviewing document, and performing quality checks	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
Total for 3/30/2023					8.30
3/31/2023	JEE	Respond to inquiries from nominees re: voting and opt out events	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
3/31/2023	JNG	Respond to security holder inquiries re solicitation materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
3/31/2023	JNG	Team meeting re status of Broadridge jobs re Class 3 voting and Class 8 Opt Outs	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
3/31/2023	JNG	Prepare final JEF re the Class 8 Equity Opt Out job event and provide to Broadridge	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
3/31/2023	KVR	Communication w/ DTC SPR confirming receipt of SPR	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
3/31/2023	JTN	Setup plan, voting classes, and ballot questions in KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	1.00
Total for 3/31/2023					4.70
Total Hours					108.30

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

03/01/2023 - 03/31/2023

Expenses

Description

Units

Rate

Amount

Total Expenses



May 15, 2023

Tricida, Inc.
Tricida, Inc.
7000 Shoreline Court, Suite 201
South San Francisco CA 94080

Re: Tricida, Inc.
USBC Case No. 23-10024

Dear Tricida, Inc.:

Enclosed please find Kurtzman Carson Consultants' ("KCC") invoice for the period April 1, 2023 to April 30, 2023 in the amount of \$6,629.54 for the above referenced matter. Pursuant to our services agreement, KCC's invoice is due upon receipt.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (310) 751-1803 or egershbein@kccllc.com.

Sincerely,
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Evan Gershbein".

Evan Gershbein
EVP Restructuring

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

Account Number	70956FA	Invoice Date	May 15, 2023
Invoice Number	US_KCC2494726	Due Date	Due upon receipt

Tricida, Inc.
Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>Hourly Fees</u>	
Hourly Fees Charged	\$6,629.54
Total of Hourly Fees	\$6,629.54
<u>Expenses</u>	
Expenses	\$0.00
Total Expenses	\$0.00
Invoice Subtotal	\$6,629.54
Sales and Use Tax	0.00
Total Invoice	\$6,629.54

Please detach and return this portion of the statement with your check to KCC.
Please reference your Account Number and Invoice Number on your Remittance.

Account Number 70956FA
Invoice Number US_KCC2494726
Total Amount Due \$6,629.54

Check Payments to:
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
Dept CH 16639
Palatine, IL 60055-6639

Wire Payments to:
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
HSBC Bank, NA
452 Fifth Avenue, New York, NY 10018
Account # 000183571
FED ABA # 021001088
ACH Routing # 022000020

Amount Paid

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023

Total Hourly Fees by Employee

<u>Initial</u>	<u>Employee Name</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
AGN	Adam Gorman	SOL	4.70	\$182.75	\$858.93
ASK	Ashley Kuarasingh	SOL	5.50	\$174.25	\$958.34
JEE	James Lee	SOL	5.20	\$182.75	\$950.30
JNG	Jennifer Ngo	SOL	7.60	\$182.75	\$1,388.89
KVR	Kevin Martin	SOL	1.90	\$182.75	\$347.21
SMZ	Stanley Martinez	SOL	12.20	\$174.25	\$2,125.87
			Total		\$6,629.54

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
4/2/2023	JEE	Admin review of service of solicitation materials and jobs set up at nominees' agents	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
Total for 4/2/2023					0.40
4/3/2023	AGN	Finalize post solicitation Voting Amount Spreadsheet	SOL	Solicitation	2.60
4/3/2023	ASK	Prepare COS draft re Solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
4/3/2023	ASK	Prepare COS exhibits re Solicitation mailing to securities parties	SOL	Solicitation	1.80
Total for 4/3/2023					5.60
4/4/2023	ASK	Coordinate with accounting re solicitation mailing Broadridge invoice	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
4/4/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding preparation of certificate of service for solicitation materials service	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
4/4/2023	SMZ	Administrative Review of Certificate of Service for solicitation mailing and correspond with KCC case team re updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	1.60
4/4/2023	JNG	Respond to Broadridge re solicitation materials and event details	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 4/4/2023					2.70
4/5/2023	ASK	Coordinate with Broadridge re solicitation mailing wire confirmation	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
4/5/2023	SMZ	Review and respond to inquiry from Laura Calhoun at Worldwide Clinical Trials Limited requesting solicitation materials and related Class 5 ballot	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
4/5/2023	JNG	Team meeting re status of solicitation event	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
Total for 4/5/2023					1.30
4/6/2023	JEE	Follow up w/ Broadridge re: voting job setup and VIF for class 3 notes class	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
4/6/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
Total for 4/6/2023					0.50
4/7/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/7/2023	JEE	Respond to inquiries from nominees re: solicitation documents	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
4/7/2023	SMZ	Administrative Review of updated Certificate of Service for solicitation materials mailing and correspond with KCC case team re updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	2.80
4/7/2023	JNG	Review solicitation email service to nominees for noteholders in Class 3	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
4/7/2023	JNG	Review solicitation email service to nominees for noteholders in Class 8	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 4/7/2023					4.40
4/10/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/10/2023	ASK	Respond to inquiry re solicitation materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/10/2023	JNG	Update registration master file with registration documents	SOL	Solicitation	2.70
4/10/2023	KVR	Communication w/ D Bay at BNP Parabis re: Class 8 Equity, forwarded solicitation materials per request	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
4/10/2023	KVR	Communication w/ D Bay at BNP Parabis confirming corporate actions team email address	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/10/2023	KVR	Communication w/ securities team re: updating corporate actions team email for DTC No. 2787 BNP Parabis	SOL	Solicitation	0.20

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
4/10/2023	KVR	Communication w/ A Choule at Wells Fargo re: Class 8 Equity, forwarded solicitation materials per request	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 4/10/2023					4.20
4/11/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/11/2023	AGN	Review preliminary and test ballot data	SOL	Solicitation	2.10
4/11/2023	JNG	Update registration master file with registration documents	SOL	Solicitation	2.90
Total for 4/11/2023					5.20
4/12/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/12/2023	JEE	Respond to inquiries from nominees re: solicitation documents	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
4/12/2023	ASK	Respond to inquiry re solicitation materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/12/2023	SMZ	Correspond with KCC operations team regarding received ballots to be input into KCC CaesView	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
4/12/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
4/12/2023	KVR	Communication w/ C Campos at Scotia Bank re: Class 8 solicitation materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 4/12/2023					2.30
4/13/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 4/13/2023					0.20
4/14/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/14/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 4/14/2023					0.50
4/17/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/17/2023	ASK	Respond to inquiry re solicitation materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/17/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
4/17/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
4/17/2023	KVR	Communication w/ T Tran at State Street re: common shares classified in Class 8, not entitled to vote but can elect the Opt Out of Release election	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
4/17/2023	KVR	Communication w/ P Sotanipanash at Scotia Bank re: Class 3 Notes, forwarded solicitation materials per request	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 4/17/2023					1.50
4/18/2023	JEE	Email w/ case team re: prep for confirmation hearing	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/18/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/18/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 4/18/2023					0.70
4/19/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/19/2023	JEE	Respond to inquiries from nominees re: voting and opt out events	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
4/19/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.20

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Total for 4/19/2023					0.90
4/20/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/20/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 4/20/2023					0.40
4/21/2023	JEE	Email w/ counsel re: preliminary voting results	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/21/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/21/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
4/21/2023	SMZ	Prepare Ballot Summary Report for the period ending April 21, 2023	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
4/21/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 4/21/2023					1.50
4/24/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/24/2023	ASK	Coordinate with accounting re March DTC SPR invoice	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
4/24/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/24/2023	JNG	Team meeting re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 4/24/2023					1.10
4/25/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
Total for 4/25/2023					0.10
4/26/2023	SMZ	Input various ballot updates into KCC CaseView per First and Second Omnibus Objections [DNs 403-404]	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
4/26/2023	JNG	Respond to nominee inquiries re solicitation materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
Total for 4/26/2023					2.00
4/27/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
4/27/2023	SMZ	Prepare Ballot Summary Report for the period ending April 27, 2023	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
Total for 4/27/2023					0.90
4/28/2023	SMZ	Prepare Ballot Summary Report for the period ending April 28, 2023	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
Total for 4/28/2023					0.70
Total Hours					37.10

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023

Expenses

<u>Description</u>	<u>Units</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
--------------------	--------------	-------------	---------------

Total Expenses



June 14, 2023

Tricida, Inc.
Tricida, Inc.
7000 Shoreline Court, Suite 201
South San Francisco CA 94080

Re: Tricida, Inc.
USBC Case No. 23-10024

Dear Tricida, Inc.:

Enclosed please find Kurtzman Carson Consultants' ("KCC") invoice for the period May 1, 2023 to May 31, 2023 in the amount of \$20,604.44 for the above referenced matter. Pursuant to our services agreement, KCC's invoice is due upon receipt.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (310) 751-1803 or egershbein@kccllc.com.

Sincerely,
Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Evan Gershbein".

Evan Gershbein
EVP Restructuring

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

Account Number	70956FA	Invoice Date	June 14, 2023
Invoice Number	US_KCC2514287	Due Date	Due upon receipt

Tricida, Inc.
Summary

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>Hourly Fees</u>	
Hourly Fees Charged	\$20,604.44
Total of Hourly Fees	\$20,604.44
<u>Expenses</u>	
Expenses	\$0.00
Total Expenses	\$0.00
Invoice Subtotal	\$20,604.44
Sales and Use Tax	0.00
Total Invoice	\$20,604.44

Please detach and return this portion of the statement with your check to KCC.
Please reference your Account Number and Invoice Number on your Remittance.

Account Number 70956FA

Invoice Number US_KCC2514287

Total Amount Due \$20,604.44

Amount Paid \$

Check Payments to:

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
Dept CH 16639
Palatine, IL 60055-6639

Wire Payments to:

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC
HSBC Bank, NA
452 Fifth Avenue, New York, NY 10018
Account # 000183571
FED ABA # 021001088
ACH Routing # 022000020

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

05/01/2023 - 05/31/2023

Total Hourly Fees by Employee

<u>Initial</u>	<u>Employee Name</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
AGN	Adam Gorman	SOL	32.10	\$182.75	\$5,866.31
ASK	Ashley Kuarasingh	SOL	7.20	\$174.25	\$1,254.57
JEE	James Lee	SOL	27.20	\$182.75	\$4,970.80
JNG	Jennifer Ngo	SOL	5.70	\$182.75	\$1,041.68
KVR	Kevin Martin	SOL	14.70	\$182.75	\$2,686.43
PJM	Patrick Morrow	SOL	1.20	\$182.75	\$219.30
SMZ	Stanley Martinez	SOL	22.70	\$174.25	\$3,955.47
SUS	Sumesh Srivastava	SOL	3.50	\$174.25	\$609.88
			Total		\$20,604.44

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

05/01/2023 - 05/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
5/1/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/1/2023	SMZ	Correspond with counsel regarding updated ballot tabulation results	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
Total for 5/1/2023					0.20
5/2/2023	JEE	Respond to inquiries from nominees re: voting instructions	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
5/2/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of inquiry from OrbiMed regarding received opt out form and correspond with KCC case team re treatment of same	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/2/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/2/2023	KVR	Communication w/ L Furtado at Wells Fargo re: Class 3 master ballot to be submitted by Broadridge	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/2/2023	KVR	Review of Tricida ballot email box for Class 3 Master Ballot submissions	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
5/2/2023	KVR	Communication and call w/ U Abbasi at Summer Road re: submission of Class 3 beneficial holder to nominee to ensure counted	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
Total for 5/2/2023					2.00
5/3/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: status of vote tabulations and trust creation issues	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/3/2023	SMZ	Prepare Ballot Summary Report for the period ending May 3, 2023	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/3/2023	KVR	Processed DTC No. 50 Morgan Stanley Class 3 Master Ballot	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/3/2023	KVR	Review of Tricida ballot email box for Class 3 Master Ballot submissions	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
5/3/2023	KVR	Communication w/ A Hoe at Morgan Stanley confirming receipt of Class 3 Master Ballot	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 5/3/2023					1.60
5/4/2023	JEE	Process master ballots received	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/4/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting amount spreadsheet re disputed voting claims	SOL	Solicitation	2.10
5/4/2023	AGN	Quality control review of ballot data re voting submissions and vote totals	SOL	Solicitation	1.50
5/4/2023	KVR	Communication w/ A Aboudrare at State Street re: Class 8 Master Opt Out from no acceptable for Class 3 Notes CUSIP 89610F AB7. Forwarded Class 3 Master Ballot and requested State Street resubmit	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/4/2023	KVR	Review of Class 8 Beneficial Holder Opt Out forms. Processed and contacted beneficial holders to request they submit opt out forms to their nominee	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/4/2023	KVR	Review of Tricida ballot email box for Class 3 Master Ballot submissions	SOL	Solicitation	0.90
Total for 5/4/2023					5.70
5/5/2023	JEE	Process master ballots received	SOL	Solicitation	1.00
5/5/2023	JEE	Prepare summary and detail exhibits for vote certification	SOL	Solicitation	1.10
5/5/2023	JEE	Respond to inquiries from nominees re: master ballot for votes and opt outs	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/5/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: audit of votes and prep of vote exhibits	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/5/2023	PJM	Administrative review of ballots input into KCC CaseView; prepare updates to data re same; prepare master Class 5 detail report for review	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
5/5/2023	AGN	Quality control review of ballot data re voting submissions and vote totals	SOL	Solicitation	2.80
5/5/2023	AGN	Prepare draft voting totals and schedule	SOL	Solicitation	2.50
5/5/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.30

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

05/01/2023 - 05/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
5/5/2023	SMZ	Prepare Ballot Summary Report for the period ending May 5, 2023	SOL	Solicitation	1.80
5/5/2023	SMZ	Review and update ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/5/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of correspondence from counsel regarding opt out form for creditor Ann Neilson and Luke Neilson; correspond with KCC case team re treatment of same	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/5/2023	SUS	Administrative quality control review of ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	3.50
5/5/2023	KVR	Review of Tricida ballot email box for Class 3 Master Ballot submissions	SOL	Solicitation	1.40
5/5/2023	KVR	Communication w/ A Gorman re: status of Class 3 master ballots and anticipated preliminary vote results available in the afternoon after the voting deadline	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/5/2023	KVR	Audit and final review of Class 3 master ballots	SOL	Solicitation	1.50
Total for 5/5/2023					18.50
5/8/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: plan vote and opt out status	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/8/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting report summary; correspond with counsel re same	SOL	Solicitation	1.70
Total for 5/8/2023					1.90
5/9/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: solicitation status	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/9/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting amount spreadsheet re un-returned ballots and abstained ballots	SOL	Solicitation	2.10
5/9/2023	AGN	Administrative review of final returned ballot data for certification	SOL	Solicitation	2.10
5/9/2023	SMZ	Correspond with KCC operations team regarding the administrative review of received ballots to ensure inclusion in updated voting report	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/9/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/9/2023	SMZ	Prepare Ballot Summary Report for the period ending May 9, 2023	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
5/9/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of correspondence from counsel regarding opt out form for creditors Ann Neilson and Luke Neilson and correspond with KCC case team re treatment of same	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/9/2023	KVR	Communication w/ case team confirming Class 3 tabulation results unchanged from voting deadline report	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 5/9/2023					6.50
5/10/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: outstanding solicitation issues	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/10/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting amount spreadsheet re disputed claims, returned mail, and opt-outs	SOL	Solicitation	2.10
5/10/2023	SMZ	Prepare draft voting certification for KCC case team review in preparation for upcoming confirmation hearing	SOL	Solicitation	2.80
5/10/2023	SMZ	Correspond with KCC operations team regarding status of Patheon ballot per inquiry from counsel	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/10/2023	SMZ	Review and respond to inquiry from counsel regarding status of Patheon ballot and potential receipt of same	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/10/2023	JNG	Team meeting re confirmation status and conference call with Sidley	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 5/10/2023					5.80
5/11/2023	JEE	Call w/ counsel re: plan support declarations and upcoming confirmation hearing	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
5/11/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: outstanding solicitation issues	SOL	Solicitation	0.10

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

05/01/2023 - 05/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
5/11/2023	AGN	Draft and prepare voting certification	SOL	Solicitation	1.70
5/11/2023	ASK	Process Master Opt-Out forms received	SOL	Solicitation	0.60
5/11/2023	ASK	Tabulate Master Opt-Out forms received	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
5/11/2023	ASK	Respond to inquiry re opt-out materials	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/11/2023	SMZ	Review and update draft voting certification and correspond with KCC case team re updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
5/11/2023	JNG	Team meeting re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/11/2023	KVR	Review of Tricida ballot email box for Class 8 Master Opt Out form submissions	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
5/11/2023	KVR	Communication w/ A Kuarsingh re: processing Mediant Class 8 Master Ballot submissions	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
Total for 5/11/2023					6.00
5/12/2023	JEE	Review draft vote certification	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/12/2023	JEE	Respond to inquiries from equity holders re: opt outs	SOL	Solicitation	0.70
5/12/2023	AGN	Update and revise draft voting certification and exhibits; correspondence with counsel re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.20
5/12/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/12/2023	SMZ	Review and prepare updated voting certification per KCC case team review comments	SOL	Solicitation	1.90
5/12/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/12/2023	SMZ	Administrative review of received ballot for Patheon Austria GmbH & Co KG and correspond with counsel regarding treatment of same	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/12/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated voting exhibits for final version of voting certification	SOL	Solicitation	1.90
5/12/2023	JNG	Team meeting re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/12/2023	KVR	Review of Tricida ballot email box for Class 8 Master Opt Out form submissions	SOL	Solicitation	1.10
5/12/2023	KVR	Review of draft tabulation declaration and Class 3 vote details exhibits, provided comments to case team for revisions	SOL	Solicitation	0.90
Total for 5/12/2023					9.80
5/15/2023	JEE	Emails w/ counsel re: updates to draft declarations	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/15/2023	JEE	Process master opt out forms received	SOL	Solicitation	1.40
5/15/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: review of opt outs and reports on same	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/15/2023	JEE	Review draft declaration re: class 8 equity opt outs	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
5/15/2023	JEE	Coordinate w/ case team re: opt out reports for registered equity holders and impaired equity holders who submitted POCs	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/15/2023	JEE	Research precedent of equity class opt out return rates	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
5/15/2023	JEE	Prepare exhibits of class 8 third party release opt outs	SOL	Solicitation	1.00
5/15/2023	JEE	Audit of class 8 equity opt out report	SOL	Solicitation	0.90
5/15/2023	JEE	Emails w/ case team re: prep for confirmation hearing and declarations re: vote tabulation and opt out reports	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
5/15/2023	JEE	Research opt out report from Canadian nominees	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
5/15/2023	AGN	Update and revise voting certification and exhibits	SOL	Solicitation	2.10
5/15/2023	AGN	Research DE precedent re re-solicitation of opt-out forms to Class 5,6 and 8	SOL	Solicitation	2.60
5/15/2023	ASK	Process Master Opt-Out forms received	SOL	Solicitation	1.80

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

05/01/2023 - 05/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
5/15/2023	ASK	Tabulate Master Opt-Out forms received	SOL	Solicitation	2.50
5/15/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/15/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding updates to voting certification exhibits	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/15/2023	SMZ	Review and update Opt Out summary exhibit as well as voting summary exhibit for inclusion in updated voting certification	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/15/2023	JNG	Review draft confirmation declaration	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/15/2023	JNG	Audit Broadridge opt out votes for accuracy; team meeting re status of the same	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
5/15/2023	JNG	Prepare historical data report for past cases with equity opt-out elections	SOL	Solicitation	1.90
5/15/2023	JNG	Review equity opt out election forms submitted via Broadridge and email	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/15/2023	KVR	Communication w/ R Colachagua at Broadridge confirming KCC has downloaded master ballots	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/15/2023	KVR	Audit and final review of all received Class 8 Master Opt Out forms	SOL	Solicitation	0.90
5/15/2023	KVR	Forwarded comments to Class 8 Tabulation file to securities team prior to exhibit preparation	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
Total for 5/15/2023					22.80
5/16/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: outstanding solicitation issues	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/16/2023	JEE	Follow up w/ Broadridge re: additional information on nominees submitting opt outs	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/16/2023	AGN	Finalize Gorman Voting Certification; correspondence with client re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.20
5/16/2023	AGN	Coordinate updated voting details re voting extensions	SOL	Solicitation	1.50
5/16/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/16/2023	SMZ	Review ballots input into KCC CaseView	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/16/2023	SMZ	Prepare final exhibits for voting certification and perform various quality checks of same	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
5/16/2023	JNG	Team meeting re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/16/2023	KVR	Review of recent cases with Equity Opt Out elections, confirmed tabulation results and forwarded comments to J Lee	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
Total for 5/16/2023					6.60
5/17/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: outstanding solicitation issues and prep for confirmation hearing	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
5/17/2023	JEE	Review docket for pleadings related to confirmation hearing and open issues re same	SOL	Solicitation	0.80
5/17/2023	JEE	Emails w/ counsel re: prep for confirmation hearing	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/17/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/17/2023	JNG	Team meeting re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
Total for 5/17/2023					1.70
5/18/2023	JEE	Admin review of solicitation process and information in prep for confirmation hearing	SOL	Solicitation	2.30
5/18/2023	JEE	Email w/ counsel re: cost to resolicit/renotice opt out on class 8 equity	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/18/2023	JEE	Call w/ counsel re: preparation of confirmation hearing as declarants	SOL	Solicitation	0.50
5/18/2023	JEE	Office conference w/ securities team re: outstanding solicitation issues and prep for confirmation hearing	SOL	Solicitation	0.20

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

05/01/2023 - 05/31/2023

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Employee</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Position Type</u>	<u>Category</u>	<u>Hours</u>
5/18/2023	JEE	Review objections by UST and SEC re: class 8 equity opt outs	SOL	Solicitation	1.20
5/18/2023	JEE	Review report of opt out precedent and class 8 opt out data	SOL	Solicitation	1.00
5/18/2023	ASK	Phone conference with Broadridge re solicitation	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/18/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/18/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding preparation of updated voting amount spreadsheet for supplemental Opt Out notice mailing	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/18/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated voting amount spreadsheet for opt out only parties in preparation for upcoming supplemental mailing to same	SOL	Solicitation	2.20
5/18/2023	JNG	Review new job set up for potential resolicitation to equity holders	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/18/2023	JNG	Team meeting re solicitation cost and procedures	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/18/2023	KVR	Communication w/ counsel re: estimate to re-solicit equity with opt out	SOL	Solicitation	0.40
5/18/2023	KVR	Review of securities precedent, forwarded same to J Lee for reference for possible confirmation hearing testimony	SOL	Solicitation	1.60
Total for 5/18/2023					11.30
5/19/2023	JEE	Conference w/ counsel re: preparation for confirmation hearing	SOL	Solicitation	1.00
5/19/2023	JEE	Attend and testify at confirmation hearing	SOL	Solicitation	5.00
Total for 5/19/2023					6.00
5/20/2023	AGN	Prepare post-effective files for re-solicitation of class 5 & 6 data; prepare preliminary reports re same	SOL	Solicitation	2.90
Total for 5/20/2023					2.90
5/22/2023	ASK	Phone conference with KCC GSG team re case status	SOL	Solicitation	0.10
5/22/2023	SMZ	Telephonic meeting with KCC case team regarding upcoming supplemental opt out notice mailing to class 5 and 6 claimants	SOL	Solicitation	0.30
5/22/2023	SMZ	Prepare updated class 5 and 6 voting amount spreadsheet for upcoming updated Opt Out notice mailing	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
Total for 5/22/2023					1.70
5/24/2023	SMZ	Prepare class 5 and 6 electronic supplemental Opt-Out election forms and correspond with KCC case team re potential updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	1.80
Total for 5/24/2023					1.80
5/25/2023	SMZ	Review and update class 5 and 6 electronic supplemental Opt-Out election forms and correspond with KCC case team re additional updates to same	SOL	Solicitation	1.30
5/25/2023	SMZ	Correspond and coordinate with KCC operations team regarding service of updated opt out election forms to class 6/5 claimants and processing of same	SOL	Solicitation	0.20
Total for 5/25/2023					1.50
Total Hours					114.30

Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC

05/01/2023 - 05/31/2023

Expenses

Description

Units

Rate

Amount

Total Expenses