

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
HOUSTON DIVISION

In re:)	
)	Chapter 11
TEHUM CARE SERVICES, INC., ¹)	Case No. 23-90086 (CML)
)	
Debtor.)	

**FOURTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF PROVINCE, LLC
FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES AND REIMBURSEMENT
OF EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL TORT
CLAIMANTS’ COMMITTEE FOR THE PERIOD FROM
APRIL 1, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2024**

Pursuant to the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals* [Docket No. 357] entered by the Court on April 14, 2022 (the “Interim Compensation Order”), Province, LLC (“Province”), financial advisor to the Official Tort Claimants’ Committee of Tehum Care Services, Inc. (the “TCC”), submits this monthly statement (the “Statement”) of services rendered and expenses incurred in this case for the period from April 1, 2024 through April 30, 2024 (the “Statement Period”).

I. Itemization of Services Rendered by Province

A. The following is a list of individuals and their respective titles that provided services during the Statement Period. It includes information regarding their respective billing rates and the total number of hours spent by each individual providing services during the Statement Period for which Province seeks compensation.

¹ The last four digits of the Debtor’s federal tax identification number is 8853. The Debtor’s service address is: 205 Powell Place, Suite 104, Brentwood, Tennessee 37027.



SUMMARY

Name of Professional Individual	Position of the Applicant, Prior Relevant Experience, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Michael Atkinson, MBA, CPA, CIRA, ABV, CVA, CFE, CFF	Principal – Financial consulting, bankruptcy consulting, and litigation analysis since 1991.	\$1,420	14.9	\$21,158.00
Jason Crockett, MBA, CIRA	Principal - Financial consulting, corporate restructuring, and litigation analysis since 2002.	\$1,100	31.0	\$34,100.00
James Bland	Director - Financial analysis and management consulting since 2016.	\$820	3.5	\$2,870.00
Raul Busto	Director - Financial Consulting, Corporate Restructuring and Litigation Analysis since 2018.	\$810	15.0	\$12,150.00
Ryan Power	Senior Associate - Financial and data analytics.	\$620	5.6	\$3,472.00
Mitchell Boal, CFA	Senior Associate - Financial and data analytics.	\$600	3.7	\$2,220.00
Byron Groth	Senior Associate - Corporate restructuring and data analytics.	\$590	2.4	\$1,416.00
Reymundo Delgado	Analyst	\$400	2.5	\$1,000.00
	Subtotal		78.6	\$78,386.00
		Hourly Billing Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Para Professionals				
Eric Mattson	Matter Manager	\$300	0.3	\$90.00
Laura Conn	Matter Administrator	\$270	1.1	\$297.00
	Subtotal		1.4	\$387.00
			Fee Statement Hours	Total Compensation
	Grand Total		80.0	\$78,773.00

B. The time records of Province consisting of a daily breakdown of the time spent by each person on each day and detail as to the disbursements incurred are attached as **Exhibit A** to this Statement.

II. Itemization of Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred by Category

The following itemization presents the services rendered by Province by task category and provides a summary of disbursements incurred by category of disbursement.

1. Services Rendered

The following services were rendered in the following task categories:

Project Categories	Total Hours	Total Fees
Business Analysis / Operations	6.3	\$6,434.00
Claims Analysis and Objections	19.3	\$18,710.00
Court Filings	3.0	\$2,118.00
Court Hearings	3.2	\$3,144.00
Fee / Employment Applications	2.5	\$1,047.00
Litigation	37.2	\$39,841.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	8.5	\$7,479.00
Grand Total	80.0	\$78,773.00

A detailed itemization of the services rendered in each of the above task categories is set forth in Exhibit A.

2. Disbursements Incurred

The disbursements incurred by Province for this Statement are as follows:

Expense Category	Description	Total Expenses
Total Expenses		\$0.00

A detailed itemization of the disbursements incurred in each of the above expense categories is set forth in Exhibit A.

3. Total Amount Payable

Accordingly, the amount of compensation and expenses payable for this Statement Period is **\$63,018.40** which is calculated as follows:

Total Fees for Services Rendered During Statement Period	\$78,773.00
Twenty Percent (20%) Holdback	\$15,754.60
Fees Minus Holdback	\$63,018.40
Costs (100%)	\$0.00
Total	\$63,018.40

WHEREFORE, pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Province requests payment of (i) compensation in the amount of \$63,018.40 (80% of \$78,773.00) on account of actual,

reasonable and necessary professional services rendered to the TCC by Province and (ii) reimbursement of actual and necessary costs and expenses in the amount of \$0.00 incurred on behalf of the TCC by Province.

Dated: June 4, 2024

Respectfully submitted,

By: /s/ Michael Atkinson

Michael Atkinson, Principal
Province, LLC
2360 Corporate Circle, Suite 340
Henderson, NV 89074
(702) 685-5555
matkinson@provincefirm.com

*Financial Advisor to the Official Tort
Claimants' Committee*

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I certify that on June 4, 2024, I caused a copy of the foregoing document to be served by the Electronic Case Filing System for the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas.

/s/ Michael Atkinson

MICHAEL ATKINSON

EXHIBIT A**BILLING DETAILS**

Entry Date	Person	Comments	Task	Hours	Billing Rate	Amount
4/2/2024	Mitchell Boal	Reviewed latest fee applications.	Fee / Employment Applications	0.30	600.00	\$180.00
4/7/2024	Michael Atkinson	Call with counsel regarding litigation issues.	Litigation	0.40	1,420.00	\$568.00
4/8/2024	Mitchell Boal	Reviewed colleagues time entries for fee apps.	Fee / Employment Applications	0.50	600.00	\$300.00
4/9/2024	Reymundo Delgado	Created internal update on latest docket filings.	Court Filings	0.30	400.00	\$120.00
4/9/2024	Jason Crockett	Investigated issues related to Naphcare and potential successor.	Litigation	1.20	1,100.00	\$1,320.00
4/10/2024	Jason Crockett	Analyzed potential claims against defendant entities and value of those claims.	Claims Analysis and Objections	1.10	1,100.00	\$1,210.00
4/10/2024	Byron Groth	Analyzed transactions with entity alleged to be affiliated in new court filings.	Litigation	1.20	590.00	\$708.00
4/10/2024	Reymundo Delgado	Created internal update on latest docket filings.	Court Filings	0.30	400.00	\$120.00
4/10/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed pro se complaint and information in data room regarding for counsel.	Litigation	1.40	1,420.00	\$1,988.00
4/11/2024	James Bland	Listened to court hearing.	Court Hearings	0.80	820.00	\$656.00
4/11/2024	Byron Groth	Attended virtual hearing for Court rulings on settlement and dismissal	Court Hearings	0.80	590.00	\$472.00
4/11/2024	Reymundo Delgado	Created internal update on latest docket filings.	Court Filings	0.30	400.00	\$120.00
4/11/2024	Mitchell Boal	Analyzed amended DS.	Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.20	600.00	\$720.00
4/11/2024	Jason Crockett	Participated in court hearing regarding ruling on 9019 motion.	Court Hearings	0.80	1,100.00	\$880.00
4/11/2024	Michael Atkinson	Attended court hearing.	Court Hearings	0.80	1,420.00	\$1,136.00
4/12/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed court ruling.	Court Filings	0.90	1,420.00	\$1,278.00
4/17/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared materials in support of mediation regarding potential value of claims of torts and trade.	Litigation	1.60	1,100.00	\$1,760.00
4/17/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed and followed up with counsel on case issues related to court ruling.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.60	1,420.00	\$852.00
4/17/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared information requests regarding outstanding financials to evaluate estate cause of actions.	Litigation	0.90	1,100.00	\$990.00
4/19/2024	Jason Crockett	Investigated additional contract awards to CHS affiliates to assess magnitude of incremental revenue.	Litigation	1.20	1,100.00	\$1,320.00
4/22/2024	Jason Crockett	Analyzed potential value of unresolved claims against debtor.	Claims Analysis and Objections	1.70	1,100.00	\$1,870.00
4/22/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed and analyzed fee issues.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.30	1,420.00	\$426.00
4/22/2024	Raul Busto	Attended case update call with counsel.	Litigation	0.60	810.00	\$486.00

Entry Date	Person	Comments	Task	Hours	Billing Rate	Amount
4/22/2024	Eric Mattson	Revised March fee statement (0.2). Corresponded with J. Bland re: same (0.1).	Fee / Employment Applications	0.30	300.00	\$90.00
4/22/2024	Laura Conn	Drafted 3rd Monthly Fee Statement (1.0). Emailed to M. Boal for review (0.1).	Fee / Employment Applications	1.10	270.00	\$297.00
4/22/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared materials for committee in support of upcoming mediation.	Litigation	1.60	1,100.00	\$1,760.00
4/22/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed and followed up with counsel on mediation issues.	Litigation	0.80	1,420.00	\$1,136.00
4/22/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared list of outstanding information requests key to analyzing any potential mediation settlement discussions.	Litigation	0.40	1,100.00	\$440.00
4/22/2024	Mitchell Boal	Ensured accuracy of latest fee application before sending to Counsel.	Fee / Employment Applications	0.30	600.00	\$180.00
4/23/2024	Jason Crockett	Reviewed draft motion for leave and related documents and prepared comments for counsel.	Litigation	1.20	1,100.00	\$1,320.00
4/23/2024	Reymundo Delgado	Analyzed and reviewed relevant documents in the docket.	Court Filings	0.30	400.00	\$120.00
4/23/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed and analyzed materials for mediation for counsel.	Litigation	0.90	1,420.00	\$1,278.00
4/24/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed and analyzed potential mediation materials for counsel.	Litigation	1.20	1,420.00	\$1,704.00
4/24/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared materials for mediation in support of greater settlement values.	Litigation	1.50	1,100.00	\$1,650.00
4/24/2024	Reymundo Delgado	Analyzed and reviewed relevant documents in the docket.	Court Filings	0.30	400.00	\$120.00
4/25/2024	Jason Crockett	Analyzed information to support value or divisive merger.	Litigation	1.70	1,100.00	\$1,870.00
4/26/2024	Reymundo Delgado	Created internal update on latest docket filings.	Court Filings	0.30	400.00	\$120.00
4/26/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared materials related to TCC settlement proposal.	Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.20	1,100.00	\$1,320.00
4/26/2024	Raul Busto	Reviewed proposal structure outline.	Litigation	0.60	810.00	\$486.00
4/26/2024	Raul Busto	Worked on claims presentation.	Claims Analysis and Objections	2.30	810.00	\$1,863.00
4/26/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed and analyzed proposal outline and required analysis.	Business Analysis / Operations	1.70	1,420.00	\$2,414.00
4/26/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared analysis of plan structure where TCC would be supportive of settlement and approximate recoveries.	Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.30	1,100.00	\$1,430.00
4/26/2024	Michael Atkinson	Call with counsel regarding proposal structure.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.50	1,420.00	\$710.00
4/26/2024	Jason Crockett	Analyzed potential value of various types of claims.	Claims Analysis and Objections	1.10	1,100.00	\$1,210.00
4/27/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed and analyzed materials for counsel related to mediation.	Litigation	1.80	1,420.00	\$2,556.00
4/27/2024	Raul Busto	Created draft slides on settlement proposal framework.	Litigation	2.60	810.00	\$2,106.00
4/27/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared draft materials for counsel related to mediation and justification for increased settlement proceeds.	Litigation	2.10	1,100.00	\$2,310.00
4/27/2024	Raul Busto	Continued working on settlement proposal presentation.	Litigation	1.90	810.00	\$1,539.00

Entry Date	Person	Comments	Task	Hours	Billing Rate	Amount
4/28/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed and analyzed analysis requested by counsel on alternative plan options for mediation.	Litigation	1.40	1,420.00	\$1,988.00
4/28/2024	Mitchell Boal	Analyzed draft settlement allocation analysis.	Litigation	0.50	600.00	\$300.00
4/28/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared analysis of value of unsecured claims relevant to allocation of settlement proceeds.	Claims Analysis and Objections	2.30	1,100.00	\$2,530.00
4/29/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared draft waterfall recovery analysis to support mediation and improved settlement.	Litigation	1.60	1,100.00	\$1,760.00
4/29/2024	Michael Atkinson	Reviewed and analyzed materials for counsel related to mediation proposal.	Litigation	2.20	1,420.00	\$3,124.00
4/29/2024	Jason Crockett	Analyzed information and claims detail to support estimate of potential personal injury claims in aggregate.	Claims Analysis and Objections	1.90	1,100.00	\$2,090.00
4/29/2024	Raul Busto	Continued working on claims presentation.	Claims Analysis and Objections	2.60	810.00	\$2,106.00
4/29/2024	Jason Crockett	Analyzed non-personal injury claims and potential aggregate value adjustments.	Claims Analysis and Objections	1.10	1,100.00	\$1,210.00
4/30/2024	Raul Busto	Continued working on claims analysis for proposal presentation.	Claims Analysis and Objections	2.30	810.00	\$1,863.00
4/30/2024	Mitchell Boal	Call with internal team re: settlement allocation.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.40	600.00	\$240.00
4/30/2024	Jason Crockett	Prepared materials for counsel in support of greater settlement value.	Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.50	1,100.00	\$1,650.00
4/30/2024	Mitchell Boal	Analyzed second amended DS.	Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.50	600.00	\$300.00
4/30/2024	James Bland	Analyzed litigation history including past settlements.	Litigation	2.30	820.00	\$1,886.00
4/30/2024	Ryan Power	Call with internal team re: settlement allocation.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.40	620.00	\$248.00
4/30/2024	Ryan Power	Analyzed the debtor's master claims database file.	Claims Analysis and Objections	0.90	620.00	\$558.00
4/30/2024	Reymundo Delgado	Created internal update on latest docket filings.	Court Filings	0.30	400.00	\$120.00
4/30/2024	Ryan Power	Reviewed settlement allocation diligence materials and plan analysis.	Litigation	1.20	620.00	\$744.00
4/30/2024	Ryan Power	Reviewed sample complaints filed against the debtor.	Litigation	1.20	620.00	\$744.00
4/30/2024	Raul Busto	Call with internal team re: settlement allocation.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.40	810.00	\$324.00
4/30/2024	Reymundo Delgado	Call with internal team re: settlement allocation.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.40	400.00	\$160.00
4/30/2024	James Bland	Call with internal team re: settlement allocation.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.40	820.00	\$328.00
4/30/2024	Byron Groth	Call with internal team re: settlement allocation.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.40	590.00	\$236.00
4/30/2024	Raul Busto	Analyzed plan presentation.	Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.70	810.00	\$1,377.00

Entry Date	Person	Comments	Task	Hours	Billing Rate	Amount
4/30/2024	Jason Crockett	Analyzed comparable cases to assess reasonable TDP figures for various types of injuries alleged.	Claims Analysis and Objections	2.00	1,100.00	\$2,200.00
4/30/2024	Ryan Power	Reviewed disclosure statement filed in the debtor's docket.	Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.10	620.00	\$682.00
4/30/2024	Ryan Power	Reviewed digest of hot documents provided by the debtors.	Business Analysis / Operations	0.80	620.00	\$496.00