1	LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP JEFFREY D. PROL (admitted pro hac vice)	
2	jprol@lowenstein.com BRENT WEISENBERG (admitted pro hac vic	a)
3	bweisenberg@lowenstein.com One Lowenstein Drive	ε)
4	Roseland, New Jersey 07068 Telephone: (973) 597-2500	
5		
_	KELLER BENVENUTTI KIM LLP TOBIAS S. KELLER (Cal. Bar No. 151445)	
$\begin{bmatrix} 6 \\ 7 \end{bmatrix}$	JANE KIM (Cal. Bar No. 298192)	
8	jkim@kbkllp.com GABRIELLE L. ALBERT (Cal. Bar No. 1908)	95)
9	galbert@kbkllp.com 101 Montgomery Street, Suite 1950	
	San Francisco, California 94104 Telephone: (415) 496-6723	
10	Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecur Creditors	ed
12		ANKRUPTCY COURT
13	NORTHERN DISTR	RICT OF CALIFORNIA DIVISION
14	O/IKE/IIV	
15	In re:	Case No. 23-40523 WJL
16	THE ROMAN CATHOLIC BISHOP OF OAKLAND, a California corporation sole,	Chapter 11
17	Debtor.	SUMMARY SHEET TO SEVENTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF
18	Detion.	LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL
19		COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR ALLOWANCE AND
20		PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
21		FOR THE PERIOD FROM MAY 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING AUGUST
22		31, 2025
23		
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		
-~	I and the second se	

Entered: 10/: 2340523251015000000000010

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25 15

SUMMARY COVER SHEET TO SEVENTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION

Name of Applicant	Lowenstein Sandler LLP
Name of client	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Time period covered by application	05/01/25 to 08/31/25
Total compensation sought this period	\$4,112,758.00
Total expenses sought this period	\$148,307.78
Petition Date	May 8, 2023
Retention date	July 8, 2023, effective as of May 30, 2023
Date of order approving employment	July 8, 2023
Total compensation approved by interim order to date	\$8,229,305.51
Total expenses approved by interim order to date	\$251,538.07
Total allowed compensation paid to date	\$7,745,551.67
Total allowed expenses paid to date	\$251,538.07
*Outstanding holdback from Sixth Interim Fee Application	\$495,369.02 ¹
Blended rate in this application for all attorneys	\$963.18
Blended rate in this application for all timekeepers	\$930.91
Compensation sought in this application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$2,641,408.00
Expenses sought in this application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$141,869.07
Number of professionals (attorneys) included in this application	36
If applicable, number of professionals in this application not included in staffing plan approved by client	16
If applicable, difference between fees budgeted and compensation sought for this application period	\$197,758.00
Number of professionals (attorneys) billing fewer than 15 hours to the case during this period	5
Are any rates higher than those approved or disclosed at retention? If yes, calculate the amount of compensation attributable to any rate increase	Yes. Lowenstein Sandler increased its rates effective January 1, 2025. See Notice of Change In Hourly Rates [Dkt. No. 1552]. The amount attributable to this rate increase is \$531,513.00 or 8% of the total billed since January 1, 2025.

Case:

Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 2 of

Lowenstein also requests payment of the holdback amount (the "Sixth Holdback") previously approved but which has not yet been paid. By agreement between the Debtor and the Committee, Lowenstein, along with the other estate professionals, was not paid the Sixth Holdback after the approval of the Sixth Interim Fee Application but is allowed to request its payment at this time. 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25

SUMMARY OF MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS

Date Filed	Period Covered	Requested Fees	Requested Expenses	Paid Fees	Paid Expenses	Holdback Fees Requested
06/30/2025	05/01/2025	\$1,566,190.50	\$29,741.27	\$1,096,333.35	\$29,741.27	\$469,857.15
[Dkt. No.	_					
2105]	05/31/2025					
07/30/2025	06/01/2025	\$1,390,045.00	\$88,588.41	\$973,031.50	\$88,588.41	\$417,013.50
[Dkt. No.	_					
2170]	06/30/2025					
08/29/2025	07/01/2025	\$817,204.50	\$23,539.39	\$572,043.15	\$23,539.39	\$245,161.35
[Dkt. No.	_					
2226]	07/31/2025					
09/30/2025	08/01/2025	\$339,318.00	\$6,438.71	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$101,795.40*
[Dkt. No.	_					
2351] ²	08/31/2025					
	05/01/2025	\$4,112,758.00	\$148,307.78	\$2,641,408.00	\$141,869.07	\$1,233,827.40
Total	_					
	08/31/2025					

Summary of Any Objections to Monthly Fee Statements: None.

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 3 of

1 2

As of the date of this filing, no payments have been made on account of Lowenstein Sandler's Twenty-Seventh Monthly Fee Statement [Dkt. No.2351].

1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13	NORTHERN DIST	vice) 55) 90895)
14	In re:	Case No. 23-40523 WJL
15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 23	THE ROMAN CATHOLIC BISHOP OF OAKLAND, a California corporation sole, Debtor.	Chapter 11 SEVENTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR ALLOWANCE AND PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM MAY 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING AUGUST 31, 2025
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 4 of 15

Lowenstein Sandler LLP ("Lowenstein"), counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee") of the Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland (the "<u>Debtor</u>") in the above captioned chapter 11 case (the "<u>Chapter 11 Case</u>") files this Seventh Interim Fee Application (this "Application"), under sections 330 and 331 of chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), the United States Trustee Appendix B Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases, effective November 1, 2013, the Guidelines for Compensation and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals and Trustees for the Northern District of California, dated February 19, 2014 (the "UST Guidelines"), and the Order Authorizing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. No. 170], as modified by the Agreed Order Amending Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. No. 2101] (together, the "Interim Fee Order"), for interim approval and allowance of (i) compensation for professional services rendered to the Committee from May 1, 2025 through August 31, 2025 (the "Compensation Period") and (ii) reimbursement of expenses incurred in connection with such services.³ In support of this Application, Lowenstein represents as follows:

18

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

13

15

16

17

19

2021

2223

2425

26

27

Case:

THE UST GUIDELINES

I.

1. After the Office of the United States Trustee (the "<u>UST</u>") established the UST Guidelines, the UST promulgated forms to aid compliance with the UST Guidelines. Charts and tables based on such forms, and certain other exhibits, are attached and filled out with data to the extent relevant to this Chapter 11 Case:

Exhibit A: Customary and Comparable Compensation Disclosures with Fee Applications;

Lowenstein also requests payment of the holdback amount (the "Sixth Holdback") previously approved but which has not yet been paid. By agreement between the Debtor and the Committee, Lowenstein, along with the other estate professionals, was not paid the Sixth Holdback after the approval of the Sixth Interim Fee Application but is allowed to request its payment at this time.

- 1		
	Exhibit B:	Summary of Timekeepers in this Application;
	Exhibit C:	Budget and Staffing Plan;
	Exhibit D:	Summary of Compensation by Project Category;
	Exhibit E:	Summary of Expense Reimbursement Requested by Category;
	Exhibit F:	Summary Cover Sheet of Fee Application;
	Exhibit G:	Declaration of Counsel;
	Exhibit H:	Detailed time records for the Compensation Period; and
	Exhibit I:	Proposed Order.
		II.
		JURISDICTION
	2. This	Court has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157
	and 1334, the Orde	er Referring Bankruptcy Cases and Proceedings to Bankruptcy Judges,
	General Order 24 (N	J.D. Cal.) and Rule 5011-1(a) of the Local Rules. This is a core proceeding
	under 28 U.S.C. §1:	57(b)(2). Venue of this proceeding and this Application in this Court is
	proper under 28 U.S	S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.
		III.
		BACKGROUND
	3. On M	May 8, 2023, the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11
	of the Bankruptcy	Code. The Debtor continues to operate as a debtor in possession under
	sections 1107(a) and	1 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.
	4. On M	May 23, 2023, the UST, under section 1102(a)(1) of the Bankruptcy Code,
	appointed nine Surv	vivors holding claims against the Debtor to serve on the Committee. The
	Committee is charge	ed with representing the interests of all Survivors in this Chapter 11 Case.
	5. On M	May 30, 2023, the Committee selected Lowenstein as its lead counsel. The
	Committee then sele	ected Keller Benvenutti Kim LLP as local counsel. On July 14, 2023, the
	Committee selected	Burns Bair LLP to serve as special insurance counsel.
,	6. On Ju	aly 8, 2023, the Court entered the Order Authorizing Retention of Lowenstein

Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 6 of 15

Sandler LLP as Lead Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of the Roman

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 7 of

15

1	
2	
3	
4	
5	
6	
7	
8	
9	
10	paı
11	Lo
12	paı
13	dis
14	pei
15	rec
16	rei
17	agg
18	
19	pei
20	ser
21	Lo
22	Lo
23	ren
24	Ap
25	

- (xiii) preparing, on behalf of the Committee, any pleadings, including, without limitation, motions, memoranda, complaints, adversary complaints, objections, or comments in connection with any of the foregoing as may be necessary in furtherance of the Committee's interests and objectives in this Chapter 11 Case, including, without limitation, the preparation of retention applications and fee applications for the Committee's professionals, including Lowenstein; and
- performing such other legal services as may be required or are otherwise deemed (xiv) to be in the interests of the Committee in accordance with the Committee's powers and duties under the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rules, or other applicable law.

IV.

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES REQUESTED

- 9. During the Compensation Period. Lowenstein's professionals and aprofessionals expended 4,418 hours providing necessary services to the Committee. wenstein was able to efficiently provide services by using the expertise of professionals and aprofessionals within relevant practice groups to effectively advise the Committee regarding crete issues and ensure that the level of seniority was commensurate with the work being formed. In connection with services rendered on behalf of the Committee, Lowenstein juests allowance of reasonable compensation in the total amount of \$4,112,758.00, and mbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$148,307.78, for an gregate total of \$4,261,065.78 for the Compensation Period.
- 10. There is no agreement or understanding between Lowenstein and any other rson, other than members of the firm, for the sharing of compensation to be received for vices rendered in this Chapter 11 Case. Except as set forth below with respect to payments wenstein may receive under the Interim Fee Order, during the Compensation Period, wenstein received no payment and no promises of payment from any source for services dered or to be rendered in any capacity in connection with the matters covered by this plication.
- 11. Lowenstein agreed to reduce its hourly rates for the benefit of the Committee's constituency (holders of sexual abuse claims against the Debtor). To ensure that any price reduction inures solely to the benefit of the Committee's constituency, Lowenstein is holding ten percent of all fees received in this Chapter 11 Case in a trust account to benefit Survivors.

Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 8 of 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25

27

Case:

 The funds will be held until a trust is established through a Plan, or if no such trust is created, the funds will be donated to a child advocacy organization to be selected by the Committee at the end of the Chapter 11 Case.

- 12. Other than the foregoing discount: (i) the fees charged by Lowenstein in this Chapter 11 Case were billed in accordance with its existing billing rates and procedures in effect during the Compensation Period and (ii) these rates are the same rates Lowenstein charges for services rendered by its attorneys and paraprofessionals in comparable matters and are reasonable given the compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in similar matters in both the California and national markets.
- 13. Lowenstein maintains computerized time records, which have been filed on the docket with its monthly fee statements and furnished to the Debtor and the UST in the format specified by the Modified Interim Fee Order. As discussed above, detailed time records for the Compensation Period are attached as **Exhibit H**.
- 14. The Committee has reviewed this Application and approved the fees and expenses requested.

V.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES PERFORMED BY LOWENSTEIN <u>DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD</u>

15. During the Compensation Period, Lowenstein rendered professional services to the Committee solely in connection with this Chapter 11 Case and, on behalf of the Committee, in accordance with Lowenstein's professional responsibilities. The services performed were necessary to the administration of this Chapter 11 Case and were beneficial at the time at which the services were rendered. All services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed. Recitation of every item of the professional services performed by Lowenstein during the Compensation Period would be unduly burdensome. Thus, the following summary highlights meaningful issues to which Lowenstein devoted time and attention during the

Ш

Compensation Period. This summary is organized in accordance with Lowenstein's internal system of project categories.

- **A.** <u>Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Court Litigation</u> (419.70 hours; \$378,103.00).
- 16. This category includes time spent by Lowenstein prosecuting adversary proceedings (i) challenging the Debtor's designation of certain restricted assets and (ii) seeking a declaratory judgment that the Debtor and certain other Catholic entities within the Diocese are alter egos of one another. Lowenstein's attorneys' work encompassed a broad spectrum of motion practice, including dispositive motions, procedural and scheduling motions, discovery-related motions (including reconsideration, sealing and case management), and included:
 - (i) Drafting objections to Motions to Dismiss Amended Adversary Complaints related to the Oakland Parochial Fund (Adv. Pro. No. 24-04051) and Bond Obligated Group (Adv. Pro. No. 24-04053) filed by the Debtor and non-debtor affiliates; and
 - (ii) Drafting a motion for reconsideration of the order dismissing the First Amended Adversary Complaint (Adv. Pro. No. 24-04053), as well as preparing replies to objections thereto.
 - **B.** <u>Court Hearings</u> (91.80 hours; \$99,721.50).
- 17. Time billed to this category is for attorney time spent preparing for and attending various court hearings in the Chapter 11 Case and the adversary proceedings on behalf of the Committee, including, but not limited to, tending to post-hearing activities such as reviewing hearing transcripts, summarizing outcomes, and communicating results and next steps to the Committee. Lowenstein attended: (i) the hearing on motions to dismiss the adversary complaints; (ii) the hearing related to discovery disputes (protective order and motion to quash); (iii) the hearing on the proposed amendment to the Interim Compensation Order; (iv) the hearing on the Committee's renewed lift-stay motion; (v) the hearing on the Committee's objection to the payment of certain amounts to CCCEB; (vi) the hearing on the Debtor's motion to adjourn the plan confirmation trial; and (vii) multiple status conferences.
 - C. Employment and Retention Applications Others (43.10 hours; \$45,567.50).

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 10

of 15

8

9

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

25

26

27

18.

Time billed in this category includes time spent on retaining multiple experts for confirmation and related litigation. Lowenstein: (i) drafted, revised, and finalized several expert retention applications and proposed orders; (ii) coordinated and negotiated retention terms directly with prospective experts; (iii) researched legal authority on the use of experts; (iv) prepared a reply to the Debtor's objections to expert retentions and worked to resolve the objections with the Debtor; and (v) reviewed and analyzed the Debtor's application to retain its own expert, National Economic Research Associates.

D. **Mediation** (63.30 hours; \$80,241.00).

19. This category includes intensive work to advance mediation, including developing and refining settlement strategy, proposals, and presentation materials. Time spent in this category includes, but is not limited to: (i) collaborating closely with co-counsel, financial and claims consultants (Burns Bair, BRG and Stout) to analyze the Debtor's financial status, claims counts/ valuation, and insurance allocation; (ii) building alternative settlement models and preparing comprehensive mediation decks; (iii) coordinating mediator issues and communications (including responses to the request for Judge Lafferty to serve as mediator) and (iv) reviewing and analyzing the Debtor's settlement offer and refining related non-monetary terms (such as Child Protection Protocols).

Ε. Meetings of and Communication with Creditors (87.70 hours; \$105,305.50).

20. Lowenstein spent time communicating with Committee members and their state court counsel to discuss all issues germane to this case, including, but not limited to, the following: (i) scheduling for depositions and hearings, preparation of agendas, following up on discovery, and addressing questions on the automatic stay and related proceedings; (ii) providing guidance on voting, and balloting, including analysis of voting outcomes, and discussions regarding committee member testimony and confirmation strategy; (iii) summarizing post-hearing results and case developments, including summaries of court rulings on motions to dismiss, adjournment of confirmation, and the CCCEB payment issues; (iv) resumption of mediation and related strategy; and (v) providing guidance on late claim issues, proof-of-claim

28

Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 11 Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25

1	inquiries, updates on lift-stay proceedings and insurer appeals, and circulation of schedules and									
2	briefing tim	elines.								
3	F.	F. Plan and Disclosure Statement (3,443.00 hours; \$3,142,346.00).								
4	Lowenstein spent extensive time in this category:									
5 6 7	•	Preparing, drafting, and revising objections to versions of the Debtor's Disclosure Statement, including the Third Amended Disclosure Statement, and developing the Committee's plan confirmation objection addressing good faith, best interests, feasibility, unfair discrimination, First Amendment and RFRA issues, insurance assignment, and restricted assets.								
8	•	Preparing and serving document requests on the Debtor, VeraCruz and the Unknown Abuse Claims Representative.								
9	•	Identifying and preparing deposition exhibits and organizing deposition/hearing materials and logistics.								
10	•	Preparing and serving document subpoenas on Bishop Barber, the Debtor, RCC, and Adventus.								
12 13 14	•	Reviewing roughly (i) 5,800 documents produced on May 23rd (the Friday of Memorial Day weekend); (ii) 2,800 documents produced by VeraCruz documents on May 24th; (iii) 25,000 documents from the Debtor on May 29th and (iv) 9,800 documents from the Debtor on June 1st. In total, the Committee reviewed a total of (i) 40,171 documents from the Debtor (including from Veracruz) (232,607 pages) and (ii) 289 documents from the non-debtor entities (2,692 pages).								
15	•	Facilitating the claw back of 19 privileged documents produced by the Debtor which the Committee identified.								
16	•	Reviewing plan supplements and analyzing voting/tabulation issues.								
17	•	Making numerous requests for additional information on the creditors in each Class of the Plan and followed up on May 9th, May 21st, and May 29th.								
18	•	Preparing and producing a (categorical) privilege log with the Committee's document production on May 23rd, the due date for document productions.								
19	•	Preparing for and conducting 10 fact depositions:								
20		1. RCC – May 28th								
21		2. Dan Flanagan – May 28th								
22		3. Judge Hogan – May 30th								
23		4. Lisa Oberempt – June 3rd								
		5. Bishop Barber – June 3rd								
24		 6. RCWC – June 5th 7. OPF 30(b)(6) – Attila Bardos – June 5th 								
25		 OPF 30(b)(6) – Attila Bardos – June 5th Adventus 30(b)(6) – Attila Bardos – June 5th 								
26		9. Debtor 30(b)(6) – Dan Flanagan (May 28th) and Attila Bardos (June 12th & 13th)								
27		10. Attila Bardos (individually) – June 12th and 13th								
28	23-40523	Issuing several supplemental document requests for documents that were not produced following depositions.								
Case:	23-40323	Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 12 of 15								

Working with 4 experts to issue their expert reports by July 1st:

- 1. Katheryn McNally
- 2. Randi Rosen
- 3. Robin Klomparens
- 4. Paul Shields
- Analyzing the Debtor's 5 expert reports:
 - 1. Charles Moore
 - 2. Kurt Martens
 - 3. Denise Martin
 - 4. John Satter
 - 5. Adam Zimmerman
- Preparing for depositions of the Committee's experts, as well as the Debtor's experts, as they were coming up during the weeks of July 28th and August 4th.
- G. Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings (53.80 hours; \$56,536.00).
- 21. This category includes time spent by Lowenstein addressing automatic stay issues, including, but not limited to, the following: (i) drafting and prosecuting the Committee's renewed motion to lift the automatic stay; (ii) researching legal standards and case law supporting stay relief; (iii) reviewing objections to the renewed lift stay motion and drafting, revising, and finalizing the Committee's reply in support of stay relief; (iv) preparing for the hearing on the renewed lift stay motion, and drafting the proposed order granting stay relief; and (vi) conferring with state court counsel regarding the progression of state court actions and monitoring progress following entry of stay relief.

VI.

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES

- 22. Lowenstein incurred reasonable and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the sum of \$148,307.78 in connection with rendering legal services to the Committee during the A description of the expenses is set forth in Exhibit E. Compensation Period. disbursements are itemized in the annexed schedule. These disbursements were necessary to effectively render legal services in this Chapter 11 Case.
- 23. During this Chapter 11 Case, Lowenstein has incurred and paid its actual and necessary disbursements and expenses.

Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 13 Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25

22

23

24

25

26

27

THE REQUESTED COMPENSATION SHOULD BE ALLOWED

24. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code to govern the Court's award of such compensation. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code provides that a court may award a professional employed under section 327 of the Bankruptcy Code "reasonable compensation for actual necessary services rendered ... and reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses." 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1). Section 330 also sets forth the criteria for the award of such compensation and reimbursement:

- 25. In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the court should consider the nature, extent, and the value of such services, considering all relevant factors, including—
 - (i) the time spent on such services;
 - (ii) the rates charged for such services;
 - (iii) Whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
 - (iv) Whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed:
 - (v) With respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and
 - (vi) Whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.

11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3).

26. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the amount requested is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of this Chapter 11 Case, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the cost of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 14

of 15

1	27. In sum, the services rendered by Lowenstein were necessary and beneficial to the
2	Debtor's estates and were consistently performed timely commensurate with the types of issues
3	involved in this Chapter 11 Case. Accordingly, approval of the compensation for professional
4	services and reimbursement of expenses sought in this Application is warranted.
5	VIII.
6	<u>NOTICE</u>
7	28. Notice of the Application has been provided to parties in interest in accordance
8	with the procedures set forth in the Modified Interim Fee Order. Lowenstein submits that, in
9	view of the facts and circumstances of this Chapter 11 Case, such notice is sufficient, and no
10	other or further notice need be provided.
11	WHEREFORE, Lowenstein respectfully requests that the Court enter an order: (i)
12	allowing Lowenstein (a) interim compensation for professional services rendered as counsel for
13	the Committee during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$4,112,758.00; and (b)
14	reimbursement of reasonable and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$148,307.78 for
15	a total award of \$4,261,065.78; (ii) requiring the payment of the approved but not yet paid
16	holdback fees from the Sixth Interim Fee Application of \$495,369.02; and (iii) granting any
17	other relief that the Court deems just and proper.
18	Dated: October 15, 2025 LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP
19	By: <u>Jeffrey D. Prol</u> Jeffrey D. Prol
20	Brent Weisenberg
21	One Lowenstein Drive Roseland, New Jersey 07068
22	Telephone: (973) 597-2500
23	Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
24	
25	
26	
27	
	1

28

Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 15 Filed: 10/15/25 of 15 Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386

EXHIBIT A

Customary and Comparable Compensation Disclosures with Fee Applications

	BLENDED HOURLY RATE		
Category of Timekeeper (using categories already maintained by the firm)	Billed Preceding Year, Excluding Bankruptcy	Billed This Fee Application	
Partner	\$1,081.63	\$1,208.31	
Counsel	\$815.83	\$1,028.76	
Associate	\$615.22	\$758.81	
Paralegal	\$365.65	\$407.13	
Law Clerk	\$527.19	\$475.00	
Research Services	\$300.44	\$417.27	
All Timekeepers Aggregated	\$799.86	\$930.91	

Lowenstein Sandler's hourly rates for bankruptcy services are comparable to the hourly rates charged in complex chapter 11 cases by comparably skilled bankruptcy attorneys. The "Blended Hourly Rate – Billed Preceding Year, Excluding Bankruptcy" (the "BHREB") noted above reflects the firm's blended hourly rate billed for calendar year 2024 excluding bankruptcy related work, but including all alternative fee arrangements other than contingency fee cases. In calendar year 2024, the firm increased its billing rates on January 1st in accordance with its normal practice. The BHREB also represents the billed rate across a larger, more expansive population of the firm's attorneys with a multitude of rates that are impacted by a number of factors, including level of experience, complexity of the work and office location. For example, approximately 32% of Lowenstein Sandler's attorneys are based in New York, while approximately 57% are based in NJ, approximately 7% are based in California and Utah, and 4% are based in Washington DC. Thus, the "Blended Hourly Rate – Billed This Fee Application" is a function of, among other things, the experience and location of the subset of attorneys delivering the services and the sophistication and complexity of the specific matter.

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: October 15, 2025

Interim or Final: Seventh Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-1 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 1

EXHIBIT BSummary of Timekeepers Included in this Fee Application

							Hourly Rate Billed	
Name	Title	Department	Date of 1st Admission	Fees Billed	Hours Billed	Number of Rate Increases	In This Application	In First Interim Application
Adamo, Lesley P.	Partner	Corporate / Tax	2011	\$5,005.00	3.50	0	\$1,430.00	\$1,430.00
Albin, Barry T.	Partner	Litigation	1976	\$124,100.00	73.00	0	\$1,700.00	\$1,700.00
Kaplan, Michael A.	Partner	Litigation	2011	\$414,956.00	365.60	1	\$1,135.00	\$955.00
Prol, Jeffrey D.	Partner	Bankruptcy	1990	\$361,543.00	263.90	2	\$1,370.00	\$1,155.00
Ramey, Elinor Carson	Partner	Corporate / Tax	2008	\$3,630.00	3.00	0	\$1,210.00	\$1,210.00
Restel, Colleen M.	Partner	Bankruptcy	2015	\$454,050.00	403.60	1	\$1,125.00	\$895.00
Weisenberg, Brent I.	Partner	Bankruptcy	2002	\$454,140.00	391.50	1	\$1,160.00	\$975.00
Chahil, Rasmeet K.	Counsel	Litigation	2017	\$245,797.50	252.10	1	\$975.00	\$785.00
Gross, Philip J.	Counsel	Bankruptcy	2008	\$90,556.50	82.70	1	\$1,095.00	\$995.00
Moynihan, Kelly E.	Counsel	Bankruptcy	2016	\$111,935.50	106.10	0	\$1,055.00	\$1,055.00
Sklar, Lindsay H.	Counsel	Bankruptcy	2014	\$212,793.50	201.70	0	\$1,055.00	\$1,055.00
Beeman, Rachel Danielle	Associate	Corporate / Tax	2022	\$12,638.50	15.70	0	\$805.00	\$805.00
Berliner, Mikayla R.	Associate	Litigation	2021	\$110,374.00	127.60	0	\$865.00	\$865.00
Cassidy, David J.	Associate	Litigation	2024	\$17,225.00	26.50	0	\$650.00	\$650.00
Cherubini, Christopher T.	Associate	Litigation	1996	\$22,400.00	40.00	0	\$560.00	\$560.00
Clark, Brittany M.	Associate	Bankruptcy	2023	\$43,272.00	60.10	1	\$720.00	\$545.00

Case Name: <u>The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland</u>

Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: <u>Lowenstein Sandler LLP</u>

Date of Application: October 15, 2025

Interim or Final: Seventh Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

D'Eramo, Anna	Associate	Corporate / Tax	2025	\$4,615.00	7.10	0	\$650.00	\$650.00
Daniel, Kathryn A.	Associate	Corporate / Tax	2024	\$585.00	0.90	0	\$650.00	\$650.00
Dernbach, Christopher	Associate	Litigation	2021	\$158,814.00	183.60	1	\$865.00	\$600.00
Diaz, Madison	Associate	Litigation	2024	\$22,230.00	34.20	0	\$650.00	\$650.00
Frankel, Chelsea	Associate	Bankruptcy	2024	\$157,146.00	238.10	1	\$660.00	\$515.00
Gauvin, Carolyn	Associate	Bankruptcy	2024	\$73,788.00	111.80	1	\$660.00	\$550.00
Giblin, Anna Maria	Associate	Litigation	2023	\$221,364.00	309.60	1	\$715.00	\$515.00
Jameson, Jennifer Bagger	Associate	Litigation	2022	\$232,203.00	295.80	0	\$785.00	\$785.00
Minicozzi, Julie A.	Associate	Litigation	2021	\$100,792.00	117.20	0	\$860.00	\$860.00
Nadler, Zohar	Associate	Corporate / Tax	2025	\$4,160.00	6.40	0	\$650.00	\$650.00
Pastore, Hannah	Associate	Corporate / Tax	2025	\$3,900.00	6.00	0	\$650.00	\$650.00
Patel, Anish	Associate	Litigation	2021	\$93,593.00	108.20	0	\$865.00	\$865.00
Platt, Harrison	Associate	Corporate / Tax	2024	\$13,650.00	21.00	0	\$650.00	\$650.00
Rauchberg, Jake A.	Associate	Bankruptcy	2023	\$9,042.00	13.70	0	\$660.00	\$660.00
Rodriguez, Nina Renee	Associate	Litigation	2021	\$2,681.50	3.10	0	\$865.00	\$865.00
Rogan, Liam	Associate	Corporate / Tax	2024	\$10,660.00	16.40	1	\$650.00	\$300.00
Seltzer, Eric James	Associate	Bankruptcy	2022	\$32,895.00	38.70	1	\$850.00	\$715.00
Sharma, Rishabh	Associate	Corporate / Tax	2024	\$7,930.00	12.20	0	\$650.00	\$650.00
Stewart, Cristina G.	Associate	Litigation	2022	\$165,713.50	211.10	0	\$785.00	\$785.00
Wong, Chelsea	Associate	Corporate / Tax	2024	\$3,763.00	5.30	0	\$710.00	\$710.00
Charles, Kelly F.	Paralegal	Litigation		\$24,280.00	60.70	0	\$400.00	\$400.00
Claussen, Diane	Paralegal	Bankruptcy		\$13,960.00	34.90	1	\$400.00	\$340.00
Jara, Gabriel	Paralegal	Practice Support		\$858.00	2.20	0	\$390.00	\$390.00
King, Crystal	Paralegal	Practice Support	t	\$2,550.00	8.50	0	\$300.00	\$300.00
Lawler, Elizabeth B.	Paralegal	Bankruptcy		\$608.00	1.60	1	\$380.00	\$345.00

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: October 15, 2025
Interim or Final: Seventh Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

of 3

Pagano, Jamie J.	Paralegal	Practice Support	\$3	37,152.00	86.40	1	\$430.00	\$365.00
Suhail, Aneela	Paralegal	Practice Support		\$2,810.50	7.70	1	\$365.00	\$305.00
Taboada, Valerie	Paralegal	Litigation		\$225.00	0.50	0	\$450.00	\$450.00
Rocco, Raquelle	Law Clerk	Summer Associate	\$	16,150.00	34.00	0	\$475.00	\$475.00
Hayter, Carrie T.	Research Services	Knowledge and Research Services		\$2,747.00	6.70	1	\$410.00	\$345.00
Michaud, Zoraida	Research Services	Knowledge and Research Services		\$7,476.00	17.80	0	\$420.00	\$420.00

Case Name: <u>The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland</u>

Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: October 15, 2025

Interim or Final: Seventh Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

of 3

EXHIBIT C

Budget for Seventh Interim Period from May 1, 2025 through August 31, 2025

Project Category	Estimated Hours		Estimated Fees ¹	
	Low	High	Low	High
Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Court Litigation	550	600	\$398,750.00	\$435,000.00
Appeals	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Asset Analysis and Recovery	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Asset Disposition	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Avoidance Action Analysis	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Business Operations	8	10	\$5,800.00	\$7,250.00
Case Administration	40	50	\$29,000.00	\$36,250.00
Claims Administration and Objections	75	90	\$54,375.00	\$65,250.00
Court Hearings	300	350	\$217,500.00	\$253,750.00
Employee Benefits/Pensions	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Employment and Retention Applications - Others	30	35	\$21,750.00	\$25,375.00
Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	15	20	\$10,875.00	\$14,500.00
Fee/Employment Applications	30	40	\$21,750.00	\$29,000.00
Fee/Employment Objections	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Financing/Cash Collateral	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Investigation of Prepetition Lenders	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mediation	75	100	\$54,375.00	\$72,500.00
Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	125	150	\$90,625.00	\$108,750.00
Non-Working Travel	125	150	\$90,625.00	\$108,750.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	3000	3500	\$2,175,000.00	\$2,537,500.00
Other - Insurance Matters	60	75	\$43,500.00	\$54,375.00

Lowenstein Sandler's estimated fees are calculated at the rate of \$725 per hour.

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: October 15, 2025
Interim or Final: Seventh Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

Project Category	Estimated Hours		Estimated Fees ¹		Estimated Hours Estimated Fees ¹	
	Low	High	Low	High		
Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	65	80	\$47,125.00	\$58,000.00		
Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	125	150	\$90,625.00	\$108,750.00		
Schedules and Statements	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Tax Issues	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Valuation	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00		
TOTAL	4623	5400	\$3,351,675.00	\$3,915,000.00		

Lowenstein reserves its right to modify this budget and staffing plan in the event circumstances unforeseen at the time these were prepared would cause Lowenstein Sandler to be required to utilize additional or different staffing to appropriately deal with events that may arise in the bankruptcy case.

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: October 15, 2025
Interim or Final: Seventh Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

EXHIBIT C

Staffing Plan for Seventh Interim Period from May 1, 2025 through August 31, 2054

Category of Timekeeper	Number of Timekeepers Expected to Work on the Matter During the Budget Period	Average Hourly Rate
Partner	5-7	\$690–\$1,835
Counsel	2-3	\$575–\$1,070
Associate	8-10	\$475–\$965
Paralegal	1-2	\$305–\$425

The Applicant reserves its right to modify this budget and staffing plan in the event circumstances unforeseen at the time these were prepared that would cause Applicant to be required to utilize additional or different staffing to appropriately deal with events that may arise in the bankruptcy case.

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: October 15, 2025
Interim or Final: Seventh Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

<u>EXHIBIT D</u> Summary of Compensation Requested by Project Category

Project Category	Hours	Fees
Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Court Litigation	Billed 419.70	Sought \$378,103.00
	419.70	
Appeals	19.80	\$20,237.00
Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.40	\$506.00
Asset Disposition	36.20	\$41,824.50
Business Operations	16.20	\$14,796.00
Case Administration	8.40	\$3,350.00
Claims Administration and Objections	18.90	\$19,057.00
Court Hearings	91.80	\$99,721.50
Employment and Retention Applications - Others	43.10	\$45,567.50
Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	36.40	\$37,092.00
Fee/Employment Applications	21.90	\$11,712.50
Fee/Employment Objections	35.00	\$35,658.00
Investigation of Prepetition Lenders	1.80	\$927.00
Mediation	63.30	\$80,241.00
Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	87.70	\$105,305.50
Other - Insurance Matters	9.90	\$12,248.50
Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	6.40	\$5,809.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	3,443.00	\$3,142,346.00
Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	53.80	\$56,536.00
Restructurings	4.30	\$1,720.00
TOTAL	4,418.00	\$4,112,758.00

Case Name:	The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number:	23-40523 (WJL
Applicant's Name:	Lowenstein Sandler LLP
Date of Application:	October 15, 2025
Interim or Final:	Seventh Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

<u>EXHIBIT E</u> Summary of Expense Reimbursement Requested by Category

Category	Amount
Case preparation expenses	\$1,012.31
Computerized legal research	\$29,861.45
Evidence preparation services	\$2,934.45
Filing fees	\$656.00
Messenger and delivery charges	\$1,034.77
Printing and Duplicating Services - External	\$15,630.54
Searches	\$10.45
Transcript charges	\$36,043.76
Travel	\$56,283.36
Meals	\$2,698.08
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$148,307.78

of 5

EXHIBIT E – CONTINUED – Expense Detail

Date	Description	Amount
05/27/25	eDiscovery Review (VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-05-27 83.15 GB eDiscovery Review)	\$449.01
06/26/25	eDiscovery Review (VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-06-26 102.05 GB eDiscovery Review)	\$551.07
07/24/25	eDiscovery Review (VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-07-24 106.00 GB eDiscovery Review)	\$572.40
08/27/25	eDiscovery Review (VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-08-27 105.58 GB eDiscovery Review)	\$570.13
Case nrenar	ation expenses	
06/18/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/18/25; Misc - Other; Purchase complaint in Thatcher v. Doe 1 per R. Chahil)	\$7.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Garner v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, ct. al.)	\$201.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; For Rasmeet Chahil)	\$47.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; For Rasmeet Chahil)	\$29.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; John Doe 38 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$6.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; R. Roe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$47.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Dietrich v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$18.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Martell v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$23.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Beaudry v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$24.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 51 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$12.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; John Doe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$15.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; For Rasmeet Chahil)	\$17.50

06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Jane Roe I v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$21.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Jane Doe I v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$5.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 5 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$15.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Does 9 & 10 v. Roman Catholic Lanza, Joseph Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$18.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Susan Dalis v. The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, A Corporation Sole; John Doe 2; John Doe 3; and DOES 4 through 100, inclusive)	\$15.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 8 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$17.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 31 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$11.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 42 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$13.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 21 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$18.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; F. Roe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$48.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 6 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$17.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; John Doe 28 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$13.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Dutra v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$40.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Thomas E. Lumsden vs. The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland and Does 1 through 30)	\$19.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; John A. Doe & John B. Doe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland,et. al.)	\$19.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; DeDiemar v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$22.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; John Doe 1, 2 & 3 vs. The Roman	\$20.50

Catholic Bishop of Oakland, Et al.)

06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Minor v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.)	\$13.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Jane Doe 1, et al. v. The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland)	\$53.00
06/23/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/23/25; Misc - Other; Purchase Notice of case rescheduling per C. Stewart)	\$11.40
06/23/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/23/25; Misc - Other; Declaration of John S. Pierce in opposition to motion for attorney's fees and costs)	\$40.00
06/26/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/26/25; Misc - Other; John PJ Doe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. per R. Chahil)	\$27.80
06/26/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/26/25; Misc - Other; John PT Doe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. per R. Chahil)	\$27.00
06/27/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other; Search by name credits in Alameda County Court for Ron. L. v. Oakland case search per R. Chahil)	\$4.00
06/27/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other; S. Roe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. per R. Chahil)	\$21.00
06/27/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other; Does 9 & 10 v. Roman Catholic Lanza, Joseph Bishop of Oakland, et. al. per R. Chahil)	\$9.50
06/27/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other; Beaudry v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. per R. Chahil)	\$8.50
06/27/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other; John Doe 1, 2 & 3 vs. The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, Et al. per R. Chahil)	\$10.50
07/01/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 07/01/25; Misc - Other; Fee for processing documents - for Rasmeet Chahil)	\$0.11
07/01/25	Reference Materials (VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 07/01/25; Misc - Other; For Rasmeet Chahil)	\$2.50
Messenger and 05/28/25	I delivery charges Federal Express	\$156.68
05/28/25	Federal Express	\$83.24
05/28/25	Federal Express	\$146.90
05/28/25	Federal Express	\$161.59

05/28/25	Federal Express	\$137.10
06/30/25	Federal Express	\$146.63
07/02/25	Federal Express	\$61.28
07/07/25	Federal Express	\$141.35
Printing and	Duplicating Services - External	
06/05/25	Outside Printing and Duplicating Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2588 DATE: 6/5/2025 RCBO - printing deposition exhibits)	\$5,694.23
06/05/25	Outside Printing and Duplicating Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2587 DATE: 6/5/2025 RCBO - deposition exhibits)	\$525.79
06/05/25	Outside Printing and Duplicating Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2591 DATE: 6/5/2025 RCBO - Fee - Printing exhibits to use at the Motion to Dismiss court hearing)	\$136.50
06/05/25	Outside Printing and Duplicating Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2589 DATE: 6/5/2025 RCBO - Printing Fee - Printing Deposition Exhibits)	\$692.00
06/05/25	Outside Printing and Duplicating Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2592 DATE: 6/5/2025 RCBO - Fee - Printing exhibits to use at the Motion to Dismiss court hearing)	\$136.50
06/05/25	Outside Printing and Duplicating Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2590 DATE: 6/5/2025 RCBO - Printing Fee - Printing Deposition Exhibits)	\$541.92
06/05/25	Outside Printing and Duplicating Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2586 DATE: 6/5/2025 Lisa Oberempt deposition exhibit)	\$927.49
06/05/25	Outside Printing and Duplicating Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2585 DATE: 6/5/2025 RCBO - Bishop Depo Exhibits)	\$1,072.67
06/16/25	Outside Printing and Duplicating Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2595 DATE: 6/16/2025 Attila Bardos Deposition)	\$5,903.44
Evidence pre	eparation services	
07/10/25	Evidence Preparation Services (VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC INVOICE#: 2601 DATE: 7/10/2025 RCBO - Deposition Preparation Fee)	\$2,934.45
Filing fees		
05/13/25	Filing Fees (VENDOR: American Express INVOICE#: 7466081707010206 DATE: 7/1/2025; 05/13/25; Filing Fees; Filing fee)	\$328.00
05/13/25	Filing Fees (VENDOR: American Express INVOICE#: 7466081707010206 DATE: 7/1/2025; 05/13/25; Filing Fees; Filing fee)	\$328.00
Meals 05/28/25	Meals (local) (For Bagger, Jennifer INVOICE#: 7459707706030201 Breakfast with Jennifer Jameson; Breakfast at Newark Liberty International Airport during travel to deposition)	\$12.64
06/01/25	Meals (local) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7479618006100201 06/01/25; lunch before flight - during attendance at (i) the hearing on the Debtor's motion to increase holdbacks, (ii) the hearing on the motions to dismiss Committee's Amended Complaints and (iii) Bishop Barber deposition)	\$33.57

EXHIBIT FSummary Cover Sheet of Fee Application

Name of applicant	Lowenstein Sandler LLP
Name of client	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Time period covered by application	05/01/25 to 08/31/25
Total compensation sought this period	\$4,112,758.00
Total expenses sought this period	\$148,307.78
Petition date	May 8, 2023
Retention date	July 8, 2023, effective as of May 30, 2023
Date or order approving employment	July 8, 2023
Total compensation approved by interim order to date	\$8,229,305.51
Total expenses approved by interim order to date	\$251,538.07
Total allowed compensation paid to date	\$7,745,551.67
Total allowed expenses paid to date	\$251,538.07
*Outstanding holdback from Sixth Interim Fee Application	\$495,369.02 ²
Blended rate in this application for all attorneys	\$963.18
Blended rate in this application for all timekeepers	\$930.91
Compensation sought in this application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$2,641,408.00
Expenses sought in this application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$141,869.07
Number of professionals (attorneys) included in this application	36
If applicable, number of professionals in this application not included in staffing plan approved by client	N/A
If applicable, difference between fees budgeted and compensation sought for this application period	\$197,758.00
Number of professionals (attorneys) billing fewer than 15 hours to the case during this period	5
Are any rates higher than those approved or disclosed at retention? If yes, calculate the amount of compensation attributable to any rate increase	Yes. Lowenstein Sandler increased its rates effective January 1, 2025. <i>See Notice of Change In Hourly Rates</i> [Dkt. 1552]. The amount attributable to this rate increase is \$531,513.00 or 8% of the total billed since January 1, 2025

Page 1

Lowenstein also requests payment of the holdback amount (the "<u>Sixth Holdback</u>") previously approved but which has not yet been paid. By agreement between the Debtor and the Committee, Lowenstein, along with the other estate professionals, was not paid the Sixth Holdback after the approval of the Sixth Interim Fee Application but is allowed to request its payment at this time.

1	
2	
3	
4	
5	
6	
7	
8	
9	
10	
11	
12	
13	
14	
15	
16	
17	
18	
19	
20	
21	
22	
23	
24	
25	
26	

28

Exhibit G

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2386-7 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 1 of 8

1	LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP		
2	JEFFREY D. PROL (admitted pro hac vice) jprol@lowenstein.com		
3	BRENT WEISENBERG (admitted pro hac vice) bweisenberg@lowenstein.com		
4	One Lowenstein Drive Roseland, New Jersey 07068		
5	Telephone: (973) 597-2500		
6	KELLER BENVENUTTI KIM LLP TOBIAS S. KELLER (Cal. Bar No. 151445)		
7	JANE KIM (Cal. Bar No. 298192)		
8	jkim@kbkllp.com GABRIELLE L. ALBERT (Cal. Bar No. 190895)		
9	galbert@kbkllp.com 101 Montgomery Street, Suite 1950		
10	San Francisco, California 94104 Telephone: (415) 496-6723		
11	Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors		
12		ANIZDUDTOV COUDT	
13	UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA OAKLAND DIVISION		
14			
15	In re:	Case No. 23-40523 WJL	
16	THE ROMAN CATHOLIC BISHOP OF OAKLAND, a California corporation sole,	Chapter 11	
17	Debtor.	DECLARATION OF JEFFREY D. PROL IN SUPPORT OF SEVENTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR ALLOWANCE AND PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM MAY 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING AUGUST	
18 19			
20			
21			
22		31, 2025	
23			
24			
25			
26			
27			
28			

Doc# 2386-7 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 2 of 8 Case 23-40523

I, Jeffrey D. Prol, hereby declare, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746 as follows:

- 1. I am a partner in the law firm of Lowenstein Sandler LLP ("Lowenstein"), lead counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors ("the "Committee") of the Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland (the "Debtor") in connection with the above-referenced chapter 11 case (the "Chapter 11 Case"). I am familiar with the Order Authorizing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. 170], as modified by the Agreed Order Amending Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. 2101] (together, the "Interim Fee Order"), the United States Trustee Appendix B Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases, effective November 1, 2013 (the "U.S. Trustee Guidelines") and the Guidelines for Compensation and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals and Trustees for the Northern District of California, dated February 19, 2014 (the "Local Guidelines").
- 2. This Declaration is submitted in support of the Seventh Interim Fee Application of Lowenstein Sandler LLP as Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Allowance and Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period From May 1, 2025 Through and Including August 31, 2025 (the "Application").
 - 3. Pursuant to the Local Guidelines, Lowenstein states as follows:
 - a. I have read the Application;
 - b. To the best of my knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, except as set forth in the Application, the fees and disbursements sought fall within the Local Guidelines; and
 - c. The fees and disbursements sought are billed at rates in accordance with those generally charged by Lowenstein and generally accepted by Lowenstein's clients.
- 4. The Debtor, the Debtor's professionals and the U.S. Trustee are each being provided with a copy of the Application in accordance with the Interim Fee Order.

23-40523 Doc# 2386-7 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 3

of

Case

All capitalized terms not defined herein have the meaning given to them in the Application.

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2386-7 Filed: 10/15/25 ₋₂Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 4

when retaining the law firm to accept all future rate increases? If not, did you inform your client that they need not agree to modified rates or terms

in order to have you continue the representation, consistent with ABA Formal Ethics Opinion 11-458? Response: Yes to both question i. and ii. Lowenstein Sandler increased its rates effective January 1, 2025. 8. Attached as Exhibit A is a true and correct copy of an email transmitting the Application to the Chairperson of the Committee and advising the Committee of the right to review and object to the compensation and expense reimbursement sought therein. Pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, I hereby declare under the penalty of perjury that the foregoing statements made by me are true and correct to the best of my knowledge. Executed this 15th day of October, 2025 in Roseland, New Jersey. By: /s/ Jeffrey D. Prol Jeffrey D. Prol

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2386-7 Filed: 10/15/25 _3Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 5

1
2 3 4
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2386-7 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 6 of 8

EXHIBIT A



October 14, 2025

By Electronic Mail

Mr. Steve Woodall, Committee Chairperson

Email: sjwoodall@gmail.com

Re: <u>In re The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland (Bankr. N.D. Cal.)</u>

Committee Professionals' Interim Fee Applications

Mr. Woodall:

Attached for the Committee's review are copies of the following interim fee applications:

- Seventh Interim Fee Application of Lowenstein Sandler LLP as Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Allowance and Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period of May 1, 2025, through August 31, 2025 and the Declaration of Jeffrey Prol in support thereof;
- Seventh Interim Fee Application of Keller Benvenutti Kim LLP as Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Allowance and Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period of May 1, 2025, through August 31, 2025 and the Declaration of Tobias S. Keller in support thereof;
- Sixth Interim Fee Application of Burns Bair LLP as Special Insurance Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Allowance and Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period May 1, 2025, through August 31, 2025 and the Declaration of Jesse J. Bair in support thereof;
- Sixth Interim Fee Application of Stout Risius Ross, LLC for Allowance and Payment of Fees for the Period from May 1, 2025, through August 31, 2025 and the Declaration of Katheryn McNally in support thereof;
- Sixth Interim Fee Application of Berkeley Research Group for Allowance and Payment of Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period May 1, 2025, through August 31, 2025 and the Declaration of Matthew Babcock in support thereof;

of 8

Steve Woodall October 14, 2025 Page 2

> First Interim Fee Application of Stout Risius Ross, LLC for Allowance and Payment of Compensation for the Period of April 1, 2025, through August 31, 2025 and the Declaration of Randi Rosen in support thereof.

The Court's Guidelines for Compensation and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals and Trustees provide that a debtor in possession, a trustee or an official committee must exercise reasonable business judgment in monitoring the fees and expenses of the estate's professionals. We invite you to discuss any objections, concerns or questions you may have with us. The Office of the United State Trustee will also accept your comments. The Court will also consider timely filed objections by any party in interest at the time of the hearing on the application.

If you have any questions or comments, please do not hesitate to call me.

With best regards,

Gabrielle I. Albert

Attachments

cc (via electronic mail, with attachments):

Jeffrey Prol, Esq. (jprol@lowenstein.com)

Brent Weisenberg, Esq. (bweisenberg@lowenstein.com)

of 8

 $\underline{\textbf{EXHIBIT H}}$ Full Detailed List of Services Rendered by Lowenstein Sandler by Project Category

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
<u>B100 - Adn</u>	<u>ninistration</u>				
B110 Case A	Administration				
B110	05/01/25	DC	Update fee application status chart and attorney calendar	0.20	\$80.00
B110	05/05/25	DC	Update attorney calendar with zoom link for 5/7/25 hearing	0.10	\$40.00
B110	05/08/25	DC	Review e-mails re: confirmation and motion deadlines, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar (.3); circulate zoom link for 5/13/25 hearing (.1)	0.40	\$160.00
B110	05/08/25	GJ	Assist with document download and import	0.20	\$78.00
B110	05/09/25	GJ	Download production received and import it into database for attorney review	0.80	\$312.00
B110	05/12/25	DC	Download filed pleadings, update electronic files and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00
B110	05/14/25	DC	Update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.20	\$80.00
B110	05/15/25	DC	Download supplemental pleadings for preparation of e- binder for 5/21/25 hearing	0.20	\$80.00
B110	05/19/25	KFC	Review and calendar upcoming deposition dates for attorneys	0.80	\$320.00
B110	05/28/25	DC	Review docket, download filed pleadings, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.50	\$200.00
B110	06/02/25	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00
B110	07/01/25	DC	Review dockets in lead case and adversary proceedings, update critical dates memo, attorney calendar and fee application status chart	0.40	\$160.00
B110	07/09/25	KFC	Confirm logistics for expert depositions; calendar dates, schedule court reporters and confer with printing vendors	1.80	\$720.00
B110	07/11/25	DC	Review dockets in lead case and adversary proceedings, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.40	\$160.00
B110	07/21/25	DC	Review updates re: confirmation hearing, confer with lodging management re: cancellation of proposal for August, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.50	\$200.00
B110	08/04/25	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00
B110	08/18/25	DC	Review docket, download pleadings, update electronic files, critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.60	\$240.00
B110	08/21/25	DC	Review files for 7/16/25 hearing transcript and forward same to J. Prol	0.10	\$40.00
B110	08/25/25	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00
			Total B110 - Case Administration	8.40	\$3,350.00

of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120 Asset A	nalysis and R	ecovery			
B120	08/18/25	JDP	Review notice filed by RCBO re: assets of Telecommunications Network	0.20	\$274.00
B120	08/24/25	BIW	Review Debtor's disclosures re: Catholic Telemedia Network	0.20	\$232.00
			Total B120 - Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.40	\$506.00
B120A Invest	tigation of Pre	petition Lenders	<u>=</u>		
B120A	08/21/25	EBL	Review Rockville Center Diocese docket and retrieve and circulate documents related to the sale of Spectrum Licenses	0.40	\$152.00
B120A	08/22/25	EBL	Review and pull additional documents related to Rockville Centre Diocese sale of spectrum licenses	0.50	\$190.00
B120A	08/29/25	KAD	Confer with E. Ramey re: research; research corporate governance law	0.90	\$585.00
			Total B120A - Investigation of Prepetition Lenders	1.80	\$927.00
B130 Asset D	<u>Disposition</u>				
B130	08/19/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: CCSS and potential disposition of interest	0.30	\$337.50
B130	08/19/25	JDP	Review Debtor's motion to divest interest in CCSS; develop strategy for response	1.30	\$1,781.00
B130	08/20/25	BIW	Review CCSS Sale Motion (.4); draft emails re: same (.2)	0.60	\$696.00
B130	08/20/25	CMR	Summary review of Motion to Sell interest in CCSS (.3); Confer with LS Team re: same (.5)	0.80	\$900.00
B130	08/20/25	JDP	Review debtor's motion re: divesting interest in CCSS; conduct diligence; develop strategy	1.20	\$1,644.00
B130	08/20/25	MAK	Review and analyze Debtor 363 motion on CMS and compare to discovery from RCC re: the same	1.70	\$1,929.50
B130	08/21/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG re: analysis of proposed sale of Debtor asset	0.60	\$696.00
B130	08/21/25	CMR	Call with LS and BRG Teams re: Motion to Sell (.6); Strategize re: same (.5)	1.10	\$1,237.50
B130	08/21/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: CCSS divestiture motion	0.60	\$822.00
B130	08/21/25	JDP	E-mails to/from M. Lee and LS litigation team re: meet and confer on CCSS divestiture motion	0.30	\$411.00
B130	08/21/25	MAK	Telephone call with BRG to discuss strategy re: CMS 363 motion	0.50	\$567.50
B130	08/22/25	BIW	Draft email re: research needed in connection with proposed sale of Debtor asset	0.20	\$232.00
B130	08/22/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Motion to Sell Assets	0.90	\$1,012.50
B130	08/22/25	JAR	Research standard of review re: sale of assets to insiders	0.30	\$198.00
B130	08/23/25	BIW	Outline issues re: CCSS Sale Motion	0.50	\$580.00
B130	08/24/25	JAR	Research standard of review re: sale to insiders	0.70	\$462.00
B130	08/25/25	BIW	Review CCSS documents	0.30	\$348.00
B130	08/25/25	BIW	Review CCSS documents	1.20	\$1,392.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B130	08/25/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Motion to Sell (.2); Call with Debtor re: same (.3)	0.50	\$562.50
B130	08/25/25	JAR	Research standard of review re: sale to insiders	1.20	\$792.00
B130	08/25/25	JDP	Prepare for (.4) and participate in (.3) meet and confer on CCSS divestiture motion	0.70	\$959.00
B130	08/25/25	MAK	Prepare for (.2) and participate in (.3) conference call with Debtor re: CMS 363 motion	0.50	\$567.50
B130	08/26/25	BIW	Participate in call with E. Ramey re: analysis of CCSS transaction	0.50	\$580.00
B130	08/26/25	BIW	Review requested documents re: CCSS and comment on same	0.30	\$348.00
B130	08/26/25	CMR	Revise (.3) and serve (.1) informal discovery re: Motion to Sell	0.40	\$450.00
B130	08/26/25	ECR	Call to discuss sale of governance rights (.5); research re: same (.5)	1.00	\$1,210.00
B130	08/26/25	JAR	Further research standard of review re: sale to insiders (1.5); correspondence with B. Weisenberg re: same (0.3)	1.80	\$1,188.00
B130	08/26/25	JDP	Review and analyze settlement letter from Debtor's counsel; develop strategy for response	1.30	\$1,781.00
B130	08/26/25	JDP	Call with E. Ramey re: sale of governance rights	0.50	\$685.00
B130	08/27/25	BIW	Continue drafting response to CCSS Motion	0.70	\$812.00
B130	08/27/25	BIW	Begin drafting Statement in response to CCSS Motion	1.30	\$1,508.00
B130	08/28/25	BIW	Continue drafting Statement in response to CCSS Motion	1.40	\$1,624.00
B130	08/28/25	ECR	Review documents and provide comments on proposed CCSS divestiture motion	1.00	\$1,210.00
B130	08/29/25	BIW	Continue drafting Statement in response to CCSS Motion	1.10	\$1,276.00
B130	08/29/25	BIW	Continue drafting Statement in response to CCSS Motion	2.60	\$3,016.00
B130	08/29/25	BIW	Review documents provided by Debtor re: CCSS	1.40	\$1,624.00
B130	08/29/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol re: legal strategy in connection with CCSS Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B130	08/29/25	ECR	Research re: sale motion and nonprofit governance	1.00	\$1,210.00
B130	08/29/25	JDP	Review research re: authority to sell right to appoint board seats; direct further research	0.40	\$548.00
B130	08/29/25	JDP	Review and edit draft response to Debtor's motion to release interest in CCSS	1.60	\$2,192.00
B130	08/30/25	BIW	Revise Statement in response to CCSS Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B130	08/30/25	JDP	Review and edit revised draft of objection to motion to release interests in CCSS	1.10	\$1,507.00
D140 Dallas	from Star/Ad-	quata Destaction	Total B130 - Asset Disposition	36.20	\$41,824.50
	•	quate Protection			0.4.5
B140	06/05/25	BIW	Revise Lift Stay Motion	1.10	\$1,276.00
B140	06/06/25	BIW	Continue drafting Lift Stay Motion	0.80	\$928.00
B140	06/06/25	BIW	Review most recent CMC transcript	0.40	\$464.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B140	06/06/25	BIW	Continue drafting Lift Stay Motion	2.60	\$3,016.00
B140	06/09/25	BIW	Continue revising renewed Lift Stay Motion	2.30	\$2,668.00
B140	06/10/25	BIW	Finalize Renewed Lift Stay Motion	1.10	\$1,276.00
B140	06/12/25	JDP	Review draft of renewed lift stay motion and comments received from co-counsel	1.20	\$1,644.00
B140	06/13/25	BIW	Revise Lift Stay Motion	0.90	\$1,044.00
B140	06/13/25	JDP	Review and edit draft motion to lift stay	1.50	\$2,055.00
B140	06/14/25	JDP	Review and comment on revised draft of lift stay motion	0.70	\$959.00
B140	06/17/25	BIW	Revise Renewed Lift Stay Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B140	06/17/25	CF	Conduct research for renewed lift stay motion and review relevant transcripts	2.50	\$1,650.00
B140	06/17/25	JDP	Review and edit revised draft of lift stay motion	1.20	\$1,644.00
B140	06/18/25	BIW	Revise Renewed Lift Stay Motion	1.60	\$1,856.00
B140	06/20/25	CF	Review draft renewed motion to lift stay	1.00	\$660.00
B140	06/23/25	CF	Review and revise renewed motion to lift stay	6.80	\$4,488.00
B140	06/23/25	CF	Review and revise renewed lift stay motion	4.10	\$2,706.00
B140	06/24/25	BIW	Finalize Renewed Lift Stay Motion	0.90	\$1,044.00
B140	06/24/25	CF	Revise renewed motion to lift stay (2.1) and call with B. Weisenberg re: same (.2)	2.30	\$1,518.00
B140	06/25/25	BIW	Finalize Renewed Lift Stay Motion	0.20	\$232.00
B140	06/26/25	BIW	Review recently entered Sacramento Lift Stay Stipulation	0.20	\$232.00
B140	07/07/25	BIW	Begin outlining reply to impending objections to Renewed Lift Stay Motion	0.70	\$812.00
B140	07/09/25	BIW	Continue outlining contemplated response to lift stay objections while preparing for hearing on same	1.10	\$1,276.00
B140	07/10/25	BIW	Review lift stay objections	1.20	\$1,392.00
B140	07/10/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: summarize lift stay objections	0.30	\$348.00
B140	07/10/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: financial analysis underlying Plan	0.30	\$348.00
B140	07/10/25	BIW	Continue drafting Reply to Lift Stay Objections	2.20	\$2,552.00
B140	07/10/25	JDP	Review objections to renewed lift stay motion (1.5); review and edit draft reply (1.1)	2.60	\$3,562.00
B140	07/11/25	BIW	Continue drafting reply to lift stay objections	1.70	\$1,972.00
B140	07/11/25	JDP	Review and edit draft reply in support of renewed stay relief motion	2.30	\$3,151.00
B140	07/13/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: Lift Stay Reply issues	0.30	\$348.00
B140	07/13/25	BIW	Finalize Lift Stay Reply	0.40	\$464.00
B140	07/14/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: Lift Stay Reply issues	0.30	\$348.00
B140	07/14/25	BIW	Prepare for hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion	0.90	\$1,044.00
B140	07/14/25	JDP	Review and revise reply in support of renewed stay relief motion	1.60	\$2,192.00
B140	07/15/25	BIW	Prepare for Renewed Lift Stay hearing	1.30	\$1,508.00
B140	07/17/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: debrief on prior day's Lift Stay hearing	0.40	\$464.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B140	07/17/25	BIW	Revise proposed order granting Renewed Lift Stay Motion (.2); email correspondence re: same (.2)	0.40	\$464.00
B140	07/21/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: process for moving lift stay cases forward	0.10	\$137.00
B140	07/22/25	BIW	Draft email to R. Simons re: attendance at following day's CMC	0.10	\$116.00
B140	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with Foley Insurance Team re: following day's CMC	0.40	\$464.00
B140	07/23/25	BIW	Draft email to Foley Insurance Team re: prosecution of CMC cases	0.20	\$232.00
B140	07/27/25	BIW	Draft email to R. Simons re: entry of Lift Stay Order	0.20	\$232.00
B140	07/30/25	JDP	Review and respond to email from SCC re: best practices on stay relief motions	0.20	\$274.00
B140	08/15/25	BIW	Confer with Burns Bair re: prepare for call with Debtor on progress of State Court Actions	0.20	\$232.00
B140	08/15/25	BIW	Confer with Debtor on progress of State Court Actions	0.20	\$232.00
B140	08/15/25	JDP	Call with T. Burns re: case selection for proceeding in State Court	0.20	\$274.00
B140	08/18/25	JDP	Review and respond to emails re: case selection process in State Court	0.20	\$274.00
			Total B140 - Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	53.80	\$56,536.00
B150 Meetin	gs of and Com	munication wit	h Creditors		
B150	05/07/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: BOG Amended Complaint	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/08/25	JDP	Confer with SCC re: confirmation discovery	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	05/08/25	MAK	Confer with individual committee member counsel re: confirmation discovery	0.90	\$1,021.50
B150	05/09/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: explain expert retentions	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/10/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: summarize protective order pleadings	0.30	\$348.00
B150	05/12/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: status of case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/13/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: provide draft of objection to Administrative Fee Order	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/14/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: impending deposition demands and subpoenas	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/14/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee re: agenda for following day's call	0.20	\$232.00
B150	05/14/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: committee members testifying at confirmation	0.50	\$685.00
B150	05/15/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivor re: balloting issues	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/15/25	BIW	Participate on call with counsel to Committee members re: debrief on recent Court rulings	0.50	\$580.00
B150	05/15/25	MAK	Call with SCC to prepare for committee call	0.50	\$567.50
B150	05/16/25	BIW	Participate on call with Committee members re: debrief on recent Court rulings	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	05/16/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: discuss Plan confirmation issues	0.70	\$812.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	05/16/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.10	\$1,507.00
B150	05/16/25	MAK	Participate in committee call	1.10	\$1,248.50
B150	05/19/25	BIW	Confer with creditor re: status of Plan confirmation hearings	0.30	\$348.00
B150	05/19/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivors re: status of Coordinated Proceedings	0.30	\$348.00
B150	05/20/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of voting and plan confirmation discovery	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/23/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of Plan voting	0.30	\$348.00
B150	05/24/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: summarize motions to Dismiss BOG Complaint	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/24/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: summarize motions to Dismiss Restricted Asset Complaint	0.50	\$580.00
B150	05/27/25	BIW	Confer with client for Committee Member re: status of voting	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/27/25	BIW	Confer with client for Committee Member re: case resolution	0.60	\$696.00
B150	05/28/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Plan voting	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/28/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: status of Plan vote and next steps	1.00	\$1,160.00
B150	05/28/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: strategy following voting deadline	1.00	\$1,370.00
B150	05/29/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: reminder of voting deadline	0.10	\$116.00
B150	05/29/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: summarize opposition briefs to Motions to Dismiss	0.80	\$928.00
B150	05/29/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to counsel for Committee member re: ramifications of failing to vote	0.10	\$116.00
B150	05/29/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: need for assistance with claim	0.40	\$464.00
B150	05/29/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: prepare for following week's depositions and hearings	1.20	\$1,392.00
B150	06/02/25	BIW	Drat email to Committee re: update on final Plan vote and next steps	0.40	\$464.00
B150	06/02/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B150	06/04/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Plan confirmation strategy	0.80	\$928.00
B150	06/04/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: status of deps and strategy	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	06/06/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Plan confirmation strategy	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	06/10/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on Plan confirmation litigation	0.60	\$696.00
B150	06/10/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: update on Plan confirmation litigation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	06/12/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee members re: update on litigation	0.70	\$812.00
B150	06/12/25	JDP	Participate in call with SCC re: litigation status	0.70	\$959.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	06/13/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee re: Bi-weekly call	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	06/13/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on Court's ruling	0.40	\$464.00
B150	06/13/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	06/17/25	BIW	Confer with counsel to Committee member re: status of discovery	0.30	\$348.00
B150	06/17/25	BIW	Confer with counsel to Committee member re: fact discovery issues	0.40	\$464.00
B150	06/18/25	BIW	Confer with counsel to Committee member re: fact discovery issues	0.40	\$464.00
B150	06/18/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member and counsel to Committee member re: willingness to serve as Committee designee for deposition	0.40	\$464.00
B150	06/19/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: explanation of renewed lift stay motion	0.40	\$464.00
B150	06/20/25	BIW	Confer with counsel to Committee member re: discovery update	0.20	\$232.00
B150	06/25/25	BIW	Confer with S. Woodall re: service as Committee deponent (2 @ .3 each)	0.60	\$696.00
B150	06/25/25	BIW	Confer with R. Simons re: S. Woodall service as Committee deponent	0.20	\$232.00
B150	06/25/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on recent events and upcoming deadlines in lieu of bi-weekly call	0.60	\$696.00
B150	06/26/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to State Court Counsel re: answer inquiry on litigation strategy	0.20	\$232.00
B150	06/26/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to Committee member re: answer inquiry on case update email	0.10	\$116.00
B150	06/30/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: timing of Committee designee deposition	0.20	\$232.00
B150	07/01/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to Survivor re: status of case	0.30	\$348.00
B150	07/09/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: status of plan confirmation proceedings	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/10/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/10/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee member re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	0.30	\$348.00
B150	07/10/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/10/25	JDP	Participate in SCC update call	0.60	\$822.00
B150	07/11/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	1.00	\$1,160.00
B150	07/11/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/11/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.00	\$1,370.00
B150	07/11/25	MAK	Participate in committee call	1.00	\$1,135.00
B150	07/13/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: filings expected in the coming week	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/13/25	BIW	Email correspondence with counsel for Committee members re: form of insurance assignment	0.30	\$348.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/14/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: update on plan confirmation trial	0.70	\$812.00
B150	07/14/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on plan confirmation trial	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/14/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: coordinate call for later in the week	0.10	\$116.00
B150	07/15/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: lift stay hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B150	07/17/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee members re: debrief on previous day's hearing	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on hearing on Debtor's request for adjournment	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Participate in bi-weekly call with Committee members	1.20	\$1,392.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: prepare for hearing on Debtor's request for adjournment	0.30	\$348.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: update on status of case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: debrief on Wednesday's hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on Committee call earlier in the day	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: debrief on Adjournment Hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/18/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.20	\$1,644.00
B150	07/19/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on recent events	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/21/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee member re: go forward strategy	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	07/21/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: debrief on recent events	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/21/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: moving case forward	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	07/22/25	BIW	Develop go forward strategy in light of Plan confirmation adjournment	0.50	\$580.00
B150	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: following day's CMC	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/23/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee members' counsel re: Judge's ruling on SubCon and adjournment of Plan confirmation hearing	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	07/23/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of negotiations	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/23/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: path forward	1.10	\$1,507.00
B150	07/24/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on adjournment of Plan confirmation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/24/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee member re: Judge's ruling on SubCon and adjournment of Plan confirmation hearing	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/24/25	BIW	Review motion to deem late filed claim timely (.4); draft email to Committee re: same (.3)	0.70	\$812.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/24/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: Judge's ruling on SubCon and adjournment of Plan confirmation hearing	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	07/24/25	JDP	Participate in SCC update call	1.10	\$1,507.00
B150	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of negotiations	0.20	\$232.00
B150	07/25/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee members re: Judge's ruling on SubCon and adjournment of Plan confirmation hearing	1.00	\$1,160.00
B150	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Restricted Assets adversary proceeding	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of 5108 cases	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/25/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.00	\$1,370.00
B150	07/28/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: scope of automatic stay	0.20	\$232.00
B150	07/28/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: renewing mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/29/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee member re: prospects for further mediation	0.70	\$812.00
B150	07/29/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: settlement alternatives	0.70	\$959.00
B150	07/30/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee members re: prospects for further mediation	0.60	\$696.00
B150	08/01/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel to Committee Members re: mediation before Judge Lafferty	0.20	\$232.00
B150	08/04/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG re: asset analysis	1.00	\$1,160.00
B150	08/05/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of case	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/06/25	BIW	Confer with creditor inquiring about status of case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/06/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of state court cases	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/07/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: update on State Court proceedings	0.60	\$696.00
B150	08/07/25	BIW	Draft two emails to survivors responding to inquiries	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/07/25	JDP	Participate in SCC update and strategy call	0.60	\$822.00
B150	08/08/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee members re: update on case status	1.00	\$1,160.00
B150	08/08/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: update on status conference held earlier in the day	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/08/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/08/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on Status Conference	0.50	\$580.00
B150	08/08/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/08/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on Status Conference	0.50	\$580.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 9 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	08/08/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on Status Conference	0.60	\$696.00
B150	08/08/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.00	\$1,370.00
B150	08/08/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: update on status conference before Judge Lafferty	0.20	\$274.00
B150	08/09/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: settlement analyses	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/09/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: settlement analyses	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/10/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: Notices of Appeal filed by Insurers to Lift Stay Order	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/11/25	BIW	Participle in call with counsel for Committee members re: settlement analyses	1.80	\$2,088.00
B150	08/11/25	BIW	Participle in call with counsel for Committee member re: settlement analyses	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/11/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivor re: status of case	0.20	\$232.00
B150	08/11/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: settlement analyses	0.50	\$580.00
B150	08/11/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: settlement analyses	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/11/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: settlement proposal	1.80	\$2,466.00
B150	08/12/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivor re: request for additional information	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/12/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivor re: request for additional information	0.20	\$232.00
B150	08/12/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivor re: request for additional information	0.20	\$232.00
B150	08/14/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: debrief on prior day's Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/14/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on prior day's Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/14/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: debrief on prior day's Status Conference	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/14/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on prior day's Status Conference	0.50	\$580.00
B150	08/21/25	BIW	Review and revise email to Survivor re: claim inquiry	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/21/25	JDP	Draft email to committee re: 8/20 status conference before Judge Corley	0.30	\$411.00
B150	08/25/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: agenda for following day's call	0.20	\$232.00
B150	08/26/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivors re: respond to request for status of case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/26/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: request for call in light of recent developments	0.60	\$696.00
B150	08/27/25	BIW	Draft email to Survivor re: respond to inquiry on POC	0.20	\$232.00
B150	08/27/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: questions on claim allowance	0.40	\$464.00
B150	08/27/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on status of case	0.20	\$232.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 10 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	08/27/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on status of case	0.60	\$696.00
B150	08/27/25	BIW	Confer with two additional counsel for Committee members re: debrief on status of case	0.60	\$696.00
B150	08/27/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: update on briefing schedule in Lift Stay appeal	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/27/25	BMC	Correspondence with claimant and call with same	0.70	\$504.00
B150	08/28/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: procedural course of case	0.50	\$580.00
B150	08/28/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: prepare for meeting with Committee members	1.20	\$1,392.00
B150	08/28/25	JDP	Call with SCC to present settlement scenarios	1.20	\$1,644.00
B150	08/29/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: procedural course of case	0.60	\$696.00
B150	08/29/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee Members re: CCSS sale issues	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/29/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: CCSS Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B150	08/30/25	JDP	Review and edit draft email to SCC re: recommendation on Debtor's motion to release interests in CCSS	0.20	\$274.00
B150	08/31/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee member re: respond to inquiry on case status	0.30	\$348.00
			Total B150 - Meetings of and Communication with	87.70	\$105,305.50
B155 Mediat	ion		Creditors		
B155	05/22/25	BIW	Confer with Burns Bair re: status of mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B155	06/12/25	JDP	Review and update settlement position	0.50	\$685.00
B155	06/13/25	JDP	Review settlement strategy	0.50	\$685.00
B155	06/30/25	BIW	Confer with M. Lee re: mediation issues (.8); confer with J. Prol re: same (.2)	1.00	\$1,160.00
B155	06/30/25	JDP	Call with M. Lee re: settlement structures (.8); strategize with B. Weisenberg re: same (.2)	1.00	\$1,370.00
B155	07/01/25	JDP	Emails from/to A. Uetz re: scheduling settlement meeting	0.20	\$274.00
B155	07/19/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: updating settlement proposal	0.50	\$685.00
B155	07/22/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: settlement analysis (1.1); develop strategy re: ability to pay analysis (.6)	1.70	\$2,329.00
B155	07/23/25	JDP	Review and update ability to pay analysis and insurance allocation; develop settlement position	0.60	\$822.00
B155	07/24/25	JDP	Develop alternative settlement model	1.20	\$1,644.00
B155	07/28/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG re: asset analysis	1.00	\$1,160.00
B155	07/28/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: settlement analysis	1.00	\$1,370.00
B155	07/30/25	BIW	Participate in call with Stout re: claims analysis	0.40	\$464.00
B155	07/30/25	BIW	Review Westport letter re: mediator proposal and draft emails re same	0.30	\$348.00
B155	07/30/25	CMR	Summary review of Westport letter to Court re: mediation	0.20	\$225.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 11 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B155	07/30/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: settlement analysis	1.10	\$1,507.00
B155	07/30/25	JDP	Call with Stout re: settlement analysis	0.50	\$685.00
B155	07/31/25	JDP	Review, analyze and comment on revised settlement analysis	1.20	\$1,644.00
B155	07/31/25	JDP	Review and respond to Westport letter to court re: mediation	0.50	\$685.00
B155	08/01/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: settlement analysis	0.50	\$685.00
B155	08/01/25	JDP	Develop settlement proposal and strategy	2.20	\$3,014.00
B155	08/04/25	BIW	Devise mediation strategy	0.60	\$696.00
B155	08/04/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: revised settlement analysis (1.); confer with B. Weisenberg re: strategy (.3)	1.30	\$1,781.00
B155	08/06/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft of settlement analysis	0.60	\$822.00
B155	08/07/25	BIW	Draft Mediation Presentation	1.10	\$1,276.00
B155	08/07/25	BIW	Continue drafting Mediation Presentation	1.30	\$1,508.00
B155	08/07/25	BIW	Confer with Stout re: claims count analysis	0.60	\$696.00
B155	08/07/25	BIW	Review Debtor's letter to Court re: request for Judge Lafferty to serve as mediator (.2); draft emails re: same (.2)	0.40	\$464.00
B155	08/07/25	JDP	Review and revise presentation of revised settlement strategy	1.40	\$1,918.00
B155	08/08/25	BIW	Confer with Stout re: claims count analysis	0.40	\$464.00
B155	08/08/25	BIW	Devise settlement strategy	0.70	\$812.00
B155	08/08/25	BIW	Draft response to Debtor's letter to Court re: request for Judge Lafferty to serve as mediator	1.40	\$1,624.00
B155	08/08/25	BIW	Revise mediation presentation for Committee	0.60	\$696.00
B155	08/08/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team re: response to letter re: mediation	0.20	\$225.00
B155	08/08/25	JDP	Review Debtor's letter to Court requesting Judge Lafferty serve as mediator; review and comment on draft response	0.60	\$822.00
B155	08/08/25	JDP	Review and edit draft settlement proposal	1.30	\$1,781.00
B155	08/08/25	RKC	Review and analyze prior insurer filings re: use of judge as mediator	1.20	\$1,170.00
B155	08/09/25	BIW	Revise settlement analyses	0.60	\$696.00
B155	08/09/25	JDP	Call with Judge Sontchi re: returning to mediation	0.50	\$685.00
B155	08/09/25	JDP	Strategize with B. Weisenberg re: return to mediation	0.50	\$685.00
B155	08/09/25	JDP	Review and edit deck for mediation proposal	1.40	\$1,918.00
B155	08/10/25	BIW	Revise Settlement Analysis	0.90	\$1,044.00
B155	08/10/25	BIW	Further revise Settlement Analysis based on Committee professional comments	0.40	\$464.00
B155	08/11/25	BIW	Revise Settlement Analyses	0.70	\$812.00
B155	08/11/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: Insurer settlement analyses	0.20	\$232.00
B155	08/11/25	BIW	Review certain filed Abuse Claims to assist in settlement analyses	0.60	\$696.00
B155	08/11/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee professionals re: Settlement Analysis	0.40	\$464.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 12 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B155	08/11/25	BIW	Further revise Settlement Analysis based on Committee professional comments	0.70	\$812.00
B155	08/11/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee professionals re: Settlement Analysis	0.80	\$928.00
B155	08/11/25	JDP	Review settlement analysis slide deck to prepare for professionals call (.5); call with professionals to review deck and prepare presentation for SCC (.8)	1.30	\$1,781.00
B155	08/11/25	JDP	Edit settlement deck to prepare for SCC call	0.60	\$822.00
B155	08/11/25	JDP	Follow-up call with Committee professionals re: settlement proposal	0.40	\$548.00
B155	08/12/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee professionals re: Settlement Analysis	1.10	\$1,276.00
B155	08/12/25	BIW	Modify Settlement Analysis in advance of Committee meeting	0.60	\$696.00
B155	08/12/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: settlement analysis	1.10	\$1,507.00
B155	08/12/25	JDP	Analyze SCC comments to settlement analysis and review strategy	0.70	\$959.00
B155	08/13/25	BIW	Modify Settlement Analysis in advance of Committee meeting	0.50	\$580.00
B155	08/13/25	BIW	Revise Child Protection Protocols	0.80	\$928.00
B155	08/15/25	BIW	Refine settlement analysis	0.70	\$812.00
B155	08/19/25	JDP	Review and edit settlement deck	1.50	\$2,055.00
B155	08/20/25	JDP	Review and edit draft deck re: settlement analysis	0.80	\$1,096.00
B155	08/24/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: settlement offer	0.40	\$548.00
B155	08/24/25	JDP	Preliminary review of RCBO settlement offer	0.40	\$548.00
B155	08/24/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg and M. Kaplan re: RCBO settlement offer	0.40	\$548.00
B155	08/25/25	BIW	Review recent decision on TDPs and insurance assignments	1.40	\$1,624.00
B155	08/25/25	JDP	Review and analyze RCBO settlement proposal and develop strategy	1.40	\$1,918.00
B155	08/26/25	BIW	Confer with Stout re: review analysis of claim count and valuation	0.40	\$464.00
B155	08/26/25	BIW	Revise settlement analysis	0.70	\$812.00
B155	08/26/25	BIW	Review Debtor's settlement offer (.3); confer with J. Prol re: same (.4)	0.70	\$812.00
B155	08/26/25	BIW	Review latest draft of Child Protection Protocols	0.80	\$928.00
B155	08/26/25	BIW	Review recent JCCP decision in In re Northern District of California clergy cases	0.80	\$928.00
B155	08/26/25	CMR	Analyze Debtor settlement proposal	0.80	\$900.00
B155	08/27/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: analysis of Debtor's settlement offer and response thereto	0.60	\$696.00
B155	08/27/25	BIW	Review Debtor's proposed Child Protection Protocols	0.70	\$812.00
B155	08/27/25	BIW	Draft emails to BRG re: review of settlement analysis	0.20	\$232.00
B155	08/27/25	JDP	Review and edit settlement response	1.40	\$1,918.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 13 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B155	08/28/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee professionals re: prepare for meeting with counsel for Committee members	1.10	\$1,276.00
B155	08/28/25	BIW	Revise Settlement Analysis Presentation for Committee	0.60	\$696.00
B155	08/28/25	JDP	Call with Judge Sontchi re: restarting mediation	0.30	\$411.00
B155	08/28/25	JDP	Review draft power point presentation to prepare for call with committee professionals and for call with SCC (.5); call with committee professionals to finalize presentation and prepare for call with SCC resettlement scenarios (1.1)	1.60	\$2,192.00
B155	08/29/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: settlement proposal	0.40	\$548.00
B155	08/30/25	JDP	Review and respond to letter from T. Schiavoni re: meet and confer request	0.20	\$274.00
			Total B155 - Mediation	63.30	\$80,241.00
B160 Fee/Em	nployment App	olications			
B160	05/05/25	DC	Review Omnibus Order Approving Committee Fee Applications and verify LS amounts	0.30	\$120.00
B160	05/08/25	DC	E-mails with C. Restel re: pro hac vice applications for R. Chahil and C. Dernbach	0.20	\$80.00
B160	05/09/25	CD	Review pro hac vice application	0.10	\$86.50
B160	05/09/25	DC	Prepare draft pro hac vice applications for R. Chahil and C. Dernbach (.9); revise applications per attorney comments and forward drafts to local counsel for review (.4)	1.30	\$520.00
B160	05/12/25	DC	Revise pro hac applications for R. Chahil and C. Dernbach and tend to filing same	0.90	\$360.00
B160	05/27/25	DC	Prepare draft LS' April Monthly Fee Statement	0.40	\$160.00
B160	05/30/25	DC	Reconcile fees and update fee application status chart	0.30	\$120.00
B160	06/11/25	DC	Commence preparation of LS' Sixth Interim Fee Application	1.30	\$520.00
B160	06/12/25	DC	Continue drafting LS' Sixth Interim Fee Application	5.70	\$2,280.00
B160	06/13/25	BIW	Review and revise Interim Fee Application pleadings	1.20	\$1,392.00
B160	06/13/25	DC	Continue drafting LS' Sixth Interim Fee Application with formatted exhibits A-G	2.10	\$840.00
B160	06/13/25	EBL	Work on reconciliation of account for sixth interim fee application; emails with D. Claussen re: same	0.70	\$266.00
B160	06/16/25	BIW	Finalize Lowenstein Interim Fee Application	0.20	\$232.00
B160	06/16/25	DC	Edit, format and finalize LS' Sixth Interim Fee Application with exhibits and supporting Declarations	1.20	\$480.00
B160	06/16/25	JDP	Review and edit interim fee application	0.40	\$548.00
B160	06/17/25	DC	Prepare LEDES files and forward to the UST (.3); download filed copies of fee applications, update electronic files and attorney calendar (.3)	0.60	\$240.00
B160	06/20/25	DC	Commence preparation of draft budget for Seventh Interim Period (.4), review and research re: contested confirmation hearing for other diocesan matters and confer with B. Weisenberg re: same (.5)	0.90	\$360.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 14 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B160	06/20/25	DC	Email to UST forwarding LEDES files for LS' Sixth Interim Fee Application	0.10	\$40.00
B160	06/23/25	BIW	Revise May through August 2025 budget	0.40	\$464.00
B160	06/25/25	DC	Reconcile fees and update A/R report with accounting	0.20	\$80.00
B160	06/26/25	DC	Update fee application spreadsheet	0.10	\$40.00
B160	06/30/25	DC	Edit and format budget for seventh interim period	0.40	\$160.00
B160	06/30/25	DC	Draft LS' May 2025 Monthly Fee Statement (.4); revise monthly fee statement pursuant to modified Interim Compensation Order (.2)	0.60	\$240.00
B160	07/01/25	DC	Edit and finalize budget for seventh interim period; update fee application status chart	0.40	\$160.00
B160	07/01/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft budget	0.20	\$274.00
B160	07/23/25	DC	Download CNO for LS May Monthly Fee Statement, confer with team re: applied funds and update fee application status chart	0.20	\$80.00
B160	07/31/25	JDP	Review fee examiner's interim report re: LS interim fee application and develop response (.5); Telephone conference with D. Klauder re: same (.3)	0.80	\$1,096.00
B160	08/06/25	JDP	Review fee examiner follow-up analysis re: LS interim fee app and respond	0.20	\$274.00
B160	08/29/25	DC	Prepare Lowenstein's twenty-sixth monthly fee statement with exhibits for filing	0.50	\$200.00
			Total B160 - Fee/Employment Applications	21.90	\$11,712.50
B165 Employ	ment and Rete	ention Applicati	ions - Others		
B165	05/04/25	LHS	Work on expert retention applications	0.70	\$738.50
B165	05/05/25	LHS	Work on expert retention applications	3.00	\$3,165.00
B165	05/06/25	LHS	Work on expert retention applications	4.00	\$4,220.00
B165	05/07/25	BIW	Review and revise expert retention pleadings (4 experts)	1.60	\$1,856.00
B165	05/07/25	LHS	Work on drafting and revising expert retention applications (3.0); review revisions and e-mails from B. Weisenberg and make additional edits to retention applications for experts (.5); exchange correspondences with experts re: finalizing retention applications (.3)	3.80	\$4,009.00
B165	05/08/25	BIW	Review and revise expert retention pleadings for J. Haselberger	0.30	\$348.00
B165	05/08/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to prospective expert re: terms of retention	0.30	\$348.00
B165	05/08/25	LHS	Review responses from potential experts and exchange additional correspondence to finalize applications (.6); review and incorporate revisions to expert retention applications from insurance counsel (.4); revise applications further (.7)	1.70	\$1,793.50
B165	05/09/25	BIW	Review and revise expert retention pleadings for J. Stempel and J. Lipson	0.60	\$696.00
B165	05/09/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert re: terms of retention	0.50	\$580.00
B165	05/09/25	JDP	Review expert retention pleadings	0.60	\$822.00
B165	05/09/25	JDP	Review and comment on expert retention applications	0.40	\$548.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 15 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B165	05/09/25	LHS	Review comments to expert retention application from M. Kaplan (.2); exchange with proposed experts to complete retention application (.6); call with potential expert and B. Weisenberg (.5); review comments from multiple experts on applications and declarations (2); further revise and finalize retention applications (3.5)	6.80	\$7,174.00
B165	05/09/25	MAK	Review and revise retention application for rebuttal canon law expert	0.30	\$340.50
B165	05/10/25	BIW	Revise Expert Retention Applications	0.40	\$464.00
B165	05/10/25	JDP	Review and respond to emails from LS team re: Klomparens retention	0.20	\$274.00
B165	05/10/25	LHS	Revise and finalize expert retention applications	4.00	\$4,220.00
B165	05/11/25	BIW	Review and revise Lipson retention pleadings	0.80	\$928.00
B165	05/11/25	LHS	Exchange correspondences with experts re: finalizing retention applications	0.30	\$316.50
B165	05/12/25	BIW	Review revisions to Expert Retention Applications	0.30	\$348.00
B165	05/12/25	LHS	Revise and finalize Lipson expert retention application (.6); review revisions to Klomparens application and make additional changes (.6); calls and correspondence with experts re: retention applications (1.0)	2.20	\$2,321.00
B165	05/13/25	BIW	Review case law on use of experts	0.60	\$696.00
B165	05/13/25	LHS	Finalize Klomparens retention application (1.0); review case law re: response to expert retention objection (.3)	1.30	\$1,371.50
B165	05/14/25	BIW	Review research on use of experts in Ninth Circuit (.4); confer with L. Sklar and J. Jamison re: same (.4)	0.80	\$928.00
B165	05/14/25	BIW	Review revisions to Expert Retention Applications	0.20	\$232.00
B165	05/14/25	JBJ	Prepare for (0.2) and participate in (0.4) meeting with B. Weisenberg and L. Sklar re: expert retention reply	0.60	\$471.00
B165	05/14/25	LHS	Call with B. Weisenberg and J. Jameson re: response to expert retention objection	0.40	\$422.00
B165	05/14/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein team re: research in preparation for reply briefs on expert retention opposition issues	0.20	\$195.00
B165	05/15/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns and J. Bair re: anticipated objection to Insurance Expert	0.40	\$464.00
B165	05/15/25	JBJ	Draft expert retention reply	3.70	\$2,904.50
B165	05/16/25	JDP	Confer with LS team re: strategy re: expert retention	0.30	\$411.00
B165	05/16/25	LHS	Attention to e-mails between debtors and committee re: resolution of issues re: expert retention and revise proposed order	0.70	\$738.50
B165	05/16/25	MAK	Call with M. Lee re: expert retentions	0.40	\$454.00
B165	05/18/25	LHS	Review e-mail re: resolution of expert retention issues between Committee and Debtors	0.10	\$105.50
B165	05/20/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Lee re: proposed order granting Haselberger retention	0.10	\$116.00
B165	05/20/25	LHS	Exchange e-mails with B. Weisenberg and G. Albert re: expert retention order and revise order for filing	0.30	\$316.50
B165	06/05/25	BIW	Review Debtor's application to retain NERA	0.20	\$232.00
			Total B165 - Employment and Retention	43.10	\$45,567.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 16 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
			Applications - Others		
B170 Fee/Em	nployment Obj	ections		-	
B170	05/09/25	CMR	Review Objection to Motion to Revise Interim Compensation Procedures	0.40	\$450.00
B170	05/12/25	CMR	Prepare discovery re: Interim Compensation Motion	0.30	\$337.50
B170	05/30/25	CMR	Review and revise Sur-Reply re: Motion to Amend Interim Compensation Procedures	0.80	\$900.00
B170	05/30/25	JDP	Review and comment on sur-reply in further opposition to motion to amend administrative fee order	0.50	\$685.00
B170	07/10/25	BIW	Draft objection to Foley's May MFS	1.10	\$1,276.00
B170	07/10/25	JDP	Review and edit objection to Foley fee application	1.40	\$1,918.00
B170	07/11/25	BIW	Draft email to Debtor's counsel re: response to objection to Lowenstein's May MFS	0.20	\$232.00
B170	07/11/25	CF	Draft motion to enforce the interim compensation order and related motion to shorten papers	7.70	\$5,082.00
B170	07/11/25	DC	Prepare summary chart of professionals' fees for response to objection	0.60	\$240.00
B170	07/11/25	JDP	Review and edit objection to Foley May fee statement	1.30	\$1,781.00
B170	07/11/25	JDP	Develop strategy re: fee dispute	0.60	\$822.00
B170	07/11/25	JDP	Review and edit draft email to Foley re: objection to May fee statement	0.20	\$274.00
B170	07/12/25	BIW	Review and revise Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order and Motion to Shorten Time	0.80	\$928.00
B170	07/12/25	CF	Revise motion to enforce interim compensation order	1.30	\$858.00
B170	07/12/25	CF	Emails to/from J. Prol and B. Weisenberg re: motion to enforce admin fee order revisions	0.40	\$264.00
B170	07/12/25	JDP	Review and revise draft motion to compel compliance with Administrative fee order	3.20	\$4,384.00
B170	07/13/25	BIW	Review and revise Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order, Motion to Shorten Time and Weisenberg Declaration	0.60	\$696.00
B170	07/14/25	BIW	Review and revise Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order, Motion to Shorten Time and Weisenberg Declaration	0.70	\$812.00
B170	07/14/25	JDP	Review and revise draft of motion to compel enforcement of administrative fee order	1.50	\$2,055.00
B170	07/15/25	BIW	Confer with M. Lee re: meet and confer on fee objection	1.00	\$1,160.00
B170	07/15/25	JDP	Participate in call with B. Weisenberg and M. Lee re: discovery requests and fee objections	1.00	\$1,370.00
B170	07/16/25	DC	Prepare chart of professionals' fees billed to date for court hearing	0.60	\$240.00
B170	07/17/25	BIW	Revise Order granting Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order (.1); email correspondence re: same (.2)	0.30	\$348.00
B170	07/17/25	DC	Confer with local counsel re: objection to LS' May Monthly Fee Statement (.1); review docket and draft CNO (.3)	0.40	\$160.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 17 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B170	07/17/25	JDP	Review proposed order granting motion to compel compliance with Administrative Fee Order and Debtor's objection to same; revise form of order; confer with B. Weisenberg re: same	0.40	\$548.00
B170	07/22/25	BIW	Review Fee Examiner's Report re: Sixth Interim Fee Application	0.20	\$232.00
B170	07/30/25	JDP	Preliminary review of fee examiner report on LS interim fee app; preliminary review of fee application and develop response	0.30	\$411.00
B170	07/30/25	JDP	Review LS monthly fee request for June to prepare for fee objection hearing	0.30	\$411.00
B170	08/09/25	JAR	Calls with B. Weisenberg re: objection to counsel to Debtor's June fee statement (0.2); draft objection to counsel to Debtor's June fee statement (1.8)	2.00	\$1,320.00
B170	08/14/25	LHS	Draft objection to OCP retention	1.60	\$1,688.00
B170	08/15/25	BIW	Review and revise Objection to CO retention	0.50	\$580.00
B170	08/15/25	LHS	Review B. Weisenberg's revisions to CU OCP Objection and review new citations	0.60	\$633.00
B170	08/18/25	JDP	Review and comment on response to debtor's application to retain real estate consultant as ordinary course professional	0.30	\$411.00
B170	08/18/25	LHS	Attention to response from J. Prol re: OCP Objection and send final draft of OCP objection for filing	0.20	\$211.00
B170	08/19/25	LHS	Review filed objection to retention of CU as an OCP	0.20	\$211.00
B170	08/27/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Lee and S. Moses re: proposal to resolve objection to CU Advisory Corp. OCP retention	0.20	\$232.00
B170	08/27/25	BIW	Participate in call with M. Lee and S. Moses re: Meet and Confer on OCP retention	0.30	\$348.00
B170	08/27/25	JDP	Meet and confer with M. Lee re: OCP retention	0.30	\$411.00
B170	08/27/25	LHS	Review correspondence with debtor re: CU retention and acceptable form of order	0.30	\$316.50
B170	08/28/25	LHS	E-mail B. Weisenberg re: CU order (.2); review docket re: CU OCP application and related pleadings (.2)	0.40	\$422.00
			Total B170 - Fee/Employment Objections	35.00	\$35,658.00
B175 Fee Ap	oplications and	Invoices - Othe	<u>rs</u>		
B175	05/01/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: Administrative Fee Order negotiations	0.40	\$464.00
B175	05/05/25	BIW	Review and comment on Interim Fee Order objection	0.20	\$232.00
B175	05/05/25	CF	Review RCBO motion to modify interim compensation order and cash flow exhibits	0.90	\$594.00
B175	05/06/25	CF	Draft objection to Debtor's motion to amend interim compensation order	7.70	\$5,082.00
B175	05/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: evidence in support of Motion to Amend Interim Compensation Order	0.50	\$580.00
B175	05/07/25	BIW	Review and revise Objection to Motion to Amend Interim Compensation Order	1.70	\$1,972.00
B175	05/07/25	CF	Call with B. Weisenberg re: objection to motion to modify interim compensation procedures	0.10	\$66.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 18 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	05/08/25	BIW	Review and revise Objection to Motion to Amend Interim Compensation Order and outline discovery needed for same simultaneously	2.60	\$3,016.00
B175	05/08/25	BIW	Further revise Objection to Motion to Amend Interim Compensation Order and outline discovery needed for same simultaneously	0.60	\$696.00
B175	05/09/25	BIW	Draft email to BRG re: comments needed to Objection to Motion to Amend Interim Compensation Order and discovery needed for same	0.40	\$464.00
B175	05/09/25	BIW	Review and revise Objection to Motion to Amend Interim Compensation Order and revise outline discovery needed for same simultaneously	1.80	\$2,088.00
B175	05/09/25	CF	Email communications re objection to interim compensation motion and reviewing and commenting on revised objection re same	0.40	\$264.00
B175	05/09/25	JDP	Review and edit objection to amend administrative fee order (1.4); call with B. Weisenberg re: same (.2); review revised draft of same (.6)	2.20	\$3,014.00
B175	05/12/25	BIW	Re-confer with BRG re: analyze Cash Forecast accompanying Motion to Amend Professional Fee Order	0.70	\$812.00
B175	05/12/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: analyze Cash Forecast accompanying Motion to Amend Professional Fee Order	1.10	\$1,276.00
B175	05/12/25	BIW	Revise objection to Motion to Amend Professional Fee Order	0.60	\$696.00
B175	05/12/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: analyze Debtor's financial performance	0.40	\$464.00
B175	05/12/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: assistance needed with discovery (2 @. 3 each)	0.60	\$696.00
B175	05/12/25	CF	Review transcripts and revise interim compensation objection	1.30	\$858.00
B175	05/13/25	BIW	Add additional arguments to Objection to Motion to Amend Professional Fee Order	0.90	\$1,044.00
B175	05/13/25	CF	Revise objection to motion to modify interim compensation order (.3); review transcripts re: same (.2); email communications with B. Weisenberg re: same (.1)	0.60	\$396.00
B175	05/14/25	BIW	Revise objection to Motion to Amend Professional Fee Order and related document demands (1.4); confer with BRG re: same (.4)	1.80	\$2,088.00
B175	05/16/25	BIW	Confer with M. Lee re: adjournment of Interim Fee Order Amendment Motion	0.20	\$232.00
B175	05/19/25	BIW	Review April MOR in connection with request to increase holdback	0.60	\$696.00
B175	05/20/25	BIW	Review M. Kemner April Invoice	0.20	\$232.00
B175	05/27/25	BIW	Review analysis of Restricted Assets in advance of hearing on Motion to Modify Fee Order	0.40	\$464.00
B175	05/30/25	BIW	Finalize motion requesting right to file surreply and surreply (.7); draft emails re: same (.2)	0.90	\$1,044.00
B175	05/30/25	BIW	Revise motion requesting right to file surreply and surreply	0.80	\$928.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 19 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	05/30/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Reply in Support of Motion to Amend Interim Fee Order; draft motion requesting right to file surreply and surreply	2.80	\$3,248.00
B175	06/02/25	JDP	Assist with preparation for hearing on motion to amend administrative fee order	0.40	\$548.00
B175	06/03/25	BIW	Draft email to A. Uetz re: outline settlement of Administrative Fee Order Objection filed by Committee	0.30	\$348.00
B175	06/09/25	BIW	Review Dr. Kemner May 2025 invoice	0.30	\$348.00
B175	06/11/25	BIW	Confer with P. Shields re: update on hearing on Interim Fee Order Modification Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B175	06/25/25	BIW	Review and revise Order amending Interim Compensation Order	0.30	\$348.00
B175	06/25/25	DC	Coordinate with committee professionals re: LEDES files for interim fee applications	0.40	\$160.00
B175	07/31/25	JDP	Receive and disburse funds for committee expense reimbursement applications	0.20	\$274.00
B175	08/01/25	JDP	Review and comment on committee member expense report	0.20	\$274.00
B175	08/05/25	JDP	Review Committee member expenses/reimbursement application	0.20	\$274.00
B175	08/22/25	BIW	Review and comment on Stout MFS	0.30	\$348.00
			Total B175 - Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	36.40	\$37,092.00
B190 Other C	Contested Matt	ers (excluding a	= ussumption/rejection motions)		
B190	05/08/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Dismiss	0.80	\$928.00
B190	05/09/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Dismiss	0.80	\$928.00
B190	05/09/25	MAK	Call with counsel for BRG re: UST notice	0.80	\$908.00
B190	05/12/25	BIW	Review Insurer's Response to BRG Data Incident Letter	0.10	\$116.00
B190	05/14/25	BIW	Draft emails to T. Schiavoni re: request for information (2 @ .2 each)	0.40	\$464.00
B190	05/14/25	JDP	Review email from T. Schivoni re: discovery re: BRG data incident and proposed response	0.30	\$411.00
B190	05/27/25	BIW	Review letter regarding U.S. Trustee Reply to Berkeley Research Group	0.40	\$464.00
B190	06/11/25	CF	Email communications with B. Weisenberg re: potential motion to dismiss case	0.10	\$66.00
B190	06/13/25	СТН	Obtain docket sheet and complaint for John Doe v. Diocese of Oakland, et al., Alameda County No. RG19008221	0.30	\$123.00
B190	06/17/25	CTH	Research access to older CA state court complaints	1.00	\$410.00
B190	06/26/25	СТН	Obtain complaints against Diocese for several cases filed in the 2000s	0.90	\$369.00
B190	08/04/25	BIW	Review Removal Extension Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B190	08/05/25	JDP	Review and comment on debtor's motion to extend time to remove actions	0.20	\$274.00

B200 - Operations

Total B190 - Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 20 of 101

motions) 6.40 \$5,809.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 21 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B210 Busines	ss Operations				
B210	05/22/25	JDP	Review notice to transfer assets to churches; analyze transfers	0.20	\$274.00
B210	06/09/25	BIW	Review Periodic Report Regarding Value, Operations, and Profitability of Entities in Which the Debtor's Estate Holds a Substantial or Controlling Interest	0.40	\$464.00
B210	06/20/25	BIW	Analyze May MOR and compare to Debtor's Cash Forecast (.4); draft email to BRG re: same (.2)	0.60	\$696.00
B210	07/10/25	BIW	Revise email objection to CCCEB payment	0.20	\$232.00
B210	07/10/25	CF	Call with B. Weisenberg re: Debtor payments to Cathedral Corp	0.20	\$132.00
B210	07/12/25	CF	Review documents and communications re: CCCEB Note and draft objection to CCCEB payments	3.60	\$2,376.00
B210	07/12/25	CF	Research case law re: "ordinary course" and docket re: CCCEB references (1.4); finalize objection to CCCEB payments (2.7)	4.10	\$2,706.00
B210	07/13/25	BIW	Review and revise objection to CCCEB quarterly payment	0.80	\$928.00
B210	07/14/25	BIW	Review and revise objection to CCCEB quarterly payment (.9); review research for same (.4)	1.30	\$1,508.00
B210	07/14/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: CCCEB Note issues	0.30	\$348.00
B210	07/14/25	CF	Research re: heightened scrutiny of insider payments	1.10	\$726.00
B210	07/14/25	JDP	Review and revise objection to proposed payment to CCCEB	2.20	\$3,014.00
B210	07/15/25	BIW	Review Debtor's reply to CCCEB Payment Objection	0.30	\$348.00
B210	07/21/25	BIW	Review June MOR	0.40	\$464.00
B210	07/22/25	BIW	Review email (with attachment) from M. Lee re: CCCEB Q3 funding	0.20	\$232.00
B210	08/22/25	BIW	Review July MOR	0.30	\$348.00
			Total B210 - Business Operations	16.20	\$14,796.00
B300 - Clain	is and Plan			_	
B310 Claims	Administratio	n and Objection	<u>ns</u>		
B310	05/06/25	JDP	Review transcript of hearing on motion to allow late filed claim	0.30	\$411.00
B310	05/13/25	BIW	Review claims filed	0.80	\$928.00
B310	05/14/25	BIW	Review proposed order granting Motion to Allow Late Filed Claim	0.20	\$232.00
B310	05/19/25	BIW	Review Abuse Claims	0.80	\$928.00
B310	05/27/25	CF	Review bar date order to determine whether current minors need to file proofs of claim	0.50	\$330.00
B310	07/14/25	BIW	Review Motion to Allow Late Claim	0.30	\$348.00
B310	07/23/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Moore re: late filed claims	0.10	\$116.00
B310	07/25/25	BIW	Draft follow up email to M. Moore re: late filed claims	0.10	\$116.00
B310	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with Stout re: re-review claims analysis	0.50	\$580.00
B310	07/25/25	JDP	Participate in call with M. Schwab re: claims analysis	0.50	\$685.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B310	07/28/25	BIW	Email correspondence with M. Moore re: late claims	0.20	\$232.00
B310	07/29/25	BIW	Email correspondence with M. Moore re: late claims	0.10	\$116.00
B310	08/04/25	BIW	Draft email to Stout re: claim deemed timely filed	0.20	\$232.00
B310	08/06/25	BIW	Review Debtor's and Insurer's objections to Late Claim Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B310	08/06/25	BIW	Review Claim Supplement re: recently filed claim	0.30	\$348.00
B310	08/07/25	BIW	Review research on late and informal proofs of claim (.4); draft email re: same (.3)	0.70	\$812.00
B310	08/07/25	BIW	Review and revise Statement in Support of Late Claim and Reply to Debtor's objection	0.40	\$464.00
B310	08/07/25	CMR	Review Objections to Late Filed Claims	0.40	\$450.00
B310	08/07/25	JDP	Review objections to motion to allow late filed claim; develop strategy	0.40	\$548.00
B310	08/08/25	CMR	Prepare Statement re: Motion for Late Claim	1.40	\$1,575.00
B310	08/08/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft response in support of late claim motion	0.30	\$411.00
B310	08/09/25	BIW	Confer with M. Lee and M. Moore re: adjournment of late claim motion	0.40	\$464.00
B310	08/09/25	CMR	Review and revise Statement re: Late Filed Claim	0.70	\$787.50
B310	08/09/25	JDP	Review and edit draft response to motion to allow late filed claim	0.30	\$411.00
B310	08/10/25	CMR	Review and revise Statement re: Late Filed Claim	0.10	\$112.50
B310	08/11/25	BMC	Call/emails with B. Weisenberg re: survivor claims analysis and creditor outreach	0.20	\$144.00
B310	08/18/25	BMC	Review pre-1962 claims and email B. Weisenberg re: same	0.20	\$144.00
B310	08/19/25	BMC	Call with A. Harriman re: review of certain proofs of claim (.1); review and analyze same (.1); correspondence with various counsel for survivors re: same (.3)	0.50	\$360.00
B310	08/20/25	BMC	Review and analyze proof of claims (2.1); various calls and emails with counsel for survivors and B. Weisenberg re: same (.5)	2.60	\$1,872.00
B310	08/21/25	BIW	Draft email to Stout re: updated claims analysis	0.30	\$348.00
B310	08/21/25	BIW	Draft email re: analysis of certain Abuse Claims	0.20	\$232.00
B310	08/21/25	BMC	Correspondence with B. Weisenberg and A. Harriman re: analysis of survivor proof of claim (.3); revise draft email to survivor and confer with B. Weisenberg re: same (.3); email survivor (.1)	0.70	\$504.00
B310	08/22/25	BIW	Draft email to A. Harriman re: questions on claims analysis	0.30	\$348.00
B310	08/22/25	BMC	Correspondence from Stout re: claims analysis (.2); correspondence with B. Weisenberg re: same (.2)	0.40	\$288.00
B310	08/23/25	BIW	Draft email to Stout Team re: questions on claim analysis	0.30	\$348.00
B310	08/23/25	BIW	Draft subsequent email to Stout re: claims analysis questions	0.30	\$348.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 23 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B310	08/24/25	BIW	Draft email to B. Clark re: analysis of certain Abuse	0.30	\$348.00
B310	08/25/25	BMC	Claims Various emails with B. Weisenberg, Stout, and POA for survivor re: claims analysis (.4); review POA for survivor and coordinate a call with same (.2)	0.60	\$432.00
B310	08/26/25	BIW	Confer with B. Clark re: analysis of certain Abuse Claims	0.20	\$232.00
B310	08/26/25	BMC	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: survivor proof of claim (.2); call with Stout re: claims analysis (.5); correspondence with claimant re: proof of claim (.1)	0.80	\$576.00
B310	08/27/25	BMC	Analyze claims (.4); confer with B. Weisenberg re: same (.2)	0.60	\$432.00
			Total B310 - Claims Administration and Objections	18.90	\$19,057.00
B320 Plan an	nd Disclosure S	Statement (inclu	ding Business Plan)		
B320	05/01/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Debtor responses to discovery requests (.3); prepare for Meet and Confer re: same (.1)	0.40	\$450.00
B320	05/01/25	JBJ	Review and respond to internal question re: research (0.1); meet with R. Chahil re: objection to motion quash (0.4)	0.50	\$392.50
B320	05/01/25	JDP	Prepare for confirmation hearing	2.00	\$2,740.00
B320	05/01/25	RKC	Review index of prior productions from RCBO	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/01/25	RKC	Draft objection to motion to quash subpoenas to churches	1.80	\$1,755.00
B320	05/01/25	RKC	Confer with J. Jameson re: research for objection to motion to quash	0.40	\$390.00
B320	05/02/25	CD	Research legal issue with respect to calling corporate designees at trial	1.30	\$1,124.50
B320	05/02/25	CMR	Prepare and serve list of potential fact witnesses re: Confirmation (.9); Summary review of Debtor list re: same (.5)	1.40	\$1,575.00
B320	05/02/25	JBJ	Legal research re: motion to quash (2.0); draft motion to quash (1.0)	3.00	\$2,355.00
B320	05/02/25	MAK	Review and analyze debtor fact witness list	0.40	\$454.00
B320	05/02/25	MAK	Review and revise opposition to motion to quash	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	05/02/25	MAK	Begin outlining topics for corporate designee depositions of debtor and affiliates	2.70	\$3,064.50
B320	05/03/25	AMG	Strategize re: Debtor's fact witness list	0.20	\$143.00
B320	05/03/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: Debtor's Fact Witness List	0.30	\$348.00
B320	05/03/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Debtor's fact witnesses and preparation for deposition of same	0.40	\$450.00
B320	05/03/25	LHS	Review research re: fact witnesses	0.30	\$316.50
B320	05/03/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions of RCBO witnesses	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/03/25	RKC	Strategize re: deposition notices and subpoenas	1.30	\$1,267.50
B320	05/04/25	AMG	Draft deposition notices and subpoenas for Debtor's fact witnesses	1.50	\$1,072.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 24 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/04/25	CMR	Summary review of draft subpoenas re: Debtor's fact witnesses (.3); Prepare for Meet and Confer with Debtor's counsel re: confirmation discovery (.5)	0.80	\$900.00
B320	05/04/25	JBJ	Review (0.6) and revise (0.6) draft subpoena and deposition notices	1.20	\$942.00
B320	05/04/25	MAK	Call with C. Restel to prepare for meet and confer	0.30	\$340.50
B320	05/04/25	MAK	Prepare for discovery meet and confer with debtor	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	05/04/25	RKC	Review/revise draft deposition subpoena form	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/05/25	AMG	Draft and revise subpoenas for Debtor's fact witnesses	7.50	\$5,362.50
B320	05/05/25	CD	Prepare deposition outlines	1.10	\$951.50
B320	05/05/25	CD	Draft task list (0.6); draft email to Non-Debtor Catholic Entities re: deficiencies in discovery responses (2.0)	2.60	\$2,249.00
B320	05/05/25	CGS	Conduct research regarding non-party document production	1.50	\$1,177.50
B320	05/05/25	CMR	Meet and Confer with Debtor's counsel re: confirmation discovery (1.2); Analyze issues and prepare for fact witness depositions (3.8); Analyze issues re: expert witnesses (.5)	5.50	\$6,187.50
B320	05/05/25	JBJ	Draft deposition topics for subpoena and deposition notices (4.8); legal research re: motion to quash (0.6); draft motion to quash (0.8)	6.20	\$4,867.00
B320	05/05/25	JDP	Research re: Plan provisions and TDP's for assignment of insurance acceptable to insurers	0.40	\$548.00
B320	05/05/25	JDP	Review and comment on discovery responses and prepare for deps	1.80	\$2,466.00
B320	05/05/25	LHS	Review list of Debtors' fact witnesses and respond to C. Restel re: deposition preparation	0.30	\$316.50
B320	05/05/25	MAK	Meet and confer with debtor's counsel re: confirmation discovery	1.20	\$1,362.00
B320	05/05/25	MAK	Prepare topics and issues for deposition of Debtor corporate designee	3.90	\$4,426.50
B320	05/05/25	MAK	Prepare topics and issues for deposition of RCC corporate designee	1.10	\$1,248.50
B320	05/05/25	MRB	Email communication with C. Restel re: deposition preparation	0.20	\$173.00
B320	05/05/25	RKC	Review/revise 12 deposition notices/subpoenas	0.60	\$585.00
B320	05/05/25	RKC	Strategize re: discovery tasks	0.60	\$585.00
B320	05/05/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	1.10	\$1,072.50
B320	05/05/25	ZM	Search for information confirming the identity of Ronald Gies' connection to the Roman Catholic Diocese of Oakland	1.50	\$630.00
B320	05/06/25	AMG	Revise subpoenas for Debtor's fact witnesses	1.50	\$1,072.50
B320	05/06/25	CD	Draft deficiency letter to non-debtor catholic entities	2.00	\$1,730.00
B320	05/06/25	CD	Strategize re: deposition prep	0.30	\$259.50
B320	05/06/25	CGS	Conduct research re: document production for C. Dernbach's review	1.90	\$1,491.50
B320	05/06/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (1.8); Analyze issues re: deficiencies in discovery responses (.3)	2.10	\$2,362.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/06/25	JBJ	Revise deposition topics for subpoena and deposition notices (0.5); draft motion to quash (1.4)	1.90	\$1,491.50
B320	05/06/25	JDP	Review and comment on research for confirmation brief	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	05/06/25	JDP	Confer with M. Kaplan re: deps and meet and confer	0.30	\$411.00
B320	05/06/25	JDP	Review research re: insurance assignment acceptable to insurers	0.30	\$411.00
B320	05/06/25	JJP	Provide assistance to C. Dernback re: document review	0.20	\$86.00
B320	05/06/25	LHS	Prepare for depositions	0.20	\$211.00
B320	05/06/25	MAK	Prepare topics and issues for deposition of Debtor corporate designee (1.8); confer with J. Prol re: same (.3)	2.10	\$2,383.50
B320	05/06/25	MAK	Prepare topics and issues for deposition of OPF corporate designee	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	05/06/25	RKC	Draft objection to motion to quash subpoena to Pastors	1.20	\$1,170.00
B320	05/06/25	RKC	Strategize re: discovery deficiencies and e-mail Debtor re: same (0.5); strategize and prepare for upcoming depositions (1.1); confer with BRG re: topics for upcoming depositions (0.4)	2.00	\$1,950.00
B320	05/07/25	AMG	Revise subpoenas for Debtor's fact witnesses	0.30	\$214.50
B320	05/07/25	BIW	Confer with P. Gross re: outline objection to Plan to assist in its drafting	0.60	\$696.00
B320	05/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivor re: Debtor's intent to call client at trial	0.60	\$696.00
B320	05/07/25	CD	Analyze deficiencies in Bishop's and VeraCruz's responses and objections to committee's subpoena and draft email re: same	0.50	\$432.50
B320	05/07/25	CF	Review precedent plan documents and trust distribution procedures and email communications with J. Prol resame	0.60	\$396.00
B320	05/07/25	CMR	Prepare for fact witness depositions (2.6); Analyze issues and correspondence re: discovery deficiencies (.6)	3.20	\$3,600.00
B320	05/07/25	JBJ	Revise deposition topics for subpoena and deposition notices (0.7); draft motion to quash (2.1)	2.80	\$2,198.00
B320	05/07/25	JDP	Review emails re: deposition schedule	0.20	\$274.00
B320	05/07/25	KEM	Call with B. Weisenberg re: deposition outlines in preparation for confirmation (.1); correspondence with R. Chahil re: deposition preparation (.1)	0.20	\$211.00
B320	05/07/25	MAK	Prepare topics and issues for deposition of RCC corporate designee	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	05/07/25	MAK	Prepare topics and issues for deposition of RCWC corporate designee	1.70	\$1,929.50
B320	05/07/25	PJG	Call with B. Weisenberg re: plan confirmation objection issues and research re: preparing confirmation objection	0.60	\$657.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/07/25	PJG	Review and research filed Committee Disclosure Statement objection re: likely plan confirmation objection/issues (0.8); additional research re: other mass tort/non-profit plan confirmation objections (1.4); begin drafting outline re: plan confirmation objection high level issues (2.1); confer with B. Weisenberg re: same (.3)	4.60	\$5,037.00
B320	05/07/25	RKC	Draft/revise objection to motion to quash subpoenas to pastors	1.10	\$1,072.50
B320	05/07/25	RKC	Strategize re: preparation for upcoming depositions	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/07/25	RKC	Revise deposition notices and deposition subpoenas	0.80	\$780.00
B320	05/08/25	AMG	Strategize re: depositions of Debtor's fact witnesses	1.20	\$858.00
B320	05/08/25	AMG	Revise and finalize subpoenas to Debtor's fact witnesses	2.20	\$1,573.00
B320	05/08/25	BIW	Draft email to P. Gross re: outline objection to Plan to assist in its drafting (.4); confer with P. Gross re: same (.3)	0.40	\$464.00
B320	05/08/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivors re: Debtor's intent to call clients at trial	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	05/08/25	BIW	Outline Plan objection facts and law	1.70	\$1,972.00
B320	05/08/25	BIW	Draft email re: assist with facts in support of objection to Debtor's motion for a Protective Order	0.40	\$464.00
B320	05/08/25	CD	Review documents in preparation for drafting deposition outline	3.80	\$3,287.00
B320	05/08/25	CD	Prepare for fact witness depositions	1.90	\$1,643.50
B320	05/08/25	CD	Draft email re: deficiencies in Debtor's disclosure of fact witnesses	0.90	\$778.50
B320	05/08/25	CF	Research Ninth Circuit law re: administrative insolvency and dismissal	2.80	\$1,848.00
B320	05/08/25	CG	Meet and strategize re: fact witness depositions	1.30	\$858.00
B320	05/08/25	CG	Confer with C. Frankel re: disclosure statement objection ninth circuit law	0.30	\$198.00
B320	05/08/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: fact discovery and preparation for fact witness depositions (2.8); analyze issues re: documents produced (1.5); Meeting with M. Kaplan to finalize deposition notices and subpoenas (.8); Review and revise Response to Debtor's Motion to Quash discovery (1.0)	6.10	\$6,862.50
B320	05/08/25	DC	Review Debtor fee applications for communications with pastors and parishes	2.90	\$1,160.00
B320	05/08/25	JBJ	Revise subpoenas and deposition notices (3.5); locate and verify sources for motion to quash (1.1); meet and strategize internally re: fact witness depositions (1.3)	5.90	\$4,631.50
B320	05/08/25	JDP	Confer with LS litigation team re: deps	0.40	\$548.00
B320	05/08/25	KEM	Prepare for fact witness depositions	1.30	\$1,371.50
B320	05/08/25	MAK	Review and revise opposition brief to motion to quash	2.10	\$2,383.50
B320	05/08/25	MAK	Prepare topics and issues for deposition of Debtor corporate designee	1.30	\$1,475.50
B320	05/08/25	MAK	Confer with B. Weisenberg and J. Prol re: deposition of individual survivors	0.40	\$454.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 27 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/08/25	MAK	Review and revise corporate designee topics for debtor and non-debtor affiliates	0.80	\$908.00
B320	05/08/25	MAK	Meet and confer with debtor's counsel re: confirmation discovery	0.60	\$681.00
B320	05/08/25	MRB	Prepare for fact witness depositions (1.3); analyze document productions to prepare for same (0.3)	1.60	\$1,384.00
B320	05/08/25	PJG	Additional research re: good faith and fair and equitable (1.8); draft outline of preliminary legal argument re: good faith confirmation objection (1.4)	3.20	\$3,504.00
B320	05/08/25	RKC	Revise deposition notices and subpoenas	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/08/25	RKC	Confer with local counsel re: revised deposition notices and subpoenas	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/08/25	RKC	Revise objection to motion to quash subpoenas to Pastors	2.80	\$2,730.00
B320	05/08/25	RKC	Prepare for upcoming depositions and discovery deficiencies	0.90	\$877.50
B320	05/08/25	RKC	Prepare for fact witness depositions	1.70	\$1,657.50
B320	05/08/25	RKC	Attend meet and confer with Debtor re: discovery issues	0.60	\$585.00
B320	05/09/25	AMG	Revise, proof, and finalize subpoenas to Debtor's fact witnesses	1.90	\$1,358.50
B320	05/09/25	AMG	Strategize re: deposition of A. Bardos (1.5); review documents for deposition of A. Bardos (6.1)	7.60	\$5,434.00
B320	05/09/25	BIW	Review and revise Objection to Debtor's motion for a Protective Order	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	05/09/25	BIW	Review Debtor's objection to Committee's Motion for Protective Order	0.40	\$464.00
B320	05/09/25	CD	Consider strategy for deposition of the Bishop and the Debtor	0.40	\$346.00
B320	05/09/25	CD	Review documents and draft deposition outline for OPF	7.40	\$6,401.00
B320	05/09/25	CG	Review and analyze Debtors' objection to protective order and prepare for hearing in connection with same (3.5); confer with C. Restel re: same (.3)	3.80	\$2,508.00
B320	05/09/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (.9); Call with R. Chahil and A. Giblin re: same (.7); Analyze issues re: discovery deficiencies (.3); Review and revise Objection to Debtor's Motion to Quash (.6); Analyze Response to Motion for Protective Order (1.0)	3.50	\$3,937.50
B320	05/09/25	JBJ	Revise subpoenas and deposition notices (2.0); review and verify motion to quash brief for style and accuracy (6.0)	8.00	\$6,280.00
B320	05/09/25	JDP	Review and comment on pastors' motion to quash subpoena	0.40	\$548.00
B320	05/09/25	KEM	Review RCC subpoena	0.10	\$105.50
B320	05/09/25	LHS	Review information from R. Chahil re: deposition outlines and review deposition topics	0.50	\$527.50
B320	05/09/25	MAK	Review and revise opposition brief to motion to quash	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	05/09/25	MAK	Review objection to UCC motion for a protective order	0.80	\$908.00
B320	05/09/25	MAK	Prepare topics and issues for deposition of OPF corporate designee	1.70	\$1,929.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/09/25	MRB	Review documents to prepare outline for fact witness depositions	0.40	\$346.00
B320	05/09/25	RKC	Revise and finalize objection to motion to quash subpoenas to Pastors	1.80	\$1,755.00
B320	05/09/25	RKC	Confer with local counsel re: deposition notices and subpoenas	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/09/25	RKC	Review Debtor's responses to interrogatories and draft e- mail re: deficiencies re: same	1.00	\$975.00
B320	05/09/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel and A. Giblin re: preparation for deposition of A. Bardos	0.70	\$682.50
B320	05/10/25	AMG	Strategize re: deposition outline of A. Bardos	0.20	\$143.00
B320	05/10/25	GJ	Assist K. Charles with document review	0.20	\$78.00
B320	05/10/25	JDP	Review and comment on Debtor's objection to committee motion for protective order	0.50	\$685.00
B320	05/10/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: deposition preparation	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/11/25	AMG	Review documents for deposition of A. Bardos	3.40	\$2,431.00
B320	05/11/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Moore re: voting update	0.10	\$116.00
B320	05/11/25	MRB	Review documents to prepare outline for fact witness depositions	0.40	\$346.00
B320	05/12/25	AMG	Strategize re: deposition outlines for A. Bardos and D. Flanagan	2.00	\$1,430.00
B320	05/12/25	AMG	Review documents and draft deposition outline for A. Bardos	9.50	\$6,792.50
B320	05/12/25	BIW	Confer with Litigation Team re: preparation for hearing on Protective Order Motions	0.40	\$464.00
B320	05/12/25	BIW	Review cases supporting legal arguments for objection to Plan	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	05/12/25	CD	Draft deposition notice	0.10	\$86.50
B320	05/12/25	CD	Discuss strategy with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, and R. Chahil	0.30	\$259.50
B320	05/12/25	CD	Discuss Debtor deposition outline with C. Stewart	0.20	\$173.00
B320	05/12/25	CD	Follow up on deficiency notices to Non-Debtor Catholic Entities, Bishop, and VeraCruz	0.20	\$173.00
B320	05/12/25	CD	Draft Bishop's deposition outline	5.90	\$5,103.50
B320	05/12/25	CD	Draft review tags for review of Debtors' production	0.90	\$778.50
B320	05/12/25	CD	Draft deposition outline for Oakland Parochial Fund	1.90	\$1,643.50
B320	05/12/25	CGS	Prepare and participate in meeting with C. Dernabch (.3); draft Bishop Barber deposition outline (.5)	0.80	\$628.00
B320	05/12/25	CK	Provide assistance to document review	0.30	\$90.00
B320	05/12/25	CMR	Call with M. Kaplan, R. Chahil, and C. Dernbach re: status of discovery re: Plan (.3); Analyze outstanding issues re: discovery requests (.2); Multiple calls with LS Team re: preparation for fact witness depositions (.9); Prepare for fact witness depositions (.9); Analyze issues re: discovery to Judge Hogan (.4); Prepare expert witness disclosure (.8); Call with LS and BRG Teams re: strategy for fact discovery (.5)	4.00	\$4,500.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 29 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/12/25	JDP	Calls with BRG and LS litigation team re: confirmation discovery	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	05/12/25	JDP	Participate in call with unknown claims representative re: the Debtor's plan	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	05/12/25	KEM	Review Debtor response to Committee's motion for protective order (.3); review RCC-related documents in preparation for deposition (1.6)	1.90	\$2,004.50
B320	05/12/25	MAK	Second level review of Committee documents for determination of privilege/responsiveness	3.60	\$4,086.00
B320	05/12/25	MRB	Strategize re: deposition outlines for D. Flanagan and A. Bardos (2.0); prepare outline for fact witness depositions (0.8)	2.80	\$2,422.00
B320	05/12/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein team re: review of upcoming document productions	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/12/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein and BRG re: deposition preparation strategy	0.40	\$390.00
B320	05/12/25	RKC	Confer with local counsel re: deposition notice to Judge Hogan	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/12/25	RKC	Confer/strategy re: tags for review of incoming Debtor's document productions	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/12/25	RKC	Coordinate re: upcoming depositions	0.70	\$682.50
B320	05/12/25	RKC	Review committee's responses and objections to document requests (.3); strategize re: searches to run for responsive documents (.2)	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/12/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein team re: outstanding discovery issues	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/12/25	RKC	Confer with Debtor's counsel re: outstanding discovery issues	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/13/25	AMG	Review documents and draft deposition outline for A. Bardos	7.70	\$5,505.50
B320	05/13/25	AMG	Strategize re: depositions of Debtor's fact witnesses	0.20	\$143.00
B320	05/13/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: recap of day's hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B320	05/13/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: inquire about service of subpoenas	0.20	\$232.00
B320	05/13/25	CD	Draft deposition outline for Bishop	3.90	\$3,373.50
B320	05/13/25	CD	Conduct research re: discovery from Committee	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	05/13/25	CD	Draft deposition outline for OPF	1.30	\$1,124.50
B320	05/13/25	CGS	Draft Bishop Barber deposition outline	5.00	\$3,925.00
B320	05/13/25	CGS	Draft Bishop Barber deposition outline	1.20	\$942.00
B320	05/13/25	CMR	Analyze outstanding issues re: discovery requests (.1); Analyze issues re: Committee production of documents (.1); Prepare for fact depositions (.9)	1.10	\$1,237.50
B320	05/13/25	JBJ	Draft deposition outline	1.50	\$1,177.50
B320	05/13/25	JDP	Review and comment on deposition outlines	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	05/13/25	KEM	Draft RCC/Gies deposition outline	1.20	\$1,266.00
B320	05/13/25	LHS	Work on deposition outline	1.00	\$1,055.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 30 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/13/25	MAK	Second level review of Committee documents for determination of privilege/responsiveness	2.20	\$2,497.00
B320	05/13/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel and L. Sklar re: preparation for Committee depositions	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/13/25	RKC	Confer with C. Dernbach re: deposition preparation	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/13/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: collection in response to document requests	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/14/25	AMG	Review documents and draft deposition outline for A. Bardos	4.90	\$3,503.50
B320	05/14/25	AS	Provide assistance to J. Pagano re: export out iManage documents to the network share drive for process	0.80	\$292.00
B320	05/14/25	BIW	Review case-law on legal issues to be addressed at Plan confirmation	0.70	\$812.00
B320	05/14/25	BIW	Confer with Unknown Claims Representative	0.70	\$812.00
B320	05/14/25	BIW	Confer with Litigation Team re: deposition subjects and deponents (2 @. 4 each)	0.80	\$928.00
B320	05/14/25	BIW	Confer with Litigation Team re: preparation for hearing on Protective Order Motions	0.20	\$232.00
B320	05/14/25	CD	Draft OPF deposition outline	0.30	\$259.50
B320	05/14/25	CD	Attend meet and confer re: Non-Debtor Catholic Entity subpoenas	0.50	\$432.50
B320	05/14/25	CD	Draft Bishop deposition outline	6.00	\$5,190.00
B320	05/14/25	CD	Prepare for review of documents	0.60	\$519.00
B320	05/14/25	CGS	Draft Bishop Barber deposition outline	2.00	\$1,570.00
B320	05/14/25	CMR	Prepare for fact witness depositions (.2); Meeting with M. Kaplan and R. Chahil re: same (.8); Prepare for (.3) and participate in (.5) Meet and Confer with Debtors and Non-Debtor Entities; Prepare and serve amended fact witness list (.4)	2.20	\$2,475.00
B320	05/14/25	JDP	Review and comment on deposition outlines and exhibit lists	2.50	\$3,425.00
B320	05/14/25	JDP	E-mails from/to debtors' counsel and Stout re: arranging for property inspections	0.20	\$274.00
B320	05/14/25	JDP	Review dep outlines; prepare for deps	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	05/14/25	JDP	Develop strategy for calling committee member witnesses	0.40	\$548.00
B320	05/14/25	JJP	Coordinate the collection of email files from iManage and the inclusion of same into the case database for review; (.7); prepare inclusion and exclusion searches as requested re: iManage files (1.8); transfer incoming production sets and incorporate same into the case database (1.1)	3.60	\$1,548.00
B320	05/14/25	KEM	Draft RCC/R. Gies deposition outline	4.40	\$4,642.00
B320	05/14/25	LHS	Work on deposition outline	1.60	\$1,688.00
B320	05/14/25	MAK	Meet and confer with Debtor and non-debtor affiliate counsel	0.50	\$567.50
B320	05/14/25	PJG	Additional legal research re: fair and equitable and other constitutional challenges re: comparable debtors without any profitable operations such as municipal bankruptcy	0.70	\$766.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 31 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/14/25	RKC	Coordinate re: depositions	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/14/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: upcoming depositions	0.80	\$780.00
B320	05/14/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: preparation for depositions	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/14/25	RKC	Attend meet and confer with counsel for Non-Debtor Entities	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/14/25	RKC	Coordinate re: collection of e-mails for review and production	0.80	\$780.00
B320	05/15/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document production	2.10	\$1,501.50
B320	05/15/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol re: strategy on Plan Confirmation	0.30	\$348.00
B320	05/15/25	CD	Facilitate document review	2.50	\$2,162.50
B320	05/15/25	CD	Review documents produced by Debtor	1.70	\$1,470.50
B320	05/15/25	CD	Draft deposition outline for Bishop	3.80	\$3,287.00
B320	05/15/25	CG	Perform document review re: confirmation	0.40	\$264.00
B320	05/15/25	CGS	Review documents for relevance and responsiveness	0.50	\$392.50
B320	05/15/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: production of documents re: confirmation (.4); Prepare for fact depositions (.6)	1.00	\$1,125.00
B320	05/15/25	JDP	Emails from/to Debtor's counsel and Stout re: inspection of real estate	0.20	\$274.00
B320	05/15/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: dep scheduling and retention of experts	0.30	\$411.00
B320	05/15/25	JJP	Review, revise and prepare document searches to identify subsets and report hit counts as requested by C. Dernbach (6.7); incorporate new documents into the case database and prepare same for review queue with coding panels (1.4)	8.10	\$3,483.00
B320	05/15/25	KEM	Correspondence with R. Chahil re: RCC deposition outline (.1); draft RCC/R. Gies deposition outline (1.0); correspondence from C. Dernbach re: debtor document production (.1)	1.20	\$1,266.00
B320	05/15/25	LHS	Draft deposition outline	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	05/15/25	MAK	Call with insurance counsel re: proposed insurance expert	0.20	\$227.00
B320	05/15/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	0.80	\$692.00
B320	05/15/25	RKC	Coordinate re: collection of e-mails for review and production	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/15/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: deposition strategy	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/15/25	RKC	Coordinate re: document collection for response to Debtor's document requests	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/16/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document production (8.2); strategize re: document review (0.3)	8.50	\$6,077.50
B320	05/16/25	BIW	Review of privileged documents	0.40	\$464.00
B320	05/16/25	BIW	Review documents to be produced	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	05/16/25	CD	Draft Bishop deposition outline	1.10	\$951.50
B320	05/16/25	CD	Review document production	2.40	\$2,076.00
B320	05/16/25	CD	Review documents produced by Debtor	1.90	\$1,643.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 32 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/16/25	CD	Draft OPF deposition outline	0.90	\$778.50
B320	05/16/25	CG	Perform document review re: confirmation	3.90	\$2,574.00
B320	05/16/25	CGS	Review Debtor documents for relevance and responsiveness	1.70	\$1,334.50
B320	05/16/25	CMR	Confer re: resolution of objections to expert witness retention (.1); Revise expert witness disclosure (.1); Prepare for fact witness depositions (.6)	0.80	\$900.00
B320	05/16/25	JBJ	Draft expert retention reply (2.9); review produced documents for responsiveness (2.0)	4.90	\$3,846.50
B320	05/16/25	JDP	Review and comment on ability to pay analysis	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	05/16/25	JDP	Review and analyze debtor's liquidation analysis and legal theory re: first amendment	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	05/16/25	JDP	Develop strategy for confirmation hearing	2.00	\$2,740.00
B320	05/16/25	JDP	E-mails from/to Stout and litigation team re: property inspection	0.10	\$137.00
B320	05/16/25	JJP	Conference with B. Weisenberg re: document production	0.10	\$43.00
B320	05/16/25	JJP	Review and revise searches sets as requested by C. Dernbach and provide updates results re: same	1.70	\$731.00
B320	05/16/25	KEM	Draft R. Gies/RCC deposition outline	5.20	\$5,486.00
B320	05/16/25	LHS	Work on deposition outlines	0.70	\$738.50
B320	05/16/25	MAK	Second level review of supplemental set of potentially privileged documents following discovery hearing	2.80	\$3,178.00
B320	05/16/25	MAK	Review and analyze briefing to date on religious freedom exemption and outline additional analysis needed	1.90	\$2,156.50
B320	05/16/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	0.50	\$432.50
B320	05/16/25	PJG	Review research and draft outline re: certain plan confirmation issues and analyses; confer with B. Weisenberg, J. Prol re: same	0.60	\$657.00
B320	05/16/25	RKC	Strategize re: search and review of Committee's documents for production	0.40	\$390.00
B320	05/17/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document production	7.00	\$5,005.00
B320	05/17/25	CD	Review documents produced by Debtor	1.00	\$865.00
B320	05/17/25	CD	Facilitate review of documents and review documents for production	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	05/17/25	CGS	Review Debtor document production for relevance and responsiveness	4.50	\$3,532.50
B320	05/17/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions re: Confirmation	0.20	\$225.00
B320	05/17/25	JBJ	Review documents for responsiveness and privilege	5.20	\$4,082.00
B320	05/17/25	JJP	Prepare searches, review documents and create review sets	1.20	\$516.00
B320	05/17/25	LHS	Work on deposition outlines and review documents pursuant to same	4.00	\$4,220.00
B320	05/17/25	MAK	Review and revise preliminary deposition outline for Debtor corporate designee witness	3.60	\$4,086.00
B320	05/17/25	RKC	Prepare for upcoming depositions	0.30	\$292.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/17/25	RKC	Strategize and confer with C. Dernbach re: review of Committee's documents for production	2.30	\$2,242.50
B320	05/18/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document production	5.40	\$3,861.00
B320	05/18/25	CD	Facilitate document review and review documents	0.40	\$346.00
B320	05/18/25	CG	Perform document review re: confirmation	1.50	\$990.00
B320	05/18/25	CGS	Review Debtor document production for responsiveness and relevance	2.30	\$1,805.50
B320	05/18/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions re: Plan Confirmation	0.10	\$112.50
B320	05/18/25	JBJ	Review documents for responsiveness and privilege (1.0); review produced documents for responsiveness (2.1)	3.10	\$2,433.50
B320	05/18/25	JJP	Prepare searches and provide document sets to C. Dernbach and R. Chahil	0.60	\$258.00
B320	05/18/25	LHS	Review materials re: Hogan's prior testimony and experiences for drafting outline for Hogan deposition	0.70	\$738.50
B320	05/18/25	MAK	Review and analyze prior depositions and reports from M. Hogan, as well as applicable statutes/cases, to prepare for deposition	3.90	\$4,426.50
B320	05/18/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	0.80	\$692.00
B320	05/18/25	RKC	Prepare for Judge Hogan's deposition	0.40	\$390.00
B320	05/18/25	RKC	Second level review of Committee's documents for production	1.30	\$1,267.50
B320	05/18/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: discovery strategy and next steps	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/19/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document production	0.10	\$71.50
B320	05/19/25	AMG	Review documents and draft deposition outline for A. Bardos	8.10	\$5,791.50
B320	05/19/25	BIW	Research and write summary of arguments re: First Amendment and RFRA	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	05/19/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: status of document production	0.20	\$232.00
B320	05/19/25	BIW	Research and write summary of arguments re: Hypothetical liquidation test's use in a nonprofit religious corporations	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	05/19/25	BTA	Review of emails and attachments from B. Weisenberg; review of pleadings, law review articles and numerous court cases; research whether church property is subject to sale in bankruptcy to satisfy sexual abuse claims	3.40	\$5,780.00
B320	05/19/25	CD	Facilitate document review and review documents	3.10	\$2,681.50
B320	05/19/25	CD	Attend call with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, and R. Chahil restrategy	0.50	\$432.50
B320	05/19/25	CD	Draft deposition outline for Bishop	4.80	\$4,152.00
B320	05/19/25	CG	Prepare for deposition of finance council	1.60	\$1,056.00
B320	05/19/25	CGS	Compose draft deposition outline for Bishop Barber	8.20	\$6,437.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 34 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/19/25	CMR	Call with M. Kaplan, R. Chahil, and C. Dernbach re: outstanding fact discovery issues re: Confirmation (.5); Prepare for fact witness depositions (.7); Call with R. Chahil and K. Moynihan re: same (.2); Finalize and send expert witness list to Debtor (.2)	1.60	\$1,800.00
B320	05/19/25	JAM	Research re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing (.9); draft analysis to J. Albin (.7)	1.60	\$1,376.00
B320	05/19/25	JBJ	Review documents for responsiveness and privilege (1.9); research re: confirmation issues (2.9)	4.80	\$3,768.00
B320	05/19/25	JDP	Review memo re: confirmation briefing on first amendment issues and develop strategy	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	05/19/25	JDP	Review memo on good faith issues and develop strategy	1.40	\$1,918.00
B320	05/19/25	JJP	Provide summary information to K. Charles re: document productions (.2); provide summary information to B. Weisenberg re: production distribution (.4); prepare searches requested by C. Dernbach re: valuation and appraisals (.2)	0.80	\$344.00
B320	05/19/25	KEM	Call with C. Restel and R. Chahil re: RCC deposition outline (.3); review updated deposition schedule (.1); draft RCC deposition outline (1.8)	2.20	\$2,321.00
B320	05/19/25	LHS	Review and analyze information re: Hogan for purposes of drafting deposition outline (.6); revise Adventus deposition outline (1.6); review documents pursuant to same (.3) call with R. Chahil re: same (.3); review Hogan's reports in other diocesan cases to draft deposition outline (.8)	3.60	\$3,798.00
B320	05/19/25	MAK	Review and analyze prior depositions and reports from M. Hogan, as well as applicable statutes/cases, to prepare for deposition	2.70	\$3,064.50
B320	05/19/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	1.20	\$1,038.00
B320	05/19/25	PJG	Review emails from B. Weisenberg to J Albin re: free exercise clause and Bankruptcy Code confirmation requirements including hypothetical liquidation analysis (.4); review cases and articles re: same (.9) and additional research re: general plan confirmation requirements re: good faith, best interests test, and absolute priority rule (1.1)	2.40	\$2,628.00
B320	05/19/25	PJG	Draft detailed email outline of certain confirmation objection legal arguments re: Good Faith, Fair and Equitable/Absolute Priority Rule, and Best Interests Test/Hypothetical Liquidation Analysis and related cases and legal theories (2.8); and draft email re: same to B. Weisenberg and J. Prol (0.4)	3.20	\$3,504.00
B320	05/19/25	RKC	Draft e-mail to Debtor re: follow-up re: deficient interrogatory responses	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/19/25	RKC	Second-level review of Debtor's document production	0.60	\$585.00
B320	05/19/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar re: strategy for Judge Hogan's deposition	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/19/25	RKC	Strategize and prepare for upcoming depositions	0.60	\$585.00
B320	05/19/25	RKC	Confer with K. Moynihan re: preparation for 30(b)(6) deposition of RCC	0.20	\$195.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 35 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/19/25	RKC	Confer with C. Dernbach re: document review	0.60	\$585.00
B320	05/19/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, and C. Dernbach rediscovery and document production strategy	0.60	\$585.00
B320	05/19/25	ZM	Search for declaration, statements and reports filed by Judge Michael Hogan in his capacity as the representative for the unknown claimants in the Roman Catholic Archdiocese cases	1.50	\$630.00
B320	05/20/25	AMG	Summarize Debtor's document production	0.20	\$143.00
B320	05/20/25	AMG	Review documents and draft deposition outline for A. Bardos	8.00	\$5,720.00
B320	05/20/25	BIW	Participate in call with P. Gross and J. Prol re: outline Plan confirmation objection	0.50	\$580.00
B320	05/20/25	BIW	Research constitutional and Religious Freedom arguments contemplated by Debtor re: plan confirmation	1.00	\$1,160.00
B320	05/20/25	BIW	Review research on Plan confirmation issues (.5); review outline of Plan objection (.4)	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	05/20/25	BIW	Draft email to BRG Team: re: update on discovery	0.30	\$348.00
B320	05/20/25	BTA	Confer on strategy and research with J. Minicozzi	0.20	\$340.00
B320	05/20/25	BTA	Zoom conference with J. Prol. M. Kaplan, B. Weisenberg, and J. Mincozzi to discuss constitutional implications	1.00	\$1,700.00
B320	05/20/25	CD	Draft outline for OPF deposition	0.10	\$86.50
B320	05/20/25	CD	Draft deposition outline for Bishop	2.30	\$1,989.50
B320	05/20/25	CG	Confer with C. Dernback and R. Chahil re: document production (.1); draft deposition outline (.9)	1.00	\$660.00
B320	05/20/25	CGS	Revise and edit Bishop Barber deposition outline	2.60	\$2,041.00
B320	05/20/25	CK	Attention to client documents re document exports from database for attorney review	1.10	\$330.00
B320	05/20/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (1.5); Strategize re: expert analysis and reports (.9)	2.40	\$2,700.00
B320	05/20/25	JAM	Prepare for (.4) and participate in (1.0) call with B. Albin, J. Prol, B. Weisenberg, and M. Kaplan re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing; Participate in call with B. Albin re: constitutional issues (.3); research, analyze, and summarize constitutional issues (3.2); message and attend call with A. Patel re: research for constitutional issues (.2); email with J. Prol, B. Albin, M. Kaplan, and B. Weisenberg re: constitutional issues and research (.2); research constitutional issues (1.4)	6.70	\$5,762.00
B320	05/20/25	JBJ	Research re: confirmation (1.9); draft deposition outline (6.0); call with Hon. B. Albin re: research (0.2)	8.10	\$6,358.50
B320	05/20/25	JDP	Review research re: constitutional issues to be addressed in confirmation brief (.7); participate in call with Justice Albin re: same (1.0)	1.70	\$2,329.00
B320	05/20/25	JDP	Review and comment on research for confirmation brief	2.10	\$2,877.00
B320	05/20/25	JDP	Review Debtor discovery responses and list of expert witnesses	0.50	\$685.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 36 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/20/25	JDP	Call with P. Gross and B. Weisenberg re: confirmation briefing on good faith	0.50	\$685.00
B320	05/20/25	JJP	Review correspondence from K. Charles and provide documents as requested	0.10	\$43.00
B320	05/20/25	KEM	Review document productions re: RCC deposition (3.8); draft RCC deposition outline (1.4); review and analysis of RCC loan with E. Seltzer (.2); correspondence with R. Chahil re: RCC deposition outline (.1)	5.50	\$5,802.50
B320	05/20/25	LHS	Work on deposition outlines	1.80	\$1,899.00
B320	05/20/25	LHS	Review research re: revival windows for purposes of drafting deposition outline	0.40	\$422.00
B320	05/20/25	MAK	Inter-office call re: constitutional analysis of religious freedom issues and intersection of bankruptcy law	1.00	\$1,135.00
B320	05/20/25	MAK	Revise outline and identify exhibits for corporate designee deposition of RCC	2.90	\$3,291.50
B320	05/20/25	MAK	Revise outline and identify exhibits for corporate designee deposition of RCBO	3.60	\$4,086.00
B320	05/20/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	1.30	\$1,124.50
B320	05/20/25	PJG	Review outline of legal issues (.3) and prepare for and participate in Zoom call re: same with J. Prol, B. Weisenberg re: Plan confirmation objection and strategy issues re: same (.5)	0.80	\$876.00
B320	05/20/25	PJG	Research and review plan confirmation objections re: similar confirmation issues in other non-profit and related cases	0.70	\$766.50
B320	05/20/25	RKC	Review expert witness disclosure from Debtor; confer with C. Restel re: depositions and discovery strategy	0.60	\$585.00
B320	05/20/25	ZM	Search for expert reports, depositions, testimonies, affidavits or affirmations for Charles M. Moore, Kurt Martens, Denise Martin, John Satter, Adam Zimmerman and Sarah Levitt	3.00	\$1,260.00
B320	05/21/25	AMG	Review documents and draft deposition outline for A. Bardos	7.40	\$5,291.00
B320	05/21/25	AP	Prepare for and attend meeting with Justice B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	05/21/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.10	\$1,816.50
B320	05/21/25	BIW	Confer with P. Gross re: discuss substance of Plan objection	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	05/21/25	BIW	Draft emails to J. Bair re: disclosure of fact and expert witnesses	0.20	\$232.00
B320	05/21/25	BIW	Review and comment on research re: fair and equitable standard and best interests test	1.70	\$1,972.00
B320	05/21/25	BIW	Confer with J. Haselberger re: canon expert testimony	0.60	\$696.00
B320	05/21/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: analysis needed for Plan	0.50	\$580.00
B320	05/21/25	BTA	Meeting with J. Minicozzi and A. Patel to discuss constitutional issues; research First Amendment issues	1.50	\$2,550.00
B320	05/21/25	CD	Review debtor's document production	2.00	\$1,730.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/21/25	CD	Draft deposition outline for the Bishop	6.00	\$5,190.00
B320	05/21/25	CG	Prepare for deposition re: restricted assets and review and analyze document production in connection with same	3.50	\$2,310.00
B320	05/21/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions	0.70	\$787.50
B320	05/21/25	CW	Conduct research and analysis re: confirmation issues	1.40	\$994.00
B320	05/21/25	JAM	Research and analyze journal articles re: constitutional issues (.9); prepare for and participate in meeting with J. Albin and A. Patel re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing (1.5); analyze, and summarize research inquiries re: constitutional issues (.8); research constitutional issues (2.6); email J. Albin re: constitutional issues and research (.3)	6.10	\$5,246.00
B320	05/21/25	JBJ	Draft deposition outline (5.2); research re: claims (0.3)	5.50	\$4,317.50
B320	05/21/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: expert report	0.50	\$685.00
B320	05/21/25	JDP	Review research and develop strategy for confirmation brief (1.0); call with P .Gross and B. Weisenberg re: same (1.1)	2.10	\$2,877.00
B320	05/21/25	JDP	Review and analyze vote solicitation by Bishop	0.20	\$274.00
B320	05/21/25	JDP	Review documents to prepare for Bishop's deposition	0.20	\$274.00
B320	05/21/25	JJP	Prepare searches and reports as requested by C. Dernbach and R. Chahil	3.80	\$1,634.00
B320	05/21/25	KEM	Draft RCC deposition outline (3.1); review documents re: RCC deposition outline (3.4); email to C. Restel and R. Chahil re: RCC deposition outline (.3)	6.80	\$7,174.00
B320	05/21/25	LHS	Work on deposition outlines with contemporaneous research and review of related documents	4.00	\$4,220.00
B320	05/21/25	LPA	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: confirmation research	0.30	\$429.00
B320	05/21/25	MAK	Review and analyze production from M. Hogan in response to subpoena	2.30	\$2,610.50
B320	05/21/25	MAK	Revise outline and identify exhibits for corporate designee deposition of RCBO	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	05/21/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	1.10	\$951.50
B320	05/21/25	PJG	Participate in call with B. Weisenberg and J. Prol re: Committee's plan objection and strategy and issues re: Same	1.10	\$1,204.50
B320	05/21/25	PJG	Review and research briefing and decisional case law from B. Weisenberg re: bases for plan confirmation objections, including further review of good faith and related issues (1.6); draft email re: same to B. Weisenberg, J. Prol (0.6)	2.20	\$2,409.00
B320	05/21/25	RKC	Review and analyze Debtor's 30(b)[6] designations	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/21/25	RKC	Email debtor's counsel to follow up on deficient interrogatory responses	0.10	\$97.50
B320	05/21/25	RKC	Review of Judge Hogan's documents	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/21/25	RKC	Review index of Debtor's documents for relevant entries	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/21/25	RKC	Strategize re: upcoming depositions	0.80	\$780.00
B320	05/21/25	RKC	Strategize re: review of additional documents for production	0.50	\$487.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/22/25	AMG	Review documents and draft deposition outline for A. Bardos (3.6); strategize re: deposition outlines (2.1); revise deposition outline for M. Barber (1.5)	7.20	\$5,148.00
B320	05/22/25	BIW	Confer with Burns Bair re: Plan confirmation objection	0.40	\$464.00
B320	05/22/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Disclosures re: Corporate Representatives	0.20	\$232.00
B320	05/22/25	BIW	Research recoveries in other bankruptcies	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	05/22/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of Plan voting	0.40	\$464.00
B320	05/22/25	BTA	Review of info provided by J. Minicozzi and latest Supreme Court decision	0.10	\$170.00
B320	05/22/25	CD	Revise responses to interrogatories	0.70	\$605.50
B320	05/22/25	CD	Draft deposition outline for Bishop	3.80	\$3,287.00
B320	05/22/25	CD	Draft OPF outline	2.10	\$1,816.50
B320	05/22/25	CD	Review document production	2.50	\$2,162.50
B320	05/22/25	CG	Draft and finalize deposition outline re: restricted assets	9.00	\$5,940.00
B320	05/22/25	CGS	Review documents for production to Debtor	1.50	\$1,177.50
B320	05/22/25	CGS	Draft Bishop Barber deposition outline	3.10	\$2,433.50
B320	05/22/25	CMR	Review and revise outlines re: fact depositions (2.1); Finalize production of documents (.2); Call with Foley, Hilco, and Stout teams re: coordination of property inspection (.3)	2.60	\$2,925.00
B320	05/22/25	CW	Conduct research and analysis re: tax matter; draft summary of ownership for tax purposes	3.10	\$2,201.00
B320	05/22/25	GJ	Assist J. Minicozzi with document review	0.20	\$78.00
B320	05/22/25	JAM	Research constitutional issues (4.9); prepare for and attend call with R. Rocco re: constitutional issues and research (.7); email with B. Albin and R. Rocco re: constitutional issues and research (.3)	5.90	\$5,074.00
B320	05/22/25	JBJ	Draft deposition outline (2.8); review documents for responsiveness and privilege (4.5); research re: claims (3.6)	10.90	\$8,556.50
B320	05/22/25	JDP	Review and analyze insurance neutral tdp's	0.50	\$685.00
B320	05/22/25	JJP	Provide assistance to C. Dernbach re: database searches; process new documents into the case database for production; prepare searches and export documents requested by C. Gauvin; confer with vendors re: exhibit printing in Detroit; prepare Hogan documents for production and distribute same	3.80	\$1,634.00
B320	05/22/25	KEM	Correspondence with K. Charles re: RCC deposition documents (.1); research regarding confirmation legal issues (1.2)	1.30	\$1,371.50
B320	05/22/25	KEM	Correspondence with K. Charles re: RCC deposition documents (.1); research regarding confirmation legal issues (1.2)	1.30	\$1,371.50
B320	05/22/25	LHS	Work on deposition outlines and review documents	5.00	\$5,275.00
B320	05/22/25	LPA	Conduct research re: confirmation issues	0.70	\$1,001.00
B320	05/22/25	MAK	Revise outline and identify exhibits for corporate designee deposition of RCC	2.60	\$2,951.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 39 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/22/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	8.50	\$7,352.50
B320	05/22/25	PJG	Review and respond to emails from B. Weisenberg re: plan objection issues	0.40	\$438.00
B320	05/22/25	PJG	Additional research re: plan confirmation issues (2.3); review cases and articles re: plan confirmation issues (1.1)	3.40	\$3,723.00
B320	05/22/25	PJG	Further review RCBO Disclosure Statement objections and pleadings/reply briefs re: background re: plan confirmation objection	1.40	\$1,533.00
B320	05/22/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein team re: production of Judge Hogan documents	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/22/25	RKC	Review BRG draft questions for RCBO 30(b)[6] deposition	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/22/25	RKC	Confer with C. Dernbach re: production of Committee's documents	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/22/25	RR	Prepare for and attend call with J. Minicozzi re: research concerning constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.70	\$332.50
B320	05/23/25	AMG	Strategize re: deposition outlines (.7); draft deposition outline for A. Bardos (.8)	1.50	\$1,072.50
B320	05/23/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.50	\$2,162.50
B320	05/23/25	BIW	Review and analyze attachments to emails from S. Moses re: transfer of allegedly restricted funds	0.60	\$696.00
B320	05/23/25	BIW	Review Plan Supplement	0.80	\$928.00
B320	05/23/25	BIW	Review list of real property to be used in connection with Plan funding	0.30	\$348.00
B320	05/23/25	BIW	Review certain documents produced by Debtor	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	05/23/25	BIW	Draft emails re: service of deposition notices	0.20	\$232.00
B320	05/23/25	BIW	Email correspondence with Insurers re: service of discovery notices	0.30	\$348.00
B320	05/23/25	CD	Draft privilege log	1.10	\$951.50
B320	05/23/25	CD	Draft Bishop dep outline	5.10	\$4,411.50
B320	05/23/25	CD	Facilitate document production and review documents	5.10	\$4,411.50
B320	05/23/25	CG	Call with B. Weisenberg re: restricted assets	0.20	\$132.00
B320	05/23/25	CGS	Draft Bishop Barber deposition outline	2.50	\$1,962.50
B320	05/23/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (8.4); Analyze issues re: expert testimony (.7)	9.10	\$10,237.50
B320	05/23/25	JAM	Research constitutional issues and draft and send analysis to B. Albin and A. Patel	4.60	\$3,956.00
B320	05/23/25	JBJ	Review documents for privilege (1.4); research re: witness (4.1); assist with drafting privilege log (2.5)	8.00	\$6,280.00
B320	05/23/25	JDP	Call with M. Finnegan re: TDP terms	0.20	\$274.00
B320	05/23/25	JJP	Distribute production sets to K. Charles (.2); prepare draft production sets as requested by C. Dernbach and identify conflicts (2.3); prepare searches and provide search term reports (2.7); prepare final production set and distribute same (.7); incorporate new documents into the case database as requested (.5)	6.40	\$2,752.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/23/25	KEM	Revise RCC deposition outline (2.4); prepare documents for RCC deposition (.4); correspondence with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: same (.3)	3.10	\$3,270.50
B320	05/23/25	LHS	Work on and revise deposition outlines, and create exhibits for deposition	4.00	\$4,220.00
B320	05/23/25	LHS	Review research for purposes of deposition outline	0.50	\$527.50
B320	05/23/25	LHS	Work on deposition outlines and referenced documents	4.00	\$4,220.00
B320	05/23/25	LPA	Research and draft memo re: confirmation issues	2.50	\$3,575.00
B320	05/23/25	MAK	Review and revise RCC/Geis deposition outline	2.20	\$2,497.00
B320	05/23/25	MAK	Review and revise M. Hogan deposition outline	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	05/23/25	MAK	Call with trust and estates expert	0.50	\$567.50
B320	05/23/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	2.80	\$2,422.00
B320	05/23/25	RKC	Confer with C. Dernbach re: document production	0.40	\$390.00
B320	05/23/25	RKC	Review BRG draft deposition questions for RCBO 30(b)[6] deposition	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/23/25	RKC	E-mails to/from Norton Rose re: depositions of Non- Debtor Catholic Entities	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/23/25	RKC	Strategize/confer with Lowenstein team re: review of documents produced by Non-Debtor Catholic Entities	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/23/25	RKC	Conduct QC/final review of documents to be produced by Committee	1.30	\$1,267.50
B320	05/23/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan and C. Dernbach re: privilege issues re: review of Committee's documents	0.70	\$682.50
B320	05/23/25	RKC	Strategize and confer with Lowenstein team re: categorical privilege log and update to list of individuals within Committee's privilege (0.9); update production cover letter re: same (0.3)	1.20	\$1,170.00
B320	05/23/25	RKC	Coordinate re: deposition logistics	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/23/25	RR	Review correspondence and article re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.60	\$285.00
B320	05/24/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document production	7.70	\$5,505.50
B320	05/24/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos	0.50	\$357.50
B320	05/24/25	BIW	Review outline of arguments against Motions to Dismiss and comment on same	0.40	\$464.00
B320	05/24/25	BIW	Review email correspondence on document production format	0.10	\$116.00
B320	05/24/25	CD	Draft Bishop deposition outline	0.20	\$173.00
B320	05/24/25	CD	Facilitate document review and review documents	4.70	\$4,065.50
B320	05/24/25	CGS	Review Debtor production for relevance and responsiveness	6.20	\$4,867.00
B320	05/24/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (2.4); Call with Norton Rose team re: same (.2)	2.60	\$2,925.00
B320	05/24/25	JAM	Research constitutional issues and draft portions of analysis	1.20	\$1,032.00
B320	05/24/25	JBJ	Review documents for responsiveness	7.30	\$5,730.50
B320	05/24/25	JDP	Review revised discovery response from Debtor and RCWC	1.20	\$1,644.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 41 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/24/25	JJP	Provide assistance to the review team re: incoming production sets and document review	7.80	\$3,354.00
B320	05/24/25	KEM	Review revisions to RCC deposition outline (.1); review exit facility credit agreement re: RCC deposition outline (.2)	0.30	\$316.50
B320	05/24/25	LHS	Work on various outlines for depositions and compile exhibits for depositions	4.50	\$4,747.50
B320	05/24/25	MAK	Meet and confer with counsel for RCC re: corporate designee subpoena	0.30	\$340.50
B320	05/24/25	MAK	Review document production by debtor and non-debtor affiliates for potential exhibits for RCC deposition	3.10	\$3,518.50
B320	05/24/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions (5.3); review and analyze documents from Debtor to prepare for depositions (4.0)	9.30	\$8,044.50
B320	05/24/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	4.50	\$4,387.50
B320	05/24/25	RKC	Strategize and confer with Lowenstein team re: review of Debtor's document production	1.00	\$975.00
B320	05/24/25	RKC	Confer with Debtor re: document production issues	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/25/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document production (10.0); draft questions for D. Flanagan deposition outline (3.5)	13.50	\$9,652.50
B320	05/25/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.70	\$1,470.50
B320	05/25/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: preparation for Committee's corporation designee deposition	0.30	\$348.00
B320	05/25/25	BMC	Conduct first level review of debtors" produced documents	2.10	\$1,512.00
B320	05/25/25	BTA	Research First Amendment issues	0.80	\$1,360.00
B320	05/25/25	CD	Draft deposition outline for Dan Flanagan	1.90	\$1,643.50
B320	05/25/25	CD	Draft and serve amended responses and objections to Debtor's discovery	0.20	\$173.00
B320	05/25/25	CD	Review document production	1.20	\$1,038.00
B320	05/25/25	CD	Draft dep outline	0.80	\$692.00
B320	05/25/25	CD	Review documents and facilitate document review	6.20	\$5,363.00
B320	05/25/25	CG	Review and analyze Debtors' document production	6.70	\$4,422.00
B320	05/25/25	CGS	Review Debtor production for relevance and responsiveness	6.80	\$5,338.00
B320	05/25/25	CGS	Review and draft D. Flanagan deposition outline	3.70	\$2,904.50
B320	05/25/25	CK	Provide case database assistance with the conversion and transfer of documents	2.10	\$630.00
B320	05/25/25	CK	Update case database for attorney review	0.10	\$30.00
B320	05/25/25	CMR	Prepare for fact witness depositions (1.1); Revise proposed order re: UCC Motion for Protective Order re: Plan discovery (.3)	1.40	\$1,575.00
B320	05/25/25	JAM	Emails with B. Albin and A. Patel re: research (.3); research constitutional issues and draft analysis (2.7)	3.00	\$2,580.00
B320	05/25/25	JBJ	Review documents for responsiveness	8.90	\$6,986.50
B320	05/25/25	JJP	Provide assistance to the review team re: incoming document sets	4.40	\$1,892.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/25/25	KEM	Review document production re: RCC deposition outline (2.7); draft RCC deposition outline (1.7)	4.40	\$4,642.00
B320	05/25/25	KFC	Review and finalize deposition exhibits	4.00	\$1,600.00
B320	05/25/25	LHS	Work on and finalize outlines and prepare exhibits	3.40	\$3,587.00
B320	05/25/25	MAK	Review document production by debtor and non-debtor affiliates for potential exhibits for RCC deposition	1.90	\$2,156.50
B320	05/25/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	10.80	\$9,342.00
B320	05/25/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	2.50	\$2,437.50
B320	05/26/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (8.5); review documents for D. Flanagan deposition outline (1.5)	10.00	\$7,150.00
B320	05/26/25	AP	Draft memorandum re: case law on constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.30	\$1,124.50
B320	05/26/25	AS	Provide assistance to C. Stewart re: add issue tags as requested	0.30	\$109.50
B320	05/26/25	BIW	Review and revise Objection to Motion to Dismiss BOG Amended Complaint	1.90	\$2,204.00
B320	05/26/25	BIW	Review "hot docs" produced by Debtor	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	05/26/25	BIW	Review Committee's amended responses and objections to Debtor's First Set of Written Discovery	0.40	\$464.00
B320	05/26/25	BMC	Conduct first level review of debtors' produced documents	2.20	\$1,584.00
B320	05/26/25	BTA	Review of pleadings, summary of discussions and issues, case law, and law review articles, and background issues	2.20	\$3,740.00
B320	05/26/25	CD	Draft Bishop's deposition outline	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	05/26/25	CD	Review documents for Flanagan outline	1.30	\$1,124.50
B320	05/26/25	CD	Review documents	3.50	\$3,027.50
B320	05/26/25	CD	Draft OPF deposition outline	1.10	\$951.50
B320	05/26/25	CG	Confer with C. Restel re: deposition outline	0.10	\$66.00
B320	05/26/25	CGS	Revise and edit D. Flanagan deposition outline (7.4); Review Debtor document production for responsive and relevance (4.0); Draft deposition outline for Oakland Parochial Fund (.7)	12.10	\$9,498.50
B320	05/26/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions re: Confirmation	3.40	\$3,825.00
B320	05/26/25	JAM	Emails with B. Albin and A. Patel re: research and analysis (.3); emails with B. Albin, M. Kaplan, J. Prol, and B. Weisenberg re: issues and relevant questions re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing (.2)	0.50	\$430.00
B320	05/26/25	JBJ	Review documents for responsiveness	8.20	\$6,437.00
B320	05/26/25	JJP	Prepare searches as requested by C. Stewart	0.20	\$86.00
B320	05/26/25	KEM	Draft RCC deposition outline (2.9); correspondence with M. Kaplan, C. Restel and R. Chahil re: same (.3); review document productions re: RCC deposition outline (1.7); prepare exhibits for RCC deposition (1.9)	6.80	\$7,174.00
B320	05/26/25	KFC	Review and finalize deposition exhibits and outlines	8.30	\$3,320.00
B320	05/26/25	LHS	Review Adventus responses & objections and amended responses & objections to subpoena	0.40	\$422.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/26/25	LHS	Further revise outlines for depositions and review additional documents pursuant to same	1.50	\$1,582.50
B320	05/26/25	MAK	Revise RCC deposition outline	2.70	\$3,064.50
B320	05/26/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	9.30	\$8,044.50
B320	05/26/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	7.10	\$6,922.50
B320	05/27/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos	9.40	\$6,721.00
B320	05/27/25	AP	Prepare for and attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.30	\$259.50
B320	05/27/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	05/27/25	AP	Prepare for and attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin, J. Prol, B. Weisenberg, M. Kaplan, and J. Minicozzi re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.00	\$865.00
B320	05/27/25	BIW	Review research re: constitutional and Religious Freedom arguments contemplated by Debtor	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	05/27/25	BIW	Review and revise Objection to Motion to Dismiss BOG Amended Complaint	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	05/27/25	BMC	Review plan re: unknown claimants and correspondence with C. Dernbach re: same	0.30	\$216.00
B320	05/27/25	BTA	Review of research materials on execution of judgments on Church property, on whether the First Amendment restricts executions on Church property, and on the hypothetical liquidation test; telephone conference with A. Patel	1.80	\$3,060.00
B320	05/27/25	BTA	Zoom meeting with LS Oakland Diocese team to discuss a multitude of issues, including First Amendment issues, in relation to the confirmation of a plan	1.00	\$1,700.00
B320	05/27/25	BTA	Review of detailed summary by J. Minicozzi and attachments	0.20	\$340.00
B320	05/27/25	CD	Draft OPF deposition outline	0.60	\$519.00
B320	05/27/25	CD	Revise Bishop deposition outline	1.70	\$1,470.50
B320	05/27/25	CG	Confer with C Restel and R. Chahil re: restricted assets (.6); create restricted assets chart (2.4); incorporate edits from C. Restel into deposition outline (1.3)	4.30	\$2,838.00
B320	05/27/25	CGS	Incorporate C. Dernbach's edits re: Bishop Barber deposition outline	1.40	\$1,099.00
B320	05/27/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions	5.10	\$5,737.50
B320	05/27/25	JAM	Emails with B. Albin and A. Patel re: research and analysis (.3); prepare for and participate in meeting with B. Albin, J. Prol, and B. Weisenberg re: issues and relevant questions re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing (1.0); draft analysis of issues and research avenues (.7); research constitutional issues in confirmation briefing (2.9)	5.00	\$4,300.00
B320	05/27/25	JBJ	Prepare deposition materials (5.0); revise deposition outline (1.3); verify citations in response brief (3.5)	9.80	\$7,693.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/27/25	JDP	Review and analyze research for confirmation brief (2.4); review and comment on dep outlines and exhibits (1.6)	4.00	\$5,480.00
B320	05/27/25	JDP	Call with M. Kaplan to prepare for depositions	0.50	\$685.00
B320	05/27/25	JDP	Confer with Justice Albin and team re: constitutional law issues implicated by confirmation	1.00	\$1,370.00
B320	05/27/25	JDP	Confer with M. Kaplan to prepare for deps	0.50	\$685.00
B320	05/27/25	JJP	Confirm approval for external access to production sets (.1); provide assistance to A. Giblin and R. Chahil re: document review (.6)	0.70	\$301.00
B320	05/27/25	KEM	Finalize RCC deposition outline (.1); prepare exhibits for RCC deposition (1.9)	2.00	\$2,110.00
B320	05/27/25	KFC	Search for and retrieve exhibits to be used in fact depositions; compile and prepare deposition exhibits for printing	2.70	\$1,080.00
B320	05/27/25	LHS	Finalize outlines, review additional documents, and prepare exhibits for deposition	5.00	\$5,275.00
B320	05/27/25	MAK	Call with J. Prol to prepare for depositions	0.50	\$567.50
B320	05/27/25	MAK	Inter-office call re: constitutional analysis	1.00	\$1,135.00
B320	05/27/25	MAK	Revise outline for deposition of D. Flanigan	2.20	\$2,497.00
B320	05/27/25	MRB	Prepare outline for fact witness depositions	5.90	\$5,103.50
B320	05/27/25	PJG	Review of articles from B. Weisenberg re: absolute priority and related plan objection issue	0.60	\$657.00
B320	05/27/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	7.50	\$7,312.50
B320	05/27/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel and A. Giblin re: A. Bardos deposition	0.40	\$390.00
B320	05/28/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos	8.60	\$6,149.00
B320	05/28/25	AP	Prepare for and attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.00	\$865.00
B320	05/28/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.50	\$2,162.50
B320	05/28/25	BIW	Review D. Flannigan Rough Deposition Transcript	0.80	\$928.00
B320	05/28/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: financial analysis of Plan	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	05/28/25	BTA	Zoom meeting with J. Minicozzi and A. Patel to discuss Hypothetic Liquidation test and other related issues related to Diocese Property	1.00	\$1,700.00
B320	05/28/25	CD	Draft A. Bardos deposition outline	1.20	\$1,038.00
B320	05/28/25	CD	Draft responses and objections to Committee subpoena	1.30	\$1,124.50
B320	05/28/25	CD	Draft Bishop deposition outline	2.80	\$2,422.00
B320	05/28/25	CG	Review and analyze Debtors' document production in connection with deposition preparation (3.3); incorporate comments from C. Restel re: same and finalize deposition outline (5.)	8.30	\$5,478.00
B320	05/28/25	CGS	Review relevant documents for Atilla Bardos deposition outline	1.80	\$1,413.00
B320	05/28/25	CGS	Revise and edit Committee's response to the Debtor's motions to dismiss in the adversary proceeding.	5.40	\$4,239.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 45 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/28/25	CMR	Participate in deposition of Dan Flanagan	5.50	\$6,187.50
B320	05/28/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions re: Plan Confirmation	2.80	\$3,150.00
B320	05/28/25	JAM	Emails with B. Albin and A. Patel re: research and analysis re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing (.6); messages with R. Rocco re: research (.2); prepare for and participate in meeting with B. Albin and A. Patel re: research re: constitutional issues (1.1); research constitutional issues (2.9)	4.80	\$4,128.00
B320	05/28/25	JBJ	Prepare for (0.5) and attend deposition (5.5); revise deposition outline (4.0)	10.00	\$7,850.00
B320	05/28/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: restricted assets	1.00	\$1,370.00
B320	05/28/25	JJP	Confer with K. Charles re: production distribution and Avalon (.2); attention to vendor invoices (.2)	0.40	\$172.00
B320	05/28/25	KEM	Correspondence with B. Weisenberg re: confirmation issues research	0.20	\$211.00
B320	05/28/25	LHS	Review 30b6 deposition notice to UCC from Debtor	0.30	\$316.50
B320	05/28/25	LHS	Review document production for inclusion into deposition outline (3.0); review comments to deposition outline and revise (.7)	3.70	\$3,903.50
B320	05/28/25	MAK	Call with BRG re: expert report	0.90	\$1,021.50
B320	05/28/25	MAK	Deposition of RCC corporate designee	5.20	\$5,902.00
B320	05/28/25	MAK	Review and revise Adventus corporate designee outline	1.20	\$1,362.00
B320	05/28/25	RKC	Prepare for (.5) and take deposition of D. Flanagan (5.5)	6.00	\$5,850.00
B320	05/29/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos	4.70	\$3,360.50
B320	05/29/25	AMG	Strategize re: Debtor's document production	0.40	\$286.00
B320	05/29/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.10	\$951.50
B320	05/29/25	BIW	Continue reviewing rough deposition transcript of D. Flanagan deposition	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	05/29/25	BIW	Review rough deposition transcript of D. Flanagan deposition	0.60	\$696.00
B320	05/29/25	BMC	Correspondence with R. Chahil re: debtors' document production	0.10	\$72.00
B320	05/29/25	CD	Draft search terms and facilitate document review	0.80	\$692.00
B320	05/29/25	CD	Draft responses and objections to deposition notice to Committee	2.60	\$2,249.00
B320	05/29/25	CD	Draft response to deposition notice to Committee	0.50	\$432.50
B320	05/29/25	CD	Discuss strategy with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, R. Chahil	0.50	\$432.50
B320	05/29/25	CG	Review and analyze Debtors' document production (2.); prepare deposition outlines in connection with same (4.2)	6.20	\$4,092.00
B320	05/29/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses & Objections to Debtor's 30b6 Notice to Committee (1.1); Prepare for fact depositions (4.6); Call with M. Kaplan, R. Chahil, and C. Dernbach re: same (.4); Analyze rough fact deposition transcripts (1.8)	7.90	\$8,887.50
B320	05/29/25	DC	Coordinate with C. Restel re: deposition schedule and update attorney calendar with all deposition dates	0.60	\$240.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/29/25	JAM	Research and analyze constitutional issues re: confirmation briefing (2.7); prepare for and participate in meeting with R. Rocco re: research issues in constitutional briefing (.5)	3.20	\$2,752.00
B320	05/29/25	JBJ	Revise deposition outline (8.9); draft search terms for produced documents (0.3)	9.20	\$7,222.00
B320	05/29/25	JDP	Prepare for confirmation hearing	3.50	\$4,795.00
B320	05/29/25	JJP	Export document sets for experts; provide documents to A. Giblin; secure documents as requested by A. Chahil; import documents and configure case database; prepare searches and provide search reports	5.70	\$2,451.00
B320	05/29/25	KEM	Review R. Gies deposition transcript in preparation for confirmation (.2); review update re: additional Debtor document production (.1)	0.30	\$316.50
B320	05/29/25	LHS	Multiple correspondences to prepare for Hogan deposition and review additional document (.6); provide search terms for upcoming document review as part of pre-confirmation discovery efforts (.4); further revise deposition outlines (1.0)	2.00	\$2,110.00
B320	05/29/25	LHS	Prepare for deposition	0.50	\$527.50
B320	05/29/25	MAK	Prepare for deposition of M. Hogan	2.70	\$3,064.50
B320	05/29/25	MAK	Review Debtor's supplemental document production to identify exhibits for fact witness depositions	3.60	\$4,086.00
B320	05/29/25	MRB	Review documents from debtor to prepare for depositions	0.20	\$173.00
B320	05/29/25	RKC	Prepare for upcoming depositions	2.60	\$2,535.00
B320	05/29/25	RKC	Coordinate re: search terms and review of Debtor's production of over 24,000 documents	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/29/25	RKC	Coordinate re: pulling/sending documents to expert witnesses	0.40	\$390.00
B320	05/29/25	RKC	Attention to Debtor's claw back of additional documents	0.10	\$97.50
B320	05/29/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, and C. Dernbach re: discovery issues and strategy	0.40	\$390.00
B320	05/29/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein team re: review of additional documents produced by Debtor	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/29/25	RR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with J. Minicozzi re: research about constitutional issues in confirmation briefing (.5); research and analyze case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing (1.1)	1.60	\$760.00
B320	05/30/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document production (6.8); strategize re: document review (0.7); revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (2.0)	9.50	\$6,792.50
B320	05/30/25	BIW	Begin reviewing rough deposition transcript of R. Gies deposition	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	05/30/25	BMC	Correspondence with C. Dernbach and R. Beeman re: debtors' document production	0.20	\$144.00
B320	05/30/25	CD	Facilitate document review	0.60	\$519.00
B320	05/30/25	CD	Draft responses and objections to deposition notice to committee	0.20	\$173.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/30/25	CD	Draft Bishop deposition outline	3.70	\$3,200.50
B320	05/30/25	CD	Review documents	4.40	\$3,806.00
B320	05/30/25	CD	Facilitate document review and review documents	1.90	\$1,643.50
B320	05/30/25	CG	Finalize deposition preparation and exhibit binders in connection with same	5.30	\$3,498.00
B320	05/30/25	CGS	Committee's responses and objections to Debtor's 30b6 subpoena of the Committee	0.80	\$628.00
B320	05/30/25	CK	Provide assistancere re: locating and exporting documents	0.80	\$240.00
B320	05/30/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (7.1); Analyze rough transcript from fact deposition (1.4)	8.50	\$9,562.50
B320	05/30/25	CTC	Zoom meeting with C. Dernbach, R. Beeman, A. M. Giblin, D. Cassidy and M. Diaz, re: case overview and document review protocol	0.60	\$336.00
B320	05/30/25	DJC	Meet with C. Dernbach; communications; review instructions; doc revie; review the protocol; begin review	2.80	\$1,820.00
B320	05/30/25	GJ	Assist team with document review	0.80	\$312.00
B320	05/30/25	JAM	Research and analyze constitutional issues re: confirmation briefing (1.9); emails with R. Rocco re: research (.2)	2.10	\$1,806.00
B320	05/30/25	JBJ	Revise deposition outline (1.8); review produced documents for responsiveness (3.3)	5.10	\$4,003.50
B320	05/30/25	JDP	Review deposition transcripts	4.20	\$5,754.00
B320	05/30/25	JJP	Prepare revised searches and provide counts on same (.7); update review queues (.3); provide assistance to the review team re: searches and document exports (1.9); export production sets and transfer to BRG (.5); prepare document for production as requested by L. Sklar (.4); prepare searches and isolate similar document sets from review as requested by C. Dernbach (1.2)	5.00	\$2,150.00
B320	05/30/25	KEM	Review document productions re: confirmation preparation	4.40	\$4,642.00
B320	05/30/25	LHS	Review deposition transcript from Hogan deposition	0.40	\$422.00
B320	05/30/25	LHS	Prepare for Hogan deposition (.5); Attend Hogan deposition (2.0)	2.50	\$2,637.50
B320	05/30/25	MAK	Take deposition of M. Hogan	2.00	\$2,270.00
B320	05/30/25	MD	Perform document review to prepare for upcoming depositions	4.00	\$2,600.00
B320	05/30/25	PJG	Review and respond to email from B. Weisenberg re: confirmation objection	0.20	\$219.00
B320	05/30/25	RDB	Review documents in preparation for depositions	3.10	\$2,495.50
B320	05/30/25	RKC	E-mail with BRG re: document production issues and clawback	0.50	\$487.50
B320	05/30/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar re: Judge Hogan deposition and production of document from Judge Hogan	0.70	\$682.50
B320	05/30/25	RKC	Review and analyze transcript from D. Flanagan's deposition	3.00	\$2,925.00
B320	05/30/25	RKC	Coordinate re: deposition logistics	0.40	\$390.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/30/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: new production	0.20	\$195.00
B320	05/30/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	1.80	\$1,755.00
B320	05/30/25	RKC	Coordinate and oversee review of Debtor's production of over 24,000 documents	0.60	\$585.00
B320	05/30/25	RKC	Review and revise outline for deposition of Bishop Barber	0.90	\$877.50
B320	05/30/25	RR	Research and analyze case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.10	\$997.50
B320	05/30/25	ZM	Search for statements, articles and affidavit from Bishop Michael Barber regarding the bankruptcy of the Oakland Diocese	2.50	\$1,050.00
B320	05/31/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos	9.60	\$6,864.00
B320	05/31/25	BIW	Prepare for Committee Rule 30(b)(6) deposition	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	05/31/25	BIW	Continue to prepare for Committee Rule 30(b)(six) deposition	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	05/31/25	BMC	Conduct first level review of debtors' produced documents	1.10	\$792.00
B320	05/31/25	CD	Review documents and facilitate document review	0.50	\$432.50
B320	05/31/25	CD	Draft letter re: discovery issues	1.10	\$951.50
B320	05/31/25	CD	Revise Bishop deposition outline	5.30	\$4,584.50
B320	05/31/25	CG	Finalize deposition outline and exhibit binders in connection with same (2.5); incorporate comments to same from C. Restel and R. Chahil (3.3)	5.80	\$3,828.00
B320	05/31/25	CGS	Review Debtor's production for relevance and responsiveness (6.9); revise and draft Bishop Barber draft deposition outline (.9); Review relevant documents for draft Atilla Bardos deposition outline (1.4)	9.20	\$7,222.00
B320	05/31/25	CK	Attention to database management re: locating and exporting documents	1.50	\$450.00
B320	05/31/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (3.8); Review and revise letter re: discovery (.4); Confer re: proposed order re: Committee Motion for Protective Order (.2)	4.40	\$4,950.00
B320	05/31/25	DJC	Continue Doc Review	1.70	\$1,105.00
B320	05/31/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (3.0); legal research re: discovery (0.7); search for referenced documents (2.2)	5.90	\$4,631.50
B320	05/31/25	JDP	E-mails to/from litigation team and BRG re: Debtor's supplemental production	0.30	\$411.00
B320	05/31/25	JDP	E-mails to/from Stout re: property inspections	0.30	\$411.00
B320	05/31/25	JDP	Review rough transcripts of depositions	3.50	\$4,795.00
B320	05/31/25	JJP	Provide assistance to the review team as requested re: database searches and document exports	1.30	\$559.00
B320	05/31/25	KEM	Review document productions re: confirmation preparation	2.20	\$2,321.00
B320	05/31/25	LHS	Finalize outline for Adventus 30b6 deposition and conduct document review pursuant to same	5.00	\$5,275.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 49 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	05/31/25	MAK	Review and revise outline for deposition of Bishop and incorporate new exhibits from supplemental debtor productions	3.60	\$4,086.00
B320	05/31/25	MAK	Review and revise outline for deposition of A. Bardos (in all capacities) and incorporate new exhibits from supplemental debtor productions	3.30	\$3,745.50
B320	05/31/25	MAK	Review and revise discovery letter to debtor	0.30	\$340.50
B320	05/31/25	MD	Perform document review for possible causes of action in relation to prepare for upcoming depositions	3.20	\$2,080.00
B320	05/31/25	RDB	Review documents in preparation for depositions	2.30	\$1,851.50
B320	05/31/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	2.10	\$2,047.50
B320	05/31/25	RKC	Review and revise outline for deposition of A. Bardos	2.00	\$1,950.00
B320	05/31/25	RKC	Compile documents for Committee's 30(b)[6] deposition preparation	0.30	\$292.50
B320	05/31/25	RKC	Draft and send letter re: follow-up from D. Flanagan deposition	2.20	\$2,145.00
B320	05/31/25	RKC	Oversee review of Debtor's document production	1.20	\$1,170.00
B320	06/01/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (6.0); strategize re: A. Bardos deposition outline (0.7)	6.70	\$4,790.50
B320	06/01/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.80	\$1,557.00
B320	06/01/25	AS	Load incoming production documents into Relativity case database; add newly loaded documents into review que; modify search as request; provide notice to case team availability of documents	3.50	\$1,277.50
B320	06/01/25	BIW	Continue to prepare for Committee Rule 30(b)(6) deposition	2.30	\$2,668.00
B320	06/01/25	BIW	Continue to prepare for Committee Rule 30(b)(6) deposition	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	06/01/25	BIW	Draft emails re final vote tabulation	0.20	\$232.00
B320	06/01/25	BIW	Review Judge Hogan rough Deposition Transcript	0.70	\$812.00
B320	06/01/25	BIW	Continue to prepare for Committee Rule 30(b)(6) deposition	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/01/25	CD	Draft Bishop deposition outline	2.70	\$2,335.50
B320	06/01/25	CD	Revise A. Bardos deposition outline	0.70	\$605.50
B320	06/01/25	CD	Review documents for deps	0.90	\$778.50
B320	06/01/25	CG	Review and analyze Debtors' document production and draft deposition outline	3.60	\$2,376.00
B320	06/01/25	CGS	Conduct research regarding 30b6 witnesses for R. Chahil review	3.50	\$2,747.50
B320	06/01/25	CGS	Revise and edit Bishop Barber deposition outline	1.30	\$1,020.50
B320	06/01/25	CGS	Draft Bishop Barber deposition outline	1.00	\$785.00
B320	06/01/25	CK	Prepare documents for production; post documents to SharePoint for distribution	2.60	\$780.00
B320	06/01/25	CMR	Prepare for deposition of fact witnesses re: Confirmation	5.90	\$6,637.50
B320	06/01/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions	2.20	\$2,475.00
B320	06/01/25	CTC	Review debtor documents re: deposition preparation	8.00	\$4,480.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/01/25	DJC	Continue doc review	6.40	\$4,160.00
B320	06/01/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (2.5); revise deposition outline (2.4)	4.90	\$3,846.50
B320	06/01/25	JJP	Prepare searches and export document sets (1.2); review and respond to email correspondence from the case team re: document review assistance (1.3); coordinate the inclusion of new document sets into the case database (.2);	2.70	\$1,161.00
B320	06/01/25	KEM	Review document productions re: confirmation preparation	3.80	\$4,009.00
B320	06/01/25	KFC	Review and finalize exhibits and outlines in preparation of depositions	2.50	\$1,000.00
B320	06/01/25	LHS	Work on deposition outline and conduct document review	8.00	\$8,440.00
B320	06/01/25	LHS	Review voting summary	0.20	\$211.00
B320	06/01/25	MAK	Review and revise outline for deposition of RCWC corporate designee	2.10	\$2,383.50
B320	06/01/25	MAK	Second level review of supplemental document productions	2.80	\$3,178.00
B320	06/01/25	MAK	Review and revise outline for deposition of A. Bardos (in all capacities) and incorporate new exhibits from supplemental debtor productions	4.40	\$4,994.00
B320	06/01/25	MD	Perform document review to prepare for upcoming depositions	7.10	\$4,615.00
B320	06/01/25	RDB	Review documents in preparation for depositions	5.00	\$4,025.00
B320	06/01/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	0.60	\$585.00
B320	06/01/25	RKC	Confer with C. Stewart re: ability of party that did not notice deposition to ask	0.20	\$195.00
B320	06/01/25	RKC	Review R. Gies deposition transcript	1.70	\$1,657.50
B320	06/01/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	3.10	\$3,022.50
B320	06/01/25	RKC	Strategize re: preparation for expert depositions	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/01/25	RKC	Review and revise outline for deposition of RCWC corporate designee	2.80	\$2,730.00
B320	06/02/25	AMG	Revise, proof, and cite check deposition outline for A. Bardos (10.0); prepare for A. Bardos deposition (2.7)	12.70	\$9,080.50
B320	06/02/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.80	\$692.00
B320	06/02/25	BIW	Prepare for Committee Designee deposition	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	06/02/25	BIW	Prepare for Committee Designee deposition	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/02/25	CD	Review documents and revise Bishop outline	4.30	\$3,719.50
B320	06/02/25	CG	Finalize exhibit folders for depositions and coordinate printing	2.70	\$1,782.00
B320	06/02/25	CGS	Prepare documents for Bishop Barber deposition	1.30	\$1,020.50
B320	06/02/25	CGS	Conduct research regarding Bishop Barber deposition	3.20	\$2,512.00
B320	06/02/25	CGS	Review Debtor documents for responsiveness and relevance	0.40	\$314.00
B320	06/02/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions re: Confirmation	6.70	\$7,537.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 51 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/02/25	CTC	Review debtor documents re: deposition preparation	4.20	\$2,352.00
B320	06/02/25	DJC	Continue doc review	1.20	\$780.00
B320	06/02/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (5.9); revise deposition outline (0.2); prepare deposition exhibits (0.8)	6.90	\$5,416.50
B320	06/02/25	JDP	Call with R. Rosen re: valuation of real estate	0.20	\$274.00
B320	06/02/25	JDP	E-mails from/to A. Uetz re: discovery disputes and calendar	0.20	\$274.00
B320	06/02/25	JJP	Export reviewed document sets requested by R. Chahil and distribute same to BRG (.6); convert RCBO production sets to PDF and export (.7); post documents to SharePoint (.3); convert files and provide indicies to M. Babcock as requested (.6)	2.20	\$946.00
B320	06/02/25	KEM	Review document productions re: confirmation preparation	0.50	\$527.50
B320	06/02/25	KFC	Review and finalize exhibits and outlines in preparation of depositions	4.60	\$1,840.00
B320	06/02/25	LHS	Work on revised outline, conduct document review, and prepare exhibits for deposition	3.80	\$4,009.00
B320	06/02/25	MAK	Telephone calls with A. Uetz re: discovery scheduling and issues	0.40	\$454.00
B320	06/02/25	MAK	Second level review of supplemental document productions	3.90	\$4,426.50
B320	06/02/25	MAK	Review discovery responses and pleadings in connection with DS and Plan to prepare corporate designee	3.80	\$4,313.00
B320	06/02/25	MD	Perform document review to prepare for upcoming depositions	7.20	\$4,680.00
B320	06/02/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	6.10	\$5,947.50
B320	06/02/25	RKC	Confer with J. Jameson re: research re: 30(b)[6] deposition	0.20	\$195.00
B320	06/02/25	RKC	Attention to Debtor's amended designations of witness; revise A. Bardos deposition outline re: same	0.50	\$487.50
B320	06/02/25	RR	Research and analyze case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.20	\$1,045.00
B320	06/03/25	AMG	Prepare for deposition of A. Bardos (5.0); revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (2.8)	7.80	\$5,577.00
B320	06/03/25	BIW	Attend Bishop's deposition	5.30	\$6,148.00
B320	06/03/25	CD	Draft A. Bardos deposition outline	1.00	\$865.00
B320	06/03/25	CD	Facilitate document review	0.20	\$173.00
B320	06/03/25	CD	Review documents	0.20	\$173.00
B320	06/03/25	CGS	Review Debtor production for relevance and responsiveness	0.80	\$628.00
B320	06/03/25	CMR	Prepare for (2.0) and participate in (3.0) depositions of fact witnesses	5.00	\$5,625.00
B320	06/03/25	CTC	Review debtor documents re: deposition preparation	4.10	\$2,296.00
B320	06/03/25	DJC	Continue doc review	0.70	\$455.00
B320	06/03/25	JAM	Research and analyze constitutional issues re: confirmation briefing	5.90	\$5,074.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 52 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/03/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (2.1); prepare deposition exhibits (0.9); legal research re: 30b6 witness (2.3)	5.30	\$4,160.50
B320	06/03/25	JDP	Meet with R. Rosen for inspections of RCBO real estate	4.20	\$5,754.00
B320	06/03/25	JDP	Participate in fact witness depositions (virtually)	3.00	\$4,110.00
B320	06/03/25	JJP	Export document sets to transfer to BRG (.7); review and respond to additional requests for load file conversions from M. Babcock (.5); update production tracking information (.6)	1.80	\$774.00
B320	06/03/25	KEM	Review document production	1.70	\$1,793.50
B320	06/03/25	LHS	Document review	3.00	\$3,165.00
B320	06/03/25	LHS	Final review of deposition outline	0.30	\$316.50
B320	06/03/25	MAK	Deposition of B. Barber	5.30	\$6,015.50
B320	06/03/25	MD	Perform document review for upcoming depositions	4.60	\$2,990.00
B320	06/03/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	2.40	\$2,340.00
B320	06/03/25	RKC	Review research re: 30(b)[6] deposition	0.20	\$195.00
B320	06/03/25	RKC	Attend deposition of L. Oberempt	3.00	\$2,925.00
B320	06/03/25	RKC	Review/revise A. Bardos deposition outline re: Adventus and OPF	1.70	\$1,657.50
B320	06/04/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document production (0.3); strategize re: Debtor's document production (0.3); revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (1.0); prepare for A. Bardos deposition (0.4)	2.00	\$1,430.00
B320	06/04/25	CD	Facilitate document review and review documents	1.80	\$1,557.00
B320	06/04/25	CGS	Review transcripts for follow-up requests for production from Debtor	3.30	\$2,590.50
B320	06/04/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions re: confirmation (5.5); Analyze issues re: confirmation schedule (.2)	5.70	\$6,412.50
B320	06/04/25	CTC	Review debtor documents re: deposition preparation	6.40	\$3,584.00
B320	06/04/25	DJC	Continue doc review	3.60	\$2,340.00
B320	06/04/25	JAM	Research and analyze constitutional issues re: confirmation briefing	2.10	\$1,806.00
B320	06/04/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (3.6); draft submission re: 30b6 witness (1.2)	4.80	\$3,768.00
B320	06/04/25	JDP	Review and comment on fact witness deposition	3.70	\$5,069.00
B320	06/04/25	JJP	Prepare searches and export document sets as requested by R. Chahil (1.1); modify search term reports and provide updates to A. Giblin (.6); update review queues (.2)	1.90	\$817.00
B320	06/04/25	KEM	Correspondence with P. Gross re: confirmation objection (.1); review confirmation objection outline (.4)	0.50	\$527.50
B320	06/04/25	KFC	Review and compile exhibits in preparation of A. Bardos deposition	3.50	\$1,400.00
B320	06/04/25	LHS	Document review	2.00	\$2,110.00
B320	06/04/25	MRB	Review documents from debtor to prepare for depositions	1.00	\$865.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/04/25	PJG	Review issues re: confirmation objection re: releases, impaired consenting classes, and unfair discrimination and prior briefing re: same (.6); draft email re: same to K. Moynihan, B. Weisenberg, and J. Prol (.5)	1.10	\$1,204.50
B320	06/04/25	RKC	Participate in meeting with doc review team	0.70	\$682.50
B320	06/04/25	RKC	Prepare for depositions	4.80	\$4,680.00
B320	06/05/25	AD	Attend meeting with document review team	0.70	\$455.00
B320	06/05/25	AD	Review documents produced by Debtor	1.60	\$1,040.00
B320	06/05/25	AMG	Prepare for deposition of A. Bardos (1.0); revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (0.6); strategize re: Debtor's document production (0.7); review Debtor's document production (0.6)	2.90	\$2,073.50
B320	06/05/25	BIW	Review recent Supreme Court case re: religious freedom and First Amendment issues (.4); draft email to B. Albin re: same (.4)	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/05/25	BIW	Review rough L. Oberempt deposition transcript	0.60	\$696.00
B320	06/05/25	BTA	Confer with A. Patel; review e-mail from B. Weisenberg, and responsive analysis	0.50	\$850.00
B320	06/05/25	CD	Facilitate document review and review documents	2.70	\$2,335.50
B320	06/05/25	CF	Review documents produced by Debtor for confirmation-related discovery	5.30	\$3,498.00
B320	06/05/25	CGS	Review Debtor document production for responsiveness and relevance	1.60	\$1,256.00
B320	06/05/25	CGS	Review recent transcripts for follow-up requests for production	1.30	\$1,020.50
B320	06/05/25	CGS	Assist in preparation for adversary hearing	0.40	\$314.00
B320	06/05/25	CGS	Attend Andrew Currier deposition	3.20	\$2,512.00
B320	06/05/25	CMR	Prepare for (.8) and participate in (2.8) fact depositions re: confirmation; Confer with Debtor and experts re: scheduling expert depositions (.3); Confer with Debtor's counsel re: amended confirmation schedule (.2) and prepare stipulation re: same (.9); Prepare disclosure of rebuttal experts (.4); Review and revise brief re: Committee 30b6 witness (3.1)	8.50	\$9,562.50
B320	06/05/25	CTC	Review debtor documents re: deposition preparation	6.40	\$3,584.00
B320	06/05/25	DJC	Continue doc review	2.00	\$1,300.00
B320	06/05/25	HP	Prepare for and attend meeting re: RCBO document review (.7); review documents produced by debtor (4.7)	5.40	\$3,510.00
B320	06/05/25	HP	Meet with document review team re: diligence review	0.70	\$455.00
B320	06/05/25	JAM	Emails with J. Albin and B. Weisenberg re: constitutional briefing strategy and analysis of issues	0.30	\$258.00
B320	06/05/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (2.0); draft submission re: 30b6 witness (0.5); legal research re: same (3.0)	5.50	\$4,317.50
B320	06/05/25	JDP	Prepare for and attend portion of deposition (virtually)	2.80	\$3,836.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/05/25	JJP	Prepare database searches, export document sets and transfer files to BRG with indices (.6); provide status information re: document review to C. Dernbach and A. Giblin (.3); provide assistance re: additional review team setup (.3)	1.20	\$516.00
B320	06/05/25	KEM	Review document productions re: confirmation preparation	2.00	\$2,110.00
B320	06/05/25	LHS	Document review	4.20	\$4,431.00
B320	06/05/25	LR	Prepare for and attend conference with C. Dernbach and others regarding documents produced by debtor	0.70	\$455.00
B320	06/05/25	LR	Review debtor documents	2.00	\$1,300.00
B320	06/05/25	MAK	Prepare for and take deposition of corporate designee of OPF and Adventus	3.20	\$3,632.00
B320	06/05/25	MD	Conduct document review	0.70	\$455.00
B320	06/05/25	MRB	Review documents from debtor to prepare for depositions	2.60	\$2,249.00
B320	06/05/25	RKC	Oversee/coordinate review of Debtor's document productions (0.5); prepare for depositions (0.9)	1.40	\$1,365.00
B320	06/05/25	RKC	Confer with expert witnesses re: additional documents for review	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/05/25	RKC	Prepare for (1.5) and pariticipate in (2.8) deposition of A. Currier	4.30	\$4,192.50
B320	06/05/25	RS	Prepare for conference with document review (.7); review documents produced by debtor (.9)	1.60	\$1,040.00
B320	06/05/25	ZN	Prepare for and attend conference with document review team	0.70	\$455.00
B320	06/06/25	AD	Review documents produced by Debtor	3.30	\$2,145.00
B320	06/06/25	AMG	Review documents for A. Bardos deposition (2.9); revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (5.2); strategize re: Debtor's document production (0.5)	8.60	\$6,149.00
B320	06/06/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.80	\$2,422.00
B320	06/06/25	AP	Draft memorandum re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.10	\$951.50
B320	06/06/25	BIW	Review deposition transcripts	0.60	\$696.00
B320	06/06/25	BIW	Draft email to B. Albin re: response to Debtor's First Amendment and religious freedom arguments	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/06/25	BIW	Draft email to B. Albin re: analysis of recent Supreme Court decision	0.40	\$464.00
B320	06/06/25	BTA	Review of e-mail memo from A. Patel with attached cases; independent research on the hypothetical liquidation test; e-mail exchanges with B. Weisenberg; review of transcript of Dec. 18, 2024 Bankruptcy Proceedings	1.50	\$2,550.00
B320	06/06/25	CD	Review documents and facilitate document review	5.60	\$4,844.00
B320	06/06/25	CF	Review documents produced by Debtor for confirmation-related discovery	8.50	\$5,610.00
B320	06/06/25	CGS	Review transcripts for follow-up requests for production from Debtor	7.40	\$5,809.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/06/25	CGS	Review Debtor production for relevant and responsive documents	1.10	\$863.50
B320	06/06/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (1.0); Analyze outstanding issues re: documents requested at depositions (.1); Circulate Stipulation Amending Confirmation Schedule (.1); Confer re: scheduling expert depositions (.2); Review and revise brief re: Committee 30b6 witness (3.2)	4.60	\$5,175.00
B320	06/06/25	CTC	Review debtor documents re: deposition preparation	4.70	\$2,632.00
B320	06/06/25	DJC	Continue doc review	1.50	\$975.00
B320	06/06/25	HP	Review documents produced by debtor	2.00	\$1,300.00
B320	06/06/25	HP	Review documents produced by debtor	6.30	\$4,095.00
B320	06/06/25	JAM	Research and analyze constitutional issues re: confirmation briefing (1.2); emails with A. Patel and B. Albin re: research strategy and findings (.6); emails with B. Albin, A. Patel, and B. Weisenberg re: additional theories (.3); emails with R. Rocco re: analysis research and outline (.3)	2.40	\$2,064.00
B320	06/06/25	$_{ m JBJ}$	Review produced documents for responsiveness	2.00	\$1,570.00
B320	06/06/25	JDP	Review rough versions of dep transcripts	2.00	\$2,740.00
B320	06/06/25	JJP	Prepare searches, create export sets and transfer files with indices to BRG for review (.8); incorporate new production sets into the case database and identify issues with same (.4)	1.20	\$516.00
B320	06/06/25	KEM	Review document productions re: Confirmation preparation	1.40	\$1,477.00
B320	06/06/25	KFC	Search for and retrieve documents to be used as deposition exhibits	2.00	\$800.00
B320	06/06/25	LHS	Conduct document review	3.00	\$3,165.00
B320	06/06/25	LR	Review debtor documents	5.20	\$3,380.00
B320	06/06/25	MRB	Review documents from debtor to prepare for depositions	5.70	\$4,930.50
B320	06/06/25	RDB	Review documents in preparation for depositions	1.80	\$1,449.00
B320	06/06/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel and A. Giblin re: preparation for A. Bardos deposition	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/06/25	RKC	Confer with C. Stewart re: follow-up requests for documents from depositions	0.20	\$195.00
B320	06/06/25	RR	Create research outline re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing and circulate internally	4.40	\$2,090.00
B320	06/06/25	RS	Review documents prepared by debtor	1.50	\$975.00
B320	06/06/25	ZN	Review documents produced by debtor	4.70	\$3,055.00
B320	06/07/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos	0.90	\$643.50
B320	06/07/25	CD	Review document production	1.60	\$1,384.00
B320	06/07/25	CF	Review documents produced by Debtor for confirmation-related discovery	3.60	\$2,376.00
B320	06/07/25	CG	Review and analyze Debtors' document production	3.90	\$2,574.00
B320	06/07/25	CGS	Review Debtor's produced documents for relevance and responsiveness	4.50	\$3,532.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 56 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/07/25	CMR	Review and revise brief re: Committee 30b6 witness	1.60	\$1,800.00
B320	06/07/25	DJC	Continue doc review	2.30	\$1,495.00
B320	06/07/25	HP	Review documents produced by debtor	3.30	\$2,145.00
B320	06/07/25	HP	Review documents produced by debtor	1.00	\$650.00
B320	06/07/25	JAM	Research and analyze constitutional issues re: confirmation briefing	1.20	\$1,032.00
B320	06/07/25	JJP	Prepare searches, create export sets and transfer files with indices to BRG for review	0.90	\$387.00
B320	06/07/25	KEM	Review document productions re: confirmation preparation	4.70	\$4,958.50
B320	06/07/25	LHS	Review documents produced by debtor	2.20	\$2,321.00
B320	06/07/25	LR	Review debtor documents	4.50	\$2,925.00
B320	06/07/25	MAK	Review and revise submission to court re: committee deposition	0.80	\$908.00
B320	06/07/25	MD	Perform document review	2.80	\$1,820.00
B320	06/07/25	MRB	Review documents from debtor to prepare for depositions	1.70	\$1,470.50
B320	06/07/25	RDB	Review documents in preparation for depositions	3.50	\$2,817.50
B320	06/07/25	RS	Review documents produced by debtor	5.10	\$3,315.00
B320	06/07/25	ZN	Review documents produced by debtor	0.40	\$260.00
B320	06/08/25	AD	Review documents produced by Debtor	1.50	\$975.00
B320	06/08/25	AMG	Review documents for A. Bardos deposition	0.20	\$143.00
B320	06/08/25	CD	Review documents and facilitate document review	0.80	\$692.00
B320	06/08/25	CF	Conduct plan-related document review	2.40	\$1,584.00
B320	06/08/25	CG	Review and analyze Debtors' document production	1.20	\$792.00
B320	06/08/25	CGS	Review Debtor's produced documents	4.50	\$3,532.50
B320	06/08/25	CMR	Finalize Stipulation re: Amended Confirmation Schedule (.2); Review and revise brief re: Committee 30b6 witness (.5); Confer re: scheduling expert depositions (.1); Prepare for fact depositions (2.7)	3.50	\$3,937.50
B320	06/08/25	CTC	Review debtor documents re: deposition preparation	4.70	\$2,632.00
B320	06/08/25	DJC	Continue doc review	3.10	\$2,015.00
B320	06/08/25	HP	Review documents produced by debtor	3.80	\$2,470.00
B320	06/08/25	HP	Review documents produced by debtor	0.80	\$520.00
B320	06/08/25	JJP	Prepare searches, create export sets and transfer files with indices to BRG for review	0.80	\$344.00
B320	06/08/25	KEM	Review document production re: confirmation preparation	0.10	\$105.50
B320	06/08/25	LHS	Conduct document review	4.00	\$4,220.00
B320	06/08/25	LR	Review debtor documents	4.00	\$2,600.00
B320	06/08/25	MD	Conduct document review	4.60	\$2,990.00
B320	06/08/25	MRB	Review documents from debtor to prepare for depositions	2.30	\$1,989.50
B320	06/08/25	NRR	Review documents produced by debtor	3.10	\$2,681.50
B320	06/08/25	RS	Review documents produced by debtor	4.00	\$2,600.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/08/25	ZN	Review documents produced by debtor	0.60	\$390.00
B320	06/09/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (5.0); prepare for A. Bardos deposition (1.4); review Debtor's document production (1.0)	7.40	\$5,291.00
B320	06/09/25	AP	Prepare for and attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin, J. Minicozzi, and R. Rocco reconstitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.80	\$692.00
B320	06/09/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.80	\$692.00
B320	06/09/25	BIW	Review Debtor's brief on Committee's deponent and waiver of privilege	0.20	\$232.00
B320	06/09/25	BIW	Review NOLA Child Protection Protocols	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/09/25	BTA	Zoom meeting with J. Minicozzi, A. Patel, and R. Rocco re: confirmation briefing	0.80	\$1,360.00
B320	06/09/25	BTA	Review of J. Minicozzi outline for research assignments	0.10	\$170.00
B320	06/09/25	CD	Review document production	0.20	\$173.00
B320	06/09/25	CD	Attend strategy call with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, and R. Chahil	0.50	\$432.50
B320	06/09/25	CF	Review documents produced by Debtor	1.30	\$858.00
B320	06/09/25	CGS	Review Debtor's produced documents	0.20	\$157.00
B320	06/09/25	CMR	Finalize brief re: Committee 30b6 designee (.9); Analyze Debtor brief re: same (.5); Send disclosure of Rebuttal Expert Witnesses re: Confirmation (.1); Prepare for fact depositions (4.6); Call with P. Shields re: same (.3); Call with M. Kaplan, R. Chahil, and C. Dernbach re: outstanding discovery issues (.6); Follow up with Debtor's counsel re: same (.6); Confer with G. Albert re: submission of Order on UCC Motion for Protective Order (.1); Confer re: scheduling expert depositions (.4)	8.10	\$9,112.50
B320	06/09/25	CTC	Review debtor documents re: deposition preparation	0.90	\$504.00
B320	06/09/25	DJC	Review document production	1.20	\$780.00
B320	06/09/25	HP	Review documents produced by debtor	1.50	\$975.00
B320	06/09/25	HP	Review documents produced by debtor	2.20	\$1,430.00
B320	06/09/25	JAM	Research and analyze constitutional issues re: confirmation briefing (2.2); outline draft of arguments (1.0); prepare for and attend meeting with J. Albin, A. Patel, and R. Rocco re: draft and research issues (.8); emails with R. Rocco re: research (.2); prepare for and attend meeting with R. Rocco re: research and drafting (.3); draft summary of topics and draft additional portions of outline (2.1); emails with J. Albin and A. Patel re: research and outline (.2)	6.80	\$5,848.00
B320	06/09/25	JBJ	Proofread (0.4) and verify citations in 30b6 brief (1.0)	1.40	\$1,099.00
B320	06/09/25	JJP	Update review sets (.3); follow-up with case team re: document production (.1); export documents sets and transfer to BRG (.7); provide assistance re: document review (.2)	1.30	\$559.00
B320	06/09/25	KEM	Review document production (.9); review R. Gies deposition transcript in preparation for confirmation (.7)	1.60	\$1,688.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/09/25	KFC	Review and finalize outline and exhibits for A. Bardos deposition	3.20	\$1,280.00
B320	06/09/25	LHS	Conduct document review	2.50	\$2,637.50
B320	06/09/25	MAK	Review and analyze debtor's submission on committee corporate designee deposition	0.40	\$454.00
B320	06/09/25	MAK	Review and analyze deposition transcripts for follow up requests and further discovery needs (1.6); revise follow up e-mails to debtor (.2); second level review of supplemental document production (2.7); review and revise A. Bardos deposition outline (1.4); meeting with litigation team re: discovery (.6)	6.50	\$7,377.50
B320	06/09/25	MRB	Review documents from debtor to prepare for depositions	0.50	\$432.50
B320	06/09/25	RKC	Meeting with P. Shields re: expert report	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/09/25	RKC	Address issues re: Debtor's document production (0.3); prepare for A. Bardos deposition (0.4); attention to follow-up with Debtor re: discovery issues (0.2); confer with J. Jameson re: privilege research (0.2)	1.10	\$1,072.50
B320	06/09/25	RKC	Lowenstein team meeting re: discovery strategy and next steps	0.60	\$585.00
B320	06/09/25	RR	Meet with J. Minicozzi, Justice Albin, and A. Patel reconfirmation briefing research	1.00	\$475.00
B320	06/10/25	AMG	Prepare for A. Bardos deposition (2.7); revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (1.8)	4.50	\$3,217.50
B320	06/10/25	BIW	Confer with P. Gross and K. Moynahan re: confirmation briefing issues	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	06/10/25	BIW	Review research on Debtor's ability to satisfy 1129 factors	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/10/25	CD	Research and review Debtor's expert backgrounds	4.20	\$3,633.00
B320	06/10/25	CGS	Review Debtor's produced documents	2.60	\$2,041.00
B320	06/10/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (4.4); Analyze issues re: Rebuttal Expert Disclosures (.2); Analyze issues re: expert reports (.7)	5.30	\$5,962.50
B320	06/10/25	DC	Update confirmation hearing schedule, critical dates memo and attorney calendar with deadlines and zoom link for 6/13/25 hearing	0.50	\$200.00
B320	06/10/25	JBJ	Legal research re: privilege (3.8); analyze caselaw in Debtor's brief (3.5); prepare e-binder for hearing (1.0)	8.30	\$6,515.50
B320	06/10/25	JJP	Transfer files re: restricted assets and abuse settlements (.7); incorporate new documents into the case database (.3); locate and provide copies of documents requested by R. Chahil (.3)	1.30	\$559.00
B320	06/10/25	KEM	Review and analysis of confirmation objection issues with B. Weisenberg and P. Gross (1.2); draft outline of confirmation objection (.3); review R. Gies deposition transcript re: confirmation preparation (.5); call with C. Restel re: non-abuse litigation claims (.2); correspondence with P. Gross re: confirmation objection format (.1)	2.30	\$2,426.50
B320	06/10/25	MAK	Revise Bardos outline and confer with C. Restel re: the same	3.70	\$4,199.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 59 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/10/25	PJG	Review issues list re: plan confirmation objections to prepare for call re: same with B. Weisenberg, K. Moynihan (0.5); Zoom call re: plan confirmation issues with B. Weisenberg, K. Moynihan (1.2)	1.70	\$1,861.50
B320	06/10/25	RKC	Prepare for A. Bardos deposition (1.1); confer with experts re: documents and their reports (0.7)	1.80	\$1,755.00
B320	06/10/25	ZM	Search for affidavits, declarations, expert reports, testimony, or depositions related to Timothy Raab and Nicholas DeLuca	2.00	\$840.00
B320	06/11/25	AMG	Revise deposition outline for A. Bardos (4.5); prepare for A. Bardos deposition (1.6)	10.10	\$7,221.50
B320	06/11/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	06/11/25	BIW	Review Debtor's feasibility analysis	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	06/11/25	BIW	Review case law on restricted assets and draft email re: same	0.40	\$464.00
B320	06/11/25	BIW	Review NOLA Child Protection Protocols	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/11/25	CD	Review document production	0.10	\$86.50
B320	06/11/25	CGS	Review recent Debtor document production	1.40	\$1,099.00
B320	06/11/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (2.9); Analyze legal issues re: Plan Confirmation (1.2)	4.10	\$4,612.50
B320	06/11/25	CMR	Prepare for hearing re: Rule 30b6 designee	0.80	\$900.00
B320	06/11/25	JBJ	Prepare e-binder for hearing (0.7); review documents re: Debtor's expert (4.0)	4.70	\$3,689.50
B320	06/11/25	JJP	Provide documents requested by C. Stewart and A. Giblin for review re: abuse settlements and allegedly restricted assets	0.50	\$215.00
B320	06/11/25	KEM	Research re: confirmation objection issues (2.4); draft confirmation objection outline (.5)	3.30	\$3,481.50
B320	06/11/25	KFC	Prepare and compile e-binder of A. Bardos exhibits	0.30	\$120.00
B320	06/11/25	RKC	Prepare for A. Bardos deposition	0.50	\$487.50
B320	06/12/25	AMG	Prepare for (1.5) and attend (8.0) deposition of A. Bardos	9.50	\$6,792.50
B320	06/12/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Kaplan re: questions to be posed at deposition	0.30	\$348.00
B320	06/12/25	CD	Review Debtor's expert background materials	0.80	\$692.00
B320	06/12/25	CMR	Prepare for fact depositions (.4); Attend (partial) deposition (6.3); Analyze legal issues re: privilege (.3); Analyze legal issues re: confirmation (.3); Analyze issues re: expert testimony re: confirmation (.2)	7.50	\$8,437.50
B320	06/12/25	JDP	Review deposition transcripts	0.90	\$1,233.00
B320	06/12/25	KEM	Research re: confirmation objection issues (1.8); email to C. Frankel re: confirmation research issues (.3); review R. Gies deposition re: confirmation preparation (.5)	2.60	\$2,743.00
B320	06/12/25	MAK	Prepare for deposition of A. Bardos (1.6); take deposition of A. Bardos (8.0)	9.60	\$10,896.00
B320	06/12/25	PJG	Review and edit draft confirmation objection legal arguments outline	1.30	\$1,423.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 60 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/12/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: deposition preparation (0.3); prepare for A. Bardos deposition (1.2); confer with Stout re: expert analysis and information needed (1.1); confer with expert R. Klomparens re: additional documents (0.3)	2.90	\$2,827.50
B320	06/13/25	AMG	Prepare for (1.5) and attend (3.0) deposition of A. Bardos; meet with Debtor's counsel re: Confirmation hearing (1.7)	6.20	\$4,433.00
B320	06/13/25	BIW	Review A. Bardos Deposition Transcript	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	06/13/25	BIW	Second level review of documents produced by Debtor	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/13/25	CGS	Review documents relevant for expert reports and analysis	4.10	\$3,218.50
B320	06/13/25	CMR	Prepare letter re: privilege issues (1.0); Attend continued fact deposition of Attila Bardos (3.0); Call with Foley Team re: outstanding discovery issues (.7)	4.70	\$5,287.50
B320	06/13/25	JDP	Review dep transcripts	1.40	\$1,918.00
B320	06/13/25	KEM	Research on confirmation objection issues (.5); draft confirmation objection outline (.7)	1.20	\$1,266.00
B320	06/13/25	MAK	Prepare for deposition of A. Bardos (1.3); complete deposition of A. Bardos (3.0)	4.30	\$4,880.50
B320	06/13/25	PJG	Review issues list/confirmation objection outline from K. Moynihan (.2) and draft initial questions and comments re: same to K. Moynihan (.2)	0.40	\$438.00
B320	06/13/25	PJG	Draft confirmation objection	2.10	\$2,299.50
B320	06/13/25	RKC	Review state court complaint re: abuse settlement	0.40	\$390.00
B320	06/13/25	RKC	Confer with experts re: documents/analysis	2.60	\$2,535.00
B320	06/14/25	JDP	Review report on Father Brandon	0.60	\$822.00
B320	06/14/25	RR	Draft memo re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	3.10	\$1,472.50
B320	06/15/25	PJG	Review and edit K. Moynihan draft confirmation objection	1.40	\$1,533.00
B320	06/15/25	PJG	Revise confirmation objection legal points outline	1.70	\$1,861.50
B320	06/15/25	RR	Draft memo re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	6.00	\$2,850.00
B320	06/16/25	BIW	Confer with Stout Real Estate re: timing of expert report	0.20	\$232.00
B320	06/16/25	BIW	Review research on mandatory reporting of sexual abuse in CA	0.40	\$464.00
B320	06/16/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: need for rebuttal testimony on real estate valuation	0.30	\$348.00
B320	06/16/25	BIW	Review deposition transcripts	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/16/25	CD	Review background materials for Debtor's experts	0.60	\$519.00
B320	06/16/25	CGS	Review documents relevant for expert reports and analysis	11.90	\$9,341.50
B320	06/16/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: experts re: Confirmation (.6); Analyze outstanding issues re: discovery (.3) and prepare letter re: same (.8); Analyze legal issues re: claims and voting (1.8); Calls (multiple) with BRG and LS Teams re: Confirmation issues (.5)	4.00	\$4,500.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 61 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/16/25	DC	Emails with R. Chahil and update confirmation hearing calendar and schedule	0.20	\$80.00
B320	06/16/25	JJP	Prepare indices of document productions (.5); upload document production for review (.3)	0.80	\$344.00
B320	06/16/25	KEM	Review confirmation objection outline	0.60	\$633.00
B320	06/16/25	PJG	Further draft and revise detailed confirmation objection outline and send same to K. Moynihan with additional comments and questions	1.80	\$1,971.00
B320	06/16/25	PJG	Confer and correspond with K. Moynihan re: confirmation objection outline (.4) and draft email re: same to B. Weisenberg, J. Prol and K. Moynihan (.3)	0.70	\$766.50
B320	06/16/25	PJG	Research re: additional plan confirmation issues	1.30	\$1,423.50
B320	06/16/25	RKC	Confer with R. Klomparens' office re: documents	0.40	\$390.00
B320	06/16/25	RKC	Meeting with BRG team re: plan confirmation issues	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/16/25	RKC	Confer with Stout re: documents	0.20	\$195.00
B320	06/16/25	RR	Draft memo re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	5.20	\$2,470.00
B320	06/17/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol and M. Kaplan re: plan confirmation strategy	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	06/17/25	BIW	Revise Plan Confirmation Objection outline	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	06/17/25	BIW	Review and comment on research re: plan confirmation issues	0.70	\$812.00
B320	06/17/25	BIW	Confer with P. Gross re: comment on outline of plan confirmation objection	0.60	\$696.00
B320	06/17/25	BTA	E-mail exchanges with J. Minicozzi and A. Patel; telephone conference with A. Patel	0.10	\$170.00
B320	06/17/25	CGS	Review relevant abuse claimants documents for forthcoming expert report	13.20	\$10,362.00
B320	06/17/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: confirmation of Plan (2.4); Review and revise letter re: discovery issues (2.9)	5.30	\$5,962.50
B320	06/17/25	DC	Develop confirmation hearing logistics	0.20	\$80.00
B320	06/17/25	JAM	Emails with J. Albin and A. Patel re: draft argument for constitutional argument in confirmation briefing	0.30	\$258.00
B320	06/17/25	JDP	Confer with M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg re: confirmation strategy	1.10	\$1,507.00
B320	06/17/25	JDP	Develop confirmation trial strategy with B. Weisenberg and M. Kaplan	1.10	\$1,507.00
B320	06/17/25	JDP	Review investigation report on Father Brandon	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	06/17/25	JDP	Review and edit renewed lift stay motion	1.40	\$1,918.00
B320	06/17/25	KEM	Review revisions to confirmation objection outline	0.40	\$422.00
B320	06/17/25	LHS	Review deposition transcript	0.30	\$316.50
B320	06/17/25	MAK	Meeting to coordinate plan confirmation strategy	1.10	\$1,248.50
B320	06/17/25	PJG	Call with B. Weisenberg re: comments to draft confirmation objection outline	0.60	\$657.00
B320	06/17/25	PJG	Review comments from B. Weisenberg to confirmation objection outline	0.40	\$438.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 62 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/17/25	PJG	Research re: hypothetical liquidation analysis/best interests test (.5) and draft email re: same to B. Weisenberg, K. Moynihan (.6)	1.10	\$1,204.50
B320	06/17/25	RKC	Confer with Stout re: documents	0.50	\$487.50
B320	06/17/25	RKC	Confer with R. Klomparen's office re: documents	0.50	\$487.50
B320	06/17/25	RKC	Strategize re: review and compilation of additional abuse-related documents	0.60	\$585.00
B320	06/17/25	RKC	E-mail Debtor's counsel re: abuse settlement documents	0.40	\$390.00
B320	06/17/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: follow-up on documents needed by experts and expert report strategy	0.40	\$390.00
B320	06/17/25	RR	Draft memo re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing and circulate internally for review	2.30	\$1,092.50
B320	06/18/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	4.20	\$3,633.00
B320	06/18/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol, P. Gross, and K. Moynahan re: outline of plan confirmation objection	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	06/18/25	BIW	Review and comment on research re: plan confirmation issues	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/18/25	BIW	Review draft expert reports	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	06/18/25	BIW	Assist with refinement of Plan confirmation legal strategy	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	06/18/25	CGS	Review relevant abuse claimants documents for forthcoming expert report	4.50	\$3,532.50
B320	06/18/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: export reports (.7) and initial drafts of same (1.4); Analyze legal and factual issues re: Plan Confirmation (3.0)	5.10	\$5,737.50
B320	06/18/25	JAM	Research and draft section of constitutional argument in confirmation briefing	2.10	\$1,806.00
B320	06/18/25	JBJ	Review documents re: expert	4.40	\$3,454.00
B320	06/18/25	JDP	Review dep transcripts and develop confirmation trial strategy	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	06/18/25	JDP	Participate in call with LS team re: confirmation brief	0.90	\$1,233.00
B320	06/18/25	JJP	Provide information to R. Chahil re: documents transferred to K. McNally (.6); remove clawback documents from Relativity (.1); prepare searches for document collection (.2)	0.90	\$387.00
B320	06/18/25	KEM	Review and analysis of confirmation objection outline with B. Weisenberg and P. Gross	0.90	\$949.50
B320	06/18/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of deposition transcripts to identify supplemental discovery needs and potential issues for cross-examination	2.40	\$2,724.00
B320	06/18/25	PJG	Prepare for (.5) and participate (.9) in call with J. Prol, B. Weisenberg, and K. Moynihan re: confirmation objection outline	1.40	\$1,533.00
B320	06/18/25	RKC	Review and analyze R. Currier deposition transcript	1.30	\$1,267.50
B320	06/18/25	RKC	Address document clawback request from Debtor	0.70	\$682.50
B320	06/18/25	RKC	Confer with expert R. Rosen re: report	0.20	\$195.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 63 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/18/25	RKC	Strategize re: Stout report (0.6); e-mail with Stout re: documents and expert report (0.5); e-mail with BRG team re: expert report (0.3)	1.40	\$1,365.00
B320	06/19/25	AP	Draft arguments re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	4.70	\$4,065.50
B320	06/19/25	AS	Provide assistance R. Chahil re: Export requested priest personal files from the Relativity case database and create encrypted SharePoint link to share external user	1.90	\$693.50
B320	06/19/25	BIW	Draft emails re: scheduling of depositions	0.30	\$348.00
B320	06/19/25	BTA	Telephone conference with A. Patel on hypothetical liquidation test and First Amendment; review e-mail from A. Patel, and part of attachments; review memo from R. Rocco	0.30	\$510.00
B320	06/19/25	CGS	Review Debtor confidentiality designations	6.80	\$5,338.00
B320	06/19/25	JAM	Research and draft section of constitutional argument in confirmation briefing (8.2); emails with A. Patel and B. Albin re: analysis and draft brief (.7)	8.90	\$7,654.00
B320	06/19/25	JDP	Review and comment on Stout preliminary valuation analysis	0.50	\$685.00
B320	06/19/25	JDP	Review dep transcripts	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	06/19/25	JDP	Review and comment on research for confirmation brief	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	06/19/25	RKC	Confer with Stout re: documents	0.40	\$390.00
B320	06/19/25	RKC	Review and analyze draft report from K. McNally	0.70	\$682.50
B320	06/19/25	RKC	Review letter re: confidentiality designations re: D. Flanagan deposition	0.20	\$195.00
B320	06/20/25	AP	Participate in telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.90	\$778.50
B320	06/20/25	BIW	Confer with Stout re: draft expert report	0.60	\$696.00
B320	06/20/25	BTA	Review of memo of J. Minicozzi and A. Patel on Hypothetical Liquidation Test; review of research memo of R. Rocco on First Amendment issues; review of cases	0.90	\$1,530.00
B320	06/20/25	BTA	Zoom conference with J. Minicozzi and A. Patel on their memos, additional research, and discussion of issues	0.90	\$1,530.00
B320	06/20/25	CGS	Review Protective Order re: confidentiality designations	0.30	\$235.50
B320	06/20/25	CMR	Analyze outstanding issues re: Plan Confirmation and Discovery (2.2); Call with Stout Team re: expert report (.7); Analyze confidentiality designations re: Flanagan deposition (1.2)	4.10	\$4,612.50
B320	06/20/25	JAM	Attend call with B. Albin and A. Patel re: draft constitutional argument and strategy for revisions (.9); research and revise sections of brief (2.9)	3.80	\$3,268.00
B320	06/20/25	JBJ	Legal research re: discovery (2.5); draft pleading re: same (0.5)	3.00	\$2,355.00
B320	06/20/25	JDP	Review dep transcripts	2.50	\$3,425.00
B320	06/20/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of deposition transcripts to identify supplemental discovery needs and potential issues for cross-examination	3.60	\$4,086.00
B320	06/20/25	MAK	Review and revise expert reports	2.10	\$2,383.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 64 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/20/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein team re: confidentiality designations	0.20	\$195.00
B320	06/20/25	RKC	Confer with Debtor re: outstanding items	0.10	\$97.50
B320	06/20/25	RKC	Begin review of Stout's draft report re: property valuation	0.50	\$487.50
B320	06/20/25	RKC	E-mails with N. Rose re: documents	0.20	\$195.00
B320	06/20/25	RKC	Confer with Stout team re: K. McNally's draft report	0.50	\$487.50
B320	06/21/25	BTA	Review of draft briefs by J. Minicozzi and A. Patel, and memo on First Amendment rights by R. Rocco and edit brief and review of sources	2.30	\$3,910.00
B320	06/21/25	CMR	Begin review of Stout Expert Report re: Real Estate (.6); Call with M. Moore re: voting and tabulation issues (.2); Analyze issues re: confidentiality designations (.5)	1.30	\$1,462.50
B320	06/21/25	JAM	Research and revise sections of brief re: constitutional argument (4.9); emails with B. Albin, A. Patel, and R. Rocco re: draft (.4)	5.30	\$4,558.00
B320	06/21/25	RKC	Review and send abuse complaints to Stout team	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/22/25	BTA	Review of cases cited in draft brief addressing hypothetical liquidation test	1.10	\$1,870.00
B320	06/22/25	CGS	Draft letter re: Debtor's confidentiality designations	1.50	\$1,177.50
B320	06/22/25	CMR	Continue review of Draft Stout Real Estate Expert Report	0.80	\$900.00
B320	06/22/25	JAM	Research and draft section of constitutional argument in confirmation briefing	2.10	\$1,806.00
B320	06/23/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	3.50	\$3,027.50
B320	06/23/25	AP	Draft memorandum re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	3.00	\$2,595.00
B320	06/23/25	BIW	Review recently produced documents	0.40	\$464.00
B320	06/23/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Plan confirmation trial	0.30	\$348.00
B320	06/23/25	BTA	Review of Supreme Court case law on Free Exercise and Establishment Clause	0.80	\$1,360.00
B320	06/23/25	CGS	Revise and edit draft omnibus letter re: confidentiality designations (1.0); review supplemental Debtor production of documents (1.0)	2.00	\$1,570.00
B320	06/23/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation of Plan (5.3); Review draft Expert Reports re: same (1.5)	6.80	\$7,650.00
B320	06/23/25	JDP	Reveiw dep transcripts (1.7); review and edit expert reports (1.9)	3.60	\$4,932.00
B320	06/23/25	JJP	Incorporate new production sets into the case database	1.10	\$473.00
B320	06/23/25	LHS	Review Debtors' expert witness and rebuttal expert witness disclosures (.3); review and background information on experts (2.0); work on expert deposition outline (1.4)	3.70	\$3,903.50
B320	06/23/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of deposition transcripts to identify supplemental discovery needs and potential issues for cross-examination	2.20	\$2,497.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 65 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/23/25	RKC	Strategize re: confidentiality designations for deposition transcripts	0.40	\$390.00
B320	06/23/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar re: expert deposition preparation	0.50	\$487.50
B320	06/23/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: documents	0.40	\$390.00
B320	06/23/25	RKC	Attention to document productions from RCBO and RCC	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/23/25	RKC	Confer with Stout re: documents	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/24/25	AP	Draft memorandum re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.50	\$2,162.50
B320	06/24/25	AP	Prepare for (.2) and attend (1.0) telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.20	\$1,038.00
B320	06/24/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.80	\$1,557.00
B320	06/24/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Kaplan re: review of expert reports	0.40	\$464.00
B320	06/24/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: liquidation analysis	0.60	\$696.00
B320	06/24/25	BIW	Reviewed draft Expert Report re: liquidation analysis	0.60	\$696.00
B320	06/24/25	BIW	Review revised Expert Report re: claims valuation	0.70	\$812.00
B320	06/24/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: liquidation analysis	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/24/25	BIW	Draft email to Team re: review of expert reports	0.30	\$348.00
B320	06/24/25	BTA	Telephone conference with M. Kaplan re: estopping Diocese from using canon law (.3); review of First Amendment case law on ministerial exception to application of civil law (.3), and review of draft brief (.6)	1.20	\$2,040.00
B320	06/24/25	BTA	Zoom meeting with A. Patel and J. Minicozzi constitutional law portion of draft brief	1.00	\$1,700.00
B320	06/24/25	CD	Review documents produced by Debtor	0.10	\$86.50
B320	06/24/25	CGS	Review and revise draft omnibus letter (.6); Review supplemental production and compose email detailing sufficiency of supplemental production (.6)	1.30	\$1,020.50
B320	06/24/25	CMR	Analyze draft expert reports (5.5); confer with R. Chahil and R. Klomparens re: expert report (.7); analyze legal issues re: Privilege Log (1.5)	7.00	\$7,875.00
B320	06/24/25	СТН	Research case law under 11 U.S.C. 1129 regarding real property in a hypothetical liquidation	0.60	\$246.00
B320	06/24/25	JAM	Emails with A. Patel and B. Albin re: analysis for confirmation brief (.2); prepare for (.2) and attend (1.2) meeting with B. Albin and A. Patel re: analysis for confirmation brief; emails with A. Patel re: constitutional research (.3)	1.90	\$1,634.00
B320	06/24/25	JBJ	Legal research re: discovery (0.5); draft pleading re: same (0.5); review draft expert report (0.7); edit draft expert report (7.5); participate in meeting re: draft expert report (0.5)	9.70	\$7,614.50
B320	06/24/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft expert reports	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	06/24/25	JJP	Transfer files to BRG	0.40	\$172.00
B320	06/24/25	KEM	Review confirmation objection outline (.2); research reconfirmation objection issues (.5)	0.70	\$738.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 66 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/24/25	MAK	Review and revise expert reports (3.7); confer with B. Albin re: use of Cannon law (.3)	4.00	\$4,540.00
B320	06/24/25	PJG	Review solicitation version of Plan/DS re: confirmation objection (1.5); review outlines of draft confirmation objection and begin drafting confirmation objection (3.1)	4.60	\$5,037.00
B320	06/24/25	RKC	Review releases in prior abuse settlements to assist with expert analysis	0.20	\$195.00
B320	06/24/25	RKC	Confer and strategize with C. Restel re: R. Klomparens expert report	0.70	\$682.50
B320	06/24/25	RKC	Review and analyze draft report exhibit from P. Shields	0.40	\$390.00
B320	06/24/25	RKC	Review and analyze R. Klomparens' draft report and edit same	3.20	\$3,120.00
B320	06/25/25	AMG	Conduct case law research re: methodology for valuating bankruptcy claims	2.90	\$2,073.50
B320	06/25/25	AP	Draft memorandum re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	4.80	\$4,152.00
B320	06/25/25	BIW	Prepare for confirmation trial logistics status conference with Court	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/25/25	BTA	Review of J. Minicozzi's memo on tasks for brief; review of A. Patel's memo on the Religious Freedom Restoration Act and case law and its potential application in a Chapter 11 proceeding; email to A. Patel and J. Minicozzi on whether the RFRA as applied to our case would violate the Establishment Clause	0.80	\$1,360.00
B320	06/25/25	CF	Conduct research related to plan confirmation objection	3.70	\$2,442.00
B320	06/25/25	CG	Confer with C. Restel re: privilege log	0.20	\$132.00
B320	06/25/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Debtor's privilege log (2.5); review and edit drafts of expert reports (3.5)	6.00	\$6,750.00
B320	06/25/25	DC	Draft outline for Confirmation Hearing logistics	1.10	\$440.00
B320	06/25/25	JAM	Emails with A. Patel and B. Albin re: constitutional analysis for confirmation briefing (.3); review and analyze memorandum from A. Patel re: constitutional analysis (.7)	1.00	\$860.00
B320	06/25/25	JBJ	Review draft expert report (1.0); edit draft expert report (8.1)	9.10	\$7,143.50
B320	06/25/25	JDP	Review and comment on expert reports (2.4); develop strategy for confirmation hearing (1.1)	3.50	\$4,795.00
B320	06/25/25	KEM	Review plan in preparation for confirmation objection (.4); correspondence with C. Frankel re: confirmation research (.2)	0.60	\$633.00
B320	06/25/25	MAK	Review and revise expert reports	2.20	\$2,497.00
B320	06/25/25	MAK	Review and analyze RCBO privilege log and asserted privileges (1.9); review research and analysis on application of canon law (2.5)	4.40	\$4,994.00
B320	06/25/25	MRB	Review and analyze privilege $\log (0.5)$; draft letter re: privilege $\log (0.1)$	0.60	\$519.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 67 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/25/25	PJG	Additional review of Plan, Disclosure Statement and UCC DS letter to formulate and include certain facts into plan confirmation objection (1.8); draft plan confirmation objection (2.9)	4.70	\$5,146.50
B320	06/25/25	RKC	Edit R. Klomparens draft report	0.90	\$877.50
B320	06/25/25	RKC	Review draft expert report materials from P. Shields	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/26/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	3.40	\$2,941.00
B320	06/26/25	AP	Draft memorandum re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	3.00	\$2,595.00
B320	06/26/25	BIW	Review and revise P. Shields Expert Report	1.70	\$1,972.00
B320	06/26/25	BIW	Review and revise appendix to P. Shields Expert Report	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	06/26/25	BIW	Review and comment on expert reports	0.80	\$928.00
B320	06/26/25	BIW	Draft supplemental document demand	0.40	\$464.00
B320	06/26/25	BTA	Review of A. Patel's memo on RFRA and Young II, and e-mails discussing whether RFRA as applied to Chapter 11 is violative of the Establishment clause	0.40	\$680.00
B320	06/26/25	CG	Create privilege log analysis re: priest personnel	5.70	\$3,762.00
B320	06/26/25	CGS	Review and revise forthcoming expert reports.	8.80	\$6,908.00
B320	06/26/25	CMR	Review and revise expert reports	6.50	\$7,312.50
B320	06/26/25	DC	Attend meeting with V. Taboada and K. Charles to discuss logistics for confirmation trial	0.50	\$200.00
B320	06/26/25	JAM	Emails with J. Albin and A. Patel re: research for confirmation brief	0.20	\$172.00
B320	06/26/25	JBJ	Edit draft expert report (2.2); legal research re: privilege (0.5); call with M. Berliner re: same (0.2); verify expert exhibits (3.0)	5.90	\$4,631.50
B320	06/26/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: Shields expert report	0.50	\$685.00
B320	06/26/25	JDP	Review and comment on research for confirmation brief	1.80	\$2,466.00
B320	06/26/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft expert reports	2.50	\$3,425.00
B320	06/26/25	JJP	Review and respond to email correspondence from K. Charles re: DropBox transfers	0.10	\$43.00
B320	06/26/25	KEM	Review plan in preparation for confirmation objection	0.40	\$422.00
B320	06/26/25	KFC	Attend meeting with D. Claussen and V. Taboada to discuss logistics for confirmation trial	0.50	\$200.00
B320	06/26/25	LHS	Review e-mail re: expert report deposition outline	0.30	\$316.50
B320	06/26/25	MAK	Review and revise expert reports	4.70	\$5,334.50
B320	06/26/25	MRB	Conduct research re: challenging privilege log	0.30	\$259.50
B320	06/26/25	PJG	Draft plan confirmation objection	4.20	\$4,599.00
B320	06/26/25	RKC	Coordinate and strategize re: review of all report exhibits and sources	2.50	\$2,437.50
B320	06/26/25	RKC	Confer with R. Klomparens re: expert report	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/26/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: R. Klomparens' expert report	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/26/25	RKC	Review and analyze revised report and report exhibits from K. McNally	1.50	\$1,462.50
B320	06/26/25	RKC	Review and revise R. Klomparens draft report	2.20	\$2,145.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/26/25	RKC	Review and revise P. Shields' expert report	0.80	\$780.00
B320	06/26/25	VT	Attend meeting with D. Claussen and K. Charles to discuss logistics for confirmation trial	0.50	\$225.00
B320	06/27/25	AMG	Proofread expert report of R. Rosen	10.30	\$7,364.50
B320	06/27/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.10	\$1,816.50
B320	06/27/25	AP	Draft memorandum re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	3.80	\$3,287.00
B320	06/27/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: expert report	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	06/27/25	BIW	Finalize supplemental document demand	0.30	\$348.00
B320	06/27/25	BTA	Review Mamoud v. Taylor (recent US Supreme Court decision on Free Exercise Clausen); internal discussion; review and edit revised brief	1.00	\$1,700.00
B320	06/27/25	CF	Conduct confirmation-related research and prepare memo re: same	4.80	\$3,168.00
B320	06/27/25	CG	Finalize McNally expert report	6.10	\$4,026.00
B320	06/27/25	CG	Confer with C. Restel re: privilege log and perform priest searches re: same	0.50	\$330.00
B320	06/27/25	CGS	Review supplemental production by Debtor	7.50	\$5,887.50
B320	06/27/25	CMR	Review and revise expert reports (4.8); Call with BRG Team re: expert report (.9); Analyze issues in preparation for Committee 30b6 deposition (.5); Analyze outstanding discovery issues (.7); Revise and send letter re: confidentiality designations re: depositions (1.0); Follow up with Debtor re: voting tabulation (.2)	8.10	\$9,112.50
B320	06/27/25	JAM	Revise, edit, and add citations to draft brief re: constitutional issue in confirmation briefing (5.4); emails with J. Albin and A. Patel re: draft and analyses (.4); emails with R. Rocco re: research (.2)	6.00	\$5,160.00
B320	06/27/25	JBJ	Edit draft expert report (3.0); legal research re: restricted assets (0.8); verify expert exhibits (5.1)	8.90	\$6,986.50
B320	06/27/25	JDP	Review and edit doc demand re: Father Brandon	0.30	\$411.00
B320	06/27/25	JDP	Review and edit expert reports	3.50	\$4,795.00
B320	06/27/25	JJP	Incorporate incoming production sets into the case database as requested by C. Restel (.6); transfer files to BRG as requested (.2); process new documents into the case database in preparation for production (.4); prepare and post production set (.5)	1.70	\$731.00
B320	06/27/25	LHS	Review deposition memos, 30b6 notice / responses and R&O responses to prepare for UCC 30b6 deposition (2.5); review document production (3.0); call re: same with R. Chahil and C. Restel (.4); exchange e-mails with S. Woodall and counsel (.3)	6.20	\$6,541.00
B320	06/27/25	MAK	Review and revise expert reports	2.10	\$2,383.50
B320	06/27/25	PJG	Draft plan confirmation objection	0.90	\$985.50
B320	06/27/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar and C. Restel re: preparation for Committee's 30(b)[6] deposition	0.30	\$292.50
B320	06/27/25	RKC	Confer with R. Klomparens re: expert report	0.30	\$292.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 69 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/27/25	RKC	Call with BRG re: expert report	0.80	\$780.00
B320	06/27/25	RKC	Attention to Norton Rose production (0.2); follow-up with Debtor's counsel re: production of Veracruz native files (0.2); compile and send L. Sklar materials for 30(b)[6] deposition preparation (0.4); confer with R. Rosen re: documents relied on for report (0.2); review and revise draft P. Shields report (1.2); confer with Lowenstein team re: same (0.2); review and revise draft R. Rosen report (2.3); review and revise K. McNally report and exhibits (2.6); review and revise R. Klomparens report and exhibit (.3); confer with Lowenstein team re: editing and QC of expert reports (0.5)	8.10	\$7,897.50
B320	06/28/25	AMG	Proofread expert report of R. Rosen (0.3); cite check report of K. McNally (6.0)	6.30	\$4,504.50
B320	06/28/25	BIW	Review and comment on expert reports	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	06/28/25	BTA	Review of draft brief and case law (hypothetical liquidation test)	0.80	\$1,360.00
B320	06/28/25	CF	Conduct confirmation-related research and prepare memo re: same	4.20	\$2,772.00
B320	06/28/25	CG	Confer with R. Chahil (.2); finalize McNally expert report and exhibits (5.7)	5.90	\$3,894.00
B320	06/28/25	CGS	Review production of documents related to claimants for expert evaluation and compose chart re: same	8.10	\$6,358.50
B320	06/28/25	CMR	Review expert reports (4.1); Call with BRG Team re: same (.7); Call with R. Klomparens and R. Chahil re: same (.6)	5.40	\$6,075.00
B320	06/28/25	JBJ	Legal research re: privilege	1.30	\$1,020.50
B320	06/28/25	JDP	Review Shields expert report to prepare for call (.4) and participate in call with BRG and LS teams re: Shields expert report (.8)	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	06/28/25	JDP	Review and comment on expert reports	4.80	\$6,576.00
B320	06/28/25	JJP	Process new documents into the case database (.6); prepare production sets as requested by R. Chahil (.5); export document sets requested by R. Chahil (.3)	1.40	\$602.00
B320	06/28/25	LHS	Revise Committee's response to Debtor's 30b6 notice and exchange correspondences with S. Woodall (1.0); coordinate binder for deposition prep, continue to review documents, and work on deposition memo (3.5)	4.50	\$4,747.50
B320	06/28/25	MAK	Review and revise expert reports	4.80	\$5,448.00
B320	06/28/25	MAK	Prepare witness preparation outline for committee corporate designee	1.70	\$1,929.50
B320	06/28/25	MRB	Draft letter challenging privilege log	2.80	\$2,422.00
B320	06/28/25	RKC	Meeting with BRG re: P. Shields report	0.80	\$780.00
B320	06/28/25	RKC	Revise expert reports and exhibits to expert reports (6.3); e-mail with K. McNally re: draft report and exhibits (0.5); e-mail with BRG re: draft P. Shields report (0.6)	7.40	\$7,215.00
B320	06/28/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: expert reports	0.30	\$292.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/29/25	AMG	Cite check and proof expert report of P. Shields (9.5); cite check expert report of K. McNally (0.3)	9.80	\$7,007.00
B320	06/29/25	AS	Provide assistance to R. Chahil re: prepare index from requested files folder for review	0.40	\$146.00
B320	06/29/25	BIW	Review and comment on expert reports	3.20	\$3,712.00
B320	06/29/25	BIW	Review and comment on expert reports	0.70	\$812.00
B320	06/29/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: expert report	0.30	\$348.00
B320	06/29/25	BTA	Review of draft section of brief on (hypothetical liquidation test) (.6); review of the Third Amended Disclosure Statement (1.4)	2.00	\$3,400.00
B320	06/29/25	CF	Confer with K. Moynihan re: plan confirmation research	0.20	\$132.00
B320	06/29/25	CF	Conduct confirmation-related research and prepare memo re: same	7.90	\$5,214.00
B320	06/29/25	CG	Finalize Klomparens expert report and perform research re: same	4.60	\$3,036.00
B320	06/29/25	CGS	Revise and edit chart re: Debtor's produced documents regarding abuse claimants	3.30	\$2,590.50
B320	06/29/25	CMR	Review and revise expert reports	2.00	\$2,250.00
B320	06/29/25	JBJ	Edit draft expert report (2.1); verify expert exhibits (1.2)	3.30	\$2,590.50
B320	06/29/25	JJP	Review and respond to email correspondence re: directory indices for R. Chahil (.1); provide assistance to the case team re: chronology review (.1); process new documents into the case database as requested by K. Charles (.5)	0.70	\$301.00
B320	06/29/25	KEM	Review research re: confirmation objection issues	0.40	\$422.00
B320	06/29/25	LHS	Document review and work on deposition memo	3.00	\$3,165.00
B320	06/29/25	MAK	Review and revise expert reports	3.30	\$3,745.50
B320	06/29/25	MAK	Continue preparing witness preparation outline for committee corporate designee	2.80	\$3,178.00
B320	06/29/25	MRB	Draft letter challenging privilege log	3.80	\$3,287.00
B320	06/29/25	RKC	Review and revise expert reports and exhibits to reports (10.8); confer with K. McNally re: report and exhibits (0.5); confer with R. Rosen re: edits to report (0.3); email with BRG re: P. Shields report (0.5); e-mail with R. Klomparens re: report (0.5)	12.60	\$12,285.00
B320	06/30/25	AMG	Revise, proof, and prepare for submission expert report of P. Shields	7.00	\$5,005.00
B320	06/30/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	3.00	\$2,595.00
B320	06/30/25	AP	Draft memorandum re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.50	\$2,162.50
B320	06/30/25	BIW	Review and comment on revised expert reports	0.70	\$812.00
B320	06/30/25	BIW	Confer with M. Lee re: timing of expert report submissions	0.20	\$232.00
B320	06/30/25	BIW	Revise Settlement Term Sheet	0.60	\$696.00
B320	06/30/25	BIW	Review and comment on Stout Real Estate and BRG expert reports	1.70	\$1,972.00
B320	06/30/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: expert report	0.30	\$348.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 71 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	06/30/25	BIW	Review and comment on expert reports	1.60	\$1,856.00
B320	06/30/25	BTA	Conference with P. Gross to review arguments for brief in opposition to the Reorganization Plan	1.50	\$2,550.00
B320	06/30/25	BTA	Continued review of Debtor's Third Amended disclosure statement; e-mail to A. Patel re: memo on Canon Law research	0.50	\$850.00
B320	06/30/25	BTA	Further dissection of Third Amended Disclosure statement, and research Supreme Court First Amendment cases	0.70	\$1,190.00
B320	06/30/25	CG	Finalize Klomparens expert report	0.60	\$396.00
B320	06/30/25	CMR	Review and revise expert reports	2.40	\$2,700.00
B320	06/30/25	JAM	Emails with Z. Michaud re: research for confirmation brief argument (.2); update draft with additional research (.2); emails with B. Weisenberg, B. Albin, and P. Gross re: confirmation brief (.2); emails with A. Patel and B. Albin re: constitutional issue in confirmation briefing (.3)	0.90	\$774.00
B320	06/30/25	JBJ	Edit draft expert report (4.0); verify expert exhibits (1.0); prepare expert exhibits for filing (0.4)	5.40	\$4,239.00
B320	06/30/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft expert reports	4.50	\$6,165.00
B320	06/30/25	JJP	Process new documents into the case database (.3); prepare and delivery production sets as requested (.6)	0.90	\$387.00
B320	06/30/25	KEM	Correspondence with B. Weisenberg and P. Gross reconfirmation objection (.1); review and analysis of confirmation objection with P. Gross (.4); revise confirmation objection (1.3)	1.80	\$1,899.00
B320	06/30/25	KFC	Assist with preparation of expert reports and exhibits	3.60	\$1,440.00
B320	06/30/25	LHS	Revise amended response to 30b6 notice	0.10	\$105.50
B320	06/30/25	LHS	Work on preparing deposition memo, deposition outline and binder	6.00	\$6,330.00
B320	06/30/25	MAK	Review and revise expert reports	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	06/30/25	MAK	Inter-office call re: BRG expert report	0.40	\$454.00
B320	06/30/25	MAK	Review and analyze privilege log and analysis on deficiencies	1.90	\$2,156.50
B320	06/30/25	MRB	Draft letter challenging privilege log	2.00	\$1,730.00
B320	06/30/25	PJG	Draft plan confirmation objection brief	4.30	\$4,708.50
B320	06/30/25	PJG	Confer and correspond with K. Moynihan re: Plan confirmation objection brief	0.40	\$438.00
B320	06/30/25	PJG	Call with B. Albin re: Committee's plan confirmation objection and constitutional issues re: same	1.50	\$1,642.50
B320	06/30/25	RKC	Revise expert reports and exhibits (9.4); multiple conferences with BRG re: draft expert report and exhibits (1.2)	10.60	\$10,335.00
B320	06/30/25	ZM	Search for citation to quote in a Congressional Records hearing from 1978 per J. Minicozzi	0.50	\$210.00
B320	07/01/25	AMG	Revise, proof, and prepare expert report of P. Shields for submission	11.80	\$8,437.00
B320	07/01/25	AP	Attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.60	\$519.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/01/25	AP	Revise memorandum re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.20	\$1,038.00
B320	07/01/25	BIW	Review and comment on revised expert reports (1.6); calls on same (.6)	2.20	\$2,552.00
B320	07/01/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: expert report	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/01/25	BIW	Review Stout Claims Valuation Report	0.70	\$812.00
B320	07/01/25	BIW	Review final comments to P. Shields Expert Report	0.70	\$812.00
B320	07/01/25	ВТА	Review of A. Patel's memo and attached case law on intersection of Canon Law and Bankruptcy Law and the nature of parishes as juridical entities under Canon Law (.4); telephone conference with A. Patel (.6); review of Third Amended Disclosure Statement (.4); revise and edit portion of omnibus brief on hypothetical liquidation test (1.1)	2.50	\$4,250.00
B320	07/01/25	CG	Review and analyze document production in connection with privilege log and unknown priests	0.80	\$528.00
B320	07/01/25	CG	Review and analyze priest privilege log re: confirmation preparation	1.80	\$1,188.00
B320	07/01/25	CG	Finalize McNally expert report	1.20	\$792.00
B320	07/01/25	CMR	Review and revise Expert Reports	2.00	\$2,250.00
B320	07/01/25	JAM	Emails with J. Albin and A. Patel re: confirmation brief analysis	0.20	\$172.00
B320	07/01/25	JBJ	Edit draft expert report (1.3); verify expert exhibits (3.0); prepare expert exhibits for filing (0.4)	4.70	\$3,689.50
B320	07/01/25	JDP	Review and revise expert reports	2.50	\$3,425.00
B320	07/01/25	JJP	Export documents and transfer same to BRG (.5); process new documents in preparation for production (.4); prepare revised production set and post same for distribution (.5)	1.40	\$602.00
B320	07/01/25	KEM	Draft confirmation objection	0.40	\$422.00
B320	07/01/25	KFC	Assist with finalizing and serving expert reports	4.20	\$1,680.00
B320	07/01/25	LHS	Deposition prep call with S. Woodall and M. Kaplan (1.1); further review of produced documents and e-mail S. Woodall (.5)	1.60	\$1,688.00
B320	07/01/25	LHS	Work on deposition outline	0.60	\$633.00
B320	07/01/25	MAK	Finalize expert reports	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	07/01/25	MAK	Prepare for committee corporate designee deposition (2.8); meeting with S. Woodall re: the same (1.1)	3.90	\$4,426.50
B320	07/01/25	MRB	Draft letter challenging privilege log	0.20	\$173.00
B320	07/01/25	PJG	Draft plan confirmation objection	1.10	\$1,204.50
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Serve four expert reports, and document production on all authorized counsel of record	0.50	\$487.50
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Revise P. Shields draft report	6.50	\$6,337.50
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Draft and revise expert report and document production cover letter	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Revise and finalize K. McNally expert report and exhibits	0.80	\$780.00
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Revise and finalize R. Klomparens expert report	0.50	\$487.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Calls with BRG re: draft expert report	1.40	\$1,365.00
B320	07/02/25	BIW	Review Debtor's expert reports	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	07/02/25	BIW	Review Debtor's expert reports	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	07/02/25	BTA	Review and edit brief point on Hypothetical Liquidation Test	2.30	\$3,910.00
B320	07/02/25	CG	Confer with M. Kaplan re: privilege log	0.10	\$66.00
B320	07/02/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (1.4); review expert reports (0.5); draft deposition outlines (0.5); legal research re: discovery (2.8)	5.20	\$4,082.00
B320	07/02/25	JDP	Review and analyze draft insurance assignment proposal and develop response (.4); call with T. Burns re: same (.3)	0.70	\$959.00
B320	07/02/25	JDP	Review and analyze debtor expert reports	2.70	\$3,699.00
B320	07/02/25	JDP	Develop strategy for confirmation hearing	1.60	\$2,192.00
B320	07/02/25	KEM	Draft confirmation objection	0.20	\$211.00
B320	07/02/25	KFC	Assist with collection of documents in preparation 30b6 deposition	4.00	\$1,600.00
B320	07/02/25	LHS	Exchange correspondence with R. Chahil re: expert reports	0.30	\$316.50
B320	07/02/25	LHS	Document review for 30b6 deposition preparation and prepare prep binders (1.5); work on outline to prepare for 30b6 deposition (2.0)	3.50	\$3,692.50
B320	07/02/25	MAK	Begin review and analysis of Debtor's expert reports (3.6); confer with R. Chahil re: same (.2); confer with C. Gauvin re: privilege log (.1)	3.90	\$4,426.50
B320	07/02/25	MAK	Prepare for committee corporate designee deposition	0.90	\$1,021.50
B320	07/02/25	MAK	Conference call with K. McNally re: rebuttal report	0.40	\$454.00
B320	07/02/25	MRB	Edit letter challenging privilege log (1.0); prepare expert deposition outlines (0.5)	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	07/02/25	RKC	Review and analyze D. Martin expert report	0.80	\$780.00
B320	07/02/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar re: preparation for Committee's 30(b)[6] deposition	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/02/25	RKC	Meeting with K. McNally re: rebuttal expert report	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/02/25	RKC	E-mail with experts re: RCBO's expert reports and potential rebuttal (0.8); confer with J. Jameson re: review of Veracruz natives (0.2); strategize re: expert depositions (0.7) confer with Lowenstein team re: preparation for expert depositions (0.5)	2.20	\$2,145.00
B320	07/02/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan re: expert reports	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/03/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.00	\$865.00
B320	07/03/25	AP	Attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.90	\$778.50
B320	07/03/25	AP	Review expert's report to draft motion in limine	0.50	\$432.50
B320	07/03/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Plan confirmation issues	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/03/25	BTA	Review of report of Dr. Kurt Martens on canon law	0.40	\$680.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 74 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/03/25	BTA	Zoom conference with J. Minicozzi and A. Patel to talk about opposition brief to Reorganization Plan and legal argument (.9); telephone conference with P. Gross to discuss confirmation brief issues (.5)	1.40	\$2,380.00
B320	07/03/25	CGS	Review Debtor's supplemental production of loan documents and compose summary re: same	5.10	\$4,003.50
B320	07/03/25	CMR	Analyze Debtor's Expert Reports (1.0); Confer re: potential rebuttal reports (.2)	1.20	\$1,350.00
B320	07/03/25	DC	Preliminary discussions with courthouse staff and Oakland Marriott guest services re: confirmation hearing logistics	0.60	\$240.00
B320	07/03/25	JAM	Research re: constitutional arguments in confirmation briefing (4.7); prepare for (.7) and attend (.9) conference with B. Albin and A. Patel re: constitutional arguments in confirmation briefing; emails with B. Albin and A. Patel re: research (.6); emails with R. Chahil re: research (.2)	7.10	\$6,106.00
B320	07/03/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (0.5); legal research re: discovery (0.5)	1.00	\$785.00
B320	07/03/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: rebuttal report	0.60	\$822.00
B320	07/03/25	JDP	Review debtor expert reports and develop strategy for response	2.60	\$3,562.00
B320	07/03/25	JJP	Incorporate new documents into the case database	0.70	\$301.00
B320	07/03/25	LHS	Coordinate binders and materials for deposition preparation sessions (1.0); edit and e-mail local counsel re: Amended R&Os to 30b6 Notice (.3); review COS re: same (.1); work on mock deposition outline (4.5)	5.90	\$6,224.50
B320	07/03/25	MAK	Prepare for committee corporate designee deposition	1.40	\$1,589.00
B320	07/03/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of debtor's expert reports (4.2); telephone call with BRG re: the same (.6)	4.80	\$5,448.00
B320	07/03/25	PJG	Calls and emails with B. Albin re: Diocese briefing and legal arguments re: first amendment/establishment clause and related issues	0.50	\$547.50
B320	07/03/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan re: expert report strategy	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/03/25	RKC	E-mail with BRG re: C. Moore report (0.2); e-mail Foley re: documents relied on by C. Moore (0.2); confer with Stout real estate team re: rebuttal report (0.4); attend to RCC supplemental production (0.3); confer with B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: K. Martens report (0.3); plan and prepare for rebuttal reports (0.3); confer with G. Albert re: amended responses and objections to 30(b)[6] notice (0.3)	2.00	\$1,950.00
B320	07/03/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein team re: K. Martens expert report	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/03/25	RKC	Review C. Moore report in preparation for meeting with BRG	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/03/25	RKC	Confer with BRG team re: P. Shields rebuttal report	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/04/25	BTA	Draft portion of brief on First Amendment/hypothetical liquidation test	4.50	\$7,650.00
B320	07/04/25	CMR	Review Debtor's Expert Reports	3.00	\$3,375.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/04/25	KEM	Draft confirmation objection	3.10	\$3,270.50
B320	07/05/25	BTA	Continue drafting of First Amendment/hypothetical liquidation piece of brief	2.50	\$4,250.00
B320	07/05/25	JBJ	Review (0.2) and respond (0.1) to internal correspondence re: produced documents	0.30	\$235.50
B320	07/05/25	LHS	Revise deposition outline	0.50	\$527.50
B320	07/05/25	RKC	Confer with BRG team re: expert reports	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/06/25	BTA	Complete first draft of First Amendment/hypothetical liquidation test part of brief	4.90	\$8,330.00
B320	07/06/25	MAK	Prepare for committee corporate designee deposition	1.90	\$2,156.50
B320	07/06/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of Debtor's expert reports	3.80	\$4,313.00
B320	07/06/25	RKC	Confer with J. Haselberger re: Martens report (0.2); confer with C. Stewart re: review of RCC's supplemental production (0.2); review CV and testimony list for expert K. Martens (0.2)	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/06/25	RKC	Review and analyze J. Satter expert report (1.2); review and analyze A. Zimmerman expert report (0.7)	1.90	\$1,852.50
B320	07/07/25	AP	Draft brief objecting to confirmation	4.50	\$3,892.50
B320	07/07/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.20	\$1,903.00
B320	07/07/25	BIW	Review and revise Plan Confirmation objection	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	07/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Plan structure issues	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	07/07/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns and J. Bair re: analysis of Plan confirmation hearing	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/07/25	BTA	Final read and revisions of brief section (1.0); review emails from team re: brief and respond (.8); review of CV of K. Martens (.2)	2.00	\$3,400.00
B320	07/07/25	CMR	Analyze outstanding issues re: fact discovery (.8); Analyze Debtor's Expert Reports (3.1); Multiple calls re: same (.7); Call with M. Kaplan and R. Chahil re: expert reports (.8)	5.40	\$6,075.00
B320	07/07/25	JAM	Emails with B. Weisenberg, B. Albin, A. Patel, M. Kaplan, and P. Gross re: confirmation briefing draft	0.70	\$602.00
B320	07/07/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (0.5); draft comparison chart re: same (4.7); draft deposition outlines (0.5)	5.70	\$4,474.50
B320	07/07/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: insurance assignment	1.00	\$1,370.00
B320	07/07/25	JJP	Prepare list of privileged document clawbacks	0.60	\$258.00
B320	07/07/25	KEM	Correspondence with B. Weisenberg, P. Gross, and B. Albin re: confirmation brief	0.20	\$211.00
B320	07/07/25	LHS	Prepare for deposition, including additional revision of deposition outline and creation of new binders for preparation meetings (3.5); exchange multiple e-mails with vendors and internal team re: same (.5)	4.00	\$4,220.00
B320	07/07/25	LHS	Review and analyze expert report, including supporting documents relied upon as part of report (2.5); review and conduct additional background research on expert, and prepare expert deposition outline (1.9)	4.40	\$4,642.00
B320	07/07/25	MAK	Telephone call with Stout (RE) re: expert rebuttal	0.40	\$454.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 76 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/07/25	MAK	Begin preparing issue outlines for depositions of debtor's experts	4.70	\$5,334.50
B320	07/07/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel	0.60	\$519.00
B320	07/07/25	PJG	Draft confirmation objection	1.30	\$1,423.50
B320	07/07/25	PJG	Confer and correspond with B. Weisenberg, M. Kaplan, K. Moynihan, and B. Albin re: plan confirmation objection status, timing and projected outline of pages and discussion re: page limits	0.40	\$438.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Prepare for expert depositions (1.10); analyze RCBO expert report deficiencies (0.5); e-mail Foley re: same (0.3); draft e-mail to Foley re: abuse documents (0.3); review motion to compel (0.2); confer with Stout abuse claims team re: rebuttal report (0.4); e-mail Foley re: expert deposition schedule (0.2)	3.00	\$2,925.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Confer with Stout real estate team re: analysis of Hilco expert reports	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Confer with J. Jameson re: Hilco expert depositions	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Call with BRG and Stout real estate teams re: analysis of RCBO's expert reports	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Review and analyze K. Martens expert report	0.70	\$682.50
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Assist with preparation for 30(b)(6) deposition	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Develop expert deposition strategy	0.80	\$780.00
B320	07/08/25	AP	Attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	07/08/25	AP	Draft brief objecting to confirmation	2.00	\$1,730.00
B320	07/08/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.00	\$865.00
B320	07/08/25	BTA	Meeting with J. Minicozzi and A. Patel to discuss brief in opposition to confirmation of the Reorganization Plan and other issues concerning the non-application of canon law to a bankruptcy proceeding	1.50	\$2,550.00
B320	07/08/25	BTA	Review of cite checked brief with additions; make further edits; review Articles of Incorporation of RCBO, and bylaws of the Presbyteral Council; and Bond Obligated Group; review of additional case law	2.20	\$3,740.00
B320	07/08/25	CF	Review produced bylaws and articles of incorporation and email communications re: same	1.30	\$858.00
B320	07/08/25	CMR	Analyze expert reports in preparation for depositions (1.5); Analyze Debtor confidentiality designations and review and revise letter re: same (2.0); Analyze outstanding fact issues (.3); Follow up with Debtor re: Voting Tabulation issues (.1)	3.90	\$4,387.50
B320	07/08/25	JAM	Edit confirmation brief draft (5.0); prepare for (.4) and attend (1.5) meeting with B. Albin and A. Patel re: confirmation brief draft; emails with B. Albin, A. Patel, B. Weisenberg, and C. Frankel re: confirmation brief draft (1.0); research information re: expert and draft email to R. Chahil, B. Albin, and A. Patel re: results (.9)	8.80	\$7,568.00
B320	07/08/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (0.4); draft comparison chart ressame (1.0)	1.40	\$1,099.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/08/25	LHS	Assist with deposition preparation (4); update outline (.5)	4.50	\$4,747.50
B320	07/08/25	MAK	Telephone call with canon law rebuttal expert	0.30	\$340.50
B320	07/08/25	MAK	Prepare for meeting with S. Woodall (2.2); meet with S. Woodall re: deposition preparation (4.2)	6.40	\$7,264.00
B320	07/08/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel	1.10	\$951.50
B320	07/08/25	PJG	Additional research re: best interests test (1.3); draft plan confirmation objection (1.9)	3.20	\$3,504.00
B320	07/08/25	RKC	Call with J. Haselberger re: K. Martens report	0.50	\$487.50
B320	07/08/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: expert depositions	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/08/25	RKC	Prepare for expert depositions	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/08/25	RR	Meet with J. Minicozzi re: follow up research for confirmation brief	0.40	\$190.00
B320	07/08/25	ZM	Search for background information on expert witness Adam Zimmerman	1.50	\$630.00
B320	07/09/25	AMG	Email with P. Shields re: expert report	0.10	\$71.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Research case law to support discovery motion practice	0.50	\$432.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin, M. Kaplan, C. Restel, and M. Berliner re: discovery motion practice	0.50	\$432.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Draft brief objecting to confirmation	0.70	\$605.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Research case law to support expert discovery motion practice	3.50	\$3,027.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Prepare for and attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.00	\$865.00
B320	07/09/25	AP	Draft brief for expert discovery motion practice	2.30	\$1,989.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.50	\$432.50
B320	07/09/25	BIW	Begin drafting Motion to Compel Document Production	1.80	\$2,088.00
B320	07/09/25	BIW	Review and revise Plan confirmation objection inserts	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	07/09/25	BTA	Review and revise confirmation brief re: Religious Freedom Restoration Act and cases	1.70	\$2,890.00
B320	07/09/25	BTA	Review of A. Patel's memo on relevance of canon law in bankruptcy proceeding and review of the Spokane and Portland bankruptcy matters	1.00	\$1,700.00
B320	07/09/25	BTA	Conference with A. Patel discussing K. Marten's Report on Canon Law and Reviewing RCBO's Articles of Incorporation and the bylaws of the Presbyteral Council and articles of incorporation of the Roman Catholic Welfare Corporation and Roman Catholic Cemetery Corp.	0.90	\$1,530.00
B320	07/09/25	BTA	Zoom meeting with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, M. Berliner, and A. Patel re: motion to compel	0.50	\$850.00
B320	07/09/25	CG	Perform and analyze research re: Canon lawyers	0.60	\$396.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/09/25	CMR	Revise and send letter to Debtor re: Challenge to Confidentiality Designations (.2); Analyze expert reports in preparation for depositions (8.5); Analyze outstanding fact discovery issues (.8)	9.50	\$10,687.50
B320	07/09/25	СТН	Research and obtain sources cited in expert report of Kurt Martens	1.00	\$410.00
B320	07/09/25	DC	Coordinate with Oakland Marriott re: contracts for guest rooms and war room for confirmation hearing	0.70	\$280.00
B320	07/09/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (0.5); draft comparison chart re: same (0.9); draft expert deposition outline (0.5)	1.90	\$1,491.50
B320	07/09/25	KEM	Draft confirmation objection	6.70	\$7,068.50
B320	07/09/25	LHS	Assist with deposition preparation (3.0); exchange emails with S. Woodall re: same (.2)	3.20	\$3,376.00
B320	07/09/25	MAK	Meet with S. Woodall re: deposition preparation (3.2); confer with litigation team re: motion to compel (.5)	3.70	\$4,199.50
B320	07/09/25	MRB	Meet with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, B. Albin, A. Patel re: motion to compel (0.5); draft motion to compel non-privileged documents (3.2)	3.70	\$3,200.50
B320	07/09/25	PJG	Draft confirmation objection (1.6); confer and correspond re: same with K. Moynihan (.2)	1.80	\$1,971.00
B320	07/09/25	RKC	Review analysis of two sets of Hilco valuations and R. Rosen valuations	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/09/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: documents relied on by C. Moore (0.3); review and revise analysis re: same (0.5); confer with Foley and Lowenstein teams re: expert deposition scheduling (0.5); confer with Stout re: K. McNally rebuttal report (0.3); confer with Foley re: supplemental expert materials (0.2); review and analyze list of J. Satter prior retentions (0.2); draft e-mail to counsel for Adventus re: missing documents (0.2); prepare for expert depositions (0.3)	2.50	\$2,437.50
B320	07/09/25	RR	Research and analyze case law to cross check section of confirmation brief; circulate research internally for review	3.10	\$1,472.50
B320	07/09/25	ZM	Search for references cited in Dr. Kurt Martens' expert report	0.20	\$84.00
B320	07/10/25	AP	Draft brief in support of motion in limine concerning confirmation hearing	2.00	\$1,730.00
B320	07/10/25	AP	Research case law to support expert discovery motion practice	3.90	\$3,373.50
B320	07/10/25	AP	Revise brief objecting to confirmation	0.40	\$346.00
B320	07/10/25	BIW	Review and revise portions of Plan Confirmation Objection	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	07/10/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: devise Plan confirmation objection strategy (2 @.4 each)	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/10/25	BTA	Further review and edits to First Amendment portion of confirmation brief	2.70	\$4,590.00
B320	07/10/25	CG	Perform and analyze research re: whether privilege extends to Canon lawyers	2.10	\$1,386.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/10/25	CGS	Edits and revise charts re: Debtor supplemental production	2.10	\$1,648.50
B320	07/10/25	CMR	Prepare for depositions of Debtor expert witnesses (4.8); Analyze issues re: supplemental and rebuttal expert reports (.7); Call with BRG Team re: same (.6)	6.10	\$6,862.50
B320	07/10/25	CTH	Research expert witness John Satter	2.40	\$984.00
B320	07/10/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (1.6); draft expert deposition outlines (1.7)	3.30	\$2,590.50
B320	07/10/25	JDP	Call with M. Kaplan re: strategy for confirmation hearing	0.20	\$274.00
B320	07/10/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: confirmation strategy	0.30	\$411.00
B320	07/10/25	JJP	Prepare documents for production	0.40	\$172.00
B320	07/10/25	KEM	Review and edit confirmation objection	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	07/10/25	LHS	Call with R. Chahil re: expert deposition outline (.5); review additional comments re: expert report (.2)	0.70	\$738.50
B320	07/10/25	LHS	Virtually attend S. Woodall deposition	2.50	\$2,637.50
B320	07/10/25	MAK	Meet with S. Woodall re: deposition preparation (1.5); deposition of S. Woodall (2.8)	4.30	\$4,880.50
B320	07/10/25	MAK	Review draft expert rebuttal reports	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	07/10/25	MAK	Review and analyze brief section on application of First Amendment (1.2); confer with B. Weisenberg and J. Prol re: same (.4)	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	07/10/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents	4.00	\$3,460.00
B320	07/10/25	PJG	Review and edit plan confirmation objection	0.90	\$985.50
B320	07/10/25	PJG	Review revised draft plan confirmation objection sections from K. Moynihan	0.80	\$876.00
B320	07/10/25	PJG	Revise plan confirmation objection (1.9) and emails resame to K. Moynihan, J. Albin (.4)	2.30	\$2,518.50
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar re: preparation for D. Martins deposition	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: expert report	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Prepare for expert depositions (0.6); confer with M. Kaplan re: UCC 30(b)[6] deposition (0.4); confer with C. Restel re: expert depositions (0.4)	1.40	\$1,365.00
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Prepare and serve supplemental document production	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Review supplemental P. Shields expert report	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/10/25	RR	Research and analyze case law to cross check section of confirmation brief; circulate research internally for review	1.30	\$617.50
B320	07/10/25	ZM	Search for attorney licensing credentials in California for names appearing in privilege log	2.00	\$840.00
B320	07/11/25	AP	Draft brief in support of motion in limine concerning confirmation hearing	4.00	\$3,460.00
B320	07/11/25	AP	Research case law to support expert discovery motion practice	2.50	\$2,162.50
B320	07/11/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	1.20	\$1,392.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/11/25	BIW	Review and revise portions of Plan Confirmation Objection	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	07/11/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: Plan confirmation objection strategy	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/11/25	BTA	Review and make edits to brief in opposition to Reorganization Plan	1.10	\$1,870.00
B320	07/11/25	CMR	Revise Deposition Notice re: Claims Agent (.4); Review and revise Supplemental Expert Reports (2.5); Prepare for deposition of Debtor's experts (1.6); Review and revise Motion to Compel (2.5)	7.00	\$7,875.00
B320	07/11/25	СТН	Research and obtain sources cited in expert report of Kurt Martens	0.50	\$205.00
B320	07/11/25	JAM	Review and edit motion to compel brief	2.10	\$1,806.00
B320	07/11/25	JBJ	Review expert report (1.4); draft expert deposition outline (1.4)	2.80	\$2,198.00
B320	07/11/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: settlement	0.20	\$274.00
B320	07/11/25	JDP	E-mails to/from A. Uetz re: settlement	0.30	\$411.00
B320	07/11/25	JDP	Analyze vote tally on Plan	0.30	\$411.00
B320	07/11/25	JDP	Review and comment on reply expert reports	2.20	\$3,014.00
B320	07/11/25	KEM	Research re: confirmation objection (2.5); revise confirmation objection (.8)	3.30	\$3,481.50
B320	07/11/25	MAK	Review and revise motion to compel re: production of privileged documents	0.80	\$908.00
B320	07/11/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents (5.0); analyze privilege log to prepare chart of missing information for same (1.2)	6.20	\$5,363.00
B320	07/11/25	PJG	Review revised confirmation objection brief re: unfair discrimination (.4); additional research re: same (.7); draft follow up email and questions re: unfair discrimination to K. Moynihan (.5)	1.60	\$1,752.00
B320	07/11/25	PJG	Review and edit first amendment piece of confirmation objection	0.60	\$657.00
B320	07/11/25	PJG	Review further revised plan objection draft from K. Moynihan and draft follow up email and additional questions and comments re: same to K. Moynihan	0.50	\$547.50
B320	07/11/25	PJG	Draft further edits and revisions to Plan confirmation objection	0.40	\$438.00
B320	07/11/25	RKC	Review e-mail from Norton Rose re: documents missing from production	0.10	\$97.50
B320	07/11/25	RKC	Confer with P. Shields re: supplemental expert report	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/11/25	ZM	Research re: whether individuals listed in privilege log are attorneys licensed to practice in the state of California or any other states	1.50	\$630.00
B320	07/12/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	2.30	\$2,668.00
B320	07/12/25	BIW	Review and revise Plan Confirmation Objection	0.70	\$812.00
B320	07/12/25	BTA	Review and edit brief objecting to confirmation of the Reorganization Plan	2.30	\$3,910.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 81 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/12/25	CMR	Prepare for depositions of Debtor's experts (.8); Confer re: rebuttal reports (.2)	1.00	\$1,125.00
B320	07/12/25	JAR	Research re: objection to plan confirmation	1.70	\$1,122.00
B320	07/12/25	KEM	Review emails from B. Albin and P. Gross reconfirmation objection	0.10	\$105.50
B320	07/12/25	MAK	Review and revise K. Marten deposition outline	1.10	\$1,248.50
B320	07/13/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	07/13/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	07/13/25	BTA	Review and edit brief opposing Reorganization Plan	0.60	\$1,020.00
B320	07/13/25	CMR	Review and revise expert reports	2.10	\$2,362.50
B320	07/13/25	JAR	Research re: objection to confirmation of plan	3.50	\$2,310.00
B320	07/13/25	MAK	Review and edit motion to compel production of non- privileged documents (.7); prepare expert deposition preparation outlines and mock exams (4.2)	4.90	\$5,561.50
B320	07/13/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents	3.10	\$2,681.50
B320	07/13/25	PJG	Research re: good faith plan confirmation standard	0.10	\$109.50
B320	07/14/25	AP	Revise brief in support of motion in limine	0.50	\$432.50
B320	07/14/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/14/25	BIW	Review draft P. Shields Rebuttal Report	0.70	\$812.00
B320	07/14/25	BTA	Discuss with P. Gross issues raised in brief in opposition to confirmation of the Plan	0.70	\$1,190.00
B320	07/14/25	BTA	Review of draft of brief in support of motion in limine of canon law expert	0.20	\$340.00
B320	07/14/25	CMR	Analyze issues in preparation for deposition of Debtor's experts (1.3); Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (1.9); Call with Stout team re: same (.5); Prepare for expert depositions (1.4); Analyze outstanding issues re: fact discovery (.2)	5.30	\$5,962.50
B320	07/14/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Motions in Limine	1.00	\$1,125.00
B320	07/14/25	JAM	Review and edit motion in limine brief re: expert (2.1); emails with A. Patel and B. Albin re: brief (.3)	2.40	\$2,064.00
B320	07/14/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (1.5); draft expert deposition outlines (2.0)	3.50	\$2,747.50
B320	07/14/25	KEM	Revise confirmation objection	0.50	\$527.50
B320	07/14/25	LHS	Work on expert deposition outline and review draft rebuttal report	2.10	\$2,215.50
B320	07/14/25	MAK	Conference call with K. McNally and team re: supplemental expert report	0.50	\$567.50
B320	07/14/25	MAK	Review and revise motion to compel re: purportedly privileged documents	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	07/14/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents	4.10	\$3,546.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 82 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/14/25	PJG	Review revisions to draft plan confirmation objection from K. Moynihan (.2); draft additional edits and comments to draft objection and (.2) and follow up email to K. Moynihan re: same (.1)	0.50	\$547.50
B320	07/14/25	PJG	Call with J. Albin re: plan confirmation objection and questions re: certain issues/arguments raised in draft objection brief	0.70	\$766.50
B320	07/14/25	RKC	Review and analyze K. McNally draft rebuttal report	0.70	\$682.50
B320	07/14/25	RKC	Confer with expert K. McNally re: draft rebuttal report	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/14/25	RKC	Confer with Debtor's counsel re: expert deadlines (0.2); confer with Lowenstein team re: same (0.2); confer with experts re: same (0.3); review supplemental exhibits to supplemental report from expert P. Shields (0.2)	0.90	\$877.50
B320	07/15/25	BIW	Finalize Motion to Compel the Production of Documents and revise Motion to Seal, declaration in support and proposed order granting same	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	07/15/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol re: Debtor's request to adjourn Plan confirmation	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/15/25	BIW	Review revised Rebuttal Reports	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/15/25	BTA	Revise brief in opposition to the Reorganization Plan	1.40	\$2,380.00
B320	07/15/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation (1.3); Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (1.7); Call with BRG Team re: same (.6)	3.60	\$4,050.00
B320	07/15/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (0.5); draft comparison chart re: same (1.5); draft deposition outlines (0.5); draft motion in limine (1.6)	4.10	\$3,218.50
B320	07/15/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: Debtor request to adjourn confirmation hearing; develop position; confer with B. Weisenberg re: same	0.60	\$822.00
B320	07/15/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: Debtor's request to adjourn Plan confirmation	0.40	\$548.00
B320	07/15/25	LHS	Work on expert deposition outline	2.70	\$2,848.50
B320	07/15/25	MAK	Telephone call with BRG re: expert report	0.50	\$567.50
B320	07/15/25	MAK	Prepare for deposition of C. Moore	2.90	\$3,291.50
B320	07/15/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel non-privileged documents (3.2); review and analyze privilege log to prepare same (2.0)	5.20	\$4,498.00
B320	07/15/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar re D. Martin deposition outline	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/15/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan re: case strategy and next steps	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/15/25	RKC	Review and analyze revised draft report from P. Shields	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/15/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: P. Shields expert report	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/15/25	ZM	Search bar associations and Westlaw professional licensing for persons identified in privilege log	0.60	\$252.00
B320	07/16/25	BTA	Revise brief in opposition to the Confirmation Plan	1.40	\$2,380.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/16/25	CMR	Confer re: scheduling expert depositions (.2); Prepare for Expert Depositions (2.2); Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (.8); Call with BRG Team re: same (.7); Analyze legal issues re: confirmation (.7); Review Debtor's Motion to adjourn confirmation hearing (.2); Analyze issues and prepare for hearing re: same (.5); Review and revise Motion re: Privilege Log (1.3)	6.60	\$7,425.00
B320	07/16/25	JBJ	Draft motion in limine	3.30	\$2,590.50
B320	07/16/25	LHS	Work on expert deposition outline	3.50	\$3,692.50
B320	07/16/25	MAK	Telephone call with BRG re: expert report	0.50	\$567.50
B320	07/16/25	MAK	Prepare for deposition of C. Moore	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	07/16/25	MAK	Prepare outlines for expert witness deposition preparation meetings	1.20	\$1,362.00
B320	07/16/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents (7.0); draft outline for C. Moore expert deposition (0.9)	7.90	\$6,833.50
B320	07/16/25	RKC	Draft proposed expert deposition schedule (0.7); confer with Debtor re: same (0.2); confer with R. Klomparens re: deposition (0.2); confer with Stout re: R. Rosen supplemental report (0.2); review Debtor's e-mail re: K. Martens materials (0.2); confer with C. Restel re: P. Shields report (0.4)	1.90	\$1,852.50
B320	07/16/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: P. Shields report	0.70	\$682.50
B320	07/16/25	RKC	Review C. Moore report re: real property liquidation	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/17/25	BIW	Continue to develop plan confirmation trial strategy	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/17/25	BIW	Review email from M. Lee re: response to request for documents (.2); draft respond to same (.2)	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/17/25	BIW	Review revised Rebuttal Reports	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	07/17/25	BIW	Develop plan confirmation trial strategy	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/17/25	BTA	Revise confirmation brief	0.80	\$1,360.00
B320	07/17/25	CMR	Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (.6); Analyze issues re: potential adjournment of Confirmation Hearing (.9); Analyze issues re: Motion re: Privilege Log (.3); Prepare for deposition of claims agent (2.7)	4.50	\$5,062.50
B320	07/17/25	JDP	Review and edit confirmation brief section re: constitutional law arguments	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	07/17/25	MAK	Review deposition testimony and documents produced to prepare stipulations of fact and cross-examination outlines	5.90	\$6,696.50
B320	07/17/25	MAK	Prepare outlines for expert witness deposition preparation meetings	3.30	\$3,745.50
B320	07/17/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel non-privileged documents (4.0); draft outline for C. Moore expert deposition (1.3)	5.30	\$4,584.50
B320	07/17/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: expert deposition schedule (0.2); Confer with R. Klomparens re: expert deposition (0.2); confer with R. Rosen re: expert deposition (0.2)	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: prepare for plan confirmation adjournment hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/18/25	BIW	Review and revise Confirmation Objection	1.20	\$1,392.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/18/25	BIW	Continue to review and revise Confirmation Objection	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	07/18/25	CG	Confer with C. Restel re: rebuttal expert report and review same	0.40	\$264.00
B320	07/18/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Motion re: Privilege Log (.5); Call with M. Kaplan and M. Berliner re: same (.5); Analyze Insurer Response to Motion to Adjourn Confirmation Hearing (.1); Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (.2); Prepare for Deposition of Claims Agent (2.7); Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation (1.1); Analyze Debtor Expert Reports (.8)	5.90	\$6,637.50
B320	07/18/25	JAR	Research re: objection to chapter 11 plan	1.80	\$1,188.00
B320	07/18/25	JBJ	Draft motion in limine	0.90	\$706.50
B320	07/18/25	JDP	Develop strategy for moving case forward	0.60	\$822.00
B320	07/18/25	JJP	Review email correspondence from B. Weisenberg re: document searches; prepare searches and advise on results of same; provide assistance to E. Lawler re: document distribution	0.30	\$129.00
B320	07/18/25	LHS	Conduct research related to expert deposition outline	2.60	\$2,743.00
B320	07/18/25	MAK	Review deposition testimony and documents produced to prepare stipulations of fact and cross-examination outlines	3.90	\$4,426.50
B320	07/18/25	MAK	Prepare outlines for expert witness deposition preparation meetings	1.40	\$1,589.00
B320	07/18/25	MAK	Review and analyze BRG supplemental report	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	07/18/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents	3.50	\$3,027.50
B320	07/19/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: debrief on status of Plan	0.50	\$580.00
B320	07/19/25	JAR	Research re: objection to plan confirmation	0.70	\$462.00
B320	07/21/25	BIW	Confer with B. Albin re: debrief on prior week's hearing and next steps	0.60	\$696.00
B320	07/21/25	BIW	Review recently produced documents classified as "Confidential AEO"	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/21/25	BTA	Confer with B. Weisenberg on the current standing of the Reorganization Plan	0.60	\$1,020.00
B320	07/21/25	JDP	Develop strategy for moving case forward	0.90	\$1,233.00
B320	07/21/25	JJP	Prepare searches to identify documents requested by B. Weisenberg and review results (1.2); export document sets requested by B. Weisenberg re: Fr. Brandon claims (.5)	1.70	\$731.00
B320	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with BRG Team re: settlement analysis	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: Plan drafting issues	0.60	\$696.00
B320	07/22/25	BIW	Draft email to C. Gauvin re: recently produced documents classified as "Confidential AEO"	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/22/25	BIW	Review Plan insurance assignment language used in other nonprofit sexual abuse bankruptcies	0.70	\$812.00
B320	07/22/25	CG	Meeting with B. Weisenberg in connection with document review re: certain confidential documents labeled AEO	0.30	\$198.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 85 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/22/25	JDP	Call with LS team to discuss strategy going forward to prepare for meet and confer with Debtor's counsel	0.70	\$959.00
B320	07/22/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: meet and confer with debtor on confirmation schedule	0.70	\$794.50
B320	07/23/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: debrief on adjournment of Plan confirmation	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/23/25	BIW	Devise strategy re: steps needed to resolve disputed issues	0.60	\$696.00
B320	07/23/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: confirmation schedule (.2); Confer re: same (.2)	0.40	\$450.00
B320	07/23/25	JDP	Participate in meet and confer with Debtor's counsel re: path forward	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	07/23/25	JJP	Identify clawaback and production sets (.7); provide information requested ty R. Chahil (.3); prepare exports and transfer files (.6)	1.60	\$688.00
B320	07/23/25	KFC	Review and compare spreadsheet of production documents with deposition exhibits for completeness	3.80	\$1,520.00
B320	07/23/25	MAK	Meet and confer with debtor re: confirmation schedule	0.80	\$908.00
B320	07/23/25	RKC	Address clawback of over 200 documents from Debtor's counsel	0.70	\$682.50
B320	07/24/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: case resolution issues	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/24/25	BIW	Revise proposed Adjournment Order (.1); draft email to Foley Insurance Team re: requested revision to Adjournment Order (.1)	0.20	\$232.00
B320	07/24/25	BIW	Devise strategy re: steps needed to resolve disputed issues	0.60	\$696.00
B320	07/24/25	BIW	Draft email to BRG re: certain analyses needed	0.20	\$232.00
B320	07/24/25	CG	Review confidential documents re: PEO	1.00	\$660.00
B320	07/24/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion re: Adjournment of Confirmation hearing (.2); Strategize re: confirmation issues that can proceed (.2); Call with J. Prol, M. Kaplan, and B. Weisenberg re: same (.5)	0.90	\$1,012.50
B320	07/24/25	JDP	Participate in strategy call with M. Kaplan, B. Weisenberg and C. Restel re: moving case forward pending rescheduling of confirmation trial	0.50	\$685.00
B320	07/24/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: meet and confer with debtor on confirmation schedule	0.50	\$567.50
B320	07/24/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: clawback and document productions	0.10	\$97.50
B320	07/24/25	ZM	Research re: expert report and testimony for R. Todd Neilson	1.00	\$420.00
B320	07/25/25	AS	Provide assistance to R. Chahil re: documents review	0.80	\$292.00
B320	07/25/25	CG	Review confidential documents re: PEO	0.90	\$594.00
B320	07/25/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: document productions	0.10	\$97.50
B320	07/26/25	CG	Review and analyze document production re: PEO	0.30	\$198.00
B320	07/26/25	CMR	Confer re: schedule for continued confirmation proceedings	1.00	\$1,125.00
B320	07/28/25	CG	Review and analyze document production re: PEO	2.30	\$1,518.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/30/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG re: asset analysis	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	07/30/25	BTA	Review of briefs filed by and in opposition to Santa Rosa Parishes regarding RFRA, and then review our research	0.40	\$680.00
B320	07/30/25	CMR	Confer re: new production by Debtor	0.20	\$225.00
B320	07/31/25	BTA	Exchange of emails with A. Patel and J. Minicozzi on Santa Rosa RFRA pleadings	0.10	\$170.00
B320	07/31/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team re: documents produced by Debtor (.1); Confer with LS Team re: outstanding issues re: confirmation (.3); Review Committee letter re: mediation re: Confirmation (.1)	0.50	\$562.50
B320	07/31/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (1.2); prepare documents for sharing internally (0.5)	1.70	\$1,334.50
B320	07/31/25	MAK	Review correspondence on privilege and confidentiality issues (1.6); review e-mail from debtor re: meet and confer (.2); meet and confer with debtor (.8)	2.60	\$2,951.00
B320	08/04/25	BIW	Draft emails re: plan confirmation scheduling issues	0.30	\$348.00
B320	08/04/25	CMR	Analyze issues and confer re: schedule for pending confirmation issues	0.50	\$562.50
B320	08/05/25	BIW	Review documents recently produced by Debtor	0.80	\$928.00
B320	08/05/25	JBJ	Prepare produced documents for sharing internally	0.20	\$157.00
B320	08/06/25	BIW	Review documents recently produced by Debtor	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	08/08/25	BIW	Complete review of certain recently produced documents	0.80	\$928.00
B320	08/08/25	JDP	Review Bestwell decision and dissent on dismissal of mass tort chapter 11	0.80	\$1,096.00
			Total B320 - Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	3,443.00	\$3,142,346.00
<u>B400 - Bank</u>	ruptcy-Relate	ed Advice	(mentung Dusmess Film)		
B420 Restruc	cturings				
B420	05/23/25	KFC	Prepare and serve document productions on debtor's counsel	4.30	\$1,720.00
			Total B420 - Restructurings	4.30	\$1,720.00
B430 Advers	ary Proceeding	gs and Bankrupt	tcy Court Litigation		
B430	05/01/25	BIW	Review revised BOG Amended Complaint	0.60	\$696.00
B430	05/01/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: Amended Complaint on Restricted Funds	0.40	\$464.00
B430	05/01/25	BIW	Further revise BOG Amended Complaint	0.40	\$464.00
B430	05/01/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: analysis of Amended BOG Complaint	0.80	\$928.00
B430	05/01/25	CF	Call with BRG re: BOG complaint	0.70	\$462.00
B430	05/01/25	CF	Revise bond obligated group complaint	5.90	\$3,894.00
B430	05/01/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Amended BOG Complaint (.2); Call re: same (.3)	0.50	\$562.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	05/01/25	EJS	Review BRG comments to BOG complaint (.4); call with B. Weisenberg, P. Shields (BRG) and M. Babcock (BRG) re Amended Complaint (.8)	1.20	\$1,020.00
B430	05/01/25	JDP	Review and edit revised BOG complaint	1.50	\$2,055.00
B430	05/02/25	BIW	Further revise BOG Amended Complaint	1.40	\$1,624.00
B430	05/02/25	CF	Revise bond obligated group complaint	2.60	\$1,716.00
B430	05/02/25	CF	Research equitable interest under California law (3.4) review Debtor's motion to dismiss initial bond obligated group complaint (1.2), and revise complaint accordingly (1.9)	6.50	\$4,290.00
B430	05/02/25	CMR	Review and revise Amended BOG Complaint	2.60	\$2,925.00
B430	05/02/25	EJS	Revise Amended Bond Obligated Group Adversary Complaint	2.20	\$1,870.00
B430	05/02/25	MAK	Review and revise BOG amended complaint	1.30	\$1,475.50
B430	05/03/25	BIW	Further revise BOG Amended Complaint	1.20	\$1,392.00
B430	05/03/25	MAK	Review and revise BOG amended complaint	0.80	\$908.00
B430	05/06/25	BIW	Review proposed final draft of BOG Amended Complaint	0.40	\$464.00
B430	05/06/25	CF	Review and finalize bond obligated group amended complaint	0.40	\$264.00
B430	05/06/25	CMR	Confer re: scheduling re: Adversary Proceedings and service of same	0.10	\$112.50
B430	05/07/25	JDP	Review and respond to emails re: adversary proceeding schedule	0.20	\$274.00
B430	05/08/25	KEM	Review motion to dismiss schedule	0.10	\$105.50
B430	05/08/25	LHS	Review and respond to e-mail re: schedule and briefing for upcoming adversary proceedings	0.10	\$105.50
B430	05/12/25	CF	Review bond obligated group and restricted assets complaints and begin drafting shells for responses to anticipated motions to dismiss	1.40	\$924.00
B430	05/12/25	EJS	Draft Response to Motions to Dismiss Amended Bond Obligated Group Complaint	6.20	\$5,270.00
B430	05/13/25	CF	Revise response to anticipated motions to dismiss BOG complaint (.6); email communications with E. Seltzer resame (.1)	0.70	\$462.00
B430	05/13/25	EJS	Draft Response to Motions to Dismiss Amended Bond Obligated Group Complaint	4.80	\$4,080.00
B430	05/14/25	EJS	Draft Response to Motions to Dismiss Amended Bond Obligated Group Adversary Complaint	6.60	\$5,610.00
B430	05/15/25	CF	Call with E. Seltzer re: responses to anticipated motions to dismiss adversary complaints (.2); review and revise same (.4)	0.60	\$396.00
B430	05/15/25	EJS	Draft Response to Motions to Dismiss Amended Bond Obligated Group Adversary Complaint (4.1); call with C. Frankel re: next steps in connection with same (.2)	4.30	\$3,655.00
B430	05/16/25	EJS	Revise Response to MTD	2.00	\$1,700.00
B430	05/19/25	CF	Draft response to anticipated motions to dismiss bond obligated group complaint	3.60	\$2,376.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	05/19/25	EJS	Revise Response to Motion to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Adversary Proceeding	2.00	\$1,700.00
B430	05/20/25	CF	Draft response to anticipated motions to dismiss bond obligated group complaint	2.80	\$1,848.00
B430	05/20/25	CF	Draft response to anticipated motions to dismiss restricted assets complaint	1.40	\$924.00
B430	05/20/25	EJS	Call with C. Frankel re Bond Obligated Group Response (.5); research issue re: same (.7); revise Response (.8)	2.00	\$1,700.00
B430	05/21/25	BIW	Confer with C. Frankel re: develop objection to anticipated Motions to Dismiss	0.50	\$580.00
B430	05/21/25	BIW	Develop objection to anticipated motion to dismiss certain claims asserted in Amended Complaint	0.80	\$928.00
B430	05/21/25	CF	Draft objection to motion to dismiss BOG complaint	7.50	\$4,950.00
B430	05/21/25	EJS	Revise Response to Motion to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Adversary Proceeding	0.80	\$680.00
B430	05/22/25	BIW	Review research on resolution of ownership disputes re: anticipated Motion to Dismiss BOG Complaint	0.80	\$928.00
B430	05/22/25	BIW	Outline arguments to be made in Objection to anticipated Motions to Dismiss Amended Complaints	0.80	\$928.00
B430	05/22/25	CF	Review case law re: equitable ownership under California law for response in support of bond obligated group complaint	3.30	\$2,178.00
B430	05/22/25	EJS	Revise Response to Motions to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Amended Complaint	3.10	\$2,635.00
B430	05/23/25	BIW	Review OPF Motion to Dismiss Amended Complaint re: Restricted Assets	0.60	\$696.00
B430	05/23/25	BIW	Review BOG's Motion to Dismiss Amended Complaint	0.50	\$580.00
B430	05/23/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Motion to Dismiss Amended Complaint re: Restricted Assets	0.40	\$464.00
B430	05/23/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Motion to Dismiss Amended Complaint re: BOG	0.50	\$580.00
B430	05/23/25	CF	Revise response in support of restricted assets complaint	0.80	\$528.00
B430	05/23/25	CMR	Analyze Motion to Dismiss Adversary Proceeding	0.50	\$562.50
B430	05/23/25	CW	Conduct research and analysis re: tax matter; draft summary of ownership for tax purposes	0.80	\$568.00
B430	05/24/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: objections to Motions to Dismiss	0.30	\$348.00
B430	05/24/25	CF	Conference with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, L. Sklar, K. Moynihan and E. Seltzer re: responses to motions to dismiss adversary complaints	0.80	\$528.00
B430	05/24/25	CF	Review and comment on motions to dismiss bond obligated group and restricted assets complaints (2.7); revise responses to same (4.4)	7.10	\$4,686.00
B430	05/24/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	3.50	\$3,937.50
B430	05/24/25	EJS	Review and analyze Debtor and Non-Debtor Affiliated Enities' Motions to Dismiss Amended Bond Obligated Group Complaint (1.3); call with M. Kaplan, R. Restel, and LS team re: same (.8)	2.10	\$1,785.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	05/24/25	KEM	Review debtor motions to dismiss (1.0); review draft objection to motion to dismiss substantive consolidation complaint (.3); correspondence with L. Sklar and C. Frankel re: objections to motions to dismiss (.2); review and analysis of responses to motions to dismiss (.8)	2.30	\$2,426.50
B430	05/24/25	LHS	Conference with team to strategize response to MTDs in both adversary proceedings (.8); follow-up discussion among group re: arguments (.2); review MTDs (2.0); review draft argument outlines (.5)	3.50	\$3,692.50
B430	05/24/25	MAK	Review and analyze motions to dismiss adversary proceedings filed by debtor and non-debtor affiliates	3.90	\$4,426.50
B430	05/25/25	CF	Revise response to motions to dismiss restricted assets complaint	5.70	\$3,762.00
B430	05/25/25	CMR	Review and revise response to Motions to Dismiss Restricted Asset Complaint	2.90	\$3,262.50
B430	05/25/25	KEM	Review draft objection to restricted assets motion to dismiss	0.40	\$422.00
B430	05/25/25	LHS	Review M. Kaplan's comments to response to MTD restricted asset amended complaint	0.40	\$422.00
B430	05/25/25	MAK	Review and analyze motions to dismiss adversary proceedings filed by debtor and non-debtor affiliates	1.60	\$1,816.00
B430	05/25/25	MAK	Revise opposition to restricted asset motion to dismiss	1.40	\$1,589.00
B430	05/26/25	BIW	Review and revise Objection to Motion to Dismiss Restricted Assets Complaint	0.70	\$812.00
B430	05/26/25	CF	Revise response to motions to dismiss restricted assets complaint	3.40	\$2,244.00
B430	05/26/25	CF	Revise response to motions to dismiss bond obligated group complaint	3.60	\$2,376.00
B430	05/26/25	CF	Revise response to motion to dismiss bond obligated group complaint	5.10	\$3,366.00
B430	05/26/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss	3.70	\$4,162.50
B430	05/26/25	JDP	Review and analyze motions to dismiss adversary proceeding	2.20	\$3,014.00
B430	05/26/25	LHS	Work on reply for MTD adversary complaints	2.00	\$2,110.00
B430	05/26/25	MAK	Revise opposition to restricted asset motion to dismiss	1.30	\$1,475.50
B430	05/27/25	BIW	Further revise Objection to Motion to Dismiss BOG Complaint	0.80	\$928.00
B430	05/27/25	CF	Revise response to motions to dismiss bond obligated group complaint	2.80	\$1,848.00
B430	05/27/25	CF	Revise response to motions to dismiss restricted assets complaint	1.60	\$1,056.00
B430	05/27/25	CF	Revise response to motions to dismiss bond obligated group complaint (.8); confer with B. Weisenberg resume (1.5)	2.30	\$1,518.00
B430	05/27/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	3.10	\$3,487.50
B430	05/27/25	EJS	Revise Response to Motions to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Complaint	1.40	\$1,190.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	05/27/25	JDP	Review and edit draft response to motion to dismiss restricted assets complaint	0.50	\$685.00
B430	05/27/25	JDP	Review and edit draft objection to motions to dismiss bog complaint	0.70	\$959.00
B430	05/27/25	LHS	Review latest version of reply to MTD BOG complaint	0.40	\$422.00
B430	05/27/25	MAK	Review and revise opposition to motion to dismiss BOG complaint	2.40	\$2,724.00
B430	05/28/25	BIW	Further revise Objection to Motion to Dismiss BOG Complaint	1.80	\$2,088.00
B430	05/28/25	BIW	Further revise Objection to Motion to Dismiss Restricted Assets Complaint	0.40	\$464.00
B430	05/28/25	BIW	Finalize Objection to Motion to Dismiss BOG Complaint	0.80	\$928.00
B430	05/28/25	CF	Finalize responses to motions to dismiss adversary complaints	3.40	\$2,244.00
B430	05/28/25	CF	Review and revise response to motions to dismiss bond obligated group complaint	2.90	\$1,914.00
B430	05/28/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss	1.30	\$1,462.50
B430	05/28/25	JDP	Review and edit draft response to motion to dismiss BOG complaint	1.40	\$1,918.00
B430	05/29/25	CF	Begin preparing e-binder and case chart for 6/4 Hearing	1.20	\$792.00
B430	05/29/25	CF	Prepare case chart for hearing on motions to dismiss adversary complaints	1.00	\$660.00
B430	05/29/25	CMR	Prepare for hearing re: Motions to Dismiss	0.40	\$450.00
B430	05/31/25	CF	Draft case chart in preparation for motion to dismiss hearing	1.40	\$924.00
B430	06/01/25	CF	Draft case chart for hearing on motion to dismiss bond obligated group complaint	1.40	\$924.00
B430	06/01/25	CMR	Prepare for hearing re: Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	0.20	\$225.00
B430	06/02/25	BIW	Prepare for hearing on Debtor's motion to amend Interim Fee Application Order	1.10	\$1,276.00
B430	06/02/25	BIW	Review replies to objections to Motions to Dismiss	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430	06/02/25	CF	Prepare case chart for hearing on restricted assets complaint	9.90	\$6,534.00
B430	06/02/25	CMR	Analyze Replies re: Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	0.80	\$900.00
B430	06/03/25	BIW	Assist in preparation for hearing on Motions to Dismiss by reviewing and commenting on source documents	2.00	\$2,320.00
B430	06/03/25	CF	Revise case chart for hearing on motion to dismiss restricted assets complaint	1.70	\$1,122.00
B430	06/03/25	CF	Draft case chart for hearing on motion to dismiss bond obligated group complaint	7.30	\$4,818.00
B430	06/03/25	CF	Finalize case charts summarizing cited cases and prepare case law e-binders	6.50	\$4,290.00
B430	06/03/25	CMR	Prepare for hearing on Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	1.90	\$2,137.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 91 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	06/03/25	DC	Download and circulate replies filed in the OPF and BOG adversary proceedings, update electronic files	0.30	\$120.00
B430	06/03/25	KFC	Review and compile exhibits in preparation for hearing on motion to dismiss	3.50	\$1,400.00
B430	06/03/25	MAK	Review and analyze reply briefs and prepare for oral argument on motions to dismiss	4.80	\$5,448.00
B430	06/04/25	BIW	Analyze documents produced by RCWC in support of Motion to Dismiss (.7); review caselaw cited by Debtor and RCWC in recently filed replies (.6)	1.30	\$1,508.00
B430	06/04/25	CF	Email communications with M. Kaplan re: hearing preparation	0.20	\$132.00
B430	06/04/25	CGS	Assist in preparation for motions to dismiss hearing	0.90	\$706.50
B430	06/04/25	CMR	Prepare for hearing re: Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	2.60	\$2,925.00
B430	06/04/25	MAK	Prepare for oral argument on motions to dismiss	3.60	\$4,086.00
B430	06/15/25	CMR	Prepare Order Denying Motions to Dismiss	0.30	\$337.50
B430	06/16/25	CMR	Confer re: submitting Order Denying Motions to Dismiss and next steps in Adversary Proceeding	0.20	\$225.00
B430	06/20/25	CMR	Confer re: next steps in Restricted Asset adversary proceeding	0.10	\$112.50
B430	06/24/25	CMR	Call with OPF Counsel re: Adversary Proceeding	0.30	\$337.50
B430	06/30/25	DC	Review docket in adversary proceedings, download pleadings and update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00
B430	07/04/25	CMR	Review Debtor Answer to Complaint (.4); Review draft stipulation re: OPF Dismissal (.2)	0.60	\$675.00
B430	07/07/25	CMR	Review and revise draft Stipulation re: Dismissal of OPF (.4); Confer re: next steps in Adversary Proceeding (.1)	0.50	\$562.50
B430	07/08/25	CMR	Finalize (.1) and circulate (.1) revised stipulation re: dismissal of OPF from Adversary Proceeding	0.20	\$225.00
B430	07/09/25	CMR	Review revisions (.1) and confer (.1) re: proposed stipulation re: Dismissal of OPF from Adversary Proceeding	0.20	\$225.00
B430	07/21/25	BIW	Participate in call with J. Bair re: District Court Insurance Adv Status Report	0.30	\$348.00
B430	07/21/25	CMR	Strategize re: Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding	0.60	\$675.00
B430	07/22/25	BIW	Draft email re: relevant Rule governing Motion to Reconsider	0.30	\$348.00
B430	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with C. Frankel re: Motion to Reconsider SubCon Judgment	0.30	\$348.00
B430	07/22/25	BIW	Comment on proposed order granting Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceeding	0.10	\$116.00
B430	07/22/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: status of Insurance Adversary Proceeding (.9); Analyze Court Opinion Dismissing Adversary Proceeding (.8); Analyze issues re: Motion to Reconsider Same (2.9); Review and revise Order re: Dismissal of Adversary Proceeding (.3) and confer re: same (.1)	5.00	\$5,625.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 92 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	07/23/25	BIW	Review Judge's decision re: SubCon and highlight issues for reconsideration	0.80	\$928.00
B430	07/23/25	BIW	Confer with C. Frankel re: Motion to Reconsider SubCon Judgment	0.40	\$464.00
B430	07/23/25	CF	Draft motion for reconsideration	4.40	\$2,904.00
B430	07/23/25	CF	Draft motion for reconsideration	0.90	\$594.00
B430	07/23/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding (.2); Call with BRG re: same (.7); Analyze legal issues re: Motion for Reconsideration of Dismissal of Complaint (.5); Review and revise proposed dismissal order (.2)	1.60	\$1,800.00
B430	07/23/25	JBJ	Legal research re: rules of bankruptcy procedure	2.60	\$2,041.00
B430	07/24/25	CF	Research re: motion for reconsideration	0.40	\$264.00
B430	07/24/25	CF	Draft motion for reconsideration	0.90	\$594.00
B430	07/24/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding (1.4); Strategize re: same (.6); Analyze legal issues re: Motion for Reconsideration of Dismissal of Adversary Proceeding (.7)	2.70	\$3,037.50
B430	07/24/25	MAK	Conference call with BRG re: forensic accounting	0.50	\$567.50
B430	07/25/25	CMR	Strategize re: schedule and strategy for Adversary Proceeding (.2); Confer with LS Team re: same (.2); Confer with experts re: analysis for Adversary Proceeding (.4)	0.80	\$900.00
B430	07/25/25	JDP	Review and comment on proposed schedule for restricted assets adversary proceeding	0.20	\$274.00
B430	07/25/25	JDP	Call with insurance counsel re: insurance adversary and insurance strategy	0.50	\$685.00
B430	07/26/25	CMR	Confer with experts re: analysis needed re: Adversary Proceeding	0.30	\$337.50
B430	07/27/25	BIW	Review research on property ownership in bankruptcy	0.40	\$464.00
B430	07/27/25	CF	Email communications re: deadline to file motion for reconsideration and calendaring re: same	0.20	\$132.00
B430	07/28/25	BIW	Review research on standard for motion to reconsider	0.60	\$696.00
B430	07/28/25	CF	Review transcript of court ruling re: motion to dismiss and draft motion for reconsideration	6.90	\$4,554.00
B430	07/28/25	CMR	Analyze issues relating to Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding (.3); Call with BRG re: Adversary Proceeding (.5); Review and revise discovery requests re: same (.4)	1.20	\$1,350.00
B430	07/28/25	JDP	Review court decision dismissing BOG complaint and filed complaint and analyze filing motion for reconsideration or appeal	1.50	\$2,055.00
B430	07/28/25	PJG	Call with B. Weisenberg re: Court's decision in RCWC/Schools adversary decision granting motion to dismiss with focus on count related to section 541/property of the estate (.2); review bench opinion and focus on 541 and other related grounds for reconsideration (.6); research re: section 541/542 standards and reconsideration grounds (0.9); draft email memorandum re: same to B. Weisenberg, J. Prol (.6)	2.30	\$2,518.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 93 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	07/29/25	BIW	Review additional research on standard for motion to reconsider	0.20	\$232.00
B430	07/29/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Restrict Asset Adversary Proceeding (2.7); Confer with experts re: same (.2)	2.90	\$3,262.50
B430	07/29/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft status report to Judge Corley	0.20	\$274.00
B430	07/29/25	MAK	Review status reports on insurance adversary proceeding	0.60	\$681.00
B430	07/29/25	MAK	Review and analyze CA case law on restricted asset analysis	2.10	\$2,383.50
B430	07/30/25	BIW	Draft email re: research on standard for motion to reconsider	0.20	\$232.00
B430	07/30/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding (.3); Confer with experts and LS Team (multiple) re: same (.3); Confer with LS Team re: Motion for Reconsideration of Order Dismissing Adversary Proceeding (.2)	0.80	\$900.00
B430	07/30/25	JDP	Review and comment on proposed revisions to joint status statement	0.30	\$411.00
B430	07/31/25	JDP	Meet and confer with Foley re: restricted assets adversary and plan confirmation issues	0.70	\$959.00
B430	07/31/25	JDP	Follow-up call with M. Kaplan following meet and confer with Foley	0.30	\$411.00
B430	08/01/25	CF	Draft motion for reconsideration of order dismissing first amended adversary complaint	12.80	\$8,448.00
B430	08/01/25	CMR	Prepare proposed schedule re: Adversary Proceeding (1.4); Confer with M. Kaplan re: same (.5)	1.90	\$2,137.50
B430	08/01/25	JDP	Review and comment on proposed schedule for restricted asset adversary proceeding	0.20	\$274.00
B430	08/01/25	MAK	Prepare proposed schedule re: Adversary Proceeding (1.4); Confer with M. Kaplan re: same (.5)	1.90	\$2,156.50
B430	08/02/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion for Reconsideration re: Dismissal of Adversary Proceeding	2.30	\$2,587.50
B430	08/03/25	BMC	Call with C. Restel re: motion to reconsider (.3); analyze relevant pleadings and the Court's opinion re: BOG adversary proceeding (2.6); conduct research in connection with same (1.6)	4.50	\$3,240.00
B430	08/03/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion for Reconsideration re: Dismissal of Adversary Proceeding	0.50	\$562.50
B430	08/04/25	BIW	Review draft Motion for Reconsideration	0.40	\$464.00
B430	08/04/25	BIW	Extensively revise Motion for Reconsideration while reviewing legal research for same	4.60	\$5,336.00
B430	08/04/25	BMC	Conduct research in connection with motion for reconsideration (2.8); various calls with C. Restel resame (.3); review and analyze research resame (5.5)	8.60	\$6,192.00
B430	08/04/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team (.1) and Debtor's counsel (.1) re: proposed schedule for Adversary Proceeding (.2); Review and revise Motion for Reconsideration of Order Dismissing Adversary Proceedings (3.9)	4.30	\$4,837.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 94 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	08/04/25	MAK	Review and analyze CA case law on restricted asset analysis (1.2); outline supplemental discovery for restricted asset adversary (2.7)	3.90	\$4,426.50
B430	08/05/25	BIW	Continue to revise Motion for Reconsideration while reviewing legal research for same	1.40	\$1,624.00
B430	08/05/25	BIW	Continue to revise Motion for Reconsideration while reviewing legal research for same	1.60	\$1,856.00
B430	08/05/25	BIW	Continue to revise Motion for Reconsideration while reviewing legal research for same	1.10	\$1,276.00
B430	08/05/25	BMC	Conduct research in connection with motion for reconsideration (4.4); begin drafting same (3.6); confer with B. Weisenberg and with C. Restel re: same (.9)	8.90	\$6,408.00
B430	08/05/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion for Reconsideration (5.4); Confer re: schedule for Adversary Proceeding (.2)	5.60	\$6,300.00
B430	08/06/25	BIW	Continue to revise Motion for Reconsideration while reviewing legal research for same	1.10	\$1,276.00
B430	08/06/25	BMC	Conduct research in connection with motion for reconsideration (3.9); continue drafting same (3.2); correspondence with B. Weisenberg, M. Kaplan, and C. Restel re: same (.4); review and comment on various drafts of motion for reconsideration (2.3)	9.80	\$7,056.00
B430	08/06/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion for Reconsideration	6.00	\$6,750.00
B430	08/06/25	MAK	Review discovery produced on restricted assets to date to identify supplemental discovery needed	4.40	\$4,994.00
B430	08/07/25	BIW	Review and revise Motion for Reconsideration	0.40	\$464.00
B430	08/07/25	BMC	Confer with M. Kaplan and with C. Restel re: appellate research (.3); conduct research re: same (3.3); draft summary of research and email to internal team re: same (.6); review and comment on draft motion for reconsideration (.9); draft notice of motion, proposed order, declaration, and create exhibits re: same (1.4)	6.50	\$4,680.00
B430	08/07/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion for Reconsideration	3.50	\$3,937.50
B430	08/07/25	JDP	Confer with M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg re: motion for reconsideration	0.40	\$548.00
B430	08/07/25	JDP	Review draft motion for reconsideration of Order dismissing bond Obligated Group complaint	0.90	\$1,233.00
B430	08/07/25	MAK	Review and revise motion for reconsideration (1.1); inter-office calls with J. Prol, B. Weisenberg and C. Restel re: the same (.7)	1.80	\$2,043.00
B430	08/08/25	BIW	Review revised draft of Motion to Reconsider before finalizing	0.30	\$348.00
B430	08/08/25	BMC	Finalize motion for reconsideration, proposed order, notice, declaration, and exhibits and coordinate filing of same	1.70	\$1,224.00
B430	08/08/25	CMR	Revise draft scheduling order	0.20	\$225.00
B430	08/08/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion for Reconsideration (1.6) and Notice of Appeal (.2)	1.80	\$2,025.00
B430	08/08/25	JBJ	Review brief for style and citation accuracy	2.50	\$1,962.50
B430	08/09/25	CMR	Review and revise Stipulation and Order re: schedule	0.30	\$337.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	08/11/25	CMR	Review and revise Rule 26 Disclosures	0.90	\$1,012.50
B430	08/11/25	CMR	Review and revise stipulation re: schedule	0.10	\$112.50
B430	08/11/25	MAK	Review and revise initial disclosures	0.40	\$454.00
B430	08/11/25	MAK	Review discovery produced on restricted assets to date to identify supplemental discovery needed	2.10	\$2,383.50
B430	08/12/25	CMR	Participate in hearing (partial) re: adversary proceeding schedule (.4); Review and revise stipulation re: same (.2); Circulate same to Debtor (.1); Review and revise Rule 26 Disclosures (.2);	0.90	\$1,012.50
B430	08/12/25	MAK	Review discovery produced on restricted assets to date to identify supplemental discovery needed	1.90	\$2,156.50
B430	08/13/25	CMR	Finalize and send Rule 26 Disclosures to Debtor (.1); Review Debtor's Rule 26 Disclosures (.2); Call with M. Kaplan re: same (.2)	0.50	\$562.50
B430	08/14/25	BMC	Review notice of appeal and federal rules of bankruptcy procedure (.2); correspondence with B. Weisenberg resame (.1)	0.30	\$216.00
B430	08/14/25	CMR	Confer with Foley Team re: Meet and Confer re: Rule 26 Disclosures (.1); Review and revise discovery requests for Adversary Proceeding (1.4)	1.50	\$1,687.50
B430	08/14/25	MAK	Review and revise draft discovery	1.40	\$1,589.00
B430	08/15/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: appellate deadlines (.3); Review and revise discovery requests re: Adversary Proceeding (.5); Meet and Confer with Debtor re: Rule 26 disclosures and discovery (.3); Prepare for same (1.0)	2.10	\$2,362.50
B430	08/15/25	MAK	Meet and confer with debtor re: adversary proceeding	0.40	\$454.00
B430	08/19/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests	0.10	\$112.50
B430	08/20/25	CMR	Revise and serve discovery re: Adversary Proceeding	0.50	\$562.50
B430	08/22/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding	0.50	\$562.50
B430	08/24/25	BIW	Review Debtor's discovery requests	0.40	\$464.00
B430	08/25/25	AMG	Strategize re: preparing responses and objections to Debtor's discovery requests	0.70	\$500.50
B430	08/25/25	CMR	Review discovery requests to UCC from Debtor re: Adversary Proceeding	1.30	\$1,462.50
B430	08/25/25	DC	Review Appeal docket, Case No. 25-06841, review associated cases, initial case management scheduling order, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.60	\$240.00
B430	08/26/25	MAK	Review and analyze restricted asset discovery to prepare responses to debtor discovery demands	3.90	\$4,426.50
B430	08/27/25	BIW	Review Objection to Motion to Reconsider	0.40	\$464.00
B430	08/27/25	CMR	Review Adventus Opposition to Motion for Reconsideration	0.30	\$337.50
B430	08/28/25	BIW	Confer with Litigation Team re: preparing Reply to objections to Motion to Reconsider Dismissal of First Amended Complaint	0.20	\$232.00
B430	08/28/25	BIW	Review Debtor's objection to Motion to Reconsider Dismissal of First Amended Complaint	0.40	\$464.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2386-8 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 96 of 101

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount	
B430	08/28/25	BMC	Review objection to motion for reconsideration and conduct research re: same (2.3); begin drafting reply (1.0)	3.30	\$2,376.00	
B430	08/28/25	CMR	Analyze Debtor response to Motion for Reconsideration	0.40	\$450.00	
B430	08/29/25	MAK	Review and analyze Debtor and non-debtor affiliate opposition to motion for reconsideration	1.80	\$2,043.00	
B430	08/30/25	BMC	Draft omnibus response to defendants' objections to reconsideration motion	3.20	\$2,304.00	
B430	08/31/25	BIW	Review Omnibus Reply to Objections to Motion to Reconsider	0.30	\$348.00	
B430	08/31/25	CMR	Review and revise Reply in Support of Motion for Reconsideration	1.90	\$2,137.50	
B430	08/31/25	MAK	Review and revise reply to motion for reconsideration	0.40	\$454.00	
			Total B430 - Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Court Litigation	419.70	\$378,103.00	
B430A Court	Hearings					
B430A	05/07/25	CMR	Prepare for (.1); and attend (virtually) (.8) hearing re: Amended Adversary Complaints	1.20	\$1,350.00	
B430A	05/07/25	MAK	Attend status conference on adversary proceedings	0.80	\$908.00	
B430A	05/09/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for BRG re: prepare for Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00	
B430A	05/09/25	RKC	Prepare for hearing re: discovery disputes	0.30	\$292.50	
B430A	05/10/25	CG	Finalize hearing preparation re: protective order and confer with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: same	1.80	\$1,188.00	
B430A	05/10/25	CMR	Prepare for hearing re: discovery disputes		\$562.50	
B430A	05/10/25	KFC	Compile and create electronic binders in preparation of upcoming hearing		\$1,240.00	
B430A	05/10/25	MAK	Prepare for oral argument on motion for protective order and motion to quash	3.10	\$3,518.50	
B430A	05/10/25	RKC	Prepare for hearing re: discovery disputes	0.20	\$195.00	
B430A	05/11/25	MAK	Prepare for oral argument on motion for protective order and motion to quash	3.40	\$3,859.00	
B430A	05/12/25	MAK	Prepare for oral argument on motion for protective order and motion to quash	2.10	\$2,383.50	
B430A	05/13/25	BIW	Prepare for BRG Data Incident/ Motions for Protective Order hearing	0.30	\$348.00	
B430A	05/13/25	BIW	Prepare for hearing on Objection to Motion to Amend Professional Fee Order	0.80	\$928.00	
B430A	05/13/25	BIW	Attend BRG Data Incident/ Motions for Protective Order hearing	2.20	\$2,552.00	
B430A	05/13/25	CMR	Attend (partial) hearing re: Discovery Motions	1.10	\$1,237.50	
B430A	05/13/25	MAK	Participate in omnibus hearing on late claims, BRG data breach and discovery motions	2.00	\$2,270.00	
B430A	05/14/25	DC	Prepare hearing binder for 5/21/25 hearing	0.30	\$120.00	
B430A	05/16/25	BIW	Prepare for hearing on Objection to Motion to Amend Professional Fee Order	0.80	\$928.00	
B430A	05/16/25	DC	Finalize e-binder for 5/21/25 hearing	0.30	\$120.00	

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430A	06/02/25	BIW	Prepare for and attend hearing on Debtor's motion to amend Interim Fee Application Order	2.30	\$2,668.00
B430A	06/04/25	BIW	Attend hearing on Motions to dismiss Committee Complaints	2.50	\$2,900.00
B430A	06/04/25	BIW	Attend Status Conference re: BRG data incident	0.50	\$580.00
B430A	06/04/25	JDP	Participate in hearing on motions to dismiss and discovery issues before Judge Lafferty	2.50	\$3,425.00
B430A	06/04/25	MAK	Participate in oral argument on adversary proceeding motions to dismiss and discovery issues	2.50	\$2,837.50
B430A	06/13/25	BIW	Attend hearing on motions to dismiss and Committee representative dispute (virtually)	1.00	\$1,160.00
B430A	06/13/25	CMR	Attend (partial) hearing re: UCC 30b6 and Motions to Dismiss (.8); Call with M. Kaplan re: same (.2)	1.00	\$1,125.00
B430A	06/13/25	MAK	Attend (virtual) hearing on discovery issue and adversary proceeding decision	1.00	\$1,135.00
B430A	06/26/25	BIW	Participate in conference with call with Chambers re: trial logistics	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430A	06/26/25	MAK	Court conference on trial logistics	0.90	\$1,021.50
B430A	07/10/25	DC	Prepare E-Binder for 7/16/25 Hearing	0.50	\$200.00
B430A	07/14/25	DC	Update E-binder for 7/16/25 Hearing	0.20	\$80.00
B430A	07/16/25	BIW	Prepare for hearing on lift stay, CCCEB payment and Interim Compensation Order enforcement	1.60	\$1,856.00
B430A	07/16/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: prepare for day's hearing, including anticipated adjournment request	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430A	07/16/25	BIW	Prepare for (.5), and attend, Renewed Lift Stay, Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order and CCCEB Objection hearing (3.8)	4.30	\$4,988.00
B430A	07/16/25	BIW	Prepare for hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion, Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order, CCCEB Objection and Debtor's Plan adjournment motion	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430A	07/16/25	JDP	Prepare for lift stay, CCCEP and fee objection hearings	3.50	\$4,795.00
B430A	07/16/25	JDP	Attend lift stay, CCCEB and fee objection hearings	3.80	\$5,206.00
B430A	07/16/25	MAK	Prepare for omnibus hearing on fee disputes and motion to adjourn	1.40	\$1,589.00
B430A	07/16/25	MAK	Participate in omnibus hearing	3.80	\$4,313.00
B430A	07/16/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: preparation for hearing	0.20	\$195.00
B430A	07/16/25	RKC	Prepare materials for hearing re: confirmation-related discovery	0.90	\$877.50
B430A	07/18/25	BIW	Prepare for (.6) and attend (1.1) hearing on Debtor's adjournment motion	1.70	\$1,972.00
B430A	07/18/25	JDP	Develop strategy for hearing on Debtor's motion to adjourn confirmation trial (.8); calls with B. Weisenberg and M. Kaplan re: same (.6)	1.40	\$1,918.00
B430A	07/18/25	JDP	Call with M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg re: hearing on motion to adjourn confirmation trial and strategy moving forward	0.50	\$685.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount	
B430A	07/18/25	MAK	Prepare for (.6) and participate in (1.1) Court hearing on debtor's motion to adjourn confirmation trial		\$1,929.50	
B430A	07/22/25	CF	Call with B. Weisenberg re: motion for reconsideration (.3) and review related factual information and case law (3.2)	3.50	\$2,310.00	
B430A	07/25/25	CF	Draft motion for reconsideration (5.3) and research ressame (2)	7.30	\$4,818.00	
B430A	08/08/25	JDP	Develop strategy for 8/13 status conference before Judge Lafferty	0.40	\$548.00	
B430A	08/08/25	JDP	Participate in call with M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg re: update on status conference before Judge Lafferty	0.60	\$822.00	
B430A	08/08/25	MAK	Participate in status conference (1.1); telephone call with B. Weisenberg and J. Prol re: the same (.6)	1.70	\$1,929.50	
B430A	08/10/25	BIW	Revise letter to Court re: Statement in advance of August 13th Status Conference	0.40	\$464.00	
B430A	08/11/25	BIW	Revise letter to Court re: Statement in advance of August 13th Status Conference	0.20	\$232.00	
B430A	08/11/25	JDP	Prepare for 8/13 status conference	0.30	\$411.00	
B430A	08/11/25	JDP	Review and edit draft status update to Judge Lafferty	0.20	\$274.00	
B430A	08/12/25	BIW	Review prior week's Status Conference Transcript	0.40	\$464.00	
B430A	08/12/25	BIW	Prepare for Status Conference	0.70	\$812.00	
B430A	08/13/25	BIW	Attend Fee Application hearing	1.00	\$1,160.00	
B430A	08/13/25	BIW	Attend Status Conference	1.10	\$1,276.00	
B430A	08/13/25	BIW	Prepare for Status Conference	0.60	\$696.00	
B430A	08/13/25	JDP	Review transcript of 8/8 status conference and LS fee application; prepare for 8/13 status conference and hearing on fee application	2.50	\$3,425.00	
B430A	08/13/25	JDP	Attend hearing on LS interim fee application	1.00	\$1,370.00	
B430A	08/13/25	JDP	Prepare for (.9) and attend status conference (1.1)	2.00	\$2,740.00	
B430A	08/27/25	BIW	Attend hearing on Lift Stay scheduling (virtually)	0.30	\$348.00	
B430A	08/27/25	BIW	Attend hearing on Debtor's Removal Motion (virtually)	0.20	\$232.00	
B430A	08/27/25	CMR	Attend virtual Court hearing re: schedule re: Appeals	0.30	\$337.50	
			Total B430A - Court Hearings	91.80	\$99,721.50	
B430B Appe	<u>eals</u>					
B430B	08/08/25	JDP	Review and comment on notice of appeal of dismissal of adversary proceeding	0.40	\$548.00	
B430B	08/20/25	JDP	Participate in zoom status conference before Judge Corley	0.60	\$822.00	
B430B	08/21/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team re: status and strategy re: pending appeals	0.20	\$225.00	
B430B	08/24/25	MAK	Review insurers' appellate filings on lift stay appeal		\$1,475.50	
B430B	08/25/25	BIW	Review Insurers' Statement of Issues on Appeal (.2); draft email re: same (.1)	0.30	\$348.00	
B430B	08/25/25	CMR	Analyze issues and strategize re: pending Appeals	2.00	\$2,250.00	
B430B	08/25/25	DC	Review and circulate Statement of Issues on Appeal filed by various insurers	0.30	\$120.00	

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430B	08/26/25	BIW	Draft email to H. Winsberg re: Lift Stay appeal briefing schedule	0.20	\$232.00
B430B	08/26/25	BIW	Review Lift Stay Record designation and comment on same	0.50	\$580.00
B430B	08/26/25	BIW	Review Lift Stay decision to outline appellate brief	0.50	\$580.00
B430B	08/26/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Appeals (2.5); Prepare for hearing re: same (.3)	2.80	\$3,150.00
B430B	08/27/25	BIW	Confer with C. Restel re: prepare for District Court hearing on Lift Stay appeal scheduling	0.40	\$464.00
B430B	08/27/25	BIW	Review Insurer's letter to District Court re: proposed Lift Stay appeal briefing schedule	0.30	\$348.00
B430B	08/27/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: designation of record on appeal (.4); Confer with J. Jameson re: counter designation re: same (.2); Call Clerk's office re: statement of issues and counter designation re: Restricted Asset Appeal (.2); Review Insurer letter to District Court re: Appeal (.3); Prepare for hearing re: same (.8)		\$2,137.50
B430B	08/27/25	DC	Review Appeals docket, update attorney calendar and critical dates memo	0.30	\$120.00
B430B	08/27/25	JBJ	Legal research re: appellate standard of review (0.6); draft counterstatement of issues and designation of record (1.5)	2.10	\$1,648.50
B430B	08/28/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: record on appeal	0.20	\$225.00
B430B	08/28/25	JBJ	Draft counterstatement of issues and designation of record		\$1,727.00
B430B	08/29/25	CMR	Review and revise counterstatement of issues and designation of record on appeal (.4); Review Order Consolidating Appeals (.1); Confer with M. Kaplan and G. Albert (multiple) re: same (.2); Prepare letter to Court re: same (1.0)	1.70	\$1,912.50
B430B	08/29/25	JBJ	Revise counterstatement of issues and designation of record (0.7); legal research re: filing same (0.7)	1.40	\$1,099.00
B430B	08/30/25	CMR	Review and revise Letter re: Consolidation of Appeals	0.20	\$225.00
			Total B430B - Appeals	19.80	\$20,237.00
B460 Other -	Insurance Ma	tters			
B460	07/01/25	JDP	Review insurance pass through strategy and alternative tdp's; confer with B. Weisenberg re: same	2.20	\$3,014.00
B460	07/07/25	JDP	Call with Burns Bair re: insurance strategy	0.80	\$1,096.00
B460	07/14/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Insurance Premium Financing Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B460	07/21/25	BIW	Review transcripts re: Committee's motion for standing to assert claims against Insurers and Abeyance Motion filed in District Court	0.60	\$696.00
B460	07/21/25	JDP	Review transcripts of motion for standing and opposing stay of insurance dec relief action; develop strategy for renewing motions	0.40	\$548.00
B460	07/22/25	BIW	Review transcript re: July 18th Plan Adjournment hearing		\$348.00
B460	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with BurnsBair re: status of insurance adversary and related issues	1.20	\$1,392.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460	07/25/25	MAK	Telephone call with special insurance counsel	0.50	\$567.50
B460	07/29/25	BIW	Review and revise Joint Status Conference Statement	0.40	\$464.00
B460	08/04/25	BIW	Review analysis of insurance related issues	0.40	\$464.00
B460	08/04/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft insurance assignment alternatives	0.30	\$411.00
B460	08/15/25	BIW	Review caselaw on Insurer bad faith	0.60	\$696.00
B460	08/15/25	BIW	Review caselaw on bad faith rights	1.10	\$1,276.00
B460	08/18/25	BIW	Review caselaw on insurance rights	0.70	\$812.00
			Total B460 - Other - Insurance Matters	9.90	\$12,248.50

1	Exhibit I
2	
3	
4	
5	
6	
7	
8	
9	
10	
11	
12	
13	
14	
15	
16	
17	
18	
19	
20	
21	
22	
23	
24	
25	
26	
27	
- 1	

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2386-9 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 1 of 4

1	LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP						
2	JEFFREY D. PROL (admitted pro hac vice) jprol@lowenstein.com						
3	BRENT WEISENBERG (admitted pro hac vice) bweisenberg@lowenstein.com						
4	One Lowenstein Drive Roseland, New Jersey 07068						
5	Telephone: (973) 597-2500						
6	KELLER BENVENUTTI KIM LLP TOBIAS S. KELLER (Cal. Bar No. 151445)						
7	<u>tkeller@kbkllp.com</u> JANE KIM (Cal. Bar No. 298192)						
8	jkim@kbkllp.com GABRIELLE L. ALBERT (Cal. Bar No. 1908)	95)					
9	galbert@kbkllp.com 101 Montgomery Street, Suite 1950						
10	San Francisco, Čalifornia 94104 Telephone: (415) 496-6723						
11	Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecure Creditors	ed					
12	Creanors						
13		NKRUPTCY COURT					
14		CT OF CALIFORNIA DIVISION					
15							
16	In re:	Case No. 23-40523 WJL					
17	THE ROMAN CATHOLIC BISHOP OF OAKLAND, a California corporation sole,	Chapter 11					
18	Debtor.	ORDER APPROVING SEVENTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF					
19		LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL					
20		COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR ALLOWANCE					
21		AND PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND					
22		REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM MAY 1,					
23		2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING AUGUST 31, 2025					
24	Upon consideration of the Seventh Interi	m Fee Application of Lowenstein Sandler LLP as					
25	Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsec	ured Creditors for Allowance and Payment o					
26	Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses	for the Period from May 1, 2025 Through and					
27							
28							

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2386-9 Filed: 10/15/25 Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 2 of 4

1 *Including August 31, 2025* (the "Application")¹; and this Court having jurisdiction to consider the 2 Application and the relief requested therein pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334, and the *Order* 3 Referring Bankruptcy Cases and Proceedings to Bankruptcy Judges, General Order 24 and Rule 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16

19

17

18

20 21

22 23

24

25 26

27 28 5011-1(a) of the Bankruptcy Local Rules for the United States District Court for the Northern District of California; and consideration of the Application and the requested relief being a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b); and venue being proper before this Court pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409; and due and proper notice of the Application having been provided in accordance with the procedures set forth in the Order Authorizing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. 170], as modified by the Agreed Order Amending Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. 2101], and it appearing that no other or further notice need be provided; and this Court having reviewed the Application, the declarations of Jeffrey D. Prol and Steven Woodall in support thereof; and, upon the record and all of the proceedings had before this Court; and this Court having found and determined that the relief sought in the Application is in the best interests of the Debtor, its estate, creditors, and all parties in interest; and that the legal and factual bases set forth in the Application establish just cause for the relief granted herein; and after due deliberation and sufficient cause appearing therefor;

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED THAT:

- 1. The Application is granted as provided herein.
- 2. Lowenstein Sandler LLP ("Applicant") is awarded an interim allowance of its compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$4,261,065.78, consisting of \$4,112,758.00 in fees and reimbursement of \$148,307.78 of actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Compensation Period.
- 3. Consistent with the Order Granting Interim Fee Applications of the Committee Professionals [Dkt. 2281] (the "Sixth Omnibus Fee Order"), the Debtor is hereby authorized and

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2386-9 Filed: 10/15/25₂ Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 3

Capitalized terms used but not defined herein shall have the meaning ascribed to them in the Application.

directed to pay Applicant the outstanding holdback amount of \$495,369.02, which was previously approved but has not been paid, within seven (7) days of the entry of this Order.

- 4. The Debtor is hereby authorized and directed to pay Applicant the outstanding amount of such sums allowed pursuant to Paragraph 2 within seven (7) days of the entry of this Order.
- 5. The Court shall retain jurisdiction to determine any controversy arising in connection with the implementation of this Order.

** END OF ORDER**

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2386-9 Filed: 10/15/25₃ Entered: 10/15/25 15:01:06 Page 4