1	LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP	
2	JEFFREY D. PROL (admitted <i>pro hac vice</i> )	
3	<u>jprol@lowenstein.com</u> BRENT WEISENBERG (admitted <i>pro hac vice</i> )	
_	bweisenberg@lowenstein.com	
4	COLLEEN M. RESTEL (admitted <i>pro hac vice</i> ) crestel@lowenstein.com	
5	One Lowenstein Drive	
6	Roseland, New Jersey 07068 Telephone: (973) 597-2500	
7	KELLER BENVENUTTI KIM LLP	
8	TOBIAS S. KELLER (Cal. Bar No. 151445) tkeller@kbkllp.com	
9	JANE KIM (Ĉal. Bar No. 298192)	
10	jkim@kbkllp.com GABRIELLE L. ALBERT (Cal. Bar No. 190895) galbert@kbkllp.com	
11	101 Montgomery Street, Suite 1950 San Francisco, California 94104	
12	Telephone: (415) 496-6723	
13	Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors	
14	UNITED STATES BAN	KRUPTCY COURT
15	NORTHERN DISTRIC OAKLAND I	
16		1
17	In re:	Case No. 23-40523 WJL
18	THE ROMAN CATHOLIC BISHOP OF OAKLAND, a California corporation sole,	Chapter 11
19	Debtor.	TWENTY-SIXTH MONTHLY PROFESSIONAL FEE STATEMENT
20 21		FOR LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP FOR JULY 1, 2025 THROUGH JULY 31, 2025
22	TO ALL INTERESTED PARTIES AND TO TI	HEIR COUNSEL OF RECORD:
23	NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Lo	owenstein Sandler LLP (" <u>Lowenstein</u> "), lead
24	counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured	Creditors (the "Committee") of The Roman
25	Catholic Bishop of Oakland (the "Debtor"), file	es its twenty-sixth Monthly Professional Fee
26	Statement for the period of July 1, 2025 through J	Tuly 31, 2025 (the "Monthly Fee Statement").
27	Pursuant to the Agreed Order Amending Procedure.	s for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement
28		

of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. 2101] (the "Modified Interim Fee Order")<sup>1</sup> entered by the Court on June 27, 2025, the total legal fees and costs expended by Lowenstein on account of its representation of the Committee for the period of July 1, 2025 through July 31, 2025, is:

Period	Fees	Expenses	Total
July 1, 2025 through July 31,	\$817,204.50	\$23,539.39	\$840,743.89
2025			
Net Total Allowed Payments this Statement Period: (70% of Fees and 100% of Costs)	\$572,043.15	\$23,539.39	\$595,582.54

The itemized billing statements for the fees billed and expenses incurred are attached hereto as **Exhibits A and B**, respectively. Notice Parties have 10 days from the date of service of this Monthly Fee Statement to file an objection thereto. If no objection is filed, Lowenstein may file a certificate of no objection (or if an Objection was timely served, a certificate of partial objection) with the Court after which the Debtor, without further order of the Court, shall pay Lowenstein an amount equal to the lesser of: (1) 70% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in the Monthly Fee Statement, and (2) if an Objection was served, 70% of the fees and 100% of the expenses to which there was no Objection no later than five business days after the filing of the relevant certificate.

Dated: August 29, 2025 LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP

1 0

Capitalized terms not otherwise defined have the meaning ascribed to them in the Interim Fee Order.

By: /s/ *Jeffrey D. Prol* 

One Lowenstein Drive

of Unsecured Creditors

Roseland, New Jersey 07068 Telephone: (973) 597-2500

Counsel for the Official Committee

Jeffrey D. Prol Brent Weisenberg

Colleen Restel

## EXHIBIT A

Professional Services rendered by Lowenstein Sandler LLP, through July 31, 2025

In re: Chapter 11 Proceeding

## I. SUMMARY OF TIME CHARGES AND HOURLY RATES

Name of Professional	Year Admitted	Title/Department	Hours Spent	Hourly Rate	Charge
Albin, Barry T.	1976	Partner/Litigation	40.60	\$1,700.00	\$69,020.00
Kaplan, Michael A.	2011	Partner/Litigation	94.10	\$1,135.00	\$106,803.50
Prol, Jeffrey D.	1990	Partner/Bankruptcy	74.20	\$1,370.00	\$101,654.00
Restel, Colleen M.	2015	Partner/Bankruptcy	88.70	\$1,125.00	\$99,787.50
Weisenberg, Brent I.	2002	Partner/Bankruptcy	102.00	\$1,160.00	\$118,320.00
Chahil, Rasmeet K.	2017	Counsel/Litigation	42.40	\$975.00	\$41,340.00
Gross, Philip J.	2008	Counsel/Bankruptcy	19.00	\$1,095.00	\$20,805.00
Moynihan, Kelly E.	2016	Counsel/Bankruptcy	15.50	\$1,055.00	\$16,352.50
Sklar, Lindsay H.	2014	Counsel/Bankruptcy	42.60	\$1,055.00	\$44,943.00
Berliner, Mikayla R.	2021	Associate/Litigation	46.40	\$865.00	\$40,136.00
Frankel, Chelsea	2024	Associate/Bankruptcy	44.20	\$660.00	\$29,172.00
Gauvin, Carolyn	2024	Associate/Bankruptcy	11.80	\$660.00	\$7,788.00
Giblin, Anna Maria	2023	Associate/Litigation	11.90	\$715.00	\$8,508.50
Jameson, Jennifer Bagger	2022	Associate/Litigation	42.40	\$785.00	\$33,284.00
Minicozzi, Julie A.	2021	Associate/Litigation	21.30	\$860.00	\$18,318.00
Patel, Anish	2021	Associate/Litigation	37.70	\$865.00	\$32,610.50
Rauchberg, Jake A.	2023	Associate/Bankruptcy	7.70	\$660.00	\$5,082.00
Stewart, Cristina G.	2022	Associate/Litigation	7.20	\$785.00	\$5,652.00
Charles, Kelly F.	N/A	Paralegal/Litigation	13.80	\$400.00	\$5,520.00
Claussen, Diane	N/A	Paralegal/Bankruptcy	5.50	\$400.00	\$2,200.00
Pagano, Jamie J.	N/A	Paralegal/Practice Support	6.70	\$430.00	\$2,881.00

of 38

The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland O Invoice No.: 1235851	Official Commi	ttee			Page 2 August 29, 2025
Suhail, Aneela	N/A	Paralegal/Practice Support	0.80	\$365.00	\$292.00
Rocco, Raquelle	N/A	Law Clerk/Summer Associate	4.80	\$475.00	\$2,280.00
Hayter, Carrie T.	N/A	Knowledge and Research Services	3.90	\$410.00	\$1,599.00
Michaud, Zoraida	N/A	Knowledge and Research Services	6.80	\$420.00	\$2,856.00
TOTAL FEES			792.00		\$817,204.50

\$1,066.53 **Attorney Blended Rate** 

Invoice No.: 1235851

TIME DETAIL:

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B100 - Adm	ninistration				
B110 Case	<u>Administration</u>				
B110	07/01/25	DC	Review dockets in lead case and adversary proceedings, update critical dates memo, attorney calendar and fee application status chart	0.40	\$160.00
B110	07/09/25	KFC	Confirm logistics for expert depositions; calendar dates, schedule court reporters and confer with printing vendors	1.80	\$720.00
B110	07/11/25	DC	Review dockets in lead case and adversary proceedings, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.40	\$160.00
B110	07/21/25	DC	Review updates re: confirmation hearing, confer with lodging management re: cancellation of proposal for August, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.50	\$200.00
			Total B110 - Case Administration	3.10	\$1,240.00
			- Case Administration	<del></del>	ψ1,240.00 ——————————————————————————————————
B140 Relief	from Stay/Ade	equate Protection	n Proceedings		
B140	07/07/25	BIW	Begin outlining reply to impending objections to Renewed Lift Stay Motion	0.70	\$812.00
B140	07/09/25	BIW	Continue outlining contemplated response to lift stay objections while preparing for hearing on same	1.10	\$1,276.00
B140	07/10/25	BIW	Review lift stay objections	1.20	\$1,392.00
B140	07/10/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: summarize lift stay objections	0.30	\$348.00
B140	07/10/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: financial analysis underlying Plan	0.30	\$348.00
B140	07/10/25	BIW	Continue drafting Reply to Lift Stay Objections	2.20	\$2,552.00
B140	07/10/25	JDP	Review objections to renewed lift stay motion (1.5); review and edit draft reply (1.1)	2.60	\$3,562.00
B140	07/11/25	BIW	Continue drafting reply to lift stay objections	1.70	\$1,972.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B140	07/11/25	JDP	Review and edit draft reply in support of renewed stay relief motion	2.30	\$3,151.00
B140	07/13/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: Lift Stay Reply issues	0.30	\$348.00
B140	07/13/25	BIW	Finalize Lift Stay Reply	0.40	\$464.00
B140	07/14/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: Lift Stay Reply issues	0.30	\$348.00
B140	07/14/25	BIW	Prepare for hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion	0.90	\$1,044.00
B140	07/14/25	JDP	Review and revise reply in support of renewed stay relief motion	1.60	\$2,192.00
B140	07/15/25	BIW	Prepare for Renewed Lift Stay hearing	1.30	\$1,508.00
B140	07/17/25	BIW	Revise proposed order granting Renewed Lift Stay Motion (.2); email correspondence re: same (.2)	0.40	\$464.00
B140	07/17/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: debrief on prior day's Lift Stay hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B140	07/21/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: process for moving lift stay cases forward	0.10	\$137.00
B140	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with Foley Insurance Team re: following day's CMC	0.40	\$464.00
B140	07/22/25	BIW	Draft email to R. Simons re: attendance at following day's CMC	0.10	\$116.00
B140	07/23/25	BIW	Draft email to Foley Insurance Team re: prosecution of CMC cases	0.20	\$232.00
B140	07/27/25	BIW	Draft email to R. Simons re: entry of Lift Stay Order	0.20	\$232.00
B140	07/30/25	JDP	Review and respond to email from SCC re: best practices on stay relief motions	0.20	\$274.00
			Total B140 - Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	19.20	\$23,700.00
B150 Meetin	ngs of and Con	nmunication wit	h Creditors		
B150	07/01/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to Survivor re: status of case	0.30	\$348.00
B150	07/09/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: status of plan confirmation proceedings	0.40	\$464.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2266-1 Filed: 08/29/25 Entered: 08/29/25 14:48:11 Page 4

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/10/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/10/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee member re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	0.30	\$348.00
B150	07/10/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/10/25	JDP	Participate in SCC update call	0.60	\$822.00
B150	07/11/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	1.00	\$1,160.00
B150	07/11/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on plan confirmation proceedings	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/11/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.00	\$1,370.00
B150	07/11/25	MAK	Participate in committee call	1.00	\$1,135.00
B150	07/13/25	BIW	Email correspondence with counsel for Committee members re: form of insurance assignment	0.30	\$348.00
B150	07/13/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: filings expected in the coming week	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/14/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: update on plan confirmation trial	0.70	\$812.00
B150	07/14/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: coordinate call for later in the week	0.10	\$116.00
B150	07/14/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on plan confirmation trial	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/15/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: lift stay hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B150	07/17/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee members re: debrief on previous day's hearing	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Participate in bi-weekly call with Committee members	1.20	\$1,392.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: prepare for hearing on Debtor's request for adjournment	0.30	\$348.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: update on status of case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: debrief on Wednesday's hearing	0.40	\$464.00

					114gust 25, 202.
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on Committee call earlier in the day	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on hearing on Debtor's request for adjournment	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/18/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: debrief on Adjournment Hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/18/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.20	\$1,644.00
B150	07/19/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on recent events	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/21/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee member re: go forward strategy	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	07/21/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: debrief on recent events	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/21/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: moving case forward	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: following day's CMC	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/22/25	BIW	Develop go forward strategy in light of Plan confirmation adjournment	0.50	\$580.00
B150	07/23/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of negotiations	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/23/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee members' counsel re: Judge's ruling on SubCon and adjournment of Plan confirmation hearing	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	07/23/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: path forward	1.10	\$1,507.00
B150	07/24/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee member re: Judge's ruling on SubCon and adjournment of Plan confirmation hearing	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/24/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on adjournment of Plan confirmation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/24/25	BIW	Review motion to deem late filed claim timely (.4); draft email to Committee re: same (.3)	0.70	\$812.00
B150	07/24/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: Judge's ruling on SubCon and adjournment of Plan confirmation hearing	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	07/24/25	JDP	Participate in SCC update call	1.10	\$1,507.00

Invoi	ce No.	. 123	3585
HIVOI	CE INO.	. 123	ינסכו

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/25/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee members re: Judge's ruling on SubCon and adjournment of Plan confirmation hearing	1.00	\$1,160.00
B150	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Restricted Assets adversary proceeding	0.60	\$696.00
B150	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of 5108 cases	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of negotiations	0.20	\$232.00
B150	07/25/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.00	\$1,370.00
B150	07/28/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: scope of automatic stay	0.20	\$232.00
B150	07/28/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: renewing mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	07/29/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee member re: prospects for further mediation	0.70	\$812.00
B150	07/29/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: settlement alternatives	0.70	\$959.00
B150	07/30/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee members re: prospects for further mediation	0.60	\$696.00
			Total B150 - Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	30.80	\$37,299.00
B155 Media	<u>ation</u>				
B155	07/01/25	JDP	Emails from/to A. Uetz re: scheduling settlement meeting	0.20	\$274.00
B155	07/19/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: updating settlement proposal	0.50	\$685.00
B155	07/22/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: settlement analysis (1.1); develop strategy re: ability to pay analysis (.6)	1.70	\$2,329.00
B155	07/23/25	JDP	Review and update ability to pay analysis and insurance allocation; develop settlement position	0.60	\$822.00
B155	07/24/25	JDP	Develop alternative settlement model	1.20	\$1,644.00
B155	07/28/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG re: asset analysis	1.00	\$1,160.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B155	07/28/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: settlement analysis	1.00	\$1,370.00
B155	07/30/25	BIW	Participate in call with Stout re: claims analysis	0.40	\$464.00
B155	07/30/25	BIW	Review Westport letter re: mediator proposal and draft emails re same	0.30	\$348.00
B155	07/30/25	CMR	Summary review of Westport letter to Court re: mediation	0.20	\$225.00
B155	07/30/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: settlement analysis	1.10	\$1,507.00
B155	07/30/25	JDP	Call with Stout re: settlement analysis	0.50	\$685.00
B155	07/31/25	JDP	Review and respond to Westport letter to court re: mediation	0.50	\$685.00
B155	07/31/25	JDP	Review, analyze and comment on revised settlement analysis	1.20	\$1,644.00
			Total B155 - Mediation	10.40	\$13,842.00
B160 Fee/Em	nployment Ap	plications			
B160	07/01/25	DC	Edit and finalize budget for seventh interim period; update fee application status chart	0.40	\$160.00
B160	07/01/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft budget	0.20	\$274.00
B160	07/23/25	DC	Download CNO for LS May Monthly Fee Statement, confer with team re: applied funds and update fee application status chart	0.20	\$80.00
B160	07/31/25	JDP	Review fee examiner's interim report re: LS interim fee application and develop response (.5); Telephone conference with D. Klauder re: same (.3)	0.80	\$1,096.00
			Total B160 - Fee/Employment Applications	1.60	\$1,610.00
B170 Fee/En	nployment Ob	jections			
B170	07/10/25	BIW	Draft objection to Foley's May MFS	1.10	\$1,276.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B170	07/10/25	JDP	Review and edit objection to Foley fee application	1.40	\$1,918.00
B170	07/11/25	BIW	Draft email to Debtor's counsel re: response to objection to Lowenstein's May MFS	0.20	\$232.00
B170	07/11/25	CF	Draft motion to enforce the interim compensation order and related motion to shorten papers	7.70	\$5,082.00
B170	07/11/25	DC	Prepare summary chart of professionals' fees for response to objection	0.60	\$240.00
B170	07/11/25	JDP	Review and edit draft email to Foley re: objection to May fee statement	0.20	\$274.00
B170	07/11/25	JDP	Review and edit objection to Foley May fee statement	1.30	\$1,781.00
B170	07/11/25	JDP	Develop strategy re: fee dispute	0.60	\$822.00
B170	07/12/25	BIW	Review and revise Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order and Motion to Shorten Time	0.80	\$928.00
B170	07/12/25	CF	Revise motion to enforce interim compensation order	1.30	\$858.00
B170	07/12/25	CF	Emails to/from J. Prol and B. Weisenberg re: motion to enforce admin fee order revisions	0.40	\$264.00
B170	07/12/25	JDP	Review and revise draft motion to compel compliance with Administrative fee order	3.20	\$4,384.00
B170	07/13/25	BIW	Review and revise Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order, Motion to Shorten Time and Weisenberg Declaration	0.60	\$696.00
B170	07/14/25	BIW	Review and revise Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order, Motion to Shorten Time and Weisenberg Declaration	0.70	\$812.00
B170	07/14/25	JDP	Review and revise draft of motion to compel enforcement of administrative fee order	1.50	\$2,055.00
B170	07/15/25	BIW	Confer with M. Lee re: meet and confer on fee objection	1.00	\$1,160.00
B170	07/15/25	JDP	Participate in call with B. Weisenberg and M. Lee re: discovery requests and fee objections	1.00	\$1,370.00
B170	07/16/25	DC	Prepare chart of professionals' fees billed to date for court hearing	0.60	\$240.00
B170	07/17/25	BIW	Revise Order granting Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order (.1); email correspondence re: same (.2)	0.30	\$348.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B170	07/17/25	DC	Confer with local counsel re: objection to LS' May Monthly Fee Statement (.1); review docket and draft CNO (.3)	0.40	\$160.00
B170	07/17/25	JDP	Review proposed order granting motion to compel compliance with Administrative Fee Order and Debtor's objection to same; revise form of order; confer with B. Weisenberg re: same	0.40	\$548.00
B170	07/22/25	BIW	Review Fee Examiner's Report re: Sixth Interim Fee Application	0.20	\$232.00
B170	07/30/25	JDP	Review LS monthly fee request for June to prepare for fee objection hearing	0.30	\$411.00
B170	07/30/25	JDP	Preliminary review of fee examiner report on LS interim fee app; preliminary review of fee application and develop response	0.30	\$411.00
			Total B170 - Fee/Employment Objections	26.10	\$26,502.00
B175 Fee Ap	pplications and	Invoices - Othe	<u>ers</u>		
B175	07/31/25	JDP	Receive and disburse funds for committee expense reimbursement applications	0.20	\$274.00
			Total B175 - Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	0.20	\$274.00
<u>B200 - Opera</u>	ations				
B210 Busine	ess Operations				
B210	07/10/25	BIW	Revise email objection to CCCEB payment	0.20	\$232.00
B210	07/10/25	CF	Call with B. Weisenberg re: Debtor payments to Cathedral Corp	0.20	\$132.00
B210	07/12/25	CF	Review documents and communications re: CCCEB Note and draft objection to CCCEB payments	3.60	\$2,376.00
B210	07/12/25	CF	Research case law re: "ordinary course" and docket re: CCCEB references (1.4); finalize objection to CCCEB payments (2.7)	4.10	\$2,706.00
B210	07/13/25	BIW	Review and revise objection to CCCEB quarterly payment	0.80	\$928.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B210	07/14/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: CCCEB Note issues	0.30	\$348.00
B210	07/14/25	BIW	Review and revise objection to CCCEB quarterly payment (.9); review research for same (.4)	1.30	\$1,508.00
B210	07/14/25	CF	Research re: heightened scrutiny of insider payments	1.10	\$726.00
B210	07/14/25	JDP	Review and revise objection to proposed payment to CCCEB	2.20	\$3,014.00
B210	07/15/25	BIW	Review Debtor's reply to CCCEB Payment Objection	0.30	\$348.00
B210	07/21/25	BIW	Review June MOR	0.40	\$464.00
B210	07/22/25	BIW	Review email (with attachment) from M. Lee re: CCCEB Q3 funding	0.20	\$232.00
			Total B210 - Business Operations	14.70	\$13,014.00
<u>B300 - Claim</u>	ns and Plan				
B310 Claims	Administration	on and Objection	<u>18</u>		
B310	07/14/25	BIW	Review Motion to Allow Late Claim	0.30	\$348.00
B310	07/23/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Moore re: late filed claims	0.10	\$116.00
B310	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with Stout re: re-review claims analysis	0.50	\$580.00
B310	07/25/25	BIW	Draft follow up email to M. Moore re: late filed claims	0.10	\$116.00
B310	07/25/25	JDP	Participate in call with M. Schwab re: claims analysis	0.50	\$685.00
B310	07/28/25	BIW	Email correspondence with M. Moore re: late claims	0.20	\$232.00
B310	07/29/25	BIW	Email correspondence with M. Moore re: late claims	0.10	\$116.00
			Total B310 - Claims Administration and Objections	1.80	\$2,193.00

Code		Timekeeper		Hours	Amount
B320 Plan	and Disclosure St	atement (incl	luding Business Plan)		
B320	07/01/25	AMG	Revise, proof, and prepare expert report of P. Shields for submission	11.80	\$8,437.00
B320	07/01/25	AP	Attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.60	\$519.00
B320	07/01/25	AP	Revise memorandum re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.20	\$1,038.00
B320	07/01/25	BIW	Review final comments to P. Shields Expert Report	0.70	\$812.00
B320	07/01/25	BIW	Review and comment on revised expert reports (1.6); calls on same (.6)	2.20	\$2,552.00
B320	07/01/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: expert report	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/01/25	BIW	Review Stout Claims Valuation Report	0.70	\$812.00
B320	07/01/25	ВТА	Review of A. Patel's memo and attached case law on intersection of Canon Law and Bankruptcy Law and the nature of parishes as juridical entities under Canon Law (.4); telephone conference with A. Patel (.6); review of Third Amended Disclosure Statement (.4); revise and edit portion of omnibus brief on hypothetical liquidation test (1.1)	2.50	\$4,250.00
B320	07/01/25	CG	Review and analyze document production in connection with privilege log and unknown priests	0.80	\$528.00
B320	07/01/25	CG	Review and analyze priest privilege log re: confirmation preparation	1.80	\$1,188.00
B320	07/01/25	CG	Finalize McNally expert report	1.20	\$792.00
B320	07/01/25	CMR	Review and revise Expert Reports	2.00	\$2,250.00
B320	07/01/25	JAM	Emails with J. Albin and A. Patel re: confirmation brief analysis	0.20	\$172.00
B320	07/01/25	JBJ	Edit draft expert report (1.3); verify expert exhibits (3.0); prepare expert exhibits for filing (0.4)	4.70	\$3,689.50
B320	07/01/25	JDP	Review and revise expert reports	2.50	\$3,425.00
B320	07/01/25	JJP	Export documents and transfer same to BRG (.5); process new documents in preparation for production (.4); prepare revised production set and post same for distribution (.5)	1.40	\$602.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/01/25	KEM	Draft confirmation objection	0.40	\$422.00
B320	07/01/25	KFC	Assist with finalizing and serving expert reports	4.20	\$1,680.00
B320	07/01/25	LHS	Work on deposition outline	0.60	\$633.00
B320	07/01/25	LHS	Deposition prep call with S. Woodall and M. Kaplan (1.1); further review of produced documents and e-mail S. Woodall (.5)	1.60	\$1,688.00
B320	07/01/25	MAK	Finalize expert reports	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	07/01/25	MAK	Prepare for committee corporate designee deposition (2.8); meeting with S. Woodall re: the same (1.1)	3.90	\$4,426.50
B320	07/01/25	MRB	Draft letter challenging privilege log	0.20	\$173.00
B320	07/01/25	PJG	Draft plan confirmation objection	1.10	\$1,204.50
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Calls with BRG re: draft expert report	1.40	\$1,365.00
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Serve four expert reports, and document production on all authorized counsel of record	0.50	\$487.50
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Revise P. Shields draft report	6.50	\$6,337.50
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Draft and revise expert report and document production cover letter	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Revise and finalize K. McNally expert report and exhibits	0.80	\$780.00
B320	07/01/25	RKC	Revise and finalize R. Klomparens expert report	0.50	\$487.50
B320	07/02/25	BIW	Review Debtor's expert reports	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	07/02/25	BIW	Review Debtor's expert reports	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	07/02/25	BTA	Review and edit brief point on Hypothetical Liquidation Test	2.30	\$3,910.00
B320	07/02/25	CG	Confer with M. Kaplan re: privilege log	0.10	\$66.00
B320	07/02/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (1.4); review expert reports (0.5); draft deposition outlines (0.5); legal research re: discovery (2.8)	5.20	\$4,082.00

Invoice No.: 1235851	1	

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/02/25	JDP	Review and analyze draft insurance assignment proposal and develop response (.4); call with T. Burns re: same (.3)	0.70	\$959.00
B320	07/02/25	JDP	Review and analyze debtor expert reports	2.70	\$3,699.00
B320	07/02/25	JDP	Develop strategy for confirmation hearing	1.60	\$2,192.00
B320	07/02/25	KEM	Draft confirmation objection	0.20	\$211.00
B320	07/02/25	KFC	Assist with collection of documents in preparation 30b6 deposition	4.00	\$1,600.00
B320	07/02/25	LHS	Exchange correspondence with R. Chahil re: expert reports	0.30	\$316.50
B320	07/02/25	LHS	Document review for 30b6 deposition preparation and prepare prep binders (1.5); work on outline to prepare for 30b6 deposition (2.0)	3.50	\$3,692.50
B320	07/02/25	MAK	Begin review and analysis of Debtor's expert reports (3.6); confer with R. Chahil re: same (.2); confer with C. Gauvin re: privilege log (.1)	3.90	\$4,426.50
B320	07/02/25	MAK	Prepare for committee corporate designee deposition	0.90	\$1,021.50
B320	07/02/25	MAK	Conference call with K. McNally re: rebuttal report	0.40	\$454.00
B320	07/02/25	MRB	Edit letter challenging privilege log (1.0); prepare expert deposition outlines (0.5)	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	07/02/25	RKC	Review and analyze D. Martin expert report	0.80	\$780.00
B320	07/02/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar re: preparation for Committee's 30(b)[6] deposition	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/02/25	RKC	Meeting with K. McNally re: rebuttal expert report	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/02/25	RKC	E-mail with experts re: RCBO's expert reports and potential rebuttal (0.8); confer with J. Jameson re: review of Veracruz natives (0.2); strategize re: expert depositions (0.7) confer with Lowenstein team re: preparation for expert depositions (0.5)	2.20	\$2,145.00
B320	07/02/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan re: expert reports	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/03/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.00	\$865.00

Invoice No.:	1235851
mivoice no	1233031

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/03/25	AP	Attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.90	\$778.50
B320	07/03/25	AP	Review expert's report to draft motion in limine	0.50	\$432.50
B320	07/03/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Plan confirmation issues	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/03/25	BTA	Review of report of Dr. Kurt Martens on canon law	0.40	\$680.00
B320	07/03/25	ВТА	Zoom conference with J. Minicozzi and A. Patel to talk about opposition brief to Reorganization Plan and legal argument (.9); telephone conference with P. Gross to discuss confirmation brief issues (.5)	1.40	\$2,380.00
B320	07/03/25	CGS	Review Debtor's supplemental production of loan documents and compose summary re: same	5.10	\$4,003.50
B320	07/03/25	CMR	Analyze Debtor's Expert Reports (1.0); Confer re: potential rebuttal reports (.2)	1.20	\$1,350.00
B320	07/03/25	DC	Preliminary discussions with courthouse staff and Oakland Marriott guest services re: confirmation hearing logistics	0.60	\$240.00
B320	07/03/25	JAM	Research re: constitutional arguments in confirmation briefing (4.7); prepare for (.7) and attend (.9) conference with B. Albin and A. Patel re: constitutional arguments in confirmation briefing; emails with B. Albin and A. Patel re: research (.6); emails with R. Chahil re: research (.2)	7.10	\$6,106.00
B320	07/03/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (0.5); legal research re: discovery (0.5)	1.00	\$785.00
B320	07/03/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: rebuttal report	0.60	\$822.00
B320	07/03/25	JDP	Review debtor expert reports and develop strategy for response	2.60	\$3,562.00
B320	07/03/25	JJP	Incorporate new documents into the case database	0.70	\$301.00
B320	07/03/25	LHS	Coordinate binders and materials for deposition preparation sessions (1.0); edit and e-mail local counsel re: Amended R&Os to 30b6 Notice (.3); review COS re: same (.1); work on mock deposition outline (4.5)	5.90	\$6,224.50
B320	07/03/25	MAK	Prepare for committee corporate designee deposition	1.40	\$1,589.00
B320	07/03/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of debtor's expert reports (4.2); telephone call with BRG re: the same (.6)	4.80	\$5,448.00

Invoice No.: 1235851
----------------------

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/03/25	PJG	Calls and emails with B. Albin re: Diocese briefing and legal arguments re: first amendment/establishment clause and related issues	0.50	\$547.50
B320	07/03/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein team re: K. Martens expert report	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/03/25	RKC	Review C. Moore report in preparation for meeting with BRG	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/03/25	RKC	Confer with BRG team re: P. Shields rebuttal report	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/03/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan re: expert report strategy	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/03/25	RKC	E-mail with BRG re: C. Moore report (0.2); e-mail Foley re: documents relied on by C. Moore (0.2); confer with Stout real estate team re: rebuttal report (0.4); attend to RCC supplemental production (0.3); confer with B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: K. Martens report (0.3); plan and prepare for rebuttal reports (0.3); confer with G. Albert re: amended responses and objections to 30(b)[6] notice (0.3)	2.00	\$1,950.00
B320	07/04/25	BTA	Draft portion of brief on First Amendment/hypothetical liquidation test	4.50	\$7,650.00
B320	07/04/25	CMR	Review Debtor's Expert Reports	3.00	\$3,375.00
B320	07/04/25	KEM	Draft confirmation objection	3.10	\$3,270.50
B320	07/05/25	BTA	Continue drafting of First Amendment/hypothetical liquidation piece of brief	2.50	\$4,250.00
B320	07/05/25	JBJ	Review (0.2) and respond (0.1) to internal correspondence re: produced documents	0.30	\$235.50
B320	07/05/25	LHS	Revise deposition outline	0.50	\$527.50
B320	07/05/25	RKC	Confer with BRG team re: expert reports	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/06/25	BTA	Complete first draft of First Amendment/hypothetical liquidation test part of brief	4.90	\$8,330.00
B320	07/06/25	MAK	Prepare for committee corporate designee deposition	1.90	\$2,156.50
B320	07/06/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of Debtor's expert reports	3.80	\$4,313.00

of 38

T	1225051
Invoice No.:	1233831

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/06/25	RKC	Confer with J. Haselberger re: Martens report (0.2); confer with C. Stewart re: review of RCC's supplemental production (0.2); review CV and testimony list for expert K. Martens (0.2)	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/06/25	RKC	Review and analyze J. Satter expert report (1.2); review and analyze A. Zimmerman expert report (0.7)	1.90	\$1,852.50
B320	07/07/25	AP	Draft brief objecting to confirmation	4.50	\$3,892.50
B320	07/07/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	2.20	\$1,903.00
B320	07/07/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns and J. Bair re: analysis of Plan confirmation hearing	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/07/25	BIW	Review and revise Plan Confirmation objection	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	07/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Plan structure issues	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	07/07/25	BTA	Final read and revisions of brief section (1.0); review emails from team re: brief and respond (.8); review of CV of K. Martens (.2)	2.00	\$3,400.00
B320	07/07/25	CMR	Analyze outstanding issues re: fact discovery (.8); Analyze Debtor's Expert Reports (3.1); Multiple calls re: same (.7); Call with M. Kaplan and R. Chahil re: expert reports (.8)	5.40	\$6,075.00
B320	07/07/25	JAM	Emails with B. Weisenberg, B. Albin, A. Patel, M. Kaplan, and P. Gross re: confirmation briefing draft	0.70	\$602.00
B320	07/07/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (0.5); draft comparison chart re: same (4.7); draft deposition outlines (0.5)	5.70	\$4,474.50
B320	07/07/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: insurance assignment	1.00	\$1,370.00
B320	07/07/25	JJP	Prepare list of privileged document clawbacks	0.60	\$258.00
B320	07/07/25	KEM	Correspondence with B. Weisenberg, P. Gross, and B. Albin re: confirmation brief	0.20	\$211.00
B320	07/07/25	LHS	Prepare for deposition, including additional revision of deposition outline and creation of new binders for preparation meetings (3.5); exchange multiple e-mails with vendors and internal team re: same (.5)	4.00	\$4,220.00
B320	07/07/25	LHS	Review and analyze expert report, including supporting documents relied upon as part of report (2.5); review and conduct additional background research on expert, and prepare expert deposition outline (1.9)	4.40	\$4,642.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/07/25	MAK	Telephone call with Stout (RE) re: expert rebuttal	0.40	\$454.00
B320	07/07/25	MAK	Begin preparing issue outlines for depositions of debtor's experts	4.70	\$5,334.50
B320	07/07/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel	0.60	\$519.00
B320	07/07/25	PJG	Draft confirmation objection	1.30	\$1,423.50
B320	07/07/25	PJG	Confer and correspond with B. Weisenberg, M. Kaplan, K. Moynihan, and B. Albin re: plan confirmation objection status, timing and projected outline of pages and discussion re: page limits	0.40	\$438.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Review and analyze K. Martens expert report	0.70	\$682.50
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Confer with Stout real estate team re: analysis of Hilco expert reports	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Confer with J. Jameson re: Hilco expert depositions	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Call with BRG and Stout real estate teams re: analysis of RCBO's expert reports	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Assist with preparation for 30(b)(6) deposition	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Develop expert deposition strategy	0.80	\$780.00
B320	07/07/25	RKC	Prepare for expert depositions (1.10); analyze RCBO expert report deficiencies (0.5); e-mail Foley re: same (0.3); draft e-mail to Foley re: abuse documents (0.3); review motion to compel (0.2); confer with Stout abuse claims team re: rebuttal report (0.4); e-mail Foley re: expert deposition schedule (0.2)	3.00	\$2,925.00
B320	07/08/25	AP	Attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin and J. Minicozzi re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.50	\$1,297.50
B320	07/08/25	AP	Draft brief objecting to confirmation	2.00	\$1,730.00
B320	07/08/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.00	\$865.00
B320	07/08/25	ВТА	Meeting with J. Minicozzi and A. Patel to discuss brief in opposition to confirmation of the Reorganization Plan and other issues concerning the non-application of canon law to a bankruptcy proceeding	1.50	\$2,550.00

Invoice No.: 1235851				August 29,		
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount	
B320	07/08/25	BTA	Review of cite checked brief with additions; make further edits; review Articles of Incorporation of RCBO, and bylaws of the Presbyteral Council; and Bond Obligated Group; review of additional case law	2.20	\$3,740.00	
B320	07/08/25	CF	Review produced bylaws and articles of incorporation and email communications re: same	1.30	\$858.00	
B320	07/08/25	CMR	Analyze expert reports in preparation for depositions (1.5); Analyze Debtor confidentiality designations and review and revise letter re: same (2.0); Analyze outstanding fact issues (.3); Follow up with Debtor re: Voting Tabulation issues (.1)	3.90	\$4,387.50	
B320	07/08/25	JAM	Edit confirmation brief draft (5.0); prepare for (.4) and attend (1.5) meeting with B. Albin and A. Patel re: confirmation brief draft; emails with B. Albin, A. Patel, B. Weisenberg, and C. Frankel re: confirmation brief draft (1.0); research information re: expert and draft email to R. Chahil, B. Albin, and A. Patel re: results (.9)	8.80	\$7,568.00	
B320	07/08/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (0.4); draft comparison chart re: same (1.0)	1.40	\$1,099.00	
B320	07/08/25	LHS	Assist with deposition preparation (4); update outline (.5)	4.50	\$4,747.50	
B320	07/08/25	MAK	Telephone call with canon law rebuttal expert	0.30	\$340.50	
B320	07/08/25	MAK	Prepare for meeting with S. Woodall (2.2); meet with S. Woodall re: deposition preparation (4.2)	6.40	\$7,264.00	
B320	07/08/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel	1.10	\$951.50	
B320	07/08/25	PJG	Additional research re: best interests test (1.3); draft plan confirmation objection (1.9)	3.20	\$3,504.00	
B320	07/08/25	RKC	Prepare for expert depositions	0.60	\$585.00	
B320	07/08/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: expert depositions	0.20	\$195.00	
B320	07/08/25	RKC	Call with J. Haselberger re: K. Martens report	0.50	\$487.50	
B320	07/08/25	RR	Meet with J. Minicozzi re: follow up research for	0.40	\$190.00	

Email with P. Shields re: expert report

Search for background information on expert witness

1.50

0.10

\$630.00

\$71.50

confirmation brief

Adam Zimmerman

B320

B320

07/08/25

07/09/25

ZM

AMG

111,0100 1.0	1233031				11ugust 27, 202
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/09/25	AP	Draft brief objecting to confirmation	0.70	\$605.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Research case law to support expert discovery motion practice	3.50	\$3,027.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Prepare for and attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	1.00	\$865.00
B320	07/09/25	AP	Attend telephonic conference with Justice B. Albin, M. Kaplan, C. Restel, and M. Berliner re: discovery motion practice	0.50	\$432.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Research case law to support discovery motion practice	0.50	\$432.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Draft brief for expert discovery motion practice	2.30	\$1,989.50
B320	07/09/25	AP	Research case law re: constitutional issues in confirmation briefing	0.50	\$432.50
B320	07/09/25	BIW	Begin drafting Motion to Compel Document Production	1.80	\$2,088.00
B320	07/09/25	BIW	Review and revise Plan confirmation objection inserts	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	07/09/25	BTA	Review and revise confirmation brief re: Religious Freedom Restoration Act and cases	1.70	\$2,890.00
B320	07/09/25	BTA	Review of A. Patel's memo on relevance of canon law in bankruptcy proceeding and review of the Spokane and Portland bankruptcy matters	1.00	\$1,700.00
B320	07/09/25	BTA	Conference with A. Patel discussing K. Marten's Report on Canon Law and Reviewing RCBO's Articles of Incorporation and the bylaws of the Presbyteral Council and articles of incorporation of the Roman Catholic Welfare Corporation and Roman Catholic Cemetery Corp.	0.90	\$1,530.00
B320	07/09/25	BTA	Zoom meeting with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, M. Berliner, and A. Patel re: motion to compel	0.50	\$850.00
B320	07/09/25	CG	Perform and analyze research re: Canon lawyers	0.60	\$396.00
B320	07/09/25	CMR	Revise and send letter to Debtor re: Challenge to Confidentiality Designations (.2); Analyze expert reports in preparation for depositions (8.5); Analyze outstanding fact discovery issues (.8)	9.50	\$10,687.50
B320	07/09/25	СТН	Research and obtain sources cited in expert report of Kurt Martens	1.00	\$410.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/09/25	DC	Coordinate with Oakland Marriott re: contracts for guest rooms and war room for confirmation hearing	0.70	\$280.00
B320	07/09/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (0.5); draft comparison chart re: same (0.9); draft expert deposition outline (0.5)	1.90	\$1,491.50
B320	07/09/25	KEM	Draft confirmation objection	6.70	\$7,068.50
B320	07/09/25	LHS	Assist with deposition preparation (3.0); exchange emails with S. Woodall re: same (.2)	3.20	\$3,376.00
B320	07/09/25	MAK	Meet with S. Woodall re: deposition preparation (3.2); confer with litigation team re: motion to compel (.5)	3.70	\$4,199.50
B320	07/09/25	MRB	Meet with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, B. Albin, A. Patel re: motion to compel (0.5); draft motion to compel non-privileged documents (3.2)	3.70	\$3,200.50
B320	07/09/25	PJG	Draft confirmation objection (1.6); confer and correspond re: same with K. Moynihan (.2)	1.80	\$1,971.00
B320	07/09/25	RKC	Review analysis of two sets of Hilco valuations and R. Rosen valuations	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/09/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: documents relied on by C. Moore (0.3); review and revise analysis re: same (0.5); confer with Foley and Lowenstein teams re: expert deposition scheduling (0.5); confer with Stout re: K. McNally rebuttal report (0.3); confer with Foley re: supplemental expert materials (0.2); review and analyze list of J. Satter prior retentions (0.2); draft e-mail to counsel for Adventus re: missing documents (0.2); prepare for expert depositions (0.3)	2.50	\$2,437.50
B320	07/09/25	RR	Research and analyze case law to cross check section of confirmation brief; circulate research internally for review	3.10	\$1,472.50
B320	07/09/25	ZM	Search for references cited in Dr. Kurt Martens' expert report	0.20	\$84.00
B320	07/10/25	AP	Research case law to support expert discovery motion practice	3.90	\$3,373.50
B320	07/10/25	AP	Draft brief in support of motion in limine concerning confirmation hearing	2.00	\$1,730.00
B320	07/10/25	AP	Revise brief objecting to confirmation	0.40	\$346.00
B320	07/10/25	BIW	Review and revise portions of Plan Confirmation Objection	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	07/10/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: devise Plan confirmation objection strategy (2 @.4 each)	0.80	\$928.00

Invoice	No ·	123585
mvoice.	INO.:	123303

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/10/25	BTA	Further review and edits to First Amendment portion of confirmation brief	2.70	\$4,590.00
B320	07/10/25	CG	Perform and analyze research re: whether privilege extends to Canon lawyers	2.10	\$1,386.00
B320	07/10/25	CGS	Edits and revise charts re: Debtor supplemental production	2.10	\$1,648.50
B320	07/10/25	CMR	Prepare for depositions of Debtor expert witnesses (4.8); Analyze issues re: supplemental and rebuttal expert reports (.7); Call with BRG Team re: same (.6)	6.10	\$6,862.50
B320	07/10/25	СТН	Research expert witness John Satter	2.40	\$984.00
B320	07/10/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (1.6); draft expert deposition outlines (1.7)	3.30	\$2,590.50
B320	07/10/25	JDP	Call with M. Kaplan re: strategy for confirmation hearing	0.20	\$274.00
B320	07/10/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: confirmation strategy	0.30	\$411.00
B320	07/10/25	JJP	Prepare documents for production	0.40	\$172.00
B320	07/10/25	KEM	Review and edit confirmation objection	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	07/10/25	LHS	Call with R. Chahil re: expert deposition outline (.5); review additional comments re: expert report (.2)	0.70	\$738.50
B320	07/10/25	LHS	Virtually attend S. Woodall deposition	2.50	\$2,637.50
B320	07/10/25	MAK	Meet with S. Woodall re: deposition preparation (1.5); deposition of S. Woodall (2.8)	4.30	\$4,880.50
B320	07/10/25	MAK	Review draft expert rebuttal reports	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	07/10/25	MAK	Review and analyze brief section on application of First Amendment (1.2); confer with B. Weisenberg and J. Prol re: same (.4)	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	07/10/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents	4.00	\$3,460.00
B320	07/10/25	PJG	Review and edit plan confirmation objection	0.90	\$985.50
B320	07/10/25	PJG	Review revised draft plan confirmation objection sections from K. Moynihan	0.80	\$876.00

					8
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/10/25	PJG	Revise plan confirmation objection (1.9) and emails resame to K. Moynihan, J. Albin (.4)	2.30	\$2,518.50
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar re: preparation for D. Martins deposition	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Prepare and serve supplemental document production	0.30	\$292.50
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: expert report	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Prepare for expert depositions (0.6); confer with M. Kaplan re: UCC 30(b)[6] deposition (0.4); confer with C. Restel re: expert depositions (0.4)	1.40	\$1,365.00
B320	07/10/25	RKC	Review supplemental P. Shields expert report	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/10/25	RR	Research and analyze case law to cross check section of confirmation brief; circulate research internally for review	1.30	\$617.50
B320	07/10/25	ZM	Search for attorney licensing credentials in California for names appearing in privilege log	2.00	\$840.00
B320	07/11/25	AP	Draft brief in support of motion in limine concerning confirmation hearing	4.00	\$3,460.00
B320	07/11/25	AP	Research case law to support expert discovery motion practice	2.50	\$2,162.50
B320	07/11/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	07/11/25	BIW	Review and revise portions of Plan Confirmation Objection	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	07/11/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: Plan confirmation objection strategy	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/11/25	BTA	Review and make edits to brief in opposition to Reorganization Plan	1.10	\$1,870.00
B320	07/11/25	CMR	Revise Deposition Notice re: Claims Agent (.4); Review and revise Supplemental Expert Reports (2.5); Prepare for deposition of Debtor's experts (1.6); Review and revise Motion to Compel (2.5)	7.00	\$7,875.00
B320	07/11/25	СТН	Research and obtain sources cited in expert report of Kurt Martens	0.50	\$205.00
B320	07/11/25	JAM	Review and edit motion to compel brief	2.10	\$1,806.00
B320	07/11/25	JBJ	Review expert report (1.4); draft expert deposition outline (1.4)	2.80	\$2,198.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/11/25	JDP	Review and comment on reply expert reports	2.20	\$3,014.00
B320	07/11/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: settlement	0.20	\$274.00
B320	07/11/25	JDP	E-mails to/from A. Uetz re: settlement	0.30	\$411.00
B320	07/11/25	JDP	Analyze vote tally on Plan	0.30	\$411.00
B320	07/11/25	KEM	Research re: confirmation objection (2.5); revise confirmation objection (.8)	3.30	\$3,481.50
B320	07/11/25	MAK	Review and revise motion to compel re: production of privileged documents	0.80	\$908.00
B320	07/11/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents (5.0); analyze privilege log to prepare chart of missing information for same (1.2)	6.20	\$5,363.00
B320	07/11/25	PJG	Review revised confirmation objection brief re: unfair discrimination (.4); additional research re: same (.7); draft follow up email and questions re: unfair discrimination to K. Moynihan (.5)	1.60	\$1,752.00
B320	07/11/25	PJG	Review and edit first amendment piece of confirmation objection	0.60	\$657.00
B320	07/11/25	PJG	Review further revised plan objection draft from K. Moynihan and draft follow up email and additional questions and comments re: same to K. Moynihan	0.50	\$547.50
B320	07/11/25	PJG	Draft further edits and revisions to Plan confirmation objection	0.40	\$438.00
B320	07/11/25	RKC	Confer with P. Shields re: supplemental expert report	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/11/25	RKC	Review e-mail from Norton Rose re: documents missing from production	0.10	\$97.50
B320	07/11/25	ZM	Research re: whether individuals listed in privilege log are attorneys licensed to practice in the state of California or any other states	1.50	\$630.00
B320	07/12/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	2.30	\$2,668.00
B320	07/12/25	BIW	Review and revise Plan Confirmation Objection	0.70	\$812.00
B320	07/12/25	ВТА	Review and edit brief objecting to confirmation of the Reorganization Plan	2.30	\$3,910.00

Invoice No.: 1233851				August 29, 202		
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount	
B320	07/12/25	CMR	Prepare for depositions of Debtor's experts (.8); Confer re: rebuttal reports (.2)	1.00	\$1,125.00	
B320	07/12/25	JAR	Research re: objection to plan confirmation	1.70	\$1,122.00	
B320	07/12/25	KEM	Review emails from B. Albin and P. Gross re: confirmation objection	0.10	\$105.50	
B320	07/12/25	MAK	Review and revise K. Marten deposition outline	1.10	\$1,248.50	
B320	07/13/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	0.90	\$1,044.00	
B320	07/13/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	1.10	\$1,276.00	
B320	07/13/25	BTA	Review and edit brief opposing Reorganization Plan	0.60	\$1,020.00	
B320	07/13/25	CMR	Review and revise expert reports	2.10	\$2,362.50	
B320	07/13/25	JAR	Research re: objection to confirmation of plan	3.50	\$2,310.00	
B320	07/13/25	MAK	Review and edit motion to compel production of non- privileged documents (.7); prepare expert deposition preparation outlines and mock exams (4.2)	4.90	\$5,561.50	
B320	07/13/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents	3.10	\$2,681.50	
B320	07/13/25	PJG	Research re: good faith plan confirmation standard	0.10	\$109.50	
B320	07/14/25	AP	Revise brief in support of motion in limine	0.50	\$432.50	
B320	07/14/25	BIW	Continue drafting Motion to Compel the Production of Documents	0.80	\$928.00	
B320	07/14/25	BIW	Review draft P. Shields Rebuttal Report	0.70	\$812.00	
B320	07/14/25	BTA	Review of draft of brief in support of motion in limine of canon law expert	0.20	\$340.00	
B320	07/14/25	BTA	Discuss with P. Gross issues raised in brief in opposition to confirmation of the Plan	0.70	\$1,190.00	
B320	07/14/25	CMR	Analyze issues in preparation for deposition of Debtor's experts (1.3); Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (1.9); Call with Stout team re: same (.5); Prepare for expert depositions (1.4); Analyze outstanding issues re: fact discovery (.2)	5.30	\$5,962.50	

Invoice No.:	voice No.: 1235851				
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/14/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Motions in Limine	1.00	\$1,125.00
B320	07/14/25	JAM	Review and edit motion in limine brief re: expert (2.1); emails with A. Patel and B. Albin re: brief (.3)	2.40	\$2,064.00
B320	07/14/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (1.5); draft expert deposition outlines (2.0)	3.50	\$2,747.50
B320	07/14/25	KEM	Revise confirmation objection	0.50	\$527.50
B320	07/14/25	LHS	Work on expert deposition outline and review draft rebuttal report	2.10	\$2,215.50
B320	07/14/25	MAK	Conference call with K. McNally and team re: supplemental expert report	0.50	\$567.50
B320	07/14/25	MAK	Review and revise motion to compel re: purportedly privileged documents	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	07/14/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents	4.10	\$3,546.50
B320	07/14/25	PJG	Review revisions to draft plan confirmation objection from K. Moynihan (.2); draft additional edits and comments to draft objection and (.2) and follow up email to K. Moynihan re: same (.1)	0.50	\$547.50
B320	07/14/25	PJG	Call with J. Albin re: plan confirmation objection and questions re: certain issues/arguments raised in draft objection brief	0.70	\$766.50
B320	07/14/25	RKC	Review and analyze K. McNally draft rebuttal report	0.70	\$682.50
B320	07/14/25	RKC	Confer with expert K. McNally re: draft rebuttal report	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/14/25	RKC	Confer with Debtor's counsel re: expert deadlines (0.2); confer with Lowenstein team re: same (0.2); confer with experts re: same (0.3); review supplemental exhibits to supplemental report from expert P. Shields (0.2)	0.90	\$877.50
B320	07/15/25	BIW	Finalize Motion to Compel the Production of Documents and revise Motion to Seal, declaration in support and proposed order granting same	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	07/15/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol re: Debtor's request to adjourn Plan confirmation	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/15/25	BIW	Review revised Rebuttal Reports	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/15/25	BTA	Revise brief in opposition to the Reorganization Plan	1.40	\$2,380.00

					11agast 25, 202
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/15/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation (1.3); Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (1.7); Call with BRG Team re: same (.6)	3.60	\$4,050.00
B320	07/15/25	JBJ	Review expert reports (0.5); draft comparison chart re: same (1.5); draft deposition outlines (0.5); draft motion in limine (1.6)	4.10	\$3,218.50
B320	07/15/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: Debtor request to adjourn confirmation hearing; develop position; confer with B. Weisenberg re: same	0.60	\$822.00
B320	07/15/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: Debtor's request to adjourn Plan confirmation	0.40	\$548.00
B320	07/15/25	LHS	Work on expert deposition outline	2.70	\$2,848.50
B320	07/15/25	MAK	Telephone call with BRG re: expert report	0.50	\$567.50
B320	07/15/25	MAK	Prepare for deposition of C. Moore	2.90	\$3,291.50
B320	07/15/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel non-privileged documents (3.2); review and analyze privilege log to prepare same (2.0)	5.20	\$4,498.00
B320	07/15/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan re: case strategy and next steps	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/15/25	RKC	Review and analyze revised draft report from P. Shields	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/15/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: P. Shields expert report	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/15/25	RKC	Confer with L. Sklar re D. Martin deposition outline	0.40	\$390.00
B320	07/15/25	ZM	Search bar associations and Westlaw professional licensing for persons identified in privilege log	0.60	\$252.00
B320	07/16/25	BTA	Revise brief in opposition to the Confirmation Plan	1.40	\$2,380.00
B320	07/16/25	CMR	Confer re: scheduling expert depositions (.2); Prepare for Expert Depositions (2.2); Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (.8); Call with BRG Team re: same (.7); Analyze legal issues re: confirmation (.7); Review Debtor's Motion to adjourn confirmation hearing (.2); Analyze issues and prepare for hearing re: same (.5); Review and revise Motion re: Privilege Log (1.3)	6.60	\$7,425.00
B320	07/16/25	JBJ	Draft motion in limine	3.30	\$2,590.50
B320	07/16/25	LHS	Work on expert deposition outline	3.50	\$3,692.50

Invoice	No.:	123585
111 , 0100	1 10	12000.

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/16/25	MAK	Prepare for deposition of C. Moore	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	07/16/25	MAK	Prepare outlines for expert witness deposition preparation meetings	1.20	\$1,362.00
B320	07/16/25	MAK	Telephone call with BRG re: expert report	0.50	\$567.50
B320	07/16/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents (7.0); draft outline for C. Moore expert deposition (0.9)	7.90	\$6,833.50
B320	07/16/25	RKC	Review C. Moore report re: real property liquidation	0.20	\$195.00
B320	07/16/25	RKC	Draft proposed expert deposition schedule (0.7); confer with Debtor re: same (0.2); confer with R. Klomparens re: deposition (0.2); confer with Stout re: R. Rosen supplemental report (0.2); review Debtor's e-mail re: K. Martens materials (0.2); confer with C. Restel re: P. Shields report (0.4)	1.90	\$1,852.50
B320	07/16/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: P. Shields report	0.70	\$682.50
B320	07/17/25	BIW	Continue to develop plan confirmation trial strategy	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/17/25	BIW	Review email from M. Lee re: response to request for documents (.2); draft respond to same (.2)	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/17/25	BIW	Review revised Rebuttal Reports	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	07/17/25	BIW	Develop plan confirmation trial strategy	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/17/25	BTA	Revise confirmation brief	0.80	\$1,360.00
B320	07/17/25	CMR	Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (.6); Analyze issues re: potential adjournment of Confirmation Hearing (.9); Analyze issues re: Motion re: Privilege Log (.3); Prepare for deposition of claims agent (2.7)	4.50	\$5,062.50
B320	07/17/25	JDP	Review and edit confirmation brief section re: constitutional law arguments	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	07/17/25	MAK	Review deposition testimony and documents produced to prepare stipulations of fact and cross-examination outlines	5.90	\$6,696.50
B320	07/17/25	MAK	Prepare outlines for expert witness deposition preparation meetings	3.30	\$3,745.50

Invoice No.:	1235851				August 29, 202
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/17/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel non-privileged documents (4.0); draft outline for C. Moore expert deposition (1.3)	5.30	\$4,584.50
B320	07/17/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: expert deposition schedule (0.2); Confer with R. Klomparens re: expert deposition (0.2); confer with R. Rosen re: expert deposition (0.2)	0.60	\$585.00
B320	07/18/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: prepare for plan confirmation adjournment hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/18/25	BIW	Review and revise Confirmation Objection	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	07/18/25	BIW	Continue to review and revise Confirmation Objection	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	07/18/25	CG	Confer with C. Restel re: rebuttal expert report and review same	0.40	\$264.00
B320	07/18/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Motion re: Privilege Log (.5); Call with M. Kaplan and M. Berliner re: same (.5); Analyze Insurer Response to Motion to Adjourn Confirmation Hearing (.1); Review and revise Rebuttal Expert Reports (.2); Prepare for Deposition of Claims Agent (2.7); Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation (1.1); Analyze Debtor Expert Reports (.8)	5.90	\$6,637.50
B320	07/18/25	JAR	Research re: objection to chapter 11 plan	1.80	\$1,188.00
B320	07/18/25	JBJ	Draft motion in limine	0.90	\$706.50
B320	07/18/25	JDP	Develop strategy for moving case forward	0.60	\$822.00
B320	07/18/25	JJP	Review email correspondence from B. Weisenberg re: document searches; prepare searches and advise on results of same; provide assistance to E. Lawler re: document distribution	0.30	\$129.00
B320	07/18/25	LHS	Conduct research related to expert deposition outline	2.60	\$2,743.00
B320	07/18/25	MAK	Prepare outlines for expert witness deposition preparation meetings	1.40	\$1,589.00
B320	07/18/25	MAK	Review deposition testimony and documents produced to prepare stipulations of fact and cross-examination outlines	3.90	\$4,426.50
B320	07/18/25	MAK	Review and analyze BRG supplemental report	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	07/18/25	MRB	Draft motion to compel production of non-privileged documents	3.50	\$3,027.50

					ξ,
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/19/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: debrief on status of Plan	0.50	\$580.00
B320	07/19/25	JAR	Research re: objection to plan confirmation	0.70	\$462.00
B320	07/21/25	BIW	Confer with B. Albin re: debrief on prior week's hearing and next steps	0.60	\$696.00
B320	07/21/25	BIW	Review recently produced documents classified as "Confidential AEO"	0.80	\$928.00
B320	07/21/25	ВТА	Confer with B. Weisenberg on the current standing of the Reorganization Plan	0.60	\$1,020.00
B320	07/21/25	JDP	Develop strategy for moving case forward	0.90	\$1,233.00
B320	07/21/25	JJP	Prepare searches to identify documents requested by B. Weisenberg and review results (1.2); export document sets requested by B. Weisenberg re: Fr. Brandon claims (.5)	1.70	\$731.00
B320	07/22/25	BIW	Review Plan insurance assignment language used in other nonprofit sexual abuse bankruptcies	0.70	\$812.00
B320	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with BRG Team re: settlement analysis	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: Plan drafting issues	0.60	\$696.00
B320	07/22/25	BIW	Draft email to C. Gauvin re: recently produced documents classified as "Confidential AEO"	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/22/25	CG	Meeting with B. Weisenberg in connection with document review re: certain confidential documents labeled AEO	0.30	\$198.00
B320	07/22/25	JDP	Call with LS team to discuss strategy going forward to prepare for meet and confer with Debtor's counsel	0.70	\$959.00
B320	07/22/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: meet and confer with debtor on confirmation schedule	0.70	\$794.50
B320	07/23/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: debrief on adjournment of Plan confirmation	0.30	\$348.00
B320	07/23/25	BIW	Devise strategy re: steps needed to resolve disputed issues	0.60	\$696.00
B320	07/23/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: confirmation schedule (.2); Confer re: same (.2)	0.40	\$450.00
B320	07/23/25	JDP	Participate in meet and confer with Debtor's counsel re: path forward	0.80	\$1,096.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/23/25	JJP	Identify clawaback and production sets (.7); provide information requested ty R. Chahil (.3); prepare exports and transfer files (.6)	1.60	\$688.00
B320	07/23/25	KFC	Review and compare spreadsheet of production documents with deposition exhibits for completeness	3.80	\$1,520.00
B320	07/23/25	MAK	Meet and confer with debtor re: confirmation schedule	0.80	\$908.00
B320	07/23/25	RKC	Address clawback of over 200 documents from Debtor's counsel	0.70	\$682.50
B320	07/24/25	BIW	Draft email to BRG re: certain analyses needed	0.20	\$232.00
B320	07/24/25	BIW	Devise strategy re: steps needed to resolve disputed issues	0.60	\$696.00
B320	07/24/25	BIW	Revise proposed Adjournment Order (.1); draft email to Foley Insurance Team re: requested revision to Adjournment Order (.1)	0.20	\$232.00
B320	07/24/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: case resolution issues	0.40	\$464.00
B320	07/24/25	CG	Review confidential documents re: PEO	1.00	\$660.00
B320	07/24/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion re: Adjournment of Confirmation hearing (.2); Strategize re: confirmation issues that can proceed (.2); Call with J. Prol, M. Kaplan, and B. Weisenberg re: same (.5)	0.90	\$1,012.50
B320	07/24/25	JDP	Participate in strategy call with M. Kaplan, B. Weisenberg and C. Restel re: moving case forward pending rescheduling of confirmation trial	0.50	\$685.00
B320	07/24/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: meet and confer with debtor on confirmation schedule	0.50	\$567.50
B320	07/24/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: clawback and document productions	0.10	\$97.50
B320	07/24/25	ZM	Research re: expert report and testimony for R. Todd Neilson	1.00	\$420.00
B320	07/25/25	AS	Provide assistance to R. Chahil re: documents review	0.80	\$292.00
B320	07/25/25	CG	Review confidential documents re: PEO	0.90	\$594.00
B320	07/25/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: document productions	0.10	\$97.50
B320	07/26/25	CG	Review and analyze document production re: PEO	0.30	\$198.00

Invoice No.:	1235851

nvoice No.: 1	1233831				August 29, 202
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/26/25	CMR	Confer re: schedule for continued confirmation proceedings	1.00	\$1,125.00
B320	07/28/25	CG	Review and analyze document production re: PEO	2.30	\$1,518.00
B320	07/30/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG re: asset analysis	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	07/30/25	BTA	Review of briefs filed by and in opposition to Santa Rosa Parishes regarding RFRA, and then review our research	0.40	\$680.00
B320	07/30/25	CMR	Confer re: new production by Debtor	0.20	\$225.00
B320	07/31/25	BTA	Exchange of emails with A. Patel and J. Minicozzi on Santa Rosa RFRA pleadings	0.10	\$170.00
B320	07/31/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team re: documents produced by Debtor (.1); Confer with LS Team re: outstanding issues re: confirmation (.3); Review Committee letter re: mediation re: Confirmation (.1)	0.50	\$562.50
B320	07/31/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (1.2); prepare documents for sharing internally (0.5)	1.70	\$1,334.50
B320	07/31/25	MAK	Review correspondence on privilege and confidentiality issues (1.6); review e-mail from debtor re: meet and confer (.2); meet and confer with debtor (.8)	2.60	\$2,951.00
			Total B320 - Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	592.70	\$603,067.50
	ruptcy-Relate		tcy Court Litigation		
DTJU AUVEIS	<u>541 y 1100000111</u>	igo and Dankiup	wy Court Enigation		

B430	07/04/25	CMR	Review Debtor Answer to Complaint (.4); Review draft stipulation re: OPF Dismissal (.2)	0.60	\$675.00
B430	07/07/25	CMR	Review and revise draft Stipulation re: Dismissal of OPF (.4); Confer re: next steps in Adversary Proceeding (.1)	0.50	\$562.50
B430	07/08/25	CMR	Finalize (.1) and circulate (.1) revised stipulation re: dismissal of OPF from Adversary Proceeding	0.20	\$225.00
B430	07/09/25	CMR	Review revisions (.1) and confer (.1) re: proposed stipulation re: Dismissal of OPF from Adversary Proceeding	0.20	\$225.00

of 38

ilivoice No 1	1233031				August 29, 202
Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	07/21/25	BIW	Participate in call with J. Bair re: District Court Insurance Adv Status Report	0.30	\$348.00
B430	07/21/25	CMR	Strategize re: Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding	0.60	\$675.00
B430	07/22/25	BIW	Confer with C. Frankel re: Motion to Reconsider SubCon Judgment	0.30	\$348.00
B430	07/22/25	BIW	Comment on proposed order granting Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceeding	0.10	\$116.00
B430	07/22/25	BIW	Draft email re: relevant Rule governing Motion to Reconsider	0.30	\$348.00
B430	07/22/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: status of Insurance Adversary Proceeding (.9); Analyze Court Opinion Dismissing Adversary Proceeding (.8); Analyze issues re: Motion to Reconsider Same (2.9); Review and revise Order re: Dismissal of Adversary Proceeding (.3) and confer re: same (.1)	5.00	\$5,625.00
B430	07/23/25	BIW	Review Judge's decision re: SubCon and highlight issues for reconsideration	0.80	\$928.00
B430	07/23/25	BIW	Confer with C. Frankel re: Motion to Reconsider SubCon Judgment	0.40	\$464.00
B430	07/23/25	CF	Draft motion for reconsideration	4.40	\$2,904.00
B430	07/23/25	CF	Draft motion for reconsideration	0.90	\$594.00
B430	07/23/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding (.2); Call with BRG re: same (.7); Analyze legal issues re: Motion for Reconsideration of Dismissal of Complaint (.5); Review and revise proposed dismissal order (.2)	1.60	\$1,800.00
B430	07/23/25	JBJ	Legal research re: rules of bankruptcy procedure	2.60	\$2,041.00
B430	07/24/25	CF	Research re: motion for reconsideration	0.40	\$264.00
B430	07/24/25	CF	Draft motion for reconsideration	0.90	\$594.00
B430	07/24/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding (1.4); Strategize re: same (.6); Analyze legal issues re: Motion for Reconsideration of Dismissal of Adversary Proceeding (.7)	2.70	\$3,037.50
B430	07/24/25	MAK	Conference call with BRG re: forensic accounting	0.50	\$567.50

B430

B430

07/29/25

07/29/25

JDP

MAK

Corley

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	07/25/25	CMR	Strategize re: schedule and strategy for Adversary Proceeding (.2); Confer with LS Team re: same (.2); Confer with experts re: analysis for Adversary Proceeding (.4)	0.80	\$900.00
B430	07/25/25	JDP	Call with insurance counsel re: insurance adversary and insurance strategy	0.50	\$685.00
B430	07/25/25	JDP	Review and comment on proposed schedule for restricted assets adversary proceeding	0.20	\$274.00
B430	07/26/25	CMR	Confer with experts re: analysis needed re: Adversary Proceeding	0.30	\$337.50
B430	07/27/25	BIW	Review research on property ownership in bankruptcy	0.40	\$464.00
B430	07/27/25	CF	Email communications re: deadline to file motion for reconsideration and calendaring re: same	0.20	\$132.00
B430	07/28/25	BIW	Review research on standard for motion to reconsider	0.60	\$696.00
B430	07/28/25	CF	Review transcript of court ruling re: motion to dismiss and draft motion for reconsideration	6.90	\$4,554.00
B430	07/28/25	CMR	Analyze issues relating to Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding (.3); Call with BRG re: Adversary Proceeding (.5); Review and revise discovery requests re: same (.4)	1.20	\$1,350.00
B430	07/28/25	JDP	Review court decision dismissing BOG complaint and filed complaint and analyze filing motion for reconsideration or appeal	1.50	\$2,055.00
B430	07/28/25	PJG	Call with B. Weisenberg re: Court's decision in RCWC/Schools adversary decision granting motion to dismiss with focus on count related to section 541/property of the estate (.2); review bench opinion and focus on 541 and other related grounds for reconsideration (.6); research re: section 541/542 standards and reconsideration grounds (0.9); draft email memorandum re: same to B. Weisenberg, J. Prol (.6)	2.30	\$2,518.50
B430	07/29/25	BIW	Review additional research on standard for motion to reconsider	0.20	\$232.00
B430	07/29/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Restrict Asset Adversary Proceeding (2.7); Confer with experts re: same (.2)	2.90	\$3,262.50

Review and comment on draft status report to Judge

Review status reports on insurance adversary proceeding

0.20

0.60

\$274.00

\$681.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	07/29/25	MAK	Review and analyze CA case law on restricted asset analysis	2.10	\$2,383.50
B430	07/30/25	BIW	Draft email re: research on standard for motion to reconsider	0.20	\$232.00
B430	07/30/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Restricted Asset Adversary Proceeding (.3); Confer with experts and LS Team (multiple) re: same (.3); Confer with LS Team re: Motion for Reconsideration of Order Dismissing Adversary Proceeding (.2)	0.80	\$900.00
B430	07/30/25	JDP	Review and comment on proposed revisions to joint status statement	0.30	\$411.00
B430	07/31/25	JDP	Meet and confer with Foley re: restricted assets adversary and plan confirmation issues	0.70	\$959.00
B430	07/31/25	JDP	Follow-up call with M. Kaplan following meet and confer with Foley	0.30	\$411.00
			Total B430 - Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy  Court Litigation	46.50	\$46,053.50
B430A Cour	rt Hearings				
B430A	07/10/25	DC	Prepare E-Binder for 7/16/25 Hearing	0.50	\$200.00
B430A	07/14/25	DC	Update E-binder for 7/16/25 Hearing	0.20	\$80.00
B430A	07/16/25	BIW	Prepare for (.5), and attend, Renewed Lift Stay, Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order and CCCEB Objection hearing (3.8)	4.30	\$4,988.00
B430A	07/16/25	BIW	Prepare for hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion, Motion to Enforce Interim Compensation Order, CCCEB Objection and Debtor's Plan adjournment motion	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430A	07/16/25	BIW	Prepare for hearing on lift stay, CCCEB payment and Interim Compensation Order enforcement	1.60	\$1,856.00
B430A	07/16/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: prepare for day's hearing, including anticipated adjournment request	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430A	07/16/25	JDP	Prepare for lift stay, CCCEP and fee objection hearings	3.50	\$4,795.00
B430A	07/16/25	JDP	Attend lift stay, CCCEB and fee objection hearings	3.80	\$5,206.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430A	07/16/25	MAK	Prepare for omnibus hearing on fee disputes and motion to adjourn	1.40	\$1,589.00
B430A	07/16/25	MAK	Participate in omnibus hearing	3.80	\$4,313.00
B430A	07/16/25	RKC	Confer with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: preparation for hearing	0.20	\$195.00
B430A	07/16/25	RKC	Prepare materials for hearing re: confirmation-related discovery	0.90	\$877.50
B430A	07/18/25	BIW	Prepare for (.6) and attend (1.1) hearing on Debtor's adjournment motion	1.70	\$1,972.00
B430A	07/18/25	JDP	Develop strategy for hearing on Debtor's motion to adjourn confirmation trial (.8); calls with B. Weisenberg and M. Kaplan re: same (.6)	1.40	\$1,918.00
B430A	07/18/25	JDP	Call with M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg re: hearing on motion to adjourn confirmation trial and strategy moving forward	0.50	\$685.00
B430A	07/18/25	MAK	Prepare for (.6) and participate in (1.1) Court hearing on debtor's motion to adjourn confirmation trial	1.70	\$1,929.50
B430A	07/22/25	CF	Call with B. Weisenberg re: motion for reconsideration (.3) and review related factual information and case law (3.2)	3.50	\$2,310.00
B430A	07/25/25	CF	Draft motion for reconsideration (5.3) and research ressame (2)	7.30	\$4,818.00
			Total B430A - Court Hearings	38.10	\$39,820.00
B460 Other	- Insurance Ma	atters	<del>-</del>		
B460	07/01/25	JDP	Review insurance pass through strategy and alternative tdp's; confer with B. Weisenberg re: same	2.20	\$3,014.00
B460	07/07/25	JDP	Call with Burns Bair re: insurance strategy	0.80	\$1,096.00
B460	07/14/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Insurance Premium Financing Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B460	07/21/25	BIW	Review transcripts re: Committee's motion for standing to assert claims against Insurers and Abeyance Motion filed in District Court	0.60	\$696.00
B460	07/21/25	JDP	Review transcripts of motion for standing and opposing stay of insurance dec relief action; develop strategy for renewing motions	0.40	\$548.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460	07/22/25	BIW	Review transcript re: July 18th Plan Adjournment hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B460	07/25/25	BIW	Confer with BurnsBair re: status of insurance adversary and related issues	1.20	\$1,392.00
B460	07/25/25	MAK	Telephone call with special insurance counsel	0.50	\$567.50
B460	07/29/25	BIW	Review and revise Joint Status Conference Statement	0.40	\$464.00
			Total B460 - Other - Insurance Matters	6.80	\$8,589.50

of 38

# Timekeeper Summary (by Task):

Task	Task Description	Hours	Fees
B110	Case Administration	3.10	\$1,240.00
B140	Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	19.20	\$23,700.00
B150	Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	30.80	\$37,299.00
B155	Mediation	10.40	\$13,842.00
B160	Fee/Employment Applications	1.60	\$1,610.00
B170	Fee/Employment Objections	26.10	\$26,502.00
B175	Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	0.20	\$274.00
B210	Business Operations	14.70	\$13,014.00
B310	Claims Administration and Objections	1.80	\$2,193.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	592.70	\$603,067.50
B430	Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Court Litigation	46.50	\$46,053.50
B430A	Court Hearings	38.10	\$39,820.00
B460	Other - Insurance Matters	6.80	\$8,589.50
	Total	792.00	\$817,204.50

of 38

The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland Official Committee Invoice No.: 1235851

Page 39 August 29, 2025

#### **EXHIBIT B**

# Actual and necessary disbursements incurred by Lowenstein Sandler LLP

### II. Summary of Disbursement Charges

	\$572.40
Case preparation expenses	\$1,012.31
Messenger and delivery charges	\$202.63
Evidence preparation services	\$2,934.45
Computerized legal research	\$9,369.50
Travel	\$9,113.56
Meals	\$334.54
Total Disbursements	\$23,539.39

The above charges are based upon time and expense records available on or about the date of the attached letter. Such records are believed in good faith to be accurate and substantially up to date, but there may be fees and expenses that have not been processed as of such date which Lowenstein Sandler LLP may submit in the future. Lowenstein Sandler LLP reserves the right to amend this monthly statement at a later date.

ot 8

# **DISBURSEMENT DETAIL:**

<u><b>Date</b></u> 07/24/25	Description eDiscovery Review VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-07-24	<b>Amount</b> \$572.40
06/18/25	106.00 GB eDiscovery Review Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/18/25; Misc - Other;	\$7.50
06/21/25	Purchase complaint in Thatcher v. Doe 1 per R. Chahil Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$201.00
06/21/25	Garner v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, ct. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; For Rasmeet Chahil	\$47.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; For Rasmeet Chahil	\$29.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; John Doe 38 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$6.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; R. Roe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$47.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Dietrich v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$18.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Martell v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$23.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Beaudry v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$24.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 51 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$12.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; John Doe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$15.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; For Rasmeet Chahil	\$17.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Jane Roe I v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$21.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Jane Doe I v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$5.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 5 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$15.50
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Does 9 & 10 v. Roman Catholic Lanza, Joseph Bishop of	\$18.00
06/21/25	Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Susan Dalis v. The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, A	\$15.00

	Corporation Sole; John Doe 2; John Doe 3; and DOES 4 through 100, inclusive	
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; Doe 8 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	\$17.00
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$11.00
06/21/25	Doe 31 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$13.00
06/21/25	Doe 42 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$18.00
06/21/25	Doe 21 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$48.00
06/21/25	F. Roe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$17.50
06/21/25	Doe 6 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$13.50
06/21/25	John Doe 28 v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$40.00
06/21/25	Dutra v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$19.00
06/21/25	Thomas E. Lumsden vs. The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland and Does 1 through 30 Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#:	\$19.00
	7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; John A. Doe & John B. Doe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al.	·
06/21/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$22.00
06/21/25	DeDiemar v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other; John Doe 1, 2 & 3 vs. The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland,	\$20.50
06/21/25	Et al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$13.00
06/21/25	Minor v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/21/25; Misc - Other;	\$53.00
06/23/25	Jane Doe 1, et al. v. The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/23/25; Misc - Other;	\$11.40
06/23/25	Purchase Notice of case rescheduling per C. Stewart Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/23/25; Misc - Other; Declaration of John S. Pierce in opposition to motion for	\$40.00
06/26/25	attorney's fees and costs Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/26/25; Misc - Other; John PJ Doe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. per R. Chahil	\$27.80

06/26/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/26/25; Misc - Other;	\$27.00
	John PT Doe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. per R.	
06/27/25	Chahil Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other; Search by name credits in Alameda County Court for Ron. L. v.	\$4.00
	Oakland case search per R. Chahil	
06/27/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other; S. Roe v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. per R.	\$21.00
06/27/25	Chahil Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#:	\$9.50
00/27/23	7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other; Does 9 & 10 v. Roman Catholic Lanza, Joseph Bishop of	\$9.50
06/27/25	Oakland, et. al. per R. Chahil Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#:	\$8.50
00/27/23	7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other; Beaudry v. Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland, et. al. per R. Chahil	φο.50
06/27/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#:	\$10.50
00/27/25	7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 06/27/25; Misc - Other;	Ψ10.20
	John Doe 1, 2 & 3 vs. The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland,	
07/01/25	Et al. per R. Chahil Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#:	\$0.11
0,,01,20	7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 07/01/25; Misc - Other;	φοιττ
05/01/05	Fee for processing documents - for Rasmeet Chahil	<b>#2.5</b> 0
07/01/25	Reference Materials VENDOR: City National Bank INVOICE#: 7543627807290206 DATE: 7/29/2025; 07/01/25; Misc - Other;	\$2.50
	For Rasmeet Chahil	
07/02/25	Federal Express VENDOR: Federal Express INVOICE#:	\$61.28
	891510184 DATE: 7/7/2025   Tracking #: 390605590522 Date: 20250702 To: RASMEET K CHACHIL, INFORMATION NOT	
	SUPPLIED, 1 DALIA COURT, EAST HANOVER, NJ 07936	
	US; From: Kelly F Charles, Lowenstein Sandler, One	
07/07/25	Lowenstein Drive, ROSELAND, NJ 07068 US Federal Express VENDOR: Federal Express INVOICE#:	\$141.35
01/01/23	892187349 DATE: 7/14/2025   Tracking #: 390650513766 Date:	\$141.33
	20250707 To: Jessica Mendoza, Keller Benvenutti Kim LLP,	
	101 Montgomery Street, Suite 1, SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94104	
	US; From: Lindsay H Sklar, Lowenstein Sandler, 1251 Avenue of the Americas, NEW YORK CITY, NY 10020 US	
07/10/25	Evidence Preparation Services VENDOR: Clear Discovery LLC	\$2,934.45
	INVOICE#: 2601 DATE: 7/10/2025 RCBO - Deposition	
07/15/25	Preparation Fee Meals (out of town travel) Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#:	\$45.57
07/13/23	7574842307250202 DATE: 07/15/25; Hotel dinner while	Ψ13.37
	attending hearing on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay Motion in	
07/16/25	Oakland Meals (out of town travel) Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#:	\$21.93
07/10/23	7574842307250202 DATE: 07/16/25; Breakfast while attending	Ψ21.93
07/16/25	hearing on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay Motion in Oakland Meals (out of town travel) Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#:	\$233.33
010.20	7574842307250202 DATE: 07/16/25; Dinner with Gabrielle	ψ <b>2</b> 33.33
	Albert, Jeffrey Prol, Brent Weisenberg while attending hearing	
07/16/25	on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay Motion in Oakland Meals (out of town travel) Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#:	\$16.54
07/10/23	7562851407210205 DATE: 07/16/25; Breakfast before	ψ10.54

# attendance at Hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion

07/17/25	Meals (out of town travel) Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7574842307250202 DATE: 07/17/25; Breakfast while attending	\$17.17
07/07/25	hearing on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay Motion in Oakland Travel - Accommodations Sklar, Lindsay H. INVOICE#: 7599060708050206 DATE: 07/07/25; Hotel - Lodging in San Francisco for deposition	\$542.02
07/11/25	Travel - Accommodations Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7539262007140205 DATE: 07/11/25; Hotel for depositions in San Francisco - 5 nights	\$2,031.11
07/15/25	Travel - Accommodations Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7562851407210205 DATE: 07/15/25; Hotel stay for attendance at Hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion	\$430.87
07/17/25	Travel - Accommodations Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7574842307250202 DATE: 07/17/25; Hotel while attending hearing on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay Motion in Oakland	\$668.91
07/06/25	Travel - Airfare Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7535001407040205 DATE: 07/06/25; Airfare; FROM: New York, NY - Kennedy (JFK); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO); to prepare corporate designee, S. Woodall and deposition of the same - coach class	\$1,667.00
07/07/25	Travel - Airfare Sklar, Lindsay H. INVOICE#: 7599060708050206 DATE: 8/5/2025; 07/07/25; Airfare; FROM: Newark, NJ (EWR); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO); flight to SFO to attend deposition	\$334.30
07/15/25	Travel - Airfare Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7574842307250202 DATE: 07/15/25; Wi-Fi on flight to attend hearing on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay Motion in Oakland	\$8.00
07/15/25	Travel - Airfare Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7562851407210205 DATE: 07/15/25; Wi-Fi during flight to San Francisco for attendance at Hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion	\$8.00
07/15/25	Travel - Airfare Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7562851407210205 DATE: 07/15/25; Airfare; FROM: Newark, NJ (EWR); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO); for attendance at Hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion	\$784.47
07/17/25	Travel - Airfare Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7574842307250202 DATE: 07/17/25; Wi-Fi on flight while attending hearing on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay Motion in Oakland	\$8.00
07/22/25	Travel - Airfare Chahil, Rasmeet K. INVOICE#: 7568835907220202 DATE: 07/22/25; - Flight to San Francisco for Depositions	\$783.42
07/06/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7535001407040205 DATE: 07/06/25; Parking while traveling to and from San Francisco, California to prepare corporate designee, S. Woodall and deposition of the same	\$300.00
07/06/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7535001407040205 DATE: 07/06/25; Mileage; FROM: Yardley, PA; TO: JFK International Airport; Travel to and from San Francisco, California to prepare corporate designee, S. Woodall and deposition of the same	\$123.45
07/06/25 O	ut of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7535001407040205 DATE: 07/06/25; Tolls while traveling to and from San Francisco, California to prepare corporate designee, S. Woodall and deposition of the same	\$28.05

07/06/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7539262007140205 DATE: 07/06/25; Taxi/Car Service; FROM: San Francisco, California (Airport); TO: Suter Street, San Francisco, California (Hotel) while preparing for corporate designee, S. Woodall and deposition of	\$124.09
	the same	
07/07/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Sklar, Lindsay H. INVOICE#: 7599060708050206 DATE: 07/07/25; Taxi/Car Service; FROM: airport; TO: hotel; uber from airport to hotel	\$47.98
07/08/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7539262007140205 DATE: 07/08/25; Taxi/Car Service; FROM: Suter Street, San Francisco, CA (Hotel); TO: 670 4th Street, San Francisco, CA; while traveling to prepare corporate designee, S. Woodall and deposition of the same	\$71.89
07/08/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7539262007140205 DATE: 07/08/25; Taxi/Car Service; FROM: 701 3rd Street, San Francisco, CA; TO: Suter Street, San Francisco, California (Hotel); while traveling to prepare corporate designee, S. Woodall and deposition of the same	\$48.49
07/10/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7539262007140205 DATE: 07/10/25; Taxi/Car Service; FROM: Suter Street, San Francisco, CA (Hotel); TO: San Francisco, California (Airport); while traveling to prepare corporate designee, S. Woodall and deposition of the same	\$125.31
07/10/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Sklar, Lindsay H. INVOICE#: 7599060708050206 DATE: 07/10/25; Taxi/Car Service; FROM: hotel; TO: airport; uber from hotel to	\$53.03
07/11/25	airport Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7539262007140205 DATE: 07/11/25; Toll; Travel to prepare corporate designee, S. Woodall and	\$15.49
07/15/25	deposition of the same Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7574842307250202 DATE: 07/15/25; Uber from SF International Airport to SF Marriott Union Square while attending hearing on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay	\$80.32
07/16/25	Motion in Oakland Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7574842307250202 DATE: 7/16/25; Uber to courthouse while attending hearing on Committee's	\$49.94
07/17/25	Renewed Lift Stay Motion in Oakland Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7574842307250202 DATE: 07/17/25; Taxi to airport while attending hearing on Committee's Renewed	\$60.09
07/07/25	Lift Stay Motion in Oakland  Local Travel Sklar, Lindsay H. INVOICE#: 7599060708050206  DATE: 07/07/25; Service; FROM: airport; TO: home; uber from airport home	\$65.39
07/10/25	Local Travel Sklar, Lindsay H. INVOICE#: 7599060708050206 DATE: 07/10/25; Sevice; FROM: home; TO: airport; uber from home to airport	\$133.35
07/15/25	Local Travel Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7562851407210205 DATE: 07/15/25; Uber from SFO to Oakland Marriott for attendance at Hearing on Renewed Lift	\$139.85

# Stay Motion

07/15/25	Local Travel Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7562851407210205 DATE: 07/15/25; Uber from Home to EWR	\$75.43
07/16/25	for attendance at Hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion Local Travel Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7562851407210205 DATE: 07/16/25; Uber from San Francisco to SFO Airport after attendance at Hearing on Renewed Lift Stay Motion	\$66.11
07/17/25	Local Travel Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7562851407210205 DATE: 07/17/25; Uber from EWR to Home	\$71.96
07/17/25	DATE: 07/17/25; Mileage to and from Newark Airport to attend	\$42.24
07/17/25	hearing on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay Motion in Oakland Local Travel Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7574842307250202 DATE: 07/17/25; Parking at airport while attending hearing on Committee's Renewed Lift Stay Motion in Oakland (was not provided a receipt)	\$125.00
07/02/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: MICHAUD, ZORAIDA; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-1; ;	\$103.45
07/09/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: BERLINER,MIKAYLA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 5 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$181.52
07/10/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: BERLINER,MIKAYLA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 12 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$732.04
07/09/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: GAUVIN,CAROLYN / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 10 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$135.54
07/10/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: GAUVIN,CAROLYN / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 14 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$187.49
07/10/25		\$311.09
07/10/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: MICHAUD,ZORAIDA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 6 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$326.02
07/09/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: MOYNIHAN,KELLY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 7 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$185.35
07/15/25		\$11.94
07/16/25		\$193.46
07/14/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: BERLINER,MIKAYLA / Duration of Search: 00:00 /	\$181.52
07/17/25	BERLINER,MIKAYLA / Duration of Search: 00:00 /	\$181.52
07/18/25	Transaction: 3 / Docs/Lines: 0 Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: BERLINER,MIKAYLA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 5 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$181.52

07/11/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: MICHAUD,ZORAIDA / Duration of Search: 00:00 /	\$54.34
07/14/25	Transaction: 1 / Docs/Lines: 0 Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: MICHAUD,ZORAIDA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 2 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$108.67
07/15/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: MICHAUD,ZORAIDA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 3 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$436.48
07/11/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 16 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$373.14
07/12/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 7 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$741.40
07/11/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: MOYNIHAN,KELLY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 34 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$714.57
07/12/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: RAUCHBERG,JAKE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 23 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$982.23
07/13/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: RAUCHBERG,JAKE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 9 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$185.35
07/12/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: FRANKEL, CHELSEA; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-10; DOC ACCESS-2; DOC ACCESS-4; ;	\$1,454.54
07/12/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: RAUCHBERG, JAKE; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-2;	\$306.16
07/13/25	DOC ACCESS-1;; Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: RAUCHBERG, JAKE; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-7;	\$724.13
07/19/25	; Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: RAUCHBERG, JAKE; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-3;	\$310.35
07/22/25	; Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: BAGGER,JENNIFER / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction:	\$29.85
07/23/25	9 / Docs/Lines: 0 Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: BAGGER,JENNIFER / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 23 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$35.83
	Total Disbursements	\$23,539.39
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	