1	LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP JEFFREY D. PROL (admitted pro hac vice)	
2	jprol@lowenstein.com	
	MICHAEL KAPLAN (admitted pro hac vice) mkaplan@lowenstein.com	
3	BRENT WEISENBERG (admitted pro hac vic bweisenberg@lowenstein.com	e)
4	One Lowenstein Drive Roseland, New Jersey 07068	
5	Telephone: (973) 597-2500	
6	Facsimile: (973) 597-2400	
7	KELLER BENVENUTTI KIM LLP TOBIAS S. KELLER (Cal. Bar No. 151445)	
8	<u>tkeller@kbkllp.com</u> JANE KIM (Cal. Bar No. 298192)	
9	jkim@kbkllp.com GABRIELLE L. ALBERT (Cal. Bar No. 1908)	95)
10	galbert@kbkllp.com 101 Montgomery Street, Suite 1950	
11	San Francisco, California 94104	
12	Telephone: (415) 496-6723 Facsimile: (650) 636-9251	
	Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecure	d Creditors
13	UNITED STATES B	ANKRUPTCY COURT
14		RICT OF CALIFORNIA D DIVISION
15		1
16	In re:	Case No. 23-40523 WJL
17	THE ROMAN CATHOLIC BISHOP OF	Chapter 11
18	OAKLAND, a California corporation sole,	SUMMARY SHEET TO SIXTH INTERIM
19	Debtor.	FEE APPLICATION LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP AS COUNSEL TO THE
20		OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR
21		ALLOWANCE AND PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND
22		REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1,
23		2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING
		APRIL 30, 2025
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		11 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

Entered: 06/. 20

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086 Filed: 06/16/25 16

SUMMARY COVER SHEET TO SIXTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION

Name of Applicant	Lowenstein Sandler LLP
Name of client	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Time period covered by application	01/01/25 to 04/30/25
Total compensation sought this period	\$2,534,921.00
Total expenses sought this period	\$56,907.33
Petition Date	May 8, 2023
Retention date	July 8, 2023, effective as of May 30, 2023
Date of order approving employment	July 8, 2023
Total compensation approved by interim order to date	\$5,717,336.41
Total expenses approved by interim order to date	\$194,909.20
Total allowed compensation paid to date	\$5,717,336.41
Total allowed expenses paid to date	\$194,909.20
Blended rate in this application for all attorneys	\$1,052.88
Blended rate in this application for all timekeepers	\$1,027.12
Compensation sought in this application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$1,386,749.60
Expenses sought in this application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$44,506.88
Number of professionals (attorneys) included in this application	20
If applicable, number of professionals in this application not included in staffing plan approved by client	
If applicable, difference between fees budgeted and compensation sought for this application period	The fees sought in the Application exceet the fees budgeted for the time period covere because of the Debtor's decision prosecute its Plan of Reorganization over the objection of the Committee. At the time the budget was made, the Debtor's Disclosu Statement had not yet been approved and remained uncertain whether it would be Accordingly, the budget did not anticipate contested plan confirmation process. The commencement of that adversarial process had a meaningful and material impact of the cost of the case. This fact is evidence by, among other things, the quantum of feincurred after the Disclosure Statement we approved on April 4, 2025, whe Lowenstein's fees equate to 31% of the total amount requested.
Number of professionals (attorneys) billing fewer than 15 hours to the case during this period	5
Are any rates higher than those approved or disclosed at retention? If yes, calculate the amount of compensation attributable to any rate increase	No.

SUMMARY OF MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS

Date Filed Period		Requested	-		Paid	Holdback	
	Covered	Fees	Expenses		Expenses	Fees	
						Requested	
02/28/2025	01/01/2025	\$601,877.50	\$20,567.65	\$502,069.65	\$20,567.65	\$120,375.50	
[Dkt. No.	_						
1789]	01/31/2025						
03/31/2025	02/01/2025	\$704,142.50	\$7,947.84	\$571,261.84	\$7,947.84	\$140,828.50	
Dkt. No.	_						
1858]	02/28/2025						
04/30/2025	03/01/2025	\$427,417.00	\$15,991.39	\$392,117.99	\$15,991.39	\$85,483.40	
Dkt. No.	_						
1940]	03/31/2025						
05/30/2025	04/01/2025	\$801,484.00	\$12,400.45	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$160,296.80*	
Dkt. No.	_	·	-			•	
2019]	04/30/2025						
	01/01/2025	\$2,534,921.00	\$56,907.33	\$1,420,942.60	\$44,506.88	\$506,984.20	
Total	_					•	
	04/30/2025						

*As of the date of this filing, no payments have been made on account of Lowenstein Sandler's Twenty-Third Monthly Fee Statement (the "Twenty-Third Monthly Fee Statement") [Docket No. 2019].

Summary of Any Objections to Monthly Fee Statements: None.

Case: 23-40523

Doc# 2086 Filed: 06/16/25

2ntered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 3 of

1	I OWENGERN CANDLED I I D					
- 11	LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP JEFFREY D. PROL (admitted pro hac vice)				
$_{2}\parallel$	jprol@lowenstein.com MICHAEL KAPLAN (admitted pro hac vio	,				
3	mkaplan@lowenstein.com BRENT WEISENBERG (admitted pro hac					
$_{4}\parallel$	bweisenberg@lowenstein.com One Lowenstein Drive	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,				
5	Roseland, New Jersey 07068					
$\begin{bmatrix} 5 \\ 6 \end{bmatrix}$	Telephone: (973) 597-2500 Facsimile: (973) 597-2400					
7	KELLER BENVENUTTI KIM LLP TOBIAS S. KELLER (Cal. Bar No. 151445	5)				
8	<u>tkeller@kbkllp.com</u> JANE KIM (Cal. Bar No. 298192)					
9	jkim@kbkllp.com GABRIELLE L. ALBERT (Cal. Bar No. 19	90895)				
10	galbert@kbkllp.com 101 Montgomery Street, Suite 1950					
11	San Francisco, California 94104 Telephone: (415) 496-6723					
12	Facsimile: (650) 636-9251					
13	Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsec	ured Creditors				
14	UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA					
15		ND DIVISION				
16	In re:	Case No. 23-40523 WJL				
17	THE ROMAN CATHOLIC BISHOP OF	Chapter 11				
18	OAKLAND, a California corporation sole,	SIXTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION				
19	Debtor.	LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL				
20		COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR ALLOWANCE AND				
21		PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR				
22		THE PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH AND INCLUDING APRIL 30,				
23		2025				
- 11						
24						
24 25						
25						

Lowenstein Sandler LLP ("Lowenstein"), counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee") of the Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland (the "Debtor") in the above captioned chapter 11 case (the "Chapter 11 Case") files this Sixth Interim Fee Application (this "Application"), under sections 330 and 331 of chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), the United States Trustee Appendix B Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases, effective November 1, 2013, the Guidelines for Compensation and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals and Trustees for the Northern District of California, dated February 19, 2014 (the "UST Guidelines"), and the Order Authorizing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. No. 170], for interim approval and allowance of (i) compensation for professional services rendered to the Committee from January 1, 2025 through April 30, 2025 (the "Compensation Period") and (ii) reimbursement of expenses incurred in connection with such services, and, in support, represents as follows:

16

15

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

13

14

17

18 19

20

21

22

23

Exhibit B:

24

25

26

27

28

I.

THE UST GUIDELINES

1. The Office of the United States Trustee (the "UST") established the UST Guidelines. In turn, the UST promulgated forms to aid in compliance with the UST Guidelines. Charts and tables based on such forms, and certain other exhibits, are attached and filled out with data to the extent relevant to this Chapter 11 Case:

Exhibit A: Customary and Comparable Compensation Disclosures with Fee

Summary of Timekeepers in this Application;

Exhibit C: Budget and Staffing Plan;

Exhibit D: Summary of Compensation by Project Category;

Exhibit E: Summary of Expense Reimbursement Requested by Category;

Exhibit F: Summary Cover Sheet of Fee Application;

Exhibit G: Declaration of Counsel: and

Filed: 06/16/25 Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 5 of

1	
2	
3	
4	
5	1
6	a
7	r
8	
9	a
10	
11	S
12	a
13	i
14	
15	t
16 17	d
18	s
19	i
20	
21	
22	
23	a

Exhibit H: Detailed time records for the Compensation Period.

II.

PRELIMINARY STATEMENT

- 2. Throughout the Compensation Period, Lowenstein's team of bankruptcy and litigation attorneys continued their work to protect and enforce the rights of survivors of sexual abuse ("<u>Survivors</u>"). Lowenstein's services to the Committee during the Compensation Period required it to address many issues of importance to its client and its constituency, including:
- 3. <u>First</u>, Lowenstein spent time preparing for and attending two mediation sessions and numerous court hearings.
- 4. <u>Second</u>, Lowenstein spent time drafting objections to the Debtor's Disclosure Statement (the "<u>Disclosure Statement</u>") and attending hearings on same. After the Committee agreed to withdraw its remaining objections to the Disclosure Statement, Lowenstein attorneys mmediately began preparing for a contested plan confirmation hearing.
- 5. <u>Third</u>, the Committee continued to prosecute its adversary proceedings against the Debtor and certain of its affiliates by, among other things, drafting opposition to motions to dismiss, amending its complaints and conducting legal research in connection with same.
- 6. <u>Fourth</u>, Lowenstein spent time communicating with Committee members and state court counsel, and hosting meetings to prepare for mediation and to keep the Committee informed with respect to all aspects and developments in the Chapter 11 Case.

III.

JURISDICTION

7. This Court has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334, the *Order Referring Bankruptcy Cases and Proceedings to Bankruptcy Judges*, General Order 24 (N.D. Cal.) and Rule 5011-1(a) of the Local Rules. This is a core proceeding under 28 U.S.C. §157(b)(2). Venue of this proceeding and this Application in this Court is proper under 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

28

25

26

')	•	
		•	

3

6

5

8

10

11 12

13

1415

16

17

18 19

20

21

2223

24

25

26

2728

BACKGROUND

- 8. On May 8, 2023, the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtor continues to operate as a debtor in possession under sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 9. On May 23, 2023, the UST, under section 1102(a)(1) of the Bankruptcy Code, appointed nine Survivors holding claims against the Debtor to serve on the Committee. The Committee is charged with representing the interests of all Survivors in this Chapter 11 Case.
- 10. On May 30, 2023, the Committee selected Lowenstein as its lead counsel. The Committee then selected Keller Benvenutti Kim LLP as local counsel. On July 14, 2023, the Committee selected Burns Bair to serve as special insurance counsel.
- 11. On July 8, 2023, the Court entered the Order Authorizing Retention of Lowenstein Sandler LLP as Lead Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of the Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland Effective as of May 30, 2023 [Dkt. No. 205] (the "Retention Order").
- 12. The Retention Order authorizes the Debtor to compensate and reimburse Lowenstein in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the UST Guidelines, and the Interim Compensation Order.
- 13. Under the Retention Order, the services to be provided by Lowenstein to the Committee include:
 - (i) advising the Committee with respect to its rights, duties, and powers in this Chapter 11 Case;
 - (ii) assisting and advising the Committee in its consultations and communications with the Debtor concerning administration of this Chapter 11 Case;
 - (iii) the claims of the Debtor's creditors, including negotiating and mediating issues relating to the value and payment of claims held by the Committee's constituency, which is comprised of Survivors;
 - (iv) assisting the Committee in analyzing the Debtor's capital structure;
 - (v) assisting the Committee in its investigation of the acts, conduct, assets liabilities, and financial condition of the Debtor and of the operation of the Debtor;

1	(vi)	assisting the Committee in its investigation of the liens and claims of the holders of the Debtor's prepetition debt and the prosecution of any claims or causes of action revealed by such investigation;
2 3	(vii)	assisting the Committee in its analysis of, and negotiations with, the Debtor or any third party concerning matters related to, among other things, the assumption
4		or rejection of certain leases of nonresidential real property and executory contracts, asset dispositions, financing of other transactions and the terms of any
5		chapter 11 plans for the Debtor and accompanying disclosure statements and related plan documents;
6	(viii)	assisting the Committee in its analysis of insurance policies procured by the Debtor and negotiations with the underlying insurers concerning all matters
7		related to same;
8 9	(ix)	assisting and advising the Committee as to its communications with Survivors regarding significant matters in this Chapter 11 Case;
10	(x)	representing the Committee at hearings and other proceedings;
11	(xi)	reviewing and analyzing applications, orders, statements of operations, and schedules filed with this Court and advising the Committee with respect to same;
12	(xii)	assisting the Committee in preparing pleadings and applications as may be necessary in furtherance of the Committee's interests and objectives;
13	(xiii)	preparing, on behalf of the Committee, any pleadings, including, without
14	(XIII)	limitation, motions, memoranda, complaints, adversary complaints, objections, or comments in connection with any of the foregoing as may be necessary in
1516		furtherance of the Committee's interests and objectives in this Chapter 11 Case, including, without limitation, the preparation of retention applications and fee applications for the Committee's professionals, including Lowenstein; and
17	(xiv)	performing such other legal services as may be required or are otherwise deemed
18		to be in the interests of the Committee in accordance with the Committee's powers and duties under the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rules, or other
19		applicable law.
20		V.
21		SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES REQUESTED
22	14.	During the Compensation Period, Lowenstein's professionals and
23	paraprofession	nals expended 2,468 hours in connection with providing necessary services to the
24	Committee. I	Lowenstein has been able to efficiently provide services by using the expertise of
25	professionals	and paraprofessionals within relevant practice groups to effectively advise the
26	Committee reg	garding discrete issues and ensure that the level of seniority is commensurate with
- 1	I .	

Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 8 of Filed: 06/16/25 Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086

the work being performed. In connection with services rendered on behalf of the Committee,

Lowenstein requests allowance of reasonable compensation in the total amount of

\$2,534,921.00, and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$56,907.33, for an aggregate total of \$2,591,828.33 for the Compensation Period.

- 15. There is no agreement or understanding between Lowenstein and any other person, other than members of the firm, for the sharing of compensation to be received for services rendered in this Chapter 11 Case. Except as set forth below with respect to payments Lowenstein may receive under the Interim Compensation Order, during the Compensation Period, Lowenstein received no payment and no promises of payment from any source for services rendered or to be rendered in any capacity in connection with the matters covered by this Application.
- 16. Lowenstein agreed to reduce its hourly rates for the benefit of the Committee's constituency (holders of sexual abuse claims against the Debtor). In order to ensure that any price reduction inures solely to the benefit of the Committee's constituency, Lowenstein will hold ten percent of all fees received in this Chapter 11 Case in a trust account to benefit sexual abuse claimants. The funds will be held until a trust is established through a plan of reorganization. If no such trust is created, the funds will be donated to a child advocacy organization to be selected by the Committee at the end of the Chapter 11 Case.
- 17. Other than the foregoing discount: (i) the fees charged by Lowenstein in this Chapter 11 Case were billed in accordance with its existing billing rates and procedures in effect during the Compensation Period and (ii) these rates are the same rates Lowenstein charges for services rendered by its attorneys and paraprofessionals in comparable matters and are reasonable given the compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in similar matters in both the California and national markets.
- 18. Lowenstein maintains computerized time records, which have been filed on the docket with its monthly fee statements and furnished to the Debtor and the UST in the format specified by the Interim Compensation Order. As discussed above, detailed time records for the Compensation Period are attached as **Exhibit H**.
- 19. The Committee has reviewed the Interim Application and has approved the fees and expenses requested.

SUMMARY OF SERVICES PERFORMED BY LOWENSTEIN

DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD

the Committee solely in connection with this Chapter 11 Case and, on behalf of the Committee,

in accordance with Lowenstein's professional responsibilities. The services performed were

necessary to the administration of this Chapter 11 Case and were beneficial at the time at which

the services were rendered. All services were performed within a reasonable amount of time

commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task

addressed. Recitation of every item of the professional services performed by Lowenstein during

the Compensation Period would be unduly burdensome. Thus, the following summary

highlights meaningful issues to which Lowenstein devoted time and attention during the

Compensation Period. This summary is organized in accordance with Lowenstein's internal

conducting extensive legal work related to litigation in the adversary proceedings to recover

assets of the estate, including assets purportedly belonging to the Debtor's related entities.

Specifically, the attorneys engaged in extensive motion practice, addressing a wide variety of

substantive and procedural issues. The specific types of motions they drafted, reviewed, and

Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Court Litigation (655.40 hours;

This category includes time spent by Lowenstein developing legal strategy and

Motions to Dismiss Adversary Complaints: drafting, reviewing, and revising

objections to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Complaints related to the Oakland

Parochial Fund (Adv. Pro. No. 24-04051) and Bond Obligated Group (Adv. Pro. No. 24-04053), including outlining arguments, conducting legal research, and

drafting detailed responses to the legal assertions made by the Debtor and other

Motions for Derivative Standing: drafting, reviewing, and revising motions

seeking derivative standing for the Committee to pursue certain claims on behalf of the estate, as well as replies in support of these motions and responses to

During the Compensation Period, Lowenstein rendered professional services to

1 2

3

20.

system of project categories.

\$660,197.00).

A.

21.

responded to include:

(i)

(ii)

4 5

6 7

8 9

10

11 12

13

14 15

16

17

18 19

20

21 22

23

24

25

26

27 28

Case: 23-40523

Doc# 2086

parties;

Filed: 06/16/25

Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 10

objections raised by the Debtor and other parties;

- (iii) Motions for Abeyance or Stay of Proceedings: preparing objection to motion seeking to stay or hold in abeyance the Insurance Declaratory Judgment Action;
- (iv) Motions for Authority to Substitute as Plaintiff: revising motion for authority to substitute the Committee as plaintiff in the Insurance Declaratory Judgment Action, including drafting reply to objection to same; and
- (v) Motions for Protective Orders: preparing and reviewing motions for protective orders, particularly in the context of discovery disputes and the protection of privileged or confidential information.

In sum, Lowenstein's attorneys' work encompassed a broad spectrum of motion practice, including dispositive motions, procedural and scheduling motions, discovery-related motions (including protective orders and motions to quash), and motions addressing the substantive rights and standing of the parties. This comprehensive approach reflects the complexity and contested nature of the adversary proceedings in the Chapter 11 case.

- В. **Court Hearings** (96.70 hours; \$118,015.50).
- 22. Time billed to this category is for attorney time spent preparing for and attending various court hearings in the Chapter 11 Case and the adversary proceedings on behalf of the Committee, including, but not limited to, tending to post-hearing activities such as reviewing hearing transcripts, summarizing outcomes, and communicating results and next steps to the Committee. Specifically, Lowenstein attended: (i) the hearings on motion to lift the automatic stay and standing motions; (ii) multiple hearings related to the Debtor's Disclosure Statement; (iii) motions to dismiss adversary complaints; (iv) status conferences to discuss the progress of the main case and adversary proceedings, as well as case management conferences to address scheduling, procedural issues, and next steps in litigation; (v) hearings on fee applications, objections and retention of professionals; (vi) hearings related to late claim motions and (vii) the hearing held before the Honorable Jacqueline Scott Corley in the consolidated cases (Case No. 24-00709 and 24-00711) filed in the District Court related to the motions to stay insurance adversary proceedings.
 - C. **Employment and Retention Applications - Others** (106.30 hours; \$100,798.50).
- 23. During the Compensation Period, Lowenstein's services in this category included: (i) preparing, reviewing, and revising supplemental retention applications, proposed Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086 Filed: 06/16/25

27

orders, and supporting declarations for various professionals, including Berkeley Research Group, LLC ("BRG"), as financial advisor and Stout Risius Ross, LLC ("Stout"), as real estate consultant and expert witness; (ii) conducting research to identify, vet, and evaluate the qualifications and backgrounds of potential expert witnesses in areas such as real estate valuation, insurance, trust and estate, and First Amendment issues (iii) engaging in calls and email exchanges with prospective experts, internal team members, and professionals from BRG and Stout to discuss retention strategy, gather necessary information, and finalize application documents; (iv) reviewing and responding to objections from the Debtor and other parties regarding the retention of certain experts, and revising applications as required by court rulings or comments from the U.S. Trustee; and (v) finalizing and filing retention applications.

- **D.** Claims Administration and Objections (75.40 hours; \$82,145.00).
- 24. During the Compensation Period, Lowenstein undertook a wide range of activities focused on the administration and objection of claims in the Chapter 11 Case. The primary tasks included reviewing claims filed against the estate, including the claim filed by the Oakland Parochial Fund (the "OPF Claim"). This analysis included (i) examining claim documents and related pleadings to assess validity and develop objection strategy and (ii) preparing, revising, and finalizing objection to the OPF Claim which included outlining legal arguments and drafting an amended objection.
 - **E. Mediation** (87.30 hours; \$108,113.50)
- 25. This category includes, among other things, time spent by Lowenstein in connection with preparation for mediation sessions and development of mediation strategies. Time spent in this category includes, but is not limited to: (i) communicating and conferring with Judge Sontchi, the appointed mediator, to discuss the status of the case, schedule mediation sessions, and address procedural issues related to mediation; (ii) developing mediation strategies and reviewing and analyzing relevant documents; (iii) reviewing and drafting revised motions and objections related to mediation, such as objection to the Debtor's motion to compel mediation; (iv) coordinating internal meetings and calls to refine mediation strategies, including the development of settlement goals, analysis of the Debtor's financial position, and review of

Page 12

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52

of 16

5

6

7 8 9

10 11

13 14

15 16

17 18

19 20

21 22

25 26

27

28

prior settlement proposals; (v) engaging in ongoing negotiations with the mediator, the Debtor, and other parties to address unresolved issues, analyze new proposals, and continue the mediation process as needed; and (vi) preparing presentations and supporting materials for use in mediation.

- F. Meetings of and Communication with Creditors (124.10 hours; \$143,101.50).
- 26. Lowenstein spent time communicating with Committee members and their state court counsel to discuss all issues germane to this case, including, but not limited to, the following: (i) developing a mediation strategy and preparing for mediation sessions; (ii) preparing a presentation to the Committee summarizing mediation strategy and participating in several zoom meetings and conference calls to prepare for and discuss mediation and claims analysis with the Committee; (iii) meeting with the Committee to prepare for the hearing to consider Survivor Statements and Disclosure Statement hearings, and debriefing sessions following the hearings; and (iv) summarizing prospective settlement scenarios, and ultimately the Debtor's settlement proposal.
 - G. Plan and Disclosure Statement (1,171.70 hours; \$1,198,719.00).
- 27. Lowenstein spent extensive time regarding the Plan and Disclosure Statement. Specifically, this work included: (i) preparing, drafting, and revising objections to versions of the Debtor's Disclosure Statement, including the Amended, Second Amended, and Third Amended Disclosure Statements; (ii) conducting legal research on the best interest test, hypothetical liquidation test, fair and equitable test, absolute priority rule, and the treatment of insured claims; (iii) drafting, revising, and finalizing discovery requests, including document requests, interrogatories, and subpoenas to the Debtor and related entities. This task also involved reviewing and analyzing responses to discovery, preparing responses and objections to discovery served on the Committee, and strategizing regarding motions for protective orders and motions to quash; (iv) identifying potential expert witnesses on topics such as real estate valuation, trust law, and First Amendment issues, including reviewing expert reports and background materials; (v) participating in numerous internal team meetings, calls with cocounsel, and strategy sessions to coordinate plan confirmation workstreams, discuss discovery,

Filed: 06/16/25 | Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086

4

5

6

9 10

8

11

13 14

15

16 17

18 19

20

21 22

23

24

25

26

28

27

and prepare for hearings; (vi) preparing and revising Committee solicitation letter; (vii) reviewing documents produced in discovery, analyzing the Debtor's financials, liquidation analyses, and other materials relevant to plan confirmation; and (viii) reviewing documents produced in discovery.

- Η. Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings (113.50 hours; \$97,443.00).
- 28. This category includes time spent by Lowenstein addressing automatic stay issues, including, but not limited to, the following: (i) conducting multiple conferences and calls among the legal team to discuss strategy, coordinate drafting efforts, and review drafts of replies and related pleadings; (ii) reviewing objections to motions for relief from the automatic stay, including analyzing the arguments presented by various parties; (iii) conducting extensive legal research including reviewing court transcripts from other diocesan bankruptcy cases, outlining arguments and developing counterarguments for preparation, drafting, and revising replies in support of motions to lift the automatic stay; (iv) drafting and revising proposed orders related to the relief from stay motions, including reviewing and editing orders granting or denying relief, and negotiating language with opposing counsel; and (v) monitoring and reviewing pleadings and statements filed in related state court actions and coordinated proceedings to assess the broader impact of the stay and its potential modification.

VII.

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES

- 29. Lowenstein incurred reasonable and necessary out-of-pocket expenses in the sum of \$56,907.33 in connection with rendering legal services to the Committee during the Compensation Period. A description of the expenses is set forth in Exhibit E. The disbursements are itemized in the annexed schedule. These disbursements were necessary to effectively render legal services in this Chapter 11 Case.
- 30. During this Chapter 11 Case, Lowenstein has incurred and paid its actual and necessary disbursements and expenses.

Filed: 06/16/25 1Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 14 Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086

VIII.

- 31. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code to govern the Court's award of such compensation. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code provides that a court may award a professional employed under section 327 of the Bankruptcy Code "reasonable compensation for actual necessary services rendered ... and reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses." 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1). Section 330 also sets forth the criteria for the award of such compensation and reimbursement:
- 32. In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the court should consider the nature, extent, and the value of such services, considering all relevant factors, including—
 - (i) the time spent on such services;
 - (ii) the rates charged for such services;
 - (iii) Whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
 - (iv) Whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed:
 - (v) With respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and
 - (vi) Whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.

11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3).

33. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the amount requested is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of this Chapter 11 Case, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered, (d) the value of such services, and (e) the cost of comparable services other than in a case under this title.

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 15

of 16

1	34. In sum, the services rendered by Lowenstein were necessary and beneficial to the
2	Debtor's estates and were consistently performed timely commensurate with the types of issues
3	involved in this Chapter 11 Case. Accordingly, approval of the compensation for professional
4	services and reimbursement of expenses sought in this Application is warranted.
5	IX.
6	<u>NOTICE</u>
7	35. Notice of the Application has been provided to parties in interest in accordance
8	with the procedures set forth in the Interim Compensation Order. Lowenstein submits that, in
9	view of the facts and circumstances of this Chapter 11 Case, such notice is sufficient, and no
10	other or further notice need be provided.
11	WHEREFORE, Lowenstein requests that the Court enter an order: (i) allowing
12	Lowenstein (a) interim compensation for professional services rendered as counsel for the
13	Committee during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$2,534,921.00; and (b)
14	reimbursement of reasonable and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$56,907.33 for
15	a total award of \$2,591,828.33; and (ii) granting any other relief that the Court deems just and
16	proper.
17	Dated: June 16, 2025 LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP
18	By: <u>Jeffrey D. Prol</u> Jeffrey D. Prol
19	Brent Weisenberg
20	One Lowenstein Drive Roseland, New Jersey 07068
21	Telephone: (973) 597-2500 Facsimile: (973) 597-2400
22	Counsel for the Official Committee
23	of Unsecured Creditors
24	
25	
26	
27	

Doc# 2086 Filed: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 16 of 16

EXHIBIT A

Customary and Comparable Compensation Disclosures with Fee Applications

	BLENDED HOURLY RATE			
Category of Timekeeper (using categories already maintained by the firm)	Billed Preceding Year, Excluding Bankruptcy	Billed This Fee Application		
Partner	\$1,081.65	\$1,191.79		
Counsel	\$815.85	\$1,047.95		
Associate	\$615.26	\$780.45		
Paralegal	\$365.63	\$399.41		
Research Services	\$300.44	\$417.22		
All Timekeepers Aggregated	\$805.58	\$1,027.12		

Lowenstein Sandler's hourly rates for bankruptcy services are comparable to the hourly rates charged in complex chapter 11 cases by comparably skilled bankruptcy attorneys. The "Blended Hourly Rate – Billed Preceding Year, Excluding Bankruptcy" (the "BHREB") noted above reflects the firm's blended hourly rate billed for calendar year 2024 excluding bankruptcy related work, but <u>including</u> all alternative fee arrangements other than contingency fee cases. In calendar year 2024, the firm increased its billing rates on January 1st in accordance with its normal practice. The BHREB also represents the billed rate across a larger, more expansive population of the firm's attorneys with a multitude of rates that are impacted by a number of factors, including level of experience, complexity of the work and office location. For example, approximately 32% of Lowenstein Sandler's attorneys are based in New York, while approximately 57% are based in NJ, approximately 7% are based in California and Utah, and 4% are based in Washington DC. Thus, the "Blended Hourly Rate – Billed This Fee Application" is a function of, among other things, the experience and location of the subset of attorneys delivering the services and the sophistication and complexity of the specific matter.

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: June 16, 2025

Interim or Final: Sixth Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

EXHIBIT BSummary of Timekeepers Included in this Fee Application

							Hourly Rate Billed	
Name	Title	Department	Date of 1st Admission	Fees Billed	Hours Billed	Number of Rate Increases	In This Application	In First Interim Application
Fulfree, Nicole	Partner	Bankruptcy	2014	\$49,693.00	43.40	1	\$1,145.00	\$1,040.00
Jesse, Eric	Partner	Litigation	2009	\$230.00	0.20	1	\$1,150.00	\$910.00
Kaplan, Michael A.	Partner	Litigation	2011	\$198,171.00	174.60	1	\$1,135.00	\$955.00
Prol, Jeffrey D.	Partner	Bankruptcy	1990	\$407,575.00	297.50	2	\$1,370.00	\$1,155.00
Racusin, Warren K.	Partner	Corporate / Tax	1979	\$1,381.50	0.90	0	\$1,535.00	\$1,535.00
Restel, Colleen M.	Partner	Bankruptcy	2015	\$428,287.50	380.70	1	\$1,125.00	\$895.00
Weisenberg, Brent I.	Partner	Bankruptcy	2002	\$581,972.00	501.70	1	\$1,160.00	\$975.00
Chahil, Rasmeet K.	Counsel	Litigation	2017	\$27,885.00	28.60	1	\$975.00	\$785.00
Gross, Philip J.	Counsel	Bankruptcy	2008	\$11,935.50	10.90	1	\$1,095.00	\$995.00
Moynihan, Kelly E.	Counsel	Bankruptcy	2016	\$18,146.00	17.20	0	\$1,055.00	\$1,055.00
Sklar, Lindsay H.	Counsel	Bankruptcy	2014	\$217,224.50	205.90	0	\$1,055.00	\$1,055.00
Berliner, Mikayla R.	Associate	Litigation	2021	\$5,882.00	6.80	0	\$865.00	\$865.00
Clark, Brittany M.	Associate	Bankruptcy	2023	\$504.00	0.70	1	\$720.00	\$545.00
Dernbach, Christopher	Associate	Litigation	2021	\$48,699.50	56.30	1	\$865.00	\$600.00
Frankel, Chelsea	Associate	Bankruptcy	2024	\$84,480.00	128.00	1	\$660.00	\$515.00
Gauvin, Carolyn	Associate	Bankruptcy	2024	\$13,002.00	19.70	1	\$660.00	\$550.00

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland

Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: <u>June 16, 2025</u>

Interim or Final: Sixth Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

Giblin, Anna Maria	Associate	Litigation	2023	\$56,270.50	78.70	1	\$715.00	\$515.00
Jameson, Jennifer Bagger	Associate	Litigation	2022	\$72,612.50	92.50	0	\$785.00	\$785.00
Seltzer, Eric James	Associate	Bankruptcy	2022	\$205,870.00	242.20	1	\$850.00	\$715.00
Stewart, Cristina G.	Associate	Litigation	2022	\$65,704.50	83.70	0	\$785.00	\$785.00
Claussen, Diane	Paralegal	Bankruptcy		\$22,360.00	55.90	1	\$400.00	\$340.00
Lawler, Elizabeth B.	Paralegal	Bankruptcy		\$5,814.00	15.30	1	\$380.00	\$345.00
Pagano, Jamie J.	Paralegal	Practice Support		\$2,924.00	6.80	1	\$430.00	\$365.00
Taboada, Valerie	Paralegal	Litigation		\$495.00	1.10	0	\$450.00	\$450.00
Hayter, Carrie T.	Research Services	Knowledge and Research Services		\$2,132.00	5.20	1	\$410.00	\$345.00
Michaud, Zoraida	Research Services	Knowledge and Research Services		\$5,670.00	13.50	0	\$420.00	\$420.00

Case Name: <u>The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland</u>

Case Number: <u>23-40523 (WJL</u>

Applicant's Name: <u>Lowenstein Sandler LLP</u>

Date of Application: <u>June 16, 2025</u>

Interim or Final: Sixth Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

of 2

EXHIBIT C Budget for Sixth Interim Period from January 1, 2025 through April 30, 2054

Project Category	Estimated	stimated Hours Estimated Fees ¹		Fees ¹
	Low	High	Low	High
Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Court Litigation	520	615	\$377,000.00	\$445,875.00
Appeals	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Asset Analysis and Recovery	40	50	\$29,000.00	\$36,250.00
Asset Disposition	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Avoidance Action Analysis	20	25	\$14,500.00	\$18,125.00
Business Operations	8	10	\$5,800.00	\$7,250.00
Case Administration	40	50	\$29,000.00	\$36,250.00
Claims Administration and Objections	75	90	\$54,375.00	\$65,250.00
Court Hearings	175	210	\$126,875.00	\$152,250.00
Employee Benefits/Pensions	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Employment and Retention Applications - Others	30	35	\$21,750.00	\$25,375.00
Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	15	20	\$10,875.00	\$14,500.00
Fee/Employment Applications	30	40	\$21,750.00	\$29,000.00
Fee/Employment Objections	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Financing/Cash Collateral	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Investigation of Prepetition Lenders	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mediation	60	75	\$43,500.00	\$54,375.00
Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	90	110	\$65,250.00	\$79,750.00
Non-Working Travel	125	150	\$90,625.00	\$108,750.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	700	825	\$507,500.00	\$598,125.00
Other - Insurance Matters	60	75	\$43,500.00	\$54,375.00
Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	65	80	\$47,125.00	\$58,000.00

Lowenstein Sandler's estimated fees are calculated at the rate of \$725 per hour.

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland

Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: June 16, 2025

Interim or Final: Sixth Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

Project Category Estimated Hours		Estimated Fees ¹		
	Low	High	Low	High
Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	125	150	\$90,625.00	\$108,750.00
Schedules and Statements	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Tax Issues	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
Valuation	0	0	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL	2178	2610	\$1,579,050.00	\$1,892,250.00

Lowenstein reserves its right to modify this budget and staffing plan in the event circumstances unforeseen at the time these were prepared would cause Lowenstein Sandler to be required to utilize additional or different staffing to appropriately deal with events that may arise in the bankruptcy case.

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: June 16, 2025
Interim or Final: Sixth Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

EXHIBIT C Staffing Plan for Fourth Interim Period from January 1, 2025 through April 30, 2054

Category of Timekeeper	Number of Timekeepers Expected to Work on the Matter During the Budget Period	Average Hourly Rate
Partner	5-7	\$690–\$1,835
Counsel	2-3	\$575–\$1,070
Associate	8-10	\$475–\$965
Paralegal	1-2	\$305–\$425

The Applicant reserves its right to modify this budget and staffing plan in the event circumstances unforeseen at the time these were prepared that would cause Applicant to be required to utilize additional or different staffing to appropriately deal with events that may arise in the bankruptcy case.

Case Name: The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number: 23-40523 (WJL

Applicant's Name: Lowenstein Sandler LLP

Date of Application: June 16, 2025
Interim or Final: Sixth Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

<u>EXHIBIT D</u> Summary of Compensation Requested by Project Category

Project Category	Hours Billed	Fees Sought
Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Court Litigation	655.40	\$660,197.00
Asset Analysis and Recovery	7.30	\$6,319.00
Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts	0.30	\$348.00
Avoidance Action Analysis	0.20	\$225.00
Business Operations	1.20	\$1,388.50
Case Administration	7.90	\$3,464.00
Claims Administration and Objections	75.40	\$82,145.00
Court Hearings	96.70	\$118,015.50
Employment and Retention Applications - Others	106.30	\$100,798.50
Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	10.00	\$7,116.00
Fee/Employment Applications	21.60	\$11,215.00
Fee/Employment Objections	31.60	\$32,154.50
Mediation	87.30	\$108,113.50
Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	124.10	\$143,101.50
Other - Insurance Matters	22.00	\$11,285.00
Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	1.20	\$1,374.50
Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	1,171.70	\$1,198,719.00
Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	47.80	\$48,941.50
TOTAL	2,468.00	\$2,534,921.00

Case Name:	The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland
Case Number:	23-40523 (WJL
Applicant's Name:	Lowenstein Sandler LLP
Date of Application:	June 16, 2025
Interim or Final:	Sixth Interim

UST Form 11-330-C (2013)

<u>EXHIBIT E</u> Summary of Expense Reimbursement Requested by Category

Category	Amount
Computerized legal research	\$33,420.98
Filing fees	\$328.00
Messenger and delivery charges	\$31.60
Searches	\$45.00
Telecommunications	\$535.76
Travel	\$17,780.91
Meals	\$4,012.22
Document Management	\$752.86
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$56,907.33

of 18

EXHIBIT E – CONTINUED – Expense Detail

Date	Description	Amount
Document M : 01/27/25	anagement eDiscovery Review (VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-01-27 34.43 GB eDiscovery Review)	\$185.92
02/26/25	eDiscovery Review (VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-02-26 34.43 GB eDiscovery Review)	\$185.92
03/26/25	eDiscovery Review (VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-03-26 34.43 GB eDiscovery Review)	\$185.92
04/28/25	eDiscovery Review (VENDOR: Relativity DATE:2025-04-28 36.13 GB eDiscovery Review)	\$195.10
	nd delivery charges	¢21.60
03/27/25	Federal Express	\$31.60
Filing fees 12/09/24	Filing Fees (VENDOR: American Express INVOICE#: 7161270501310201 DATE: 1/31/2025; 12/09/24; Filing Fees; E-filing)	\$328.00
<u>Meals</u> 01/07/25	Meals (local) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. Dinner; Attend hearing in Oakland)	\$25.24
12/12/24	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: American Express RCBO Oakland Diocese Meeting - Coffee/tea and light snacks before Survivor Statement Conference Hearing meeting with speakers, their counsel and Committee members. Approximately 20 individuals in attendance. Meeting was held to assist Speakers in preparing for the hearing.)	\$858.00
12/12/24	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: American Express RCBO Oakland Diocese Meeting - Lunch after Survivor Statement Conference Hearing with speakers, their counsel and Committee members. Approximately 20 individuals in attendance. Meeting was held to debrief Speakers and Committee on the day's events.)	\$2,250.00
01/07/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7163124501130201 DATE: 1/13/2025; 01/07/25; Hotel - Dinner Brent Weisenberg; for attendance at RCBO Lift Stay and Standing Motions Hearing on January 8, 2025.)	\$51.68
01/08/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7163124501130201 DATE: 1/13/2025; 01/08/25; Breakfast Brent Weisenberg; Breakfast before attendance at RCBO Lift Stay and Standing Motions Hearing on January 8, 2025.)	\$18.54
01/08/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. Dinner Brent Weisenberg; Dinner before flight from SFO to Home after attendance at RCBO Lift Stay and Standing Motions Hearing on January 8, 2025.)	\$24.63
01/08/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7170525801150205 DATE: 1/15/2025; 01/08/25; Jeffrey Prol; Dinner before 1/8 hearing in Oakland)	\$123.05
01/09/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7170525801150205 DATE: 1/15/2025; 01/09/25; Jeffrey Prol; Breakfast before 1/8 hearing in Oakland)	\$33.80

01/15/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7177915201200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/15/25; Brent Weisenberg; Dinner before attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$65.03
01/16/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7177915201200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/16/25; Lunch before attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$22.60
01/16/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7177915201200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/16/25; Brent Weisenberg; Breakfast before attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$18.54
01/16/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7178441401200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/16/25; Lunch before disclosure statement hearing)	\$17.92
02/23/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Hotel - Dinner on February 23 for attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$32.57
02/24/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Breakfast on February 24 before attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$4.95
02/24/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 - Dinner on February 24 for attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$31.26
02/24/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7267459603050203 Hotel breakfast on 2/24 while attending RCBO Mediation in San Francisco)	\$17.54
02/24/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7267459603050203 Dinner on 2/24 while attending RCBO Mediation in San Francisco)	\$50.00
02/25/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Dinner on February 25 after attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$14.87
02/25/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7267459603050203 Dinner on 2/25 while attending RCBO Mediation in San Francisco)	\$50.00
02/25/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7267459603050203 Hotel breakfast on 2/25 while attending RCBO Mediation in San Francisco)	\$39.00
03/02/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7273443903060205 Dinner on March 2 while attending Status Conference and Motion to Dismiss Hearings in CA)	\$64.81
03/03/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7273443903060205 Dinner at Hotel on March 3 while attending status conference and Motion to Dismiss Hearings in CA)	\$84.66
03/04/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7273443903060205 Dinner on March 4 while attending status conference and hearings on motion to dismiss)	\$25.81
03/31/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Hotel - Dinner for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025)	\$22.60
04/01/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Breakfast before attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025.)	\$8.27

04/01/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Lunch before attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025.)	\$5.23
04/01/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7347190304100203 Dinner while attending Friars Hearing on Joint Mediation Motion and RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on 4/1/25)	\$39.58
04/02/25	Meals (out of town travel) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7347190304100203 Breakfast while attending Friars Hearing on Joint Mediation Motion and RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on 4/1/25)	\$12.04
Computariza	A logal wasaawah	
01/13/25	d legal research Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: RESTEL, COLLEEN; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: DOC ACCESS-2; ACCESS CHARGE-8;;	\$848.66
01/13/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: RESTEL, COLLEEN; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: DOC ACCESS-2; ACCESS CHARGE-8; ;	\$848.66
01/16/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: GAUVIN, CAROLYN; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: DOC ACCESS-5; DOC ACCESS-1; DOC ACCESS-13; ACCESS CHARGE-4; ;	\$1,806.05
01/28/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: MICHAUD, ZORAIDA; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-1;;	\$105.55
02/03/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: RESTEL, COLLEEN; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-2;;	\$211.10
02/27/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: GIBLIN, ANNA MARIA; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-3;;	\$296.97
03/03/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: RESTEL, COLLEEN; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-2;;	\$211.10
03/13/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: RESTEL, COLLEEN; Service: US RESTATEMENTS; Charge Type: DOC ACCESS-3;;	\$169.51
03/14/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: GIBLIN, ANNA MARIA; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-13;;	\$1,286.87
03/25/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: RESTEL, COLLEEN; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-2; ;	\$185.79
04/15/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: MICHAUD, ZORAIDA; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-1; DOC ACCESS-4;;	\$291.81
04/18/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: HAYTER, CARRIE; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-1; ;	\$92.89
04/24/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: GIBLIN, ANNA MARIA; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-8; DOC ACCESS-1;;	\$780.56
04/25/25	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: GIBLIN, ANNA MARIA; Service: SEARCH; Charge Type: ACCESS CHARGE-1;;	\$87.12
10/03/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/03/2024 Court: CANDC Pages: 66	\$6.60
10/03/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/03/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 43	\$4.30
10/04/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/04/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 61	\$6.10
10/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/09/2024 Court: CANDC Pages: 7	\$0.70

10/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/09/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 47	\$4.70
10/10/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/10/2024 Court: CANDC Pages: 115	\$11.50
10/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/16/2024 Court: DEBK Pages: 2	\$0.20
10/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/16/2024 Court: NJBK Pages: 49	\$4.90
10/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/16/2024 Court: CANDC Pages: 21	\$2.10
10/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/16/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 152	\$15.20
10/18/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/18/2024 Court: LAEBK Pages: 92	\$9.20
10/22/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/22/2024 Court: MDBK Pages: 36	\$3.60
10/24/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/24/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 49	\$4.90
10/29/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/29/2024 Court: CANDC Pages: 22	\$2.20
10/29/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 10/29/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 17	\$1.70
11/04/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/04/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 57	\$5.70
11/11/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/11/2024 Court: CACBK Pages: 45	\$4.50
11/11/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/11/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 1	\$0.10
11/11/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586594-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/11/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 17	\$1.70
11/13/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/13/2024 Court: TXNBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
11/13/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/13/2024 Court: NJBK Pages: 60	\$6.00
11/13/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/13/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 35	\$3.50
11/13/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/13/2024 Court: MTBK Pages: 43	\$4.30
11/14/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/14/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 3	\$0.30
11/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/16/2024 Court: NJBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
11/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/16/2024 Court: MTBK Pages: 95	\$9.50
11/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/16/2024 Court: LAWBK Pages: 1	\$0.10

11/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/16/2024 Court: PAMDC Pages: 13	\$1.30
11/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/16/2024 Court: GUBK Pages: 41	\$4.10
11/16/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/16/2024 Court: AKBK Pages: 52	\$5.20
11/17/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/17/2024 Court: GUBK Pages: 70	\$7.00
11/17/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/17/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 198	\$19.80
11/17/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/17/2024 Court: CANDC Pages: 24	\$2.40
11/17/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/17/2024 Court: NYSBK Pages: 119	\$11.90
11/18/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/18/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 206	\$20.60
11/18/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/18/2024 Court: NYSBK Pages: 114	\$11.40
11/18/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/18/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 39	\$3.90
11/20/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/20/2024 Court: ORBK Pages: 71	\$7.10
11/22/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/22/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 245	\$24.50
11/22/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/22/2024 Court: TXSDC Pages: 2	\$0.20
11/22/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/22/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 71	\$7.10
11/25/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/25/2024 Court: DEBK Pages: 37	\$3.70
11/25/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/25/2024 Court: CANDC Pages: 46	\$4.60
11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: NYWBK Pages: 54	\$5.40
11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: PAMBK Pages: 108	\$10.80
11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: NJBK Pages: 35	\$3.50
11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: NMBK Pages: 128	\$12.80
11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: NYSBK Pages: 165	\$16.50
11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: AKBK Pages: 169	\$16.90
11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: CASBK Pages: 31	\$3.10

11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: MTBK Pages: 86	\$8.60
11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: WVNBK Pages: 330	\$33.00
11/26/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/26/2024 Court: WIEBK Pages: 209	\$20.90
11/27/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/27/2024 Court: TXSBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
11/27/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/27/2024 Court: GUBK Pages: 192	\$19.20
11/27/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 11/27/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 22	\$2.20
12/02/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/02/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 141	\$14.10
12/02/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/02/2024 Court: NYNBK Pages: 45	\$4.50
12/02/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/02/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 79	\$7.90
12/02/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/02/2024 Court: CASBK Pages: 139	\$13.90
12/03/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/03/2024 Court: IASBK Pages: 33	\$3.30
12/03/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/03/2024 Court: CASBK Pages: 109	\$10.90
12/04/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/04/2024 Court: NYNBK Pages: 45	\$4.50
12/04/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/04/2024 Court: MNBK Pages: 64	\$6.40
12/04/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/04/2024 Court: CASBK Pages: 109	\$10.90
12/04/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/04/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 293	\$29.30
12/04/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/04/2024 Court: NYSBK Pages: 329	\$32.90
12/05/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/05/2024 Court: CANDC Pages: 45	\$4.50
12/05/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/05/2024 Court: GUBK Pages: 87	\$8.70
12/05/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/05/2024 Court: CTBK Pages: 8	\$0.80
12/06/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/06/2024 Court: NJBK Pages: 42	\$4.20
12/08/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/08/2024 Court: WAEBK Pages: 64	\$6.40
12/08/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/08/2024 Court: AKBK Pages: 122	\$12.20

12/08/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/08/2024 Court: AZBK Pages: 96	\$9.60
12/08/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/08/2024 Court: IASBK Pages: 96	\$9.60
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 21	\$2.10
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: UTBK Pages: 218	\$21.80
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 6	\$0.60
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: AKBK Pages: 297	\$29.70
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: AZBK Pages: 176	\$17.60
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: CAEBK Pages: 177	\$17.70
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 34	\$3.40
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 29	\$2.90
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: IASBK Pages: 60	\$6.00
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: WIEBK Pages: 150	\$15.00
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: CTBK Pages: 81	\$8.10
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: WAEBK Pages: 135	\$13.50
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: MTBK Pages: 62	\$6.20
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: NMBK Pages: 144	\$14.40
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: NYSBK Pages: 280	\$28.00
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: MNBK Pages: 60	\$6.00
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: PAMBK Pages: 77	\$7.70
12/09/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/09/2024 Court: ORBK Pages: 153	\$15.30
12/10/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/10/2024 Court: GUBK Pages: 57	\$5.70
12/11/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/11/2024 Court: AZBK Pages: 32	\$3.20
12/11/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/11/2024 Court: AKBK Pages: 30	\$3.00

12/11/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/11/2024 Court: IASBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
12/11/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/11/2024 Court: WAEBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
12/13/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/13/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 11	\$1.10
12/17/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/17/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 80	\$8.00
12/30/24	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q42024 DATE: 1/13/2025 Date: 12/30/2024 Court: CANBK Pages: 79	\$7.90
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: NMBK Pages: 73	\$7.30
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: NYNBK Pages: 75	\$7.50
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: PAMBK Pages: 63	\$6.30
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: CTBK Pages: 70	\$7.00
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: NYWBK Pages: 67	\$6.70
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: NJBK Pages: 63	\$6.30
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: NYSBK Pages: 131	\$13.10
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: LAEBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: MDBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: MNBK Pages: 297	\$32.10
01/05/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/05/2025 Court: MTBK Pages: 39	\$3.90
01/06/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/06/2025 Court: GUBK Pages: 38	\$3.80
01/06/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/06/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 50	\$5.00
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: DEBK Pages: 90	\$9.00
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: NMBK Pages: 49	\$4.90
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: CTBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: TXSBK Pages: 66	\$6.60
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: CAEBK Pages: 40	\$4.00

01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: WAEBK Pages: 60	\$6.00
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: WIEBK Pages: 67	\$6.70
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: MTBK Pages: 39	\$3.90
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: MNBK Pages: 32	\$3.20
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: AZBK Pages: 60	\$6.00
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: AKBK Pages: 55	\$5.50
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: NYSBK Pages: 68	\$6.80
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: IASBK Pages: 49	\$4.90
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: NYWBK Pages: 37	\$3.70
01/07/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/07/2025 Court: ORBK Pages: 99	\$9.90
01/08/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/08/2025 Court: MNBK Pages: 113	\$11.30
01/08/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/08/2025 Court: NJBK Pages: 49	\$4.90
01/08/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/08/2025 Court: NYNBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
01/08/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/08/2025 Court: NYWBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
01/14/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/14/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 58	\$5.80
01/22/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212378-Q12025 DATE: 4/24/2025 Date: 01/22/2025 Court: UTDC Pages: 30	\$3.00
01/28/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212378-Q12025 DATE: 4/24/2025 Date: 01/28/2025 Court: NYSBK Pages: 174	\$17.40
01/30/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/30/2025 Court: MNBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
01/30/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 01/30/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 5	\$0.50
01/31/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 01/31/2025 Court: MNBK Pages: 142	\$14.20
02/01/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212377-Q12025 DATE: 4/23/2025 Date: 02/01/2025 Court: MNBK Pages: 205	\$20.50
02/06/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/06/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 70	\$7.00
02/11/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/11/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 69	\$6.90

02/12/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/12/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 149	\$14.90
02/13/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/13/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 74	\$7.40
02/17/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 3212378-Q12025 DATE: 4/24/2025 Date: 02/17/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
02/18/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/18/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 221	\$22.10
02/20/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/20/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 6	\$0.60
02/21/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586594-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/21/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 6	\$0.60
02/21/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/21/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 6	\$0.60
02/26/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/26/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 6	\$0.60
02/26/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/26/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 350	\$35.00
02/28/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/28/2025 Court: CANDC Pages: 25	\$2.50
02/28/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/28/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 33	\$3.30
02/28/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 02/28/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 6	\$0.60
03/03/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/03/2025 Court: PAMBK Pages: 61	\$6.10
03/03/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/03/2025 Court: NYWBK Pages: 30	\$3.00
03/03/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/03/2025 Court: NMBK Pages: 338	\$33.80
03/04/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/04/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 177	\$17.70
03/04/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/04/2025 Court: CTBK Pages: 308	\$30.80
03/04/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/04/2025 Court: MDBK Pages: 7	\$0.70
03/04/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/04/2025 Court: NYNBK Pages: 63	\$6.30
03/13/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/13/2025 Court: TXSBK Pages: 12	\$1.20
03/13/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/13/2025 Court: GANBK Pages: 33	\$3.30
03/13/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/13/2025 Court: CANDC Pages: 25	\$2.50
03/13/25	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: 4586608-Q12025 DATE: 4/29/2025 Date: 03/13/2025 Court: CANBK Pages: 34	\$3.40

01/04/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 12 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$306.50
01/16/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: GAUVIN,CAROLYN / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 19 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$293.65
01/22/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: MICHAUD,ZORAIDA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 4 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$606.33
01/30/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 13 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$1,625.81
01/31/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 15 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$505.85
02/02/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 15 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$675.20
02/03/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 3 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$168.80
02/04/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 14 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$1,012.80
02/05/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 5 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$168.80
02/08/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 18 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$337.60
02/10/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 11 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$506.40
02/12/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 8 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$506.40
02/13/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 4 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$506.40
02/17/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: STEWART,CRISTINA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 45 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$661.25
02/21/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 4 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$337.60
02/25/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 6 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$337.60
02/27/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: GIBLIN,ANNA MARIA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 14 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$38.07
03/03/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 4 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$337.60
03/04/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 10 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$702.96
03/04/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 16 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$785.14
03/05/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 2 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$5.55
03/07/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 36 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$2,547.55
03/10/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 14 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$1,023.91

03/14/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: GIBLIN,ANNA MARIA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 18 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$38.07
03/18/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: BAGGER,JENNIFER / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 13 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$21.75
03/21/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 9 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$895.09
03/31/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: SKLAR,LINDSAY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 2 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$6.10
04/02/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: BAGGER, JENNIFER / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 9 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$11.94
04/14/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 12 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$340.48
04/16/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: DERNBACH,CHRIS / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 3 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$5.97
04/18/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: HAYTER,CARRIE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 53 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$7,393.89
04/21/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: FRANKEL,CHELSEA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 27 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$556.05
04/22/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: DERNBACH,CHRIS / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 3 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$5.97
04/24/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: GIBLIN,ANNA MARIA / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 25 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$71.65
04/24/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: MOYNIHAN,KELLY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 15 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$1,296.84
04/29/25	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: BAGGER, JENNIFER / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 51 / Docs/Lines: 0	\$211.37
Searches 04/30/25	Searches (VENDOR: Bench IQ, Inc. INVOICE#: INV-0036 DATE: 4/30/2025 For usage during April 2025)	\$45.00
Telecommunion 12/12/24	Other Telecommunications Charges (VENDOR: American Express INVOICE#: 7130241701310201 DATE: 1/31/2025; 12/12/24; Hotel - Internet; 12/13/24 Oakland Diocese Meeting - Wi-Fi charge in connection with conference room reserved for Survivor Statement Conference Hearing meeting with speakers, their counsel and	\$535.76
	Committee members. Approximately 20 individuals in attendance. Meeting was held to assist Speakers in preparing for the hearing and debriefing thereafter.)	
<u>Travel</u> 12/12/24	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: American Express INVOICE#: 7130241701310201 DATE: 1/31/2025; 12/12/24; Hotel - Meeting Room; 12/13/24 RCBO Oakland Diocese Meeting - Room rental fee as Committee needed to secure a meeting place for speakers, their counsel and Committee members attending the Survivor Speaker Conference to meet before and after the hearing.)	\$750.00
12/12/24	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: American Express INVOICE#: 7130241701310201 DATE: 1/31/2025; 12/12/24; Hotel - Other; 12/13/24 RCBO Oakland Diocese Meeting - Taxes in connection with breakfast and lunch before/ after Survivor Statement Conference Hearing with speakers, their counsel and Committee members. Approximately 20 individuals in attendance.)	\$443.47

12/19/24	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: American Express INVOICE#: 7130241701310201 DATE: 1/31/2025; 12/19/24; Hotel - Other; 12/13/24 RCBO Oakland Diocese Meeting - Taxes in connection with breakfast and lunch before/ after Survivor Statement Conference Hearing with speakers, their counsel and Committee members. Approximately 20 individuals in attendance.)	\$1,015.34
01/08/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. Lodging; Hotel (1 night) for attendance at RCBO Lift Stay and Standing Motions Hearing on January 8, 2025)	\$233.71
01/08/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. 01/08/25; Hotel - Lodging; Attend lift and stay motion hearing in Oakland)	\$181.51
01/09/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. 01/09/25; Hotel - Lodging; Attend lift and standing motion hearing in Oakland)	\$244.03
01/15/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. 01/15/25; Hotel - Lodging; Hotel (1 night) for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$401.91
01/16/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. 01/16/25; Hotel - Lodging at Marriott A-Loft at SFO; Attend hearing in CA - there was a large conference in town and hotel rates were at premium rates)	\$774.36
02/24/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7267459603050203 Hotel - Lodging; Hotel to attend RCBO Mediation in San Francisco)	\$351.29
02/24/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7267459603050203 DATE: 3/5/2025; 02/24/25; Hotel - Parking; Hotel parking to attend RCBO Mediation in San Francisco - one night)	\$70.68
02/25/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Hotel (2 nights) for attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$922.04
02/26/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. Hotel - Lodging; Hotel to attend RCBO Mediation in San Francisco - 2 nights)	\$934.91
03/01/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7274804103060205 B. Weisenberg was scheduled to attend a Disclosure Statement and hearing on two motions in Oakland Cancellation fee charged due to the hotel being cancelled after the cancellation period.)	\$215.46
03/03/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7273443903060205 DATE: Hotel while attending status conference and Motion to Dismiss Hearings in CA)	\$183.99
03/04/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7273443903060205 Hotel while attending status conference and Motion to Dismiss Hearings in CA)	\$271.99
03/04/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Maker, Colleen M. INVOICE#: 7271573403060205 Oakland Hearing Hotel Cancellation)	\$356.82
03/05/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7277186203100202 Hotel to attend RCBO motion to dismiss in Oakland - 2 nights)	\$508.57
04/01/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Hotel (1 night) for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025. (50% billed to another case))	\$109.90
04/02/25	Travel - Accommodations (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7347190304100203 Hotel RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on 4/1/25 (50% billed to another case))	\$181.51
12/20/24	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. Airfare; FROM: Newark, NJ (EWR); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO); Attend hearing in CA)	\$966.96

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-5 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 14

01/07/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. Air WiFi; Wi-Fi during flight to San Francisco to attend RCBO Lift Stay and Standing Motions Hearing on January 8, 2025.)	\$8.00
01/07/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. Airfare; FROM: Newark, NJ (EWR); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO); for attendance at RCBO Lift Stay and Standing Motions Hearing on January 8, 2025.)	\$571.96
01/07/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. Air WiFi; Attend hearing in Oakland)	\$8.00
01/09/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. Air WiFi; Attend hearing in Oakland)	\$8.00
01/14/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. Airfare; FROM: Newark, NJ (EWR); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO); Attend hearing in CA)	\$347.00
01/15/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. Air WiFi; Attend hearing in CA)	\$8.00
01/15/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. Air WiFi; Wi-Fi during flight to San Francisco to attend RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$8.00
01/16/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. Air WiFi; Attend hearing in CA)	\$8.00
01/17/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. Airfare; FROM: Newark, NJ (EWR); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO); for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$966.96
02/23/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Wi-Fi during flight to San Francisco to attend mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$8.00
02/26/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Plane fare from EWR to SFO for attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$685.23
02/26/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7267459603050203 Airfare FROM: Newark, NJ (EWR); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO) to attend RCBO Mediation in San Francisco)	\$828.29
02/28/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7273443903060205 Additional airfare for change in return flight on March 4 from hearing on motions to dismiss)	\$448.48
03/02/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7277186203110203 Airfare; FROM: New York, NY - Kennedy (JFK); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO) to attend hearing on motions to dismiss adversary)	\$1,016.99
03/11/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7347190304100203 Flight to San Francisco to attend Friars Hearing on Joint Mediation Motion and RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on 4/1/25)	\$282.27
03/31/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Wi-Fi during flight to San Francisco to attend RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025.)	\$4.00
03/31/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7347190304100203 WiFi during flight to San Francisco to attend Friars Hearing on Joint Mediation Motion and RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on 4/1/25)	\$4.00
04/01/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Airfare; FROM: Newark, NJ (EWR); TO: San Francisco, CA (SFO); for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement (50% billed to another case))	\$224.24
04/02/25	Travel - Airfare (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7347190304100203 DATE: 4/10/2025; 04/02/25; Air WiFi; WiFi during flight to attend Friars Hearing on Joint Mediation Motion and RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on 4/1/25)	\$4.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-5 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 15

01/07/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7170525801150205 DATE: 1/15/2025; 01/07/25; Taxi/CarService; FROM: airport; TO: hotel; Attend hearing in Oakland)	\$193.24
01/08/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7163124501130201 DATE: 1/13/2025; 01/08/25; Taxi/Car Service; FROM: Oakland Marriott City Center, 1001 Broadway, Oakland, CA; TO: San Francisco Airport, San Francisco, CA; after attendance at RCBO Lift Stay and Standing Motions Hearing on January 8, 2025 (with J. Prol).)	\$163.81
01/15/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7177915201200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/15/25; Uber from SFO to Oakland Hotel for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$159.57
01/16/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7178441401200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/16/25; Taxi/CarService; FROM: hotel; TO: court; Attend hearing in CA)	\$40.86
01/16/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7178441401200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/16/25; Taxi/CarService; FROM: airport; TO: hotel; Attend hearing in CA)	\$31.88
01/16/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7177915201200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/16/25; Lyft from Oakland Marriott to SFO (with J. Prol) after attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$92.37
02/23/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Uber on February 23 from SFO to Hotel for attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$92.92
02/25/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Uber on February 25 from Foley to Airport after attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$74.92
03/02/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7277186203100202 FROM: San Francisco, California (Airport); TO: 1001 Broadway, Oakland, CA; to attend hearing on motions to dismiss adversary)	\$170.88
03/02/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7277186203100202 FROM: Yardley, PA; TO: Queens, NY (JFK International Airport); to attend hearing on motions to dismiss adversary)	\$122.97
03/02/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7277186203100202 03/02/25; Tolls; Travel to and from Oakland, CA to attend hearing on motions to dismiss adversary)	\$53.04
03/02/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7277186203100202 03/02/25; Parking at airport; to attend hearing on motions to dismiss adversary)	\$280.00
03/03/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7273443903060205 Uber from SFO Airport to Court on March 3 for status conference and hearings on motion to dismiss)	\$124.04
03/04/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7273443903060205 Uber from Court to SFO Airport on March 4 following status conference and hearing on motion to dismiss)	\$165.25
03/04/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Kaplan, Michael A. INVOICE#: 7277186203100202 Taxi/Car Service; FROM: 1001 Broadway, Oakland, California; TO: San Francisco, California (Airport); while attending hearing on motions to dismiss adversary)	\$122.41

03/31/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Taxi/Car Service; FROM: SFO Airport, San Francisco, CA; TO: Oakland Marriott Hotel, 1001 Broadway, Oakland, CA; Uber from SFO to Oakland Hotel for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025 (with Jeff Prol).)	\$96.30
03/31/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Taxi/Car Service; FROM: SFO Airport, San Francisco, CA; TO: Oakland Marriott Hotel, 1001 Broadway, Oakland, CA; Uber from SFO to Oakland Hotel for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025 (with Jeff Prol).)	\$48.14
04/01/25	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc) (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 DATE: Uber from Oakland Marriott to SFO after attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025.)	\$57.10
01/06/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7170525801150205 DATE: 1/15/2025; 01/06/25; EWR Airport Parking; Attend hearing in Oakland)	\$107.33
01/07/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7170525801150205 DATE: 1/15/2025; 01/07/25; Mileage; FROM: office; TO: airport; Attend hearing in Oakland)	\$27.80
01/07/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7163124501130201 DATE: 1/13/2025; 01/07/25; Uber from Home to EWR for attendance at RCBO Lift Stay and Standing Motions Hearing on January 8, 2025)	\$74.54
01/09/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7163124501130201 DATE: 1/13/2025; 01/09/25; Uber from EWR to Home after attendance at RCBO Lift Stay and Standing Motions Hearing on January 8, 2025.)	\$65.64
01/15/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7177915201200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/15/25; Uber from Home to EWR for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$73.60
01/15/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7178441401200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/15/25; Mileage; FROM: home; TO: airport; Attend hearing in CA)	\$46.47
01/17/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7177915201200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/17/25; Uber from EWR to Home after attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on January 16, 2025.)	\$63.76
01/17/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7178441401200203 DATE: 1/20/2025; 01/17/25; EWR Airport Parking; Attend hearing in CA)	\$120.00
02/21/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7267459603050203DATE: 02/21/25; Uber from home to airport to attend RCBO Mediation in SanFrancisco)	\$160.96
02/23/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Uber on February 23 from Home to EWR for attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$69.80
02/25/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7256926002270202 Uber on February 25 from EWR to Home after attendance at mediation sessions on February 24th and 25th, 2025.)	\$60.37
03/04/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7273443903060205 Uber from EWR airport to home on March 4 following status conference and hearing on motion to dismiss)	\$91.61
03/31/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Uber from Home to EWR for attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025.)	\$37.94
03/31/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7347190304100203 Roundtrip mileage to Newark airport to attend Friars Hearing on Joint Mediation Motion and	\$21.12

RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on 4/1/25)

04/01/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Weisenberg, Brent I. INVOICE#: 7334615704030201 Uber from EWR to Home after attendance at RCBO Disclosure Statement and the FFCI Mediation Motion Hearings on April 1, 2025.)	\$31.15
04/02/25	Local Travel (VENDOR: Prol, Jeffrey D. INVOICE#: 7347190304100203 Parking at airport while attending Friars Hearing on Joint Mediation Motion and RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing on 4/1/25)	\$81.25
	Total Disbursements	\$56,907.33

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-5 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 18

EXHIBIT F Summary Cover Sheet of Fee Application

Name of applicant	Lowenstein Sandler LLP
Name of client	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Time period covered by application	01/01/25 to 04/30/25
Total compensation sought this period	\$2,534,921.00
Total expenses sought this period	\$56,907.33
Petition date	May 8, 2023
Retention date	July 8, 2023, effective as of May 30, 2023
Date or order approving employment	July 8, 2023
Total compensation approved by interim order to date	\$5,717,336.41
Total expenses approved by interim order to date	\$194,909.20
Total allowed compensation paid to date	\$5,717,336.41
Total allowed expenses paid to date	\$194,909.20
Blended rate in this application for all attorneys	\$1,052.88
Blended rate in this application for all timekeepers	\$1,027.12
Compensation sought in this application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$1,386,749.60
Expenses sought in this application already paid pursuant to a monthly compensation order but not yet allowed	\$44,506.88
Number of professionals (attorneys) included in this application	20
If applicable, number of professionals in this application not included in staffing plan approved by client	N/A
If applicable, difference between fees budgeted and compensation sought for this application period	The fees sought in the Application exceed the fees budgeted for the time period covered because of the Debtor's decision to prosecute its Plan of Reorganization over the objection of the Committee. At the time the budget was made, the Debtor's Disclosure Statement had not yet been approved and it remained uncertain whether it would be. Accordingly, the budget did not anticipate a contested plan confirmation process. The commencement of that adversarial process has had a meaningful and material impact on the cost of the case. This fact is evidenced by, among other things, the quantum of fees incurred after the Disclosure Statement was approved on April 4, 2025, where Lowenstein's fees equate to 31% of the total amount requested.
Number of professionals (attorneys) billing fewer than 15 hours to the case during this period	5

Page 1

Are any rates higher than those approved or disclosed at	No.
retention? If yes, calculate the amount of compensation	
attributable to any rate increase	

1	
2	
3	
4	
5	
6	
7	
8	
9	
10	
11	
12	
13	
14	
15	
16	
17	
18	
19	
20	
21	
22	
23	
24	
25	
26	

28

EXHIBIT G

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2086-7 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 1 of 7

1	LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP	
2	JEFFREY D. PROL (admitted <i>pro hac vice</i>) jprol@lowenstein.com	
3	BRENT WEISENBERG (admitted pro hac v bweisenberg@lowenstein.com	ice)
4	COLLEEN M. RESTEL (admitted pro hac v. crestel@lowenstein.com	ice)
5	One Lowenstein Drive Roseland, New Jersey 07068	
6	Telephone: (973) 597-2500	
7	KELLER BENVENUTTI KIM LLP TOBIAS S. KELLER (Cal. Bar No. 151445)	
8	tkeller@kbkllp.com JANE KIM (Cal. Bar No. 298192)	
9	jkim@kbkllp.com GABRIELLE L. ALBERT (Cal. Bar No. 190	0895)
10	galbert@kbkllp.com 101 Montgomery Street, Suite 1950	
11	San Francisco, California 94104 Telephone: (415) 496-6723	
12	Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsect	ıred Creditors
13		BANKRUPTCY COURT
14		RICT OF CALIFORNIA ND DIVISION
15	In re:	Case No. 23-40523 WJL
16	THE ROMAN CATHOLIC BISHOP OF	Chapter 11
17	OAKLAND, a California corporation sole,	DECLARATION OF JEFFREY D. PROL IN
18	Debtor.	SUPPORT OF SIXTH INTERIM FEE
19		APPLICATION LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL
20		COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR ALLOWANCE AND
21		PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR
22		THE PERIOD FROM JANUARY 1, 2025
23		THROUGH AND INCLUDING APRIL 30, 2025
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		

Case 2314970 25234970 268. Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 2 of 7

Case

I, Jeffrey D. Prol, hereby declares, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746 as follows:

- 1. I am a partner in the law firm of Lowenstein Sandler LLP ("Lowenstein"), lead counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors ("the "Committee") of the Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland (the "Debtor") in connection with the above-referenced chapter 11 case (the "Chapter 11 Case"). I am familiar with the Order Authorizing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals [Dkt. 170] (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the United States Trustee Appendix B Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 by Attorneys in Larger Chapter 11 Cases, effective November 1, 2013 (the "U.S. Trustee Guidelines") and the Guidelines for Compensation and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals and Trustees for the Northern District of California, dated February 19, 2014 (the "Local Guidelines").
- 2. This Declaration is submitted in support of the Sixth Interim Fee Application of Lowenstein Sandler LLP as Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Allowance and Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period From January 1, 2025 Through and Including April 30, 2025 (the "Application").¹
 - 3. Pursuant to the Local Guidelines, Lowenstein states as follows:
 - a. I have read the Application;
 - b. To the best of my knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, except as set forth in the Application, the fees and disbursements sought fall within the Local Guidelines; and
 - c. The fees and disbursements sought are billed at rates in accordance with those generally charged by Lowenstein and generally accepted by Lowenstein's clients.
- 4. The Debtor, the Debtor's professionals, and the U.S. Trustee are each being provided with a copy of the Application in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order.

All capitalized terms not defined herein have the meaning given to them in the Application.

- 5. As required by the Interim Compensation Order, Lowenstein sent monthly billing statements to the Debtor during the Compensation Period. In addition, the Debtor and the U.S. Trustee are each being provided with a copy of the Application in accordance with the Interim Compensation Order.
- 6. Lowenstein responds to the questions identified in the U.S. Trustee Guidelines as follows:
 - (a) Question: Did you agree to any variations from, or alternatives to, your standard or customary billing arrangements for this engagement?
 - Response: Yes. Lowenstein agreed to reduce its hourly rates for the benefit of the Committee's constituency (i.e., holders of sexual abuse claims against the Debtor). In order to assure that any price reduction inures solely to the benefit of the Committee's constituency, Lowenstein will hold ten percent of all fees received in this Chapter 11 Case in a trust account to benefit sexual abuse claimants. The funds will be contributed to the trust established for the benefit of Survivors through a plan of reorganization in this Chapter 11 Case. If no such trust is created, the funds will be donated to a child advocacy organization to be selected by the Committee at the conclusion of the Chapter 11 Case. Additionally, Lowenstein has agreed not to charge the Committee for its travel time to and from the San Francisco Bay area.
 - **(b) Question:** If the fees sought in this fee application as compared to the fees budgeted for the time period covered by this fee application are higher by 10% or more, did you discuss the reasons for the variation with the client?
 - Response: The fees sought in the Application exceed the fees budgeted for the time period covered because of the Debtor's decision to prosecute its Plan of Reorganization over the objection of the Committee. At the time the budget was made, the Debtor's Disclosure Statement had not yet been approved and it remained uncertain whether it would be. Accordingly, the budget did not anticipate a contested plan confirmation process. The commencement of that adversarial process has had a meaningful and material impact on the cost of the case. This fact is evidenced by, among other things, the quantum of fees incurred after the Disclosure Statement was approved on April 4, 2025, where Lowenstein's fees equate to 31% of the total amount requested.
 - (c) Question: Do any of the professionals included in this engagement vary their rate based on the geographic location of the bankruptcy case?
 - Response: Lowenstein's professionals included in this engagement have not varied their rate based on the geographic location of the Chapter 11 Case.
 - (d) Question: Does the fee application include time or fees related to reviewing or revising time records or preparing, reviewing, or revising invoices? (This is limited

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2086-7 Filed: 06/16/25 _2Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 4

1		to work involved in preparing and editing billing records that would not be
2		compensable outside of bankruptcy and does not include reasonable fees for preparing a fee application). If so, please quantity by hours and fees.
3 Resp	oonse:	No.
4 (e) (Question:	Does the fee application include time or fees for reviewing time records to redact any privileged or other confidential information? If so, please quantity by hours and fees.
6 Rest	oonse:	No.
7		
8	<u>juestion</u> :	If the fee application includes any rate increases since retention: i. Did your client review and approve those rates in advance? ii. Did your client agree when rateining the law firm to accept all future rate increases? If not did
9		when retaining the law firm to accept all future rate increases? If not, did you inform your client that they need not agree to modified rates or terms
10		in order to have you continue the representation, consistent with ABA Formal Ethics Opinion 11-458?
11 Resp	onse:	Lowenstein increased its rates effective as of January 1, 2025. See Notice of
12		Change In Hourly Rates [Dkt. 1552].
13 8.	Attach	ed as Exhibit A is a true and correct copy of an email transmitting the
14 Application	to the Ch	nairperson of the Committee advising the Committee of the right to review
15 and object t	o the com	pensation and expense reimbursement sought therein.
16 Purs	suant to 2	8 U.S.C. § 1746, I hereby declare under the penalty of perjury that the
	atements	made by me are true and correct to the best of my knowledge. Executed this
	June, 2025	5 in Roseland, New Jersey.
19		
20		By: <u>/s/ Jeffrey D. Prol</u> Jeffrey D. Prol
21		
22		
23		
24		
25		
26		
27 28		

Case 23-40523 Doc# 2086-7 Filed: 06/16/25 _3Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 5 of 7

EXHIBIT A

of 7



Jeffrey D. Prol Partner One Lowenstein Drive Roseland, New Jersey 07068

T: (973) 597-2490 **F**: (973) 597-2491 **E**: jprol@lowenstein.com

June 13, 2025

VIA Email

Steve Woodall, Committee Chairperson

Email: sjwoodall@gmail.com

Re: In re The Roman Catholic Bishop of Oakland

(Bankr. N.D. Cal.) Case No.: 23-40523 (WJL)

Lowenstein Sandler LLP Sixth Interim Fee Application

Dear Mr. Woodall:

Attached for the Committee's review are copies of the Sixth Interim Fee Application of Lowenstein Sandler LLP as Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for Allowance and Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for the Period of January 1, 2025 Through April 30, 2025 and the Declaration of Jeffrey Prol in support thereof.

The Court's Guidelines for Compensation and Expense Reimbursement of Professionals and Trustees provide that a debtor in possession, a trustee or an official committee must exercise reasonable business judgment in monitoring the fees and expenses of the estate's professionals. We invite you to discuss any objections, concerns or questions you may have with us. The Office of the United State Trustee will also accept your comments, and the Court will consider timely filed objections by any party in interest at the time of the hearing on the application.

Please do not hesitate to call me with any questions related to the Lowenstein Sandler LLP Sixth Interim Fee Application.

Sincerely,

/s/ Jeffrey D. Prol, Esq.

<u>EXHIBIT H</u>

Full Detailed List of Services Rendered by Lowenstein Sandler by Project Category

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount	
<u>B100 - Adm</u>	B100 - Administration					
B110 Case A	Administration					
B110	01/09/25	DC	Review dockets, download pleadings, amended plan and disclosure statement, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.40	\$160.00	
B110	01/16/25	DC	Review dockets, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00	
B110	01/17/25	DC	Update hearing transcript file	0.10	\$40.00	
B110	01/21/25	DC	Review Stipulations entered in the committee adversary proceedings, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.40	\$160.00	
B110	01/22/25	DC	Update attorney calendar with zoom link for hearing	0.10	\$40.00	
B110	01/24/25	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.40	\$160.00	
B110	01/28/25	DC	Review court calendar and update internal calendar with zoom link and hearing agenda for 1/30/25	0.10	\$40.00	
B110	01/29/25	BIW	Draft email to Chambers re: request to reset certain dates and deadlines	0.40	\$464.00	
B110	02/15/25	DC	Update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00	
B110	02/18/25	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00	
B110	02/26/25	DC	Review docket in lead case and all adversary proceedings, download filed pleadings, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.70	\$280.00	
B110	02/28/25	DC	Review docket, download pleadings and notices, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.40	\$160.00	
B110	03/07/25	DC	Review docket, update attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00	
B110	03/13/25	DC	Review dockets, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00	
B110	03/18/25	DC	Review dockets, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.20	\$80.00	
B110	03/25/25	DC	Update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.20	\$80.00	
B110	03/27/25	DC	Review docket, download pleadings and update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.20	\$80.00	
B110	04/01/25	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.20	\$80.00	
B110	04/02/25	DC	Review proposed confirmation schedule, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	1.40	\$560.00	
B110	04/10/25	DC	Review dockets, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.50	\$200.00	
B110	04/17/25	DC	Review docket, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.30	\$120.00	
B110	04/24/25	DC	Review dockets in all pending matters, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.40	\$160.00	

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
			Total B110 - Case Administration	7.90	\$3,464.00
B120 Asset A	Analysis and R	ecovery			
B120	01/06/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Protective Order and access to confidential material	0.50	\$562.50
B120	01/07/25	AMG	Review Debtor's and non-Debtor affiliates' lease agreements	2.50	\$1,787.50
B120	01/10/25	CMR	Analyze Debtor payments to Non-Debtors	0.90	\$1,012.50
B120	01/13/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: payments made per Cash Management Order	0.70	\$787.50
B120	01/15/25	CMR	Review of new documents produced by Debtor	0.20	\$225.00
B120	01/15/25	JJP	Transfer incoming production files and incorporate same into the case database	0.50	\$215.00
B120	01/20/25	BIW	Review documents produced by Debtor	0.60	\$696.00
B120	03/03/25	BIW	Review of documents produced and summary of same	0.40	\$464.00
B120	03/03/25	JJP	Transfer incoming production sets and incorporate same into the case database for review	0.40	\$172.00
B120	03/04/25	CMR	Summary review of new documents produced by Debtor	0.10	\$112.50
B120	03/04/25	JJP	Review and respond to email correspondence from B. Weisenberg re: document production	0.10	\$43.00
B120	03/31/25	CMR	Summary review of documents produced by Debtor	0.10	\$112.50
B120	03/31/25	JJP	Transfer files and coordinate the inclusion of same into the case database (.2); provide a copy internally (.1)	0.30	\$129.00
			Total B120 - Asset Analysis and Recovery	7.30	\$6,319.00
B140 Relief f	from Stay/Ade	quate Protection	<u>Proceedings</u>		
B140	01/01/25	BIW	Review objections to Lift Stay Motion	1.40	\$1,624.00
B140	01/01/25	BIW	Draft outline of Lift Stay Reply (.8); confer with E. Seltzer and C. Restel re: same (1.0)	1.80	\$2,088.00
B140	01/01/25	BIW	Continue preparing for Lift Stay Motion	0.90	\$1,044.00
B140	01/01/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team re: Reply in Support of Motion to Lift Automatic Stay	1.00	\$1,125.00
B140	01/01/25	EJS	Call with J. Prol and C. Restel re lift stay motion reply (1.0); consider approach re counterarguments (.5)	1.50	\$1,275.00
B140	01/01/25	JDP	Review and analyze objections to lift stay motion (1.2); develop strategy (1.4); confer with LS team re: same (1.0)	3.60	\$4,932.00
B140	01/02/25	BIW	Comment on Lift Stay Objections reply	0.40	\$464.00
B140	01/02/25	BIW	Revise portions of Lift Stay Reply	0.70	\$812.00
B140	01/02/25	EJS	Revise outline for Reply ISO of Lift Stay Motion (.3); email correspondence with Lowenstein team re same (.2); draft Reply ISO Lift Stay Motion (6.9); email correspondence with R. Simons and B. Weisenberg re lift stay issues (.2)	7.60	\$6,460.00
B140	01/02/25	JDP	Review draft reply in support of motion to lift stay and develop strategy	1.40	\$1,918.00
B140	01/03/25	BIW	Revise Lift Stay Reply	2.40	\$2,784.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B140	01/03/25	CMR	Analyze issues and review draft of Reply in Support of Motion to Lift Stay	1.00	\$1,125.00
B140	01/03/25	EJS	Draft Reply ISO Lift Stay Motion (7.1); multiple calls with LS team re: same (.4) and email correspondence (.3) with B. Weisenberg re same	7.80	\$6,630.00
B140	01/03/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft of reply on committee's lift stay motion	1.40	\$1,918.00
B140	01/04/25	BIW	Further revise Lift Stay Reply	0.90	\$1,044.00
B140	01/04/25	CMR	Review draft Reply in Support of Motion to Lift Stay	0.80	\$900.00
B140	01/04/25	EJS	Review and comment on revisions to Lift Stay Reply (.9); email correspondence with B. Weisenberg and C. Restel re same (.3)	1.20	\$1,020.00
B140	01/05/25	BIW	Revise Reply to Objections to Lift Stay Motion	0.60	\$696.00
B140	01/05/25	BIW	Continue revising Lift Stay Reply	0.90	\$1,044.00
B140	01/05/25	MAK	Review and revise reply to motion to lift automatic stay	1.30	\$1,475.50
B140	01/06/25	CG	Review, proof, and cite check reply ISO relief from stay	2.40	\$1,584.00
B140	01/06/25	JDP	Review and comment on final version of reply in support of lift stay motion	1.40	\$1,918.00
B140	01/21/25	BIW	Draft Order re: Lift Stay	0.40	\$464.00
B140	01/22/25	JDP	Review and edit draft order granting and denying in part committee lift stay motion	0.30	\$411.00
B140	01/24/25	CF	Call with B. Weisenberg re: proposed lift stay order	0.20	\$132.00
B140	01/28/25	BIW	Review Debtor's revised draft of Lift Stay Order	0.20	\$232.00
B140	01/30/25	BIW	Revise Debtor's draft of Lift Stay Order	0.30	\$348.00
B140	01/30/25	JDP	Review and comment on revised form of order on lift stay motion	0.30	\$411.00
B140	03/03/25	BIW	Review San Francisco transcripts re: extent of stay	0.30	\$348.00
B140	03/18/25	BIW	Confer with Burns Bair re: scope of automatic stay	0.60	\$696.00
B140	03/20/25	DC	Research dockets in other Diocesan cases for objections to lift stay motions	1.70	\$680.00
B140	03/22/25	JDP	Review statement filed with state court re: status of Northern CA tort cases	0.30	\$411.00
B140	03/24/25	BIW	Review JCCP 5108 - CMC Statement	0.40	\$464.00
B140	03/25/25	BIW	Review pleadings filed in Coordinated Proceeding	0.40	\$464.00
			Total B140 - Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	47.80	\$48,941.50
B150 Meetin	gs of and Com	munication witl	h Creditors		
B150	01/01/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on upcoming hearings	0.40	\$464.00
B150	01/02/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: lift stay hearing preparation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/03/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to survivor re: projected timing of distributions	0.20	\$232.00
B150	01/04/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee to inform Committee of filing of Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.30	\$348.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	01/05/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for survivor re: preparation for Lift Stay hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B150	01/05/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: explanation of Solicitation letter	0.40	\$464.00
B150	01/05/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for survivor re: preparation for Lift Stay hearing	0.20	\$232.00
B150	01/05/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: objection to Abeyance Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/06/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: upcoming hearings	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/06/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee members to prepare for Lift Stay hearing	0.80	\$928.00
B150	01/06/25	JDP	Prepare for (.2) and participate in (.8) call with SCC to prepare for hearing on lift stay motion	1.00	\$1,370.00
B150	01/07/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to survivor re: lift stay motion hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/08/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: debrief on day's hearing	0.20	\$232.00
B150	01/08/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: Mediation Motion to be filed	0.40	\$464.00
B150	01/09/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivor re: debrief on case	0.60	\$696.00
B150	01/10/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee Members re: debrief on Lift Stay hearing	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	01/10/25	JDP	Participate in SCC update call	1.10	\$1,507.00
B150	01/14/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to Survivor re: expectation on timing of Lift Stay decision	0.20	\$232.00
B150	01/15/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of case	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/15/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: Judge's inquiry on status of state court cases	0.70	\$812.00
B150	01/15/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: filing of objection to Mediation Motion	0.20	\$232.00
B150	01/15/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: inquiries on claims filing	0.20	\$232.00
B150	01/16/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: Debtor's Reply to Committee's Mediation Objection	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/17/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on recent hearings	0.80	\$928.00
B150	01/17/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to Survivor re: case timeline	0.20	\$232.00
B150	01/17/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: debrief on prior day's hearing	0.60	\$696.00
B150	01/21/25	BIW	Confer with counsel to Committee member re: debrief on Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.60	\$696.00
B150	01/21/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.50	\$580.00
B150	01/21/25	BIW	Confer with counsel to Committee member re: debrief on Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.80	\$928.00
B150	01/21/25	BIW	Confer with counsel to Committee member re: debrief on Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.60	\$696.00
B150	01/21/25	BIW	Confer with counsel to Committee member re: debrief on denial of Lift Stay Motion	0.30	\$348.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	01/22/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: debrief on Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B150	01/22/25	JDP	Call with counsel to committee member re: denial of lift stay motion	0.30	\$411.00
B150	01/23/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee re: debrief on recent hearings	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	01/23/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: agenda for following today's call	0.20	\$232.00
B150	01/23/25	JDP	Participate in update call with SCC re: decisions on lift stay and derivative standing and status of ds hearing	1.10	\$1,507.00
B150	01/24/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: attendance at mediation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/24/25	BIW	Confer with Committee re: debrief on recent hearings	1.20	\$1,392.00
B150	01/24/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: debrief on recent hearings	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/24/25	JDP	Prepare for (.3) and participate in (1.2) update call with committee	1.50	\$2,055.00
B150	01/26/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: additional mediation sessions	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/27/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: status of case	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/27/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: issues remaining with Disclosure Statement	0.40	\$464.00
B150	01/27/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: preparation for mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	01/27/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee members re: resumption of mediation	0.80	\$928.00
B150	01/28/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: confirmation of mediation sessions	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/28/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: mediation logistics	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/29/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to counsel for Committee member re: mediation logistics	0.20	\$232.00
B150	01/29/25	BIW	Confer with Committee Member re: anticipated mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	01/30/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to counsel for Committee member re: scope of automatic stay	0.30	\$348.00
B150	01/31/25	BIW	Confer with Committee members re: debrief on prior day's Disclosure Statement hearing	1.30	\$1,508.00
B150	01/31/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.30	\$1,781.00
B150	02/02/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: response to inquiry on Solicitation Letter	0.20	\$232.00
B150	02/04/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: pursuit of non-debtor defendants in State Court	0.30	\$348.00
B150	02/04/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: analysis of prior survivor recoveries	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/04/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: rescheduling mediation preparation calls	0.20	\$232.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	02/04/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member re: mediation preparation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	02/05/25	BIW	Draft emails to counsel for Committee members re: mediation preparation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/06/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: mediation	0.60	\$696.00
B150	02/06/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: mediation	0.50	\$580.00
B150	02/06/25	BIW	Draft emails to counsel for Committee members re: mediation preparation	0.20	\$232.00
B150	02/06/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: insurance assignment	0.60	\$822.00
B150	02/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: mediation	0.50	\$580.00
B150	02/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: mediation	0.50	\$580.00
B150	02/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: mediation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	02/07/25	JDP	Calls with SCC re: terms of insurance assignment	2.30	\$3,151.00
B150	02/10/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: inquiry on Plan	0.50	\$580.00
B150	02/11/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: status of case	0.20	\$232.00
B150	02/11/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: review of claims filed on behalf of his client	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/12/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: status of case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/12/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee Member re: thoughts on mediation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	02/12/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/12/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: attendance for mediations sessions	0.20	\$232.00
B150	02/12/25	JDP	Call with committee professionals re: insurance coverage analysis	0.50	\$685.00
B150	02/12/25	JDP	Participate in call with SCC re: mediation	0.40	\$548.00
B150	02/13/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: update on mediation	0.60	\$696.00
B150	02/13/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee member re: logistics of mediations sessions	0.20	\$232.00
B150	02/17/25	JDP	Review committee settlement presentation to prepare for committee meeting	0.70	\$959.00
B150	02/18/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Abuse Claimants re: need to amend proofs of claim	0.10	\$116.00
B150	02/18/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee Members re: mediation preparation	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	02/18/25	JDP	Participate in SCC call to prepare for mediation	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	02/19/25	BIW	Confer with Committee re: mediation preparation	1.50	\$1,740.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	02/19/25	JDP	Participate in committee meeting to prepare for mediation	1.50	\$2,055.00
B150	02/20/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: Responses to Motions to Dismiss	0.30	\$348.00
B150	02/20/25	BIW	Confer with Committee Member and counsel re: mediation preparation	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	02/20/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee Member re: mediation preparation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/20/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee Member re: mediation preparation	0.70	\$812.00
B150	02/21/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: Second OPF Claim Objection	0.30	\$348.00
B150	02/21/25	BIW	Draft emails to certain counsel for Committee members re: proposed meeting with Bishop at mediation (2 @.2 each)	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/21/25	BIW	Confer with Committee Member and counsel re: mediation preparation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	02/21/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee Member re: mediation preparation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	02/21/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee Member re: mediation preparation	0.60	\$696.00
B150	02/21/25	CF	Draft Committee presentation on potential claims and causes of action	2.80	\$1,848.00
B150	02/27/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivor re: update on case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/28/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on case and OPF claim	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/28/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivor re: update on case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	02/28/25	BIW	Draft email to Survivor re: response to inquiry on upcoming hearings	0.20	\$232.00
B150	03/03/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: status of case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	03/04/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: debrief on case	0.40	\$464.00
B150	03/05/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member and counsel re: Plan confirmation proceedings	0.70	\$812.00
B150	03/05/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee Member re: debrief on status of mediation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	03/05/25	BIW	Confer with Committee Member re: debrief on status of mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	03/06/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns to prepare for following week's Committee call	0.30	\$348.00
B150	03/06/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: update on ability to pay analysis	0.20	\$232.00
B150	03/06/25	BIW	Participate in state court counsel call re: debrief on mediation and Plan confirmation proceedings	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	03/06/25	JDP	Participate in SCC update call	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	03/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: RCWC access to Survivor proofs of claim	0.20	\$232.00
B150	03/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: proposed contribution by RCWC in exchange for release	0.40	\$464.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	03/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: granting access to certain claims to RCWC	0.60	\$696.00
B150	03/07/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	03/09/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: Sacramento Survivor Statement decision	0.10	\$116.00
B150	03/10/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: status of mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	03/10/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of state court actions against RCWC	0.50	\$580.00
B150	03/11/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: status of mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	03/12/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee members re: Stout Real Estate retention	0.40	\$464.00
B150	03/12/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee Member re: RCWC Stipulation confidentiality issues	0.30	\$348.00
B150	03/14/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivor to respond to inquiry on filing Survivor Claim	0.30	\$348.00
B150	03/17/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: RCWC's access to Survivor claims	0.60	\$696.00
B150	03/18/25	BIW	Confer with Burns Bair to prepare for meeting with counsel for Committee members	0.40	\$464.00
B150	03/18/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: changes made to Second Amended Plan	0.70	\$812.00
B150	03/19/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee re: agenda for follow day's call	0.20	\$232.00
B150	03/20/25	BIW	Confer with P. Shields and T. Burns to prepare for call with Committee counsel	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	03/20/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee members re: bi- weekly update call	1.50	\$1,740.00
B150	03/20/25	JDP	Participate in SCC strategy call	1.50	\$2,055.00
B150	03/20/25	JDP	Confer with BRG and co-counsel to prepare for SCC call	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	03/21/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: asset analysis	0.40	\$464.00
B150	03/21/25	BIW	Draft email update to counsel for Committee members	0.30	\$348.00
B150	03/21/25	BIW	Participate in Committee update call	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	03/21/25	JDP	Participate in committee update call	1.10	\$1,507.00
B150	03/26/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee member re: claims bar date issues	0.20	\$232.00
B150	03/27/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: attendance at April 1st hearing	0.10	\$116.00
B150	03/28/25	JDP	Prepare for (.3) and participate in (1.1) call with SCC re: insurance assignment issues	1.40	\$1,918.00
B150	04/01/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on day's hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B150	04/02/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel to Committee members re: agenda for following day's call	0.20	\$232.00
B150	04/02/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee Member to prepare for contested Plan confirmation hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B150	04/03/25	BIW	Participate on call with counsel for Committee members re: Solicitation Procedures issues	0.50	\$580.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	04/03/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: ability to pay analysis	0.30	\$411.00
B150	04/03/25	JDP	Participate in SCC update call	0.50	\$685.00
B150	04/04/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee re: plan confirmation hearing issues	0.80	\$928.00
B150	04/05/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivor re: discuss recent developments in case	0.30	\$348.00
B150	04/05/25	BIW	Draft outline for survivor Town Hall	0.30	\$348.00
B150	04/05/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: explain plan solicitation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	04/06/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: explain Court's decision on Church/ OPF Complaint motions to dismiss	0.80	\$928.00
B150	04/07/25	BIW	Draft email to Survivor re: respond to inquiry on case status	0.30	\$348.00
B150	04/07/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivors re: Plan summary	0.40	\$464.00
B150	04/07/25	CF	Draft update to Committee re: motion to allow late claim	1.40	\$924.00
B150	04/08/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: debrief on Disclosure Statement hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B150	04/08/25	BIW	Revise email to Committee re: describe Late Claim Motion	0.60	\$696.00
B150	04/10/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: plan solicitation issues	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	04/10/25	JDP	Participate in SCC update call	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	04/11/25	BIW	Confer with another Survivor counsel re: explain solicitation	0.30	\$348.00
B150	04/11/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor counsel re: explain solicitation	0.40	\$464.00
B150	04/11/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Survivors re: Plan voting	0.90	\$1,044.00
B150	04/11/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: voting	0.90	\$1,233.00
B150	04/11/25	JDP	Prepare for call with SCC re: voting on Debtor's Plan	0.60	\$822.00
B150	04/14/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivors re: respond to inquiries on ballot	0.70	\$812.00
B150	04/14/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivors re: plan solicitation (2 @.3)	0.60	\$696.00
B150	04/15/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivors re: respond to inquiries on ballot	0.10	\$116.00
B150	04/15/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update in lieu of bi- weekly call	0.30	\$348.00
B150	04/15/25	EJS	Prepare Committee presentation re: Plan solicitation and voting	6.90	\$5,865.00
B150	04/15/25	JDP	Call with SCC re: terms of an acceptable insurance assignment and tdp	0.80	\$1,096.00
B150	04/16/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Survivors re: respond to solicitation questions	0.50	\$580.00
B150	04/16/25	EJS	Prepare Committee presentation re: Plan solicitation and voting	2.50	\$2,125.00
B150	04/17/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivor re: inquiry on multiple claim forms filed	0.40	\$464.00
B150	04/17/25	BIW	Revise Presentation to Survivors re: Plan voting	0.70	\$812.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	04/17/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: respond to inquiries on Plan solicitation	0.60	\$696.00
B150	04/17/25	EJS	Call with B. Weisenberg re Committee Town Hall (.2); revise slide deck for same (.3)	0.50	\$425.00
B150	04/18/25	BIW	Revise Presentation to Survivors re: Plan voting	1.20	\$1,392.00
B150	04/18/25	BIW	Prepare for Town Hall with Survivors	0.70	\$812.00
B150	04/18/25	EJS	Revise slide deck for Committee Town Hall re: plan and solicitation	0.50	\$425.00
B150	04/18/25	JDP	Call with SCC to prepare for creditor town hall meeting	0.70	\$959.00
B150	04/21/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivors re: townhall meeting with Survivors re: Plan and solicitation process	0.60	\$696.00
B150	04/21/25	EJS	Revise presentation for Committee Town Hall re: plan and solicitation	2.80	\$2,380.00
B150	04/22/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update Committee on Stout retention issues	0.30	\$348.00
B150	04/22/25	BIW	Revise Presentation to Survivors re: Plan Voting	0.60	\$696.00
B150	04/22/25	EJS	Call with B. Weisenberg re Committee Town Hall Presentation (.2); further revise same (.2)	0.40	\$340.00
B150	04/23/25	BIW	Draft email re: answer Survivor counsel's questions on Plan	0.20	\$232.00
B150	04/23/25	BIW	Draft email re: answer Survivor's questions on Plan	0.40	\$464.00
B150	04/24/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: status of balloting	0.40	\$464.00
B150	04/24/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update on Bond Obligated Group decision	0.50	\$580.00
B150	04/25/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Survivor re: status of case	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	04/25/25	BIW	Confer with Survivor re: respond to questions on Plan	0.80	\$928.00
B150	04/25/25	BIW	Participate in call with Committee members and counsel re: Survivor Town Hall	1.20	\$1,392.00
B150	04/25/25	BIW	Revise Presentation re: Survivor Town Hall	1.10	\$1,276.00
B150	04/25/25	BIW	Draft responsive email to counsel for Survivor re: execution of ballots	0.10	\$116.00
B150	04/25/25	BIW	Draft email to Survivors re: Survivor Town Hall	0.60	\$696.00
B150	04/25/25	EJS	Revise Town Hall Presentation re plan and solicitation (.3); call with B. Weisenberg re: same (.2)	0.50	\$425.00
B150	04/26/25	BIW	Revise Presentation re: Survivor Town Hall	0.70	\$812.00
B150	04/28/25	BIW	Confer with co-panelists re: preparation for Town Hall (.5); finalize presentation for same (.3)	0.80	\$928.00
B150	04/28/25	BIW	Prepare for Town Hall	0.40	\$464.00
B150	04/28/25	BIW	Participate in Town Hall	1.80	\$2,088.00
B150	04/28/25	JDP	Review and edit deck for survivor town hall meeting	0.50	\$685.00
B150	04/28/25	JDP	Participate in Survivor town hall meeting re: plan terms and confirmation process (.5); call with co-hosts to prepare (.5)	1.00	\$1,370.00
B150	04/28/25	MAK	Monitor creditors forum and provide real time feedback to presenters	1.30	\$1,475.50
B150	04/29/25	BIW	Confer with R. Simons re: debrief on Town Hall	0.30	\$348.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	04/29/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Committee members re: update on meeting with Bishop	0.80	\$928.00
B150	04/29/25	BIW	Draft email to Committee re: update in lieu of call	0.30	\$348.00
B150	04/29/25	JDP	Participate in SCC call re: meeting with Bishop	0.80	\$1,096.00
			Total B150 - Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	124.10	\$143,101.50
B155 Mediat	<u>ion</u>				
B155	01/02/25	BIW	Confer with Judge Sontchi re: status of case	0.50	\$580.00
B155	01/07/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: update on case	0.50	\$580.00
B155	01/07/25	JDP	Call with Judge Sontchi re: restarting mediation	0.50	\$685.00
B155	01/08/25	BIW	Revise Mediation Motion Objection	0.40	\$464.00
B155	01/08/25	BIW	Review Mediation Motion filed by Debtor (.2); revise objection (.3)	0.50	\$580.00
B155	01/08/25	CMR	Review Debtor's Motion to Compel Mediation (.3); Summary review of Committee's response to same (.2)	0.50	\$562.50
B155	01/09/25	BIW	Revise Objection to Mediation Motion	0.80	\$928.00
B155	01/09/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Debtor document request (.3); Confer re: same (.1)	0.40	\$450.00
B155	01/10/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team (.1) and Debtor (.1) re: discovery request to Committee	0.20	\$225.00
B155	01/13/25	BIW	Revise objection to Mediation Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B155	01/13/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: potential mediation sessions	0.30	\$348.00
B155	01/13/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Debtor discovery request re: Mediation Motion (.9); confer with LS team re: same (.2)	1.10	\$1,237.50
B155	01/13/25	JDP	Review e-mails re: debtor document production request (.3); confer with LS team re: same (.2)	0.50	\$685.00
B155	01/14/25	CMR	Review and revise draft Opposition to Motion to Compel Mediation	0.70	\$787.50
B155	01/15/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Reply to Mediation Objection	0.30	\$348.00
B155	01/15/25	CMR	Review Insurer response re: Motion to Compel Mediation (.1); Review Debtor Reply re: same (.3)	0.40	\$450.00
B155	01/18/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: results of Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B155	01/20/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: mediation motion and related issues	0.80	\$928.00
B155	01/22/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Insurer right to document productions	1.20	\$1,350.00
B155	01/23/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: status of case	0.60	\$696.00
B155	01/23/25	JDP	Participate in call with Judge Sontchi re: mediation	0.60	\$822.00
B155	01/25/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: possibility of resumed mediation	0.30	\$348.00
B155	01/26/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: proposed dates for resumed mediation	0.30	\$348.00
B155	01/27/25	JDP	Review and respond to emails re: scheduling mediation	0.20	\$274.00
B155	01/28/25	BIW	Draft email to Mediators re: confirmation of mediation sessions	0.20	\$232.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 11 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B155	01/29/25	DC	Construct survey for mediation attendees for February 24/25 mediation sessions	0.90	\$360.00
B155	01/29/25	JDP	Prepare for upcoming mediation	0.20	\$274.00
B155	01/31/25	BIW	Draft presentation to Committee on mediation	0.60	\$696.00
B155	01/31/25	BIW	Confer with Mediators to prepare for Mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B155	01/31/25	JDP	Develop strategy for mediation	0.80	\$1,096.00
B155	01/31/25	JDP	Call with mediators to prepare for February mediation	0.50	\$685.00
B155	02/03/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: mediation preparation	1.50	\$1,740.00
B155	02/03/25	BIW	Devise mediation strategy	0.40	\$464.00
B155	02/03/25	BIW	Draft email to T. Burns re: settlement goals	0.30	\$348.00
B155	02/03/25	JDP	Review and edit deck for committee presentation to prepare for mediation	1.30	\$1,781.00
B155	02/03/25	JDP	Review prior mediation presentation to committee to prepare for upcoming committee meeting and mediation	1.60	\$2,192.00
B155	02/03/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG to prepare for mediation	1.50	\$2,055.00
B155	02/04/25	BIW	Revise presentation to Committee re: mediation preparation	0.60	\$696.00
B155	02/05/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol re: mediation preparation	0.20	\$232.00
B155	02/05/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: mediation strategy	0.20	\$274.00
B155	02/06/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol re: mediation preparation	0.20	\$232.00
B155	02/06/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: mediation preparation	0.20	\$274.00
B155	02/10/25	BIW	Draft email to A. Uetz re: request for financial statements	0.20	\$232.00
B155	02/10/25	JDP	Develop strategy for mediation	0.60	\$822.00
B155	02/10/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG to prepare for mediation	0.40	\$548.00
B155	02/11/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: mediation	0.50	\$580.00
B155	02/11/25	BIW	Review analyses needed for mediation	0.60	\$696.00
B155	02/11/25	JDP	Review and edit draft presentation for committee to prepare for mediation	0.80	\$1,096.00
B155	02/11/25	JDP	Confer with Judge Sontchi to prepare for upcoming mediation	0.50	\$685.00
B155	02/12/25	BIW	Draft email to BRG re: analysis needed for mediation	0.20	\$232.00
B155	02/12/25	DC	Review survey results for mediation attendees, prepare report for B. Weisenberg and coordinate re: committee member attendance	0.50	\$200.00
B155	02/14/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: mediation preparation	1.10	\$1,276.00
B155	02/14/25	BIW	Confer with Stout and Burns Bair re: mediation preparation	0.50	\$580.00
B155	02/14/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: presentation to committee re: mediation position	1.10	\$1,507.00
B155	02/19/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: mediation preparation	0.40	\$464.00
B155	02/19/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: mediation preparation	0.60	\$696.00
B155	02/19/25	DC	Review and update mediation attendee list	0.30	\$120.00
B155	02/19/25	JDP	Prepare for mediation	0.60	\$822.00
B155	02/20/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: mediation preparation	0.80	\$928.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B155	02/20/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: mediation preparation	1.00	\$1,160.00
B155	02/21/25	BIW	Confer with BRG and Stout re: valuation of Debtor's real estate	0.60	\$696.00
B155	02/23/25	BIW	Review presentation to Debtor re: prior settlement proposal	0.40	\$464.00
B155	02/24/25	BIW	Attend Mediation Session	7.30	\$8,468.00
B155	02/24/25	JDP	Attend mediation	7.00	\$9,590.00
B155	02/25/25	BIW	Attend Mediation Session	8.90	\$10,324.00
B155	02/25/25	JDP	Attend mediation	8.50	\$11,645.00
B155	02/26/25	BIW	Confer with Committee member to debrief on mediation	0.60	\$696.00
B155	02/26/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol re: strategy	0.40	\$464.00
B155	02/26/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member to debrief on mediation	0.60	\$696.00
B155	02/26/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member to debrief on mediation	0.40	\$464.00
B155	02/26/25	JDP	Develop mediation strategy	0.80	\$1,096.00
B155	02/26/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: status and strategy	0.40	\$548.00
B155	02/27/25	BIW	Confer with Mediators re: status of negotiations	0.90	\$1,044.00
B155	02/27/25	BIW	Confer with J. Prol re: analysis of Debtor's mediation proposal	0.90	\$1,044.00
B155	02/27/25	JDP	Strategize with B. Weisenberg re: mediation strategy	0.90	\$1,233.00
B155	02/27/25	JDP	Review property of estate analysis and insurance claims analysis and develop mediation strategy	1.20	\$1,644.00
B155	02/27/25	JDP	Call with mediators re: settlement offer	0.90	\$1,233.00
B155	02/28/25	BIW	Confer with Mediators re: follow-up on previous day's call	0.50	\$580.00
B155	02/28/25	BIW	Confer with Burns Bair re: debrief on mediation	0.80	\$928.00
B155	02/28/25	BIW	Confer with Judge Sontchi re: follow-up on previous day's call	0.30	\$348.00
B155	02/28/25	BIW	Review and revise draft of Property of Estate Stipulation	0.30	\$348.00
B155	02/28/25	JDP	Participate in call with co-counsel re: mediation strategy	0.80	\$1,096.00
B155	02/28/25	JDP	Develop mediation strategy	0.80	\$1,096.00
B155	02/28/25	JDP	Participate in call with mediators	0.50	\$685.00
B155	02/28/25	JDP	Call with Judge Sontchi re: mediation	0.30	\$411.00
B155	03/02/25	BIW	Confer with Mediator re: debrief on mediation sessions	0.30	\$348.00
B155	03/06/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: ability to pay analysis	0.50	\$580.00
B155	03/06/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: ability to pay analysis	0.40	\$464.00
B155	03/06/25	JDP	Review ability to pay analysis; develop strategy for counter	0.60	\$822.00
B155	03/07/25	JDP	E-mails to/from Judge Sontchi re: follow-up on mediation	0.20	\$274.00
B155	03/08/25	JDP	Draft e-mail to Judge Sontchi re: mediation	0.30	\$411.00
B155	03/18/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: settlement strategy	0.50	\$685.00
B155	03/18/25	JDP	Follow-up call with BRG re: settlement strategy	0.50	\$685.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 13 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B155	03/20/25	BIW	Draft email to BRG re: asset analysis and recovery for purposes of offer analysis	0.40	\$464.00
B155	03/25/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re ability to pay analysis	0.60	\$822.00
B155	03/26/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG and counsel for Committee member re: asset analysis	0.80	\$928.00
B155	03/26/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG and SCC re: ability to pay analysis	0.80	\$1,096.00
B155	04/09/25	JDP	Develop alternate insurance assignment provision	1.30	\$1,781.00
B155	04/24/25	JDP	Call with co-counsel re: settlement strategy	0.50	\$685.00
			Total B155 - Mediation	87.30	\$108,113.50
B160 Fee/Em	ployment App	olications	=	=======================================	
B160	01/03/25	DC	E-mail with local counsel re: CNO for monthly fee statements	0.10	\$40.00
B160	01/09/25	DC	E-mail with local counsel re: CNO for November monthly fee statements	0.10	\$40.00
B160	01/23/25	DC	Reconcile fees and update fee application status chart	0.20	\$80.00
B160	01/24/25	DC	Prepare LS' December monthly fee statement with exhibits	0.40	\$160.00
B160	01/30/25	DC	Commence drafting LS' Fifth Interim Fee Application	0.70	\$280.00
B160	02/06/25	DC	Revise interim bill for exhibits to Fifth Interim Fee Application	0.40	\$160.00
B160	02/10/25	DC	Continue drafting LS' Fifth Interim Fee Application	1.20	\$480.00
B160	02/10/25	DC	Prepare draft budget for sixth interim period	0.90	\$360.00
B160	02/11/25	DC	Continue drafting LS' Fifth Interim Fee Application	1.50	\$600.00
B160	02/11/25	DC	Revise draft budget for sixth interim period and confer with B. Weisenberg re: same	0.30	\$120.00
B160	02/12/25	BIW	Revise budget for January 2025 to April 2025	0.30	\$348.00
B160	02/12/25	DC	Continue drafting LS' Fifth Interim Fee Application	2.40	\$960.00
B160	02/13/25	BIW	Revise budget for January 2025 to April 2025	0.20	\$232.00
B160	02/13/25	DC	Revise Budget in final form for transmission to the Committee	0.50	\$200.00
B160	02/13/25	DC	Finalize drafting, proofing, editing LS' Fifth Interim Fee Application with exhibits A-H, Declarations and transmittal letter	4.10	\$1,640.00
B160	02/13/25	EBL	Assist D. Claussen with preparation of interim fee application; reconcile fee application chart	1.60	\$608.00
B160	02/13/25	JDP	Review and edit LS 5th interim fee application	0.80	\$1,096.00
B160	02/13/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft budget	0.30	\$411.00
B160	02/14/25	DC	Final revisions and formatting to LS' Fifth Interim Fee Application with Exhibits A-G, and coordinate with local counsel re: filing	1.40	\$560.00
B160	02/14/25	JDP	Review and comment on revised draft of LS fifth interim fee application (.8) and final version of same (.4)	1.20	\$1,644.00
B160	02/15/25	DC	Draft LS' January Monthly Fee Statement	0.40	\$160.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B160	02/15/25	DC	Download filed fee applications, update fee application status chart and update attorney calendar (.3); prepare LEDES files and forward same to the UST (.3)	0.60	\$240.00
B160	03/05/25	DC	Update fee application status chart and attorney calendar	0.20	\$80.00
B160	03/13/25	DC	Commence drafting LS' February monthly fee statement	0.30	\$120.00
B160	03/26/25	DC	Edit and finalize LS' February Monthly Fee Statement with exhibits	0.40	\$160.00
B160	04/24/25	DC	Draft LS' March Monthly Fee Statement with exhibits	0.40	\$160.00
B160	04/29/25	DC	E-mails with J. Prol re: revisions to March monthly fee statement (.2); revise monthly fee statement and coordinate with local counsel re: filing and service (.3)	0.50	\$200.00
B160	04/29/25	EBL	Update master fee application chart	0.20	\$76.00
			Total B160 - Fee/Employment Applications	21.60	\$11,215.00
B165 Employ	yment and Ret	ention Applicati	ions - Others		
B165	02/11/25	BIW	Revise Stout Expert Notice	0.30	\$348.00
B165	02/11/25	BIW	Research re: prospective expert witnesses	0.60	\$696.00
B165	02/11/25	JDP	Review CV of potential expert	0.20	\$274.00
B165	02/11/25	ZM	Search for expert reports, testimonies, affidavits, declarations for potential expert witness	2.50	\$1,050.00
B165	02/12/25	JDP	Review and comment on e-mail stream re: retention of expert for confirmation trial	0.20	\$274.00
B165	02/13/25	CD	Review background of potential expert witness	1.90	\$1,643.50
B165	02/14/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert re: real estate valuation	0.80	\$928.00
B165	02/14/25	JDP	Participate in call with prospective expert	0.60	\$822.00
B165	02/14/25	LHS	Draft supplemental retention application for BRG, proposed order, and declaration and exchange correspondences with B. Weisenberg re: same	4.20	\$4,431.00
B165	02/17/25	BIW	Review and revise Supplemental BRG Application and Order	0.60	\$696.00
B165	02/17/25	LHS	Review edits from B. Weisenberg to Supplemental BRG Retention Application and proposed order and revise further (.5); revise draft Declaration of P. Shields ISO same (1.0)	1.50	\$1,582.50
B165	02/18/25	LHS	Finalize BRG supplemental retention application documents	0.30	\$316.50
B165	02/19/25	CD	Review background of potential expert	0.30	\$259.50
B165	03/06/25	BIW	Confer with prospective Real Estate Expert	0.50	\$580.00
B165	03/06/25	JDP	Call with prospective real estate consultant	0.50	\$685.00
B165	03/09/25	BIW	Review Hilco Retention Application	0.30	\$348.00
B165	03/10/25	JDP	Call with prospective real estate consultant	0.40	\$548.00
B165	03/10/25	LHS	Review retention application and order for Stout and correspondence re: same for purposes of drafting supplemental retention application	0.50	\$527.50
B165	03/10/25	LHS	Review and analyze Hilco application, proposed order, declarations and exhibits	1.00	\$1,055.00
B165	03/11/25	BIW	Review CV and related materials re: prospective expert on real estate valuation	0.40	\$464.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B165	03/11/25	BIW	Draft email to Debtor and UST re: Notice of Revised Stout Retention	0.20	\$232.00
B165	03/11/25	LHS	Work on supplemental Stout application and proposed order	2.10	\$2,215.50
B165	03/12/25	LHS	Revise BRG retention and Stout retention applications (1.2); review and incorporate comments to supplemental BRG retention and revise both supplemental BRG retention and Stout Retention further (.6); review e-mail re: CVs and qualifications for incorporation into supplemental Stout retention (.2)	2.00	\$2,110.00
B165	03/14/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: proposed retention of expert real estate advisor	0.40	\$464.00
B165	03/18/25	LHS	E-mail BRG team re: supplemental retention application draft	0.20	\$211.00
B165	03/19/25	BIW	Review and revise Stout Real Estate Retention pleadings	0.30	\$348.00
B165	03/19/25	LHS	Review and incorporate BRG's edits to BRG Supplemental Retention Application (.3); review comments to revise Stout Supplemental Retention Application (.2); review original Stout application for incorporation of additional sections (.4)	0.90	\$949.50
B165	03/21/25	LHS	Revise Stout's supplemental retention application and draft declaration (1.8); e-mail Stout professionals resame (.2); update BRG supplemental retention application (.4)	2.40	\$2,532.00
B165	03/24/25	LHS	Revise draft Stout declaration, review professionals' CVs, and make additional edits to Stout supplemental application	1.70	\$1,793.50
B165	03/25/25	LHS	Review responses from Stout to questions re: supplemental retention application and revise Stout's supplemental retention application and declaration	0.80	\$844.00
B165	03/26/25	LHS	Review additional responses from Stout and revise Stout supplemental retention application and declaration further	0.50	\$527.50
B165	03/27/25	LHS	Continue to revise Stout supplemental retention application, declaration, and proposed order	2.00	\$2,110.00
B165	03/28/25	LHS	Further update supplemental retention application for Stout	0.60	\$633.00
B165	03/31/25	BIW	Review and revise Stout Supplemental Retention Application (.4); draft email re: same (.2)	0.60	\$696.00
B165	03/31/25	LHS	Review comments on Stout Supplemental Retention Application and e-mails/calls with Stout team for additional information (.7); revise Stout Supplemental Retention Application and declaration (1.8)	2.50	\$2,637.50
B165	04/02/25	BIW	Review and revise Stout Supplemental Retention Application	0.40	\$464.00
B165	04/02/25	CMR	Call with BRG re: expert retention	0.40	\$450.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B165	04/02/25	LHS	Review B. Weisenberg's changes to Stout Supplemental Retention Application and calls with B. Weisenberg to discuss strategy (.6); further revise BRG and Stout supplemental retention applications (1.0); call with C. Restel and BRG (.5); send e-mails to BRG and internally re: expert reports (.3); exchange e-mails with Stout re: supplemental retention application (.2)	2.60	\$2,743.00
B165	04/03/25	LHS	Edit Stout supplemental retention application, declaration and order and finalize for filing	0.40	\$422.00
B165	04/03/25	LHS	Exchange e-mails with BRG re: retention application and next steps (.2); call with B. Weisenberg re: supplemental retention applications (.2)	0.40	\$422.00
B165	04/04/25	JDP	Review and comment on supplemental application to retain Stout	1.20	\$1,644.00
B165	04/04/25	LHS	Review and incorporate changes to Shields Declaration ISO BRG Supplemental Retention Application and respond to BRG's email (.4); edit Stout supplemental retention application and e-mail R. Rosen (.4); exchange e-mails with R. Rosen re: Stout disclosures of disinterestedness (.2); review edits to Stout supplemental retention declaration and comments from J. Prol and B. Weisenberg re: same (.5); revise Stout application (.4)	1.90	\$2,004.50
B165	04/05/25	LHS	Revise Stout retention application and declaration	1.00	\$1,055.00
B165	04/06/25	BIW	Review and revise Stout retention pleadings	0.40	\$464.00
B165	04/06/25	BIW	Draft email to U.S. Trustee re: preview of Stout retention pleadings	0.20	\$232.00
B165	04/06/25	LHS	Call with B. Weisenberg and further revise Stout retention application	1.00	\$1,055.00
B165	04/07/25	BIW	Review and revise Stout retention pleadings	0.60	\$696.00
B165	04/07/25	JDP	Review and edit revised draft of Stout supplemental retention application (.5); confer with B. Weisenberg resame (.1)	0.60	\$822.00
B165	04/07/25	LHS	Review and analyze J. Prol's comments to Stout retention application (.3); review final draft of Stout application, declaration, and order with attention to new revisions (.4); send to Stout for approval (.2); revise Stout application further and call R. Rosen (.6)	1.50	\$1,582.50
B165	04/08/25	LHS	Edit and finalize Stout retention application for filing	0.30	\$316.50
B165	04/08/25	LHS	Review UST's comments to the Stout retention application (.2); revise proposed order authorizing stout retention (.3); send revised order with redline and final retention documents to R. Rosen and Stout team and exchange correspondence re: finalizing same (.4)	0.90	\$949.50
B165	04/09/25	LHS	Exchange e-mail correspondence with BRG and call with B. Weisenberg re: finalizing BRG supplemental retention application (.3); review latest drafts of BRG supplemental application (.2)	0.50	\$527.50
B165	04/09/25	LHS	E-mail local counsel re: filing Stout retention application (.2); exchange multiple e-mails and calls with R. Rosen re: finalizing declaration (.5)	0.70	\$738.50
B165	04/10/25	BIW	Confer with J. Kim re: expert retention	0.30	\$348.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B165	04/10/25	JDP	Call with J. Kim re: potential experts	0.30	\$411.00
B165	04/10/25	LHS	Finalize drafts of BRG supplemental retention application, declaration, and order	0.50	\$527.50
B165	04/11/25	JDP	Vet process for selecting experts	0.30	\$411.00
B165	04/14/25	JDP	Vet potential experts for confirmation	0.50	\$685.00
B165	04/14/25	JDP	Review and edit supplemental BRG retention application	0.30	\$411.00
B165	04/14/25	LHS	Work on finalizing BRG supplemental retention and exchange e-mails with team re: potential revisions to same (.5); attention to responses from local counsel re: Stout retention application (.2)	0.70	\$738.50
B165	04/14/25	WKR	Emails from and to J. Prol re: identifying expert witness re certain charitable questions; review ACTEC fellows to identify experts	0.90	\$1,381.50
B165	04/15/25	BIW	Participate in call with SCC Working Group re: Plan's insurance assignment	0.80	\$928.00
B165	04/15/25	BIW	Confer with Burns Bair re: expert retention	0.50	\$580.00
B165	04/15/25	JDP	Participate in all with Burns Bair re: identifying an insurance expert	0.50	\$685.00
B165	04/15/25	LHS	Further revise and finalize BRG supplemental retention application and send to local counsel (.4); e-mail BRG for approval of retention application (.2)	0.60	\$633.00
B165	04/15/25	MAK	Telephone call with insurance counsel re: potential insurance expert for confirmation	0.50	\$567.50
B165	04/15/25	ZM	Search for Trust & Estate expert witnesses in California	1.50	\$630.00
B165	04/16/25	LHS	Exchange multiple e-mails with BRG and local counsel re: finalizing declaration for supplemental retention application (.3); review proposed changes to BRG retention application from P. Shields (.3)	0.60	\$633.00
B165	04/17/25	BIW	Confer with P. Shields re: BRG expert retention issues	0.30	\$348.00
B165	04/17/25	JDP	Review materials on potential experts	0.30	\$411.00
B165	04/17/25	LHS	Create and send redline of P. Shield's changes to the BRG Supplemental retention application and confer with B. Weisenberg re: same (.4); review and incorporate new revisions to BRG retention application and finalize documents for execution and filing (.6)	1.00	\$1,055.00
B165	04/18/25	BIW	Research prospective experts	0.60	\$696.00
B165	04/18/25	BIW	Review Debtor's objection to Stout retention (.3); confer with C. Frankel re: response to same (.3)	0.60	\$696.00
B165	04/18/25	CTH	Research on experts	3.00	\$1,230.00
B165	04/18/25	MAK	Review and analyze CVs and background documents on potential insurance, trust and estate and first amendment experts	3.80	\$4,313.00
B165	04/19/25	CD	Review background of potential expert	1.80	\$1,557.00
B165	04/19/25	CGS	Review background information of possible expert	2.40	\$1,884.00
B165	04/20/25	CGS	Review background information and materials of potential expert	0.80	\$628.00
B165	04/21/25	CD	Review background for expert witness	0.40	\$346.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B165	04/21/25	CD	Review background of potential expert witness	3.50	\$3,027.50
B165	04/21/25	CGS	Review background information and materials of potential expert	3.10	\$2,433.50
B165	04/21/25	JBJ	Review documents re: expert	3.70	\$2,904.50
B165	04/21/25	ZM	Search for expert witness material for potential expert	1.00	\$420.00
B165	04/21/25	ZM	Retrieve all depositions, testimonies, affidavits, declarations and expert reports for Jeffrey Stempel per C. Restel	2.00	\$840.00
B165	04/22/25	CD	Review background for potential expert witness	6.80	\$5,882.00
B165	04/22/25	CTH	Expert witness research on potential expert	2.00	\$820.00
B165	04/22/25	JBJ	Review documents re: expert	4.20	\$3,297.00
B165	04/22/25	ZM	Search for expert materials for potential expert	1.50	\$630.00
B165	04/23/25	CD	Review background of potential expert witness	1.20	\$1,038.00
B165	04/23/25	JDP	Review research re: potential experts	0.20	\$274.00
B165	04/23/25	JDP	Continued review of research re: potential experts	0.30	\$411.00
B165	04/23/25	JDP	Participate in call with prospective expert witness	0.60	\$822.00
B165	04/24/25	BIW	Revise Stout's Retention Application pursuant to Court ruling	0.30	\$348.00
B165	04/24/25	CTH	Research on potential expert	0.20	\$82.00
B165	04/26/25	JDP	Review and comment on revised draft of Stout and BRG retention orders	0.20	\$274.00
B165	04/29/25	BIW	Participate in call with prospective Insurance Expert	0.40	\$464.00
B165	04/29/25	BIW	Confer with Litigation Team re: expert witness selection	0.50	\$580.00
B165	04/30/25	BIW	Review reports prepared on prospective expert witnesses	0.40	\$464.00
B165	04/30/25	LHS	Review entered stout retention order	0.20	\$211.00
B165	04/30/25	LHS	Work on expert retention applications	0.40	\$422.00
			Total B165 - Employment and Retention Applications - Others	106.30	\$100,798.50
B170 Fee/Em	ployment Obj	ections_			
B170	02/12/25	BIW	Review proposed Hilco retention and draft email re: same	0.30	\$348.00
B170	02/12/25	JDP	Review and comment on email re: debtor's retention of Hilco as ordinary course professional	0.20	\$274.00
B170	02/13/25	JDP	Review and comment on revised email to debtor's counsel re: debtor's proposed retention of Hilco	0.10	\$137.00
B170	02/14/25	LHS	Review e-mail correspondences with debtor re: Hilco retention; research re: professional retention	0.50	\$527.50
B170	02/19/25	LHS	Draft and revise objection to Hilco OCP retention	3.50	\$3,692.50
B170	02/21/25	BIW	Review and revise Objection to Hilco retention	0.60	\$696.00
B170	02/21/25	LHS	Review revisions to objection to Hilco retention per comments received	0.30	\$316.50
B170	02/24/25	BIW	Revise Objection to Hilco retention	0.40	\$464.00
B170	02/24/25	JDP	Review and comment on objection to retention of Hilco	0.40	\$548.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B170	02/24/25	LHS	Revise Hilco objection per comments received from J. Prol and B. Weisenberg	0.50	\$527.50
B170	02/25/25	LHS	Proofread, citecheck, and revise objection to Hilco retention (1.5); confer with B. Weisenberg re: same (.2)	1.70	\$1,793.50
B170	04/10/25	DC	Review expense objections from fee examiner and pull receipts for further review	0.30	\$120.00
B170	04/10/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: fees; e-mail to LS team re: same; review letter from A. Uetz re: same	0.30	\$411.00
B170	04/10/25	JDP	Review fee examiner report on LS fifth interim fee application; compile information for response	0.50	\$685.00
B170	04/14/25	BIW	Begin drafting responsive letter to Debtor's letter re: administrative fee order	0.70	\$812.00
B170	04/15/25	BIW	Continue drafting responsive letter to Debtor's letter re: administrative fee order	0.40	\$464.00
B170	04/15/25	BIW	Continue drafting responsive letter to Debtor's letter re: administrative fee order	0.80	\$928.00
B170	04/16/25	BIW	Review M. Kemner February and March invoices (.3); confer with M. Kaplan re: same (.2)	0.50	\$580.00
B170	04/16/25	BIW	Finalize letter to A. Uetz re: analysis of administrative fee order	0.60	\$696.00
B170	04/18/25	CF	Draft response to Debtor's objection to Stout application (1.8); call with B. Weisenberg and L. Sklar re: same (.5)	2.30	\$1,518.00
B170	04/18/25	JDP	Review and edit draft response to Debtor's counsel's letter re: admin expenses	0.40	\$548.00
B170	04/18/25	JDP	E-mails with M. Lee re: Debtor objection to retention of Stout; call with C. Restel re: same; Call with M. Lee and C. Restel re: same	0.50	\$685.00
B170	04/18/25	LHS	Review Debtor's objection to Stout retention and related pleadings (.5); call with B. Weisenberg and C. Frankel re: drafting response to objection (.5)	1.00	\$1,055.00
B170	04/18/25	MAK	Review RCBO limited objection to Stout retention	0.30	\$340.50
B170	04/19/25	CF	Review disclosure statement, Douglas Wilson application, Stout application, and Debtor objection, and draft response to objection (3.5); call with B. Weisenberg re: same (.1)	3.60	\$2,376.00
B170	04/19/25	LHS	Review draft response to Debtor's objection to Stout retention application	0.50	\$527.50
B170	04/21/25	BIW	Review and revise Response to Stout Objection and add request for emergency hearing	1.40	\$1,624.00
B170	04/21/25	LHS	Revise response to debtor's objection to Stout retention (1.0); review subsequently revised draft of response to Stout objection (.3)	1.30	\$1,371.50
B170	04/22/25	BIW	Participate in call with counsel for Debtor re: proposal on amendment to Interim Fee Order	0.20	\$232.00
B170	04/22/25	BIW	Revise Response to Stout Objection	0.40	\$464.00
B170	04/22/25	CF	Call with B. Weisenberg re: motion to modify interim compensation order	0.20	\$132.00
B170	04/22/25	CF	Call with B. Weisenberg re: Stout response	0.10	\$66.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B170	04/22/25	JDP	Review and edit draft reply to limited objection to Stout Real Estate retention	1.30	\$1,781.00
B170	04/22/25	JDP	Call with A. Uetz re: Debtor request to modify interim compensation order	0.20	\$274.00
B170	04/22/25	LHS	Review latest revisions to response to Stout retention application objection	0.30	\$316.50
B170	04/22/25	MAK	Review and revise reply brief to objection to Stout retention	0.40	\$454.00
B170	04/23/25	CF	Review motion to revise interim compensation order	0.40	\$264.00
B170	04/23/25	CMR	Review Debtor Motion to Amend Interim Compensation Procedures	0.20	\$225.00
B170	04/24/25	BIW	Review Fee Examiner's Report	0.20	\$232.00
B170	04/24/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Lee re: respond to inquiry on narrowing scope of BRG's retention	0.20	\$232.00
B170	04/24/25	CF	Draft objection to debtor's motion to amend interim compensation procedures	1.20	\$792.00
B170	04/24/25	CF	Call with B. Weisenberg re: Debtor's motion to modify interim compensation order	0.20	\$132.00
B170	04/24/25	LHS	Review various e-mails between Committee and Debtors re: BRG supplemental retention application and call with B. Weisenberg re: response to Debtors' limited objection to BRG retention scope	0.50	\$527.50
B170	04/24/25	MAK	Call with M. Lee re: BRG expert retention	0.30	\$340.50
B170	04/25/25	BIW	Confer with M. Lee re: Stout and BRG retentions	0.40	\$464.00
B170	04/25/25	BIW	Revise Stout Retention Application	0.20	\$232.00
B170	04/28/25	BIW	Confer with P. Shields re: analysis of Debtor's liquidity	0.40	\$464.00
B170	04/29/25	BIW	Draft email to BRG re: analysis of Debtor's liquidity	0.40	\$464.00
			Total B170 - Fee/Employment Objections	31.60	\$32,154.50
B175 Fee Ap	oplications and	Invoices - Othe	e <u>rs</u>		
B175	01/20/25	BIW	Review M. Kemner's November invoice	0.20	\$232.00
B175	02/02/25	BIW	Review M. Kemner Invoice December 2024	0.20	\$232.00
B175	02/10/25	DC	Review retention pleadings for Douglas Wilson Companies; confer with B. Weisenberg re: interim fee application and commence drafting same	0.50	\$200.00
B175	02/11/25	BIW	Review and revise Douglas Wilson First Interim Fee Application	0.70	\$812.00
B175	02/11/25	DC	Draft First Interim Fee Application for Douglas Wilson Companies as Real Estate Consultant for the Committee (2.5); review docket for prior fee statements, retention papers and declarations (.5); e-mail to DWC requesting revised invoices reflecting separate components of services provided and expenses incurred (.3)	3.30	\$1,320.00
B175	02/12/25	BIW	Confer with Douglas Wilson re: assistance needed with First Interim Fee Application	0.30	\$348.00
B175	02/12/25	DC	Conference call with R. Weidman of Douglas Wilson re: expenses	0.40	\$160.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 21 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	02/12/25	DC	Revise and format Douglas Wilson First Interim Fee Application, circulate redlined version and prepare exhibit for expenses (1.1); draft Declaration of D. Wilson in support of First Interim Fee Application (.6)	1.70	\$680.00
B175	02/15/25	BIW	Review Debtor professional fee applications	0.40	\$464.00
B175	02/28/25	BIW	Review Foley January 2025 MFS	0.30	\$348.00
B175	03/03/25	BIW	Review M. Kemner January 2025 invoice	0.20	\$232.00
B175	03/12/25	BIW	Confer with G. Albert to prepare for Fee Hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B175	03/28/25	BIW	Review Debtor professional Monthly Fee Statements	0.40	\$464.00
B175	04/16/25	BIW	Review Hilco Real Estate's March invoice	0.20	\$232.00
B175	04/16/25	BIW	Review Foley's March invoice	0.30	\$348.00
B175	04/21/25	BIW	Review Stout's March invoice	0.20	\$232.00
B175	04/30/25	BIW	Review Foley March 2025 Monthly Fee Statement	0.40	\$464.00
			Total B175 - Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	10.00	\$7,116.00
B180 Avoidar	nce Action Ar	<u>nalysis</u>			
B180	04/04/25	CMR	Finalize (.1) and circulate for filing (.1) Stipulation re: Avoidance Action Deadline	0.20	\$225.00
			Total B180 - Avoidance Action Analysis	0.20	\$225.00
B185 Assump	tion/Rejection	n of Leases and	<u> </u>		
B185	03/12/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Fifth Motion to Extend Deadline to Assume or Reject Unexpired Leases	0.30	\$348.00
			Total B185 - Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts	0.30	\$348.00
B190 Other C	ontested Matt	ers (excluding a	assumption/rejection motions)		
B190	01/31/25	BIW	Review Motion to Extend Removal Deadline (.2); draft email re: same (.2)	0.40	\$464.00
B190	03/14/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Motion for Protective Order	0.50	\$562.50
B190	04/02/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Motion for Entry of Order Approving Settlement with Ruben Galindo	0.30	\$348.00
			Total B190 - Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	1.20	\$1,374.50
B200 - Opera	tions				
B210 Busines	s Operations				
B210	01/13/25	BIW	Revise email to S. Moses re: question on CCCEB lease payment	0.10	\$116.00
B210	01/14/25	CMR	Confer with Debtor's counsel re: payments to CCCEB	0.10	\$112.50
B210	01/22/25	BIW	Review Debtor's December Monthly Operating Report	0.20	\$232.00
B210	02/18/25	BIW	Review Periodic Report as of June 30, 2024 Regarding Value, Operations, and Profitability of CTN	0.30	\$348.00
B210	02/21/25	BIW	Review January 2025 Monthly Operating Report	0.20	\$232.00
B210	03/21/25	BIW	Review February Monthly Operating Report	0.30	\$348.00
			Total B210 - Business Operations	1.20	\$1,388.50
B300 - Claim	s and Plan		_		

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B310 Claims	Administratio	n and Objection	<u>18</u>		
B310	01/16/25	NF	Review and comment on OPF stip and email re: same	0.40	\$458.00
B310	01/20/25	BIW	Review and revise OPF Scheduling Stipulation	0.20	\$232.00
B310	01/22/25	BIW	Devise OPF claim objection strategy	0.60	\$696.00
B310	01/22/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Stipulation Scheduling OPF Claim Objection (.2); review OPF Claim Objection (1.0); confer with M. Kaplan and N. Fulfree re: same (.7)	1.90	\$2,137.50
B310	01/22/25	MAK	Inter-office conference with C. Restel and N. Fulfree re: OPF claim objection	0.70	\$794.50
B310	01/22/25	NF	Call with C. Restel, and M. Kaplan re: OPF claim objection scheduling and strategy	0.70	\$801.50
B310	01/23/25	CF	Call with R. Simons re: proofs of claim and potential amendments re: same	0.60	\$396.00
B310	01/25/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: response to OPF Claim Objection	1.20	\$1,350.00
B310	01/25/25	MAK	Review and analyze opposition to OPF claim objection	1.90	\$2,156.50
B310	01/26/25	BIW	Review Debtor's and OPF's Responses to OPF Claim Objection; outline response to same	1.60	\$1,856.00
B310	01/26/25	MAK	Review and analyze opposition to OPF claim objection	1.30	\$1,475.50
B310	01/26/25	NF	Initial review of OPF claim objection responses and draft notes re: same (.9); review B. Weisenberg notes re: same (.4)	1.30	\$1,488.50
B310	01/27/25	BIW	Draft document demands of OPF, RCWC and Debtor re: OPF claim objection	1.40	\$1,624.00
B310	01/27/25	BIW	Outline Reply to Responses to OPF Claim Objection	0.70	\$812.00
B310	01/27/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: OPF Claim Objection	0.20	\$225.00
B310	01/27/25	JDP	Review debtor's statement in response to OPF claim objection	0.20	\$274.00
B310	01/28/25	BIW	Draft document demands of OPF, RCWC and Debtor re: OPF claim objection	1.30	\$1,508.00
B310	01/28/25	BIW	Outline arguments to be made in response to OPF Reply to UCC Claim Objection	1.40	\$1,624.00
B310	01/28/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee member re: review of filed claims	0.20	\$232.00
B310	01/28/25	CF	Call with R. Simons re: proofs of claim (.4); email communications re: same (.1)	0.50	\$330.00
B310	01/28/25	LHS	Begin review OPF claim documents to draft reply	0.80	\$844.00
B310	01/28/25	MAK	Review and analyze opposition to OPF claim objection	1.60	\$1,816.00
B310	01/29/25	BIW	Continue drafting document demands of OPF, RCWC and Debtor re: OPF claim objection	1.30	\$1,508.00
B310	01/29/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: OPF Claim Objection	1.10	\$1,237.50
B310	01/29/25	LHS	Review OPF claim objection and related pleadings, declarations, and statements in order to prepare draft of response	2.40	\$2,532.00
B310	01/30/25	BIW	Continue drafting document demands of OPF, RCWC and Debtor	1.60	\$1,856.00
B310	01/30/25	BIW	Continue drafting document demands of OPF, RCWC and Debtor	1.20	\$1,392.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B310	01/31/25	BIW	Draft outline of Reply to OPF Responses	1.10	\$1,276.00
B310	02/03/25	BIW	Outline amended OPF Claim Objection	0.90	\$1,044.00
B310	02/03/25	BIW	Outline OPF Claim Objection Response	0.30	\$348.00
B310	02/03/25	BIW	Confer with Stout re: analysis of RCWC Claims	0.50	\$580.00
B310	02/03/25	CF	Review Debtors' reply to OPF claim objection (1); call with B. Weisenberg and C. Restel re: same (.6); and call re: same with LS team (.2)	1.80	\$1,188.00
B310	02/04/25	BIW	Confer with M. Moore re: claims reconciliation	0.40	\$464.00
B310	02/04/25	CF	Call with R. Simons re: proofs of claim issues (.2); call with B. Weisenberg and M. Moore re: same (.2); call with B. Weisenberg re: solution for same (.2)	0.60	\$396.00
B310	02/04/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: amending OPF Claim Objection	0.70	\$787.50
B310	02/06/25	MAK	Strategize with B. Weisenberg and C. Restel re: OPF adversary, claim objection and proposed stipulation	1.00	\$1,135.00
B310	02/07/25	BIW	Draft emails to counsel for Debtor and counsel for Committee member re: reconciling survivor claims	0.50	\$580.00
B310	02/07/25	CMR	Prepare Amended Objection to OPF Claim	3.40	\$3,825.00
B310	02/10/25	CMR	Prepare Amended Objection to OPF Claim	4.10	\$4,612.50
B310	02/11/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Debtor re: identity of survivor filing proofs of claim	0.20	\$232.00
B310	02/11/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Amended OPF Claim Objection	0.30	\$337.50
B310	02/12/25	BIW	Call with LS team re: OPF Claim Objection	0.70	\$812.00
B310	02/12/25	BIW	Revise OPF Claim Objection (.4); draft email to counsel for Debtor and OPF re: same (.3)	0.70	\$812.00
B310	02/12/25	CMR	Review and revise Objection to OPF Claim (3.2); Call with M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg re: same (.7)	3.90	\$4,387.50
B310	02/12/25	MAK	Confer with C. Restel and B. Weisenberg re: OPF claims objection	0.70	\$794.50
B310	02/13/25	BIW	Revise OPF Claim Objection	1.80	\$2,088.00
B310	02/13/25	CMR	Review and revise Objection to OPF Claim	0.40	\$450.00
B310	02/14/25	CMR	Review and revise OPF Claim Objection	1.00	\$1,125.00
B310	02/14/25	JDP	Review amended OPF claim objection	0.50	\$685.00
B310	02/17/25	BIW	Revise Second OPF Claim Objection	0.80	\$928.00
B310	02/17/25	CMR	Review and revise OPF Claim Objection	1.00	\$1,125.00
B310	02/17/25	JBJ	Verify and review source and citation accuracy and style in claim objection pleading	6.10	\$4,788.50
B310	02/17/25	JDP	Review and edit Committee's second objection to OPF Claim	1.30	\$1,781.00
B310	02/18/25	CMR	Review and revise Objection to OPF Claim	1.00	\$1,125.00
B310	02/18/25	JBJ	Verify and review source and citation accuracy and style in claim objection pleading	0.90	\$706.50
B310	02/21/25	BIW	Review proposed RCWC Amended Bar Date Order (.1); draft email re: same (.1)	0.20	\$232.00
B310	02/25/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team re: strategy for Objections to OPF Claim	0.10	\$112.50
B310	02/26/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: OPF Claim Objection	0.20	\$225.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B310	02/28/25	LHS	Review OPF claim stipulation	0.20	\$211.00
B310	03/04/25	LHS	Review entered order withdrawing OPF claim	0.20	\$211.00
B310	03/07/25	BIW	Draft Amended and Restated Stipulation re: Amended Bar Date	0.40	\$464.00
B310	03/07/25	BIW	Draft several emails to counsel for Debtor and RCWC re: granting access to certain claims to RCWC	0.30	\$348.00
B310	03/10/25	BIW	Confer with M. Moore and R. Manns re: RCWC's review of Survivor Proofs of Claim	0.40	\$464.00
B310	03/10/25	BIW	Confer with R. Manns re: RCWC's review of Survivor Proofs of Claim	0.40	\$464.00
B310	03/11/25	BIW	Review list of claims filed against RCWC	0.40	\$464.00
B310	03/11/25	BIW	Revise RCWC Claim Stipulation	0.20	\$232.00
B310	03/11/25	BIW	Draft several emails to counsel for RCWC re: RCWC Claim Stipulation	0.40	\$464.00
B310	03/12/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for RCWC re: RCWC Claim Stipulation	0.10	\$116.00
B310	03/13/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: RCWC access to claims	0.40	\$464.00
B310	03/13/25	BIW	Revise RCWC Amended and Restated POC Stipulation	0.40	\$464.00
B310	03/13/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor and RCWC re: RCWC Amended and Restated POC Stipulation	0.30	\$348.00
B310	03/13/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor and RCWC re: RCWC Amended and Restated POC Stipulation	0.80	\$928.00
B310	03/13/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Committee member re: RCWC's access to proofs of claim	0.40	\$464.00
B310	03/14/25	BIW	Revise RCWC Amended and Restated POC Stipulation	0.10	\$116.00
B310	03/19/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Moore re: RCWC access to Survivor proofs of claim	0.20	\$232.00
B310	03/24/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Claims filed	1.50	\$1,687.50
B310	03/27/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor and RCWC re: claim analysis	0.30	\$348.00
B310	04/03/25	BIW	Review Motion to file late claim (.3); draft email re: same (.2)	0.50	\$580.00
B310	04/17/25	BIW	Confer with M. Moore: duplicative claim issues	0.30	\$348.00
B310	04/23/25	BIW	Review Debtor's objection to Late Claim Motion	0.20	\$232.00
B310	04/24/25	BIW	Review Debtor's objection to Late Claim Motion	0.20	\$232.00
B310	04/24/25	BIW	Review Pacific's Objection to Late Claim Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B310	04/28/25	BIW	Confer with K. Roggendorf re: Late Filed Claim Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B310	04/28/25	BIW	Confer with D. Storey re: Late Filed Claim Motion	0.20	\$232.00
B310	04/30/25	BIW	Debrief with counsel for claimant requesting deemed timely filing of claims	0.30	\$348.00
B310	04/30/25	BIW	Debrief with counsel for claimant requesting deemed timely filing of claims	0.30	\$348.00
			Total B310 - Claims Administration and Objections	75.40	\$82,145.00

B320 Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	01/01/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team re: Objection to Disclosure Statement	0.10	\$112.50
B320	01/02/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: Committee's liquidation value analysis	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	01/02/25	BIW	Outline objection to Disclosure Statement	0.60	\$696.00
B320	01/02/25	CG	Confer with C. Restel re: drafting objection to disclosure statement	0.30	\$198.00
B320	01/02/25	CMR	Call with C. Gauvin re: issues re: Disclosure Statement in preparation for objection to same	0.30	\$337.50
B320	01/02/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: disclosure statement objection	1.00	\$1,370.00
B320	01/03/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: liquidation analysis issues	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	01/03/25	BIW	Confer with BRG and DWC re: real estate valuation analysis	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	01/03/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team re: issues re: Disclosure Statement Objection	0.10	\$112.50
B320	01/03/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: liquidation analysis	1.10	\$1,507.00
B320	01/03/25	JDP	Develop strategy re: upcoming disclosure statement hearing	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	01/03/25	MAK	Telephone call with BRG re: liquidation analysis	1.10	\$1,248.50
B320	01/04/25	CMR	Review Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.50	\$562.50
B320	01/04/25	EJS	Begin reviewing Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement (1.4); correspondence with B. Weisenberg and G. Albert (Keller) re same (.2)	1.60	\$1,360.00
B320	01/04/25	JDP	Review and analyze amended plan and disclosure statement	2.50	\$3,425.00
B320	01/05/25	BIW	Confer with G. Albert re: drafting of objection to Amended Disclosure Statement	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/05/25	BIW	Review and comment on Amended Plan	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	01/05/25	BIW	Confer with G. Albert and E. Seltzer re: outline points to be made in objection to Amended Disclosure Statement	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	01/05/25	BIW	Finalize draft of Committee's Solicitation letter	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/05/25	BIW	Outline arguments to be made to Amended Disclosure Statement	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	01/05/25	CG	Review disclosure statement approval pleadings and confirmation scheduling orders of prior diocese cases (3.0); draft and organize chart re same (1.2)	4.20	\$2,772.00
B320	01/05/25	CMR	Summary review of revised Plan and Disclosure Statement	2.00	\$2,250.00
B320	01/05/25	EJS	Call with B. Weisenberg and G. Albert (Keller) re Renewed DS Objection (.9); review DS Hearing transcript and Committee DS Objection re adequate disclosure issues (3.5); prepare summary chart re same (1.2); email correspondence with B. Weisenberg and G. Albert re same (.2)	5.80	\$4,930.00
B320	01/06/25	BIW	Outline additional objections to Disclosure Statement	0.60	\$696.00
B320	01/06/25	BIW	Review and comment on Amended Disclosure Statement	1.60	\$1,856.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	01/06/25	BIW	Confer with J. Bair re: analysis of Amended Disclosure Statement	0.30	\$348.00
B320	01/06/25	BIW	Confer with G. Albert re: drafting of objection to Amended Disclosure Statement	0.30	\$348.00
B320	01/06/25	EJS	Call with B. Weisenberg re Renewed Disclosure Statement Objection (.1); multiple calls (.5) (.2) (.1) with G. Albert (Keller) re issues in connection with same; draft Renewed Disclosure Statement Objection (6.8); related correspondence with Lowenstein team (.2)	7.90	\$6,715.00
B320	01/06/25	JDP	Review and analyze amended plan and disclosure statement	2.30	\$3,151.00
B320	01/07/25	BIW	Further comment on Disclosure Statement	0.80	\$928.00
B320	01/07/25	BIW	Draft email to G. Albert re: points to be made in Disclosure Statement Objection	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/07/25	BIW	Review draft of Disclosure Statement Objection (.4); draft email with comments to same (.5)	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	01/07/25	BIW	Draft emails re: proposed plan confirmation hearing scheduling	0.30	\$348.00
B320	01/07/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Disclosure Statement Objection	1.40	\$1,575.00
B320	01/07/25	EJS	Draft renewed Disclosure Statement Objection (6.7); call (.2) with G. Albert (Keller) re same; email correspondence with B. Weisenberg, G. Albert, and BRG re issues in connection with same (.2)	7.10	\$6,035.00
B320	01/08/25	BIW	Revise Solicitation Letter based on comments from Committee	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/08/25	BIW	Draft email to E. Seltzer re: outline objections to Disclosure Statement	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/08/25	BIW	Draft plan confirmation discovery schedule	0.30	\$348.00
B320	01/08/25	BIW	Review inserts to Amended Disclosure Statement Objection and comment on same	0.60	\$696.00
B320	01/08/25	BIW	Draft emails commenting on inserts to Amended Disclosure Statement	0.60	\$696.00
B320	01/08/25	CG	Revise disclosure statement objection (2.5); edit C. Restel's insert to DS objection (.5)	3.00	\$1,980.00
B320	01/08/25	CMR	Prepare objection to Disclosure Statement	2.90	\$3,262.50
B320	01/08/25	EJS	Research issue re Disclosure Statement Objection (1.0); call with G. Albert (Keller) re same (.2); email correspondence with B. Weisenberg and G. Albert re Disclosure Statement Objection (.3); revise Disclosure Statement Objection (.8); call with G. Albert re Disclosure Statement Objection Exhibit (.1); prepare exhibit (1.2).	3.60	\$3,060.00
B320	01/09/25	BIW	Continue revising Disclosure Statement Objection	1.90	\$2,204.00
B320	01/09/25	BIW	Continue revising Disclosure Statement Objection	2.70	\$3,132.00
B320	01/09/25	BIW	Review and revise Disclosure Statement Objection	4.70	\$5,452.00
B320	01/09/25	CMR	Prepare insert for Disclosure Statement Objection	0.30	\$337.50
B320	01/09/25	EJS	Revise Disclosure Statement Objection (.6); call with G. Albert (Keller) re same (.2); email correspondence with B. Weisenberg and G. Albert re same (.2)	1.00	\$850.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	01/09/25	JDP	Review and edit disclosure statement objection	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	01/09/25	JDP	Review amended plan and disclosure statement and outline objection	4.20	\$5,754.00
B320	01/10/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns and J. Bair re: objection to Amended Disclosure Statement	0.30	\$348.00
B320	01/10/25	BIW	Continue revising Disclosure Statement Objection	3.40	\$3,944.00
B320	01/10/25	BIW	Continue revising Disclosure Statement Objection	2.40	\$2,784.00
B320	01/10/25	BIW	Continue revising Disclosure Statement Objection	2.70	\$3,132.00
B320	01/10/25	BMC	Conduct research Ninth Circuit research re: free exercise clause	0.70	\$504.00
B320	01/10/25	EJS	Correspondence with Lowenstein team re Disclosure Statement Objection (.1); review filed version of same (.3)	0.40	\$340.00
B320	01/10/25	JDP	Review and revise revised draft of objection to disclosure statement	2.20	\$3,014.00
B320	01/10/25	JDP	Review and edit draft objection to amended disclosure statement	3.60	\$4,932.00
B320	01/10/25	JDP	Call with co-counsel re: comments on disclosure statement objection	0.40	\$548.00
B320	01/12/25	BIW	Review revised form of Ballots (.2); draft email to C. Restel re: same (.2)	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/13/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: comparable cases	0.60	\$696.00
B320	01/13/25	BIW	Draft emails to C. Restel re: proposed Property of Estate Stipulation	0.20	\$232.00
B320	01/13/25	BIW	Finalize revisions to Committee's Solicitation Letter	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/13/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Disclosure Statement and Solicitation Package	0.90	\$1,012.50
B320	01/13/25	MAK	Review and analyze amended disclosure statement and plan	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	01/14/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Reply to Committee's Disclosure Statement Objection (.5); outline response to same (1.1); confer with B. Gauvin re: research for same (.2)	1.80	\$2,088.00
B320	01/14/25	BIW	Revise proposed Property of Estate Stipulation	0.30	\$348.00
B320	01/14/25	CG	Correspond with B. Weisenberg re: research for best interest test	0.20	\$132.00
B320	01/14/25	EJS	Review Debtor's Reply to Second DS Objection	0.40	\$340.00
B320	01/15/25	BIW	Draft email to T. Burns re: question on Debtor's Reply to Amended Disclosure Statement Objection	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/16/25	CG	Perform and analyze research re: hypothetical liquidation test	3.40	\$2,244.00
B320	01/17/25	JDP	Develop strategy for ongoing disclosure statement disputes	1.80	\$2,466.00
B320	01/20/25	BIW	Draft email outlining approach to Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.60	\$696.00
B320	01/20/25	JDP	Review and comment on revised appendix to disclosure statement	0.50	\$685.00
B320	01/20/25	MAK	Review and analyze contested discovery schedules in recent dioceses cases	1.70	\$1,929.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	01/21/25	BIW	Develop plan confirmation strategy	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	01/21/25	BIW	Outline issues for meet and confer with Debtor	0.60	\$696.00
B320	01/21/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns post Amended Disclosure Statement hearing re: next steps	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/22/25	BIW	Review research on plan confirmation issues	0.80	\$928.00
B320	01/22/25	BIW	Outline factual and legal Plan confirmation issues to be addressed	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	01/22/25	BIW	Outline remaining issues with Disclosure Statement	0.80	\$928.00
B320	01/22/25	CG	Review and finalize fair and equitable test research	0.20	\$132.00
B320	01/22/25	CMR	Research re: potential expert witnesses re: Confirmation Hearing	0.30	\$337.50
B320	01/22/25	ZM	Search for any testimony, affidavits, expert reports, depositions, news and articles for potential expert witness	2.00	\$840.00
B320	01/23/25	BIW	Revise letter to accompany Disclosure Statement	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/23/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert	0.60	\$696.00
B320	01/23/25	BIW	Confer with prospective experts	0.60	\$696.00
B320	01/23/25	BIW	Confer with Litigation Team re: plan for contested confirmation hearing	1.00	\$1,160.00
B320	01/23/25	CMR	Call with LS Team re: preparation for confirmation hearing (1.0); Strategize with M. Kaplan re: Confirmation discovery issues and timing (.8)	1.80	\$2,025.00
B320	01/23/25	JDP	Meeting with LS team re: confirmation discovery and trial (1.); follow-up call with M. Kaplan re: same (.5)	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	01/23/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: confirmation litigation strategy (1.0) confer with J. Prol re: same (.5)	1.50	\$1,702.50
B320	01/23/25	MAK	Strategize with C. Restel re: confirmation discovery issues and timing	0.80	\$908.00
B320	01/24/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: Amended Disclosure Statement issues	0.80	\$928.00
B320	01/24/25	BIW	Outline remaining issues with Amended Disclosure Statement	1.80	\$2,088.00
B320	01/24/25	JDP	Call with B. Weisenberg re: preparing for follow-up call with debtor's counsel re: comments on amended disclosure statement	0.40	\$548.00
B320	01/24/25	JDP	Participate in call with Debtor's counsel re: comments to amended disclosure statement	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	01/25/25	JDP	Review revise disclosure statement, objection and hearing notes to prepare for meet and confer with debtor's counsel on further amendments to the disclosure statement	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	01/27/25	BIW	Prepare for call with Debtor re: remaining issues with Disclosure Statement	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/27/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: potential confirmation witnesses	0.20	\$225.00
B320	01/27/25	JDP	Review remaining DS objections and develop strategy for DS settlement conference and hearing	2.20	\$3,014.00
B320	01/27/25	KEM	Review disclosure statement and outline anticipated discovery requests	0.30	\$316.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	01/28/25	BIW	Meet and confer with Debtor's counsel re: Amended Disclosure Statement	1.80	\$2,088.00
B320	01/28/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: potential confirmation witnesses	0.20	\$225.00
B320	01/28/25	JDP	Participate in meet and confer with Debtor's counsel on revisions to the disclosure statement	1.80	\$2,466.00
B320	01/28/25	JDP	Meet and confer with Debtor's counsel re: Amended Disclosure Statement	1.80	\$2,466.00
B320	01/28/25	ZM	Search for any testimony, affidavits, expert reports, depositions, news and articles for potential expert	1.50	\$630.00
B320	01/29/25	BIW	Continue drafting document demands of OPF, RCWC and Debtor	2.10	\$2,436.00
B320	01/29/25	BIW	Meet with Litigation Team re: Plan confirmation litigation strategy	1.50	\$1,740.00
B320	01/29/25	CMR	Review Court Memorandum re: Disclosure Statement Issues	0.30	\$337.50
B320	01/29/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: preparation for confirmation hearing (.2); Meeting with J. Prol, M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg re: same (1.5)	1.70	\$1,912.50
B320	01/29/25	JDP	Prepare for (1.) and participate in (1.5) meeting with LS litigation team re: confirmation discovery and trial prep	2.50	\$3,425.00
B320	01/29/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: confirmation litigation strategy	1.50	\$1,702.50
B320	01/30/25	BIW	Revise Committee's Solicitation Letter	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/30/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: recap of Disclosure Statement hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B320	01/30/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: Disclosure Statement hearing	0.30	\$348.00
B320	01/30/25	BIW	Review Court's Memorandum re: Disclosure Statement issues (.2) confer with T. Burns and J. Bair re: same (.5); draft detailed email re: same (.4)	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	01/30/25	JDP	Call with co-counsel re: further briefing on disclosure statement	0.40	\$548.00
B320	01/30/25	JDP	Prepare for (3.) and participate in (.3) call with debtor's counsel re: agenda for disclosure statement hearing	0.60	\$822.00
B320	01/30/25	JDP	Review and analyze court's memo on insurance issues in disclosure statement; develop strategy	0.50	\$685.00
B320	01/31/25	BIW	Review research on adequate disclosure	1.70	\$1,972.00
B320	01/31/25	BIW	Research prospective experts	0.30	\$348.00
B320	01/31/25	CMR	Review draft Committee Solicitation Letter	1.20	\$1,350.00
B320	01/31/25	EJS	Review insurance language in connection with Plan	0.10	\$85.00
B320	01/31/25	JDP	Develop strategy for confirmation hearing	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	01/31/25	JDP	Develop response to Court's memo re: insurance related disclosure issues	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	01/31/25	KEM	Review disclosure statement re: discovery requests	0.50	\$527.50
B320	02/01/25	BIW	Begin drafting objection to Disclosure Statement	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	02/02/25	BIW	Continue drafting Disclosure Statement objection	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	02/03/25	BIW	Draft objection to amended Disclosure Statement	0.70	\$812.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	02/03/25	CMR	Analyze confirmation issues	1.20	\$1,350.00
B320	02/03/25	JDP	Review and revise committee solicitation letter	0.60	\$822.00
B320	02/04/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Kaplan re: retention of experts	0.30	\$348.00
B320	02/04/25	BIW	Meet with Litigation Team re: Plan confirmation preparation	1.50	\$1,740.00
B320	02/04/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert re: claim valuation	0.60	\$696.00
B320	02/04/25	BIW	Review proposed revisions to Objection to Amended Disclosure Statement	0.30	\$348.00
B320	02/04/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert re: real estate valuation	0.60	\$696.00
B320	02/04/25	BIW	Revise objection to Amended Disclosure Statement	0.80	\$928.00
B320	02/04/25	CMR	Meeting with LS Team re: confirmation issues (1.5); Analyze issues re: confirmation (1.0)	2.50	\$2,812.50
B320	02/04/25	JDP	Review open disclosure statement issues; confer with B. Weisenberg re: same	0.40	\$548.00
B320	02/04/25	JDP	Prepare for (.6) and participate in (1.5) meeting with LS litigation team re: confirmation discovery and trial strategy	2.10	\$2,877.00
B320	02/04/25	JDP	Review and edit draft brief on insurance assignment issue	0.40	\$548.00
B320	02/04/25	JDP	Further edits to committee solicitation letter	0.30	\$411.00
B320	02/04/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: litigation strategy and schedule	1.50	\$1,702.50
B320	02/05/25	BIW	Continue outline of Plan confirmation factual and legal issues	0.80	\$928.00
B320	02/05/25	BIW	Outline Plan confirmation factual and legal issues	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	02/05/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns and J. Bair re: revisions needed to Objection to Amended Disclosure Statement	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	02/05/25	CMR	Analyze legal and factual issues re: confirmation of Plan	2.90	\$3,262.50
B320	02/05/25	JDP	Review and revise committee solicitation letter	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	02/05/25	JDP	Review insurance assignment in Plan, briefing on DS and insurance assignments in other plans; develop strategy for insurance assignment	2.40	\$3,288.00
B320	02/05/25	JDP	Review and comment on committee response to Court's Memo on insurance assignment in Debtor's plan	0.50	\$685.00
B320	02/05/25	KEM	Review and analysis of disclosure statement re: anticipated discovery	0.20	\$211.00
B320	02/06/25	AMG	Strategize re: Plan confirmation workstreams (0.6); phone call with R. Chahil re: drafting Plan confirmation discovery (0.2)	0.80	\$572.00
B320	02/06/25	BIW	Review research on legal issues raised by Plan	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	02/06/25	BIW	Continue outline Plan confirmation factual and legal issues	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	02/06/25	BIW	Revise Objection to Amended Disclosure Statement	2.90	\$3,364.00
B320	02/06/25	CD	Strategize re: plan confirmation workstreams	0.60	\$519.00
B320	02/06/25	CD	Strategize re: discovery for plan confirmation	0.50	\$432.50
B320	02/06/25	CD	Review objection to disclosure statement to consider strategy re: plan confirmation	0.80	\$692.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 31 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	02/06/25	CF	Review proposed plan for formulation of plan discovery (.6); call with C. Restel re: same (.5)	1.10	\$726.00
B320	02/06/25	CF	Review email communications from M. Moore and B. Weisenberg re: survivor claims issues (.2); email communications with R. Simons re: same (.2)	0.40	\$264.00
B320	02/06/25	CG	Research re: artificial impairment 9th Circuit law	0.20	\$132.00
B320	02/06/25	CGS	Participate in internal meeting re: confirmation trial workstream assignments	0.50	\$392.50
B320	02/06/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: confirmation objection (1.5); Interoffice conference re: confirmation issues (.5)	2.00	\$2,250.00
B320	02/06/25	EJS	Attend all-hands call with Lowenstein team re: confirmation related workstreams (.5); review task list (.3)	0.80	\$680.00
B320	02/06/25	JBJ	Prepare for (.5) and participate in (.5) internal strategy meeting re: plan confirmation	1.00	\$785.00
B320	02/06/25	JDP	Final review and edits to brief in response to Court's memo re: insurance assignment	0.50	\$685.00
B320	02/06/25	KEM	Review and analysis of disclosure statement and related discovery issues (.6); review research re: artificial impairment (.1)	0.70	\$738.50
B320	02/06/25	LHS	Participate in interoffice conference re: confirmation issues (.5); review documents and pleadings in order to prepare discovery requests in advance of confirmation (3.0)	3.50	\$3,692.50
B320	02/06/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: litigation workstreams for contested confirmation	0.50	\$567.50
B320	02/06/25	RKC	Attend Lowenstein team conference re: confirmation issues	0.50	\$487.50
B320	02/06/25	RKC	Strategize re: Plan confirmation discovery	0.90	\$877.50
B320	02/06/25	RKC	Confer with A. Giblin re: draft discovery	0.30	\$292.50
B320	02/07/25	AMG	Draft Plan discovery templates and instructions	1.80	\$1,287.00
B320	02/07/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Committee re: filed Disclosure Statement objection	0.30	\$348.00
B320	02/07/25	BIW	Revise Objection to Amended Disclosure Statement	0.80	\$928.00
B320	02/07/25	BIW	Review legal research on legal issues raised by Plan	0.60	\$696.00
B320	02/07/25	CD	Draft Plan confirmation discovery to debtor	0.80	\$692.00
B320	02/07/25	CMR	Analyze insurance issues re: plan	0.20	\$225.00
B320	02/07/25	JDP	Develop strategy for confirmation trial	1.60	\$2,192.00
B320	02/07/25	LHS	Continue review of documents for purposes of drafting discovery requests in connection with confirmation	3.20	\$3,376.00
B320	02/08/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns re: analysis of proposed insurance assignment	0.40	\$464.00
B320	02/08/25	EJS	Draft RCC/RCWC Plan discovery requests	0.40	\$340.00
B320	02/10/25	AMG	Draft Plan confirmation discovery templates and instructions	1.60	\$1,144.00
B320	02/10/25	BIW	Confer with K. McNally re: potential expert testimony	0.70	\$812.00
B320	02/10/25	BIW	Confer with P. Shields re: potential expert testimony	0.80	\$928.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 32 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	02/10/25	BIW	Outline issues relevant for Plan confirmation discovery (.5); confer with J. Prol re: same (.3)	0.80	\$928.00
B320	02/10/25	BIW	Review documents produced in discovery	1.40	\$1,624.00
B320	02/10/25	CGS	Review Plan confirmation discovery in other Diocese cases	0.80	\$628.00
B320	02/10/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: confirmation objection	1.40	\$1,575.00
B320	02/10/25	JBJ	Review and revise Plan confirmation document requests	1.60	\$1,256.00
B320	02/10/25	JDP	Participate in call with BRG re: confirmation hearing	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	02/10/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: preparation for confirmation trial	0.30	\$411.00
B320	02/10/25	JDP	Participate in call with K. McNally re: confirmation hearing preparation	0.70	\$959.00
B320	02/10/25	LHS	Draft and revise Plan confirmation discovery	2.00	\$2,110.00
B320	02/10/25	MAK	Telephone call with Stout re: prospective expert testimony	0.70	\$794.50
B320	02/10/25	MAK	Telephone call with BRG re: prospective expert testimony	0.80	\$908.00
B320	02/10/25	RKC	Review/revise draft Plan confirmation discovery	0.80	\$780.00
B320	02/11/25	AMG	Revise Plan confirmation discovery templates and instructions (0.6); draft definitions for discovery requests (2.5)	3.10	\$2,216.50
B320	02/11/25	BIW	Review documents produced by Debtor for use at confirmation trial	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	02/11/25	CMR	Analyze templates for discovery requests re: confirmation (.7); Analyze and attend to issues re: potential experts re: confirmation (.8)	1.50	\$1,687.50
B320	02/11/25	JBJ	Review and revise Plan confirmation document requests	4.00	\$3,140.00
B320	02/11/25	LHS	Review and analyze amended disclosure statement and amended plan in connection with confirmation-related assignments	3.30	\$3,481.50
B320	02/11/25	MAK	Review and revise forms of RFAs, interrogatories, and RFPs for confirmation discovery	1.30	\$1,475.50
B320	02/12/25	AMG	Draft definitions for Plan confirmation discovery requests	1.00	\$715.00
B320	02/12/25	BIW	Review document production for confirmation hearing exhibits	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	02/12/25	JBJ	Review and revise Plan confirmation document requests	3.00	\$2,355.00
B320	02/13/25	BIW	Review documents shared by BRG and related analyses	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	02/13/25	BIW	Review documents shared by BRG	0.70	\$812.00
B320	02/13/25	CGS	Review draft Plan confirmation requests for production	2.10	\$1,648.50
B320	02/13/25	KEM	Review and analysis of disclosure statement re: anticipated confirmation discovery	0.50	\$527.50
B320	02/13/25	LHS	Revise draft Plan confirmation document requests and incorporate additional categories of requests	2.50	\$2,637.50
B320	02/14/25	BIW	Review draft of Debtor's Second Amended Plan and comment on same	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	02/14/25	BIW	Review draft of Debtor's Second Amended Disclosure Statement and comment on same	1.40	\$1,624.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	02/14/25	CD	Draft Plan confirmation requests for production	0.70	\$605.50
B320	02/14/25	DC	Meeting with B. Weisenberg and E. Lawler re: transcript review project; (.3) follow up meeting with E. Lawler re: same (.2); meeting with practice support re: queue for search terms and confer with E. Lawler re: same (.3); email and confer with court transcriber re: ACCII files and review same (.3); review and comment on search terms (.2)	1.30	\$520.00
B320	02/14/25	EBL	Meeting with B. Weisenberg and D. Claussen re: discussion of transcript review project (.3); follow up meeting with D. Claussen re: same (.2)	0.50	\$190.00
B320	02/14/25	EBL	Prepare search terms for transcript review project	0.60	\$228.00
B320	02/14/25	EJS	Draft discovery requests in connection with confirmation (1.0) review related documents (.5)	1.50	\$1,275.00
B320	02/14/25	JBJ	Review and revise Plan confirmation document requests	0.70	\$549.50
B320	02/15/25	BIW	Review and analyze Second Amended Disclosure Statement	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	02/15/25	BIW	Draft email to T. Burns re: Debtor's and Insurer's insurance briefs	0.20	\$232.00
B320	02/15/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Brief on insurance assignment	0.40	\$464.00
B320	02/15/25	CMR	Summary review of responsive briefs re: Insurance issues in Plan	0.70	\$787.50
B320	02/15/25	DC	Upload ASCII files to shared drive for application of search terms re: transcript review project	0.40	\$160.00
B320	02/15/25	JDP	Analyze amended disclosure statement and outline remaining objections	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	02/15/25	JDP	Review and comment on amended plan and disclosure statement	4.00	\$5,480.00
B320	02/15/25	LHS	Review and revise Plan confirmation document requests	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	02/16/25	BIW	Draft email to BRG re: questions on CTN	0.30	\$348.00
B320	02/17/25	BIW	Revise email to Debtor re: Disclosure Statement comments	0.30	\$348.00
B320	02/17/25	BIW	Finalize comments to Debtor's draft Second Amended Disclosure Statement (.4); finalize draft of Committee Solicitation Letter (.2); draft email to Debtor re: same (.2)	0.80	\$928.00
B320	02/17/25	BIW	Begin drafting objection to Second Amended Disclosure Statement	0.30	\$348.00
B320	02/17/25	JDP	Review and edit draft email to debtor's counsel re: objections to second amended disclosure statement	0.20	\$274.00
B320	02/17/25	JDP	Review and comment on debtor and insurer responses to committee brief on Court's memorandum on insurance issues raised by disclosure statement	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	02/17/25	LHS	Continue to work on Plan confirmation document requests with contemporaneous review of relevant documents and pleadings	1.20	\$1,266.00
B320	02/17/25	RKC	Strategize re: plan confirmation discovery	1.20	\$1,170.00
B320	02/18/25	BIW	Continue drafting objection to Second Amended Disclosure Statement	1.40	\$1,624.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 34 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	02/18/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: Second Amended Disclosure Statement	0.80	\$928.00
B320	02/18/25	BIW	Comment on draft Debtor's Second Amended Plan	0.60	\$696.00
B320	02/18/25	CD	Draft Plan confirmation discovery requests	0.10	\$86.50
B320	02/18/25	DC	Research Debtor's prior statements about transfer of funds to OPF and alleged loan made to Debtor	1.20	\$480.00
B320	02/18/25	JDP	Prepare for (.7) and participate in (.8) meet and confer call with Debtor's counsel re: edits to amended disclosure statement	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	02/18/25	LHS	Additional revisions to Plan confirmation document requests	0.50	\$527.50
B320	02/18/25	LHS	Review and edit objection to Disclosure Statement	0.60	\$633.00
B320	02/19/25	BIW	Review BRG's analysis of CTN documents	0.20	\$232.00
B320	02/19/25	BIW	Continue drafting objection to Second Amended Disclosure Statement	2.60	\$3,016.00
B320	02/19/25	BIW	Add comments to Second Amended Disclosure Statement for use as exhibit to forthcoming Objection	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	02/19/25	CD	Draft Plan confirmation discovery requests	0.90	\$778.50
B320	02/19/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: potential expert witnesses re: confirmation	0.20	\$225.00
B320	02/19/25	JDP	Develop strategy for confirmation trial	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	02/20/25	BIW	Continue drafting Objection to Disclosure Statement	1.60	\$1,856.00
B320	02/20/25	BIW	Continue drafting Objection to Disclosure Statement	2.30	\$2,668.00
B320	02/20/25	CD	Draft Plan confirmation discovery requests	0.30	\$259.50
B320	02/20/25	CMR	Summary review of Second Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.70	\$1,912.50
B320	02/20/25	EJS	Research issues re: unknown claims representative (4.3); draft memorandum re: research findings (1.7); review mass tort chapter 11 plans re: future claims representative issue (1.4); prepare email summary of same (.3)	7.40	\$6,290.00
B320	02/20/25	JDP	Follow-up call with BRG re: preparation for confirmation trial	0.50	\$685.00
B320	02/20/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: preparation for confirmation trial	1.00	\$1,370.00
B320	02/20/25	LHS	Revise Plan confirmation document requests (1.3); review documents produced by Debtor to be considered as evidence at confirmation hearing (.7)	2.00	\$2,110.00
B320	02/21/25	BIW	Review drafts of Solicitation Order and Ballot	0.30	\$348.00
B320	02/21/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: Plan confirmation discovery	0.40	\$464.00
B320	02/21/25	BIW	Continue drafting Objection to Disclosure Statement and related documents	2.60	\$3,016.00
B320	02/21/25	CF	Research re: restricted assets research	0.40	\$264.00
B320	02/21/25	DC	Research re: Debtor's prior statements about transfer of funds to OPF and alleged loan made to Debtor	0.70	\$280.00
B320	02/21/25	EJS	Continue research on unknown claims representative issues (1.3); draft email correspondence re: same (.2); draft Plan confirmation document requests for RCWC (.5); RCC (.3), and Adventus (.3)	2.60	\$2,210.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 35 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	02/21/25	JDP	Review and edit revised draft of disclosure statement objection	3.70	\$5,069.00
B320	02/21/25	LHS	Call with BRG re: Plan confirmation document requests (.4); review prior informal requests related to OPF (.3); review pertinent sections of disclosure statement and documents previously produced for purposes of additional requests (1.2); further revise requests (.4)	2.30	\$2,426.50
B320	02/22/25	BIW	Continue drafting Objection to Disclosure Statement and related documents	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	02/22/25	BIW	Revise Objection to Disclosure Statement and related documents	0.60	\$696.00
B320	02/22/25	EJS	Research disclosure statement objection issue (.2); draft memo re same (.3)	0.50	\$425.00
B320	02/22/25	JDP	Review and revise revised version of disclosure statement	0.60	\$822.00
B320	02/23/25	BIW	Finalize Objection to Second Amended Disclosure Statement	0.60	\$696.00
B320	02/24/25	AMG	Revise definitions for discovery requests	1.00	\$715.00
B320	02/24/25	BIW	Review and comment on draft Plan confirmation Document Demands	0.40	\$464.00
B320	02/24/25	CMR	Review Supplemental Liquidation Analysis	0.40	\$450.00
B320	02/24/25	EJS	Draft Plan confirmation document requests for bond obligated group (.5); email correspondence with BRG team re: same (.1); email correspondence with B. Weisenberg and C. Restel re: same (.2)	0.80	\$680.00
B320	02/24/25	LHS	Review proposed changes to Doc Requests from BRG and compile initial list of defined terms (.5); correspondence with BRG re: same (.2)	0.70	\$738.50
B320	02/24/25	RKC	Review/revise draft definitions for Plan confirmation discovery to RCBO/parishes	0.60	\$585.00
B320	02/25/25	AMG	Revise definitions for Plan confirmation discovery requests	1.00	\$715.00
B320	02/25/25	CMR	Analyze Objection to Revised Disclosure Statement in preparation for hearing	0.80	\$900.00
B320	02/25/25	EJS	Email correspondence with P. Shields (BRG) re: confirmation-related discovery requests (.1); draft discovery requests for RCWC, RCC, and Adventus (1.5)	1.60	\$1,360.00
B320	02/25/25	LHS	Revise document requests and compile new list of defined terms	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	02/25/25	MAK	Review and analyze supplemental liquidation analysis	0.60	\$681.00
B320	02/26/25	AMG	Revise definitions for Plan confirmation discovery requests	0.70	\$500.50
B320	02/26/25	AMG	Meet with R. Chahil re: attorney-client privilege research	0.10	\$71.50
B320	02/26/25	BIW	Review and comment on Debtor's liquidation analysis	0.80	\$928.00
B320	02/26/25	BIW	Confer with L. Sklar re: drafting of Church document demands	0.60	\$696.00
B320	02/26/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: drafting of document demands	1.20	\$1,392.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	02/26/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation (1.8); Call with LS and BRG Teams re: same (1.2)	3.00	\$3,375.00
B320	02/26/25	EJS	Prepare for (.2) and attend (1.2) call with B. Weisenberg, C. Restel, and BRG team re: confirmation discovery; review OPF document requests (.2); draft Bond Obligated Group document requests (1.7); email correspondence with LS team re: same (.2)	3.50	\$2,975.00
B320	02/26/25	LHS	Call with B. Weisenberg re: Plan confirmation document requests to pastors (.6); further revise and finalize document requests and send to M. Kaplan and C. Restel (.5)	1.10	\$1,160.50
B320	02/27/25	AMG	Conduct case law research re: attorney-client privilege	4.50	\$3,217.50
B320	02/27/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Response to Committee's Objection to Second Amended Disclosure Statement and cases cited therein	0.60	\$696.00
B320	02/27/25	CMR	Analyze Debtor Reply in support of Disclosure Statement	0.80	\$900.00
B320	02/27/25	EJS	Draft confirmation discovery requests	1.30	\$1,105.00
B320	02/27/25	LHS	Review committee's objection to second amended disclosure statement and debtor's reply to same	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	02/28/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation	2.20	\$2,475.00
B320	02/28/25	EJS	Draft confirmation discovery requests and definitions	1.10	\$935.00
B320	02/28/25	JDP	Review notice of adjournment of DS hearing; develop strategy	0.30	\$411.00
B320	02/28/25	RKC	Review research re: application of attorney-client privilege	0.20	\$195.00
B320	03/02/25	BIW	Review Revised Liquidation Analysis	0.60	\$696.00
B320	03/03/25	BIW	Review draft confirmation document demands	0.60	\$696.00
B320	03/03/25	BIW	Review and revise confirmation discovery requests to Pastors/Churches	0.30	\$348.00
B320	03/03/25	BIW	Review research on legal issues raised by Plan	0.80	\$928.00
B320	03/03/25	CF	Call with E. Seltzer re: document demands	0.30	\$198.00
B320	03/03/25	CMR	Review and revise document requests re: confirmation	1.10	\$1,237.50
B320	03/03/25	EJS	Research issue re: confirmation discovery (.3); email correspondence with B. Weisenberg (.2) and C. Restel (.2) re: next steps in connection with same; call with C. Frankel re: discovery issues (.3)	1.00	\$850.00
B320	03/03/25	LHS	Review and incorporate comments to confirmation discovery (.6); confer with team re: same and edit further (.8)	1.40	\$1,477.00
B320	03/03/25	MAK	Revise draft confirmation discovery	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	03/04/25	BIW	Revise discovery demands	0.60	\$696.00
B320	03/04/25	BIW	Outline legal arguments re: Plan confirmation	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	03/04/25	BIW	Review and revise Document Demands	0.80	\$928.00
B320	03/04/25	CF	Research restricted assets and trust law	2.20	\$1,452.00
B320	03/04/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation	4.80	\$5,400.00
B320	03/04/25	EJS	Continue reviewing relevant documents and drafting discovery requests	3.10	\$2,635.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	03/04/25	KEM	Research re: insured claims treatment under plan	0.30	\$316.50
B320	03/05/25	BIW	Confer with E. Seltzer re: comment on document requests	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/05/25	CD	Strategize re: discovery requests to Debtor	0.90	\$778.50
B320	03/05/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation	2.20	\$2,475.00
B320	03/05/25	EJS	Call with B. Weisenberg re: Bond Obligated Group document requests (.4); follow-up email correspondence with same re: same (.2); review documents from informal RCWC productions (2.0); draft RCWC discovery requests in connection with same (2.3)	4.80	\$4,080.00
B320	03/06/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: restricted asset analysis	1.50	\$1,740.00
B320	03/06/25	CF	Confer with internal and BRG team re: restricted assets analysis	1.50	\$990.00
B320	03/06/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: discovery requests re: confirmation	0.20	\$225.00
B320	03/06/25	EJS	Review documents from informal RCC and Adventus productions in connection with confirmation discovery process (1.6); draft RCC and Adventus discovery requests (1.9)	3.50	\$2,975.00
B320	03/06/25	JDP	Participate in call with LS team and BRG team re: restricted assets	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	03/06/25	LHS	Review relevant provisions in DS and Plan related to drafting document requests	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	03/07/25	AMG	Strategize re: discovery requests to M. Barber	0.10	\$71.50
B320	03/07/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: use of confidential documents	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/07/25	BIW	Confer with C. Restel and M. Berliner re: discovery	0.60	\$696.00
B320	03/07/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation (.6); Call with B. Weisenberg and M. Berliner re: same (.6); Confer with Committee member re: same (.1)	1.30	\$1,462.50
B320	03/07/25	EJS	Continue drafting confirmation discovery requests for RCC (.9); review Disclosure Statement in connection with same (.3)	1.20	\$1,020.00
B320	03/07/25	MRB	Zoom call with B. Weisenberg and C. Restel re: drafting document requests	0.60	\$519.00
B320	03/07/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: discovery to Bishop	0.10	\$97.50
B320	03/09/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: confirmation discovery	0.20	\$225.00
B320	03/09/25	JBJ	Revise and add Plan confirmation discovery requests	3.00	\$2,355.00
B320	03/10/25	AMG	Strategize re: document requests to Debtor's financial advisor	0.20	\$143.00
B320	03/10/25	BIW	Review Debtor's analysis of Restricted Assets and BRG's analysis of same	0.80	\$928.00
B320	03/10/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert re: real estate valuation	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/10/25	CD	Review and draft discovery requests to Debtor	0.90	\$778.50
B320	03/10/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: confirmation discovery	0.30	\$337.50
B320	03/10/25	DC	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	0.50	\$200.00
B320	03/10/25	EJS	Prepare discovery requests for RCWC, RCC, and Adventus	0.70	\$595.00
B320	03/10/25	JBJ	Revise and add Plan confirmation discovery requests	1.40	\$1,099.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 38 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	03/10/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: document productions	0.50	\$685.00
B320	03/10/25	LHS	Draft document requests	1.50	\$1,582.50
B320	03/10/25	MAK	Revise draft confirmation discovery	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	03/10/25	MRB	Discuss document request drafts with A. Giblin (.2); analyze complaint for substantive consolidation to prepare for document requests (.2)	0.40	\$346.00
B320	03/11/25	BIW	Review and revise draft discovery	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/11/25	BIW	Confer with M. Lee re: proposed revisions to Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.50	\$580.00
B320	03/11/25	CD	Draft discovery requests to Debtor	1.90	\$1,643.50
B320	03/11/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation of Plan	1.20	\$1,350.00
B320	03/11/25	EJS	Prepare discovery requests for RCWC, RCC, and Adventus	1.70	\$1,445.00
B320	03/11/25	MAK	Review RCBO document production in connection with expert testimony at confirmation	3.40	\$3,859.00
B320	03/11/25	MRB	Draft document requests	1.10	\$951.50
B320	03/12/25	BIW	Review analysis of past diocesan bankruptcy settlements	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/12/25	BIW	Outline Plan objections	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/12/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation	0.90	\$1,012.50
B320	03/12/25	EJS	Revise document requests to Bond Obligated Group per comments received from LS team	1.80	\$1,530.00
B320	03/12/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: document productions	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	03/12/25	LHS	Review pleadings related to unknown claims representative for purposes of drafting document requests	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	03/12/25	MAK	Revise draft confirmation discovery	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	03/13/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation	0.30	\$337.50
B320	03/13/25	EJS	Draft confirmation discovery requests	2.40	\$2,040.00
B320	03/13/25	LHS	Analyze relevant documents to assist in drafting of document requests	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	03/13/25	MAK	Review RCBO document production in connection with expert testimony at confirmation	2.30	\$2,610.50
B320	03/13/25	MRB	Discuss document request drafts with R. Chahil	0.20	\$173.00
B320	03/13/25	RKC	Confer with M. Berliner re: document requests	0.20	\$195.00
B320	03/14/25	AMG	Conduct research re: issuing discovery to non-debtor entities	4.90	\$3,503.50
B320	03/14/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: restricted assets analysis	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/14/25	BIW	Review Bond Obligated Group Document Requests	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/14/25	CD	Draft discovery to Debtor	0.80	\$692.00
B320	03/14/25	CGS	Review C. Restel's comments to draft requests for production and incorporate same into requests	0.30	\$235.50
B320	03/14/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation (3.1); call with LS Team re: same (.4)	3.50	\$3,937.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 39 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	03/14/25	EJS	Review comments to Bond Obligated Group discovery requests (.2); call with C. Restel re: same (.4); revise same for review by BRG (1.0)	1.80	\$1,530.00
B320	03/14/25	JBJ	Review edits to Plan confirmation discovery requests (0.3); prepare for (0.3) and participate in (0.4) meeting with C. Restel and R. Chahil re: additional Plan confirmation discovery requests (.1)	1.10	\$863.50
B320	03/14/25	LHS	Draft and revise document requests and analyze portions of DS, Plan, and other pleadings to formulate requests	2.00	\$2,110.00
B320	03/14/25	MAK	Review RCBO document production in connection with expert testimony at confirmation	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	03/14/25	RKC	Confer with LS team re: document requests to Bishop	0.40	\$390.00
B320	03/15/25	BIW	Review documents in support of anticipated Plan objection	0.80	\$928.00
B320	03/15/25	JDP	Review revised version of Plan, Disclosure Statement and Committee Objection	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	03/15/25	RKC	Review research re: party for discovery purposes in bankruptcy case	0.20	\$195.00
B320	03/17/25	AMG	Revise definitions for discovery requests (1.4); conduct follow up research re: issuing discovery to non-debtor entities (0.2)	1.60	\$1,144.00
B320	03/17/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: analysis of treatment of Survivors under Plan	0.70	\$812.00
B320	03/17/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: analysis of Debtor assets	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	03/17/25	BIW	Revise Committee Solicitation Letter	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/17/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation	1.40	\$1,575.00
B320	03/17/25	EJS	Revise confirmation-related document requests	0.50	\$425.00
B320	03/17/25	JBJ	Review and respond to internal correspondence re: edits to Plan confirmation discovery requests	0.20	\$157.00
B320	03/17/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: ability pay analysis	1.00	\$1,370.00
B320	03/17/25	MAK	Review RCBO document production in connection with expert testimony at confirmation	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	03/18/25	AMG	Revise definitions for discovery requests	1.00	\$715.00
B320	03/18/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: analysis of treatment of Survivors under Plan	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/18/25	BIW	Review revised Disclosure Statement and Plan	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	03/18/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Supplemental Motion in Support of Third Amended Disclosure Statement	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	03/18/25	CD	Review and revise discovery requests	0.60	\$519.00
B320	03/18/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation (2.1); Analyze Third Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement (3.5)	5.60	\$6,300.00
B320	03/18/25	EJS	Review Committee update email re: changes to plan treatment and survivors' trust	0.20	\$170.00
B320	03/18/25	JBJ	Revise and add Plan confirmation discovery requests	2.80	\$2,198.00
B320	03/18/25	JDP	Review amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.70	\$2,329.00
B320	03/18/25	LHS	Review and analyze Third Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.50	\$1,582.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	03/18/25	LHS	Revise document requests	0.50	\$527.50
B320	03/18/25	MAK	Review and analyze amended plan and disclosure statement	1.60	\$1,816.00
B320	03/18/25	MRB	Analyze docket documents to draft document requests to financial consultant	0.60	\$519.00
B320	03/19/25	AMG	Strategize re: definitions for discovery requests	0.10	\$71.50
B320	03/19/25	BIW	Continue drafting Objection to Third Amended Disclosure Statement, Committee Solicitation Letter and comments to Disclosure Statement	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	03/19/25	BIW	Review and comment on revised document demands	0.60	\$696.00
B320	03/19/25	BIW	Continue drafting Objection to Third Amended Disclosure Statement, Committee Solicitation Letter and comments to Disclosure Statement	2.70	\$3,132.00
B320	03/19/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Plan (1.4); Review and revise discovery requests re: same (.7); Call with BRG Team re: same (1.2)	3.30	\$3,712.50
B320	03/19/25	EJS	Call with C. Restel and BRG (P. Shields and M. Babcock) re: confirmation-related document requests for Bond Obligated Group (.7); further revise document requests (.5)	1.20	\$1,020.00
B320	03/19/25	JBJ	Revise and add Plan confirmation discovery requests	1.70	\$1,334.50
B320	03/19/25	JDP	Develop strategy re: response to Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement	0.90	\$1,233.00
B320	03/19/25	MAK	Review and analyze amended plan and disclosure statement	1.30	\$1,475.50
B320	03/19/25	MRB	Draft document requests to financial consultant	1.30	\$1,124.50
B320	03/20/25	AMG	Revise definitions for discovery requests	0.70	\$500.50
B320	03/20/25	BIW	Continue drafting Objection to Third Amended Disclosure Statement, Committee Solicitation Letter and comments to Disclosure Statement	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	03/20/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: analysis of treatment of Survivors under Plan	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	03/20/25	CD	Revise document requests to Debtor	0.30	\$259.50
B320	03/20/25	CD	Revise draft discovery requests to Debtor	0.30	\$259.50
B320	03/20/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Plan and Disclosure Statement (.2); Prepare discovery requests re: same (3.0)	3.20	\$3,600.00
B320	03/20/25	EJS	Review issue re confirmation-related discovery requests (.3); revise document requests (.8)	1.10	\$935.00
B320	03/20/25	JBJ	Revise and add Plan confirmation discovery requests	2.90	\$2,276.50
B320	03/20/25	JDP	Review and edit objection to disclosure statement	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	03/21/25	AMG	Revise definitions for discovery requests	0.30	\$214.50
B320	03/21/25	BIW	Revise letter from Committee to voters re: Plan voting	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/21/25	BIW	Continue drafting Objection to Third Amended Disclosure Statement, Committee Solicitation Letter and comments to Disclosure Statement	2.60	\$3,016.00
B320	03/21/25	CD	Revise discovery requests to Debtor	0.30	\$259.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	03/21/25	CMR	Review and revise Committee Solicitation Letter (1.3); Analyze issues re: Plan and Disclosure Statement (.5); Summary review of Claims Register (.8); Review and revise discovery re: Plan Confirmation (1.3)	3.90	\$4,387.50
B320	03/21/25	EJS	Analyze Third Amended Plan and Disclosure Statement re: changes to Survivor's Trust assets (.8); review Bond Obligated Group document request issue with BRG team (.2); draft definitions re: same (.5)	1.50	\$1,275.00
B320	03/21/25	JDP	Review and edit disclosure statement objection	3.20	\$4,384.00
B320	03/21/25	JDP	Confer with BRG re: confirmation issues	0.30	\$411.00
B320	03/21/25	LHS	Revise document requests and review additional pleadings relevant to requests	1.20	\$1,266.00
B320	03/21/25	LHS	Review supplement to Debtor's motion for order approving disclosure statement	0.80	\$844.00
B320	03/21/25	MAK	Review and revise requests for production to debtor and future claims representative	2.70	\$3,064.50
B320	03/22/25	BIW	Continue drafting Objection to Third Amended Disclosure Statement, Committee Solicitation Letter and comments to Disclosure Statement	0.80	\$928.00
B320	03/22/25	JDP	Review and edit revised version of disclosure statement objection	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	03/24/25	BIW	Review BRG analysis of Diocese assets	0.80	\$928.00
B320	03/24/25	BIW	Review draft document requests and comment on same	0.30	\$348.00
B320	03/24/25	BIW	Draft emails to counsel for Committee members re: insurance strategy	0.20	\$232.00
B320	03/24/25	BIW	Review and revise Solicitation Procedures Order	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	03/24/25	BIW	Finalize Objection to Third Amended Disclosure Statement, Committee Solicitation Letter and comments to Disclosure Statement	2.20	\$2,552.00
B320	03/24/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery re: Confirmation (1.9); Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation (1.4); Analyze legal issues re: Objection to Disclosure Statement (1.6)	4.90	\$5,512.50
B320	03/24/25	DC	E-mail with G. Albert re: objection to Disclosure Statement	0.10	\$40.00
B320	03/24/25	EJS	Email correspondence with BRG team re status of BOG document requests	0.20	\$170.00
B320	03/24/25	JBJ	Revise and add Plan confirmation discovery requests	2.10	\$1,648.50
B320	03/24/25	JDP	Review and comment on proposed Order approving disclosure statement	0.60	\$822.00
B320	03/24/25	JDP	Develop strategy for insurance assignment	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	03/24/25	JDP	Develop insurance assignment strategy	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	03/24/25	MRB	Edit document requests to financial consultant VeraCruz	1.20	\$1,038.00
B320	03/25/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: asset analysis to prepare for contested confirmation hearing	0.60	\$696.00
B320	03/25/25	BIW	Draft email to Foley Team serving unredacted copy of Disclosure Statement Objection	0.20	\$232.00
B320	03/25/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: asset analysis	0.90	\$1,044.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	03/25/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation of Plan (1.7); Prepare strategy re: same (4.1)	5.80	\$6,525.00
B320	03/25/25	JBJ	Revise Plan confirmation discovery requests	0.60	\$471.00
B320	03/25/25	RKC	Revise draft document requests to Bishop	0.80	\$780.00
B320	03/26/25	BIW	Reviewed Scheduling Orders entered in other diocesan bankruptcy cases	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/26/25	CMR	Review and revise document requests re: Confirmation of Plan (1.9); Analyze legal issues re: confirmation (.7)	2.60	\$2,925.00
B320	03/26/25	JBJ	Revise Plan confirmation discovery requests	1.00	\$785.00
B320	03/26/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing on disclosure statement	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	03/27/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: comments to liquidation analysis in Disclosure Statement	0.30	\$348.00
B320	03/27/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: drafting document demands	0.40	\$464.00
B320	03/27/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation (1.5); Call with BRG re: same (.4); Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation (2.6)	4.50	\$5,062.50
B320	03/27/25	DC	Prepare e-binder for 4/1/25 hearing	0.70	\$280.00
B320	03/27/25	EJS	Prepare for (.1) and attend (.3) call with LS and BRG teams re Bond Obligated Group document requests; revise and finalize draft of same (1.6)	2.00	\$1,700.00
B320	03/27/25	JBJ	Revise Plan confirmation discovery requests	0.90	\$706.50
B320	03/27/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing on disclosure statement	0.40	\$548.00
B320	03/27/25	JDP	Review and edit proposed order approving disclosure statement	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	03/28/25	AMG	Draft definitions for discovery requests	3.70	\$2,645.50
B320	03/28/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Response to UCC's Objection to Third Amended Disclosure Statement	0.60	\$696.00
B320	03/28/25	BIW	Prepare for Disclosure Statement Hearing	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	03/28/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation (1.0); Analyze Debtors' Reply in Support of Disclosure Statement (1.4); Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation (.3)	2.70	\$3,037.50
B320	03/28/25	EJS	Research confirmation issue (2.0); email correspondence with BRG re: confirmation-related discovery requests (.1); prepare defined terms for document requests (.3)	2.40	\$2,040.00
B320	03/28/25	LHS	Review and analyze Debtors' response to Committee's DS Objection and accompanying declaration	0.80	\$844.00
B320	03/29/25	JDP	Review Debtor reply in support of disclosure statement (.5); prepare for hearing (1.0)	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	03/31/25	AMG	Revise definitions for discovery requests	1.20	\$858.00
B320	03/31/25	BIW	Prepare for RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	03/31/25	CD	Draft document requests to debtor	0.10	\$86.50
B320	03/31/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation (1.8); Analyze legal issues re: confirmation (5.5); Call with Stout team re: expert report re: confirmation (.4)	7.70	\$8,662.50
B320	03/31/25	EJS	Revise confirmation discovery requests (.7); confer with BRG re: follow-up requests in connection with same (.2); continue research re confirmation issue (.6)	1.50	\$1,275.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	03/31/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing on Disclosure Statement	3.50	\$4,795.00
B320	03/31/25	LHS	Create list of additional definitions relating to document requests	0.50	\$527.50
B320	03/31/25	MAK	Conference call with valuation expert re: report preparation (.4); review and analyze case law on use of First Amendment expert (1.8)	2.20	\$2,497.00
B320	04/01/25	AMG	Revise definitions for discovery requests	0.10	\$71.50
B320	04/01/25	BIW	Finalize revisions to Solicitation Procedures Order	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/01/25	CD	Draft interrogatories to Debtor	0.40	\$346.00
B320	04/01/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Confirmation (3.1); Review and revise discovery requests re: same (.3); Call with Debtor's counsel re: confirmation schedule (1.2); Confer with LS Team (multiple) re same (.3)	4.90	\$5,512.50
B320	04/01/25	EJS	Research confirmation issue (1.3); draft summary of findings (.7); meet with C. Restel re: same (.2); follow-up with BRG re: confirmation-related discovery requests (.1)	2.30	\$1,955.00
B320	04/01/25	JBJ	Prepare for (0.2) and participate in (0.2) meeting with C. Restel re: legal research for Plan confirmation (4.5); review Plan confirmation discovery requests (0.4); draft Plan confirmation interrogatories (0.9)	6.20	\$4,867.00
B320	04/01/25	ZM	Search for expert witness reports and transcripts of hearing on summary judgment in the matter of Roman Catholic Archbishop of Portland Oregon	1.50	\$630.00
B320	04/02/25	AMG	Strategize re: discovery requests (0.4); revise definitions for discovery requests (0.4)	0.80	\$572.00
B320	04/02/25	BIW	Review proposed Plan Confirmation deadlines and comment on same	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/02/25	BIW	Confer with Litigation Team re: prepare for contested confirmation hearing	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	04/02/25	BIW	Review and revise document demands	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	04/02/25	BIW	Confer with M. Lee re: Plan confirmation issues	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/02/25	BIW	Review Solicitation version of Disclosure Statement	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/02/25	BIW	Participate in call with Foley re: open issues on Third Amended Disclosure Statement	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	04/02/25	CD	Draft and revise document requests and interrogatories to debtor	0.30	\$259.50
B320	04/02/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: confirmation of Plan (2.9); Review and revise discovery requests re: same (.4); Call with LS Team re: proposed confirmation schedule (1.1); Review and revise draft confirmation schedules (3.0)	7.40	\$8,325.00
B320	04/02/25	DC	Proof and edit research memo re: FRE 706	0.30	\$120.00
B320	04/02/25	EJS	Continue research re: confirmation issue (2.5); draft summary of findings (1.4); review additional documentation from BRG re: confirmation-related discovery (.4); correspondence with A. Giblin and M. Babcock (BRG) re: same (.2)	4.50	\$3,825.00
B320	04/02/25	JBJ	Legal research re: Plan confirmation (1.4); revise Plan confirmation discovery requests (3.0); review internal correspondence re: court deadlines (0.1)	4.50	\$3,532.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/02/25	JDP	Call with LS litigation team re: confirmation trial prep and strategy	1.10	\$1,507.00
B320	04/02/25	JDP	E-mails to/from LS litigation team and experts re: pre- trial and trial schedule	0.40	\$548.00
B320	04/02/25	KEM	Review trial and discovery schedule	0.10	\$105.50
B320	04/02/25	LHS	Review e-mail from C. Restel re: confirmation and certain discovery deadlines	0.20	\$211.00
B320	04/02/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: plan confirmation schedule and deadlines	1.10	\$1,248.50
B320	04/02/25	MRB	Review discovery dates and deadlines (0.1); edit document requests to financial consultant VeraCruz (0.2); email communication re: same (0.2)	0.50	\$432.50
B320	04/03/25	AMG	Revise definitions for discovery requests (1.7); strategize re: document requests (0.7); attend zoom meeting with BRG re: document requests (0.5)	2.90	\$2,073.50
B320	04/03/25	BIW	Review and revise Plan Confirmation Scheduling Order	0.20	\$232.00
B320	04/03/25	BIW	Draft outline re: Plan Confirmation litigation strategy	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/03/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: asset analysis for Plan confirmation	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/03/25	BIW	Review and revise additional set of document demands	0.70	\$812.00
B320	04/03/25	BIW	Review filed Third Amended Disclosure Statement	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/03/25	CD	Draft document requests and interrogatories to Debtor	0.50	\$432.50
B320	04/03/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: confirmation (.4); Analyze issues re: Confirmation schedule (.8); Prepare and circulate Scheduling Order re: same (1.8); Review and revise discovery requests re: same (2.3); Call with BRG Team re: same (.5); Confer (multiple) with LS Team re: same (.6)	6.40	\$7,200.00
B320	04/03/25	EJS	Complete research re: confirmation-related issue (.8); revise summary of findings re: same (.4); call with C. Restel and A. Giblin re: confirmation document requests (.4); prepare for (.1) and attend (.5) call with C. Restel, A. Giblin, M. Babcock (BRG), and R. Strong (BRG) re: same; revise document requests (1.0); call with A. Giblin re same (.2); related correspondence with LS and BRG teams (.2)	3.70	\$3,145.00
B320	04/03/25	JBJ	Revise Plan confirmation discovery requests	6.10	\$4,788.50
B320	04/03/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft confirmation scheduling order (.3); review final version (.1)	0.40	\$548.00
B320	04/03/25	JDP	Review and comment on confirmation discovery	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	04/03/25	LHS	Revise document requests and review instruction template to finalize requests	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	04/03/25	MAK	Review and revise draft confirmation discovery demands (1.8); second level review of document production for potential deposition exhibits (3.3)	5.10	\$5,788.50
B320	04/03/25	MRB	Analyze and incorporate updated definitions for discovery requests	0.20	\$173.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/04/25	AMG	Draft and revise discovery templates, definitions, and document requests to Roman Catholic Welfare Corporation, Roman Catholic Cemeteries, and Adventus (4.8); strategize re: discovery requests (0.6)	5.40	\$3,861.00
B320	04/04/25	BIW	Participate in call with Unknown Claims Representative	0.50	\$580.00
B320	04/04/25	BIW	Participate in call with Litigation Team re: valuation of Debtor real property	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/04/25	BIW	Review entered Disclosure Statement and related documents	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/04/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG re: preparation of expert reports	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	04/04/25	CD	Review and revise discovery to debtor	0.30	\$259.50
B320	04/04/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation (3.6); Confer re: schedule for Confirmation (.2); Call with BRG re: Expert Reports (1.3); Call with LS Team re: strategy for confirmation (.6)	5.70	\$6,412.50
B320	04/04/25	DC	Review revised order setting dates for confirmation, compare with prior order, update critical dates memo and attorney calendar	0.80	\$320.00
B320	04/04/25	EJS	Finalize Bond Obligated Group Document Requests (1.6); call with A. Giblin re: same (.1)	1.70	\$1,445.00
B320	04/04/25	JBJ	Revise Plan confirmation discovery requests	1.40	\$1,099.00
B320	04/04/25	JDP	Review and comment on solicitation order and materials	1.40	\$1,918.00
B320	04/04/25	JDP	Draft e-mail to experts re: confirmation hearing strategy	0.30	\$411.00
B320	04/04/25	JDP	Review and comment on confirmation discovery	1.20	\$1,644.00
B320	04/04/25	JDP	Call with LS team re: confirmation hearing strategy	0.60	\$822.00
B320	04/04/25	JDP	Call with Judge Hogan re: confirmation schedule and process	0.50	\$685.00
B320	04/04/25	LHS	Revise document requests and prepare final forms (.8); review revisions to document requests (.3); review defined terms list for document requests to ensure certain defined terms are included (.3); review other forms for discovery requests (.2); review subpoena forms and instructions from R. Chahil (.3)	1.90	\$2,004.50
B320	04/04/25	LHS	Review revised forms of plan solicitation documents with attention to redline of disclosure statement, committee letter, and redline of proposed order approving disclosure statement	1.50	\$1,582.50
B320	04/04/25	MAK	Review and revise draft confirmation discovery demands (2.6); second level review of document production for potential deposition exhibits (2.3); call with LS team re: confirmation strategy (.6)	5.40	\$6,129.00
B320	04/04/25	MAK	Conference call with BRG re: expert reports for confirmation	1.30	\$1,475.50
B320	04/04/25	MRB	Update document requests for VeraCruz to prepare for submission	0.50	\$432.50
B320	04/04/25	RKC	Review/revise draft notice of subpoena form	0.40	\$390.00
B320	04/04/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: discovery	0.60	\$585.00
B320	04/04/25	RKC	Review/revise draft subpoena covers	0.40	\$390.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/05/25	AMG	Strategize re: document requests to Roman Catholic Welfare Corporation, Roman Catholic Cemeteries, and Adventus	0.30	\$214.50
B320	04/05/25	BIW	Revise documents explaining Plan and Committee's recommendation on same	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/05/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Moore re: final copy of Committee Solicitation Letter	0.20	\$232.00
B320	04/05/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: RCWC discovery issues	0.30	\$348.00
B320	04/05/25	CD	Draft document requests to debtor	0.10	\$86.50
B320	04/05/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation of Plan	3.10	\$3,487.50
B320	04/05/25	EJS	Review and revise various discovery requests (1.5); review additional requests from BRG (.3)	1.80	\$1,530.00
B320	04/05/25	MAK	Emails with BRG re: expert analysis	0.40	\$454.00
B320	04/06/25	AMG	Revise discovery templates, definitions, and document requests to Roman Catholic Welfare Corporation, Roman Catholic Cemeteries, and Adventus	1.80	\$1,287.00
B320	04/06/25	BIW	Draft email to P. Shields re: respond to inquiry on best interests test	0.20	\$232.00
B320	04/06/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation of Plan	2.20	\$2,475.00
B320	04/06/25	LHS	Revise document requests based on updated forms (.5); create subpoenas (.5)	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	04/06/25	MRB	Analyze updated definitions for discovery requests	0.20	\$173.00
B320	04/07/25	AMG	Strategize re: Debtor's discovery requests	0.10	\$71.50
B320	04/07/25	BIW	Review research re: Plan confirmation issues	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	04/07/25	BIW	Participate in call with Stout re: real estate valuation issues	0.80	\$928.00
B320	04/07/25	BIW	Revise covering email to Plan Voters	0.30	\$348.00
B320	04/07/25	BIW	Review revised Document Demands	0.70	\$812.00
B320	04/07/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG re: analysis of non-Debtor entity assets	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/07/25	BIW	Revise document demands	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/07/25	CD	Draft discovery requests to Debtor	0.60	\$519.00
B320	04/07/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation of Plan (5.2); Analyze legal issues re: confirmation of Plan (1.3); Call with BRG Team re: same (.7)	7.20	\$8,100.00
B320	04/07/25	EJS	Review confirmation issue re RCWC assets	0.20	\$170.00
B320	04/07/25	JBJ	Revise Plan confirmation discovery requests	1.20	\$942.00
B320	04/07/25	JDP	Call with Stout re: real estate valuation strategy	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	04/07/25	JDP	E-mails to/from BRG and LS litigation team re: confirmation trial strategy	0.50	\$685.00
B320	04/07/25	JDP	Call with BRG and LS litigation team re: confirmation strategy	0.70	\$959.00
B320	04/07/25	JDP	Develop strategy re: opposing RCWC release	0.30	\$411.00
B320	04/07/25	MAK	Conference call with BRG re: expert analysis	0.70	\$794.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/07/25	RKC	Strategize and begin drafting interrogatories to Bishop; confer with C. Restel re: same	0.40	\$390.00
B320	04/08/25	BIW	Develop insurance recovery strategy	0.80	\$928.00
B320	04/08/25	BIW	Review proposed revisions to document demands	0.70	\$812.00
B320	04/08/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Moore re: covering email to solicitation email	0.20	\$232.00
B320	04/08/25	BIW	Draft email re: solicitation of Plan and educating survivors on its contents	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/08/25	BIW	Outline Plan confirmation opposition strategy	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/08/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation of Plan	3.70	\$4,162.50
B320	04/08/25	DC	Review and compare Debtor's solicitation contact list for state court counsel	0.80	\$320.00
B320	04/08/25	JDP	Develop confirmation trial strategy	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	04/08/25	MAK	Begin review and analysis of documents and information exchanged in mediation for potential assertion of mediation privilege	3.30	\$3,745.50
B320	04/08/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: subpoenas	0.10	\$97.50
B320	04/09/25	AMG	Strategize re: discovery requests	0.10	\$71.50
B320	04/09/25	BIW	Draft email to J. Bair re: plan discovery	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/09/25	BIW	Draft Plan confirmation litigation outline	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/09/25	BIW	Participate in meeting with LS Litigation Team re: plan confirmation preparation	1.80	\$2,088.00
B320	04/09/25	BIW	Review and comment on revise document demands	0.90	\$1,044.00
B320	04/09/25	CGS	Review and revise discovery requests to debtor and third-parties	7.10	\$5,573.50
B320	04/09/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: Confirmation of Plan (5.2); Meeting with Litigation Team re: trial prep (1.8)	7.00	\$7,875.00
B320	04/09/25	EJS	Call with B. Weisenberg re solicitation issues (.2)	0.20	\$170.00
B320	04/09/25	JDP	Meeting with litigation team re: confirmation trial strategy	1.80	\$2,466.00
B320	04/09/25	KEM	Correspondence with C. Frankel re: confirmation issues research	0.10	\$105.50
B320	04/09/25	LHS	Call with C. Restel re: discovery issues in advance of confirmation process (.2); revise document requests (3)	3.20	\$3,376.00
B320	04/09/25	MAK	Meeting with litigation team re: trial preparation	1.80	\$2,043.00
B320	04/09/25	MAK	Review and revise final drafts of discovery to RCBO and affiliated entities	3.40	\$3,859.00
B320	04/10/25	BIW	Review revised document demands	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	04/10/25	CF	Research re: absolute priority rule (3.7); meeting with K. Moynihan re: same (.4)	4.10	\$2,706.00
B320	04/10/25	CG	Finalize subpoenas	5.80	\$3,828.00
B320	04/10/25	CGS	Finalize discovery requests and notices of subpoenas for individual pastors	13.80	\$10,833.00
B320	04/10/25	CMR	Review and revise discovery requests re: confirmation of Plan	2.70	\$3,037.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/10/25	JDP	Review and comment on plan discovery	2.50	\$3,425.00
B320	04/10/25	KEM	Review and analysis of confirmation research issues with C. Frankel (.4); review and analysis of absolute priority rule research (.4)	0.80	\$844.00
B320	04/10/25	LHS	Work on finalizing discovery requests	3.00	\$3,165.00
B320	04/10/25	MAK	Inter-office emails re: revisions to discovery demands	0.70	\$794.50
B320	04/10/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: subpoenas	0.30	\$292.50
B320	04/11/25	CGS	Finalize discovery requests and notices of subpoena for individual pastors	10.50	\$8,242.50
B320	04/11/25	CMR	Finalize and serve discovery re: confirmation of Plan	6.80	\$7,650.00
B320	04/11/25	JDP	Call with Burns Bair re: discovery to insurers (.3); confer with LS litigation team re: same (.2)	0.50	\$685.00
B320	04/11/25	JDP	Draft e-mail to A. Uetz re: plan confirmation process	0.20	\$274.00
B320	04/11/25	JDP	Finalize confirmation discovery requests	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	04/11/25	LHS	Work on finalizing document requests	3.30	\$3,481.50
B320	04/11/25	MAK	Finalize written discovery demands to Debtor and affiliates	4.60	\$5,221.00
B320	04/11/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of documents and information exchanged in mediation for potential assertion of mediation privilege	2.10	\$2,383.50
B320	04/12/25	CMR	Analyze discovery served on Committee and strategize re: same (.9); Call and emails with M. Lee re: discovery (.2); Confer with LS Team re: document review protocol (.1)	1.20	\$1,350.00
B320	04/12/25	JDP	Develop insurance neutral insurance assignment provision	0.70	\$959.00
B320	04/12/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: liquidation analysis	0.70	\$959.00
B320	04/12/25	MAK	Review and analyze debtor's discovery to the committee	0.80	\$908.00
B320	04/12/25	RKC	Confer with C. Restel re: document review	0.30	\$292.50
B320	04/14/25	BIW	Revise letter to Debtor re: discovery in connection with BOG Complaint	0.30	\$348.00
B320	04/14/25	BIW	Review documents previously produced by Debtor	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	04/14/25	BIW	Participate in call with BRG re: analyze liquidation analysis	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/14/25	CD	Draft responses and objections to Debtor's discovery to the Committee	3.30	\$2,854.50
B320	04/14/25	CF	Conduct research re: absolute priority rule and self-insured retention	3.40	\$2,244.00
B320	04/14/25	CMR	Confer re: service of subpoenas (.2); Analyze legal issues and confer re: discovery requests and responses (.6)	0.80	\$900.00
B320	04/14/25	EJS	Prepare Committee presentation re: Plan solicitation and voting	1.20	\$1,020.00
B320	04/14/25	JDP	Review Stout analysis (.2); call with Stout real estate re: real estate valuation (.6)	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	04/14/25	JDP	Call with BRG re: ability to pay analysis	0.60	\$822.00
B320	04/14/25	JDP	Develop strategy for confirmation trial	1.20	\$1,644.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 49 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/14/25	JDP	Review discovery served on committee and develop response	1.10	\$1,507.00
B320	04/14/25	KEM	Correspondence with C. Frankel re: absolute priority research	0.30	\$316.50
B320	04/14/25	MAK	Review and revise letter to debtor re: adversary proceeding discovery	0.30	\$340.50
B320	04/15/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Survivors re: respond to inquiry on balloting	0.20	\$232.00
B320	04/15/25	BIW	Review research re: absolute priority rule	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/15/25	BIW	Meet with Litigation Team re: application of absolute priority rule	0.80	\$928.00
B320	04/15/25	BIW	Meet with LS Litigation Team re: responses to interrogatories	0.70	\$812.00
B320	04/15/25	BIW	Review additional research re: absolute priority rule	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/15/25	CD	Draft discovery responses and objections	2.10	\$1,816.50
B320	04/15/25	CF	Research re: absolute priority rule in context of nonprofit entities (1.3); email communications re: same (.3)	1.60	\$1,056.00
B320	04/15/25	CMR	Analyze legal research re: confirmation issues (.5); Multiple meetings throughout the day re: confirmation issues and discovery re: same (3.4); Analyze issues re: responses to discovery requests (.6); Analyze issues re: potential discovery motions (.3); Analyze potential expert witnesses re: plan confirmation (.5)	5.30	\$5,962.50
B320	04/15/25	JBJ	Draft issue tags and descriptions for produced documents	1.60	\$1,256.00
B320	04/15/25	JDP	Meet with LS litigation team re: absolute priority rule	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	04/15/25	JDP	Meeting with litigation team re: discovery responses	0.70	\$959.00
B320	04/15/25	JDP	Call with K. Kernen re: real estate expert report	0.20	\$274.00
B320	04/15/25	JDP	Review research re: absolute priority rule and develop position	1.50	\$2,055.00
B320	04/15/25	KEM	Review and analysis of absolute priority rule research	0.40	\$422.00
B320	04/15/25	LHS	Interoffice meeting with C. Restel in connection with discovery in advance of confirmation (.6); review template for interrogatory responses (.3); review DS objections to draft certain interrogatory responses (1.2)	2.10	\$2,215.50
B320	04/15/25	MAK	Continue second level review of debtor's document production for potential deposition/trial exhibits	1.90	\$2,156.50
B320	04/16/25	BIW	Analyze Debtor's Mission Alignment Process documents for Plan confirmation	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	04/16/25	BIW	Review extensive discovery on absolute priority rule	1.80	\$2,088.00
B320	04/16/25	CD	Draft discovery responses and objections	1.90	\$1,643.50
B320	04/16/25	CF	Research re: self-insured retention case law	1.10	\$726.00
B320	04/16/25	CMR	Strategize with LS Team re: responses to discovery requests (.4); Analyze issues re: same (.2); Call with K. Moynihan re: Motion for Protective Order (.1); Strategize re: confirmation hearing (.5)	1.20	\$1,350.00
B320	04/16/25	CMR	Analyze documents produced re: confirmation	0.40	\$450.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/16/25	JJP	Prepare searches and provide same to R. Chahil	0.20	\$86.00
B320	04/16/25	KEM	Call with C. Restel re: motion for protective order and correspondence from B. Weisenberg re: absolute priority	0.10	\$105.50
B320	04/16/25	LHS	Call with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, and C. Dernbach re: responses to discovery requests including interrogatories (.4); work on interrogatory responses (4.0)	4.40	\$4,642.00
B320	04/16/25	MAK	Review and analyze case law on applicable privileges (1.6); draft notes on preliminary responses to discovery demands (.8); continue review and analysis of documents subject to mediation privilege (1.4); continue second level review of debtor's document production for potential deposition/trial exhibits (2.3)	6.10	\$6,923.50
B320	04/16/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: preliminary responses to discovery demands	0.40	\$454.00
B320	04/16/25	RKC	Review Relativity documents and tags and confer with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: same	0.90	\$877.50
B320	04/17/25	BIW	Participate in call with Stout Real Estate re: real estate valuation	0.50	\$580.00
B320	04/17/25	BIW	Review research on religious freedom and the Bankruptcy Code	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	04/17/25	CD	Draft discovery responses and objections	2.00	\$1,730.00
B320	04/17/25	CMR	Confer re: document review protocol re: confirmation related discovery (.2); Analyze issues re: potential confirmation experts (.1); Review and revise Responses and Objections to discovery re: Confirmation (1.5)	1.80	\$2,025.00
B320	04/17/25	DC	Review Order Setting Confirmation Deadlines and verify calendar dates	0.20	\$80.00
B320	04/17/25	JBJ	Review produced documents (1.5); match issue tags to requests for documents (2.0)	3.50	\$2,747.50
B320	04/17/25	JDP	Call with Stout re: real estate valuation	0.50	\$685.00
B320	04/17/25	LHS	Continue to draft responses to interrogatories from Debtor	4.50	\$4,747.50
B320	04/17/25	RKC	Strategize re: review of documents previously produced	0.40	\$390.00
B320	04/18/25	BIW	Reviewed research on First Amendment and Bankruptcy Code	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	04/18/25	BIW	Review research on Plan confirmation requirements	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/18/25	BIW	Review Debtor's document demands and assist with responding to Interrogatories	0.80	\$928.00
B320	04/18/25	CD	Review background of potential expert	0.50	\$432.50
B320	04/18/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: potential experts for confirmation (1.0); Analyze issues re: discovery responses re: confirmation (.3) and confer with LS team re: same (.1); Confer with LS and Foley teams re: scheduling a call re: confirmation discovery (.1); Review Objection to Stout Retention (.3) and multiple calls with LS and Foley teams re: same (.3)	2.10	\$2,362.50
B320	04/18/25	JBJ	Review and respond to internal correspondence re: expert	0.20	\$157.00
B320	04/18/25	JDP	Review and comment on research on applicability of absolute priority rule in non-profit bankruptcies	1.30	\$1,781.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/18/25	LHS	Revise interrogatory responses	2.50	\$2,637.50
B320	04/18/25	MAK	Outline issues for protective order motion and potential motion to quash	1.90	\$2,156.50
B320	04/20/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Discovery Requests	1.40	\$1,575.00
B320	04/20/25	LHS	Review C. Restel's comments to interrogatory responses and work on revisions	2.00	\$2,110.00
B320	04/21/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert (.8); draft email re: same (.3)	1.10	\$1,276.00
B320	04/21/25	BIW	Review research on issues of law to be addressed at Plan confirmation	1.20	\$1,392.00
B320	04/21/25	CD	Draft discovery responses to Debtor's discovery	0.20	\$173.00
B320	04/21/25	CF	Conduct research re: plan confirmation (1.5); call with K. Moynihan re: same (.4)	1.90	\$1,254.00
B320	04/21/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses and Objections to Discovery Requests to Committee (4.6); Analyze potential experts re: Confirmation (.4)	5.00	\$5,625.00
B320	04/21/25	JDP	Review and comment on discovery responses	0.50	\$685.00
B320	04/21/25	KEM	Confer with C. Frankel re: confirmation research issues	0.40	\$422.00
B320	04/21/25	LHS	Call with C. Restel re: interrogatory responses (.4); revise interrogatory responses (1.2)	1.60	\$1,688.00
B320	04/21/25	MAK	Outline issues for protective order motion and potential motion to quash (.8); continue review and analysis of background documents on potential experts (2.6); continue second level review of document production to identify deposition and trial exhibits (2.2)	5.60	\$6,356.00
B320	04/21/25	RKC	Strategize re: review of RCBO documents previously produced	0.80	\$780.00
B320	04/22/25	AMG	Strategize re: document review	0.20	\$143.00
B320	04/22/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert re: expert testimony needed at Plan confirmation	0.70	\$812.00
B320	04/22/25	BIW	Review caselaw on issues germane to Plan confirmation	0.80	\$928.00
B320	04/22/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert re: expert testimony needed at Plan confirmation	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/22/25	CD	Draft interrogatory responses and objections	1.10	\$951.50
B320	04/22/25	CGS	Review background information and materials of potential expert	7.30	\$5,730.50
B320	04/22/25	CMR	Confer re: scheduling meet and confer re: discovery re: Confirmation (.1); Analyze issues re: potential experts re: Confirmation (1.4); Review and revise Responses and Objections to discovery requests propounded on Committee (1.0)	2.50	\$2,812.50
B320	04/22/25	JDP	Review and comment on research re: intersection between 1st Amendment and Bankruptcy	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	04/22/25	JJP	Prepare searches requested by A. Chahil and provide document counts	0.20	\$86.00
B320	04/22/25	LHS	Review and incorporate rounds of comments on document request and interrogatory responses from M. Kaplan to finalize response	2.30	\$2,426.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 52 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/22/25	MAK	Review and revise protective order motion (1.8); continue review and analysis of background documents on potential experts (1.2); continue second level review of document production to identify deposition and trial exhibits (1.3)	4.30	\$4,880.50
B320	04/22/25	PJG	Office conference with J. Prol re: plan confirmation issues including absolute priority rule, good faith and hypothetical liquidation analysis and related issues (.6); initial review of Lowenstein DS objection and preliminary research re: absolute priority rule in non-profit bankruptcy and comparable law in the Chapter 9 municipal bankruptcy context (3.6)	4.20	\$4,599.00
B320	04/22/25	RKC	Strategize re: review of RCBO documents previously produced	2.20	\$2,145.00
B320	04/23/25	AMG	Review documents produced by Debtor	2.20	\$1,573.00
B320	04/23/25	BIW	Confer with prospective expert re: plan confirmation testimony needed	0.80	\$928.00
B320	04/23/25	BIW	Draft email to M. Moore re: use of DocuSign for completing ballots	0.20	\$232.00
B320	04/23/25	CD	Draft discovery responses and objections	0.10	\$86.50
B320	04/23/25	CGS	Review background materials for potential expert	7.50	\$5,887.50
B320	04/23/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: potential experts re: Confirmation (.1); Confer re: preparation of Discovery Motions re: Confirmation (.1); Review and revise Responses & Objections to Discovery served on Committee (.3); Confer re: Debtor potential objection to BRG expert retention (.1)	0.60	\$675.00
B320	04/23/25	JBJ	Review documents re: expert report	5.50	\$4,317.50
B320	04/23/25	KEM	Review Debtor's first set of discovery requests (.7); correspondence with C. Restel re: same (.1); draft motion for protective order (3.3)	4.10	\$4,325.50
B320	04/23/25	LHS	Further edit and finalize Committee's response and objections to Debtor's document request and interrogatories	1.60	\$1,688.00
B320	04/23/25	MAK	Continue second level review of document production to identify deposition and trial exhibits	1.90	\$2,156.50
B320	04/23/25	RKC	Confer with BRG team re: review of documents previously produced by Debtor	0.20	\$195.00
B320	04/24/25	AMG	Review documents produced by Debtor	4.20	\$3,003.00
B320	04/24/25	AMG	Strategize and conduct research re: discovery of a committee of unsecured creditors	4.00	\$2,860.00
B320	04/24/25	BIW	Participate in call with Burns Bair re: preparation for contested plan confirmation	0.40	\$464.00
B320	04/24/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: exhibit for confirmation	0.60	\$696.00
B320	04/24/25	BIW	Review and revise Committee Responses to Document Requests and Interrogatories	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	04/24/25	CD	Review background of potential expert witness and draft memorandum re: same	2.30	\$1,989.50
B320	04/24/25	CGS	Review background material for potential expert	6.20	\$4,867.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 53 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/24/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion for Protective Order re: confirmation discovery (3); Analyze issues and prepare Request for Inspection of Property (1.4); Analyze issues re: potential expert witnesses (.3); Meet and Confer with Debtors' counsel re: discovery (.8); Analyze issues re: discovery responses (.6)	6.10	\$6,862.50
B320	04/24/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (2.7); call with C. Dernbach and C. Stewart re: expert review (0.1)	2.80	\$2,198.00
B320	04/24/25	JDP	Develop strategy re: use of experts at trial	0.70	\$959.00
B320	04/24/25	JDP	Review and edit discovery responses	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	04/24/25	JDP	Confer with LS litigation team re: real estate valuation issues	0.30	\$411.00
B320	04/24/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: expert retention, fee motion and strategy for confirmation hearing	0.50	\$685.00
B320	04/24/25	JDP	Review and analyze first list of properties to be appraised (.2); develop discovery strategy (.1)	0.30	\$411.00
B320	04/24/25	JJP	Provide assistance to R. Chahil re: database searches for document review	0.10	\$43.00
B320	04/24/25	KEM	Correspondence with M. Kaplan, C. Restel, and A. Giblin re: motion for protective order (.3); call with A. Giblin re: protective order research (.2); research regarding protective order motion issues (1.9); draft protective order motion (4.3)	6.70	\$7,068.50
B320	04/24/25	LHS	Call with C. Restel re: discovery responses and e-mail team re: finalizing responses to debtor's discovery requests	0.30	\$316.50
B320	04/24/25	MAK	Meet and confer with debtor re: confirmation discovery	0.60	\$681.00
B320	04/24/25	MAK	Review and revise motion for protective order	1.70	\$1,929.50
B320	04/24/25	PJG	Research re: absolute priority rule, liquidation analysis and related issues	1.30	\$1,423.50
B320	04/24/25	RKC	Strategize re: review and run searches in RCBO documents previously produced	1.10	\$1,072.50
B320	04/25/25	AMG	Review documents produced by Debtor	3.70	\$2,645.50
B320	04/25/25	AMG	Cite check and proof motion for protective order	3.10	\$2,216.50
B320	04/25/25	AMG	Cite check and proof Committee's discovery responses	2.10	\$1,501.50
B320	04/25/25	BIW	Review research on issues of law under Plan	0.70	\$812.00
B320	04/25/25	CD	Revise responses to Debtor's discovery requests	1.90	\$1,643.50
B320	04/25/25	CGS	Review previously produced documents from Debtor to ensure responsiveness to requests	0.60	\$471.00
B320	04/25/25	CMR	Review and revise Motion for Protective Order (1.6); Analyze issues re: expert testimony re: confirmation (.4); Review and revise Responses and Objections re: confirmation discovery (1.6)	3.60	\$4,050.00
B320	04/25/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness	1.40	\$1,099.00
B320	04/25/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft responses to discovery demanded by the Debtor	1.30	\$1,781.00
B320	04/25/25	JDP	Review and edit discovery responses	2.20	\$3,014.00
B320	04/25/25	JDP	Review and edit draft motion for a protective order	0.60	\$822.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/25/25	KEM	Correspondence with C. Restel, A. Giblin, and G. Albert re: revisions to and filing of motion for protective order (.4); research re: protective order motion issues (.7); revise motion for protective order (.6)	1.70	\$1,793.50
B320	04/25/25	LHS	Review comments and proposed revisions from J. Prol and B. Weisenberg to Committee's response to Debtor's discovery requests (.5); revise language in responses to interrogatories per comments from J. Prol (.5); review outstanding comments and revise to finalize responses (.6)	1.60	\$1,688.00
B320	04/25/25	MAK	Finalize motion for protective order	0.80	\$908.00
B320	04/25/25	MAK	Finalize responses to discovery demands	0.70	\$794.50
B320	04/25/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of background documents on potential experts (.7); continue second level review of document production to identify deposition and trial exhibits (3.4)	4.10	\$4,653.50
B320	04/26/25	BIW	Review Debtor, Bishop and Vera Cruz responses to discovery demands	1.30	\$1,508.00
B320	04/26/25	CD	Review debtor's interrogatory responses and document request responses	0.80	\$692.00
B320	04/26/25	CGS	Compose email to R. Chahil re: review of Debtor's produced documents (.1); respond to C. Dernbach email re: possible urgent assignment (.1)	0.20	\$157.00
B320	04/26/25	CMR	Summary review of Debtors' Motion to Quash (.2); Review Responses and Objections to Committee's discovery requests (1.9)	2.10	\$2,362.50
B320	04/26/25	LHS	Review debtors' responses to interrogatories, production, and bishop's responses and objections to subpoena in connection with pre-Confirmation discovery	1.00	\$1,055.00
B320	04/26/25	MAK	Begin review and analysis of RCBO and affiliates discovery responses to prepare deficiency letter and for meet and confer	1.10	\$1,248.50
B320	04/26/25	RKC	Review/analyze Debtor's response and objections to document requests and strategize re: same	1.60	\$1,560.00
B320	04/27/25	AMG	Review documents produced by Debtor	3.10	\$2,216.50
B320	04/27/25	BIW	Review Committee and Debtor Motions for Protective Order	0.80	\$928.00
B320	04/27/25	CGS	Review previously produced documents from Debtor to ensure responsiveness to requests.	7.00	\$5,495.00
B320	04/27/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: documents produced by Debtors and Responses and Objection to discovery re: Confirmation (.6); Confer with M. Kaplan re: same (.3)	0.90	\$1,012.50
B320	04/27/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness	1.40	\$1,099.00
B320	04/27/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of RCBO and affiliates discovery responses to prepare deficiency letter and for meet and confer	1.90	\$2,156.50
B320	04/27/25	RKC	Review BRG's analysis of financial documents previously produced	0.50	\$487.50
B320	04/27/25	RKC	Review/analyze motion to quash subpoenas	0.70	\$682.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/27/25	RKC	Strategize re: review of RCBO documents previously produced and comparison to plan confirmation requests; confer with Lowenstein team re: same; confer with BRG team re: same	2.30	\$2,242.50
B320	04/28/25	AMG	Review documents produced by Debtor	2.70	\$1,930.50
B320	04/28/25	BIW	Confer with interested party re: value of Debtor's real estate	0.70	\$812.00
B320	04/28/25	CD	Review and analyze responses to Committee's discovery	1.90	\$1,643.50
B320	04/28/25	CGS	Review documents previously produced by Debtor to ensure responsiveness to Requests for Production	2.00	\$1,570.00
B320	04/28/25	CMR	Revise and serve Request for Inspection of Property re: confirmation (.8); Analyze issues re: verification of discovery responses (.2); Confer with LS Team re: response to Motion to Quash (.2); Analyze issues re: documents produced re: confirmation (.2); Call with potential expert witnesses re: confirmation (.8); Call with M. Kaplan re: potential expert witnesses (.3); Analyze issues re: fact witnesses and depositions (.2)	2.70	\$3,037.50
B320	04/28/25	JBJ	Review produced documents for responsiveness (2.0); review response to document requests (1.3)	3.30	\$2,590.50
B320	04/28/25	JDP	Review and edit discovery request re: access to real estate	0.40	\$548.00
B320	04/28/25	JJP	Review email correspondence from R. Chahil re: productions; prepare searches and provide response to same re: file types	0.20	\$86.00
B320	04/28/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of RCBO and affiliates discovery responses to prepare deficiency letter and for meet and confer	2.30	\$2,610.50
B320	04/28/25	MAK	Initial interview with potential First Amendment and trust experts	0.80	\$908.00
B320	04/28/25	RKC	Analyze and finalize chart of documents requested versus documents already produced	1.20	\$1,170.00
B320	04/28/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: documents previously produced by Debtor	0.50	\$487.50
B320	04/28/25	RKC	Confer with Lowenstein team re: review of documents	1.20	\$1,170.00
B320	04/28/25	RKC	Strategize re: opposition to motion to quash subpoenas to pastors	0.60	\$585.00
B320	04/29/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document productions	4.90	\$3,503.50
B320	04/29/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan re: identification of fact witnesses	0.20	\$232.00
B320	04/29/25	CD	Review and analyze discovery responses from Debtor and non-parties	4.00	\$3,460.00
B320	04/29/25	CGS	Review documents previously produced by Debtor to evaluate responsiveness to requests for production (3.2); compose and edit chart re: status of production in anticipation of forthcoming meet and confer (2.5)	5.70	\$4,474.50
B320	04/29/25	CMR	Confer with Debtor's counsel re: discovery responses in preparation for Meet and Confer	0.30	\$337.50

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	04/29/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: potential fact witnesses for Confirmation Hearing (.4); Analyze legal issues re: confirmation (.4); analyze issues re: Debtors' discovery responses re: Confirmation (.3); Call with potential expert witness (.5); Strategize re: Confirmation witnesses (.2) Call with LS Team re: potential Confirmation witnesses (.6);	2.40	\$2,700.00
B320	04/29/25	JBJ	Legal research re: motion to quash (2.0); review responses to document requests and interrogatories (2.5)	4.50	\$3,532.50
B320	04/29/25	JDP	Develop confirmation trial strategy	0.80	\$1,096.00
B320	04/29/25	JJP	Provide assistance to the case team re: searches and document review	1.20	\$516.00
B320	04/29/25	MAK	Conference call with potential insurance expert for confirmation	0.50	\$567.50
B320	04/29/25	MAK	Inter-office emails re: discovery deficiency letter	0.60	\$681.00
B320	04/29/25	PJG	Review DS objection and issues re: best interests, fair and equitable and good faith (0.9); additional research re: constitutional issues/arguments raised by tort plaintiffs and potential counter-arguments re: same (2.7); draft memorandum re: same (1.8)	5.40	\$5,913.00
B320	04/29/25	RKC	Review e-mail from M. Kaplan re: Debtor's responses and objections	0.20	\$195.00
B320	04/29/25	RKC	Confer with A. Giblin re: index of Debtor's prior productions	0.40	\$390.00
B320	04/29/25	RKC	Draft list of individuals within Committee attorney- client privilege	0.40	\$390.00
B320	04/29/25	RKC	Draft e-mail to Debtor re: deficiencies in responses and objections	1.20	\$1,170.00
B320	04/29/25	RKC	Confer with BRG re: restricted asset documents	0.70	\$682.50
B320	04/29/25	RKC	Review summaries of documents already produced and additional analysis/strategizing re: same	2.80	\$2,730.00
B320	04/30/25	AMG	Review Debtor's document productions	5.10	\$3,646.50
B320	04/30/25	CD	Research verification requirements	1.00	\$865.00
B320	04/30/25	CD	Review and analyze responses to discovery requests	1.10	\$951.50
B320	04/30/25	CMR	Strategize re: witnesses re: confirmation (.2); Analyze discovery responses in preparation for Meet and Confer re: same (.7); Analyze legal issues re: discovery (.1)	1.00	\$1,125.00
B320	04/30/25	JBJ	Legal research re: motion to quash	4.50	\$3,532.50
			Total B320 - Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	1,171.70	\$1,198,719.00
<u>B400 - Bank</u>	ruptcy-Relate	ed Advice			
·			tcy Court Litigation		
B430	01/01/25	BIW	Revise Objection to RCBO's Motion for Abeyance	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430	01/01/25	BIW	Review objections to Standing Motion (1.4); call with N. Fulfree and C. Frankel re: reply (1.0)	2.40	\$2,784.00
B430	01/01/25	CF	Call with N. Fulfree and B. Weisenberg re: reply in support of derivative standing motion	1.00	\$660.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	01/01/25	JDP	Review and analyze response to motion for standing (1.2); develop strategy and outline for reply (.8)	2.00	\$2,740.00
B430	01/01/25	JDP	Review and analyze response to motion for authority to substitute in as plaintiff in insurance adversary (.9); review and comment on reply (1.2)	2.10	\$2,877.00
B430	01/01/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis of opposition briefs to UCC Lift Stay Motion	1.10	\$1,248.50
B430	01/01/25	MAK	Continue review and analysis opposition briefs to UCC Derivative Standing Motion	1.60	\$1,816.00
B430	01/01/25	NF	Draft derivative standing reply (6.6); call with B. Weisenberg and C. Frankel re: same (1.0); emails re: strategy for same (.5)	8.10	\$9,274.50
B430	01/02/25	BIW	Draft email to T. Burns and J. Prol re: reply to Debtor's Abeyance Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/02/25	BIW	Revise Objection to Abeyance Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/02/25	BIW	Confer with N. Fulfree re: proposed stipulation to resolve Church property issues	0.20	\$232.00
B430	01/02/25	BIW	Comment on Reply to Committee's Derivative Standing Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B430	01/02/25	BIW	Review final objection to Abeyance Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/02/25	BIW	Review and revise draft Insurance Standing Reply	0.60	\$696.00
B430	01/02/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: standing motions (4.4); Call with N. Fulfree re: Reply in support of Derivative Standing Motion (.3); Review draft of same (.3)	5.00	\$5,625.00
B430	01/02/25	JDP	Review draft reply to motion to stay insurance adversary proceeding; confer with T. Burns re: same	1.20	\$1,644.00
B430	01/02/25	NF	Review POE stipulation and email Debtor's counsel re: same (.3); call with B. Weisenberg re: same (.1); follow up with defendant's counsel re: extension stipulations (.1); call with C. Restel re: reply to derivative standing motion (.3); continue drafting reply to derivative standing motion (8.2)	9.00	\$10,305.00
B430	01/03/25	BIW	Review and comment on revised draft Reply to Debtor's objection to Committee's Standing Motion (.3); confer with N. Fulfree re: same (.1)	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/03/25	BIW	Confer with C. Restel re: drafting reply to Debtor's objection to Committee's Standing Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/03/25	BIW	Review draft Reply to Debtor's objection to Committee's Standing Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/03/25	CMR	Review and revise Reply in Support of Derivative Standing Motion (3.5); confer with B. Weisenberg resame (.4)	3.90	\$4,387.50
B430	01/03/25	DC	E-mails with C. Frankel re: preparation for 1/8/25 hearing	0.20	\$80.00
B430	01/03/25	JDP	Review and comment on reply in support of committee motion for derivative standing to pursue insurance adversary proceeding	0.80	\$1,096.00
B430	01/03/25	JDP	Develop arguments for reply brief on committee motion for derivative standing on OPF/Parish complaint	0.70	\$959.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 58 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	01/03/25	JDP	Review and comment on opposition to debtor's motion to stay insurance adversary	1.10	\$1,507.00
B430	01/03/25	NF	Review of emails re: standing reply (.1) and call with B. Weisenberg re: same (.1)	0.20	\$229.00
B430	01/04/25	CF	Revise reply in support of standing motion	3.30	\$2,178.00
B430	01/04/25	CF	Further revise reply in support of standing motion	1.90	\$1,254.00
B430	01/04/25	CMR	Review and revise Reply in Support of Derivative Standing Motion	3.20	\$3,600.00
B430	01/04/25	JDP	Review and edit draft of reply in support of committee standing motion on OPF/Parish Complaint	1.50	\$2,055.00
B430	01/04/25	MAK	Review and revise reply to derivative standing motion	1.80	\$2,043.00
B430	01/05/25	BIW	Review proposed revisions to Reply to Standing Motion Objections	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/05/25	BIW	Confer with M. Kaplan and C. Restel re: revisions needed to Standing Reply	0.50	\$580.00
B430	01/05/25	BIW	Review and comment on Reply to Objection to Committee's Standing Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/05/25	CF	Further revise reply in support of standing motion	4.90	\$3,234.00
B430	01/05/25	CMR	Call with M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg re: Standing Reply (.5); Review and revise same (3.1)	3.60	\$4,050.00
B430	01/05/25	MAK	Inter-office call re: reply to derivative standing brief (.5); review and revise the same (1.6)	2.10	\$2,383.50
B430	01/05/25	NF	Review updated standing motion reply	0.90	\$1,030.50
B430	01/06/25	BIW	Email correspondence with M. Plevin re: access to redacted Standing Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B430	01/06/25	BIW	Review and revise Reply to Objections to Insurance Standing Motion	0.80	\$928.00
B430	01/06/25	BIW	Review proposed revisions to Reply to Standing Motion Objections	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/06/25	CMR	Revise Reply in Support of Standing Motion	1.60	\$1,800.00
B430	01/06/25	JDP	Review and comment on final version of reply in support of derivative standing on insurance adversary proceeding	1.10	\$1,507.00
B430	01/06/25	JDP	Review and comment on reply in support of motion for derivative standing	1.20	\$1,644.00
B430	01/07/25	BIW	Draft email to C. Restel re: need for defendants to execute acceptance of service stipulation	0.30	\$348.00
B430	01/08/25	CMR	Review edits to stipulation re: Debtor property (.2); Confer with LS Team re: response to same (.3)	0.50	\$562.50
B430	01/09/25	CMR	Confer via email (multiple) re: Stipulations to Extend Time re: Adversary Proceedings	0.30	\$337.50
B430	01/12/25	BIW	Review Continental's Response to Abeyance Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B430	01/12/25	BIW	Review Debtor's Reply to UCC's Abeyance Objection	0.30	\$348.00
B430	01/12/25	BIW	Review Debtor's proposed revisions to Property of Estate Stipulation (.4); draft email re: same (.3)	0.70	\$812.00
B430	01/13/25	BIW	Revise Property of Estate Stipulation	0.40	\$464.00
B430	01/13/25	CMR	Review and revise Stipulation re: Property of the Estate	1.00	\$1,125.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	01/13/25	NF	Review lift stay reply (.5); brief review of amended plan and disclosure statement (.7)	1.20	\$1,374.00
B430	01/14/25	CMR	Review and revise Stipulation re: Property of the Estate	0.70	\$787.50
B430	01/14/25	JDP	Review and edit draft stip re: claims vs churches	0.30	\$411.00
B430	01/15/25	NF	Review final stipulations extending deadlines (.2); and email from Foley re: OPF claim objection deadline and email G. Albert re: same (.1)	0.30	\$343.50
B430	01/18/25	BIW	Review and revise proposed order denying Committee's Insurance Standing Motion and Court's decision on same	0.50	\$580.00
B430	01/18/25	CMR	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: schedule in adversary proceedings	0.10	\$112.50
B430	01/20/25	CMR	Confer with LS Team re: deadlines in Adversary Proceedings	0.10	\$112.50
B430	01/20/25	JDP	Review and analyze Court's decision on motion for derivative standing to pursue insurance dec relief action and develop strategy	0.80	\$1,096.00
B430	01/20/25	JDP	Review and comment on proposed order denying motion for standing to pursue insurance dec relief action	0.20	\$274.00
B430	01/21/25	CMR	Strategize with LS Team re: status and strategy post- denial of lift stay and standing	1.50	\$1,687.50
B430	01/21/25	CMR	Confer re: Draft Stipulation re Church Property	0.10	\$112.50
B430	01/21/25	JDP	Confer with LS team re: status and strategy following court's decisions on lift stay and derivative standing	1.50	\$2,055.00
B430	01/22/25	CMR	Prepare stipulation re: extension of deadline to bring Avoidance Actions (.5); Confer with J. Prol and B. Weisenberg (multiple) re: same (.3)	0.80	\$900.00
B430	01/22/25	JDP	Develop strategy following denial of lift stand and derivative standing	1.80	\$2,466.00
B430	01/22/25	JDP	Review and comment on draft order tolling avoidance power statute of limitations	0.30	\$411.00
B430	01/24/25	BIW	Revise proposed order denying Standing Motion	0.20	\$232.00
B430	01/24/25	CF	Review docket and draft proposed order denying standing motion without prejudice	0.40	\$264.00
B430	01/25/25	BIW	Review pleadings filed in response to Committee complaints	0.70	\$812.00
B430	01/25/25	JDP	Review motions to dismiss committee adversary proceedings and outline responses	2.50	\$3,425.00
B430	01/26/25	BIW	Review Motions to Dismiss Committee Complaints outline response to same	1.20	\$1,392.00
B430	01/26/25	CMR	Review Motion to Dismiss OPF Complaint	0.90	\$1,012.50
B430	01/26/25	MAK	Review and analyze MTD OPF complaint	2.90	\$3,291.50
B430	01/27/25	BIW	Confer with G. Albert re: hearing date for motions to dismiss	0.20	\$232.00
B430	01/27/25	BIW	Draft email to Foley Team re: need to finalize Stipulations and Orders	0.30	\$348.00
B430	01/27/25	CMR	Call with LS Team re: Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	1.00	\$1,125.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	01/27/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Motions to Dismiss RCWC Complaint (3.3); Analyze issues re: Motions to Dismiss OPF Complaint (3.3)	6.60	\$7,425.00
B430	01/27/25	EJS	Call (.1) and correspondence (.1) with B. Weisenberg re: RCBO Adversary Complaint reply	0.20	\$170.00
B430	01/27/25	JDP	Review and comment on OPF motion to dismiss sub con complaint; develop strategy for response	1.40	\$1,918.00
B430	01/27/25	JDP	Review and comment on RCWC motion to dismiss; develop strategy for response	1.50	\$2,055.00
B430	01/27/25	JDP	Participate in strategy call with LS litigation team re: responses to motion to dismiss and OPF claim objection	1.00	\$1,370.00
B430	01/27/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: responses to MTD adversary proceedings	1.00	\$1,135.00
B430	01/27/25	MAK	Review and analyze MTD OPF complaint	1.90	\$2,156.50
B430	01/27/25	NF	Review responses to OPF claim objection (.8); Attend call re: OPF claim objection response and MTDs (1.0)	1.80	\$2,061.00
B430	01/28/25	BIW	Outline responses to Motions to Dismiss	0.80	\$928.00
B430	01/28/25	BIW	Outline arguments to be made in response to Motions to Dismiss	1.30	\$1,508.00
B430	01/28/25	BIW	Review Debtor's revised draft of Derivative Standing Order	0.10	\$116.00
B430	01/28/25	BIW	Review Debtor's proposed changes to Property of the Estate Stipulation (.3); draft emails re: same (.2)	0.50	\$580.00
B430	01/28/25	CMR	Analyze revisions to property of the estate stipulation (.2); Confer with LS Team re: same (.3); Strategize re: response to Motions to Dismiss (2.2); Call with B. Weisenberg and L. Sklar re: same (.5)	3.20	\$3,600.00
B430	01/28/25	EJS	Review and analyze motions to dismiss in connection with pending adversary proceedings (2.9); create internal issues list (.4); email correspondence with C. Restel re same (.1)	3.40	\$2,890.00
B430	01/28/25	LHS	Begin review of adversary complaint and motions to dismiss complaint in order to begin drafting responses	2.00	\$2,110.00
B430	01/28/25	NF	Review MTDs by OPF, BOG, and Debtors and take notes re: same (1.9); review B. Weisenberg notes re: same (.4)	2.30	\$2,633.50
B430	01/29/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Motions to Dismiss OPF Complaint	2.90	\$3,262.50
B430	01/29/25	EJS	Email correspondence with C. Restel re: 1/30 adversary proceedings strategy call (.1); update issues list ahead of same (.2)	0.30	\$255.00
B430	01/29/25	LHS	Further review and analysis of debtors' motion to dismiss OPF complaint in order to draft response	1.30	\$1,371.50
B430	01/30/25	BIW	Outline arguments in response to Motions to Dismiss	0.60	\$696.00
B430	01/30/25	CF	Review motions to dismiss and review cited case law (1.4); meeting with N. Fulfree, C. Restel, L. Sklar and E. Seltzer re: same (.9)	2.30	\$1,518.00
B430	01/30/25	CMR	Strategize re: Responses to Motions to Dismiss (1.0); Meeting with LS Team re: same (.9); Call with N. Fulfree re: same (.2)	2.10	\$2,362.50

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 61 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	01/30/25	DC	Review dockets in adversary proceedings, download pleadings and update electronic files (.4); prepare draft response pleading templates for each motion to dismiss filed in RCC and OPF (1.0)	1.40	\$560.00
B430	01/30/25	EJS	Prepare for (.1) and attend (.9) call with N. Fulfree,, C. Restel, L. Sklar, and C. Frankel re: motions to dismiss and strategy; review motions to dismiss OPF adversary proceeding (1.0); research issues in connection with response to motions to dismiss (3.5); email correspondence with Lowenstein team re: preliminary findings (.2)	5.70	\$4,845.00
B430	01/30/25	LHS	Work on OPF MTD response (1.1); review hearing transcript pursuant to same (.5)	1.60	\$1,688.00
B430	01/30/25	MAK	Outline arguments in opposition to MTD	2.20	\$2,497.00
B430	01/30/25	NF	Further review of MTDs to prepare for team call (.7); call with LS team re: MTD responses (.9); review emails re: MTD scheduling (.2); review emails re: POE stipulation (.3); call with C. Restel re: MTD complaints (.2); review hearing transcript on standing motion (.5)	2.80	\$3,206.00
B430	01/30/25	NF	Review transcript of recent hearings (.8) and additional high level review and notes on MTD issues (.9)	1.70	\$1,946.50
B430	01/31/25	BIW	Confer with counsel for Debtor re: property of estate stipulation (.5); confer with C. Restel re: same (.2)	0.70	\$812.00
B430	01/31/25	CF	Revise memorandum re: substantive consolidation and section 303 of the Bankruptcy Code	2.60	\$1,716.00
B430	01/31/25	CMR	Call with Foley Team and B. Weisenberg re: Property of the Estate Stipulation (.5); Call with B. Weisenberg re: same (.2)	0.70	\$787.50
B430	01/31/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings in preparation of Responses to same (2.9); confer with E. Seltzer re: same (.5)	3.40	\$3,825.00
B430	01/31/25	EJS	Research multiple issues re: Response to Motions to Dismiss (3.4); call (.5) and correspondence (.2) with C. Restel re: same; draft Response to Motions to Dismiss (3.7); email correspondence with B. Weisenberg and LS team re next steps in connection with same (.1)	7.90	\$6,715.00
B430	01/31/25	LHS	Conduct legal research on the legal standard for surviving a MTD on substantive consolidation (3.4); begin drafting section of legal argument re: substantive consolidation for response to MTD (2.3); contemporaneous review of related pleadings pursuant to same (.4)	6.10	\$6,435.50
B430	01/31/25	NF	Review emails re: MTD responses and draft email response (.2); review MTD pleadings in similar diocese cases and review memo on substantive consolidation in connection with MTD responses (2.4)	2.60	\$2,977.00
B430	02/01/25	CF	Draft response to substantive consolidation arguments made in motions to dismiss adversary proceedings	1.40	\$924.00
B430	02/01/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Responses to Motions to Dismiss	0.20	\$225.00
B430	02/01/25	EJS	Draft Response to Motions to Dismiss (3.8); research issues in connection with same (1.2)	5.00	\$4,250.00
B430	02/01/25	LHS	Review memo on subcon for use in response to MTD	0.80	\$844.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 62 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	02/01/25	LHS	Review Archdiocese of Minneapolis and St. Paul briefing in relation to drafting MTD response	1.00	\$1,055.00
B430	02/02/25	CMR	Analyze issues in preparation for Responses to Motions to Dismiss	1.00	\$1,125.00
B430	02/02/25	LHS	Draft argument on substantive consolidation for Committee's response to MTD complaint	4.30	\$4,536.50
B430	02/03/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Motions to Dismiss (1.4); Analyze issues re: OPF Adversary and Claim (.7)	2.10	\$2,362.50
B430	02/03/25	EJS	Draft Response to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings (4.4); email correspondence with Lowenstein team re: same (.1)	4.50	\$3,825.00
B430	02/03/25	LHS	Review brief section on property of the estate (.4); further revise section on substantive consolidation for response to MTD (1.5)	1.90	\$2,004.50
B430	02/03/25	LHS	Continue to draft and revise response to motion to dismiss (3.6); conduct additional research on case law for insertion into subcon argument section (3.4)	7.00	\$7,385.00
B430	02/03/25	MAK	Outline arguments in opposition to motion to dismiss	1.80	\$2,043.00
B430	02/03/25	NF	Review subcon draft and related cases (1.2); review emails with defendants' counsel re: scheduling and property of the estate stipulation(.4)	1.60	\$1,832.00
B430	02/04/25	BIW	Review draft of Response to Motions to Dismiss	0.60	\$696.00
B430	02/04/25	BIW	Confer with Debtor re: OPF and Property of Estate and related issues	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430	02/04/25	CF	Draft legal section for section 303 argument in response to motions to dismiss adversary proceedings	2.00	\$1,320.00
B430	02/04/25	CMR	Analyze issues in preparation of Responses to Motions to Dismiss	1.70	\$1,912.50
B430	02/04/25	CMR	Call with Debtors' counsel re: stipulation re: property of the estate	0.90	\$1,012.50
B430	02/04/25	EJS	Revise Response to Motions to Dismiss (1.3); email correspondence with C. Restel re: same (.2)	1.50	\$1,275.00
B430	02/04/25	LHS	Further draft and revise argument and legal standard for substantive consolidation sections (2.7); review and analyze relevant cases cited in debtor's and OPF's briefs (1.5); review draft from C. Frankel on 303 / alter-ego analysis for the response to the MTD (.4)	4.60	\$4,853.00
B430	02/05/25	BIW	Draft Reservation of Rights re: Removal Motion	2.30	\$2,668.00
B430	02/05/25	CF	Revise responses to motions to dismiss OPF and Bond Obligated Group adversary complaints	0.30	\$198.00
B430	02/05/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: (1.1) and review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings (1.7)	2.80	\$3,150.00
B430	02/05/25	EJS	Email correspondence with C. Restel and LS team re: adversary proceeding strategy	0.20	\$170.00
B430	02/05/25	JDP	Review debtor motion to extend time to remove state court actions; develop response	0.40	\$548.00
B430	02/05/25	LHS	Review BOG complaint and motion to dismiss for purpose of assisting in drafting responses	3.00	\$3,165.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	02/05/25	LHS	Review edits from C. Restel on MTD response (.2); respond to comments from C. Restel and incorporate changes into updated draft (.3); revise further (.3)	0.80	\$844.00
B430	02/05/25	NF	Review and comment on subcon / 303 section and further review of revised draft of response to MTD ressame	2.10	\$2,404.50
B430	02/06/25	BIW	Review Debtor's proposed changes to Property of Estate Stipulation	0.20	\$232.00
B430	02/06/25	BIW	Revise Reservation of Rights re: Removal Motion	0.30	\$348.00
B430	02/06/25	CMR	Review stipulation and correspondence re: Property of the Estate stipulation	0.60	\$675.00
B430	02/06/25	CMR	Review and revise stipulations re: adversary proceedings and OPF Claim Objection	0.80	\$900.00
B430	02/06/25	CMR	Analyze legal issues re: OPF Adversary Proceeding (1.0); Prepare Amended Complaint (2.5)	3.50	\$3,937.50
B430	02/06/25	EJS	Review legal standards for substantive consolidation in connection with Response to Motion to Dismiss (.4); email correspondence with LS team re next steps (.1)	0.50	\$425.00
B430	02/06/25	LHS	Work on response to MTD OPF Adversary Proceeding (2.5); additional review of pleadings necessary for drafting fact section of response (2.4)	4.90	\$5,169.50
B430	02/07/25	BIW	Draft email outlining responses to Motions to Dismiss	0.30	\$348.00
B430	02/07/25	BIW	Comment on drafts of Responses to Motions to Dismiss	1.20	\$1,392.00
B430	02/07/25	BIW	Draft email to A. Uetz re: OPF stipulation	0.30	\$348.00
B430	02/07/25	BIW	Revise Reservation of Rights re: Removal Motion	0.60	\$696.00
B430	02/07/25	CF	Internal office conference re: response to motion to dismiss OPF complaint (.8); review motions to dismiss OPF complaint and prepare draft response to same (3.5)	4.30	\$2,838.00
B430	02/07/25	CMR	Strategize with LS Team re: Motions to Dismiss OPF Adversary Proceeding (.8) and RCWC/RCC Adversary Proceeding (.8)	1.60	\$1,800.00
B430	02/07/25	CMR	Review and revise stipulations re: OPF and church property	0.60	\$675.00
B430	02/07/25	CMR	Review revised draft of Property of the Estate stipulation; e-mails to/from LS team re: same	0.90	\$1,012.50
B430	02/07/25	EJS	Prepare for (.1) and attend (.8) internal call re: Response to MTD Bond Obligated Group Adversary Complaint; review documents and demonstratives in connection with response (.5); draft Response (3.4)	4.80	\$4,080.00
B430	02/07/25	JDP	Review and comment of proposed orders and stipulations re: OPF and church complaints	1.20	\$1,644.00
B430	02/07/25	JDP	Review stip from Debtor's counsel re: property of the estate issues; confer with B. Weisenberg re: same	0.20	\$274.00
B430	02/07/25	LHS	Interoffice conference with working group re: response to OPF MTD (.8) and work on drafting response (.4)	1.20	\$1,266.00
B430	02/07/25	MAK	Inter-office conference re: stipulation on OPF and churches	0.60	\$681.00
B430	02/07/25	NF	Attend internal call re: BOG complaint (.8)	0.80	\$916.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	02/08/25	BIW	Review and revise Stipulations re: scheduling for motions to dismiss	0.30	\$348.00
B430	02/08/25	CF	Draft response to motion to dismiss OPF complaint	6.20	\$4,092.00
B430	02/08/25	CMR	Review and revise draft stipulations re: scheduling in Adversary Proceedings	0.50	\$562.50
B430	02/08/25	EJS	Draft Reply to MTD Bond Obligated Group Complaint	1.70	\$1,445.00
B430	02/08/25	EJS	Email correspondence with B. Weisenberg re: 2/10 BRG call	0.10	\$85.00
B430	02/09/25	BIW	Draft email to BRG re: analysis of Motions to Dismiss	0.10	\$116.00
B430	02/09/25	CF	Draft response to motions to dismiss OPF complaint	3.20	\$2,112.00
B430	02/09/25	LHS	Review draft reply to MTD and revise draft	5.50	\$5,802.50
B430	02/10/25	BIW	Revise Reservation of Rights re: Removal Motion	0.40	\$464.00
B430	02/10/25	CF	Call with BRG team and internal team re: motions to dismiss adversary complaints	0.40	\$264.00
B430	02/10/25	CF	Draft response to motion to dismiss OPF complaint	5.40	\$3,564.00
B430	02/10/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings (.2); Call with BRG Team re: same (.4); Call with S. Moses re: stipulations re: same (.2)	0.80	\$900.00
B430	02/10/25	EJS	Draft Response to Motion to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Complaint (5.9); email correspondence with C. Restel and LS Team re: same (.2); attend meeting with LS and BRG teams re: Adversary Proceeding strategy (.4); prepare questions in connection with same (.2)	6.70	\$5,695.00
B430	02/10/25	JDP	Review and edit draft response to debtor's motion to extend time to withdraw cases	1.40	\$1,918.00
B430	02/10/25	LHS	Further revise response to OPF MTD (1.6); review comments from E. Seltzer re: argument sections of briefs and review declaratory judgment section for potential inclusion in OPF MTD reply (.5); research potential argument to include in brief (1.4)	3.50	\$3,692.50
B430	02/10/25	LHS	Call with BRG and LS team re: responses to MTD adversary complaints	0.40	\$422.00
B430	02/11/25	BIW	Confer with G. Goodman re: property of estate stipulation	0.40	\$464.00
B430	02/11/25	BIW	Confer with BRG re: facts plead in avoidance complaints	1.10	\$1,276.00
B430	02/11/25	CF	Revise response to motion to dismiss OPF Complaint	1.20	\$792.00
B430	02/11/25	CMR	Revise and circulate Stipulation re: Extension of 546 deadline	0.20	\$225.00
B430	02/11/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings (1.9); Call with BRG re: preparation of same (1.1); Confer re: stipulations re scheduling of Adversary Proceedings (.1)	3.10	\$3,487.50
B430	02/11/25	EJS	Continue drafting Response to Motion to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Adversary Proceeding (5.4); conduct related legal research (1.1); correspondence with C. Restel re issues in connection with same (.2)	6.70	\$5,695.00
B430	02/11/25	LHS	Revise latest draft of response to OPF MTD	2.00	\$2,110.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	02/11/25	LHS	Review comments and revisions from C. Restel and begin next version of response to OPF MTD	1.20	\$1,266.00
B430	02/11/25	NF	Review OPF MTD response draft	0.70	\$801.50
B430	02/12/25	BIW	Confer with G. Goodman re: consensual resolution of Church/ OPF Complaint issues	0.30	\$348.00
B430	02/12/25	CF	Review revisions to response to motion to dismiss OPF Complaint and email communications re: same	0.90	\$594.00
B430	02/12/25	CMR	Revise (.2) and circulate (.1) stipulation re: extension of 546(a) deadline	0.30	\$337.50
B430	02/12/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss	0.60	\$675.00
B430	02/12/25	EJS	Draft Response to Motions to Dismiss Bond Obligated Adversary Complaint (3.6); revise same (1.3); email correspondence with LS team re next steps in connection with same (.2)	5.10	\$4,335.00
B430	02/12/25	JDP	Review and comment on stip extending time to bring avoidance claims	0.20	\$274.00
B430	02/12/25	JDP	Review and comment on response to motion to dismiss	1.20	\$1,644.00
B430	02/12/25	LHS	Review and revise draft of Committee's response to BOG MTD	0.50	\$527.50
B430	02/12/25	LHS	Revise response to OPF MTD to incorporate comments from C. Restel (2.5); research to add new arguments and citations (1.4)	3.90	\$4,114.50
B430	02/13/25	BIW	Review and revise Response to Motion to Dismiss	1.10	\$1,276.00
B430	02/13/25	CMR	Confer with Debtors (.1) and LS Team (.1) re: proposed stipulation extending 546(a) deadline	0.20	\$225.00
B430	02/13/25	CMR	Review and revise responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	3.30	\$3,712.50
B430	02/13/25	EJS	Calls with B. Weisenberg re: Bond Obligated Group Adversary Proceeding (.3); revise Reply to Motions to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Adversary Proceeding (2.9); calls with C. Restel re: same (.2); related email correspondence with LS team (.2)	3.60	\$3,060.00
B430	02/13/25	JDP	Review and comment on responses to motions to dismiss	0.70	\$959.00
B430	02/13/25	LHS	Address and incorporate multiple rounds of comments to response to OPF MTD response (3.8); research case law and review transcript to make additional revisions to same (3.2)	7.00	\$7,385.00
B430	02/14/25	BIW	Review and revise Response to Motions to Dismiss	2.10	\$2,436.00
B430	02/14/25	BIW	Review and revise Response to Motions to Dismiss	0.80	\$928.00
B430	02/14/25	CF	Revise response to motion to dismiss OPF complaint	4.10	\$2,706.00
B430	02/14/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	4.90	\$5,512.50
B430	02/14/25	EJS	Further revise Response to Motion to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Adversary Proceeding (.8); email correspondence with C. Restel and B. Weisenberg re same (.2)	1.00	\$850.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	02/14/25	JJP	Conference with E. Lawler and D. Claussen re: transcript review project (.2); review and respond to email correspondence re: same (.1)	0.30	\$129.00
B430	02/14/25	LHS	Review C. Restel's edits and incorporate into Response to OPF MTD (.8); review latest draft of BOG MTD response to compare/align relevant sections (.5); review updates to OPF MTD response from C. Frankel (.5); make additional comments (.5)	2.30	\$2,426.50
B430	02/14/25	MAK	Review and revise draft opposition to motion to dismiss	1.20	\$1,362.00
B430	02/14/25	NF	Review latest draft of BOG MTD	0.80	\$916.00
B430	02/15/25	BIW	Draft email to A. Uetz re: comments to proposed Second Amended Disclosure Statement	0.80	\$928.00
B430	02/15/25	BIW	Draft extensive inserts to Response to Motions to Dismiss	3.10	\$3,596.00
B430	02/15/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary	1.10	\$1,237.50
B430	02/15/25	EJS	Review comments to draft Response (.8); revise draft response to Motion to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Complaint (8.5); email correspondence with LS team re: issues in connection with same (.2)	9.50	\$8,075.00
B430	02/15/25	LHS	Review and revise responses to MTDs	0.40	\$422.00
B430	02/16/25	BIW	Review caselaw cited in Response to Motions to Dismiss	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430	02/16/25	BIW	Review and revise Response to Motions to Dismiss	1.50	\$1,740.00
B430	02/16/25	CF	Review response to motion to dismiss bond-obligated group complaint	0.70	\$462.00
B430	02/16/25	CF	Review and revise response to motion to dismiss OPF Complaint	1.40	\$924.00
B430	02/16/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	3.40	\$3,825.00
B430	02/16/25	EJS	Further revise response to motions to dismiss bond obligated group adversary complaint (6.7); calls with B. Weisenberg re: same (.4); email correspondence with LS team re: same (.2)	7.30	\$6,205.00
B430	02/16/25	LHS	Review redline and new re-worked version of BOG response to MTD (.4); review changes and comments to OPF MTD response (.6); review B. Weisenberg's revisions to OPF MTD Response and attention to internal correspondences re: same (.6); review local rules to determine page limits (.2); review changes and redline on OPF MTD response from C. Frankel (.3); review further updated draft from C. Restel (.5)	2.60	\$2,743.00
B430	02/16/25	MAK	Review and revise draft opposition to motion to dismiss OPF action	1.90	\$2,156.50
B430	02/16/25	NF	Review M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg comments to MTD responses and emails re: same	0.90	\$1,030.50
B430	02/17/25	BIW	Review and revise Response to Motions to Dismiss	2.70	\$3,132.00
B430	02/17/25	BIW	Further review and revise Response to Motions to Dismiss	0.80	\$928.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	02/17/25	CF	Email communications with C. Stewart re: motion to dismiss OPF Complaint (.2); review response to motion to dismiss bond-obligated group complaint (.3)	0.50	\$330.00
B430	02/17/25	CF	Revise response to motion to dismiss OPF complaint	1.30	\$858.00
B430	02/17/25	CGS	Revise and edit response to Debtor's motion to dismiss	5.80	\$4,553.00
B430	02/17/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	3.00	\$3,375.00
B430	02/17/25	EJS	Review revised Response to MTD (.4); call with B. Weisenberg re same (.2); email correspondence with LS team re questions in connection with same (.2)	0.80	\$680.00
B430	02/17/25	JDP	Review and edit responses to motions to dismiss	2.20	\$3,014.00
B430	02/17/25	LHS	Review M. Kaplan's comments to most updated version of OPF MTD response and review B. Weisenberg's revised BOG MTD response (.6); review redline of additional changes to responses from C. Frankel and C. Restel (.4); attention to additional correspondence among working group re: revisions to same (.2); review additional changes to OPT MTD response from J. Prol (.4)	1.60	\$1,688.00
B430	02/17/25	MAK	Review and revise draft opposition to motion to dismiss OPF action	1.60	\$1,816.00
B430	02/17/25	NF	Review J. Prol edits to MTD response (.4); Review input M. Kaplan edits to MTD responses and C. Frankel response re: same (.8); emails with respect to fact sources and review appendix A and emails with B. Weisenberg re: same (.4)	1.60	\$1,832.00
B430	02/18/25	BIW	Outline arguments for oral argument on Motions to Dismiss and Disclosure Statement hearings	1.20	\$1,392.00
B430	02/18/25	BIW	Revise Responses to Motion to Dismiss	0.80	\$928.00
B430	02/18/25	BIW	Review and revise Responses to Motion to Dismiss	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430	02/18/25	CF	Revise responses to dismiss adversary proceedings (2.9); email communications with internal team re: same (.2); call with B. Weisenberg re: same (.1)	3.20	\$2,112.00
B430	02/18/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	3.40	\$3,825.00
B430	02/18/25	EBL	Research Debtor's prior statements about OPF	0.60	\$228.00
B430	02/18/25	EJS	Further revise Response to Bond Obligated Group Motion to Dismiss (4.6); correspondence with P. Shields (BRG) re: cash management issue in connection with Response (.1)	4.70	\$3,995.00
B430	02/18/25	JJP	Incorporate transcripts into the case database as requested by D. Claussen and E. Lawler (1.6); conference re: searching and review of same (.4); prepare database searches and configure same for review (.3)	2.30	\$989.00
B430	02/19/25	BIW	Finalize Responses to Motion to Dismiss	2.30	\$2,668.00
B430	02/19/25	BIW	Finalize Response to Motion to Dismiss BOG Complaint	0.60	\$696.00
B430	02/19/25	BIW	Finalize Response to Motion to Dismiss OPF Complaint	0.70	\$812.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	02/19/25	CF	Revise response to bond obligated group motion to dismiss	6.10	\$4,026.00
B430	02/19/25	CMR	Review and revise Responses to Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	5.70	\$6,412.50
B430	02/19/25	DC	Research re: Debtor's prior statements about transfer of funds to OPF and alleged loan made to Debtor	2.50	\$1,000.00
B430	02/19/25	EJS	Revise and finalize Response to Bond Obligated Group motion to dismiss (5.1); redact same (1.0); coordinate filing of Response with LS team and G. Albert (Keller) (.7)	6.80	\$5,780.00
B430	02/19/25	LHS	Finalize briefs for MTD responses and review final drafts of both responses	1.20	\$1,266.00
B430	02/19/25	NF	Review final drafts of MTD responses and various filing related issues	1.60	\$1,832.00
B430	02/20/25	DC	Draft Notices of Appearance in OPF and BOG adversary proceedings for Prol, Kaplan, Weisenberg and Restel	0.60	\$240.00
B430	02/20/25	DC	Draft summary of research re: OPF transfers	0.20	\$80.00
B430	02/21/25	DC	Tend to filing Notices of Appearance in the Adversary Proceedings	0.50	\$200.00
B430	02/21/25	JJP	Prepare database searches and review documents (.3); coordinate transfer of file sets (.2)	0.50	\$215.00
B430	02/21/25	LHS	Review citation form in response to OCP motion to dismiss (.4); citecheck response (.5)	0.90	\$949.50
B430	02/23/25	JJP	Prepare searches to locate documents requested by B. Weisenberg; provide copies of same	0.20	\$86.00
B430	02/24/25	BIW	Review Joint Case Management Conference Statement	0.50	\$580.00
B430	02/24/25	LHS	Additional review of OCP Motion with respect to citations	0.30	\$316.50
B430	02/26/25	DC	Tend to filing Notices of Appearance for C. Restel in the OPF and BOG adversary proceedings	0.30	\$120.00
B430	02/27/25	BIW	Draft outline response to Replies filed by Debtor and Bond Obligated Group re: oral argument	1.30	\$1,508.00
B430	02/27/25	BIW	Assist with draft of declaration to be attached to proposed sur-reply on OPF motion to dismiss	0.40	\$464.00
B430	02/27/25	CMR	Analyze Replies in Support of Motions to Dismiss (4.2); Prepare for hearing re: same (1.1); Prepare Sur-Reply in Opposition to OPF Motion to Dismiss (1.7)	7.00	\$7,875.00
B430	02/27/25	EJS	Review Debtors' and Non-Debtor Affiliated Entities' Replies to Motions to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group Complaint (.7); compile Bond Obligated Group pleadings for B. Weisenberg (.4); email correspondence with same re: pleadings e-binder (.1); correspondence with C. Frankel re Debtors' Reply (.1)	1.30	\$1,105.00
B430	02/27/25	JDP	Review reply briefs in support of motions to dismiss	0.60	\$822.00
B430	02/27/25	LHS	Review Debtor and OPF's replies to Committee's responses to the MTDs with respect to both adversary complaints	1.00	\$1,055.00
B430	02/27/25	MAK	Review and analyze reply briefs filed in support of motions to dismiss	2.80	\$3,178.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	02/28/25	BIW	Confer with G. Goodman re: Motions to Dismiss scheduling and Church/ OPF issues	0.40	\$464.00
B430	02/28/25	BIW	Prepare for BOG Motion to Dismiss Complaint	0.60	\$696.00
B430	02/28/25	BIW	Further review Debtor's replies to Committee's responses to Motion to Dismiss	1.10	\$1,276.00
B430	02/28/25	BIW	Review analysis of scope of attorney-client privilege	0.30	\$348.00
B430	02/28/25	CF	Review replies in support of motion to dismiss adversary proceedings (.6); prepare notes to C. Restel and E. Seltzer re: same (.6)	1.20	\$792.00
B430	02/28/25	CMR	Prepare Sur-Reply re: OPF Motion to Dismiss (.6); Prepare for hearing re: Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings (1.5); Review and revise proposed stipulation re: Church Adversary Proceeding (.9)	3.00	\$3,375.00
B430	02/28/25	DC	Tend to filing Notices of Appearance in OPF and BOG adversary proceedings for B. Weisenberg	0.30	\$120.00
B430	02/28/25	EJS	Email correspondence with B. Weisenberg re: Debtor's Reply to MTD Bond Obligated Group Complaint (.1); email correspondence with C. Restel and C. Frankel re declaratory relief issue in connection with Bond Obligated Group Complaint (.2); review relevant caselaw re: same (.2)	0.50	\$425.00
B430	02/28/25	JDP	Review and comment on church property stipulation	0.20	\$274.00
B430	02/28/25	JDP	Review replies on motions to dismiss; prepare for hearing	1.60	\$2,192.00
B430	02/28/25	MAK	Revise stipulation re: church property	0.30	\$340.50
B430	03/01/25	CF	Email communications with C. Restel and E. Seltzer re: replies in support of motions to dismiss	0.20	\$132.00
B430	03/01/25	CMR	Prepare for hearing on Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings	1.10	\$1,237.50
B430	03/02/25	BIW	Assist M. Kaplan in preparing for oral argument on SubCon Complaint	0.40	\$464.00
B430	03/02/25	MAK	Prepare for oral argument on MTDs adversary complaints	5.30	\$6,015.50
B430	03/03/25	BIW	Review Joint Status Update re: District Court Insurance Adv. Proc.	0.30	\$348.00
B430	03/03/25	BIW	Review and comment on Removal Order	0.20	\$232.00
B430	03/03/25	BIW	Assist M. Kaplan in preparing for Motion to Dismiss hearing re: substantive consolidation	0.60	\$696.00
B430	03/03/25	CMR	Prepare for hearing re: Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings (1.3); Prepare Complaint re: Restricted Assets (2.3)	3.60	\$4,050.00
B430	03/03/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing on motions to dismiss	0.70	\$959.00
B430	03/03/25	LHS	Review sur reply and B. Weisenberg declaration in connection with OPF MTD	0.30	\$316.50
B430	03/03/25	MAK	Prepare for oral argument on motion to dismiss adversary complaints	4.60	\$5,221.00
B430	03/04/25	BIW	Draft emails to G. Goodman re: Property of Estate Stipulation	0.40	\$464.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	03/04/25	BIW	Assist M. Kaplan re: preparation for Motion to Dismiss hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B430	03/04/25	BIW	Draft letter to Court re: remaining issues on motions to dismiss Complaints	0.50	\$580.00
B430	03/04/25	CMR	Prepare for hearing re: Motions to Dismiss Adversary Proceedings (1.2); Review and revise stipulation re: property of the estate re: same (.6); Review draft letter to Court re: Adversary Proceedings (.1); Confer re: same (.1)	2.00	\$2,250.00
B430	03/04/25	EJS	Follow-up communications with LS team re next steps in connection with adversary proceedings after March 4 hearing on motions to dismiss	0.30	\$255.00
B430	03/04/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing on motions to dismiss	1.30	\$1,781.00
B430	03/04/25	MAK	Review and analyze discovery produced to evaluate alter ego allegations and restricted asset claims	3.30	\$3,745.50
B430	03/04/25	MAK	Prepare for oral argument on motion to dismiss adversary complaints	1.70	\$1,929.50
B430	03/05/25	BIW	Revise Property of Estate Stipulation	0.30	\$348.00
B430	03/05/25	BIW	Revise letter to Court re: status of OPF issues	0.30	\$348.00
B430	03/05/25	BIW	Revise Church/ OPF Stipulation	1.30	\$1,508.00
B430	03/05/25	CMR	Review and revise draft stipulation re: property of the estate (.4); Strategize re: proceeding in adversary proceedings (1.0)	1.40	\$1,575.00
B430	03/05/25	JDP	Review revised church property stip	0.20	\$274.00
B430	03/05/25	JDP	Review draft letter to court re: dispute on church property stip	0.20	\$274.00
B430	03/05/25	JDP	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: strategy on church property complaint and stip	0.30	\$411.00
B430	03/05/25	JDP	Develop strategy on asserting claims re: restricted funds	1.10	\$1,507.00
B430	03/05/25	MAK	Review and analyze discovery produced to evaluate alter ego allegations and restricted asset claims	2.90	\$3,291.50
B430	03/06/25	BIW	Draft email to counsel for Debtor re: Property of Estate Stipulation	0.30	\$348.00
B430	03/06/25	BIW	Revise Church/ OPF Stipulation	0.80	\$928.00
B430	03/06/25	CMR	Call with BRG re: restricted asset analysis	1.50	\$1,687.50
B430	03/06/25	JDP	Review and comment on revised draft of property of the estate stipulation proposed by the Debtor	0.20	\$274.00
B430	03/07/25	CF	Conduct research re: restricted assets	7.10	\$4,686.00
B430	03/07/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: stipulation re: property of the estate re: Adversary Proceedings (.4); Analyze legal issues re: restricted assets (1.2)	1.60	\$1,800.00
B430	03/07/25	MAK	Review research and analysis on legal standard governing restricted asset claims	1.80	\$2,043.00
B430	03/08/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: restricted assets in preparation of Complaint	0.30	\$337.50
B430	03/10/25	CF	Email communications with C. Restel re: restricted assets complaint and research	0.30	\$198.00

Case: 23-40523 Doc# 2086-8 Filed: 06/16/25 Entered: 06/16/25 15:32:52 Page 71 of 78

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	03/10/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: Amended Complaint re: restricted assets	2.10	\$2,362.50
B430	03/11/25	CMR	Review and revise stipulations re: OPF	0.60	\$675.00
B430	03/11/25	CMR	Analyze issues in preparation of Amended Complaint re: Restricted Assets	2.50	\$2,812.50
B430	03/12/25	CMR	Analyze issues in preparation of Complaint re: restricted assets	5.20	\$5,850.00
B430	03/12/25	JJP	Provide assistance to C. Restel re: document requests	0.30	\$129.00
B430	03/13/25	BIW	Review proposed Stipulation Extending 546(a) Deadline	0.20	\$232.00
B430	03/13/25	CF	Call with adversary complaint draft	0.20	\$132.00
B430	03/13/25	CMR	Review Debtor's proposed changes to the stipulation extending the 546(a) deadline	0.20	\$225.00
B430	03/13/25	CMR	Review and revise Complaint re: Restricted Assets	5.70	\$6,412.50
B430	03/14/25	BIW	Review Debtor's proposed revisions to Property of Estate Stipulation (.3); draft email re: same (.2)	0.50	\$580.00
B430	03/14/25	BIW	Review Debtor's proposed changes to Property of Estate Stipulation	0.40	\$464.00
B430	03/14/25	CF	Review BRG analysis re: restricted assets	0.80	\$528.00
B430	03/14/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: revisions to stipulation re: property of the estate re: adversary proceeding claims (.2); Review and revise complaint re: restricted assets (2.5); Call with BRG re: same (.4)	3.10	\$3,487.50
B430	03/17/25	BIW	Revise Property of Estate Stipulation	0.40	\$464.00
B430	03/17/25	CMR	Review and revise Complaint re: Restricted Assets	1.40	\$1,575.00
B430	03/17/25	JDP	Review and comment on Debtor's latest revision to property of the estate stipulation	0.30	\$411.00
B430	03/18/25	CF	Review BRG documents related to restricted assets	0.40	\$264.00
B430	03/18/25	CMR	Review and revise Complaint re: Restricted Assets	2.40	\$2,700.00
B430	03/21/25	CF	Review restricted assets complaint (.8) and call with C. Restel re: same (.4)	1.20	\$792.00
B430	03/21/25	CMR	Call with C. Frankel re: revisions to Complaint re: Restricted Assets	0.40	\$450.00
B430	03/26/25	BIW	Finalize revisions to Property of Estate Stipulation (.3); draft email to counsel for Debtor re: same (.2)	0.50	\$580.00
B430	03/26/25	CMR	Analyze issues (.1) and confer (.1) re: stipulation to extend deadline to bring Avoidance Actions	0.20	\$225.00
B430	03/29/25	CF	Revise restricted assets complaint	0.60	\$396.00
B430	03/31/25	CF	Revise restricted assets complaint	2.00	\$1,320.00
B430	04/01/25	CF	Review restricted assets document production and revise restricted assets complaint	1.10	\$726.00
B430	04/04/25	BIW	Review decision on Motion to Dismiss	0.40	\$464.00
B430	04/04/25	CF	Review BRG restricted assets analysis	2.00	\$1,320.00
B430	04/05/25	BIW	Review decision on Motion to Dismiss	0.20	\$232.00
B430	04/05/25	CF	Review BRG restricted assets analysis and documents re: same	1.20	\$792.00
B430	04/06/25	CF	Review restricted assets documents and revise restricted assets complaint	0.80	\$528.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	04/06/25	CMR	Analyze decision re: Motions to Dismiss OPF/Church Complaint	0.50	\$562.50
B430	04/06/25	LHS	Review Court's decision on motion to dismiss OPF complaint	0.30	\$316.50
B430	04/07/25	CF	Review restricted assets documents and revise restricted assets complaint	4.60	\$3,036.00
B430	04/07/25	CMR	Review and revise Complaint re: Restricted Assets	2.10	\$2,362.50
B430	04/08/25	CD	Draft letter re: discovery in adversary proceeding	1.00	\$865.00
B430	04/08/25	CMR	Review and revise letter to parties re: discovery in Adversary Proceeding (.3); Review and revise Complaint re: Restricted Assets (.8); Call with BRG Team re: same (.5)	1.60	\$1,800.00
B430	04/09/25	CD	Draft and send letter to counsel re: adversary proceeding discovery	0.30	\$259.50
B430	04/12/25	CD	Draft letter re: discovery in adversary proceeding	0.50	\$432.50
B430	04/12/25	CMR	Review letter re: discovery in adversary proceeding (.2); Confer with M. Kaplan and C. Dernbach re: response to same (.2)	0.40	\$450.00
B430	04/14/25	CD	Draft letter re: discovery in adversary proceeding	1.40	\$1,211.00
B430	04/14/25	CMR	Review and revise letter re: discovery in Adversary Proceeding	0.60	\$675.00
B430	04/14/25	CMR	Confer via email (.1) and telephone (.2) with BRG re: Complaint re: Restricted Assets	0.30	\$337.50
B430	04/15/25	CMR	Review and revise Complaint re: Restricted Assets	0.70	\$787.50
B430	04/16/25	BIW	Review and comment on draft Complaint re: Restricted Assets	0.90	\$1,044.00
B430	04/16/25	CMR	Review and revise Complaint re: restricted asssets	0.70	\$787.50
B430	04/17/25	MAK	Review and revise amended restricted asset complaint against debtor and OPF	2.70	\$3,064.50
B430	04/21/25	BIW	Complete review of Restricted Assets Complaint (.2) and draft email re: same (.1)	0.30	\$348.00
B430	04/21/25	CMR	Prepare for status conference re: adversary proceedings (.4); Review and revise complaint re: Restricted Assets (.1)	0.50	\$562.50
B430	04/21/25	DC	Follow up on matters scheduled for hearing on 4/23/25, update zoom links and attorney calendar (.3); e-mails with local counsel and C. Restel re: upcoming hearing dates (.2)	0.50	\$200.00
B430	04/22/25	BIW	Provide comments to Restricted Assets Complaint	0.40	\$464.00
B430	04/22/25	BIW	Review decision on BOG Complaint Motion to Dismiss (.3); confer with LS Litigation Team re: drafting amended complaint (.8)	1.10	\$1,276.00
B430	04/22/25	CF	Review order granting motion to dismiss BOG complaint (.6); Call with E. Seltzer re same (.3)	0.90	\$594.00
B430	04/22/25	CMR	Prepare for status conference re: Adversary Proceedings (.4); Review and revise complaint re: Restricted Assets (1.5); Analyze Court Order re: Bond Obligated Group Complaint (.2); Confer with LS Team re: Amended Bond Obligated Group Complaint (.3)	2.40	\$2,700.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	04/22/25	EJS	Review Order re Motion to Dismiss Bond Obligated Group adversary proceeding (.3); call with B. Weisenberg re same (.3); call with C. Frankel re: next steps in connection with same (.3)	0.90	\$765.00
B430	04/22/25	MAK	Review and revise draft amended restricted asset complaint (1.4); review and analyze Court decision on BOG complaint (.4)	1.80	\$2,043.00
B430	04/23/25	CMR	Review and revise Amended Complaint re: Restricted Assets (.3); Confer with M. Kaplan re: same (.3)	0.60	\$675.00
B430	04/23/25	JBJ	Review and verify adversary proceeding complaint for style and accuracy	1.50	\$1,177.50
B430	04/23/25	MAK	Review and revise draft amended BOG complaint	1.40	\$1,589.00
B430	04/24/25	BIW	Confer with Litigation Team re: amendments to BOG Complain (1 @.4 and 1 @ .3)	0.70	\$812.00
B430	04/24/25	BIW	Comment on revised Complaint	0.40	\$464.00
B430	04/24/25	CF	Call with E. Seltzer re: bond-obligated group complaint	0.30	\$198.00
B430	04/24/25	DC	Follow up with the Court and local counsel re: continued status conference for today and circulate zoom link	0.20	\$80.00
B430	04/24/25	EJS	Call with B. Weisenberg re: issues in connection with Amended Bond Obligated Group Complaint (.5); videoconference with M. Kaplan and B. Weisenberg re: same (.3); draft Amended Adversary Complaint (1.0); call with C. Frankel re same (.3)	2.10	\$1,785.00
B430	04/24/25	MAK	Review and revise draft amended BOG complaint	1.20	\$1,362.00
B430	04/25/25	BIW	Revise Amended Complaint re: substantive consolidation	0.60	\$696.00
B430	04/25/25	CF	Review decision dismissing bond obligated group complaint and revise bond obligated group complaint fact sections (2.1); call with E. Seltzer re: same (.5)	2.60	\$1,716.00
B430	04/25/25	CF	Revise bond-obligated group complaint and review interrogatories and document production re: same	3.10	\$2,046.00
B430	04/25/25	CMR	Analyze issues re: preparing amended complaint	0.20	\$225.00
B430	04/25/25	EJS	Draft Amended Bond Obligated Group Complaint (4.4); calls with B. Weisenberg (.3); C. Restel (.2), and C. Frankel (.3) re: same	5.20	\$4,420.00
B430	04/26/25	CF	Review decision dismissing bond obligated group complaint and revise bond obligated group complaint fact sections (.7); call with E. Seltzer re: same (.1)	0.80	\$528.00
B430	04/26/25	EJS	Review Debtor, RCWC, RCC, and Adventus responses to interrogatories and document requests in connection with Bond Obligated Group Adversary Proceeding (1.5); call with C. Frankel re Amended Complaint (.2)	1.70	\$1,445.00
B430	04/27/25	LHS	Review Court's decision on bond obligated group adversary complaint	0.30	\$316.50
B430	04/28/25	EJS	Draft Amended Complaint for Bond Obligated Group Adversary Proceeding	6.70	\$5,695.00
B430	04/28/25	MAK	Review and revise draft amended BOG complaint	1.70	\$1,929.50
B430	04/29/25	BIW	Further revise BOG Amended Complaint	0.80	\$928.00
B430	04/29/25	BIW	Review and revise BOG Amended Complaint	2.30	\$2,668.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430	04/29/25	CF	Call with E. Seltzer, B. Weisenberg, C. Restel and M. Kaplan (partial) re: revisions to bond obligated group complaint	0.60	\$396.00
B430	04/29/25	CF	Revise bond-obligated group complaint (1.3); call with E. Seltzer re: same (.1)	1.40	\$924.00
B430	04/29/25	CMR	Call with LS Team re: Amended Complaint re: Bond Obligated Group	0.60	\$675.00
B430	04/29/25	EJS	Revise Amended Complaint for Bond Obligated Group Adversary Proceeding (2.8); call with M. Kaplan, B. Weisenberg, C. Restel, and C. Frankel re same (.6)	3.40	\$2,890.00
B430	04/30/25	BIW	Review Amended Complaint re: Restricted Funds	0.20	\$232.00
B430	04/30/25	BIW	Further revise BOG Amended Complaint	1.10	\$1,276.00
B430	04/30/25	BIW	Further revise BOG Amended Complaint	2.20	\$2,552.00
B430	04/30/25	CMR	Finalize Amended Complaint re: restricted assets for filing (.6); Review and revise Amended Complaint re: Bond Obligated Group (2.3)	2.90	\$3,262.50
B430	04/30/25	EJS	Revise Bond Obligated Group Adversary Complaint	1.70	\$1,445.00
B430	04/30/25	MAK	Confer with C. Restel and B. Weisenberg re: BOG amended complaint	0.60	\$681.00
			Total B430 - Adversary Proceedings and Bankruptcy Court Litigation	655.40	\$660,197.00
B430A Court	t Hearings				
B430A	01/02/25	BIW	Continue preparing for Lift Stay hearing	0.80	\$928.00
B430A	01/03/25	BIW	Continue preparing for Lift Stay hearing	2.60	\$3,016.00
B430A	01/05/25	BIW	Continue preparing for Lift Stay hearing	0.70	\$812.00
B430A	01/06/25	BIW	Continue preparing for Lift Stay hearing	0.70	\$812.00
B430A	01/06/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns and counsel for Committee member re: preparation for Lift Stay hearing	0.40	\$464.00
B430A	01/06/25	BIW	Continue Lift Stay preparation	0.60	\$696.00
B430A	01/06/25	CF	Prepare for Jan. 8 hearing and prepare binder re: same	1.70	\$1,122.00
B430A	01/06/25	DC	Prepare index and hearing binder for 1.8.25 Hearing and update attorney calendar	1.20	\$480.00
B430A	01/07/25	BIW	Continue Lift Stay Hearing preparation	2.90	\$3,364.00
B430A	01/07/25	JDP	Review pleadings to prepare for 1/8 hearings on committee motions	4.50	\$6,165.00
B430A	01/08/25	BIW	Attend Lift Stay/ Standing Motion hearing	3.50	\$4,060.00
B430A	01/08/25	BIW	Prepare for Lift Stay hearing	2.30	\$2,668.00
B430A	01/08/25	JDP	Meet with SCC to prepare for hearing on lift stay motion	0.60	\$822.00
B430A	01/08/25	JDP	Attend hearing on committee motions	3.50	\$4,795.00
B430A	01/08/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing on committee motions	4.50	\$6,165.00
B430A	01/12/25	BIW	Begin preparing for Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.70	\$812.00
B430A	01/13/25	BIW	Continue to prepare Disclosure Statement hearing	1.20	\$1,392.00
B430A	01/13/25	BIW	Prepare for Disclosure Statement hearing	2.70	\$3,132.00
B430A	01/14/25	BIW	Continue to prepare for Disclosure Statement hearing	2.10	\$2,436.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430A	01/14/25	CMR	Review pleadings re: Disclosure Statement in preparation for hearing	1.20	\$1,350.00
B430A	01/14/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing on Debtor's motion to compel global mediation	2.40	\$3,288.00
B430A	01/15/25	BIW	Prepare for Mediation Motion hearing	1.50	\$1,740.00
B430A	01/15/25	BIW	Prepare for Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing	2.70	\$3,132.00
B430A	01/15/25	EJS	Correspondence with B. Weisenberg re: Disclosure Statement Hearing	0.10	\$85.00
B430A	01/15/25	JDP	Prepare for 1/16 hearings	3.20	\$4,384.00
B430A	01/16/25	BIW	Prepare for Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing	2.60	\$3,016.00
B430A	01/16/25	BIW	Attend Amended Disclosure Statement Hearing	4.20	\$4,872.00
B430A	01/16/25	BIW	Meet with J. Prol and T. Burns re: strategy for Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.80	\$928.00
B430A	01/16/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing on Debtor motion to compel mediation and Committee motion for derivative standing (1.7); meeting with B. Weisenberg and T. Burns re: same (.8)	2.50	\$3,425.00
B430A	01/16/25	JDP	Participate in hearing before Judge Corley on Debtor motion to stay insurance adversary proceeding	1.00	\$1,370.00
B430A	01/16/25	JDP	Participate in DS hearing and hearing on committee's derivative standing motion	4.20	\$5,754.00
B430A	01/16/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing before Judge Corley on Debtor's motion to stay insurance adversary	1.00	\$1,370.00
B430A	01/17/25	EJS	Review Disclosure Statement hearing summary	0.20	\$170.00
B430A	01/18/25	BIW	Prepare for second hearing on Amended Disclosure Statement	1.30	\$1,508.00
B430A	01/20/25	JDP	Prepare for Disclosure Statement hearing	1.30	\$1,781.00
B430A	01/21/25	BIW	Confer with T. Burns to prepare for Amended Disclosure Statement hearing	0.10	\$116.00
B430A	01/21/25	BIW	Attend Second hearing on Amended Disclosure Statement	2.20	\$2,552.00
B430A	01/21/25	EJS	Review Disclosure Statement Hearing summary (.2) and correspondence with Committee (.1) re: next steps	0.30	\$255.00
B430A	01/21/25	JDP	Participate in continued Disclosure Statement hearing	2.20	\$3,014.00
B430A	01/27/25	BIW	Review January 21st hearing transcript	0.40	\$464.00
B430A	01/30/25	BIW	Attend hearing on Amended Disclosure Statement	1.40	\$1,624.00
B430A	01/30/25	JDP	Participate in disclosure statement hearing	1.40	\$1,918.00
B430A	02/27/25	VT	Confer with C. Restel re: electronic binder to be prepared for hearing (0.2); prepare electronic binder for hearing (0.7); upload file to secret link (0.2)	1.10	\$495.00
B430A	03/03/25	BIW	Attend Status Conference via Zoom	0.40	\$464.00
B430A	03/03/25	JDP	Draft memo to LS team re: status conference	0.40	\$548.00
B430A	03/03/25	JDP	Prepare for (.5) and attend (1.0) status conference before Judge Lafferty	1.50	\$2,055.00
B430A	03/04/25	BIW	Attend Hearing on Motions to Dismiss (virtually)	1.40	\$1,624.00
B430A	03/04/25	JDP	Attend hearing on motions to dismiss	2.00	\$2,740.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430A	03/04/25	MAK	Attend hearing on motion to dismiss adversary complaints	2.00	\$2,270.00
B430A	04/01/25	BIW	Attend RCBO Disclosure Statement Hearing	3.50	\$4,060.00
B430A	04/01/25	JDP	Attend hearing on Third Amended Disclosure Statement, including negotiations with Debtor's counsel over terms for withdrawal of Disclosure Statement objection	3.50	\$4,795.00
B430A	04/03/25	BIW	Attend Disclosure Statement hearing (virtually)	0.40	\$464.00
B430A	04/23/25	CMR	Attend hearing (virtual) re: status of Adversary Proceedings	0.70	\$787.50
B430A	04/23/25	JDP	Participate in status conference before Judge Lafferty	0.70	\$959.00
B430A	04/24/25	BIW	Attend hearing on Stout's Retention Application (virtually)	0.50	\$580.00
B430A	04/24/25	JDP	Prepare for hearing on application to retain Stout Valuation Services	1.20	\$1,644.00
B430A	04/24/25	JDP	Participate in hearing on Stout retention	0.50	\$685.00
B430A	04/29/25	DC	Review Judge Lafferty's calendar for 4/30/25, follow up with attorneys and circulate zoom link	0.20	\$80.00
B430A	04/30/25	BIW	Attend Fee Application and Late Claim hearing	1.30	\$1,508.00
			Total B430A - Court Hearings	96.70	\$118,015.50
B460 Other -	Insurance Ma	tters			
B460	02/03/25	EJ	Confer with B. Weisenberg re: insurance assignment matters	0.20	\$230.00
B460	02/11/25	BIW	Draft email to T. Burns re: review of survivor claims and insurance coverage	0.20	\$232.00
B460	02/12/25	BIW	Review insurance coverage analysis	0.60	\$696.00
B460	02/12/25	BIW	Confer with Stout and Burns Bair re: analysis of insurance covered claims	1.20	\$1,392.00
B460	02/12/25	JDP	Review insurance coverage analysis	0.30	\$411.00
B460	02/13/25	BIW	Review insurance coverage analysis	0.30	\$348.00
B460	03/03/25	DC	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	1.60	\$640.00
B460	03/03/25	DC	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	1.60	\$640.00
B460	03/03/25	EBL	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	2.20	\$836.00
B460	03/03/25	EBL	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	2.20	\$836.00
B460	03/04/25	DC	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	1.10	\$440.00
B460	03/04/25	DC	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	1.10	\$440.00
B460	03/04/25	EBL	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	1.60	\$608.00
B460	03/04/25	EBL	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	1.60	\$608.00

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460	03/05/25	EBL	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	1.80	\$684.00
B460	03/07/25	DC	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	0.40	\$160.00
B460	03/07/25	DC	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	0.40	\$160.00
B460	03/07/25	EBL	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	1.20	\$456.00
B460	03/07/25	EBL	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	1.20	\$456.00
B460	03/09/25	BIW	Review correspondence with Insurers re: Survivor demands for policy information	0.30	\$348.00
B460	03/10/25	DC	Analyze historical survivor recoveries from Insurers in bankruptcy	0.50	\$200.00
B460	03/25/25	BIW	Review responses to "Boicourt" letters	0.40	\$464.00
			Total B460 - Other - Insurance Matters	22.00	\$11,285.00