
4939-1343-9749.6 36027.003  

PACHULSKI STANG ZIEHL & JONES LLP 
Jeffrey N. Pomerantz (CA Bar No. 143717) (admitted pro hac vice) 
John A. Morris (NY Bar No. 2405397) (admitted pro hac vice) 
Gregory V. Demo (NY Bar No. 5371992) (admitted pro hac vice) 
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Melissa S. Hayward (TX Bar No. 24044908)  
MHayward@HaywardFirm.com 
Zachery Z. Annable (TX Bar No. 24053075) 
ZAnnable@HaywardFirm.com 
10501 N. Central Expy, Ste. 106 
Dallas, TX 75231 
Telephone: (972) 755-7100 
Facsimile: (972) 755-7110 
 
Counsel for Highland Capital Management, L.P.  
 

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS 

DALLAS DIVISION   
 

In re: 
 
HIGHLAND CAPITAL MANAGEMENT, L.P.,1 
 
Reorganized Debtor. 

) 
) 
) 
) 
) 
) 
) 

Chapter 11 
 
Case No. 19-34054-sgj11 
 

 

 
1 Highland’s last four digits of its taxpayer identification number are (8357).  The headquarters and service address 
for Highland is 100 Crescent Court, Suite 1850, Dallas, TX 75201. 
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NOTICE OF ATTORNEYS’ FEES CALCULATION  
AND BACKUP DOCUMENTATION [SEE DOCKET NO. 4176] 

 
 PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that Highland Capital Management, L.P. (“Highland”), the 

reorganized debtor in the above-captioned chapter 11 case (the “Bankruptcy Case”), hereby files 

this Notice of Attorney’s Fees Calculation and Backup Documentation [See Docket No. 4176]  (the 

“Notice”) in support of its Motion for (A) a Bad Faith Finding and (B) an Award of Attorneys’ 

Fees Against Highland CLO Management, Ltd. and James Dondero in Connection with HCLOM 

Claims 3.65 and 3.66 [Docket No. 4176] (the “Motion”).  Attached as Exhibit 1 is the declaration 

of John A. Morris in support of the Motion (the “Declaration”) and backup documentation 

supporting the calculation of attorneys’ fees.  

[Remainder of Page Intentionally Blank]  
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Dated: December 13, 2024 PACHULSKI STANG ZIEHL & JONES LLP 
 
Jeffrey N. Pomerantz (CA Bar No. 143717) 
John A. Morris (NY Bar No. 2405397) 
Gregory V. Demo (NY Bar No. 5371992) 
Hayley R. Winograd (NY Bar No. 5612569) 
10100 Santa Monica Blvd., 13th Floor 
Los Angeles, CA 90067 
Telephone: (310) 277-6910 
Facsimile: (310) 201-0760 
Email:  jpomerantz@pszjlaw.com 
  jmorris@pszjlaw.com 
 gdemo@pszjlaw.com 
 hwinograd@pszjlaw.com  

-and- 

HAYWARD PLLC 
 /s/ Zachery Z. Annable 
 Melissa S. Hayward 

Texas Bar No. 24044908 
MHayward@HaywardFirm.com 
Zachery Z. Annable 
Texas Bar No. 24053075 
ZAnnable@HaywardFirm.com 
10501 N. Central Expy, Ste. 106 
Dallas, Texas 75231 
Tel: (972) 755-7100 
Fax: (972) 755-7110 

Counsel for Highland Capital Management, L.P. 
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EXHIBIT 1 
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DECLARATION OF JOHN A. MORRIS IN SUPPORT OF HIGHLAND CAPITAL 
MANAGEMENT, L.P.’S MOTION FOR (A) A BAD FAITH FINDING AND (B) AN 

AWARD OF ATTORNEYS’ FEES AGAINST HIGHLAND CLO MANAGEMENT, LTD. 
AND JAMES DONDERO IN CONNECTION WITH HCLOM CLAIMS 3.65 AND 3.66 

 

I, John A. Morris, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, under penalty of perjury, declare as 

follows:    

1. I am a partner in the law firm Pachulski, Stang, Ziehl & Jones LLP (the “Firm”), 

counsel to Highland.1  I submit this Declaration in support of the Motion.  I have overseen my 

Firm’s representation of Highland in all aspects of the litigation concerning the HCLOM Claim.  

This Declaration is based on my personal knowledge and review of the documents listed below.      

A. Attorneys’ Fees Charged by the Firm in Connection with Highland’s 
Objection to the HCLOM Claim and the Preparation of the Motion 

2. I and others working at my direction have reviewed invoices related to the 

attorneys’ fees and expenses charged to Highland in connection with Highland’s objection to the 

HCLOM Claim and the preparation of the Motion and calculated the amount of attorneys’ fees 

and expenses incurred in connection therewith.  

3. In the ordinary course of business, timekeepers (including attorneys and legal 

assistants) at my Firm record billable time in increments of one-tenth of an hour.  Timekeepers are 

also required to classify their work by task codes and/or matter numbers to differentiate between 

individual tasks conducted for the same client.    

 
1 Capitalized terms not defined in this Declaration shall have the meanings ascribed to them in the Notice of Attorney’s 
Fees Calculation and Backup Documentation [See Docket No. 4176]  (the “Notice”) or the Motion for (A) a Bad Faith 
Finding and (B) an Award of Attorneys’ Fees Against Highland CLO Management, Ltd. and James Dondero in 
Connection with HCLOM Claims 3.65 and 3.66 [Docket No. 4176] (the “Motion”). 
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4. For the period April 3, 2023 through November 30, 2024,2 the Firm’s timekeepers 

generally recorded their time entries relating to the HCLOM Claim and Motion under matter 

number “.003” and task code “BL” (short for “Bankruptcy Litigation”), “OIC” (short for “Other 

Insider Claims”), or “CO” (short for “Claim Objection”).3  Attached as Exhibit A are the Firm’s 

invoices for the period April 3, 2023 through November 30, 2024 that reflect all of the Firm’s time 

billed to the litigation of the HCLOM Claim (collectively, the “PSZJ Invoices”).  We have redacted 

all entries that we concluded were unrelated to services rendered in connection with the HCLOM 

Claim or Motion. 

5. Subject to the foregoing, for the period April 3, 2023 through November 30, 2024, 

the attorneys’ fees billed by the Firm’s timekeepers with respect to the HCLOM Claim are in the 

aggregate amount of $599,912.50 (the “Fees”).  With one exception, all Fees have been charged 

to, and paid by, Highland.4    

B. Third-Party Expenses Incurred in Connection with the HCLOM Claim 

6. Highland took or defended five depositions in connection with the HCLOM Claim 

(the “Depositions”), two of which took place in Dallas, Texas (the “In-Person Depositions”) and 

three of which were taken remotely.     

7. Attached as Exhibit B are invoices rendered by Veritext Legal Solutions, Everest 

Court Reporting, and Remote Legal for court reporting services provided in connection with the 

 
2 The time period covering Highland’s request for an award of attorneys’ fees begins on April 3, 2023, the date 
HCLOM Ltd. filed its Response.  See Motion ¶ 14.  For the avoidance of doubt, Highland does not seek to recover 
any costs or expenses concerning its initial investigation of the HCLOM Claim or the preparation of the Objection, 
because HCLOM Ltd. had not yet taken a position in relation to the Objection. 
3 Certain time entries for work related to the HCLOM Claim were inadvertently billed to other task codes. See 
September and November 2024 invoices (containing task codes “CLO,” “HCREBF,” DAFC,” or “RECU”).  
4 The exception pertains to the fees incurred in the month of November 2024; the Firm has prepared the invoice but it 
has not been reviewed or paid by Highland.  This declaration will be updated prior to the Hearing if there is a change 
in the amounts charged or expected to be paid by Highland. 
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Depositions (the “Deposition Expenses”).  The Deposition Expenses incurred by the Firm are in 

the aggregate amount of $9,545.90.  

8. I traveled from New York to Dallas for the In-Person Depositions.  Attached as 

Exhibit C are invoices showing that the amount the Firm incurred in connection with this travel 

(the “Travel Expenses,” and together with the Deposition Expenses, the “Expenses”) are in the 

aggregate amount of $1,261.96.    

9. For the period April 1, 2024 through November 30, 2024, the Expenses incurred by 

the Firm and charged to, and paid by, Highland with respect to the HCLOM Claim are in the total 

aggregate amount of $10,807.86.5   

C. Summary of Fees and Expenses Incurred by Highland in Connection with the 
HCLOM Claim 

10. Attached as Exhibit D is a chart showing that the aggregate amount of Fees and 

Expenses charged to, and paid by, Highland in connection with the HCLOM Claim is 

$610,720.36.6 

11. I declare under penalty of perjury that the forgoing is true and correct. 

Dated: December 13, 2024.    

 

              /s/ John A. Morris        
        John A. Morris 
 
 
 

 
5 See supra n. 5. 
6 See supra n. 5. 

Case 19-34054-sgj11    Doc 4184-1    Filed 12/13/24    Entered 12/13/24 16:12:33    Desc
Exhibit 1--Declaration of John A. Morris    Page 4 of 101



 

 

EXHIBIT A 
 

PSZJ INVOICES 
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Post-Effective Date

April 30, 2023Highland Capital Management LP
James P. Seery, Jr.
Highland Capital Management LP 
100 Crescent Court, Suite 1850
Dallas, TX  75201

132435Invoice

10100 Santa Monica Blvd.
13th Floor
Los Angeles, CA  90067

STATEMENT OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 04/30/2023

36027.00003Client

RE:
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Invoice 132435
45

April 30, 2023

Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

Other Insider Claims
Review responses to HCLOM claims. $510.00JMF04/03/2023 0.40 1,275.00OIC

 

 

Preliminary review/response to Objection to 
HCLOM claim (0.3); tel c. w/ J. Pomerantz re: 
next steps on HCLOM claim objection (0.1); 
tel c. w/ J. Seery re: next steps on HCLOM 
objection (0.2).

$930.00JAM04/08/2023 0.60 1,550.00OIC

E-mail to M. Aigen, J. Pomerantz, G. Demo 
re: stay vs. discovery concerning HCLOM 
objection (0.4); e-mails w/ J. Seery, J. 
Pomerantz, G. Demo re: email to Aigen (0.1).

$775.00JAM04/09/2023 0.50 1,550.00OIC

 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 

E-mails with attorneys re our draft reply re 
stay of HCLOM objection, including review 
of same, as well as responses from HCLOM 
counsel.

$493.50IDK04/10/2023 0.30 1,645.00OIC

Review HCLOM responses to claim objection 
(0.4); review draft reply (0.3)

$875.00GVD04/10/2023 0.70 1,250.00OIC

Review emails from T. Cooke and J. Morris 
re: HCLOM objection (0.2).

$165.00HRW04/10/2023 0.20 825.00OIC

Review reply in support of HCLOM objection 
(0.1).

$82.50HRW04/10/2023 0.10 825.00OIC

Review email from M. Aigen re: Stay 
Stipulation for HCLOM Objection (0.1).

$82.50HRW04/12/2023 0.10 825.00OIC
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Invoice 132435
46

April 30, 2023

Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

 
 

Review/revise stipulation to stay HCLOM 
claim objection litigation (the “Stay”) (0.2); e-
mails w/ M. Aigen re: Stay stipulation (0.1); e-
mails w/ S. Bates re: Stay stipulation (0.1); e-
mails w/ Z. Annable, M. Aigen, S. Bates re: 
Stay stipulation (0.2).

$930.00JAM04/12/2023 0.60 1,550.00OIC

Review email from J. Morris re: stay 
stipulation on HCLOM Objection (0.1).

$82.50HRW04/14/2023 0.10 825.00OIC

Review email from J. Morris re: HCLOM stay 
stipulation (0.1).

$82.50HRW04/19/2023 0.10 825.00OIC

Review email from M. Aigen re: stay 
stipulation for HCLOM objection (0.1).

$82.50HRW04/20/2023 0.10 825.00OIC
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Post-Effective Date

May 31, 2023Highland Capital Management LP
James P. Seery, Jr.
Highland Capital Management LP 
100 Crescent Court, Suite 1850
Dallas, TX  75201

132623Invoice

10100 Santa Monica Blvd.
13th Floor
Los Angeles, CA  90067

STATEMENT OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 05/31/2023

36027.00003Client

RE:
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Invoice 132623
39

May 31, 2023

Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Other Insider Claims
Conference with T. Cournoyer re HCLOM 
bank accounts (0.4); correspondence with 
counsel to Dugaboy and M. Okada re bank 
account issues (0.3)

$875.00GVD05/17/2023 0.70 1,250.00OIC
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Post-Effective Date

December 1, 2023Highland Capital Management LP
James P. Seery, Jr.
Highland Capital Management LP 
100 Crescent Court, Suite 1850
Dallas, TX  75201

136183Invoice

10100 Santa Monica Blvd.
13th Floor
Los Angeles, CA  90067

STATEMENT OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 11/30/2023

36027.00003Client

RE:

Case 19-34054-sgj11    Doc 4184-1    Filed 12/13/24    Entered 12/13/24 16:12:33    Desc
Exhibit 1--Declaration of John A. Morris    Page 11 of 101



Invoice 136183
16

December 1, 2023

Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

 

 

Claims Administration and Objections
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

$255.000.20 1,275.00

Review email from J. Morris re: HCLOM 
objection and next steps (0.1).

$82.50HRW11/16/2023 0.10 825.00CO

Review Acis response to HCLOM objection 
(0.2).

$165.00HRW11/16/2023 0.20 825.00CO

Review emails from J. Seery, J. Morris re: 
HCLOM Objection and Acis motion to 
intervene (0.3).

$247.50HRW11/17/2023 0.30 825.00CO

Review emails from J. Morris, Z. Annable re: 
notice to life stay on HCLOM objection (0.2).

$165.00HRW11/22/2023 0.20 825.00CO

Review emails from J. Morris, J. Seery, D. 
Perez re: schedule for the HCLOM objection 
(0.2).

$165.00HRW11/27/2023 0.20 825.00CO

Review HCLOM Objection and related 
briefing (0.4).

$330.00HRW11/27/2023 0.40 825.00CO
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Invoice 136183
17

December 1, 2023

Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

Review emails from J. Morris, D. Perez, S. 
Bates re: Notice to Resume HCLOM Claim 
Objection and Related Litigation (0.3).

$247.50HRW11/28/2023 0.30 825.00CO
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Invoice 136183
29

December 1, 2023

Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

 

 

Other Insider Claims
Review pleadings on HCLOM objection, 
including Acis motion to intervene (0.8); e-
mail to J. Seery, D. Klos, J. Pomerantz, re: 
status of HCLOM objection and Acis motion 
to intervene (0.8).

$2,480.00JAM11/16/2023 1.60 1,550.00OIC

Draft notice of intent to restart HCLOM claim 
objection litigation (0.3); e-mails w/ J. Seery, 
D. Klos, Z. Annable, J. Pomerantz, G. Demo, 
H. Winograd re: notice of intent to restart 
HCLOM claim objection litigation (0.1).

$620.00JAM11/22/2023 0.40 1,550.00OIC

Draft e-mail to counsel re: intent to restart 
HCMLP's objection to the HCLOM claim 
(0.3).

$465.00JAM11/23/2023 0.30 1,550.00OIC

E-mail to J. Seery, D. Klos, T. Cournoyer, J. 
Pomerantz, G. Demo, H. Winograd re: 
proposed discovery schedule for HCLOM 
claim objection litigation (0.3).

$465.00JAM11/27/2023 0.30 1,550.00OIC

E-mail to S. Bates, D. Perez re: proposed 
schedule for objection to HCLOM scheduled 
claims (0.4).

$620.00JAM11/28/2023 0.40 1,550.00OIC

$4,650.003.00
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Post-Effective Date

December 31, 2023Highland Capital Management LP
James P. Seery, Jr.
Highland Capital Management LP 
100 Crescent Court, Suite 1850
Dallas, TX  75201

137393Invoice

10100 Santa Monica Blvd.
13th Floor
Los Angeles, CA  90067

STATEMENT OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 12/31/2023

36027.00003Client

RE:
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Invoice 137393
5

December 31, 2023

Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

 

 

 

 

 

Bankruptcy Litigation

 

 

Review emails from S. Bates, J. Morris, M. 
Aigen re: Proposed Schedule for Litigation of 
HCLOM Objection and Related Matters (0.2).

$165.00HRW12/02/2023 0.20 825.00BL
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Post-Effective Date

April 30, 2024Highland Capital Management LP
James P. Seery, Jr.
Highland Capital Management LP
100 Crescent Court, Suite 1850
Dallas, TX  75201

138912Invoice

10100 Santa Monica Blvd.
13th Floor
Los Angeles, CA  90067

STATEMENT OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 04/30/2024

36027.00003Client

RE:
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Invoice 138912

10

April 30, 2024

Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:

Highland Capital Management LP

Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

 draft e-mail to counsel for
Dugaboy/Acis re: HCLOM objection and
related litigation (0.6).

$1,017.00JAM04/16/2024 0.60 1,695.00BL
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Invoice 138912

24

April 30, 2024

Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:

Highland Capital Management LP

Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

Review email from J. Morris re: notice to
resume HCLOM claim objection and related
litigation (0.1).

$107.50HRW04/30/2024 0.10 1,075.00OIC

E-mail to S. Bates, DDP re: HCLOM (0.1). $169.50JAM04/30/2024 0.10 1,695.00OIC

$17,699.5012.50
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Post-Effective Date

August 31, 2024Highland Capital Management LP
James P. Seery, Jr.
Highland Capital Management LP
100 Crescent Court, Suite 1850
Dallas, TX  75201

142317Invoice

10100 Santa Monica Blvd.
13th Floor
Los Angeles, CA  90067

STATEMENT OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 08/31/2024

36027.00003Client

RE:
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Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

 

 
 

HCLOM
Prepare for Dondero deposition (HCLOM) 
(4.6); tel c. w/ J. Seery, T. Cournoyer re: 
HCLOM issues (0.8).

$9,153.00JAM11/01/2024 5.40 1,695.00H

E-mails to A. Bates, D. Klos re: 
exhibits/documents for HCLOM deposition 
(0.2); e-mail to M. Aigen, DDP, H. Winograd 
re: Cournoyer and HCLOM deposition (0.3).

$847.50JAM11/01/2024 0.50 1,695.00H

Prepare for Dondero deposition (4.4); tel cs. 
w/ J. Seery re: Dondero deposition (.3); tel c. 
w/ A. Bates re: Dondero deposition (0.1); e-
mails w/ A. Bates re: Dondero deposition 
(0.1).

$8,305.50JAM11/04/2024 4.90 1,695.00H

Dondero deposition (including short breaks) 
(4.5); tel c. w/ J. Pomerantz re: Dondero 
deposition (0.3); tel c. w/ J. Seery re: Dondero 
deposition and related matters (0.5)

$8,983.50JAM11/04/2024 5.30 1,695.00H

Participate in Dondero deposition. $6,037.50JNP11/04/2024 3.50 1,725.00H

Conference with J.  Morris after Dondero 
deposition.

$517.50JNP11/04/2024 0.30 1,725.00H

Call with J. Morris re: HCLOM discovery 
issues (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/05/2024 0.30 1,075.00H
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

Email with J. Morris, D. Klos, D. Perez re: 
HCLOM discovery issues (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/05/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Review email from A. Bates re: transcript of 
Dondero deposition in HCLOM litigation 
(0.1).

$107.50HRW11/05/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Prepare for HCLOM litigation (0.3); e-mails 
w/ HCMLP team re: documents/exhibits (0.2); 
e-mail to HCMLP team re: HCLOM 
accounting issues (0.6).

$1,864.50JAM11/05/2024 1.10 1,695.00H

Zoom call w/ J. Seery, D. Klos, T. Cournoyer, 
M. Gray re: HCLOM strategy and deposition 
preparation (2.6); e-mails w/ G. Demo re: 
successor trustee issues (0.2); e-mails w/ A. 
Bates re: documents and W&E list (0.3).

$5,254.50JAM11/05/2024 3.10 1,695.00H

Review letter from D. Perez re: HCLOM 
discovery issues (0.1).

$107.50HRW11/06/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Review and edit response to letter from D. 
Perez re: HCLOM discovery issues (0.4).

$430.00HRW11/06/2024 0.40 1,075.00H

Email with J. Morris, J. Seery, D. Klos, A. 
Bates, T. Cournoyer, T. Surgent re: response to 
letter from D. Perez re: HCLOM discovery 
issues (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/06/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Review email from J. Morris re: response to 
letter from D. Perez re: HCLOM discovery 
issues (0.1).

$107.50HRW11/06/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Review emails from J. Morris re: deposition 
scheduling in HCLOM litigation (0.1).

$107.50HRW11/06/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Email with J. Morris re: preparation for 
HCLOM evidentiary hearing (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/06/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Call with J. Morris, J. Seery, D. Klos, A. 
Bates, T. Cournoyer, T. Surgent re: HCLOM 
discovery issues (0.7).

$752.50HRW11/06/2024 0.70 1,075.00H

Email with J. Morris, J. Seery, D. Klos, A. 
Bates, T. Cournoyer, T. Surgent re: HCLOM 
discovery issues (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/06/2024 0.30 1,075.00H
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

E-mails w/ D. Klos re: Dameris documents 
(0.1); e-mails w/ Dameris' counsel re: 
document production (0.1); tel c. w/ J. Seery 
re: litigation matters (0.2).

$678.00JAM11/06/2024 0.40 1,695.00H

Review/analyze DDP discovery letter (0.3); 
Zoom call w/ HCMLP team, H. Winograd, A. 
Bates re: document searches and response to 
DDP discovery letter (0.6); draft response to 
DDP discovery letter (0.5).

$2,373.00JAM11/06/2024 1.40 1,695.00H

E-mails w/ J. Seery, D. Klos, H. Winograd re: 
response to DDP discovery letter (0.2); revise 
response to DDP's discovery letter (0.4).

$1,017.00JAM11/06/2024 0.60 1,695.00H

Email with J. Morris, A. Bates re: HCLOM 
document production (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/07/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Review email from J. Morris re: HCLOM 
document production (0.1).

$107.50HRW11/07/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Review emails from J. Morris, M. Aigen re: 
deposition scheduling for HCLOM litigation 
(0.2).

$215.00HRW11/07/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Review witness and exhibit list for HCLOM 
evidentiary hearing (0.1).

$107.50HRW11/07/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Email with A. Bates, J. Morris re: witness and 
exhibit list for HCLOM evidentiary hearing 
(0.1).

$107.50HRW11/07/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Email with A. Bates re: HCLOM depositions 
and related matters (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/07/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Call with A. Bates re: HCLOM depositions 
and related matters (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/07/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Call with J. Morris re: HCLOM case 
background and related issues (1.2).

$1,290.00HRW11/07/2024 1.20 1,075.00H

Review Frank Waterhouse deposition 
transcript (2.5).

$2,687.50HRW11/07/2024 2.50 1,075.00H

Tel c. w/ H. Winograd re: HCLOM facts and 
strategy (1.2); review documents and work on 
W&E list (3.1).

$7,288.50JAM11/07/2024 4.30 1,695.00H
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Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

E-mail to DDP, M. Aigen re: document 
production in response to 11/11 letter (0.1); e-
mails w/ J. Seery, T. Cournoyer, M. Aigen re: 
deposition schedule (0.1).

$339.00JAM11/07/2024 0.20 1,695.00H

Email with A. Bates, J. Morris, D. Klos re: 
witness and exhibit list for HCLOM 
evidentiary hearing (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/08/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Email with A. Bates, J. Morris, M. Aigen re: 
deposition scheduling for HCLOM litigation 
(0.2).

$215.00HRW11/08/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Review trial exhibits for HCLOM litigation 
(1.0).

$1,075.00HRW11/08/2024 1.00 1,075.00H

Continue to review Frank Waterhouse 
deposition transcript and related documents in 
connection with HCLOM litigation(6.5).

$6,987.50HRW11/08/2024 6.50 1,075.00H

Zoom call w/ J. Seery, T. Cournoyer, D. Klos, 
M. Gray re: HCLOM facts and deposition 
preparation (2.2); tel c. w/ J. Seery re: 
HCLOM issues (0.3); e-mails w/ M. Gray re: 
documents/exhibits (0.2).

$4,576.50JAM11/08/2024 2.70 1,695.00H

E-mails to A. Bates, H. Winograd re: W&E list 
and related matters (0.3); review/analysis of 
factual issues concerning HCLOM claim 
objection (2.1).

$4,068.00JAM11/08/2024 2.40 1,695.00H

Review Dondero deposition transcript and 
documents in preparation for HCLOM 
litigation (2.5).

$4,237.50JAM11/10/2024 2.50 1,695.00H

Review transcript of Dondero HCLOM 
deposition

$837.00GVD11/11/2024 0.60 1,395.00H

Review emails from J. Morris re: Dondero and 
Waterhouse depositions in connection with 
HCLOM litigation

$215.00HRW11/11/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Email with J. Seery, M. Gray, T. Cournoyer, J. 
Morris re: documents in connection with 
HCLOM litigation

$322.50HRW11/11/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Review and analyze materials in connection 
with HCLOM litigation, including Waterhouse 
and Dondero deposition transcripts

$5,912.50HRW11/11/2024 5.50 1,075.00H
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Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

Prepare for HCLOM (4.8); tel c. w/ J. Seery 
re: HCLOM claim objection (0.3); tel c. w/ A. 
Bates re: W&E list (0.2).

$8,983.50JAM11/11/2024 5.30 1,695.00H

Calls with J. Morris re: HCLOM trial 
preparation (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/12/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Email with J. Morris re: HCLOM trial 
preparation (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/12/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Email with F. MacAdam re: Cayman research 
issues in connection with HCLOM litigation 
(0.3).

$322.50HRW11/12/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Review emails from A. Bates, J. Morris, D. 
Klos, M. Gray re: witness and exbibit list in 
connection with HCLOM hearing (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/12/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Email with A. Bates re: HCLOM trial exhibits 
in connection with trial (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/12/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Review and analyze trial exhibits in 
preparation for HCLOM hearing (1.5).

$1,612.50HRW11/12/2024 1.50 1,075.00H

Review and analyze deposition transcripts in 
connection with HCLOM litigation (3.5).

$3,762.50HRW11/12/2024 3.50 1,075.00H

Prepare for HCLOM (5.5); Zoom call w/ J. 
Seery, D. Klos, T. Cournoyer, M. Gray re: 
HCLOM/deposition preparation (2.5); tel c. w/ 
H. Winograd re: HCLOM claim objection 
(0.2); tel c. w/ J. Seery re: HCLOM issues 
(0.3).

$14,407.50JAM11/12/2024 8.50 1,695.00H

Attend deposition of J. Seery in connection 
with HCLOM litigation (3.5).

$3,762.50HRW11/13/2024 3.50 1,075.00H

Meet with J. Morris, J. Seery for client 
conference in connection with HCLOM 
litigation (1.0).

$1,075.00HRW11/13/2024 1.00 1,075.00H

Attend deposition of T. Cournoyer in 
connection with HCLOM litigation (1.8).

$1,935.00HRW11/13/2024 1.80 1,075.00H

Call with J. Morris, J. Seery, T. Cournoyer, M. 
Gray, D. Klos re: Cournoyer deposition 
debrief in connection with HCLOM litigation 
(0.3).

$322.50HRW11/13/2024 0.30 1,075.00H
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Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

Email with M. Gray re: deposition of F. 
Waterhouse in connection with HCLOM 
litigation (0.1).

$107.50HRW11/13/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Email with F. MacAdam, N. Dunne re: 
Cayman research issues in connection with 
HCLOM litigation (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/13/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Email with J. Morris, J. Seery re: Acis joint 
pre-trial order in connection with HCLOM 
litigation (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/13/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Review background materials in connection 
with HCLOM litigation in preparation for 
deposition of J. Seery (1.5).

$1,612.50HRW11/13/2024 1.50 1,075.00H

Prepare for HCLOM claim objection litigation 
(review of FW deposition transcript) (1.7); 
meet w/ J. Seery re: HCLOM claim objection 
and deposition (0.2); Seery deposition (3.5).

$9,153.00JAM11/13/2024 5.40 1,695.00H

Zoom call w/ HCMLP team, J. Seery, H. 
Winograd re: HCLOM depositions (1.0); 
Cournoyer deposition (2.8); Zoom call w/ 
HCMLP team, J. Seery, H. Winograd re: 
Cournoyer deposition (0.3); meet w/ H. 
Winograd re: HCLOM issues (0.2).

$7,288.50JAM11/13/2024 4.30 1,695.00H

Multiple conferences with J Seery re HCLOF 
issues

$418.50GVD11/14/2024 0.30 1,395.00H

Review and revise draft HCLOF settlement 
agreement from CLOH/DAF

$2,371.50GVD11/14/2024 1.70 1,395.00H

Conference with HCLOF directors re 
revisions to settlement agreement

$418.50GVD11/14/2024 0.30 1,395.00H

Continue to review and analyze HCLOM 
exhibits and related background documents in 
connection with HCLOM litigation

$5,375.00HRW11/14/2024 5.00 1,075.00H

Draft motion for bad faith finding in 
connection with HCLOM litigation

$3,225.00HRW11/14/2024 3.00 1,075.00H

Tel c. w/ J. Seery re: litigation matters (1.1); 
work on HCLOM litigation (4.8); tel c. w/ H. 
Winograd re: HCLOM arguments and facts 
(0.2).

$10,339.50JAM11/14/2024 6.10 1,695.00H
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Rate AmountHours

Review R Boleat revisions to HCLOF 
settlement agreement and revise same

$1,395.00GVD11/15/2024 1.00 1,395.00H

Review F Waterhouse transcript in HCLOM $279.00GVD11/15/2024 0.20 1,395.00H

Review docket and related pleadings in Acis 
adversary proceeding in connection with 
HCLOM litigation

$537.50HRW11/15/2024 0.50 1,075.00H

Email with Z. Annable, J. Morris re: trial 
setting in Acis adversary proceeding in 
connection with HCLOM litigation

$322.50HRW11/15/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Email with J. Morris, J. Seery, D. Klos re: 
document production in HCLOM litigation

$215.00HRW11/15/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Email with J. Morris re: Dondero deposition 
digest in connection with HCLOM litigation

$107.50HRW11/15/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Email with J. Morris, D. Klos, A. Bates, M. 
Gray, J. Seery re: witness and exhibit list in 
connection with HCLOM litigation

$215.00HRW11/15/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Draft motion for bad faith finding in 
connection with HCLOM litigation

$6,450.00HRW11/15/2024 6.00 1,075.00H

Email with J. Morris re: Waterhouse 
deposition digest in connection with HCLOM 
litigation

$215.00HRW11/15/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Work on HCLOM litigation, including 
completion of Waterhouse digest and 
review/revise W&E list (4.3); tel c. w/ A. 
Bates re: W&E list (0.1).

$7,458.00JAM11/15/2024 4.40 1,695.00H

Tel c. w/ J. Seery re: analysis of HCLOM 
issues (0.3); e-mail to J. Seery, D. Klos, J. 
Pomerantz, G. Demo, H. Winograd re: 
Waterhouse digest (0.1); e-mails to A. Bates 
re: W&E list (0.3).

$1,186.50JAM11/15/2024 0.70 1,695.00H

Draft motion for bad faith finding in 
connection with HCLOM litigation

$6,450.00HRW11/16/2024 6.00 1,075.00H

Review/revise W&E list (0.8). $1,356.00JAM11/16/2024 0.80 1,695.00H

Email with J. Morris re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/17/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Email with N. Dunne re: research in 
connection with HCLOM litigation (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/17/2024 0.20 1,075.00H
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22
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

Review Klos transcript in preparation for 
HCLOM trial (1.0).

$1,075.00HRW11/17/2024 1.00 1,075.00H

Review research in connection with HCLOM 
litigation (0.5).

$537.50HRW11/17/2024 0.50 1,075.00H

Draft motion for bad faith finding against 
HCLOM and related work (0.5).

$537.50HRW11/17/2024 0.50 1,075.00H

Work on HCLOM litigation (4.5). $7,627.50JAM11/17/2024 4.50 1,695.00H

HCLOM - update witness and exhibit list. $476.00ATB11/18/2024 0.80 595.00H

Review J Seery changes to HCLOF settlement 
and revise same

$279.00GVD11/18/2024 0.20 1,395.00H

Email with J. Morris re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/18/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Email with D. Klos, J. Seery, M. Gray, T. 
Cournoyer, A. Bates re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.4).

$430.00HRW11/18/2024 0.40 1,075.00H

Call with J. Morris re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.4).

$430.00HRW11/18/2024 0.40 1,075.00H

Call with D. Klos, J. Seery, M. Gray, T. 
Cournoyer, A. Bates re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.7).

$752.50HRW11/18/2024 0.70 1,075.00H

Draft motion for bad faith fiding against 
HCLOM (7.5).

$8,062.50HRW11/18/2024 7.50 1,075.00H

Work on Bad Faith motion including detailed 
outline (4.4); tel c. w/ H. Winograd re: Bad 
Faith motion (0.4); e-mail to HCMLP team, H. 
Winograd re: outline for Bad Faith motion 
(0.1); e-mails w/ D. Klos re: Bad Faith motion 
(0.2).

$8,644.50JAM11/18/2024 5.10 1,695.00H

Multiple conferences with J Seery re open 
issues re HCLOF settlement agreement.

$837.00GVD11/19/2024 0.60 1,395.00H

Review and revise HCLOF settlement 
agreement re comments from J Seery.

$976.50GVD11/19/2024 0.70 1,395.00H

Email with J. Morris re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/19/2024 0.30 1,075.00H
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

Email with D. Klos, J. Seery, M. Gray, T. 
Cournoyer, A. Bates re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/19/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Calls with J. Morris re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/19/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Continue to draft bad faith motion against 
HCLOM (8.0).

$8,600.00HRW11/19/2024 8.00 1,075.00H

Email with N. Dunne re: Cayman research in 
connection with bad faith motion against 
HCLOM (0.1).

$107.50HRW11/19/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Call with N. Dunne re: Cayman research in 
connection with bad faith motion against 
HCLOM (0.1).

$107.50HRW11/19/2024 0.10 1,075.00H

Review/revise Motion for Bad Faith Finding 
and an Award of Attorneys' Fees (the 
“Motion") (8.3); tel c. w/ H. Winograd re: 
Motion (0.2); tel c. w/ J. Seery re: Motion 
(0.2).

$14,746.50JAM11/19/2024 8.70 1,695.00H

E-mail to DDP, M. Aigen, H. Winograd re: 
Motion (0.1); tel c. w/ H. Winograd re: Motion 
(0.1); email to HCMLP team, H. Winograd re: 
Motion (0.1).

$508.50JAM11/19/2024 0.30 1,695.00H

HCLOM - Draft H. Winograd declaration; 
finalize exhibits.

$1,368.50ATB11/20/2024 2.30 595.00H

Review drafts of motion for sanctions re 
HCLOM proof of claim

$1,116.00GVD11/20/2024 0.80 1,395.00H

Email with D. Klos, J. Seery, M. Gray, T. 
Cournoyer, A. Bates re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/20/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Email with A. Bates, I. Soto, Z. Annable, J. 
Morris re: re: bad faith motion against 
HCLOM (0.5).

$537.50HRW11/20/2024 0.50 1,075.00H

Continue to draft bad faith motion against 
HCLOM and ancillary documents (8.5).

$9,137.50HRW11/20/2024 8.50 1,075.00H

Calls with A. Bates re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM and ancillary documents 
(0.4).

$430.00HRW11/20/2024 0.40 1,075.00H
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Rate AmountHours

Calls with J. Morris re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM and ancillary documents 
(0.2).

$215.00HRW11/20/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Email with G. Demo, J. Morris, J. Pomerantz 
re: bad faith motion against HCLOM (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/20/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

E-mail to HCMLP and PSZJ teams re: Bad 
Faith brief (0.1); e-mails w/ J. Pomerantz, G. 
Demo, H. Winograd re: Bad Faith brief and 
Stinson (0.1); tel c. w/ J. Seery re: Bad Faith 
brief (0.2).

$678.00JAM11/20/2024 0.40 1,695.00H

Review motion for bad faith finding and 
attorneys fees in HCLOM litigation.

$862.50JNP11/20/2024 0.50 1,725.00H

Email with J. Morris, A. Bates, Z. Annable, I. 
Soto re: bad faith motion against HCLOM 
(1.0).

$1,075.00HRW11/21/2024 1.00 1,075.00H

Email with D. Klos, J. Seery, M. Gray, T. 
Cournoyer, A. Bates re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.6).

$645.00HRW11/21/2024 0.60 1,075.00H

Calls with J. Morris re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.4).

$430.00HRW11/21/2024 0.40 1,075.00H

Calls with A. Bates re: bad faith motion 
against HCLOM (0.4).

$430.00HRW11/21/2024 0.40 1,075.00H

Calls with I. Soto re: bad faith motion against 
HCLOM (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/21/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Email with C. Raynor re: Cayman research in 
connection with bad faith motion against 
HCLOM (0.4).

$430.00HRW11/21/2024 0.40 1,075.00H

Continue to review and edit bad faith motion 
against HCLOM and ancillary documents in 
preparation for filing (8.5).

$9,137.50HRW11/21/2024 8.50 1,075.00H

Substantial review/revisions to brief in support 
of Motion for Bad Faith finding ("BF 
Motion") and supporting documents (W&E 
list, proposed order, and Winograd declaration 
(7.4); tel c. w/ J. Seery re: BF Motion (0.2).

$12,882.00JAM11/21/2024 7.60 1,695.00H
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP Page:
Highland Capital Management LP
Client 36027.00003

Rate AmountHours

Tel c. w/ A. Bates re: BF Motion (0.1); tel c. 
w/ H. Winograd re: BF Motion (0.2); tel c. w/ 
J. Seery re: BF Motion (0.1); tel c. w/ H. 
Winograd re: BF Motion (0.1); tel c. w/ J. 
Seery re: BF Motion (0.1); tel c. w/ H. 
Winograd re: BF Motion (0.1).

$1,186.50JAM11/21/2024 0.70 1,695.00H

Tel c. w/ J. Seery re: BF Motion (0.1); tel c. w/ 
Z. Annable re: BF Motion (0.1); numerous 
emails w/ H. Winograd, A. Bates, Z. Annable 
re: BF Motion and supporting documents 
(0.5).

$1,186.50JAM11/21/2024 0.70 1,695.00H

Numerous email w/ HCMLP team, H. 
Winograd, A. Bates re: BF Motion and 
supporting documentation (0.3).

$508.50JAM11/21/2024 0.30 1,695.00H

Review motion for sanction re HCLOM. $558.00JMF11/21/2024 0.40 1,395.00H

Call with J. Seery, J. Morris, J. Pomerantz re: 
motion for bad faith finding against HCLOM 
(0.5).

$537.50HRW11/25/2024 0.50 1,075.00H

Review emails from M. Aigen, J. Morris re: 
motion for bad faith finding against HCLOM 
(0.2).

$215.00HRW11/25/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Review emails from J. Morris, Z. Annable re: 
notice of hearing on motion for bad faith 
finding against HCLOM (0.3).

$322.50HRW11/25/2024 0.30 1,075.00H

Review notice of hearing on motion for bad 
faith finding against HCLOM (0.2).

$215.00HRW11/25/2024 0.20 1,075.00H

Review and revise HCLOF settlement 
agreement and conference with J Seery re 
same

$1,813.50GVD11/26/2024 1.30 1,395.00H

Conference with client and Guernsey directors 
re HCLOF settlement and next steps

$418.50GVD11/27/2024 0.30 1,395.00H

$297,542.00216.20
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Expenses

 

2,400.00Remote Legal Inv. 32909, JAM11/05/2024 TR
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2,634.15Veritext, Inv. 788500511/20/2024 TR
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SUMMARY OF ALL FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED
Fee Period Invoice # Fees
April 2023 132435 $9,076.00
May 2023 132623 $875.00
Nov 2023 136183 $6,052.50
Dec 2023 137393 $165.00
April 2024 138912 $1,294.00
May 2024 139547 $5,286.50
June 2024 140169 $2,362.50
July 2024 141239 $26,058.50
August 2024 142317 $114,471.00
Sept 2024 142604 $124,417.00
Oct 2024 143199 $12,312.50
Nov 2024 143602 $297,542.00
Total Fees $599,912.50
Total Expenses $10,807.86
TOTAL FEES AND EXPENSES $610,720.36
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