

Scott L. Alberino (admitted *pro hac vice*)  
 Alexander F. Antypas (VSB No. 92083)  
**AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP**  
 Robert S. Strauss Tower  
 2001 K Street, N.W.  
 Washington, DC 20006-1037  
 Telephone: (202) 887-4000  
 Facsimile: (202) 887-4288

Ira S. Dizengoff (admitted *pro hac vice*)  
 Abid Qureshi (admitted *pro hac vice*)  
 Jason P. Rubin (admitted *pro hac vice*)  
**AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP**  
 One Bryant Park  
 New York, New York 10036  
 Telephone: (212) 872-1000  
 Facsimile: (212) 872-1002

Lawrence A. Katz (VSB No. 47664)  
 Kristen E. Burgers (VSB No. 67997)  
**HIRSCHLER FLEISCHER, P.C.**  
 1676 International Drive, Suite 1350  
 Tysons, Virginia 22102  
 Telephone: (703) 584-8900  
 Facsimile: (703) 584-8901

*Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

*Local Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors*

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
 EASTERN DISTRICT OF VIRGINIA  
 ALEXANDRIA DIVISION**

In re:  ENVIVA, INC., <i>et al.</i> , <sup>1</sup>  Debtors.	Chapter 11  Case No. 24-10453 (BFK)  (Jointly Administered)  Objection Deadline: September 26, 2024
--	---

**FOURTH MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF ALIXPARTNERS, LLP,  
 FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF  
 UNSECURED CREDITORS, FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR  
 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES  
INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD FROM JULY 1, 2024 THROUGH JULY 31, 2024**

<b>Name of Applicant:</b>	<b>ALIXPARTNERS, LLP</b>	
<b>Applicant’s Role in Case:</b>	<b>Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors</b>	
<b>Date of Employment Order:</b>	<b>May 29, 2024 effective as of March 28, 2024 [Docket No. 628]</b>	
<b>Time period covered by this Fee Statement:</b>	<b>Beginning of Period</b>	<b>End of Period</b>
	<b>July 1, 2024</b>	<b>July 31, 2024</b>
<b>Summary of Total Fees and Expenses Requested:</b>		
<b>Total fees requested in this Fee Statement:</b>	<b>\$883,265.20 (80% of \$1,104,081.50)</b>	

<sup>1</sup> Due to the large number of Debtors in these jointly administered chapter 11 cases, a complete list of the Debtor entities and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers is not provided herein. A complete list may be obtained on the website of the Debtors’ proposed claims and noticing agent at [www.kccllc.net/enviva](http://www.kccllc.net/enviva). The location of the Debtors’ corporate headquarters is: 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800, Bethesda, MD 20814.



<b>Total expenses requested in this Fee Statement:</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>Total fees and expenses requested in this Fee Statement:</b>	<b>\$883,265.20</b>

**ALIXPARTNERS, LLP**

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL<sup>2</sup>  
JULY 1, 2024 THROUGH JULY 31, 2024**

Professional	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
David MacGreevey	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,435	36.3	\$ 52,090.50
David Hindman	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,410	5.0	7,050.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,380	41.5	57,270.00
Marc J Brown	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,320	1.2	1,584.00
Richard Collura	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,320	46.5	61,380.00
James Horgan	Partner	\$1,200	1.0	1,200.00
Elizabeth S Kardos	Partner	\$900	0.5	450.00
Mark Cervi	Director	\$1,125	100.7	113,287.50
Matthew D Gates	Director	\$1,025	40.1	41,102.50
Loring Hill	Director	\$960	27.4	26,304.00
Ryan H Komendowski	Director	\$960	112.6	108,096.00
Scott Weiner	Director	\$960	23.2	22,272.00
Sarah Jakobsen	Director	\$960	5.2	4,992.00
Dhwani Kapadia	Senior Vice President	\$895	34.4	30,788.00
Andrew Valentini	Senior Vice President	\$895	151.5	135,592.50
John Moskal	Senior Vice President	\$880	8.6	7,568.00
Christopher Cuomo	Senior Vice President	\$880	29.3	25,784.00
Ivan Esteban	Senior Vice President	\$825	2.2	1,815.00
Kristina Borkowski	Senior Vice President	\$825	1.5	1,237.50
Thomas G Prince	Senior Vice President	\$880	134.9	118,712.00
Sari Rosenfeld	Senior Vice President	\$625	1.1	687.50

<sup>2</sup> AlixPartners’ standard hourly rates are reviewed semi-annually, and certain professionals’ rates were adjusted as of July 1, 2024. Adjustments included reasonable, routine, across-the-board rate increases to reflect promotions and general market increases comparable to market rates of comparable firms performing similar services.

**ALIXPARTNERS, LLP**

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL  
JULY 1, 2024 THROUGH JULY 31, 2024**

Professional	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
Elizabeth Bruttomesso	Vice President	\$770	14.6	11,242.00
Chase Hood	Vice President	\$750	62.0	46,500.00
Daniel Lopresti	Vice President	\$750	123.0	92,250.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	Vice President	\$750	149.3	111,975.00
Lisa Marie Bonito	Vice President	\$550	23.0	12,650.00
Disha Pareshkumar Kapadia <sup>3</sup>	Consultant	\$555	20.4	11,322.00
<b>Total Hours and Fees for Professionals</b>			<b>1,197.0</b>	<b>\$ 1,105,202.00</b>
Less Voluntary Reduction from June 2024 Fee Statement				(1,120.50)
<b>Total Fees for Professionals Less Voluntary Reduction</b>				<b>\$ 1,104,081.50</b>
Less 20% Holdback				(220,816.30)
<b>Total Fees for Professionals Less Holdback</b>				<b>\$ 883,265.20</b>

**Average Billing Rate \$ 923.31**

---

<sup>3</sup> Due to a clerical error in the *Third Monthly Fee Statement of AlixPartners, LLP, Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, for Allowance of Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred for the Period from June 1, 2024 through June 30, 2024* [Docket No. 972] (the "June 2024 Fee Statement"), Disha Pareshkumar Kapadia was inadvertently billed as a Senior Vice President and at a billing rate of \$690.00 per hour. AlixPartners has voluntarily reduced the professional fees in the within Fee Statement in the amount of \$1,120.50.

**ALIXPARTNERS, LLP**

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY MATTER CATEGORY  
JULY 1, 2024 THROUGH JULY 31, 2024**

<b>Matter Code</b>	<b>Matter Category</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Fees</b>
1.1	Planning, Coordination and Case Management	37.2	\$ 37,669.00
1.2	Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors	87.2	92,486.00
1.3	Preparation of Committee Presentations	69.4	66,083.50
1.4	Meetings & Communication with Debtors	17.5	19,503.50
1.7	Liquidity and Cash Management	68.0	63,146.50
1.9	Business and Strategic Plan	155.4	131,079.50
1.10	Employee Compensation and Advisor Retention Matters	1.5	1,556.50
1.11	Financial and Other Diligence	46.2	37,348.00
1.12	Other Motions and Related Objections	3.7	4,460.00
1.13	Litigation Support & Investigations	243.9	236,444.00
1.14	Claims Analysis	64.9	59,989.00
1.15	Valuation and Solvency Analysis	91.8	83,496.00
1.17	RSA, Disclosure Statement & Plan of Reorganization	5.4	5,529.50
1.19	Retention Applications & Relationship Disclosures	0.5	450.00
1.20	Fee Applications & Fee Statements	34.2	24,592.00
1.22	Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis	263.5	235,139.50
1.23	eDiscovery	6.7	6,229.50
<b>Total Hours and Fees by Matter Category Before Reduction</b>		<b>1,197.0</b>	<b>\$ 1,105,202.00</b>

**Average Billing Rate \$ 923.31**

AlixPartners, LLP (“AlixPartners”), as financial advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Committee”) to the above-captioned debtors (the “Debtors”), hereby submits its fourth monthly fee statement (the “Fee Statement”) seeking compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement of out-of-pocket expenses for the period from July 1, 2024 through July 31, 2024 (the “Compensation Period”), pursuant to the *Order (i) Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals and (ii) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 317] (the “Interim Compensation Order”) and the *Order Authorizing the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors to Employ and Retain AlixPartners, LLP as its Financial Advisor, Effective as of March 28, 2024* [Docket No. 628].

The Interim Compensation Order provides that fourteen (14) days after the filing of this Fee Statement (the “Objection Deadline”), the Debtors are authorized and directed to pay AlixPartners 80% of the professional fees and 100% of the out-of-pocket expenses requested in this Fee Statement, with the exception of any fees and/or expenses subject to an objection.

Detailed descriptions of the services performed by each professional, organized by matter category and by date, and the hours of services provided (in tenths of an hour) during the Compensation Period are attached hereto as Exhibit A.

**WHEREFORE**, AlixPartners, as financial advisor to the Committee, respectfully requests: (i) an interim allowance of compensation for professional services in the amount of \$1,104,081.50 for the Compensation Period; (ii) that, upon expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors are authorized and directed to pay AlixPartners professional fees in the amount of \$883,265.20 (80% of \$1,104,081.50); and (iii) such other and further relief as this Court deems proper.

Dated: September 12, 2024

ALIXPARTNERS, LLP  
909 Third Avenue, 28<sup>th</sup> Floor  
New York, New York 10022

*/s/ David MacGreevey*

---

By: David MacGreevey  
Partner & Managing Director

Electronically filed by:

*/s/ Kristen E. Burgers*

---

Lawrence A. Katz (VSB No. 47664)  
Kristen E. Burgers (VSB No. 67997)  
Allison P. Klana (VSB No. 96400)  
**HIRSCHLER FLEISCHER, P.C.**  
1676 International Drive, Suite 1350  
Tysons, Virginia 22102  
Telephone: (703) 584-8900  
Facsimile: (703) 584-8901

*Local Counsel to the Official Committee  
of Unsecured Creditors*

**Exhibit A**

**Detailed Description of AlixPartners' Fees and Hours by Matter Category**



**Exhibit A**

**Detailed Description of AlixPartners' Fees and Hours by Matter Category**



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/02/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, T. Prince, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.3
07/02/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, T. Prince, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.3
07/02/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, T. Prince, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.3
07/02/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, T. Prince, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.3
07/02/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, T. Prince, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.3
07/02/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, T. Prince, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.3
07/02/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, T. Prince, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.3
07/02/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, T. Prince, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.3
07/02/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, T. Prince, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.3
07/09/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: aligning with Ducera on business plan and waterfall workstreams	0.3
07/09/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.6
07/09/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: aligning with Ducera on business plan and waterfall workstreams	0.3
07/09/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.6
07/09/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.6
07/09/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: aligning with Ducera on business plan and waterfall workstreams	0.3



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/09/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: aligning with Ducera on business plan and waterfall workstreams	0.3
07/09/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.6
07/09/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: aligning with Ducera on business plan and waterfall workstreams	0.3
07/09/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.6
07/09/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: aligning with Ducera on business plan and waterfall workstreams	0.3
07/09/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.6
07/09/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps.	0.6
07/09/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.6
07/09/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: aligning with Ducera on business plan and waterfall workstreams	0.3
07/09/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and next steps	0.6
07/16/2024	DM	Emails with C. Hood and M. Cervi re: EVA staffing and work plan	0.2
07/17/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/17/2024	AV	Review notes from UCC advisor call re: workstreams and open items	0.4
07/17/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/17/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/17/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/17/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/17/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/17/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/17/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/17/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/17/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/17/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.9
07/24/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/24/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/24/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: EVA work plan and strategy	0.7
07/29/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: status of ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.3
07/29/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: status of ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.3
07/29/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: status of ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.3
07/29/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: status of ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.3
07/29/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: status of ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.3
07/29/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: status of ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.3
07/29/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: status of ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.3
07/30/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
07/30/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
07/30/2024	CC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.5
07/30/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/30/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
07/30/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
07/30/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
07/30/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
07/30/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
07/30/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
07/30/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
07/30/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners ongoing workstreams and strategy	0.5
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>37.2</u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	3.5	\$ 5,022.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	3.3	4,554.00
Richard Collura	\$1,320	1.3	1,716.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	3.6	4,050.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	2.7	2,767.50
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	2.8	2,688.00
Scott Weiner	\$960	3.3	3,168.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	4.0	3,580.00
Christopher Cuomo	\$880	1.9	1,672.00
Thomas G Prince	\$880	2.7	2,376.00
Chase Hood	\$750	3.3	2,475.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$750	2.4	1,800.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$750	2.4	1,800.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>37.2</b>	<b>\$ 37,669.00</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/01/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genreux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC work plan and strategy	0.8
07/01/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genreux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC work plan and strategy	0.8
07/01/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genreux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC work plan and strategy	0.8
07/01/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genreux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC work plan and strategy	0.8
07/01/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genreux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC work plan and strategy	0.8
07/01/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genreux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC work plan and strategy	0.8
07/01/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genreux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC work plan and strategy	0.8
07/01/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genreux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC work plan and strategy	0.8
07/02/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: value allocation and waterfall construct	1.4
07/02/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: value allocation and waterfall construct	1.4
07/02/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: value allocation and waterfall construct	1.4
07/02/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: value allocation and waterfall construct	1.4





Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/02/2024	DM	Emails with L. Katz (Hirschler) and S. Alberino and A. Luft (Akin) re: impact and next steps related to rejection of V&E retention application	0.4
07/02/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: value allocation and waterfall construct	1.4
07/02/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: value allocation and waterfall construct	1.4
07/02/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: value allocation and waterfall construct	1.4
07/03/2024	DM	Review email with attachments from A. Antypas (Akin) re: EVA updates in lieu of UCC meeting	0.2
07/03/2024	MC	Review email from D. Giller (Akin) re: investigation docs received	0.2
07/08/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.5
07/08/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.5
07/08/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.5
07/08/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.5
07/08/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.5
07/08/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.5
07/08/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.5



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/08/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.5
07/09/2024	AV	Review Akin case calendar	0.3
07/10/2024	AV	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), J. Koh and others (Ducera), L. Katz, K. Burgers (Hirschler) re: preparation of presentation and agenda for upcoming call with Committee	0.4
07/10/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: Debtors' replacement counsel, business plan, liquidity, investigation, and other case updates	0.5
07/10/2024	CH	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), J. Koh and others (Ducera), L. Katz, K. Burgers (Hirschler) re: preparation of presentation and agenda for upcoming call with Committee	0.4
07/10/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: Debtors' replacement counsel, business plan, liquidity, investigation, and other case updates	0.5
07/10/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: Debtors' replacement counsel, business plan, liquidity, investigation, and other case updates	0.5
07/10/2024	DM	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), J. Koh and others (Ducera), L. Katz, K. Burgers (Hirschler) re: preparation of presentation and agenda for upcoming call with Committee	0.4
07/10/2024	DM	Review email with attachments from A. Antypas (Akin) re: EVA updates	0.2
07/10/2024	KBM	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), J. Koh and others (Ducera), L. Katz, K. Burgers (Hirschler) re: preparation of presentation and agenda for upcoming call with Committee	0.4
07/10/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: Debtors' replacement counsel, business plan, liquidity, investigation, and other case updates	0.5



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/10/2024	MC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), J. Koh and others (Ducera), L. Katz, K. Burgers (Hirschler) re: preparation of presentation and agenda for upcoming call with Committee	0.4
07/10/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: Debtors' replacement counsel, business plan, liquidity, investigation, and other case updates	0.5
07/10/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: Debtors' replacement counsel, business plan, liquidity, investigation, and other case updates.	0.5
07/10/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), J. Koh and others (Ducera), L. Katz, K. Burgers (Hirschler) re: preparation of presentation and agenda for upcoming call with Committee	0.4
07/10/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), J. Koh and others (Ducera), L. Katz, K. Burgers (Hirschler) re: preparation of presentation and agenda for upcoming call with Committee	0.4
07/10/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: Debtors' replacement counsel, business plan, liquidity, investigation, and other case updates	0.5
07/10/2024	SW	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), J. Koh and others (Ducera), L. Katz, K. Burgers (Hirschler) re: preparation of presentation and agenda for upcoming call with Committee	0.4
07/10/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: Debtors' replacement counsel, business plan, liquidity, investigation, and other case updates	0.5
07/15/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.5
07/15/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.5



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/15/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.5
07/15/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.5
07/15/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.5
07/15/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.5
07/15/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.5
07/16/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: Debtor intercompany relationships and impact on GUC recoveries	0.9
07/16/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: Debtor intercompany relationships and impact on GUC recoveries	0.9
07/16/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: Debtor intercompany relationships and impact on GUC recoveries	0.9
07/16/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: Debtor intercompany relationships and impact on GUC recoveries	0.9
07/16/2024	DM	Emails with A. Antypas (Akin) re: cancel EVA UCC update call and written update topics	0.2
07/16/2024	DM	Review email with attachment from A. Antypas (Akin) re: written EVA UCC update in lieu of meeting	0.2
07/16/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: Debtor intercompany relationships and impact on GUC recoveries	0.9
07/16/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: Debtor intercompany relationships and impact on GUC recoveries	0.9
07/16/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: Debtor intercompany relationships and impact on GUC recoveries	0.9



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/16/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: Debtor intercompany relationships and impact on GUC recoveries	0.9
07/17/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of meeting with PW	0.7
07/17/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of meeting with PW	0.7
07/17/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of meeting with PW	0.7
07/17/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of meeting with PW	0.7
07/17/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of meeting with PW	0.7
07/17/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of meeting with PW.	0.7
07/17/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of meeting with PW	0.7
07/17/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of meeting with PW	0.7
07/18/2024	DL	Attend discussion with S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), J. Koh and T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), L. Katz and others (Hirschler), M. Cervi, M. Gates, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: prepare for EVA meeting with PW, Lazard and A&M	0.5
07/18/2024	DM	Attend discussion with S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), J. Koh and T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), L. Katz and others (Hirschler), M. Cervi, M. Gates, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: prepare for EVA meeting with PW, Lazard and A&M	0.5



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/18/2024	KBM	Attend discussion with S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), J. Koh and T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), L. Katz and others (Hirschler), M. Cervi, M. Gates, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: prepare for EVA meeting with PW, Lazard and A&M	0.5
07/18/2024	MC	Attend discussion with S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), J. Koh and T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), L. Katz and others (Hirschler), M. Cervi, M. Gates, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: prepare for EVA meeting with PW, Lazard and A&M	0.5
07/18/2024	MDG	Attend discussion with S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), J. Koh and T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), L. Katz and others (Hirschler), M. Cervi, M. Gates, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: prepare for EVA meeting with PW, Lazard and A&M	0.5
07/22/2024	AV	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.4
07/22/2024	CH	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.4
07/22/2024	DM	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.4
07/22/2024	KBM	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.4
07/22/2024	MC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.4
07/22/2024	MDG	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.4
07/22/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.4
07/22/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.4





Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/22/2024	SW	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) EVA UCC professionals work plan and strategy	0.4
07/24/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting related to work plan and strategy	0.4
07/24/2024	AV	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: plan process, liquidity, investigation, and other weekly case updates	0.5
07/24/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: value allocation working session	0.5
07/24/2024	CH	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: plan process, liquidity, investigation, and other weekly case updates	0.5
07/24/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting related to work plan and strategy	0.4
07/24/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: value allocation working session	0.5
07/24/2024	DM	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: plan process, liquidity, investigation, and other weekly case updates	0.5
07/24/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: value allocation working session	0.5
07/24/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting related to work plan and strategy	0.4



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/24/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: value allocation working session	0.5
07/24/2024	KBM	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: plan process, liquidity, investigation, and other weekly case updates	0.5
07/24/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting related to work plan and strategy	0.4
07/24/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: value allocation working session	0.5
07/24/2024	MC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: plan process, liquidity, investigation, and other weekly case updates	0.5
07/24/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting related to work plan and strategy	0.4
07/24/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting related to work plan and strategy	0.4
07/24/2024	MDG	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: plan process, liquidity, investigation, and other weekly case updates	0.5
07/24/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting related to work plan and strategy	0.4





Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/24/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: plan process, liquidity, investigation, and other weekly case updates	0.5
07/24/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: plan process, liquidity, investigation, and other weekly case updates	0.5
07/24/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting related to work plan and strategy	0.4
07/24/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: value allocation working session	0.5
07/24/2024	SW	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: plan process, liquidity, investigation, and other weekly case updates	0.5
07/24/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: value allocation working session	0.5
07/26/2024	TGP	Email communications with C. Hudson and others (Akin) re: diligence items	0.4
07/29/2024	AV	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.7
07/29/2024	CH	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.7
07/29/2024	KBM	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.7
07/29/2024	MC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.7



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/29/2024	MDG	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.7
07/29/2024	MDG	Respond to questions from Akin re: claims presentation	0.5
07/29/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.7
07/29/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.7
07/29/2024	SW	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.7
07/29/2024	TGP	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: weekly UCC advisor workplan meeting	0.7
07/30/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: potential EVA plan constructs	0.8
07/30/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: potential EVA plan constructs	0.8
07/30/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: potential EVA plan constructs	0.8
07/30/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: potential EVA plan constructs	0.8
07/30/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: potential EVA plan constructs	0.8
07/30/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: potential EVA plan constructs	0.8
07/30/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: potential EVA plan constructs	0.8



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/31/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting	0.5
07/31/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), UCC Members (Committee) re: investigation, plan process, liquidity and other case updates	0.7
07/31/2024	AV	Correspond with S. Schiff (Ducera) re: banker exit fee calculations & exit liquidity	0.4
07/31/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting	0.5
07/31/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), UCC Members (Committee) re: investigation, plan process, liquidity and other case updates	0.7
07/31/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), UCC Members (Committee) re: investigation, plan process, liquidity and other case updates	0.7
07/31/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting	0.5
07/31/2024	DM	Prepare discussion points for EVA meeting with professionals and UCC members	0.5
07/31/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting	0.5
07/31/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), UCC Members (Committee) re: investigation, plan process, liquidity and other case updates	0.7
07/31/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting	0.5



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/31/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), UCC Members (Committee) re: investigation, plan process, liquidity and other case updates	0.7
07/31/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting	0.5
07/31/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), UCC Members (Committee) re: investigation, plan process, liquidity and other case updates	0.7
07/31/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting.	0.5
07/31/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), UCC Members (Committee) re: investigation, plan process, liquidity and other case updates	0.7
07/31/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting	0.5
07/31/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), UCC Members (Committee) re: investigation, plan process, liquidity and other case updates	0.7
07/31/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler) re: precall in advance of upcoming Committee meeting	0.5
07/31/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Gates, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), UCC Members (Committee) re: investigation, plan process, liquidity and other case updates	0.7
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b>87.2</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	11.2	\$ 16,072.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	8.0	11,040.00
Richard Collura	\$1,320	6.1	8,052.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	10.9	12,262.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	6.9	7,072.50
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	6.6	6,336.00
Scott Weiner	\$960	6.7	6,432.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	10.4	9,308.00
Thomas G Prince	\$880	4.7	4,136.00
Chase Hood	\$750	10.2	7,650.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$750	4.1	3,075.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$750	1.4	1,050.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>87.2</b>	<b>\$ 92,486.00</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Preparation of Committee Presentations  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.3

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/01/2024	AV	Draft slides for business plan presentation re: charts from EIA data	1.4
07/01/2024	CH	Draft updates to Committee presentation re: monthly financial results	1.9
07/01/2024	DL	Update claims presentation for UCC based on AlixPartners team member feedback	0.3
07/01/2024	DM	Review, revise and comment on presentation to EVA UCC re: operations and liquidity updates	0.6
07/01/2024	KBM	Review weekly presentation to the Committee	0.7
07/01/2024	MDG	Review presentation on MOR analysis	0.5
07/02/2024	AV	Revise UCC liquidity presentation re: comments from A. Antypas (Akin)	0.5
07/03/2024	AV	Draft liquidity and DIP presentation slides	1.7
07/03/2024	AV	Revised UCC liquidity presentation re: comments from A. Antypas (Akin)	0.3
07/03/2024	MC	Review draft liquidity update slides for committee	0.2
07/08/2024	DL	Perform quality check over claims presentation	0.7
07/08/2024	DL	Update claims presentation for critical vendor payments	2.8
07/08/2024	MC	Review debtors liquidity reporting	0.3
07/09/2024	AV	Revise weekly UCC presentation re: case updates and deadlines	0.9
07/09/2024	AV	Revise weekly UCC presentation re: comments from A. Antypas (Akin)	0.3
07/09/2024	AV	Revise weekly UCC presentation re: comments from D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners)	1.6
07/09/2024	DM	Review, revise and provide comments on draft weekly presentation to EVA UCC re: liquidity, operations and case updates	0.6
07/09/2024	KBM	Revise filed claims summary presentation for the Committee	1.1
07/09/2024	MC	Review draft liquidity update slides for committee	0.2
07/09/2024	MC	Review draft liquidity update slides for committee	0.5
07/10/2024	KBM	Review weekly presentation to the Committee	0.8
07/11/2024	AV	Draft liquidity and DIP presentation slides	2.2
07/12/2024	DM	Review current draft of presentation to EVA UCC re: initial claims review	0.8
07/15/2024	AV	Continue to draft DIP and liquidity slides re: revised July DIP Budget	2.3
07/15/2024	AV	Continue to draft DIP and liquidity slides re: weekly variance	1.8
07/16/2024	AV	Revised DIP & liquidity presentation to UCC re: comments from M. Cervi (AlixPartners)	1.7
07/16/2024	DM	Review, comment and revise presentation to EVA UCC re: operations and liquidity updates	0.5
07/17/2024	KBM	Review weekly Committee update presentation	1.1
07/18/2024	AV	Draft liquidity and DIP presentation slides	2.1
07/18/2024	DL	Respond to comments provided from AlixPartners team members on claims presentation for UCC	1.4
07/18/2024	DL	Revise claims presentation for UCC for new claims data received	2.0
07/18/2024	MDG	Review updated presentation to the committee on claims	1.2
07/19/2024	AV	Continue to draft liquidity and DIP presentation slides	2.1
07/19/2024	MC	Review debtors liquidity reporting	0.4
07/22/2024	AV	Continue to draft DIP and liquidity slides re: weekly variance	1.7
07/22/2024	AV	Revise DIP and liquidity slides re: comments from D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners)	0.4
07/22/2024	AV	Revise DIP and liquidity slides re: comments from M. Cervi (AlixPartners)	1.1



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Preparation of Committee Presentations  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.3

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/22/2024	DM	Review, comment and revise two iterations of presentation to EVA UCC re: operations and liquidity updates	0.6
07/22/2024	MC	Review draft liquidity update slides for committee	0.7
07/23/2024	AV	Draft slide for UCC presentation re: adjusted ending liquidity bridge	2.7
07/23/2024	AV	Revise DIP and liquidity slides re: comments from A. Antypas (Akin)	0.3
07/23/2024	KBM	Review weekly update presentation to the Committee	0.8
07/24/2024	AV	Revise slide for UCC presentation re: adjusted ending liquidity bridge	1.3
07/24/2024	DL	Update claims presentation for new claims data received from Debtors	2.8
07/24/2024	MDG	Review updated claims presentation	0.7
07/26/2024	DL	Revise claims presentation for UCC for new claims information uploaded by Debtors	2.2
07/26/2024	MC	Review debtors liquidity reporting	0.3
07/28/2024	KBM	Revise presentation for the Committee on filed proofs of claim	1.4
07/29/2024	AV	Continue to draft liquidity and DIP presentation slides re: end of case liquidity analysis	0.9
07/29/2024	AV	Continue to draft liquidity and DIP presentation slides re: weekly variance	1.3
07/29/2024	AV	Draft liquidity and DIP presentation slides for week ended 7/19/2024	1.8
07/29/2024	AV	Revise liquidity deck re: comments from M. Cervi (AlixPartners)	1.6
07/29/2024	DL	Revise claims presentation for UCC for AlixPartners and counsel comments	2.7
07/29/2024	MDG	Review updates to claims presentation	1.0
07/29/2024	MDG	Review updates to claims presentation and send to Akin team	0.5
07/30/2024	AV	Revise liquidity presentation re: comments from A. Antypas(Akin)	0.3
07/30/2024	AV	Revise liquidity presentation re: comments from D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners)	0.5
07/30/2024	AV	Revise liquidity presentation re: MGT assumptions	1.4
07/30/2024	DM	Provide comments on draft presentation to EVA UCC re: liquidity and operations	0.7
07/31/2024	AV	Revise DIP and liquidity presentation re: end of case liquidity assumptions	1.4
07/31/2024	KBM	Review updated weekly Committee presentation	0.8
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u><u>69.4</u></u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Preparation of Committee Presentations  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.3

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	3.8	\$ 5,453.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	6.7	9,246.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	2.6	2,925.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	3.9	3,997.50
Andrew Valentini	\$895	35.6	31,862.00
Chase Hood	\$750	1.9	1,425.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$750	14.9	11,175.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>69.4</b>	<b>\$ 66,083.50</b>





Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/01/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: recent contract rejections	0.2
07/01/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: recent contract rejections	0.2
07/01/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: recent contract rejections	0.2
07/01/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: recent contract rejections	0.2
07/08/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: liquidity, contract negotiations, and operations updates	0.5
07/08/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: liquidity, contract negotiations, and operations updates	0.5
07/08/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: liquidity, contract negotiations, and operations updates	0.5
07/08/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: liquidity, contract negotiations, and operations updates	0.5
07/12/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: liquidity and operations updates and business plan diligence items	0.7
07/12/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), L. Callerio and others (A&M) re: intercompany process and balance overview	0.8
07/12/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: liquidity and operations updates and business plan diligence items	0.7
07/12/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), L. Callerio and others (A&M) re: intercompany process and balance overview	0.8
07/12/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: liquidity and operations updates and business plan diligence items	0.7
07/12/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), L. Callerio and others (A&M) re: intercompany process and balance overview	0.8
07/12/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: liquidity and operations updates and business plan diligence items	0.7



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/12/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), L. Callerio and others (A&M) re: intercompany process and balance overview	0.8
07/12/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: liquidity and operations updates and business plan diligence items	0.7
07/12/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), L. Callerio and others (A&M) re: intercompany process and balance overview	0.8
07/12/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), J. Koh and others (Ducera) re: liquidity and operations updates and business plan diligence items	0.7
07/12/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), L. Callerio and others (A&M) re: intercompany process and balance overview	0.8
07/16/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: revised July DIP budget	0.5
07/16/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: revised July DIP budget	0.5
07/16/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: revised July DIP budget	0.5
07/16/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: revised July DIP budget	0.5
07/16/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: revised July DIP budget	0.5
07/17/2024	DM	Review email from A. Antypas (Akin) re: draft agenda for meeting with EVA advisors	0.2
07/18/2024	DM	Attend meeting with P. Basta and A. Parlen (PW), C. Tempke (Lazard), P. Mosley and D. Shiffman (A&M), M. Genreux and J. Koh (Ducera), S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akjn) and D. MacGreevey and M. Cervi (AlixPartners) re: EVA case status and UCC diligence	0.9
07/18/2024	MC	Attend meeting with P. Basta and A. Parlen (PW), C. Tempke (Lazard), P. Mosley and D. Shiffman (A&M), M. Genreux and J. Koh (Ducera), S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akjn) and D. MacGreevey and M. Cervi (AlixPartners) re: EVA case status and UCC diligence	0.9
07/19/2024	DM	Attend meeting with D. Shiffman and K. Sohr (A&M) re: EVA liquidity and operations updates	0.3
07/25/2024	MC	Prepare agenda for A&M meeting	0.3
07/26/2024	MC	Prepare agenda for A&M meeting	0.4
07/31/2024	AV	Correspond with K. Sohr (A&M) re: DIP model questions	0.2
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>17.5</u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>		<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	4.1	\$	5,883.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	2.0		2,760.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	4.3		4,837.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	0.2		205.00
Scott Weiner	\$960	0.7		672.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	2.7		2,416.50
Thomas G Prince	\$880	0.8		704.00
Chase Hood	\$750	2.7		2,025.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>17.5</b>	<b>\$</b>	<b>19,503.50</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Liquidity and Cash Management  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.7

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/01/2024	AV	Review UCC liquidity presentation week ending 6/21	0.9
07/03/2024	AV	Review Vendor Negotiations Report (week ending 6.28.24)	0.3
07/08/2024	AV	Analyze DIP & liquidity variance report	2.3
07/08/2024	AV	Prepare for call with A&M re: weekly variance report	0.5
07/08/2024	AV	Review weekly DIP & liquidity variance report	0.6
07/08/2024	AV	Revise DIP and liquidity slide for week ending 6/28	2.6
07/08/2024	CH	Analyze liquidity and variance reporting materials received from Debtors	0.6
07/09/2024	AV	Prepare for call with Ducera re: liquidity at emergence and diligence tracker	0.5
07/10/2024	AV	Review email from Akin re: updated DIP milestones	0.2
07/11/2024	AV	Review email from Ducera re: updated DIP milestones	0.2
07/11/2024	AV	Review Vendor Payments Report (week ending 7.5.24)	0.5
07/12/2024	AV	Analyze DIP & liquidity variance report	2.4
07/12/2024	AV	Call with C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: liquidity update and latest variance reporting received from Debtors	0.3
07/12/2024	AV	Prepare for call with A&M re: liquidity questions	0.4
07/12/2024	AV	Review revised July DIP budget	1.0
07/12/2024	CH	Analyze latest variance and liquidity reporting received from Debtors	0.7
07/12/2024	CH	Call with C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: liquidity update and latest variance reporting received from Debtors	0.3
07/12/2024	CH	Review updated reporting on first day motion payments and trade agreements	0.5
07/12/2024	DM	Call with C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: liquidity update and latest variance reporting received from Debtors	0.3
07/12/2024	KBM	Call with C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: liquidity update and latest variance reporting received from Debtors	0.3
07/12/2024	KBM	Review weekly liquidity updates from the Debtors	0.8
07/12/2024	MC	Review customer trade agreement	0.2
07/12/2024	MC	Review debtors liquidity reporting	0.3
07/15/2024	AV	Analyze revised July DIP Budget re: bridge ending liquidity form prior budget	2.4
07/15/2024	AV	Continue to review revised July DIP budget	1.1
07/15/2024	AV	Review July DIP model re: updated assumptions	2.8
07/15/2024	CH	Analyze latest cash flow forecast, related assumptions and variances to prior forecast	1.7
07/16/2024	AV	Analyze ending case liquidity re: sensitized assumptions in the July budget	2.2
07/16/2024	AV	Prepare for call with A&M re: July DIP budget	0.7
07/16/2024	AV	Revise July DIP budget Analyze bridge of June to July budgets	2.1
07/16/2024	KBM	Review updated cash flow forecast	1.1
07/17/2024	AV	Analyze July DIP Budget re: MGT receipt and loan assumptions	0.9
07/17/2024	AV	Compare business plan model to July DIP budget re: professional fee assumptions	1.2
07/17/2024	AV	Draft to liquidity overview to inform debt capacity discussion with Ducera	1.8
07/18/2024	AV	Analyze July DIP model re: ship schedule and customer terms	1.3
07/18/2024	AV	Revise liquidity overview to inform debt capacity discussion with Ducera	1.4
07/18/2024	AV	Sensitize critical vendor spend July budget model	0.6
07/19/2024	AV	Analyze DIP & liquidity variance report	2.2
07/19/2024	AV	Prepare for call with A&M re: liquidity questions	0.2



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Liquidity and Cash Management  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.7

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/19/2024	AV	Call with D. MacGreevey, S. Weiner, M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: weekly liquidity and variance reporting materials received	0.3
07/19/2024	AV	Review weekly DIP and liquidity variance report	0.5
07/19/2024	CH	Analyze latest weekly liquidity and variance reporting package	0.6
07/19/2024	CH	Call with D. MacGreevey, S. Weiner, M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: weekly liquidity and variance reporting materials received	0.3
07/19/2024	\$0	Call with D. MacGreevey, S. Weiner, M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: weekly liquidity and variance reporting materials received	0.3
07/19/2024	DM	Review EVA DIP budget variance report week ended 7.12	0.3
07/19/2024	KBM	Call with D. MacGreevey, S. Weiner, M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: weekly liquidity and variance reporting materials received	0.3
07/19/2024	KBM	Review Debtors' weekly liquidity updates	0.8
07/19/2024	MC	Call with D. MacGreevey, S. Weiner, M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: weekly liquidity and variance reporting materials received	0.3
07/19/2024	SW	Call with D. MacGreevey, S. Weiner, M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: weekly liquidity and variance reporting materials received	0.3
07/22/2024	AV	Analyze July DIP budget re: Epes forecast	1.2
07/22/2024	AV	Analyze drivers and potential adjustments impacting ending cash liquidity	2.2
07/22/2024	AV	Continue to analyze drivers and potential adjustments impacting ending cash liquidity	0.9
07/23/2024	AV	Analyze July DIP Budget re: FDM forecast	1.2
07/23/2024	AV	Continue to analyze July DIP Budget re: MGT receipt and loan assumptions	1.7
07/23/2024	AV	Revise liquidity analysis banker exit fee calculations	1.4
07/24/2024	AV	Review AR Aging Schedule as of 7.12.24	0.4
07/24/2024	AV	Revise agenda for liquidity call with A&M	0.2
07/24/2024	AV	Revise liquidity Analyze updated AR Aging Schedule	0.8
07/24/2024	DL	Review materials shared from Ducera re: debt analysis for Debtors at emergence	0.8
07/26/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: liquidity, variance reporting and other operations updates	0.5
07/26/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: liquidity and variance reporting update	0.2
07/26/2024	AV	Prepare questions for DIP and liquidity call with A&M	0.4
07/26/2024	AV	Review DIP variance report through 7.19	0.6
07/26/2024	AV	Review Vendor Payments Report (week ending 7.19.2024)	0.3



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Liquidity and Cash Management  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.7

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/26/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: liquidity, variance reporting and other operations updates	0.5
07/26/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: liquidity and variance reporting update	0.2
07/26/2024	CH	Review latest cash variance and liquidity reporting package received from Debtors	0.6
07/26/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: liquidity, variance reporting and other operations updates	0.5
07/26/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: liquidity and variance reporting update	0.2
07/26/2024	KBM	Review Debtors' weekly liquidity updates	0.7
07/26/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: liquidity, variance reporting and other operations updates	0.5
07/26/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: liquidity and variance reporting update	0.2
07/26/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera), K. Burgers and others (Hirschler), Committee Members (UCC) re: liquidity and variance reporting update	0.2
07/29/2024	AV	Analyze DIP & liquidity variance report	2.1
07/30/2024	AV	Analyze July DIP Budget re: receipts and demurrage calculation in forecast period	1.4
07/30/2024	AV	Revise end of case liquidity analysis banker fee assumptions	0.8
07/30/2024	AV	Revise end of case liquidity analysis MGT assumptions	1.7
07/31/2024	AV	Revise liquidity Analyze forecasted receipts fees estimates	0.9
07/31/2024	KBM	Review new trade agreements with critical vendors	0.3
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>68.0</u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Liquidity and Cash Management  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.7

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	0.9	\$ 1,291.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	5.0	6,900.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	1.5	1,687.50
Scott Weiner	\$960	0.3	288.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	53.3	47,703.50
Thomas G Prince	\$880	0.2	176.00
Chase Hood	\$750	6.0	4,500.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$750	0.8	600.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>68.0</b>	<b>\$ 63,146.50</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

DATE	PROFESSIONAL	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
07/01/2024	AV	Analyze FMI data re: key industry metrics and forecast	0.6
07/01/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: emergence capital structure and plan issues	0.4
07/01/2024	AV	Prepare for internal call re: emergence capital structure and plan issues	0.6
07/01/2024	AV	Review A&M responses to business plan diligence questions	2.2
07/01/2024	AV	Review Epes quarterly update June 2024	1.1
07/01/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: emergence capital structure and plan issues	0.4
07/01/2024	DH	Participate in call with D. Hindman, M. Cowen, and S. Gullapalli re: contract workstream	0.5
07/01/2024	DH	Analysis of Enviva business plan for discussion with internal team	2.5
07/01/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: emergence capital structure and plan issues	0.4
07/01/2024	EB	Call with M. Cowen, E. Bruttomesso (AlixPartners) re: analyzing latest business plan model	0.4
07/01/2024	EB	Create slides based on analysis of plant usage and capex	2.1
07/01/2024	EB	Review and analysis of plant capacity	3.6
07/01/2024	EB	Analyze plant capacity in EVA model	2.0
07/01/2024	EB	Review Enviva initial business plan	0.8
07/01/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: emergence capital structure and plan issues	0.4
07/01/2024	MC	Review customer contracts included in business plan	0.4
07/01/2024	MC	Review debtor responses to business plan diligence questions	1.8
07/01/2024	MC	Review draft analysis of analysis of capex spend in business plan slides	0.6
07/01/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	2.5
07/01/2024	RMC	Participate in call with D. Hindman, M. Cowen, and S. Gullapalli re: contract workstream	0.5
07/01/2024	RMC	Analyze Epes file	0.6
07/01/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cowen, E. Bruttomesso (AlixPartners) re: analyzing latest business plan model	0.4
07/01/2024	RMC	Revise customer contracts analysis	2.6
07/01/2024	MDG	Participate in call with D. Hindman, M. Cowen, and S. Gullapalli re: contract workstream	0.5
07/01/2024	MDG	Review Debtors' responses to business plan due diligence questions	0.7
07/02/2024	AV	Continue to analyze FMI data re: key industry metrics and forecast	2.6
07/02/2024	AV	Prepare for call with Ducera re: business plan & valuation	0.4
07/02/2024	AV	Review internal analysis plant production and capex	0.6
07/02/2024	EB	Review and analysis of Enviva supply/demand overview and market intelligence.	1.5
07/02/2024	EB	Review and analysis of market intelligence and comparison with EVA model	1.6
07/02/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	2.1
07/02/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	2.5
07/02/2024	RMC	Analyze key metrics for market sales vs offtake contracts within latest business plan model	1.9
07/03/2024	EB	Review and comparison of EVA model and plant & port supplemental detail	2.6
07/03/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	2.2





Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/03/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for pricing impact within offtake contracts	2.6
07/03/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	3.0
07/08/2024	AV	Call with A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: business plan workstreams and open items	0.2
07/08/2024	AV	Review business plan diligence tracker re: open items	0.6
07/08/2024	AV	Revise IEA industry data slide for business plan deck	0.8
07/08/2024	KBM	Review business plan diligence updates	0.6
07/08/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	1.7
07/08/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for pricing impact within offtake contracts and market sales	2.5
07/08/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	3.0
07/08/2024	SW	Call with A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: business plan workstreams and open items	0.2
07/09/2024	AV	Analyze industry report re: projected industry value and growth	1.3
07/09/2024	AV	Email to A&M team re: Business Plan diligence tracker	0.1
07/09/2024	AV	Review customer contract status update from A&M	0.3
07/09/2024	AV	Review interim business plan model	1.2
07/09/2024	AV	Review plant liquidation analysis	0.6
07/09/2024	AV	Revise diligence tracker re: data requests	0.4
07/09/2024	CH	Analyze offtake contracts and map to legal entity	0.6
07/09/2024	MC	Review updated business plan diligence listing	0.5
07/09/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	2.0
07/09/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for pricing impact within offtake contracts and market sales	1.9
07/09/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for impact of plant closures	2.3
07/09/2024	RMC	Meeting with M. Cowen, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: reviewing latest business plan model	1.1
07/09/2024	SW	Meeting with M. Cowen, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: reviewing latest business plan model	1.1
07/09/2024	SW	Review and provide comments on price/volume sensitivity analysis provided by M. Cowen (AlixPartners)	2.1
07/09/2024	SW	Review and update business plan diligence request list	1.2
07/10/2024	AV	Review new filings re: extension of deadline to assume or reject leases	0.3
07/10/2024	DH	Analysis of Enviva business plan for additional discussions with internal team	2.0
07/10/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	1.9
07/10/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	2.4
07/10/2024	RMC	Analyze contract bonuses within latest business plan model	0.5
07/12/2024	AV	Review 7/10/2024 Epes weekly internal update	1.3
07/12/2024	AV	Review Hawkins Wright 4Q24 report	2.6
07/12/2024	CH	Review Epes construction update report	0.3
07/12/2024	CH	Review wood pellet industry supply and demand outlook report	1.6
07/12/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cowen, R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: reviewing latest solvency analysis slides	0.3
07/12/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cowen, R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: reviewing latest solvency analysis slides	0.3



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

DATE	PROFESSIONAL	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
07/15/2024	MC	Analyze business plan model for price adjustments	0.6
07/16/2024	DM	Emails with M. Cervi re: EVA business plan diligence debrief	0.2
07/17/2024	AV	Revise diligence tracker re: professional fee assumptions in business plan model	0.4
07/17/2024	DM	Review emails from S. Gullapalli re: analysis of EVA business plan	0.3
07/17/2024	MC	Review analysis of NCV quality bonuses	0.8
07/18/2024	AV	Review email from A&M re: Bond purchase price and capital spend	0.3
07/18/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	2.8
07/18/2024	RMC	Revise customer contracts analysis	2.0
07/18/2024	SW	Review updated diligence tracker	1.3
07/19/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: analysis of the Debtors' debt capacity	0.5
07/19/2024	AV	Review 7/17/2024 Epes weekly internal update	0.5
07/19/2024	AV	Review uploads to dataroom re: Epes contracts and other documents	1.7
07/19/2024	AV	Revise diligence tracker re: recent uploads to data room	0.3
07/19/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: analysis of the Debtors' debt capacity	0.5
07/19/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: analysis of the Debtors' debt capacity	0.5
07/19/2024	KBM	Review Debtors' updates to contract assumptions and rejections	1.1
07/19/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: analysis of the Debtors' debt capacity	0.5
07/19/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	2.2
07/19/2024	RMC	Update Epes analysis slides	0.9
07/19/2024	SW	Assess information provided by A&M re: Bond project relative to public filings and information provided in VDR	1.8
07/19/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: analysis of the Debtors' debt capacity	0.5
07/19/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), T. Hatfield and others (Ducera) re: analysis of the Debtors' debt capacity	0.5
07/22/2024	AV	Review dataroom for detailed budget of Epes through completion	0.6
07/22/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	0.9
07/22/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	3.0
07/22/2024	RMC	Update customer contracts analysis	2.1
07/23/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	0.4
07/23/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	1.3
07/23/2024	RMC	Analyze key metrics for market sales vs offtake contracts within latest business plan model	2.8
07/23/2024	RMC	Research trends in lumber prices vs CPI	1.3
07/23/2024	RMC	Update customer contracts analysis slides	1.0



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/24/2024	KBM	Review value allocation presentation	0.6
07/24/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	1.7
07/24/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	2.4
07/24/2024	RMC	Update customer contracts analysis slides	1.9
07/25/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	1.8
07/25/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	2.0
07/25/2024	RMC	Revise customer contracts analysis slides	1.2
07/25/2024	RMC	Update Epes analysis slides	0.6
07/26/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model file for Epes impact	0.5
07/26/2024	RMC	Revise customer contracts analysis slides	1.1
07/26/2024	RMC	Update customer contracts analysis	1.6
07/26/2024	RMC	Update Epes analysis slides	2.3
07/29/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for Epes impact	1.0
07/29/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	2.4
07/29/2024	RMC	Analyze key metrics for market sales vs offtake contracts within latest business plan model	0.6
07/29/2024	RMC	Create plant closure impact slides	2.1
07/29/2024	RMC	Update Epes analysis slides	1.3
07/30/2024	RMC	Analyze business plan model for plant impact	1.5
07/31/2024	SW	Review additional Epes construction contracts	1.4
07/31/2024	SW	Review Volta/Irondale Epes construction contracts	1.8
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u><u>155.4</u></u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	1.4	\$ 2,009.00
David Hindman	\$1,410	5.0	7,050.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	2.8	3,864.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	5.6	6,300.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	1.2	1,230.00
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	0.3	288.00
Scott Weiner	\$960	11.4	10,944.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	22.5	20,137.50
Thomas G Prince	\$880	0.5	440.00
Elizabeth Bruttomesso	\$770	14.6	11,242.00
Chase Hood	\$750	2.9	2,175.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$750	87.2	65,400.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>155.4</b>	<b>\$ 131,079.50</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Employee Compensation and Advisor Retention Matters  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.10

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/02/2024	DM	Review Memorandum Opinion and Order denying V&E retention application	0.3
07/02/2024	MDG	Review order re: motion to reconsider V&E retention	0.4
07/31/2024	AV	Review PW and V&E retention applications re: future work streams and accrued fees	0.8
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>1.5</u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Employee Compensation and Advisor Retention Matters  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.10

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	0.3	\$ 430.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	0.4	410.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	0.8	716.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<u><b>1.5</b></u>	<u><b>\$ 1,556.50</b></u>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Financial and Other Diligence  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.11

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/01/2024	RMC	Perform substantive analysis on new VDR files	1.1
07/01/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.4
07/01/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.3
07/02/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	1.4
07/03/2024	AV	Review docket re: recent filings	0.3
07/03/2024	RMC	Perform substantive analysis on new VDR files	0.5
07/03/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.4
07/03/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
07/08/2024	AV	Review dataroom re: new uploads	0.3
07/08/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	1.1
07/09/2024	AV	Review docket re: new filings	0.3
07/09/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.2
07/10/2024	AV	Continue to draft diligence tracker re: comparing A&M diligence tracker	2.0
07/10/2024	AV	Draft updates to diligence tracker to incorporate all open items and recent VDR uploads	2.7
07/10/2024	KBM	Review updates to outstanding diligence list items	0.9
07/10/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	1.6
07/11/2024	MC	Review draft updated diligence listing for Akin	0.4
07/11/2024	RMC	Perform substantive analysis on new VDR files	0.4
07/11/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.2
07/11/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
07/12/2024	AV	Revise diligence tracker re: comments received from Ducera and Akin	0.9
07/12/2024	AV	Revise diligence tracker re: new documents received from A&M	0.3
07/12/2024	RMC	Perform substantive analysis on new VDR files	1.0
07/12/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	2.3
07/12/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.4
07/15/2024	AV	Revise diligence tracker re: intercompany requests	1.2
07/16/2024	AV	Revise diligence tracker re: comments from A. Antypas	0.6
07/18/2024	AV	Revise diligence tracker re: information received from Debtors	0.2
07/18/2024	RMC	Analyze files recently uploaded to the VDR	0.5
07/18/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	3.0
07/18/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
07/19/2024	RMC	Perform substantive analysis on new VDR files	1.4
07/19/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	2.8
07/19/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.4
07/19/2024	TGP	Review documents recently uploaded to virtual data room	1.2
07/22/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	2.3
07/23/2024	AV	Review docket re: recent filings	0.4
07/23/2024	AV	Review updated Akin diligence document re: litigation requests	1.5
07/23/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	1.2
07/24/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.3
07/25/2024	RMC	Perform substantive analysis on new VDR files	1.1
07/25/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
07/25/2024	TGP	Review documents recently uploaded to virtual data room	1.1
07/26/2024	RMC	Analyze files recently uploaded to the VDR	1.6



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Financial and Other Diligence  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.11

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/26/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.2
07/26/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.4
07/30/2024	AV	Review docket re: recent filings	0.3
07/30/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	2.2
07/31/2024	AV	Review online dataroom re: recent uploads	0.6
07/31/2024	RMC	Perform substantive analysis on new VDR files	0.6
07/31/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.7
07/31/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>46.2</u></b>





Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Financial and Other Diligence  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.11

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	0.9	\$ 1,242.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	0.4	450.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	11.6	10,382.00
Thomas G Prince	\$880	2.3	2,024.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$750	31.0	23,250.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>46.2</b>	<b>\$ 37,348.00</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Other Motions and Related Objections  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.12

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/01/2024	MC	Draft email related to comment on contracts to be rejected	0.4
07/23/2024	MC	Draft email related to John Hancock motion	0.1
07/23/2024	MC	Review John Hancock lift stay motion	1.1
07/24/2024	DM	Review 7.23 email with attachment from A. Antypas (Akin) re: John Hancock lift stay motion	0.7
07/24/2024	KBM	Review Hancock relief from stay motion	0.7
07/24/2024	TGP	Review John Hancock lift stay motion	0.4
07/25/2024	MC	Draft summary of status of John Hancock lift stay motion discussion	0.3
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<u><u>3.7</u></u>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Other Motions and Related Objections  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.12

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	0.7	\$ 1,004.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	0.7	966.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	1.9	2,137.50
Thomas G Prince	\$880	0.4	352.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<u>3.7</u>	<u>\$ 4,460.00</u>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/01/2024	DPK	Conduct document review	2.5
07/01/2024	IE	Summarize analyst reports between February and June of 2023	2.2
07/01/2024	LH	Review litigation filings	2.3
07/01/2024	RC	Review financial information provided in response to initial diligence requests.	1.3
07/02/2024	RHK	Call with R. Komendowski, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: status of ongoing investigation and next steps	0.2
07/02/2024	TGP	Call with R. Komendowski, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: status of ongoing investigation and next steps	0.2
07/03/2024	DPK	Prepare list of meeting minutes and categorize minutes with type of minutes and the dates of the meeting	2.3
07/05/2024	RHK	Document observations of documents produced in relativity.	2.4
07/05/2024	RHK	Review audit committee minutes produced in relativity.	2.0
07/05/2024	RHK	Review board minutes produced in relativity.	2.6
07/05/2024	RHK	Review documents produced by counsel.	3.0
07/06/2024	RHK	Document observations of documents produced in relativity.	1.7
07/08/2024	MC	Review 2004 production documents	3.2
07/08/2024	RC	Update summary of discovery provided to date in response to requests from counsel.	0.8
07/08/2024	RHK	Prepare documentation for documents received in relativity.	1.0
07/09/2024	MC	Review 2004 production documents	2.4
07/09/2024	RC	Review due diligence materials provided by Enviva.	1.4
07/09/2024	RHK	Document observations of 2004 production.	2.4
07/09/2024	RHK	Review 2004 document production in relativity.	3.0
07/09/2024	RHK	Review additional documents produced in relativity.	1.0
07/10/2024	CH	Review Baker Botts preliminary findings from EVA investigation	0.4
07/10/2024	MC	Review 2004 production documents	2.8
07/10/2024	RC	Review and analysis of financial information provided in response to diligence requests.	0.8
07/10/2024	RHK	Document observations of key files identified in the 2004 production.	1.4
07/10/2024	RHK	Review additional documents produced in relativity.	2.4
07/11/2024	JM	Reviewing and analyzing SEC filings for inflow transactions for investigation	2.8
07/11/2024	MC	Review 2004 production documents	2.7
07/11/2024	RC	Review and update summary of latest round of discovery received from the Debtors.	1.3
07/12/2024	DK	Prepare analysis re prepetition analysis	1.2
07/12/2024	RC	Review preliminary observations re: recent discovery provided by the Debtors.	0.4
07/14/2024	RHK	Review historical board minutes.	1.3
07/15/2024	CH	Research re: prepetition transactions	1.2
07/15/2024	DL	Review changes to intercompany payables balances and tabs for accuracy within waterfall model prior to meeting with Akin and Ducera	0.7
07/15/2024	DK	Prepare analysis related to solvency	0.2
07/15/2024	JM	Review and analyze inflows/outflows	2.8
07/15/2024	JM	Reviewing and analyzing valuation analysis report for investigation	2.6
07/16/2024	RC	Review and analysis of public filings and update work plan.	1.3
07/16/2024	RC	Review diligence materials provided in response to valuation requests.	1.1



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/17/2024	LH	Analyze equity offerings	2.5
07/17/2024	RC	Review initial financial analysis related to valuation and solvency.	1.6
07/17/2024	TGP	Research re: cash inflows and outflows	0.8
07/17/2024	TGP	Research re: the Debtors' historical financial performance	2.1
07/18/2024	DK	Prepare analysis related to solvency	1.8
07/18/2024	JM	Review drop down analysis for investigation	0.4
07/18/2024	RC	Call with R. Komendowski and R. Collura (AlixPartners) to discuss responses to requests from Akin re: outstanding discovery.	0.2
07/18/2024	RC	Review diligence materials and prepare responses to requests from Akin re: prepetition transactions.	0.3
07/18/2024	RC	Review information related to the drop-down transactions.	0.6
07/18/2024	RHK	Call with R. Komendowski and R. Collura (AlixPartners) to discuss responses to requests from Akin re: outstanding discovery.	0.2
07/19/2024	DK	Analysis related to solvency	3.0
07/19/2024	DK	Continue to analysis related to solvency	1.0
07/19/2024	DPK	Delve into the characteristics and details of a major merger transaction	2.9
07/19/2024	DPK	Continue to delve into the characteristics and details of the merger	1.5
07/19/2024	RC	Review financial statement disclosures related to the Simplification and Drop-down transactions.	1.4
07/20/2024	DPK	Review pre-insolvency merger agreements.	2.6
07/20/2024	DPK	Continue to review pre-petition merger agreements	2.6
07/21/2024	DK	Analysis related to simplification transaction	3.0
07/21/2024	DK	Continue analysis related to simplification transaction	0.8
07/21/2024	DPK	Compile pre-liquidation merger agreements	0.8
07/22/2024	CC	Review 10-K and research related to dropdown transactions	2.1
07/22/2024	DK	Analysis related to simplification transaction	3.0
07/22/2024	DK	Analysis related to simplification transaction	1.6
07/22/2024	LH	Review draft 2004 filing	2.2
07/22/2024	MC	Comment on second draft UCC 2004 production request	1.4
07/22/2024	RC	Review and comment of financial liquidity analysis.	1.4
07/22/2024	RC	Review draft 2004 discovery requests.	0.4
07/22/2024	RC	Review materials provided by Baker Botts re: investigation.	1.3
07/22/2024	RHK	Document findings from 2004 production.	1.3
07/22/2024	RHK	Review 2004 document production.	2.0
07/22/2024	RHK	Review documents provided through discovery.	2.7
07/23/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), P. DaSilva, D. Slemmer, D. Giller, N. Lombardi (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.8
07/23/2024	CC	Review 10-K and research related to dropdown transactions	1.9
07/24/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), P. DaSilva, D. Slemmer, D. Giller, N. Lombardi (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.8
07/23/2024	CC	Review relativity docket for drop down documentation	1.2



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/23/2024	DM	Attend meeting with W. Clareman, T. McRoberts and J. Prince (Baker Botts), A. Luft, A. Qureshi and J. Rubin (Akin), R. Komendowski and R. Collura re: Baker Botts preliminary findings from EVA investigation	1.4
07/23/2024	DK	Analysis related to prepetition transactions	3.0
07/23/2024	DK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), P. DaSilva, D. Slemmer, D. Giller, N. Lombardi (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.8
07/23/2024	KBM	Review updates to Rule 2004 request list	0.9
07/23/2024	LH	Analyze diligence requests	2.2
07/23/2024	LH	Revisions to draft 2004	2.3
07/23/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), P. DaSilva, D. Slemmer, D. Giller, N. Lombardi (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.8
07/23/2024	MC	Review second draft UCC 2004 production request	1.7
07/23/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), P. DaSilva, D. Slemmer, D. Giller, N. Lombardi (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.8
07/23/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, D. MacGreevey and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners), A. Querishi and D. Giller (Akin) and J Prince and K. Clarke (Baker Botts) to discuss Special Committee investigation.	1.4
07/23/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) to discuss diligence request updates.	0.3
07/23/2024	RC	Review materials related to valuation and solvency analysis.	1.2
07/23/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), P. DaSilva, D. Slemmer, D. Giller, N. Lombardi (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.8
07/23/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) to discuss diligence request updates.	0.3
07/23/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura, D. MacGreevey and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners), A. Querishi and D. Giller (Akin) and J Prince and K. Clarke (Baker Botts) to discuss Special Committee investigation.	1.4
07/23/2024	RHK	Review 2004 document production.	2.4
07/23/2024	RHK	Review documents provided through discovery.	3.0
07/23/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), P. DaSilva, D. Slemmer, D. Giller, N. Lombardi (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.8
07/24/2024	AV	Compare litigation request to business plan requests for duplicates	1.3
07/24/2024	CC	Document dropdown transaction information from public earnings transcripts (2016-2019)	2.8
07/24/2024	CC	Document dropdown transaction information from public earnings transcripts (2019 onwards)	1.1
07/24/2024	CC	Review relativity docket for drop down documentation	1.5
07/24/2024	DK	Analysis related to simplification transaction	1.2
07/24/2024	RC	Review and comment on preliminary valuation and solvency analysis.	1.3
07/24/2024	RC	Review and provide comments to draft 2004 discovery requests.	0.6



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/25/2024	CC	Aggregate data on dropdown transactions from public filings and news	1.6
07/25/2024	CC	Incorporate EV/EBITDA multiples into dropdown analysis	1.7
07/25/2024	CC	Review wall street research on MLPs and dropdowns	2.2
07/25/2024	DK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), D. Slemmer, A. Qureshi, A. Luft, D. Giller, J. Rubin, M. Myatt, N. Lombardi, P. DaSilva (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	1.2
07/25/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), D. Slemmer, A. Qureshi, A. Luft, D. Giller, J. Rubin, M. Myatt, N. Lombardi, P. DaSilva (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	1.2
07/25/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), D. Slemmer, A. Qureshi, A. Luft, D. Giller, J. Rubin, M. Myatt, N. Lombardi, P. DaSilva (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	1.2
07/25/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) to prepare for call with counsel to discuss status of investigation.	0.6
07/25/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), D. Slemmer, A. Qureshi, A. Luft, D. Giller, J. Rubin, M. Myatt, N. Lombardi, P. DaSilva (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	1.2
07/25/2024	RC	Update investigation materials re: valuation and solvency analysis.	1.7
07/25/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, R. Komendowski, K. McGlynn, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), D. Slemmer, A. Qureshi, A. Luft, D. Giller, J. Rubin, M. Myatt, N. Lombardi, P. DaSilva (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	1.2
07/25/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) to prepare for call with counsel to discuss status of investigation.	0.6
07/25/2024	RHK	Review drop-down transaction documentation provided in discovery.	1.8
07/26/2024	CC	Research EV/EBITDA multiples from midstream and refining sectors for comparables analysis	2.3
07/26/2024	CC	Review board minutes for information on dropdown transactions	0.7
07/26/2024	DK	Research re: solvency	1.3
07/26/2024	MC	Review 2004 production documents	0.9
07/26/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners), A. Querishi and D. Giller (Akin) and J Prince and K. Clarke (Baker Botts) to discuss Special Committee investigation.	1.6
07/26/2024	RC	Review information related to the Debtors' insurance policies and communicate with counsel.	0.3
07/26/2024	RC	Review valuation and solvency materials and provide comments.	1.2
07/26/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners), A. Querishi and D. Giller (Akin) and J Prince and K. Clarke (Baker Botts) to discuss Special Committee investigation.	1.6
07/26/2024	RHK	Review 2004 document production.	1.2
07/26/2024	RHK	Review liquidity documentation in the production.	2.8



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/29/2024	LH	Analyze dividends	1.5
07/29/2024	MC	Review 2004 production documents	1.6
07/29/2024	RC	Review and comment on initial draft solvency materials.	1.6
07/29/2024	RC	Review draft summary observations re: valuation information.	0.8
07/29/2024	RC	Review materials provided by Baker Botts re: the special committee's investigation.	1.3
07/29/2024	RC	Review materials provided in the Debtors' data room re: investigation topics.	0.9
07/29/2024	RHK	Review 2004 document production for responsive financial projection documentation.	1.6
07/30/2024	AV	Review revised UCC 2004 diligence list	0.9
07/30/2024	CC	Conduct search for dropdown transactions pursuant to latest date upload	1.5
07/30/2024	DM	Discussion with D. MacGreevey and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: Baker Botts investigation	0.5
07/30/2024	DK	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.5
07/30/2024	DK	Call with R. Komendowski, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.2
07/30/2024	DK	Review research re: investigation	1.0
07/30/2024	DPK	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.5
07/30/2024	DPK	Call with R. Komendowski, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.2
07/30/2024	DPK	Review financial document to understand the financial transaction, and culled files relevant to the transaction	2.2
07/30/2024	LH	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.5
07/30/2024	RMC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.5
07/30/2024	RMC	Perform liquidity-related document search of recently uploaded 2004-005 investigation files	3.0
07/30/2024	RMC	Perform liquidity-related document search of recently uploaded 2004-006 investigation files	0.8
07/30/2024	RMC	Perform liquidity-related document search of recently uploaded 2004-007 investigation files	0.9
07/30/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps.	0.5
07/30/2024	RC	Review and comment on updated draft 2004 discovery requests.	1.1
07/30/2024	RC	Review latest discovery materials produced by Baker Botts.	1.2
07/30/2024	RC	Review presentations materials provided by Baker Botts.	0.8





Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/30/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.5
07/30/2024	RHK	Call with R. Komendowski, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.2
07/30/2024	RHK	Discussion with D. MacGreevey and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: Baker Botts investigation	0.5
07/30/2024	TGP	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, Di. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	0.5
07/31/2024	CC	Aggregate press release information on dropdown transactions	2.8
07/31/2024	CC	Continue to aggregate press release information on dropdown transactions	0.8
07/31/2024	CC	Review database for relevant discovery documents re: dropdowns	1.7
07/31/2024	CC	Review dropdown valuation analysis	0.7
07/31/2024	DK	Call with R. Collura, R. Komendowski and D. Kapadia (AlixPartners) and D. Giller and others (Akin), to discuss status of discovery requests and latest productions received.	1.2
07/31/2024	DK	Review research re: investigation	0.8
07/31/2024	DPK	Conduct document review to collate information on a significant transaction	2.3
07/31/2024	KBM	Review investigation related updates	0.3
07/31/2024	LH	Analyze equity offerings	2.7
07/31/2024	LH	Analyze equity offerings	2.6
07/31/2024	LH	Analyze pre-petition transactions	2.9
07/31/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cowen, R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: aligning on investigation workstream and next steps	0.2
07/31/2024	RMC	Perform liquidity-related document search of recently uploaded 2004-005 investigation files	3.0
07/31/2024	RMC	Perform liquidity-related document search of recently uploaded 2004-006 investigation files	2.4
07/31/2024	RMC	Perform liquidity-related document search of recently uploaded 2004-007 investigation files	1.7
07/31/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, R. Komendowski and D. Kapadia (AlixPartners) and D. Giller and others (Akin), to discuss status of discovery requests and latest productions received.	1.2
07/31/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) to discuss market cap and stock price analysis.	0.6
07/31/2024	RC	Review board materials and update discovery tracker.	0.8
07/31/2024	RC	Review information related to insurance policies in response to requests from counsel.	0.5
07/31/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura, R. Komendowski, D. Kapadia (AlixPartners), D. Giller, N. Lombardi, M. Myatt, D. Slemmer (Akin) re: investigation workstream, priority tasks, next steps	1.2
07/31/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cowen, R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: aligning on investigation workstream and next steps	0.2



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/31/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) to discuss market cap and stock price analysis.	0.6
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<u><u>243.9</u></u>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	1.9	\$ 2,726.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	2.4	3,312.00
Richard Collura	\$1,320	39.1	51,612.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	18.7	21,037.50
Loring Hill	\$960	21.7	20,832.00
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	52.5	50,400.00
Scott Weiner	\$960	0.8	768.00
Dhwani Kapadia	\$895	26.8	23,986.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	3.0	2,685.00
John Moskal	\$880	8.6	7,568.00
Christopher Cuomo	\$880	27.4	24,112.00
Ivan Esteban	\$825	2.2	1,815.00
Thomas G Prince	\$880	3.6	3,168.00
Chase Hood	\$750	1.6	1,200.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$750	0.7	525.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$750	12.5	9,375.00
Disha Pareshkumar Kapadia	\$555	20.4	11,322.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>243.9</b>	<b>\$ 236,444.00</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Claims Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.14

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/01/2024	AV	Review claims register re: large filed proofs	0.6
07/01/2024	AV	Review draft of claims analysis presentation	0.8
07/01/2024	DM	Emails with attachment with J. Rubin (Akin) and M. Cervi re: EVA contract rejections	0.3
07/01/2024	MC	Review draft claims analysis	0.8
07/03/2024	MDG	Review impact of first day motions on claims	1.5
07/05/2024	MDG	Update claims analysis to reflect payments under first day motions	2.5
07/06/2024	MDG	Review updated claims analysis and provide direction to D. Lo Presti re: further update of claims presentation	0.7
07/07/2024	MDG	Review updated claims presentation	0.7
07/09/2024	MC	Review draft claims analysis	0.7
07/10/2024	KBM	Review updates to waterfall analysis	0.6
07/12/2024	KBM	Review intercompany claims analysis provided by the Debtors	1.9
07/15/2024	MDG	Review Debtors' presentation on intercompany claims	0.8
07/15/2024	MDG	Review updated claim register provided by Debtors	0.6
07/16/2024	MDG	Review updated claims file provided by A&M	0.5
07/17/2024	DL	Review new claims register provided by claims agent	0.7
07/17/2024	JH	Meet with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, J. Horgan (AlixPartners) re: intercompany claims diligence questions	0.3
07/17/2024	JH	Prepare list of intercompany claims diligence questions for discussion with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi (AlixPartners)	0.7
07/17/2024	MDG	Review claims file for updating of intercompany claims	0.6
07/17/2024	TGP	Analyze potential contract rejection claims	0.9
07/18/2024	DL	Revise claims data to include newly filed claims and replace old intercompany balances with new data from Debtors	3.0
07/18/2024	KBM	Review updates to claims analysis	0.4
07/19/2024	DL	Perform quality check on claims data after adding new claims and amending intercompany claims per new information provided by Debtors	2.3
07/19/2024	KBM	Review updates to potential rejection damages	0.4
07/22/2024	CH	Preparation of convenience class template model	1.9
07/22/2024	KBM	Review updates to claims analyses	0.9
07/22/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' claim register	2.1
07/23/2024	CH	Draft convenience class analysis and sensitivities	2.2
07/23/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative costs of a potential convenience class	0.9
07/23/2024	TGP	Review updates made to convenience class model	0.7
07/24/2024	CH	Draft updates to claims data to be used in convenience class analysis	1.4
07/24/2024	CH	Draft updates to convenience class analysis to incorporate internal comments	1.6
07/24/2024	DL	Call with M. Gates, D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) re: changes to initial claims analysis presentation	0.3
07/24/2024	DL	Update claims analysis for new data received from Debtors	0.8
07/24/2024	KBM	Review updates to rejection damages	0.4
07/24/2024	MDG	Call with M. Gates, D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) re: changes to initial claims analysis presentation	0.3
07/24/2024	TGP	Provide comments to summary slides of convenience class analysis	0.3
07/24/2024	TGP	Review summary slides of convenience class analysis	0.4



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Claims Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.14

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/25/2024	CH	Draft discussion materials for Committee re: convenience class analysis	2.4
07/25/2024	DL	Prepare claims analysis by box at the request of counsel	2.6
07/25/2024	DL	Revise claims analysis by box at the request of AlixPartners team members	2.5
07/25/2024	MC	Review convenience class draft slides	0.8
07/25/2024	MDG	Download claims analysis and presentation provided by A&M and begin review.	1.0
07/26/2024	CH	Review claims detail analysis prepared by Debtors	1.1
07/26/2024	DL	Call with M. Gates, D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) re: review of Debtors claims analysis	0.2
07/26/2024	DL	Review claims analysis shared by Debtors and reconcile to AlixPartners claims analysis	3.3
07/26/2024	MDG	Analyze claims data and presentation provided by A&M	2.5
07/26/2024	MDG	Call with M. Gates, D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) re: review of Debtors claims analysis	0.2
07/26/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative costs of a potential convenience class	1.1
07/29/2024	CH	Update convenience class analysis for revised claims data	1.2
07/29/2024	KBM	Review claims analysis presentation	0.6
07/29/2024	KBM	Review updated claims analysis presentation	0.9
07/29/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' claim register	1.2
07/30/2024	CH	Prepare additional scenarios for convenience class analysis	1.4
07/30/2024	MDG	Review claims files provided by A&M to create bridge to internal AlixPartners claim file	1.5
07/31/2024	DL	Review potential contract rejection claims and items still outstanding	0.5
07/31/2024	KBM	Review updated claims analysis	0.4
07/31/2024	MDG	Review claims file provided by A&M and prepare questions	1.0
07/31/2024	MDG	Review claims related to customers	2.0
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>64.9</u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Claims Analysis  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.14

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	0.3	\$ 430.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	6.5	8,970.00
James Horgan	\$1,200	1.0	1,200.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	2.3	2,587.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	16.4	16,810.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	1.4	1,253.00
Thomas G Prince	\$880	7.6	6,688.00
Chase Hood	\$750	13.2	9,900.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$750	16.2	12,150.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>64.9</b>	<b>\$ 59,989.00</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Valuation and Solvency Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.15

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/06/2024	RHK	Prepared historical solvency analyses from documents produced.	1.6
07/10/2024	RMC	Research relevant documents for solvency analysis	2.5
07/10/2024	RHK	Review liquidity documents produced in relativity.	2.2
07/10/2024	RHK	Review 2004 documents produced for solvency analysis.	2.6
07/11/2024	RMC	Analyze solvency assessment documents	2.8
07/11/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cowen, R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: reviewing latest solvency analysis data	0.5
07/11/2024	RMC	Compile solvency assessment data	1.7
07/11/2024	RMC	Create first draft of solvency assessment slides	2.5
07/11/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cowen, R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: reviewing latest solvency analysis data	0.5
07/11/2024	RHK	Review documents provided for historical solvency review.	2.3
07/12/2024	RMC	Analyze solvency assessment data	1.8
07/12/2024	RMC	Revise solvency assessment slides	3.0
07/12/2024	RHK	Review documents provided in relativity for historical transaction review.	2.2
07/14/2024	RHK	Review documents provided in relativity for historical transaction review.	3.0
07/15/2024	RHK	Call with R. Komendowski, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: solvency analyses, priority tasks, and next steps	0.8
07/15/2024	RHK	Review historical board minutes for liquidity assessment.	1.7
07/15/2024	TGP	Call with R. Komendowski, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: solvency analyses, priority tasks, and next steps	0.8
07/15/2024	TGP	Quality review draft preliminary solvency observations presentation	1.8
07/15/2024	TGP	Research re: the Debtors' historical financial performance	2.3
07/16/2024	CH	Research historic quarterly and annual public filings re: inflows and outflows	2.1
07/16/2024	CH	Research related to unencumbered asset values	0.9
07/16/2024	CH	Review and draft updates to solvency analysis	0.8
07/16/2024	RHK	Call with R. Komendowski, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: solvency analyses, related presentation slides, and next steps	0.2
07/16/2024	RHK	Review December 2022 liquidity analysis.	2.1
07/16/2024	TGP	Call with R. Komendowski, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: solvency analyses, related presentation slides, and next steps	0.2
07/16/2024	TGP	Provide comments to draft preliminary solvency observations presentation	0.7
07/16/2024	TGP	Research re: cash inflows and outflows	1.9
07/16/2024	TGP	Update the draft preliminary solvency observations presentation	0.6
07/17/2024	MJB	Conduct investigation	0.4
07/17/2024	RHK	Review historical liquidity analysis.	1.7
07/18/2024	RHK	Review 2022 and 2023 board minutes for solvency analysis.	2.6
07/18/2024	RHK	Review historical liquidity analysis for 2022.	2.9
07/19/2024	RHK	Review 2022 and 2023 board minutes for solvency analysis.	2.7
07/23/2024	RHK	Preparation of historical liquidity analyses.	2.7
07/24/2024	DK	Research re: solvency	2.0
07/24/2024	MJB	Conduct solvency investigation	0.4
07/24/2024	RHK	Preparation of historical liquidity analyses.	3.0
07/25/2024	DK	Research re: solvency	1.5
07/29/2024	DK	Research re: solvency	1.1



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Valuation and Solvency Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.15

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/29/2024	MJB	Conducted solvency analysis	0.4
07/29/2024	RHK	Review 2004 document production for responsive solvency documentation.	2.0
07/30/2024	DK	Research re: solvency	3.0
07/30/2024	LH	Analyze historical solvency	2.9
07/30/2024	LH	Continue to analyze historical solvency	2.8
07/30/2024	RHK	Review 2004 document production for responsive liquidity documentation.	3.0
07/30/2024	RHK	Review 2004 document production for responsive solvency documentation.	2.4
07/30/2024	RHK	Review board minutes found in 2004 production for solvency investigation.	0.7
07/30/2024	RHK	Review historical solvency market data in early 2023.	2.1
07/31/2024	RHK	Preparation of historical solvency analysis for Q4 2022 dividend.	2.5
07/31/2024	RHK	Review board minute projections for historical solvency review.	2.9
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>91.8</u></b>





Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Valuation and Solvency Analysis  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.15

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEEES</b>
Marc J Brown	\$1,320	1.2	\$ 1,584.00
Loring Hill	\$960	5.7	5,472.00
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	50.4	48,384.00
Dhwani Kapadia	\$895	7.6	6,802.00
Thomas G Prince	\$880	8.3	7,304.00
Chase Hood	\$750	3.8	2,850.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$750	14.8	11,100.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>91.8</b>	<b>\$ 83,496.00</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: RSA, Disclosure Statement & Plan of Reorganization  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.17

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/10/2024	AV	Review new filings re: exclusivity extension	0.6
07/11/2024	MC	Email to D. Shiffman (A&M) re: updated milestones for business plan	0.1
07/26/2024	DM	Attend meeting with J. Rubin (Akin), J. Koh and T. Hatfield (Ducera), M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey and T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: EVA Plan constructs	0.9
07/26/2024	MC	Attend meeting with J. Rubin (Akin), J. Koh and T. Hatfield (Ducera), M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey and T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: EVA Plan constructs	0.9
07/26/2024	TGP	Attend meeting with J. Rubin (Akin), J. Koh and T. Hatfield (Ducera), M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey and T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: EVA Plan constructs	0.9
07/29/2024	AV	Review illustrative plan term sheet provided by Ducera	0.4
07/29/2024	TGP	Analyze draft illustrative Plan term sheet provided by Ducera	0.4
07/30/2024	AV	Review emails from Ducera and Akin re: Plan valuation	0.4
07/30/2024	AV	Review GUC scenario analysis	0.8
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>5.4</u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: RSA, Disclosure Statement & Plan of Reorganization  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.17

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	0.9	\$ 1,291.50
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	1.0	1,125.00
Andrew Valentini	\$895	2.2	1,969.00
Thomas G Prince	\$880	1.3	1,144.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<u>5.4</u>	<u>\$ 5,529.50</u>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Retention Applications & Relationship Disclosures  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.19

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/08/2024	ESK	Review Court opinion re: V&E retention	0.5
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b>0.5</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Retention Applications & Relationship Disclosures  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.19

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>		<b>FEES</b>
Elizabeth S Kardos	\$900	0.5	\$	450.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>0.5</b>	<b>\$</b>	<b>450.00</b>



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Fee Applications & Fee Statements  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.20

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/02/2024	DM	Review EVA May fee statement	0.5
07/02/2024	LMB	Begin preparation of First Interim Fee Application	2.7
07/02/2024	LMB	Finalize 2nd Monthly Fee Statement, supporting schedules and exhibits (May 2024)	0.6
07/02/2024	LMB	Prepare schedules for First Interim Fee Application	1.2
07/02/2024	LMB	Update fee application status chart	0.2
07/02/2024	MDG	Review first interim fee application	1.3
07/07/2024	LMB	Prepare professional fees for June 2024 Monthly Fee Statement	0.3
07/08/2024	LMB	Continue preparation of First Interim Fee Application and supporting schedules	2.3
07/08/2024	LMB	Prepare professional fees for June 2024 Monthly Fee Statement	1.8
07/08/2024	LMB	Prepare proposed Order Awarding Fees	0.4
07/08/2024	MDG	Review first interim fee application	1.0
07/08/2024	SR	Review First Interim Fee Application	0.6
07/09/2024	DM	Review EVA first interim fee application	0.5
07/09/2024	LMB	Continue preparation of First Interim Fee Application and supporting schedules	0.8
07/09/2024	LMB	Email to E. Sanzotta (Akin) attaching Second Monthly Fee Statement (May 2024) and First Interim Fee Application for review	0.2
07/10/2024	LMB	Call with E. Sanzotta (Akin) re: revisions to the May Monthly Fee Statement and First Interim Fee Application	0.2
07/10/2024	LMB	Email to E. Sanzotta (Akin) attaching Second Monthly Fee Statement (May 2024) and First Interim Fee Application for filing on the Court docket	0.2
07/10/2024	LMB	Revise and finalize First Interim Fee Application	0.6
07/10/2024	LMB	Revise Second Monthly Fee Statement (May 2024), supporting schedules and exhibits	1.6
07/11/2024	LMB	Prepare Certification of David MacGreevey in support of First Interim Fee Application	0.5
07/11/2024	LMB	Revise and finalize First Interim Fee Application	0.5
07/11/2024	SR	Review First Interim fee application	0.3
07/12/2024	DM	Review revised EVA first interim fee application	0.3
07/18/2024	LMB	Prepare professional fees for June 2024 Monthly Fee Statement	1.6
07/19/2024	MDG	Prepare June professional fees for monthly fee statement	2.0
07/22/2024	MDG	Prepare June professional fees for monthly fee statement	2.5
07/23/2024	LMB	Preparation of professional fees for June 2024 Monthly Fee Statement	1.2
07/24/2024	LMB	Continue preparation of professional fees for June 2024 Monthly Fee Statement	0.5
07/24/2024	LMB	Prepare schedule/exhibit workbook for June 2024 Monthly Fee Statement	1.2
07/24/2024	LMB	Prepare Third Monthly Fee Statement, supporting schedules and exhibits (June 2024)	1.3
07/25/2024	LMB	Revise Third Monthly Fee Statement, supporting schedules and exhibits (June 2024)	1.3
07/25/2024	MDG	Review June fee statement	0.8
07/25/2024	SR	Review Third Monthly Fee Statement (June 2024)	0.2
07/30/2024	DM	Review June EVA monthly fee statement	0.9
07/30/2024	LMB	Revise Third Monthly Fee Statement, supporting schedules and exhibits (June 2024)	1.2
07/31/2024	LMB	Email to E. Sanzotta (Akin) attaching Third Monthly Fee Statement (June 2024)	0.2



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Fee Applications & Fee Statements  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.20

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/31/2024	LMB	Finalize Third Monthly Fee Statement (June 2024)	0.4
07/31/2024	MDG	Review Third Monthly Fee Statement (June 2024)	0.3
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<u><u>34.2</u></u>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Fee Applications & Fee Statements  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.20

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	2.2	\$ 3,157.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	7.9	8,097.50
Sari Rosenfeld	\$625	1.1	687.50
Lisa Marie Bonito	\$550	23.0	12,650.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<u><b>34.2</b></u>	<u><b>\$ 24,592.00</b></u>





Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/01/2024	DL	Perform quality check on formulas and functionality of waterfall analysis prior to meeting with Akin and Ducera	0.7
07/01/2024	DL	Update allocation of value methodology in waterfall analysis	1.9
07/01/2024	DL	Update waterfall analysis to link in new claims data from KCC	2.8
07/01/2024	MC	Review latest waterfall recovery model	2.2
07/02/2024	DL	Update waterfall analysis prior to meeting with Akin and Ducera	2.5
07/02/2024	DM	Working session with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: preparation for waterfall presentation	0.5
07/02/2024	MC	Preparation for waterfall model presentation	2.7
07/02/2024	MC	Working session with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: preparation for waterfall presentation	0.5
07/02/2024	TGP	Review updates made to waterfall model	1.2
07/02/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model based on internal discussions	2.4
07/02/2024	TGP	Working session with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: preparation for waterfall presentation	0.5
07/03/2024	DM	Review email from J. Rubin (Akin) re: unencumbered assets	0.2
07/03/2024	TGP	Analyze potential general unsecured claims recoveries based on various scenarios	2.9
07/03/2024	TGP	Analyze potential unencumbered assets	2.6
07/03/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model based on internal discussions	1.9
07/08/2024	MC	Develop waterfall model allocation sensitivities	2.6
07/09/2024	CH	Draft analysis allocation of excess price margin to operating metrics and enterprise value	0.9
07/09/2024	CH	Draft analysis excess price margin and excess margin to legal entity	1.8
07/09/2024	CH	Draft updates to excess price analysis to incorporate comments from M. Cervi (AlixPartners)	0.6
07/09/2024	MC	Preparation for value allocation discussion with Ducera	2.2
07/10/2024	AV	Email to A&M re: intercompany discussion and diligence	0.1
07/10/2024	MC	Analyze waterfall model allocation methodologies	1.7
07/10/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: status of waterfall related analyses and next steps	0.2
07/10/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: value allocation methodologies	0.2
07/10/2024	TGP	Analyze potential general unsecured recoveries under various scenarios	2.6
07/10/2024	TGP	Analyze potential value allocation scenarios for waterfall model	2.3
07/10/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: status of waterfall related analyses and next steps	0.2
07/10/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: value allocation methodologies	0.2
07/10/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model based on internal discussions	2.9
07/11/2024	AV	Review cash mgmt reporting 6.30.24 (monthly)	0.4
07/11/2024	AV	Review intercompany overview 6.21.24	2.3
07/11/2024	CH	Analyze intercompany accounting overview presentation	1.4
07/11/2024	DM	Review Debtors' intercompany overview presentation	0.8
07/11/2024	MC	Analyze debtors intercompany adjustment report	1.4
07/11/2024	TGP	Analyze potential general unsecured recoveries under various scenarios	2.8
07/11/2024	TGP	Analyze potential value allocation scenarios for waterfall model	1.7
07/11/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' intercompany overview presentation dated 6/21/24	2.2



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/11/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model based on internal discussions	2.4
07/12/2024	CH	Analyze intercompany analysis supporting data	0.8
07/12/2024	MC	Analyze debtors intercompany adjustment report	2.6
07/12/2024	TGP	Analyze potential general unsecured recoveries under various scenarios	2.2
07/12/2024	TGP	Analyze potential value allocation scenarios for waterfall model	1.4
07/12/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' intercompany overview presentation dated 6/21/24	1.9
07/12/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model based on internal discussions	2.6
07/15/2024	DL	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: prepetition intercompany payables analysis	0.6
07/15/2024	DL	Review emails, document uploads, and analysis changes that occurred during PTO	1.5
07/15/2024	DL	Review intercompany analysis and presentation provided by Debtors	1.2
07/15/2024	DL	Revise waterfall analysis for new intercompany balances provided by Debtors	2.3
07/15/2024	MC	Analyze adjusted intercompany balances	1.8
07/15/2024	TGP	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: prepetition intercompany payables analysis	0.6
07/16/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: intercompany relationships and impacts to GUC recoveries	1.2
07/16/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: intercompany relationships and impacts to GUC recoveries	1.2
07/16/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: intercompany relationships and impacts to GUC recoveries	1.2
07/16/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of intercompany balances and allocation of value methodologies	0.5
07/16/2024	DL	Prepare switch in waterfall for gross vs. net prepetition intercompany balances	2.8
07/16/2024	DL	Revise allocation of value in waterfall analysis for new business plan received from Debtors	1.2
07/16/2024	DL	Revise waterfall analysis for new intercompany balance information received from Debtors	2.7
07/16/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: intercompany relationships and impacts to GUC recoveries	1.2
07/16/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: intercompany relationships and impacts to GUC recoveries	1.2
07/16/2024	MC	Analyze changes to waterfall model	2.3
07/16/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: intercompany relationships and impacts to GUC recoveries	1.2
07/16/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of intercompany balances and allocation of value methodologies	0.5



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/16/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: intercompany relationships and impacts to GUC recoveries	1.2
07/16/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of intercompany balances and allocation of value methodologies	0.5
07/16/2024	TGP	Review updates made to waterfall model	2.7
07/17/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall and recovery analysis	0.5
07/17/2024	CH	Draft summary analysis intercompany balance rollforward	2.0
07/17/2024	DL	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: allocation of value methodology for waterfall model	1.6
07/17/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall and recovery analysis	0.5
07/17/2024	DL	Prepare slides on GUC recovery scenarios for counsel	3.0
07/17/2024	DL	Revise allocation of value tab in waterfall model based on new allocation methodology	0.8
07/17/2024	DL	Revise formulas in waterfall model to handle more scenarios and levels of distributable value	2.8
07/17/2024	DL	Revise slides on GUC recovery scenarios for counsel based on AlixPartners feedback	2.1
07/17/2024	DM	Meet with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, J. Horgan (AlixPartners) re: intercompany claims diligence questions	0.3
07/17/2024	MC	Analyze changes to waterfall model	3.2
07/17/2024	MC	Analyze debtors adjusted intercompany balances	1.6
07/17/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall and recovery analysis	0.5
07/17/2024	MC	Meet with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, J. Horgan (AlixPartners) re: intercompany claims diligence questions	0.3
07/17/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall and recovery analysis	0.5
07/17/2024	TGP	Analyze potential general unsecured recoveries under various assumptions	2.8
07/17/2024	TGP	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: allocation of value methodology for waterfall model	1.6
07/17/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall and recovery analysis	0.5
07/18/2024	CH	Analyze latest intercompany reporting received from Debtors	0.7
07/18/2024	CH	Draft summary analysis unencumbered asset values	1.6
07/18/2024	CH	Draft updates to intercompany balance rollforward analysis	1.2
07/18/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince (AlixPartners) EVA waterfall analysis and PW meeting agenda	0.5
07/18/2024	DL	Review GUC recovery analysis presentation for accuracy prior to sharing with counsel	1.0
07/18/2024	DL	Revise GUC recovery analysis presentation for counsel for new format requested from AlixPartners team members	2.5



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/18/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince (AlixPartners) EVA waterfall analysis and PW meeting agenda	0.5
07/18/2024	DM	Emails with K. McGlynn and M. Cervi (both AlixPartners) re: work plan for analysis of intercompany, waterfall and claims	0.4
07/18/2024	DM	Review draft presentation to Akin re: recovery scenario analysis	0.6
07/18/2024	KBM	Review updates re: intercompany claims	0.4
07/18/2024	KBM	Review waterfall analysis presentation	1.6
07/18/2024	MC	Analyze waterfall model changes	1.8
07/18/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince (AlixPartners) EVA waterfall analysis and PW meeting agenda	0.5
07/18/2024	MC	Review draft GUC scenario analysis	1.8
07/18/2024	MC	Review draft of waterfall recovery presentation slides	1.5
07/18/2024	TGP	Analyze potential general unsecured recoveries under various assumptions	2.6
07/18/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, T. Prince (AlixPartners) EVA waterfall analysis and PW meeting agenda	0.5
07/18/2024	TGP	Provide comments to draft GUC recovery presentation	0.4
07/18/2024	TGP	Review draft GUC recovery presentation	0.8
07/18/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model based on internal discussions	1.8
07/19/2024	DL	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: required updates to waterfall model	0.5
07/19/2024	DL	Revise waterfall analysis for new claims data received from Debtors	1.6
07/19/2024	TGP	Analyze potential general unsecured recoveries under various assumptions	2.9
07/19/2024	TGP	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: required updates to waterfall model	0.5
07/22/2024	DL	Revise waterfall analysis to be accurately linked to new claims and prepetition intercompany data from Debtors	2.8
07/22/2024	DL	Revise waterfall analysis to include new claims data provided by Debtors	1.8
07/22/2024	MC	Analyze changes to waterfall model	1.3
07/22/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries under various scenarios	2.8
07/22/2024	TGP	Review updates made to waterfall model	1.6
07/22/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model to incorporate additional scenarios	2.4
07/23/2024	DL	Prepare new GUC recovery tables for new scenarios requested by counsel	2.8
07/23/2024	DL	Review John Hancock lift stay motion for relevant items to waterfall analysis	0.4
07/23/2024	DL	Update waterfall model to contain a claims reconciliation to tie back to claims presentation for UCC committee	0.7
07/23/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative recoveries for general unsecured claims holders under various scenarios	2.7
07/23/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model inputs	2.2
07/24/2024	CH	Research dataroom for information re: unencumbered leases	0.8
07/24/2024	CH	Review Ducera materials re: value allocation prior to call re: same	0.4
07/24/2024	DL	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of GUC recovery scenarios	0.7
07/24/2024	DL	Review changes to waterfall model applied by AlixPartners team members	0.5
07/24/2024	DL	Update GUC recovery presentation for new scenarios requested by AlixPartners team members	1.1



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/24/2024	MC	Analyze changes to waterfall model	2.6
07/24/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries after updating model inputs	2.1
07/24/2024	TGP	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of GUC recovery scenarios	0.7
07/24/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model inputs	2.4
07/25/2024	CH	Additional research re: leases for unencumbered assets	0.7
07/25/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: walkthrough of GUC recovery scenarios and convenience class analysis	0.7
07/25/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: walkthrough of GUC recovery scenarios and convenience class analysis	0.7
07/25/2024	DL	Prepare appendices in GUC recovery analysis highlighting different scenarios at the request of counsel	1.4
07/25/2024	DL	Prepare GUC recovery scenario analysis for counsel following changes to waterfall model	2.9
07/25/2024	MC	Analyze changes to waterfall model	2.3
07/25/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: walkthrough of GUC recovery scenarios and convenience class analysis	0.7
07/25/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries under various scenarios	2.9
07/25/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: walk through of GUC recovery scenarios and convenience class analysis	0.7
07/25/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model value allocation scenarios	1.6
07/26/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall analysis requests from counsel	0.3
07/26/2024	DL	Revise waterfall model and GUC recovery output for requests from counsel	1.7
07/26/2024	DL	Working session with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall model edits requested by counsel	0.5
07/26/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall analysis requests from counsel	0.3
07/26/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries under various scenarios	2.1
07/26/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall analysis requests from counsel	0.3
07/26/2024	TGP	Working session with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall model edits requested by counsel	0.5
07/29/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall model and GUC recovery views requested by counsel	0.3
07/29/2024	DL	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall methodology	0.5
07/29/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall model and GUC recovery views requested by counsel	0.3
07/29/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: set up of waterfall view requested by counsel	0.2
07/29/2024	DL	Perform quality check on waterfall requested by counsel	1.6
07/29/2024	DL	Prepare input tabs and schedules for linkage to new view in waterfall requested by counsel	2.9



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/29/2024	DL	Prepare view in waterfall analysis requested by counsel	2.8
07/29/2024	DL	Revise waterfall analysis for new claims information from Debtors and prepare waterfall for meeting with counsel	1.0
07/29/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall model and GUC recovery views requested by counsel	0.3
07/29/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: set up of waterfall view requested by counsel	0.2
07/29/2024	MC	Review changes to waterfall model based on counsel requests	1.8
07/29/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries under various scenarios	2.9
07/29/2024	TGP	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall methodology	0.5
07/29/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall model and GUC recovery views requested by counsel	0.3
07/29/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: set up of waterfall view requested by counsel	0.2
07/29/2024	TGP	Quality review changes made to waterfall model	2.4
07/30/2024	CH	Attend meeting with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: internal review of creditor recoveries	0.6
07/30/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall modeling	0.2
07/30/2024	DL	Attend meeting with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: internal review of creditor recoveries under plan scenario	0.6
07/30/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall modeling	0.2
07/30/2024	DL	Prepare slides for meeting with counsel re: GUC recovery scenarios	1.8
07/30/2024	DL	Prepare talking points and extra slides for GUC recovery meeting with counsel	1.9
07/30/2024	DL	Prepare waterfall model for meeting with counsel following model change requests from counsel and AlixPartners team members	2.3
07/30/2024	DL	Revise waterfall model following meeting with counsel and bankers for requested changes	1.8
07/30/2024	DM	Attend meeting with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: internal review of creditor recoveries	0.6
07/30/2024	MC	Attend meeting with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: internal review of creditor recoveries	0.6
07/30/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall modeling	0.2
07/30/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries under updated scenarios	2.8
07/30/2024	TGP	Attend meeting with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey and T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: internal review of creditor recoveries	0.6
07/30/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: review of waterfall modeling	0.2
07/30/2024	TGP	Provide comments to slides summarizing illustrative GUC recoveries	0.4
07/30/2024	TGP	Review slides summarizing illustrative GUC recoveries	1.6
07/30/2024	TGP	Update slides summarizing illustrative GUC recoveries	0.8



Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/31/2024	DL	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: GUC recovery slide deck review	0.7
07/31/2024	DL	Review GUC recovery slides for accuracy	2.4
07/31/2024	DL	Revise GUC recovery slides for new comments from AlixPartners team members	2.9
07/31/2024	DL	Revise GUC recovery slides for new scenario requested by counsel	2.9
07/31/2024	MC	Edit draft waterfall output summary slides	2.7
07/31/2024	MC	Review draft waterfall model	1.6
07/31/2024	TGP	Analyze illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries under updated scenarios	2.6
07/31/2024	TGP	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: GUC recovery slide deck review	0.7
07/31/2024	TGP	Provide comments to slides summarizing illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries under additional scenarios	0.5
07/31/2024	TGP	Quality review recent changes made to waterfall model	1.4
07/31/2024	TGP	Review updates slides summarizing illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries under additional scenarios	0.8
07/31/2024	TGP	Update slides summarizing illustrative general unsecured claims recoveries under additional scenarios	0.6
07/31/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model based on internal discussions re: sensitivity analyses	1.9
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>263.5</u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	5.1	\$ 7,318.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	3.2	4,416.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	47.9	53,887.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	0.5	512.50
Andrew Valentini	\$895	4.0	3,580.00
Thomas G Prince	\$880	102.5	90,200.00
Chase Hood	\$750	16.4	12,300.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$750	83.9	62,925.00
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<b>263.5</b>	<b>\$ 235,139.50</b>





Enviva, Inc.  
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: eDiscovery  
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.23

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/08/2024	KB	Stage and prepare data for document discovery platform. Update tracking documentation.	0.3
07/08/2024	SJ	Prepare reporting related to recently produced documents.	0.7
07/15/2024	SJ	Perform new document production to platform for reviewing	0.8
07/22/2024	SJ	Coordinate document review credentials for user.	0.3
07/23/2024	SJ	Prepare new document review credentials for user.	0.5
07/25/2024	KB	Stage and prepare data for review. Update tracking documentation.	0.3
07/26/2024	SJ	Prepare new data for review workspace and prepare associated reporting.	1.1
07/29/2024	KB	Stage and prepare data for uploading to review space. Update tracking documentation.	0.6
07/29/2024	SJ	Prepare two document productions for review and update associated reporting.	1.8
07/30/2024	KB	Prepare data for review and update tracking documentation	0.3
<b>Total Professional Hours</b>			<b><u>6.7</u></b>



Enviva, Inc.  
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata  
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800  
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: eDiscovery  
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.23

<b>PROFESSIONAL</b>	<b>RATE</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>FEES</b>
Sarah Jakobsen	\$960	5.2	\$ 4,992.00
Kristina Borkowski	\$825	1.5	1,237.50
<b>Total Professional Hours and Fees</b>		<u>6.7</u>	<u>\$ 6,229.50</u>