

Scott L. Alberino (admitted *pro hac vice*)
 Alexander F. Antypas (VSB No. 92083)
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
 Robert S. Strauss Tower
 2001 K Street, N.W.
 Washington, DC 20006-1037
 Telephone: (202) 887-4000
 Facsimile: (202) 887-4288

Ira S. Dizengoff (admitted *pro hac vice*)
 Abid Qureshi (admitted *pro hac vice*)
 Jason P. Rubin (admitted *pro hac vice*)
AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD LLP
 One Bryant Park
 New York, New York 10036
 Telephone: (212) 872-1000
 Facsimile: (212) 872-1002

Lawrence A. Katz (VSB No. 47664)
 Kristen E. Burgers (VSB No. 67997)
HIRSCHLER FLEISCHER, P.C.
 1676 International Drive, Suite 1350
 Tysons, Virginia 22102
 Telephone: (703) 584-8900
 Facsimile: (703) 584-8901

Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

Local Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
 FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF VIRGINIA
 ALEXANDRIA DIVISION**

In re: ENVIVA, INC., <i>et al.</i> , ¹ Debtors.	Chapter 11 Case No. 24-10453 (BFK) (Jointly Administered) Objection Deadline: June 18, 2024
--	--

**FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF ALIXPARTNERS, LLP,
 FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
 UNSECURED CREDITORS, FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR
 PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
 INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD FROM MARCH 28, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2024**

Name of Applicant:	ALIXPARTNERS, LLP	
Applicant's Role in Case:	Financial Advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors	
Date of Employment Order:	May 29, 2024 effective as of March 28, 2024 [Docket No. 628]	
Time period covered by this Fee Statement:	Beginning of Period	End of Period
	March 28, 2024	April 30, 2024
Summary of Total Fees and Expenses Requested:		

¹ Due to the large number of Debtors in these jointly administered chapter 11 cases, a complete list of the Debtor entities and the last four digits of their federal tax identification numbers is not provided herein. A complete list may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' proposed claims and noticing agent at www.kccllc.net/enviva. The location of the Debtors' corporate headquarters is: 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800, Bethesda, MD 20814.



ALIXPARTNERS, LLP

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL
MARCH 28, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2024**

Professional	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
David MacGreevey	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,435	92.1	\$ 132,163.50
David Hindman	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,410	3.5	4,935.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,380	103.4	142,692.00
Marc J Brown	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,320	0.5	660.00
Richard Collura	Partner & Managing Director	\$1,320	53.6	70,752.00
Christopher Rubel	Partner	\$1,200	31.3	37,560.00
Elizabeth S Kardos	Partner	\$900	3.8	3,420.00
Mark Cervi	Director	\$1,125	122.8	138,150.00
Jeff Wooding	Director	\$1,025	9.1	9,327.50
Matthew D Gates	Director	\$1,025	102.8	105,370.00
Loring Hill	Director	\$960	88.6	85,056.00
Ryan H Komendowski	Director	\$960	68.9	66,144.00
Scott Weiner	Director	\$960	43.5	41,760.00
Uday Rao	Director	\$960	24.2	23,232.00
Dhwani Kapadia	Senior Vice President	\$895	10.9	9,755.50
Andrew Valentini	Senior Vice President	\$855	200.2	171,171.00
Christopher Cuomo	Senior Vice President	\$800	34.4	27,520.00
Ivan Esteban	Senior Vice President	\$800	21.3	17,040.00
Thomas G Prince	Senior Vice President	\$800	153.9	123,120.00
Kaitlyn A Sundt	Senior Vice President	\$650	2.6	1,690.00
Sari Rosenfeld	Senior Vice President	\$625	7.6	4,750.00
Brooke Filler	Senior Vice President	\$575	7.6	4,370.00
Jennifer Braverman	Senior Vice President	\$535	8.3	4,440.50

[continued on next page]

ALIXPARTNERS, LLP

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL
MARCH 28, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2024**

Professional	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
Chase Hood	Vice President	\$690	113.3	78,177.00
Daniel Lopresti	Vice President	\$690	58.1	40,089.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	Vice President	\$690	123.2	85,008.00
Michael Toolan	Vice President	\$640	25.8	16,512.00
Lisa Marie Bonito	Vice President	\$550	1.2	660.00
Lauren Prohaska	Vice President	\$525	60.7	31,867.50
Total Hours and Fees for Professionals			1,577.2	\$ 1,477,392.50
Less 20% Holdback				(295,478.50)
Total Fees for Professionals				\$ 1,181,914.00

Average Billing Rate \$ 936.72

ALIXPARTNERS, LLP

**SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY MATTER CATEGORY
MARCH 28, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2024**

Matter Code	Matter Category	Hours	Fees
1.1	Planning, Coordination and Case Management	86.8	\$ 89,420.00
1.2	Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors	167.2	178,855.00
1.3	Preparation of Committee Presentations	100.9	95,038.50
1.4	Meetings & Communication with Debtors	61.4	63,401.00
1.6	DIP Financing and Cash Collateral	210.3	205,343.50
1.7	Liquidity and Cash Management	33.1	32,781.00
1.9	Business and Strategic Plan	192.5	173,050.50
1.10	Employee Compensation and Advisor Retention Matters	10.7	8,962.50
1.11	Financial and Other Diligence	147.4	122,849.00
1.12	Other Motions and Related Objections	80.0	86,047.00
1.13	Litigation Support & Investigations	244.4	240,619.00
1.14	Claims Analysis	4.0	4,002.50
1.15	Valuation and Solvency Analysis	30.6	30,615.50
1.17	RSA, Disclosure Statement & Plan of Reorganization	3.9	4,360.00
1.18	Court Hearings and Status Conferences	2.2	2,886.00
1.19	Retention Applications & Relationship Disclosures	97.1	59,832.50
1.20	Fee Applications & Fee Statements	1.6	958.00
1.22	Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis	103.1	78,371.00
Total Hours and Fees by Matter Category		1,577.2	\$ 1,477,392.50

Average Billing Rate \$ 936.72

AlixPartners, LLP (“AlixPartners”), as financial advisor to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Committee”) to the above-captioned debtors (the “Debtors”), hereby submits its first monthly fee statement (the “Fee Statement”) seeking compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement of out-of-pocket expenses for the period from March 28, 2024 through April 30, 2024 (the “Compensation Period”), pursuant to the *Order (i) Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Retained Professionals and (ii) Granting Related Relief* [Docket No. 317] (the “Interim Compensation Order”) and the *Order Authorizing the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors to Employ and Retain AlixPartners, LLP as its Financial Advisor, Effective as of March 28, 2024* [Docket No. 628].

The Interim Compensation Order provides that fourteen (14) days after the filing of this Fee Statement (the “Objection Deadline”), the Debtors are authorized and directed to pay AlixPartners 80% of the professional fees and 100% of the out-of-pocket expenses requested in this Fee Statement, with the exception of any fees and/or expenses subject to an objection.

Detailed descriptions of the services performed by each professional, organized by matter category and by date, and the hours of services provided (in tenths of an hour) during the Compensation Period are attached hereto as Exhibit A.

WHEREFORE, AlixPartners, as financial advisor to the Committee, respectfully requests: (i) an interim allowance of compensation for professional services in the amount of \$1,477,392.50 for the Compensation Period; (ii) that, upon expiration of the Objection Deadline, the Debtors are authorized and directed to pay AlixPartners professional fees in the amount of \$1,181,914.00 (80% of \$1,477,392.50); and (iii) such other and further relief as this Court deems proper.

Dated: June 10, 2024

ALIXPARTNERS, LLP
909 Third Avenue, 28th Floor
New York, New York 10022

/s/ David MacGreevey

By: David MacGreevey
Partner & Managing Director

Electronically filed by:

/s/ Kristen E. Burgers

Lawrence A. Katz (VSB No. 47664)
Kristen E. Burgers (VSB No. 67997)
Allison P. Klena (VSB No. 96400)
HIRSCHLER FLEISCHER, P.C.
1676 International Drive, Suite 1350
Tysons, Virginia 22102
Telephone: (703) 584-8900
Facsimile: (703) 584-8901

*Local Counsel to the Official Committee
of Unsecured Creditors*

Exhibit A

Detailed Description of AlixPartners' Fees and Hours by Matter Category



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/2024	CH	Prepare working group list and email distribution group	0.8
04/01/2024	KBM	Coordinate initial case set-up items	1.1
04/01/2024	MC	Draft email to coordinate with Debtors re: access to dataroom	0.2
04/02/2024	AV	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	CH	Draft updates to working group list and email distribution group	0.5
04/02/2024	CH	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	CC	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	DH	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	DH	Review case materials and provide guidance to AlixPartners's internal team re: same	1.0
04/02/2024	DM	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	JW	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.5
04/02/2024	KBM	Coordinate workstreams amongst team members	0.6
04/02/2024	KBM	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	LH	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	MC	Draft email to K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: first day motion work	0.2
04/02/2024	MC	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	MDG	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	TGP	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: case workplan and allocation of workstreams	0.6
04/04/2024	AV	Review agenda for UCC call	0.1
04/04/2024	CH	Draft additional updates to working group list and email distribution group	0.5
04/04/2024	DM	Develop Enviva workstream and staffing plan	1.2



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/05/2024	DL	Review materials provided in dataroom and in AlixPartners shared folder in preparation for case	0.4
04/08/2024	MC	Meeting with M. Cervi, T. Prince (both AlixPartners) re: case updates, ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.7
04/08/2024	TGP	Meeting with M. Cervi, T. Prince (both AlixPartners) re: case updates, ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.7
04/09/2024	CH	Correspondence with M. Cowen (AlixPartners) re: ongoing workstreams	0.5
04/09/2024	DM	Meeting with D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: case workstreams and next steps	0.5
04/09/2024	KBM	Meeting with D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: case workstreams and next steps	0.5
04/10/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: case background, ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	1.5
04/10/2024	TGP	Working session with M. Cowen, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: case background, ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	1.5
04/11/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/11/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/11/2024	CR	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/11/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/11/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/11/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/11/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/11/2024	MT	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/11/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/11/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/11/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.4
04/12/2024	CH	Draft updates to working group list and email distribution group	0.3
04/12/2024	DM	Review draft proposed work plans for Ducera and Akin for coordination with AlixPartners work plan	0.5
04/12/2024	JW	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, T. Prince, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
04/12/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, T. Prince, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
04/12/2024	MC	Draft AlixPartners team workplan	1.4
04/12/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, T. Prince, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
04/12/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, T. Prince, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
04/12/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, M. Gates, T. Prince, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: coordination of workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
04/14/2024	MC	Review DIP milestone model	0.3
04/14/2024	MC	Create consolidated workplan for UCC professional firms	2.9
04/15/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: historical liquidity and events leading up to Chapter 11 filing	0.2
04/15/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: historical liquidity and events leading up to Chapter 11 filing	0.2
04/15/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: historical liquidity and events leading up to Chapter 11 filing	0.2
04/15/2024	KBM	Revise workstream tracker for relevant case issues	1.1
04/15/2024	KBM	Working session with M. Cervi, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: update UCC workplan tracker	0.7
04/15/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: historical liquidity and events leading up to Chapter 11 filing	0.2
04/15/2024	MC	Update consolidated workplan for UCC professional firms	1.4
04/15/2024	MC	Working session with M. Cervi, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: update UCC workplan tracker	0.7
04/15/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: historical liquidity and events leading up to Chapter 11 filing	0.2
04/16/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/16/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	CR	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	JW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding, U. Rao (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	MT	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/16/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6
04/16/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, A. Valentini, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates, next steps, and other case topics	0.8
04/16/2024	TGP	Working session with M. Cowen, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: ongoing workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6
04/17/2024	KBM	Review UCC professionals workstreams related to case issues	0.6
04/17/2024	KBM	Revise UCC professionals workstream tracker	0.7
04/17/2024	MC	Update consolidated workplan for UCC professional firms	2.2
04/18/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood (AlixPartners) re: project management tracker for Committee	0.7
04/18/2024	CH	Draft detailed project management tracker and case timeline chart for Committee members	2.2
04/18/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood (AlixPartners) re: project management tracker for Committee	0.7
04/18/2024	MC	Coordinate document production access	1.2
04/22/2024	AV	Emails to D. MacGreevey and M. Cervi (AlixPartners) re: data room files	0.2
04/22/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: to discuss case workplan	0.3
04/22/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: to discuss case workplan	0.3
04/23/2024	AV	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	CH	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	CC	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	CR	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/23/2024	DL	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	DM	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	DM	Prepare for internal discussion with Enviva team re: work plan and strategy	0.5
04/23/2024	KBM	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	KBM	Review changes to UCC advisors' workplan	0.9
04/23/2024	LH	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	MC	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	MDG	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	MT	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	RC	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	RMC	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/23/2024	RHK	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/23/2024	TGP	Attend internal meeting with D. MacGreevey, M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, and A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: Enviva work plan, strategy and case updates	0.6
04/24/2024	CH	Attend internal working session with D. MacGreevey M. Cervi, K. McGlynn and C. Hood re: detailed Enviva work plan tracker and timeline	1.2
04/24/2024	CH	Draft updates to detailed project management tracker and case timeline analysis for Committee	1.7
04/24/2024	DM	Attend internal working session with D. MacGreevey M. Cervi, K. McGlynn and C. Hood re: detailed Enviva work plan tracker and timeline	1.2
04/24/2024	KBM	Attend internal working session with D. MacGreevey M. Cervi, K. McGlynn and C. Hood re: detailed Enviva work plan tracker and timeline	1.2
04/24/2024	KBM	Review changes to UCC advisors' work plan	0.9
04/24/2024	MC	Attend internal working session with D. MacGreevey M. Cervi, K. McGlynn and C. Hood re: detailed Enviva work plan tracker and timeline	1.2
04/25/2024	AV	Email to C. Hood re: UCC deck workstreams	0.2
04/26/2024	KBM	Review final UCC advisors' work plan for the Committee	0.9
04/30/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	DM	Prepare for internal call re: Enviva work plan and strategy	0.5
04/30/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	LH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/30/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
04/30/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners workstream updates and next steps	0.8
Total Professional Hours			<u>86.8</u>



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Planning, Coordination and Case Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.1

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	7.8	\$ 11,193.00
David Hindman	\$1,410	1.6	2,256.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	12.7	17,526.00
Richard Collura	\$1,320	1.4	1,848.00
Christopher Rubel	\$1,200	1.8	2,160.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	17.0	19,125.00
Jeff Wooding	\$1,025	1.5	1,537.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	3.0	3,075.00
Loring Hill	\$960	2.0	1,920.00
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	1.8	1,728.00
Scott Weiner	\$960	1.8	1,728.00
Andrew Valentini	\$855	3.9	3,334.50
Christopher Cuomo	\$800	3.2	2,560.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	6.2	4,960.00
Chase Hood	\$690	11.4	7,866.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$690	3.0	2,070.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$690	4.9	3,381.00
Michael Toolan	\$640	1.8	1,152.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		86.8	\$ 89,420.00



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/2024	DM	Discussion with UCC investment banker candidate	0.5
04/01/2024	DM	Review presentation materials submitted by three firms for Enviva investment banker role	2.0
04/02/2024	AV	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	CH	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	CC	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	DM	Participate in kick off call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Brown, M. Cervi (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas, J. Rubin, S. Alberino, A. Qureshi, E. Sanzotta (all Akin) re: first day motions and near term workplan	0.5
04/02/2024	DM	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino, J. Rubin and A. Qureshi (Akin) and Enviva UCC members and counsel to interview and select an investment banker	1.8
04/02/2024	DM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	DM	Discussion with M. Genereux (Ducera) re: Enviva DIP workstream and strategy	0.4
04/02/2024	DM	Prepare remarks for meeting with Enviva UCC	0.4
04/02/2024	KBM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	KBM	Participate in investment banker interviews	1.5
04/02/2024	KBM	Participate in kick off call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Brown, M. Cervi (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas, J. Rubin, S. Alberino, A. Qureshi, E. Sanzotta (all Akin) re: first day motions and near term workplan	0.5
04/02/2024	LH	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	MJB	Participate in kick off call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Brown, M. Cervi (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas, J. Rubin, S. Alberino, A. Qureshi, E. Sanzotta (all Akin) re: first day motions and near term workplan	0.5
04/02/2024	MC	Draft email to T. Hatfield (Ducera) re: diligence request list	0.1



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/02/2024	MC	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	MC	Participate in kick off call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Brown, M. Cervi (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas, J. Rubin, S. Alberino, A. Qureshi, E. Sanzotta (all Akin) re: first day motions and near term workplan	0.5
04/02/2024	MDG	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.6
04/02/2024	TGP	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, J. Wooding, M. Cervi, M. Gates, L. Hill, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: engagement kick-off and near-term workstreams	0.6
04/03/2024	AV	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and C. Cuomo (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), M. Genereux and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: DIP motion overview	0.8
04/03/2024	CH	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and C. Cuomo (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), M. Genereux and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: DIP motion overview	0.8
04/03/2024	CH	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: first day motions and workstreams	0.7
04/03/2024	CC	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and C. Cuomo (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), M. Genereux and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: DIP motion overview	0.8
04/03/2024	DM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: first day motions and workstreams	0.7
04/03/2024	DM	Emails with J. Rubin (Akin), W. Greve (Ducera) and M. Cervi re: comments and revisions to Enviva preliminary diligence request	0.4
04/03/2024	DM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and C. Cuomo (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), M. Genereux and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: DIP motion overview	0.8
04/03/2024	KBM	Communication with A. Antypas (Akin) re: first day motions	0.4
04/03/2024	KBM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and C. Cuomo (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), M. Genereux and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: DIP motion overview	0.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/03/2024	KBM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: first day motions and workstreams	0.7
04/03/2024	MC	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and C. Cuomo (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), M. Genereux and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: DIP motion overview	0.8
04/03/2024	MDG	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: first day motions and workstreams	0.7
04/03/2024	RHK	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and C. Cuomo (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: DIP motion overview	0.8
04/03/2024	TGP	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and C. Cuomo (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), M. Genereux and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: DIP motion overview	0.8
04/04/2024	AV	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: upcoming UCC call	0.2
04/04/2024	AV	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), and Committee members re: first day motions, DIP motion, and other case status updates	0.8
04/04/2024	CH	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: upcoming UCC call	0.2
04/04/2024	CH	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), and Committee members re: first day motions, DIP motion, and other case status updates	0.8
04/04/2024	CC	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: upcoming UCC call	0.2
04/04/2024	CC	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), and Committee members re: first day motions, DIP motion, and other case status updates	0.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/04/2024	DH	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi (all AlixPartners), M. Mazzucchi, M. Bertolatus (Houlihan Lokey / RWE) re: case background	1.3
04/04/2024	DM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi (all AlixPartners), M. Mazzucchi, M. Bertolatus (Houlihan Lokey / RWE) re: case background	1.3
04/04/2024	DM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: upcoming UCC call	0.2
04/04/2024	DM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), and Committee members re: first day motions, DIP motion, and other case status updates	0.8
04/04/2024	KBM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: upcoming UCC call	0.2
04/04/2024	KBM	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), and Committee members re: first day motions, DIP motion, and other case status updates	0.8
04/04/2024	KBM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi (all AlixPartners), M. Mazzucchi, M. Bertolatus (Houlihan Lokey / RWE) re: case background	1.3
04/04/2024	MC	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: upcoming UCC call	0.2
04/04/2024	MC	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), and Committee members re: first day motions, DIP motion, and other case status updates	0.8
04/04/2024	MC	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, M. Cervi (all AlixPartners), M. Mazzucchi, M. Bertolatus (Houlihan Lokey / RWE) re: case background	1.3
04/04/2024	MDG	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: upcoming UCC call	0.2



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/04/2024	MDG	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), and Committee members re: first day motions, DIP motion, and other case status updates	0.8
04/04/2024	RHK	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), and Committee members re: first day motions, DIP motion, and other case status updates	0.8
04/04/2024	TGP	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (all Ducera), and S. Alberino and others (all Akin) re: upcoming UCC call	0.2
04/04/2024	TGP	Participate in a call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), and Committee members re: first day motions, DIP motion, and other case status updates	0.8
04/05/2024	TGP	Email communications with E. Sanzotta (Akin) re: VDR access	0.1
04/06/2024	TGP	Email communications with E. Sanzotta (Akin) re: VDR access	0.1
04/07/2024	CH	Participate in call with K. McGlynn, M. Gates, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day motion reporting	0.2
04/07/2024	KBM	Participate in call with K. McGlynn, M. Gates, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day motion reporting	0.2
04/07/2024	MDG	Participate in call with K. McGlynn, M. Gates, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day motion reporting	0.2
04/08/2024	AV	Review email and attachments from V&E re: draft of final orders and DIP objection extension	0.3
04/08/2024	DM	Emails with J. Rubin (Akin) re: diligence and strategy around Enviva critical vendor program	0.2
04/09/2024	AV	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.4
04/09/2024	AV	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.5
04/09/2024	AV	Review emails from Akin re: hearing date track w/ attachments and scheduling calls	0.2
04/09/2024	CH	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.4
04/09/2024	CH	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/09/2024	CC	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.5
04/09/2024	DL	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.4
04/09/2024	DL	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.5
04/09/2024	DM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.5
04/09/2024	DM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.4
04/09/2024	KBM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.4
04/09/2024	KBM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.5
04/09/2024	MC	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.4
04/09/2024	MDG	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.4
04/09/2024	MDG	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.5
04/09/2024	TGP	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.4
04/09/2024	TGP	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners) and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: first day reporting markups	0.5
04/10/2024	AV	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	AV	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: preparation call for advisors prior to Committee meeting	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/10/2024	CH	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: preparation call for advisors prior to Committee meeting	0.5
04/10/2024	CH	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	CC	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: preparation call for advisors prior to Committee meeting	0.5
04/10/2024	CC	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	CC	Edit meeting notes from UCC weekly call	0.3
04/10/2024	CR	Prepare for Committee call with advisors	0.7
04/10/2024	CR	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: preparation call for advisors prior to Committee meeting	0.5
04/10/2024	CR	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	DL	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: preparation call for advisors prior to Committee meeting	0.5
04/10/2024	DL	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	DM	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/10/2024	DM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: preparation call for advisors prior to Committee meeting	0.5
04/10/2024	DM	Discussion with J. Rubin and A. Antypas (Akin) re: status of Enviva first day motions	0.3
04/10/2024	DM	Emails with J. Rubin (Akin) re: Enviva critical vendor analysis	0.2
04/10/2024	DM	Prepare memorandum to S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin) re: analysis of various scenarios related to critical vendor programs and liquidity	2.5
04/10/2024	KBM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: preparation call for advisors prior to Committee meeting	0.5
04/10/2024	KBM	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	LH	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	MC	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: preparation call for advisors prior to Committee meeting	0.5
04/10/2024	MC	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	MDG	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	RC	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/10/2024	RHK	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/10/2024	TGP	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), and A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: preparation call for advisors prior to Committee meeting	0.5
04/10/2024	TGP	Attend meeting with I. Dizengoff, S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin), M. Genereux and J. Koh (Ducera), D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, R. Collura, M. Gates, R. Komendowski, C. Rubel, M. Cervi, L. Hill, A. Valentini, C. Cuomo, T. Prince, C. Hood and D. Lopresti (AlixPartners) and UCC members and counsel re: first day orders, DIP topics, and other case updates	1.1
04/11/2024	MC	Review email from A. Antypas (Akin) re: hearing update	0.1
04/12/2024	AV	Prepare for call with Akin re: review and edit slides	0.4
04/12/2024	RC	Call with A. Qureshi and others (all Akin), R. Komendowski, T. Prince (all AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps.	0.2
04/12/2024	RHK	Call with A. Qureshi and others (all Akin), R. Komendowski, T. Prince (all AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps.	0.2
04/12/2024	TGP	Call with A. Qureshi and others (all Akin), R. Komendowski, T. Prince (all AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps.	0.2
04/13/2024	MDG	Review email from Ducera re: workstreams	0.5
04/14/2024	KBM	Communication with A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC professionals workstream tracker	0.2
04/14/2024	KBM	Revise list of case workstreams for Committee	0.4
04/15/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: DIP forecast sensitivities	0.6
04/15/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: DIP forecast sensitivities	0.6
04/15/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: DIP forecast sensitivities	0.6
04/15/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: DIP forecast sensitivities	0.6
04/16/2024	KBM	Call with A. Antypas (Akin) re: outstanding first day motion issues	0.2
04/17/2024	DM	Review email from J. Koh (Ducera) re: Enviva DIP trading activity	0.2
04/17/2024	KBM	Calls with A. Antypas (Akin) re: workplan tracker	0.3
04/17/2024	MC	Review Committee update email from A. Antypas (Akin)	0.2
04/18/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/18/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	CR	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	CR	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/18/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	LH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/18/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	RC	Communicate with Akin team re: Relativity database access.	0.1
04/18/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/18/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/18/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering workstreams, Committee bylaws, and other case matters	1.1
04/19/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, S. Weiner (both AlixPartners), J. Koh, W. Greve, L. Tousignant (Ducera), G. Berube, A. Finnie, H. Barry (Evercore) re: to discuss case workplan	0.5
04/22/2024	MC	Draft email to A. Antypas (Akin) re: component of DIP budget spend	0.2
04/23/2024	MC	Review Committee update email from A. Antypas (Akin)	0.3
04/24/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/24/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	CR	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	CR	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	DM	Emails with attachments with J. Rubin (Akin) and M. Cervi re: proposed Enviva Green bond settlement	0.6
04/24/2024	DM	Emails with S. Alberino and I. Dizengoff (Akin) and M. Genereux (Ducera) re: Enviva DIP	0.4



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/24/2024	DM	Prepare for discussions with Akin, Ducera and Enviva UCC re: weekly updates and strategy	0.8
04/24/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	LH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	LH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	MC	Draft email to J. Rubin (Akin) re: green bond trustee fees	0.1
04/24/2024	MC	Respond to email from A. Antypas (Akin) re: DIP objection	0.2
04/24/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	MDG	Correspondence with A. Antypas (Akin) re: Sumitomo contract	0.2
04/24/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/24/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	RHK	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/24/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve (Ducera), A. Antypas (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/24/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, R. Komendowski, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP status, special Committee investigation, and other case updates	1.1
04/25/2024	KBM	Call with A. Antypas and E. Sanzotta (both Akin) re: cash management order	0.2
04/25/2024	KBM	Communication with Committee Counsel re: changes to cash management order	0.4
04/26/2024	DM	Review emails with attachments from M. Genereux (Ducera) re: Enviva DIP	0.5
04/26/2024	MC	Review Committee update on motion to reconstitute Committee from E. Sanzotta (Akin)	0.1
04/26/2024	MDG	Call with A. Antypas (Akin) re: Sumitomo contract	0.2
04/27/2024	KBM	Communication with Committee Counsel re: changes to Cash Management Order	0.4
04/28/2024	KBM	Communication with Committee Counsel re: changes to Cash Management Order	0.4



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/29/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	AV	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	CH	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	CR	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	CR	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	DL	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners), P. Brown, S. Millman, D. Roehrenbeck (Carr) re: call with landlord creditor to discuss general case status and Committee composition	0.5
04/29/2024	DM	Prepare for public information discussion with Enviva creditor	0.7



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/29/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	KBM	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	LH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	LH	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	LH	Call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: investigation status and related discovery.	0.5
04/29/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners), P. Brown, S. Millman, D. Roehrenbeck (Carr) re: call with landlord creditor to discuss general case status and Committee composition	0.5
04/29/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	MDG	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/29/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: investigation status and related discovery.	0.5
04/29/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	RMC	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	SW	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/29/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering DIP proposal and other case matters	0.8
04/29/2024	TGP	Call with R. Collura, M. Cowen, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), W. Greve and others (Ducera), A. Antypas and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.3
04/30/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), C. Gessner (Akin) re: DIP budget allocation	0.2
04/30/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), Committee Members (UCC) re: continued UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	0.3
04/30/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/30/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics (partial attendance)	1.0
04/30/2024	CC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	CR	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	CR	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	DL	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	DM	Call with R. Collura, M. Cervi, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/30/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), Committee Members (UCC) re: continued UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	0.3
04/30/2024	DM	Prepare for calls with Enviva UCC and advisors	0.4
04/30/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), Committee Members (UCC) re: continued UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	0.3
04/30/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	LH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	LH	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), C. Gessner (Akin) re: DIP budget allocation	0.2
04/30/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), Committee Members (UCC) re: continued UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	0.3
04/30/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/30/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	MC	Respond to DIP data request from C. Gessner (Akin)	0.6
04/30/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	RC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
04/30/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/30/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin) re: UCC meeting pre-call for advisors	0.5
04/30/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, R. Collura, M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, L. Hill, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, C. Rubel, A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners), S. Schiff and others (Ducera), S. Alberino and others (Akin), Committee Members (UCC) re: UCC meeting covering outstanding DIP matters and other case topics	1.5
Total Professional Hours			<u>167.2</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with UCC and Creditors
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.2

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS		FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	26.9	\$	38,601.50
David Hindman	\$1,410	1.3		1,833.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	18.4		25,392.00
Marc J Brown	\$1,320	0.5		660.00
Richard Collura	\$1,320	8.0		10,560.00
Christopher Rubel	\$1,200	8.4		10,080.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	16.0		18,000.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	11.5		11,787.50
Loring Hill	\$960	8.0		7,680.00
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	5.6		5,376.00
Scott Weiner	\$960	4.7		4,512.00
Andrew Valentini	\$855	13.0		11,115.00
Christopher Cuomo	\$800	9.3		7,440.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	11.4		9,120.00
Chase Hood	\$690	12.5		8,625.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$690	8.6		5,934.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$690	3.1		2,139.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		167.2	\$	178,855.00



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Preparation of Committee Presentations
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.3

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/2024	DM	Review draft Enviva working group list	0.3
04/02/2024	CH	Prepare summary presentation for Committee re: first day motions	2.7
04/02/2024	KBM	Coordinate preparation of weekly Committee presentation with M. Gates (AlixPartners)	0.6
04/02/2024	MDG	Revise presentation on first day motions	2.5
04/03/2024	CH	Draft additional updates to Committee discussion materials re: first day motions to incorporate comments from counsel	1.8
04/03/2024	CH	Draft updates to Committee presentation materials re: first day motions to incorporate comments from D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn	2.7
04/03/2024	DM	Review and revise draft presentation to Enviva UCC re: analysis of first day motions	1.8
04/03/2024	KBM	Revise summary of first day motions for Committee	2.2
04/03/2024	MDG	Review and update presentation on first day motions	1.9
04/04/2024	DM	Review and comment on revised draft Enviva first day motions presentation	0.4
04/04/2024	KBM	Prepare for weekly Committee presentation	1.0
04/08/2024	AV	Draft slide for presentation re: capex spend at Epes facility	0.8
04/08/2024	AV	Draft slides for Committee presentation re: DIP budget to actuals and sources and uses bridge	2.3
04/08/2024	AV	Revise DIP presentation for UCC re: comments M Cervi	0.6
04/09/2024	AV	Revise DIP deck re: internal comments	1.4
04/09/2024	AV	Revise DIP deck re: updated budget to actuals	1.6
04/09/2024	CH	Draft updates to first day motion summary materials for upcoming Committee call to incorporate agreed revisions and comments from counsel	2.5
04/09/2024	KBM	Review and update first day motion presentation for the Committee	1.1
04/09/2024	MDG	Revise first day motion presentation in response to comments from K. McGlynn	0.9
04/09/2024	MDG	Update materials for Committee on first day motions	2.3
04/10/2024	AV	Draft presentation re: DIP funding requirements through 5/10/24	2.7
04/10/2024	KBM	Prepare for weekly Committee meeting presentation	0.6
04/10/2024	MC	Review draft DIP budget interim extension slides	0.6
04/11/2024	AV	Revise UCC presentation re: budget to actual CF budget	1.4
04/15/2024	AV	Revise DIP Milestones deck re: comments from M. Cervi and D. MacGreevey	2.5
04/16/2024	MC	Review draft slides on liquidity runway	1.6
04/17/2024	AV	Revise DIP variance deck re: breakout of spend from CV , postpetition capex and favorable trade terms	1.3
04/17/2024	AV	Revise DIP variance deck re: comments from M. Cervi	1.6
04/17/2024	AV	Revise DIP variance deck re: liquidity position tracker	1.4
04/17/2024	AV	Revise DIP variance report re: comments from K. McGlynn	0.2
04/17/2024	CH	Draft updates to discussion materials for upcoming Committee call to incorporate comments from M. Cervi (AlixPartners) and A. Antypas (Akin)	1.7
04/17/2024	CH	Prepare professionals workstream tracker discussion materials for upcoming Committee call	2.8
04/17/2024	KBM	Review presentation for the Committee re: DIP	0.9
04/17/2024	KBM	Revise liquidity update presentation	0.8
04/17/2024	MC	Analyze draft DIP budget reporting slides	1.2
04/19/2024	AV	Draft DIP sizing deck for Committee	2.6



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Preparation of Committee Presentations
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.3

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/19/2024	AV	Revise DIP sizing deck for Committee re: comments from M. Cervi	1.8
04/21/2024	AV	Revise DIP sizing deck for Committee re: comments from D. MacGreevey	2.7
04/21/2024	DM	Review draft presentation to Enviva UCC re: liquidity analysis and scenarios	0.5
04/22/2024	AV	Draft budget to actual presentation for UCC re: report for week ending 4/12	2.9
04/22/2024	AV	Revise budget to actual presentation for UCC re: comments from D. MacGreevey	1.6
04/22/2024	AV	Revise budget to actual presentation for UCC re: comments from M. Cervi	1.4
04/22/2024	DM	Review presentation to Enviva UCC re: budget analysis	0.6
04/22/2024	KBM	Review revisions to liquidity presentation for the Committee	0.9
04/23/2024	AV	Revise budget to actual presentation for UCC re: variances from critical vendor program	0.8
04/24/2024	AV	Draft outline of UCC presentation re: key updates and workstreams	2.4
04/24/2024	CH	Prepare revised demonstrative materials for Committee re: project management tracker and workstream timeline	2.6
04/24/2024	DM	Review draft presentation to Enviva UCC re: detailed work plan	0.8
04/24/2024	MC	Review updated case workplan slides for Committee	0.9
04/24/2024	MC	Review updated DIP slides for Committee	0.5
04/25/2024	AV	Draft slides for UCC deck re: revised DIP budget	2.6
04/25/2024	CH	Draft materials for upcoming Committee meeting re: updated DIP budget	0.9
04/25/2024	CH	Draft updates to materials for upcoming Committee meeting re: first day motions	2.1
04/25/2024	MDG	Update presentation on first day motions	1.7
04/26/2024	AV	Revise slides for UCC deck re: revised DIP budget	2.4
04/26/2024	MC	Edit draft Committee update presentation on DIP and First Day Motions	2.7
04/26/2024	MC	Review edits to the workplan summary slides for Committee	0.5
04/26/2024	MDG	Review updated presentation on first day motions	1.5
04/29/2024	AV	Revise slides for UCC deck re: comments from M. Cervi	2.6
04/29/2024	AV	Revise slides for UCC deck re: DIP bridge analysis	1.8
04/29/2024	CH	Draft updates to presentation materials in advance of upcoming Committee call	1.6
04/29/2024	KBM	Review changes to UCC work plan for Committee	0.8
04/29/2024	MC	Review comments from J. Rubin (Akin) re: workplan slides for Committee	0.2
04/29/2024	MC	Update UCC workplan slides for Committee	0.6
04/29/2024	MDG	Review and finalize update on first day motions	0.7
04/30/2024	KBM	Review updates to first day motion presentation for the Committee	0.3
04/30/2024	KBM	Review updates to liquidity presentation for the Committee	0.6
04/30/2024	MDG	Draft narrative on raise the bridge initiative for Committee presentation	1.6
Total Professional Hours			<u>100.9</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Preparation of Committee Presentations
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.3

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	4.4	\$ 6,314.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	9.8	13,524.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	8.8	9,900.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	13.1	13,427.50
Andrew Valentini	\$855	43.4	37,107.00
Chase Hood	\$690	21.4	14,766.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		100.9	\$ 95,038.50



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
03/30/2024	DM	Discussion with M. Rajceвич (A&M) re: Enviva kickoff	0.7
03/30/2024	DM	Prepare for discussion with M. Rajceвич (A&M) re: Enviva kickoff	0.5
04/05/2024	AV	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera), and D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: initial DIP budget walkthrough	1.0
04/05/2024	CH	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera), and D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: initial DIP budget walkthrough	1.0
04/05/2024	CC	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera), and D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: initial DIP budget walkthrough	1.0
04/05/2024	DL	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera), and D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: initial DIP budget walkthrough	1.0
04/05/2024	DM	Attend meeting with D. Shiffman and P. Mosley (A&M), J. Koh (Ducera), K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, C. Hood and D. Lopresti re: Enviva diligence and DIP sizing walk through	1.0
04/05/2024	KBM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera), and D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: initial DIP budget walkthrough	1.0
04/05/2024	MC	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera), and D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: initial DIP budget walkthrough	1.0
04/05/2024	MDG	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera), and D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: initial DIP budget walkthrough	1.0
04/05/2024	TGP	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, C. Cuomo, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Koh and others (Ducera), and D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: initial DIP budget walkthrough	1.0
04/07/2024	AV	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), and C. Matthaеus and others (A&M) re: first day motion reporting	0.6
04/07/2024	CH	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), and C. Matthaеus and others (A&M) re: first day motion reporting	0.6



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/07/2024	DL	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), and C. Matthaues and others (A&M) re: first day motion reporting	0.6
04/07/2024	DM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), and C. Matthaues and others (A&M) re: first day motion reporting	0.6
04/07/2024	KBM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), and C. Matthaues and others (A&M) re: first day motion reporting	0.6
04/07/2024	MDG	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, D. Lopresti, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), and C. Matthaues and others (A&M) re: first day motion reporting	0.6
04/09/2024	AV	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaues and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), and W. Greve and others (Ducera) re: DIP updates	1.0
04/09/2024	AV	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaues and others (A&M) re: critical vendor and DIP motion outstanding diligence items and latest variance reporting	0.7
04/09/2024	AV	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), C. Matthaues and others (A&M), and M. Pyeatt and others (V&E) re: outstanding first day motion diligence items	0.5
04/09/2024	AV	Participate in call with K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaues and others (A&M), and C. Tempke and others (Lazard) re: DIP facility and marketing process	0.7
04/09/2024	CH	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaues and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), and W. Greve and others (Ducera) re: DIP updates	1.0
04/09/2024	CH	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaues and others (A&M) re: critical vendor and DIP motion outstanding diligence items and latest variance reporting	0.7
04/09/2024	CH	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), C. Matthaues and others (A&M), and M. Pyeatt and others (V&E) re: outstanding first day motion diligence items	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/09/2024	CH	Participate in call with K. McGlynn, C. Hood (both AlixPartners), C. Matthaueus, and K. Harmon (both A&M) re: outstanding tax motion diligence items	0.3
04/09/2024	CH	Participate in call with K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), and C. Tempke and others (Lazard) re: DIP facility and marketing process	0.7
04/09/2024	DL	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), and W. Greve and others (Ducera) re: DIP updates	1.0
04/09/2024	DM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor and DIP motion outstanding diligence items and latest variance reporting	0.7
04/09/2024	DM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), and W. Greve and others (Ducera) re: DIP updates	1.0
04/09/2024	DM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), and M. Pyeatt and others (V&E) re: outstanding first day motion diligence items	0.5
04/09/2024	KBM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), and W. Greve and others (Ducera) re: DIP updates	1.0
04/09/2024	KBM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor and DIP motion outstanding diligence items and latest variance reporting	0.7
04/09/2024	KBM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), and M. Pyeatt and others (V&E) re: outstanding first day motion diligence items	0.5
04/09/2024	KBM	Participate in call with K. McGlynn, C. Hood (both AlixPartners), C. Matthaueus, and K. Harmon (both A&M) re: outstanding tax motion diligence items	0.3
04/09/2024	KBM	Participate in call with K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), and C. Tempke and others (Lazard) re: DIP facility and marketing process	0.7



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/09/2024	MC	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor and DIP motion outstanding diligence items and latest variance reporting	0.7
04/09/2024	MC	Participate in call with K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), S. Alberino and others (Akin), M. Genereux and others (Ducera), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), and C. Tempke and others (Lazard) re: DIP facility and marketing process	0.7
04/09/2024	MDG	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Gates, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), J. Rubin and others (Akin), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), and M. Pyeatt and others (V&E) re: outstanding first day motion diligence items	0.5
04/09/2024	TGP	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and D. Lopresti (all AlixPartners), A. Antypas and others (Akin), M. Pyeatt and others (V&E), C. Matthaueus and others (A&M), V. Yang and others (Lazard), and W. Greve and others (Ducera) re: DIP updates	1.0
04/09/2024	TGP	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor and DIP motion outstanding diligence items and latest variance reporting	0.7
04/10/2024	AV	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor motion diligence and scenarios	0.6
04/10/2024	CH	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince (all AlixPartners), B. Cumberland and others (all A&M) re: wages and benefits motion	0.5
04/10/2024	CH	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor motion diligence and scenarios	0.6
04/10/2024	DM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince (all AlixPartners), B. Cumberland and others (all A&M) re: wages and benefits motion	0.5
04/10/2024	DM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor motion diligence and scenarios	0.6
04/10/2024	KBM	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince (all AlixPartners), B. Cumberland and others (all A&M) re: wages and benefits motion	0.5
04/10/2024	KBM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor motion diligence and scenarios	0.6
04/10/2024	MC	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor motion diligence and scenarios	0.6
04/10/2024	MDG	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaueus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor motion diligence and scenarios	0.6



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/10/2024	TGP	Call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, C. Hood, T. Prince (all AlixPartners), B. Cumberland and others (all A&M) re: wages and benefits motion	0.5
04/10/2024	TGP	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, M. Gates, T. Prince, A. Valentini, C. Hood (all AlixPartners), and C. Matthaeus and others (A&M) re: critical vendor motion diligence and scenarios	0.6
04/11/2024	MC	Review trade agreement email from C. Matthaeus (A&M)	0.1
04/14/2024	AV	Emails to D. Shiffman (A&M) re: DIP model	0.2
04/15/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: DIP budget model and variance reporting	0.5
04/15/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: DIP budget model and variance reporting	0.5
04/15/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: DIP budget model and variance reporting	0.5
04/16/2024	AV	Email to D. Shiffman (A&M) re: scheduling standing calls on the DIP variance report	0.1
04/17/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, M. Gates, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: business plan model	1.7
04/17/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, M. Gates, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: business plan model	1.7
04/17/2024	JW	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, M. Gates, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: business plan model	1.7
04/17/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, M. Gates, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: business plan model	1.7
04/17/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, M. Gates, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: business plan model	1.7
04/17/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, M. Gates, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: business plan model (Partial)	0.3
04/17/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, M. Gates, S. Weiner, J. Wooding (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: business plan model	1.7
04/19/2024	AV	Call with C. Hood, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: DIP budget variance and liquidity	0.4
04/19/2024	AV	Email to D. Shiffman (A&M) re: DIP budget	0.1
04/19/2024	AV	Prepare for call with A&M re: compile questions from team	0.4
04/19/2024	CH	Call with C. Hood, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: DIP budget variance and liquidity	0.4
04/19/2024	SW	Call with M. Cervi, S. Weiner (both AlixPartners), J. Koh, W. Greve, L. Tousignant (Ducera), G. Berube, A. Finnie, H. Barry (Evercore) re: to discuss case workplan	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/19/2024	TGP	Call with C. Hood, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman and others (A&M) re: DIP budget variance and liquidity	0.4
04/23/2024	MDG	Correspondence with A&M re: scheduling call on business plan and contracts	0.3
04/24/2024	AV	Emails with D. Shiffman (A&M) re: greenbond advisor fees	0.1
04/24/2024	MC	Draft email to J. Rubin (Akin) re: green bond trustee fees	0.1
04/24/2024	MDG	Correspondence with V&E and Akin re: cash management motion	0.3
04/26/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman (A&M) re: revised DIP budget and weekly variance report	0.7
04/26/2024	AV	Prepare questions for budget variance call with A&M	0.4
04/26/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman (A&M) re: revised DIP budget and weekly variance report	0.7
04/26/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman (A&M) re: revised DIP budget and weekly variance report	0.7
04/26/2024	KBM	Call with C. Mattheus (A&M) re: outstanding cash management diligence requests	0.2
04/26/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman (A&M) re: revised DIP budget and weekly variance report	0.7
04/26/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Shiffman (A&M) re: revised DIP budget and weekly variance report	0.7
04/28/2024	KBM	Communication with A&M re: changes to Cash Management Order	0.2
04/29/2024	CH	Call with M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: customer contract re-negotiations and other case updates	0.8
04/29/2024	CC	Call with M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: customer contract re-negotiations and other case updates	0.8
04/29/2024	DL	Call with M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: customer contract re-negotiations and other case updates	0.8
04/29/2024	DM	Call with M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: customer contract re-negotiations and other case updates	0.8
04/29/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: customer contract re-negotiations and other case updates	0.8
04/29/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: customer contract re-negotiations and other case updates	0.8
04/29/2024	RMC	Call with M. Cowen, C. Cuomo, M. Gates, C. Hood, D. Lopresti, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners), B. Bergamo and others (A&M) re: customer contract re-negotiations and other case updates	0.8
Total Professional Hours			61.4



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Meetings & Communication with Debtors
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.4

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS		FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	9.3	\$	13,345.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	9.5		13,110.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	6.1		6,862.50
Jeff Wooding	\$1,025	1.7		1,742.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	4.4		4,510.00
Scott Weiner	\$960	2.2		2,112.00
Andrew Valentini	\$855	9.7		8,293.50
Christopher Cuomo	\$800	1.8		1,440.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	4.2		3,360.00
Chase Hood	\$690	8.3		5,727.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$690	3.4		2,346.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$690	0.8		552.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		61.4	\$	63,401.00



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: DIP Financing and Cash Collateral
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.6

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
03/29/2024	DM	Review Enviva DIP motion	2.4
04/01/2024	MC	Review DIP motion	1.5
04/02/2024	MC	Analyze DIP Motion	1.8
04/03/2024	AV	Correspond with M Cervi (AlixPartners) re: DIP deck	0.3
04/03/2024	AV	Draft deck re: key issues on the proposed DIP financing	2.3
04/03/2024	AV	Analyze DIP filings	2.2
04/03/2024	AV	Analyze monthly cash flow budget	0.7
04/03/2024	CH	Initial review of DIP facility and key terms	0.7
04/03/2024	DM	Discussion with Enviva interested party	0.5
04/03/2024	MC	Analyze DIP budget documents on datasite	1.5
04/04/2024	AV	Edit and revise DIP analysis and presentation	2.7
04/04/2024	AV	Review redlined revised proposed final DIP order	0.4
04/04/2024	CH	Review draft DIP issues list	0.4
04/05/2024	AV	Review A&M presentation re: DIP and 13wk cash flow forecast	0.7
04/05/2024	AV	Review and analyze DIP model provided by A&M	1.8
04/05/2024	AV	Review DIP budget to actual deck from A&M	0.5
04/05/2024	CH	Initial review of Debtors' 13-week cash flow forecast model	1.6
04/05/2024	CH	Initial review of Debtors' operating model	1.1
04/05/2024	DM	Emails with M. Cervi re: Enviva DIP diligence	0.4
04/05/2024	KBM	Review DIP commitment letter	0.6
04/05/2024	MC	Analyze DIP forecast model	2.3
04/05/2024	MC	Develop list of questions related to DIP forecast	0.6
04/05/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' DIP motion	2.2
04/08/2024	AV	Analyze DIP budget to actuals for two weeks ended 3/22	1.1
04/08/2024	AV	Review limited objection to the Debtors' DIP motion filed by the New Markets Tax Credit	0.3
04/08/2024	RC	Review information re: First Day and DIP motions.	0.5
04/09/2024	AV	Review and analyze DIP budget to actuals through 3/29	1.4
04/09/2024	AV	Review DIP Process Overview deck provided by Debtor FA	0.4
04/09/2024	AV	Review Draft DIP Budget deck provided by Debtor FA	0.6
04/09/2024	DM	Prepare for meetings with A&M and Akin re: critical vendor motion and DIP diligence	0.8
04/09/2024	DM	Review draft Ducera presentation re: Enviva DIP comps	1.0
04/09/2024	DM	Review emails with attachments from J. Rubin (Akin) and T. Spears (V&E) re: DIP positions and support in advance of negotiation discussion	0.5
04/09/2024	KBM	Review DIP issues list	0.6
04/10/2024	AV	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: critical vendor and DIP sizing analysis	0.5
04/10/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi and A. Valentini re: DIP budget analysis	0.2
04/10/2024	AV	Email to D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: projected cash through 5/10	0.2
04/10/2024	AV	Prepare analysis of DIP funding requirements through 5/10/24	2.8
04/10/2024	AV	Review correspondence with Akin re: DIP funding needs and CV spend	0.3
04/10/2024	AV	Revise analysis of DIP funding requirements through 5/10/24 re: FDM adjustments	1.6



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: DIP Financing and Cash Collateral
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.6

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/10/2024	CH	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: critical vendor and DIP sizing analysis	0.5
04/10/2024	DM	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: critical vendor and DIP sizing analysis	0.5
04/10/2024	KBM	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: critical vendor and DIP sizing analysis	0.5
04/10/2024	MC	Analyze critical vendor forecast vs. actuals	0.5
04/10/2024	MC	Analyze short term cash need related to interim DIP approval	2.6
04/10/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi and A. Valentini re: DIP budget analysis	0.2
04/10/2024	MC	Further analyze DIP forecast model	2.4
04/10/2024	MC	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: critical vendor and DIP sizing analysis	0.5
04/10/2024	RMC	Review Debtors' press release pertaining to DIP approval and syndication process	0.3
04/10/2024	TGP	Internal call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, M. Cervi, T. Prince, A. Valentini, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: critical vendor and DIP sizing analysis	0.5
04/11/2024	AV	Review DIP model re: adequate protection calculation	0.4
04/11/2024	AV	Analyze DIP model re: adequate protection calculation	1.3
04/11/2024	AV	Review NMTC limited objection to DIP	0.2
04/11/2024	AV	Revise analysis on DIP funding requirements through 5/10/24 re: assumptions for critical vendor spend	0.9
04/11/2024	AV	Revise presentation on DIP funding requirements through 5/10/24 re: comments from M. Cervi	2.6
04/11/2024	CH	Call with C. Hood, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: analysis of DIP financing	0.5
04/11/2024	DM	Review revised analysis of Enviva DIP funding required through May 10th	0.8
04/11/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: treatment of equity in the DIP financing	0.3
04/11/2024	MC	Review draft budget extension analysis	1.8
04/11/2024	RMC	Review DIP terms as proposed in Debtors' RSA	1.1
04/11/2024	TGP	Call with C. Hood, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: analysis of DIP financing	0.5
04/11/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: treatment of equity in the DIP financing	0.3
04/12/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Giller and others (Akin) re: DIP facility and equity conversion	0.5
04/12/2024	AV	Review and analyze DIP model re: DIP interest and prepetition interest calculations	1.4
04/12/2024	AV	Review DIP milestones and compare against budget	0.5
04/12/2024	AV	Review variance testing language in the interim DIP order and compare against budget	0.7



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: DIP Financing and Cash Collateral
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.6

DATE	PROFESSIONAL	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
04/12/2024	AV	Revise analysis re: adequate protection calculation	1.3
04/12/2024	AV	Revise DIP sources and uses analysis re: comments from M. Cervi	1.8
04/12/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Giller and others (Akin) re: DIP facility and equity conversion	0.5
04/12/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Giller and others (Akin) re: DIP facility and equity conversion	0.5
04/12/2024	DM	Emails with A. Antypas and S. Alberino (Akin) and M. Cervi re: evaluation of Enviva liquidity and case timeline	0.4
04/12/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Giller and others (Akin) re: DIP facility and equity conversion	0.5
04/12/2024	KBM	Review DIP issues list and related communication	1.1
04/12/2024	MC	Analyze DIP Cash flow model	2.1
04/12/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Giller and others (Akin) re: DIP facility and equity conversion	0.5
04/12/2024	RMC	Review Debtors' 8-K filing pertaining to RSA and DIP terms	2.2
04/12/2024	RMC	Review revised DIP terms based upon first day hearing	0.4
04/12/2024	TGP	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, T. Prince, A. Valentini (AlixPartners), D. Giller and others (Akin) re: DIP facility and equity conversion	0.5
04/13/2024	DM	Review revised draft Enviva DIP issues list	0.4
04/14/2024	AV	Analyze and adjust DIP model re: cash balance and DIP milestones	2.7
04/14/2024	AV	Compare and analyze receipts in DIP model to filed version	1.1
04/14/2024	AV	Review and adjust DIP analysis assumptions re: comments from D. MacGreevey and M. Cervi	1.6
04/14/2024	AV	Review DIP model re: operating receipts and transfer to/from non-debtors	0.8
04/15/2024	AV	Analyze DIP budget to actual for week ending 4/5/24	0.6
04/15/2024	AV	Analyze DIP model re: adjustment of assumptions and extension of liquidity	2.1
04/15/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP workstreams	0.1
04/15/2024	AV	Draft DIP milestones deck re: liquidity projections	2.6
04/15/2024	AV	Prepare for call with A&M re: DIP model	0.5
04/15/2024	AV	Review DIP budget to actual for week ending 4/5/24	0.4
04/15/2024	AV	Review DIP model re: adjustment of assumptions and extension of liquidity	0.8
04/15/2024	AV	Working session with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: updates to DIP budget sensitivity slides	0.3
04/15/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP workstreams	0.1
04/15/2024	CH	Draft analysis re: DIP forecast sensitivities	0.8
04/15/2024	CH	Review new documents uploaded re: DIP sizing and supporting analyses	2.3
04/15/2024	DM	Working session with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: updates to DIP budget sensitivity slides	0.3
04/15/2024	DM	Review draft Enviva DIP milestone analysis	0.7
04/15/2024	MC	Analyze DIP milestone sensitivity model	2.3



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: DIP Financing and Cash Collateral
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.6

DATE	PROFESSIONAL	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
04/15/2024	MC	Analyze latest cash flow actuals	1.7
04/15/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP workstreams	0.1
04/15/2024	MC	Respond to email from D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: DIP budget milestone	0.2
04/15/2024	MC	Working session with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: updates to DIP budget sensitivity slides	0.3
04/15/2024	MDG	Review current status of DIP issues list	0.7
04/15/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' DIP financing documents	1.9
04/16/2024	AV	Adjust analysis of professional fee forecast in DIP model	1.6
04/16/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP budget assumptions and milestones	0.1
04/16/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP sensitivity analysis	0.2
04/16/2024	AV	Review DIP issues list	0.3
04/16/2024	AV	Review internal analysis of professional fee forecast in adjusted DIP model	0.8
04/16/2024	AV	Review variances from filed DIP budget to adjusted model	0.5
04/16/2024	AV	Revise assumptions in DIP model re: effective date timing	2.1
04/16/2024	AV	Revise DIP Milestones deck re: comments from M. Cervi	2.7
04/16/2024	AV	Revise DIP variance deck re: comments form M. Cervi	1.0
04/16/2024	AV	Revise DIP variance deck re: liquidity bridge	1.1
04/16/2024	AV	Revise DIP variance deck re: prepetition payments	0.7
04/16/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP sensitivity analysis	0.2
04/16/2024	CH	Draft analysis and discussion materials re: professional fee forecast and DIP sensitivities	2.4
04/16/2024	DM	Analyze Enviva AHG response to UCC DIP issues list	0.5
04/16/2024	KBM	Review DIP budget and open issues related to motion	1.2
04/16/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP budget assumptions and milestones	0.1
04/16/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP sensitivity analysis	0.2
04/17/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP budget to actual deck	0.4
04/17/2024	AV	Review Debtor DIP comps	0.4
04/17/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP budget to actual deck	0.4
04/18/2024	AV	Analyze incremental DIP interest and fees related to Epes	1.2
04/18/2024	AV	Draft slide re: incremental DIP interest related to Epes and Bond facilities	0.7
04/18/2024	CH	Review insurance renewal premiums in relation to DIP budget	0.4
04/18/2024	DM	Review Lazard Enviva DIP comps as compared to AP comps	0.3
04/18/2024	MC	Analyze latest DIP sizing analysis	1.4
04/18/2024	RMC	Analyze latest DIP files in the VDR	1.1
04/18/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' DIP term sheets received prepetition	1.8
04/19/2024	AV	Analyze budget to actual report through 4/12	1.2
04/19/2024	AV	Analyze prepetition cash bridge re: comparison to DIP uses	1.3
04/19/2024	AV	Review budget to actual report through 4/12	0.5
04/19/2024	AV	Sensitize DIP budget with assumptions and variances as of 4/12	2.1
04/19/2024	MC	Review DIP related document production	2.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: DIP Financing and Cash Collateral
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.6

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/19/2024	MC	Review draft DIP sizing slides	2.7
04/19/2024	RMC	Analyze latest DIP file in the VDR	0.6
04/21/2024	AV	Analyze liquidity projections re: DIP draw need	1.7
04/21/2024	MC	Provide comment re: changes to DIP sizing slides	1.8
04/22/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP budget to actual deck	0.1
04/22/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: cash burn related to business operations	0.4
04/22/2024	AV	Email to D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: DIP timing variances	0.3
04/22/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: cash burn related to business operations	0.4
04/22/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: cash burn related to business operations	0.4
04/22/2024	KBM	Review outstanding issues related to DIP motion	1.1
04/22/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: DIP budget to actual deck	0.1
04/22/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, C. Hood, D. MacGreevey, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: cash burn related to business operations	0.4
04/22/2024	MC	Create analysis of DIP budget spend by component	1.1
04/22/2024	MC	Further review DIP related document production	3.2
04/22/2024	MDG	Review DIP sizing analysis	0.8
04/23/2024	AV	Review DIP model re: capex breakout and calculations	0.7
04/23/2024	AV	Review DIP model re: other working capital changes	0.8
04/23/2024	AV	Review draft of UCC DIP objection	0.6
04/23/2024	CH	Review draft DIP objection	0.8
04/23/2024	KBM	Review draft DIP objection	1.3
04/23/2024	MC	Further work to review DIP related document production	2.6
04/23/2024	MC	Review draft Dip objection	1.5
04/23/2024	MDG	Review draft DIP objection	0.8
04/23/2024	TGP	Review the UCC's draft DIP objection	0.7
04/24/2024	AV	Review Relativity data room re: DIP related documents	0.5
04/24/2024	AV	Sensitize DIP budget re: cash projections through May 1 DIP hearing	1.8
04/24/2024	DM	Review draft Enviva UCC DIP objection	0.8
04/24/2024	KBM	Review final UCC DIP objection	0.7
04/24/2024	KBM	Review information related to alternative DIP agreements	1.2
04/24/2024	RMC	Analyze latest DIP files in the VDR	1.7
04/24/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' DIP model	0.7
04/24/2024	TGP	Review email communications with UCC advisors re: alternative DIP	0.4
04/24/2024	TGP	Review the as-filed UCC DIP objection	0.6
04/25/2024	AV	Analyze variance from original DIP budget to revised DIP budget	2.7
04/25/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: revised DIP budget	0.4
04/25/2024	AV	Review Debtor presentation re: revised DIP budget	1.3
04/25/2024	AV	Review revised DIP model re: drivers and output	1.6
04/25/2024	CH	Analyze revised DIP budget and supporting schedules	1.7
04/25/2024	CH	Draft analysis re: weekly and monthly budget updates and comparison to previous budget	2.6
04/25/2024	CH	Review latest markup of draft cash management final order	0.3



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: DIP Financing and Cash Collateral
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.6

DATE	PROFESSIONAL	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
04/25/2024	MC	Analyze documents in DIP Production	3.4
04/25/2024	MC	Analyze latest DIP forecast presentation	0.8
04/25/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: revised DIP budget	0.4
04/25/2024	RMC	Analyze latest DIP budget in the VDR	2.4
04/26/2024	AV	Analyze budget to actuals for week ended 4/19/2024	0.9
04/26/2024	AV	Continue to analyze variance from original DIP budget to revised DIP budget	1.3
04/26/2024	AV	Review revised DIP model re: customer receipts	1.4
04/26/2024	AV	Review revised DIP model re: interest calculations	0.4
04/26/2024	AV	Review weekly DIP budget variance report	0.5
04/26/2024	AV	Revised DIP sizing analysis re: adjustments to revised DIP budget	2.6
04/26/2024	KBM	Review DIP documents	1.2
04/26/2024	MC	Review DIP terms	0.4
04/26/2024	MDG	Review DIP documents	0.7
04/26/2024	RMC	Analyze latest DIP file in the VDR	0.8
04/26/2024	TGP	Review DIP documents	0.4
04/27/2024	DM	Review joint AHG / Debtor proposal to resolve Enviva UCC DIP objections	0.3
04/29/2024	AV	Review DIP settlement proposal from Debtors	0.4
04/29/2024	CH	Analyze latest DIP proposal received	0.6
04/29/2024	DM	Analyze Enviva UCC DIP counter proposal to AHG / Debtors	0.8
04/29/2024	DM	Review DIP documents	0.3
04/29/2024	DM	Review draft supplemental Enviva UCC DIP objection and supporting M. Genereux declaration	0.7
04/29/2024	KBM	Review DIP documents	0.4
04/29/2024	KBM	Review information in preparation for upcoming DIP hearing	0.9
04/29/2024	KBM	Continued review of DIP documents	0.9
04/29/2024	KBM	Review supplemental objection to DIP motion and related items	1.1
04/29/2024	MC	Review DIP documents	0.6
04/29/2024	MC	Review draft Genereux declaration on DIP	0.3
04/29/2024	MC	Review UCC supplement objection to DIP motion	0.3
04/29/2024	MDG	Review DIP documents	0.3
04/29/2024	MDG	Review Debtors' DIP proposal	0.4
04/29/2024	MDG	Review response to Debtors' DIP proposal	0.4
04/29/2024	RMC	Analyze latest DIP file in the VDR	0.4
04/30/2024	AV	Prepare for call with Akin re: compile sources for allocation of DIP process	0.5
04/30/2024	AV	Review Debtor counter to DIP settlement proposal	0.3
04/30/2024	CH	Analyze response to UCC proposal re: DIP	0.4
04/30/2024	DM	Review email with attachments from A. Antypas (Akin) re: Ankura, AHG and Debtors replies to Enviva UCC DIP objection	0.8
04/30/2024	KBM	Review replies from Debtors, Ad Hoc, and Ankura's responses to UCC DIP objection	1.9
04/30/2024	KBM	Review responses and counter responses to open DIP issues	1.1
04/30/2024	MC	Review latest DIP issues list markup	0.4
04/30/2024	MC	Review latest draft of DIP Order	0.3
04/30/2024	MC	Review latest turn of DIP issues list with Debtor / AHG comments	0.5
04/30/2024	MC	Review latest UCC comments on DIP proposal	0.3

AlixPartners

Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: DIP Financing and Cash Collateral
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.6

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
Total Professional Hours			<u><u>210.3</u></u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: DIP Financing and Cash Collateral
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.6

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	14.1	\$ 20,233.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	16.3	22,494.00
Richard Collura	\$1,320	0.5	660.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	49.2	55,350.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	4.1	4,202.50
Andrew Valentini	\$855	86.3	73,786.50
Thomas G Prince	\$800	10.5	8,400.00
Chase Hood	\$690	18.3	12,627.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$690	11.0	7,590.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		210.3	\$ 205,343.50



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Liquidity and Cash Management
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.7

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/2024	DM	Review Enviva DIP budget and analyze key inputs	0.9
04/04/2024	CH	Review latest critical vendor payment reporting	0.6
04/04/2024	MC	Develop analysis of liquidity scenarios	2.3
04/05/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' DIP budget	1.9
04/08/2024	CH	Analyze year to date actual cash flow performance	0.7
04/08/2024	CH	Draft comparative analysis between year to date actual performance and forecasted performance per the DIP budget	1.3
04/09/2024	MC	Analyze cash liquidity forecast	2.7
04/10/2024	DM	Emails with attachments with S. Alberino and J. Rubin (Akin) and M. Cervi re: various Enviva critical vendor and DIP draw scenarios	0.7
04/10/2024	DM	Emails with S. Alberino (Akin) re: various Enviva critical vendor program and DIP draw scenarios	0.4
04/15/2024	CH	Review variance and liquidity reporting for week ended April 5	0.8
04/15/2024	DM	Analyze cumulative Enviva cash variances week ended 4.05	0.8
04/15/2024	RMC	Analyze latest cash management files in the VDR	0.8
04/16/2024	CH	Analyze back end professional fees and exit liquidity in materials provided	0.6
04/16/2024	CH	Research and analysis re: historical liquidity and financial position	1.7
04/16/2024	DM	Review and comment on proposed Enviva vendor agreement	0.2
04/16/2024	KBM	Review critical vendor payments made thus far and open issues	1.1
04/16/2024	KBM	Review Debtors' weekly liquidity updates	0.4
04/18/2024	DM	Review three proposed Enviva vendor agreements	0.3
04/18/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' bridge financing term sheets	1.8
04/19/2024	DM	Review proposed Enviva vendor agreement	0.2
04/19/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' variance report	0.8
04/19/2024	TGP	Develop list of questions re: the Debtors' variance report	0.4
04/21/2024	DM	Emails with A. Valentini and M. Cervi (AlixPartners) re: Enviva liquidity needs and scenarios	0.6
04/22/2024	CH	Analyze variance reporting for week ended 4/12	0.9
04/22/2024	DM	Analyze Enviva bridge to illustrate use of pre-petition liquidity	0.4
04/22/2024	MC	Research related to critical vendors by week to support DIP sizing analysis	0.7
04/22/2024	MC	Review budget to actual analysis	0.6
04/22/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' filed DIP budget	1.3
04/23/2024	KBM	Review Debtors' weekly liquidity update	1.3
04/25/2024	AV	Review Sumitomo Kaita impact on the revised budget	0.4
04/25/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' updated budget model	2.3
04/26/2024	CH	Review variance and liquidity reporting for week ended April 19	0.8
04/26/2024	KBM	Review Debtors' weekly liquidity updates	0.9
04/26/2024	MC	Analyze latest cash flow variance reporting	0.4
04/26/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' latest DIP budget model	1.1
Total Professional Hours			<u>33.1</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Liquidity and Cash Management
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.7

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS		FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	4.5	\$	6,457.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	3.7		5,106.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	6.7		7,537.50
Andrew Valentini	\$855	0.4		342.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	9.6		7,680.00
Chase Hood	\$690	7.4		5,106.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$690	0.8		552.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		33.1	\$	32,781.00



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' marketing financial projections	2.1
04/02/2024	DH	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, J. Wooding, and M. Cervi (all AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstream	0.6
04/02/2024	DM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, J. Wooding, and M. Cervi (all AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstream	0.6
04/02/2024	JW	Review data room materials re: the business plan	1.1
04/02/2024	JW	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, J. Wooding, and M. Cervi (all AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstream	0.6
04/02/2024	KBM	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, J. Wooding, and M. Cervi (all AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstream	0.6
04/02/2024	MC	Participate in call with D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn, D. Hindman, J. Wooding, and M. Cervi (all AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstream	0.4
04/02/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' marketing financial projections	1.3
04/05/2024	AV	Compile and analyze competitor financial statements for benchmark purposes	1.9
04/05/2024	AV	Review Debtors updated business plan model	1.7
04/05/2024	DM	Review inbound resume from industry expert re: assistance with Enviva business plan workstream	0.3
04/05/2024	JW	Call with M. Cervi, J. Wooding (both AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.2
04/05/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, J. Wooding (both AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.2
04/08/2024	AV	Review and analyze cash flow model re: capex spend at Epes facility	1.4
04/10/2024	JW	Meeting with Global Data re: obtaining wood pellet generation database	0.5
04/12/2024	AV	Review and analyze Company historicals	1.9
04/12/2024	MDG	Review business plan model	2.5
04/12/2024	MDG	Review dataroom files related to business plan	2.5
04/15/2024	CH	Review new financial and accounting documents uploaded re: Debtors' operations and business plan	1.6
04/15/2024	JW	Review VDR materials re: business plan support	1.5
04/15/2024	MDG	Call with M. Gates and S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.6
04/15/2024	MDG	Review documents posted to business plan section of the dataroom	3.0
04/15/2024	RMC	Analyze latest business plan files in the VDR	2.2
04/15/2024	RMC	Review Debtors' recently-released go-forward financial projections	1.4
04/15/2024	SW	Begin detailed review of business plan model	2.8
04/15/2024	SW	Continue detailed review of business plan model	1.4
04/15/2024	SW	Call with M. Gates and S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.6
04/15/2024	UR	Begin review of files uploaded to data room.	2.8
04/15/2024	UR	Continue review of files uploaded to data room.	1.2
04/16/2024	KBM	Review updates re: business plan analysis	0.8
04/16/2024	MC	Analyze business plan model	2.5
04/16/2024	MDG	Continue to review business plan documents	0.5
04/16/2024	RMC	Analyze latest business plan files in the VDR	2.3
04/16/2024	SW	Complete detailed review of business plan model	2.7
04/16/2024	UR	Conduct business plan review	2.4
04/16/2024	UR	Resume business plan review.	1.6
04/17/2024	AV	Review Enviva business plan model re: assumptions tab	2.1
04/17/2024	MC	Further analyze business plan model	1.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/17/2024	MDG	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: preparing analysis of customer contract negotiations and feasibility of projected EBITDA uplift	0.2
04/17/2024	RMC	Analyze contract renegotiation status across Debtors' customer base	2.2
04/17/2024	RMC	Analyze Debtors' capex plans across projects and geographies	1.3
04/17/2024	RMC	Analyze Debtors' 'Raise the Bridge' (RTB) plans for contract renegotiations and EBITDA uplift	1.2
04/17/2024	RMC	Filter business plan files for signs of contract renegotiations	2.3
04/17/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: preparing analysis of customer contract negotiations and feasibility of projected EBITDA uplift	0.2
04/17/2024	SW	Derive initial template of business plan sensitivity analysis	2.1
04/17/2024	SW	Draft initial list of questions re: business plan model in advance of discussion with A&M	2.6
04/17/2024	SW	Initial assessment of impact to changes in business plan drivers	1.7
04/17/2024	UR	Review business plan model at plant level.	2.3
04/18/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: business plan review and workstreams	0.2
04/18/2024	AV	Review business plan model re: plant historicals and projections	2.3
04/18/2024	DM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: call to discuss work related to Plant level analysis workstream	0.5
04/18/2024	JW	Review business plan excel model	1.8
04/18/2024	JW	Call with M. Cervi, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: business plan review and workstreams	0.2
04/18/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: business plan review and workstreams	0.2
04/18/2024	KBM	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: call to discuss work related to Plant level analysis workstream	0.5
04/18/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, D. MacGreevey, K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: call to discuss work related to Plant level analysis workstream	0.5
04/18/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, K. McGlynn, A. Valentini, J. Wooding (AlixPartners) re: business plan review and workstreams	0.2
04/18/2024	MDG	Review documents in dataroom related to customer contracts	2.0
04/18/2024	MDG	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: analyzing customer contract negotiations and feasibility of projected EBITDA uplift	0.5
04/18/2024	MDG	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: preparing analysis of customer contract negotiations and feasibility of projected EBITDA uplift	0.2
04/18/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: preparing analysis of customer contract negotiations and feasibility of projected EBITDA uplift	0.2
04/18/2024	RMC	Analyze relevant business plan files for signs of contract renegotiations	2.9
04/18/2024	RMC	Compile full list of contracts up for renegotiation	1.4
04/18/2024	RMC	Filter business plan files for signs of contract renegotiations	1.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/18/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: analyzing customer contract negotiations and feasibility of projected EBITDA uplift	0.5
04/18/2024	SW	Review business plan analysis	0.3
04/18/2024	SW	Call with S. Weiner and U. Ray (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.5
04/18/2024	UR	Develop plant level financial output templates	1.8
04/18/2024	UR	Continue development of the plant level financial output template	1.3
04/18/2024	UR	Update plant level output page with operational data	1.6
04/18/2024	UR	Call with S. Weiner and U. Ray (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.5
04/19/2024	MDG	Call with M. Gates and S. Weiner (both AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstream	0.2
04/19/2024	MDG	Review business plan model for contract-level data	1.0
04/19/2024	MDG	Review data related to customer contracts	2.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 1 contract renegotiations	0.6
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 2 contract renegotiations	0.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 3 contract renegotiations	0.5
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 4 contract renegotiations	0.4
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 5 contract renegotiations	0.3
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 6 contract renegotiations	0.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 7 contract renegotiations	0.5
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 8 contract renegotiations	0.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 9 contract renegotiations	0.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 10 contract renegotiations	0.4
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 11 contract renegotiations	0.3
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 12 contract renegotiations	0.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 13 contract renegotiations	0.6
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 14 contract renegotiations	0.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 15 contract renegotiations	0.5
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 16 contract renegotiations	0.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 17 contract renegotiations	0.3
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 18 contract renegotiations	0.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 19 contract renegotiations	0.2
04/19/2024	RMC	Verify RTB EBITDA uplift projections tie to bottom-up contract-by-contract forecast	1.7
04/19/2024	SW	Call with M. Gates and S. Weiner (both AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstream	0.2
04/22/2024	MC	Research on Intralinks related to Epes construction status as part of business plan analysis	0.8
04/22/2024	MDG	Review raise the bridge analysis prepared by M. Cowen and compare to business plan models	1.5
04/22/2024	RMC	Analyze tail risk in Customer 20 contract renegotiation	1.2
04/22/2024	RMC	Analyze tail risk in Customer 21 contract renegotiation	1.6
04/22/2024	RMC	Analyze tail risk in Customer 22 contract renegotiation	1.9
04/22/2024	RMC	Analyze tail risk in Customer 23 contract renegotiation	0.9
04/22/2024	UR	Continue with plant level review of outputs in business plan.	1.8
04/22/2024	UR	Review plant level outputs in business plan.	2.6



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

DATE	PROFESSIONAL	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
04/23/2024	AV	Analyze plant level financials re: historical performance	2.8
04/23/2024	AV	Call with A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.5
04/23/2024	AV	Review January 2024 business plan presentation	0.9
04/23/2024	DM	Participate in discussion with D. MacGreevey and S. Weiner (both AlixPartners) re: analysis of business plan plant projections	0.3
04/23/2024	MC	Review proposed workplan related to plant level analysis	0.4
04/23/2024	MDG	Review customer contract renegotiation documents	2.2
04/23/2024	MDG	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: analysis of trends in lumber price vs CPI over time and potential implications for contract renegotiations	0.3
04/23/2024	RMC	Analyze applicability of lumber price trends vs CPI trends to Japan tail risk	1.4
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 1 renegotiations	0.8
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 3 renegotiations	0.3
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 5 renegotiations	0.2
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 7 renegotiations	0.3
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 10 renegotiations	0.6
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 13 renegotiations	0.4
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 15 renegotiations	0.4
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 17 renegotiations	0.2
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 18 renegotiations	0.2
04/23/2024	RMC	Research status of Customer 19 renegotiations	0.2
04/23/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: analysis of trends in lumber price vs CPI over time and potential implications for contract renegotiations	0.3
04/23/2024	SW	Participate in discussion with D. MacGreevey and S. Weiner (both AlixPartners) re: analysis of business plan plant projections	0.3
04/23/2024	SW	Participate in discussion with U. Rao, S. Weiner and A. Valentini (all AlixPartners) re: business plan plant forecast analysis	0.4
04/23/2024	SW	Call with A. Valentini, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.5
04/23/2024	SW	Review mockup for business plan plant exhibits	1.0
04/23/2024	UR	Participate in discussion with U. Rao, S. Weiner and A. Valentini (all AlixPartners) re: business plan plant forecast analysis	0.4
04/24/2024	AV	Review Argus wood pellets industry research report	0.6
04/24/2024	AV	Review Hawkins Wright wood pellets industry research report	0.9
04/24/2024	AV	Review Relativity data room re: industry research	0.4
04/24/2024	CR	Call with M. Gates, C. Rubel and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: customer contract due diligence	0.2
04/24/2024	KBM	Review updates related to plant operations experts	0.6
04/24/2024	MC	Planning re: business plan workstream	1.3
04/24/2024	MDG	Call with M. Gates, C. Rubel and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: customer contract due diligence	0.2
04/24/2024	MDG	Review data room files related to business plan and prepare questions	2.1
04/24/2024	MDG	Review document production for business plan and contract information	2.0
04/24/2024	MDG	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: customer contract renegotiations updates	0.7



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/24/2024	RMC	Research expected payback multiple for Epes project	2.6
04/24/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: customer contract renegotiations updates	0.7
04/24/2024	UR	Update business plan model for reporting	1.6
04/25/2024	MDG	Review dataroom files related to business plan and create detailed index	2.5
04/25/2024	MDG	Review index of document production to identify business plan and contract related items	1.4
04/25/2024	RMC	Research expected payback multiple for Epes project	2.9
04/25/2024	SW	Begin to draft initial skeleton of historical business performance presentation	2.7
04/25/2024	UR	Continue with plant level review of outputs in business plan.	2.3
04/26/2024	DM	Emails with M. Cervi (AlixPartners) re: plans for Enviva leases	0.2
04/26/2024	MDG	Review document production for information relevant to business plan and contracts	3.0
04/29/2024	AV	Review business plan model re: legacy plant projections	1.3
04/29/2024	AV	Review data room re: plant age and capacity	0.4
04/29/2024	MDG	Review notes from call with A&M re: customer contracts and outline analysis and presentation for Committee	2.1
04/29/2024	RMC	Analyze Debtors' 'Raise the Bridge' (RTB) plans for contract renegotiations and EBITDA uplift	2.1
04/29/2024	RMC	Analyze Epes loan agreement	1.3
04/29/2024	RMC	Analyze total plant capacity under new RTB scenarios	1.7
04/29/2024	SW	Complete drafting initial skeleton of historical business performance presentation	2.1
04/30/2024	AV	Analyze plant level financials re: consolidated summary of all plants	1.7
04/30/2024	AV	Analyze port level financials re: historical performance	2.6
04/30/2024	AV	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstreams	0.3
04/30/2024	AV	Review plant historical financials re: plant volume	0.9
04/30/2024	AV	Review RTB update excel re: customer contracts through 2028	0.6
04/30/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstreams	0.3
04/30/2024	DM	Discussion with D. MacGreevey and S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: Enviva plant level operating analysis	0.4
04/30/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstreams	0.3
04/30/2024	MDG	Call with M. Cervi, M. Gates, C. Hood, A. Valentini (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis workstreams	0.3
04/30/2024	MDG	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: preparing analysis of contract renegotiations for presentation to UCC	0.6
04/30/2024	MDG	Call with S. Weiner and M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.2
04/30/2024	MDG	Review raise the bridge spreadsheet provided by A&M	0.8
04/30/2024	RMC	Analyze effects of delayed Epes completion on total production capacity	1.8
04/30/2024	RMC	Analyze total plant capacity under new RTB scenarios with Epes vs without Epes	1.4



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/30/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: preparing analysis of contract renegotiations for presentation to UCC	0.6
04/30/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: Epes cost and payback analysis	0.4
04/30/2024	SW	Begin diligence into cost estimate related to Epes facility completion	2.3
04/30/2024	SW	Discussion with D. MacGreevey and S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: Enviva plant level operating analysis	0.4
04/30/2024	SW	Review data room documents and identify items to include in summary of plants and ports	2.8
04/30/2024	SW	Call with S. Weiner and M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: business plan analysis	0.2
04/30/2024	SW	Working session with M. Cowen, S. Weiner (AlixPartners) re: Epes cost and payback analysis	0.4
Total Professional Hours			<u><u>192.5</u></u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Business and Strategic Plan
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.9

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	2.3	\$ 3,300.50
David Hindman	\$1,410	0.6	846.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	2.7	3,726.00
Christopher Rubel	\$1,200	0.2	240.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	8.4	9,450.00
Jeff Wooding	\$1,025	5.9	6,047.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	35.3	36,182.50
Scott Weiner	\$960	28.0	26,880.00
Uday Rao	\$960	24.2	23,232.00
Andrew Valentini	\$855	25.4	21,717.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	3.4	2,720.00
Chase Hood	\$690	1.9	1,311.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$690	54.2	37,398.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		192.5	\$ 173,050.50



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Employee Compensation and Advisor Retention Matters
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.10

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/02/2024	TGP	Analyze Lazard's retention application	0.6
04/03/2024	CC	Create template for calculating investment banking fees including sale transaction matrix	3.0
04/03/2024	CC	Participate in a call with T. Prince and C. Cuomo (both AlixPartners) re: discussion of adviser fees	0.2
04/03/2024	CC	Read retention letter for investment bankers to the debtors	0.8
04/03/2024	CC	Run scenario analysis on investment banking fees analysis	0.9
04/04/2024	CC	Edit investment banking fee template	0.9
04/04/2024	CC	Incorporate DIP and monthly fees into investment banking fee template	1.7
04/10/2024	CC	Edit investment banking fee analysis before sharing with T. Prince of AlixPartners	0.3
04/11/2024	AV	Review Debtor model re: projection of prof. fees	1.1
04/11/2024	AV	Review Lazard retention agreement	0.3
04/12/2024	DM	Review UST objection to Enviva retention of V&E as counsel	0.3
04/26/2024	MDG	Review draft Committee retention applications	0.6
Total Professional Hours			<u>10.7</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Employee Compensation and Advisor Retention Matters
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.10

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	0.3	\$ 430.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	0.6	615.00
Andrew Valentini	\$855	1.4	1,197.00
Christopher Cuomo	\$800	7.8	6,240.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	0.6	480.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		<u>10.7</u>	<u>\$ 8,962.50</u>



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Financial and Other Diligence
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.11

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
03/29/2024	DM	Review Enviva A&M first day declaration	0.6
03/29/2024	DM	Review Enviva CEO first day declaration	1.8
04/01/2024	CH	Initial review of documents uploaded to virtual dataroom	1.6
04/01/2024	CC	Conduct initial due diligence by reviewing first day declaration, company website and 10-K	2.4
04/01/2024	DM	Emails with attachments with K. McGlynn and M. Cervi (AlixPartners) re: Enviva diligence	0.3
04/01/2024	DM	Review draft Enviva comprehensive diligence list	0.7
04/01/2024	MC	Draft document request list	1.5
04/01/2024	MC	Review A&M first day declaration	0.9
04/01/2024	MC	Review items received and compare to diligence list	0.1
04/01/2024	SW	Create draft due diligence list/tracker and distribute to D. MacGreevey/K. McGlynn (both AlixPartners) for review	2.8
04/01/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' cleansing materials	0.7
04/01/2024	TGP	Review G. Nunziata's first day declaration	0.9
04/02/2024	AV	Review first day declaration	0.5
04/02/2024	CH	Research re: company background and key issues	1.4
04/02/2024	DM	Revise draft preliminary Enviva diligence request	0.3
04/02/2024	KBM	Prepare diligence request list related to first day motions	0.6
04/02/2024	KBM	Prepare initial diligence request list	0.6
04/02/2024	MC	Make edits to document request list	0.4
04/02/2024	MC	Review CEO Declaration	1.3
04/03/2024	DM	Review Ducera additions to Enviva initial diligence request	0.3
04/03/2024	DM	Revise preliminary Enviva diligence request	0.5
04/03/2024	MC	Draft email to D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: revised diligence list	0.2
04/03/2024	MC	Make adjustment to draft diligence list	0.3
04/03/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' background and events leading to bankruptcy	0.6
04/03/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' consolidating balance sheet as of September 2023	1.3
04/03/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' intercompany balances as of September 2023	1.8
04/04/2024	AV	Correspondence with M. Cervi re: benchmark companies	0.2
04/04/2024	AV	Research public competitors and review financial statements to determine potential benchmark companies	1.1
04/04/2024	AV	Review and analyze Company CapEx projections	0.3
04/04/2024	AV	Review Ducera deck re: key issues, DIP and adequate protection	0.6
04/05/2024	AV	Review Enviva court docket re: new filings	0.4
04/05/2024	DM	Review email with attachment from T. Prince re: responsive Enviva diligence files	0.3
04/05/2024	MDG	Review files updated to the Enviva dataroom	2.5
04/05/2024	TGP	Review documents posted to the virtual data room	0.6
04/05/2024	TGP	Summarize documents posted to the virtual data room	0.3
04/07/2024	CH	Draft updates to diligence tracker to incorporate recent VDR uploads	0.7
04/07/2024	CC	Create due diligence tracking file	2.5
04/07/2024	TGP	Review document requests lists	0.6
04/07/2024	TGP	Review documents posted in the data room	0.6



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Financial and Other Diligence
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.11

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/08/2024	AV	Review and analyze documents uploaded to data room re: historical actuals and cash management	0.7
04/08/2024	AV	Review documents uploaded to data room re: organizational documents	0.9
04/08/2024	CH	Draft updates to diligence tracker to incorporate additional documents uploaded	0.4
04/08/2024	CC	Edit due diligence tracking file	0.8
04/08/2024	DL	Review documents uploaded to data room and analyze AlixPartners pitch deck for case background	1.7
04/08/2024	DM	Review updated Enviva diligence tracker	0.3
04/09/2024	AV	Review UCC diligence tracker	0.3
04/09/2024	CH	Update internal dataroom for new uploads to virtual dataroom	0.7
04/09/2024	CC	Edit due diligence tracking file	1.8
04/09/2024	CC	Review Debtors' response to due diligence requests	0.5
04/09/2024	DL	Analyze first day declaration and other recent uploads to data room in preparation for Enviva case	0.9
04/09/2024	MDG	Review diligence tracker prepared for call with Akin	0.5
04/09/2024	MDG	Review updated files on Intralinks dataroom	1.9
04/09/2024	RMC	Compile latest electronic court docket files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/09/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/09/2024	RMC	Review case summary documents	2.4
04/09/2024	RMC	Review Debtors' financial statements	2.1
04/09/2024	RMC	Review documents pertaining to Debtors' capital structure	0.8
04/09/2024	RMC	Review latest files in the VDR	0.7
04/09/2024	RMC	Review latest updates to electronic court docket	1.6
04/10/2024	CC	Edit due diligence tracking file	0.3
04/10/2024	RMC	Compile latest electronic court docket files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.3
04/10/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/10/2024	RMC	Review documents pertaining to Debtors' capital structure	1.4
04/10/2024	RMC	Review latest files in the VDR	0.9
04/10/2024	RMC	Review latest updates to electronic court docket	0.9
04/10/2024	RMC	Review Debtors' debt documents	2.0
04/10/2024	RMC	Review Debtors' press release pertaining to bankruptcy announcement	0.3
04/10/2024	RMC	Review Debtors' press release pertaining to delayed 10-K filing	0.2
04/10/2024	TGP	Review documents posted to the data room	0.7
04/11/2024	AV	Review data room re: business plan files and new uploads	0.4
04/11/2024	CC	Edit due diligence tracking file	0.2
04/11/2024	MDG	Review documents downloaded from datasite	2.5
04/11/2024	RMC	Compile latest electronic court docket files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.3
04/11/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/11/2024	RMC	Review latest files in the VDR	0.2
04/11/2024	RMC	Review latest updates to electronic court docket	1.9
04/11/2024	RMC	Review ad hoc group of creditors	1.6
04/11/2024	RMC	Review Debtors' org chart documents	0.4



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Financial and Other Diligence
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.11

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/11/2024	RMC	Review transcripts of Debtors' recent earnings calls	1.4
04/11/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' 2020 10K	1.4
04/11/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' 2021 10K	2.1
04/11/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' 2022 10K	1.8
04/11/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' first day declaration	1.1
04/12/2024	AV	Review data room re: recent filings	0.6
04/12/2024	AV	Review docket re: recent filings	0.2
04/12/2024	RC	Review updated diligence tracker.	0.3
04/12/2024	RMC	Compile latest electronic court docket files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/12/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/12/2024	RMC	Review latest updates to electronic court docket	0.6
04/12/2024	RMC	Review analyst reports re: Debtor	2.2
04/12/2024	RMC	Review documents re: first day motions	1.5
04/12/2024	RMC	Working session with M. Cowen, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: reviewing recently uploaded documents to the VDR	0.5
04/12/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' 2021 10Qs	2.4
04/12/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' 2022 10Qs	2.4
04/12/2024	TGP	Working session with M. Cowen, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: reviewing recently uploaded documents to the VDR	0.5
04/15/2024	AV	Review data room re: budget to actual for 2023 financials	0.5
04/15/2024	KBM	Review new documents uploaded to the data room	0.9
04/15/2024	RMC	Analyze new loan agreement documents in the VDR	1.0
04/15/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.2
04/15/2024	RMC	Compile latest electronic court docket files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/15/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/15/2024	RMC	Research re: terms and covenants of Debtors' '26 unsecured notes	1.5
04/15/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' debt documents with respect to collateral	2.7
04/16/2024	CC	Revise due diligence tracking file	0.3
04/16/2024	DM	Review email from S. Weiner re: analysis into key drivers of Enviva bankruptcy filing	0.4
04/16/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	1.5
04/16/2024	RMC	Research recent analyst reports re: Debtors	2.9
04/16/2024	SW	Complete diligence into necessity to file for Chapter 11 and potential for prolonged negotiations with lenders	2.6
04/16/2024	SW	Draft and send summary of diligence into necessity to file for Ch. 11 and potential for prolonged negotiations with lenders for internal review and comment	1.4
04/16/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' capital structure	2.6
04/16/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' debt documents with respect to guarantees	1.4
04/17/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.5
04/17/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest electronic court docket documents for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.3
04/17/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' debt documents with respect to collateral	2.1



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Financial and Other Diligence
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.11

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/18/2024	AV	Review Epes and Bond loan agreements re: use of proceeds and covenants	0.8
04/18/2024	AV	Review recent uploads to the data room	0.6
04/18/2024	CH	Review bond settlement agreement motions	1.2
04/18/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.9
04/18/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' prepetition debt documents	2.8
04/19/2024	AV	Review prepetition cash bridge	0.2
04/19/2024	CC	Review due diligence file download for updates to tracker	0.3
04/19/2024	MC	Analyze prepetition cash flow actual	1.4
04/22/2024	AV	Review data room files re: detailed capex breakout	0.4
04/22/2024	AV	Review Debtor organizational chart re: Epes and unrestricted entities	0.3
04/22/2024	AV	Review docket filings re: customer contact	0.6
04/22/2024	AV	Review Relativity data room	0.8
04/22/2024	CC	Respond to due diligence tracking related requests from internal AlixPartners team	0.3
04/22/2024	RMC	Analyze new loan agreement documents in the VDR	0.5
04/22/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	1.3
04/22/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.5
04/22/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' recently uploaded debt related documents	0.8
04/23/2024	AV	Review intralinks re: new filings	0.3
04/23/2024	KBM	Review additional information provided by the Debtors in the data room	0.7
04/23/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.4
04/23/2024	RMC	Research trends in lumber prices vs CPI over time	1.8
04/23/2024	TGP	Review recently uploaded diligence items re: debt documents	1.4
04/24/2024	AV	Draft schedule for Akin re: greenbond fee schedule	0.3
04/24/2024	AV	Review Debtor actuals and projections re: Green Bond advisor fees	0.4
04/24/2024	AV	Review Green bond fee agreement	0.2
04/24/2024	AV	Review Relativity data room re: Epes planning and forecasting	0.4
04/24/2024	CH	Call with M. Cervi, L. Hill, C. Hood (AlixPartners) re: Relativity database document production	0.3
04/24/2024	CC	Provide due diligence questions to M. Gates of AlixPartners	0.3
04/24/2024	CC	Read background material on company (earnings transcript, investor day)	1.5
04/24/2024	MC	Review research related to Green bond professional fees	0.4
04/24/2024	RMC	Analyze latest debt documents in the VDR	1.5
04/24/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	1.8
04/25/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	1.5
04/25/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/26/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/28/2024	KBM	Review diligence provided by the Debtors related to intercompany transfers	0.9
04/29/2024	AV	Review Epes investor presentation	0.8
04/29/2024	CH	Analyze non-Debtor financial statements filed by the Debtors	1.2
04/29/2024	CH	Initial review of filed schedules and statements	1.7
04/29/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	0.7
04/29/2024	RMC	Compile links to latest VDR files for dissemination to AlixPartners team	0.2
04/30/2024	CC	Read industry analyst reports for background understanding of company	1.1
04/30/2024	RMC	Analyze recently uploaded documents to electronic court docket	1.5



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Financial and Other Diligence
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.11

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
Total Professional Hours			<u>147.4</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Financial and Other Diligence
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.11

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	5.5	\$ 7,892.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	3.7	5,106.00
Richard Collura	\$1,320	0.3	396.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	6.5	7,312.50
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	7.4	7,585.00
Scott Weiner	\$960	6.8	6,528.00
Andrew Valentini	\$855	12.8	10,944.00
Christopher Cuomo	\$800	12.3	9,840.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	33.6	26,880.00
Chase Hood	\$690	9.2	6,348.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$690	2.6	1,794.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$690	46.7	32,223.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		147.4	\$ 122,849.00



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Other Motions and Related Objections
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.12

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/2024	CH	Review court docket for recent relevant filings	0.4
04/01/2024	DM	Analyze Enviva critical vendor motion	0.8
04/01/2024	MDG	Read first day motions	1.8
04/02/2024	CH	Review cash management motion and interim order	0.9
04/02/2024	CH	Review critical vendor motion and interim order	0.7
04/02/2024	CH	Review other first day motions and related interim orders	2.1
04/02/2024	MDG	Prepare summaries of Critical Vendor and Wages motions	2.5
04/02/2024	MDG	Prepare summary of Utilities motion	0.4
04/02/2024	MDG	Review first day motions	0.5
04/03/2024	CH	Review Akin's markup to the first day motions	0.9
04/03/2024	CH	Review trading procedures and NOL motion	0.6
04/03/2024	DM	Emails with T. Hatfield (Ducera), J. Rubin and A. Antypas (Akin) and M. Cervi re: Enviva first day motions	0.6
04/03/2024	KBM	Review cash management motion	0.9
04/03/2024	KBM	Review critical vendor motion	0.9
04/03/2024	KBM	Review trading policies, wages, insurance, and taxes first day motions	1.3
04/04/2024	KBM	Review proposed changes to first day motions and comment with further changes	2.3
04/04/2024	MDG	Review markups of first day motions and related diligence material	0.9
04/05/2024	AV	Review motion to reconstitute the UCC	0.2
04/05/2024	KBM	Review comparable tier caps for ordinary course professionals motion	0.4
04/05/2024	KBM	Review ordinary course professionals motion	0.9
04/05/2024	KBM	Review Wilmington Trust motion to reconstitute Committee	0.4
04/05/2024	KBM	Review WSFS motion to reconstitute Committee and updates from Committee Counsel	0.6
04/05/2024	MDG	Compile data on comparable debtors' ordinary course professionals motions	1.9
04/06/2024	KBM	Communication with Committee Counsel re: comments to ordinary course professionals motion	0.4
04/06/2024	MDG	Update analysis of comparable ordinary course professional motions	0.5
04/08/2024	CH	Review diligence items provided in support of critical vendor diligence questions	1.1
04/08/2024	CH	Review diligence items provided in support of first day motion payment relief	1.3
04/08/2024	CH	Review diligence items provided in support of wages motion diligence questions	0.7
04/08/2024	CH	Review draft orders and redlines of final first day motion and ordinary course professional orders	0.8
04/08/2024	MDG	Review changes to ordinary course professionals motion and compare to comparable data	0.5
04/08/2024	MDG	Review current drafts of first day motions	1.0
04/08/2024	MDG	Review diligence material provided in relation to first day motions	1.5
04/09/2024	CH	Analyze additional critical vendor payment diligence items received in relation to critical vendor	0.8
04/09/2024	CH	Review proposed severance payment analysis	0.5
04/09/2024	KBM	Review changes to first day motion orders	1.4
04/09/2024	KBM	Review critical vendor issues list	0.4



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Other Motions and Related Objections
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.12

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/09/2024	KBM	Review responses and documents related to first day motion information requests	1.1
04/10/2024	AV	Review and analyze A&M presentation re: Incremental Interim Relief – 5/10/24	0.5
04/10/2024	AV	Review Critical Vendor Motion re: lien claimants from constructions	0.3
04/10/2024	CH	Draft analysis re: comparable key employee retention programs	1.7
04/10/2024	CH	Research re: comparable key employee retention programs	2.4
04/10/2024	CH	Review additional diligence support provided re: critical vendor motion relief requested	0.8
04/10/2024	DM	Emails with attachments with M. Cervi and A. Valentini re: Enviva critical vendor analysis	1.2
04/10/2024	KBM	Review and analyze KERP comps	0.9
04/10/2024	KBM	Review critical vendor open items and 2nd interim motion	0.7
04/10/2024	KBM	Review final changes to first day motion orders	0.9
04/10/2024	KBM	Review revisions to taxes and wages orders	1.1
04/10/2024	MDG	Preliminary research on KERP comparables for wage motion	0.5
04/10/2024	MDG	Research KERP comparables for wage motion	2.0
04/10/2024	MDG	Review analysis of KERPs and refine for presentation to counsel	1.8
04/10/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' wages motion	0.4
04/11/2024	AV	Review court docket and filings re: second day filings	0.4
04/11/2024	CH	Review latest weekly critical vendor payment reporting	0.4
04/11/2024	CH	Review recent trade agreements received re: critical vendor payments	0.6
04/11/2024	MDG	Review critical vendor trade agreement provided by A&M	0.4
04/11/2024	MDG	Review second interim critical vendor order and supporting documents	0.8
04/12/2024	DM	Discussion with D. MacGreevey and M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: process to evaluate Enviva proposed vendor agreements and renegotiated customer contracts	0.3
04/12/2024	DM	Review Enviva data room files in support of critical vendor motion	1.3
04/12/2024	DM	Review proposed Enviva vendor agreement	0.2
04/12/2024	DM	Review several proposed critical vendor agreements	0.3
04/12/2024	MC	Review critical vendor trade agreement	0.2
04/12/2024	MDG	Discussion with D. MacGreevey and M. Gates (AlixPartners) re: process to evaluate Enviva proposed vendor agreements and renegotiated customer contracts	0.3
04/16/2024	CH	Review latest trade agreements received and compare to first day motion relief	0.7
04/16/2024	DM	Review Epes Indenture Trustee supplemental statement iso motion to reconstitute UCC	0.2
04/16/2024	KBM	Review information re: cash management motion and outstanding diligence items	1.1
04/17/2024	DM	Review two proposed Enviva vendor agreements	0.2
04/17/2024	KBM	Review outstanding diligence requests re: cash management motion	0.3
04/18/2024	AV	Review critical vendor report for week ending 4/12/2024	0.3
04/18/2024	CH	Prepare trade agreement tracker for trade agreements received to date and compare to first day motion relief	1.6
04/19/2024	MDG	Review reporting related to vendor payments and analyze weekly trends	1.1
04/21/2024	AV	Review data room re: file detailing CV usage	0.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Other Motions and Related Objections
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.12

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/22/2024	CH	Analyze new trade agreements and compare to first day motion relief	0.4
04/22/2024	DM	Emails with attachments with A. Antypas (Akin), M. Cervi and A. Valentini re: analysis of Enviva critical vendor motion and spend	0.8
04/22/2024	DM	Review Carr properties statement re: motion to reconstitute Enviva UCC	0.4
04/22/2024	DM	Review Enviva Epes Green bonds 9019 motion and supporting declaration	0.5
04/22/2024	DM	Review two proposed Enviva vendor agreements	0.2
04/22/2024	KBM	Review outstanding issues related to critical vendor motion	0.4
04/22/2024	RMC	Analyze new vendor payments reports in the VDR	0.3
04/23/2024	AV	Review detailed vendor payment reports from the first three weeks of bankruptcy	1.1
04/23/2024	CH	Analyze new trade agreements and compare to first day motion relief	0.2
04/23/2024	CH	Review draft revised cash management order	0.3
04/23/2024	DM	Review two proposed Enviva vendor agreements	0.2
04/23/2024	KBM	Provide comments re: changes to cash management order	0.6
04/23/2024	KBM	Review Debtors' changes to cash management order	0.7
04/23/2024	KBM	Review new critical vendor trade agreements provided by the Debtors	0.6
04/23/2024	MDG	Review cash management motion and provide comments to K. McGlynn (AlixPartners)	0.8
04/24/2024	KBM	Provide comments re: changes to cash management order	0.9
04/24/2024	KBM	Review 9019 motions	0.3
04/24/2024	KBM	Review Debtors' Sumitomo rejection	0.6
04/24/2024	RMC	Analyze latest vendor payments reports in the VDR	0.3
04/25/2024	AV	Review vendor payments report through 4/19	0.6
04/25/2024	CH	Analyze latest payment reporting re: first day motion relief	0.6
04/25/2024	DM	Review proposed Enviva vendor agreement	0.2
04/25/2024	KBM	Review changes to cash management order	0.7
04/25/2024	KBM	Review new trade agreements related to critical vendor payments	0.3
04/25/2024	RMC	Analyze latest vendor payments reports in the VDR	1.1
04/26/2024	DM	Review and provide comments on proposed Enviva final vendors order	0.4
04/26/2024	DM	Review draft Enviva UCC statement re: motion to reconstitute Enviva UCC	0.3
04/26/2024	KBM	Review UCC's statement re: Committee reconstitution	0.6
04/26/2024	KBM	Review updates re: cash management order	0.9
04/26/2024	MDG	Review reporting related to critical vendor motion	0.6
04/26/2024	MDG	Review response to reconstitution motion	0.4
04/26/2024	RC	Review draft of UCC's statement re: reconstitution of the UCC and appointment of successor trustee to the UCC.	0.2
04/27/2024	KBM	Review revisions to Cash Management Order	0.6
04/29/2024	DM	Review two proposed Enviva vendor agreements	0.2
04/30/2024	DM	Review proposed Enviva vendor agreement	0.4
04/30/2024	KBM	Review new trade agreements related to critical vendor payments	0.4
04/30/2024	KBM	Review UCC statement re: Committee reconstitution	0.6
Total Professional Hours			<u>80.0</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Other Motions and Related Objections
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.12

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS		FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	8.7	\$	12,484.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	24.2		33,396.00
Richard Collura	\$1,320	0.2		264.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	0.2		225.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	20.2		20,705.00
Andrew Valentini	\$855	3.9		3,334.50
Thomas G Prince	\$800	0.4		320.00
Chase Hood	\$690	20.5		14,145.00
Robert Matthew Cowen	\$690	1.7		1,173.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		80.0	\$	86,047.00



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/2024	LH	Review background material	2.5
04/02/2024	DM	Emails with R. Komendowski and C. Rubel (AlixPartners) re: Enviva investigation work plan	0.3
04/02/2024	LH	Call with R. Komendowski, L. Hill, T. Prince, and M. Toolan (all AlixPartners) re: investigation planning	0.5
04/02/2024	LH	Draft work plan	1.4
04/02/2024	MT	Call with R. Komendowski, L. Hill, T. Prince, and M. Toolan (all AlixPartners) re: investigation planning	0.5
04/02/2024	MT	Research company quarterly income statements and cash flow statements	1.5
04/02/2024	MT	Review initial case materials	1.6
04/02/2024	RHK	Call with R. Komendowski, L. Hill, T. Prince, and M. Toolan (all AlixPartners) re: investigation planning	0.5
04/02/2024	RHK	Preparation for investigation.	2.1
04/02/2024	RHK	Review publicly filed documents for investigation.	1.0
04/02/2024	TGP	Call with R. Komendowski, L. Hill, T. Prince, and M. Toolan (all AlixPartners) re: investigation planning	0.5
04/03/2024	LH	Analyze financial statements	2.5
04/03/2024	LH	Call with L. Hill, T. Prince (both AlixPartners) re: investigation related workstreams, priorities, and next steps	0.4
04/03/2024	MT	Research SEC annual and quarterly filings	1.3
04/03/2024	TGP	Call with L. Hill, T. Prince (both AlixPartners) re: investigation related workstreams, priorities, and next steps	0.4
04/04/2024	LH	Review bankruptcy filings	1.9
04/04/2024	LH	Review historical financial statements	2.6
04/04/2024	MT	Create time line of Enviva transactions and dividend activity	2.8
04/04/2024	MT	Research November 2022 RWE contracts	1.8
04/04/2024	MT	Research SEC filings for mergers and acquisition transactions	2.9
04/04/2024	RHK	Review public documents for investigation.	2.4
04/05/2024	MT	Investigate 2022 sale and purchase agreements	2.8
04/05/2024	MT	Investigate amendments to senior secured revolving credit facility	2.6
04/05/2024	MT	Investigate senior secured green term loan facility	2.3
04/05/2024	RHK	Review first day filings and corresponding attachments.	1.5
04/05/2024	RHK	Review public documents for investigation.	2.9
04/08/2024	CR	Review first day motions and related declarations.	1.8
04/08/2024	CR	Review public filings for pre-petition transaction information.	1.6
04/08/2024	LH	Analyze prepetition transactions	1.8
04/08/2024	LH	Call with L. Hill and R. Collura (AlixPartners) to discuss investigation background and status update.	0.6
04/08/2024	RC	Call with L. Hill and R. Collura (AlixPartners) to discuss investigation background and status update.	0.6
04/08/2024	RC	Review First Day Declaration and other court filings for case background and pre-petition transactions.	1.3
04/08/2024	RC	Review public filings in connection with identifying pre-petition transactions.	1.1
04/08/2024	RHK	Review first day filings and corresponding attachments.	2.1
04/08/2024	RHK	Review historical financial statements for transactions.	1.9



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/09/2024	DM	Emails with R. Collura (AlixPartners) re: Enviva litigation support workstream	0.2
04/09/2024	LH	Analyze historical capitalization	2.3
04/09/2024	RC	Prepare preliminary potential investigation scope based on public filings review.	1.0
04/09/2024	RC	Review and analysis of pre-petition public filings.	1.4
04/09/2024	RC	Review and analysis of pre-petition public filings.	1.4
04/09/2024	RHK	Review documents produced for investigation.	1.5
04/09/2024	RHK	Review historical financial statements for transactions.	2.7
04/10/2024	LH	Internal call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: investigation status	0.3
04/10/2024	LH	Updates to draft investigation deck	2.3
04/10/2024	RC	Internal call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: investigation status	0.3
04/10/2024	RC	Review and update preliminary investigation workstreams.	0.7
04/10/2024	RC	Review diligence materials and updated tracker.	0.6
04/10/2024	RC	Review documents related to pre-petition transactions.	1.6
04/11/2024	CR	Call with C. Rubel, R. Komendowski, L. Hill, T. Prince (all AlixPartners) re: status of investigation workstreams and next steps	0.7
04/11/2024	LH	Analyze prepetition transactions	2.8
04/11/2024	LH	Call with C. Rubel, R. Komendowski, L. Hill, T. Prince (all AlixPartners) re: status of investigation workstreams and next steps	0.7
04/11/2024	LH	Draft diligence requests	2.8
04/11/2024	LH	Draft work plan	2.2
04/11/2024	RC	Review and analysis of public filings.	1.3
04/11/2024	RHK	Call with C. Rubel, R. Komendowski, L. Hill, T. Prince (all AlixPartners) re: status of investigation workstreams and next steps	0.7
04/11/2024	RHK	Review historical transactions in financial statements.	2.7
04/11/2024	TGP	Call with C. Rubel, R. Komendowski, L. Hill, T. Prince (all AlixPartners) re: status of investigation workstreams and next steps	0.7
04/12/2024	RC	Review summary of draft investigation work plan and initial analyses in preparation for call with Akin.	1.0
04/12/2024	RHK	Review historical transactions in financial statements.	2.2
04/15/2024	CR	Review public filings for pre-petition transaction information.	2.3
04/15/2024	RC	Review and analysis of diligence materials produced by the Debtors.	1.3
04/15/2024	RC	Review First Day documents and update investigation work plan.	1.7
04/16/2024	CR	Review public filings and industry research.	2.3
04/16/2024	LH	Analyze pre-petition transactions	1.8
04/16/2024	LH	Call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: diligence requests	0.6
04/16/2024	LH	Updates to draft diligence requests	2.8
04/16/2024	LH	Updates to draft work plan	1.7
04/16/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: diligence requests	0.6
04/16/2024	RC	Review and update initial UCC information requests.	1.1
04/16/2024	RC	Review and update initial UCC information requests.	1.1
04/16/2024	RC	Review materials produced in data room and updated diligence tracker.	0.8
04/16/2024	RHK	Review documents produced for investigation.	1.5
04/17/2024	LH	Analyze intercompany transactions	2.2
04/17/2024	LH	Analyze public filings	2.1



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

DATE	PROFESSIONAL	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	HOURS
04/17/2024	RC	Review diligence materials re: investigation topics.	1.6
04/17/2024	RC	Review documents related to pre-petition transactions.	1.2
04/17/2024	RHK	Review documents produced for investigation.	3.0
04/17/2024	RHK	Review public financial statements for investigation.	1.1
04/17/2024	RHK	Review shipping contracts in financial statements.	1.9
04/18/2024	LH	Prepare for internal call	1.3
04/18/2024	LH	Review documents uploaded to data room	2.9
04/18/2024	RC	Coordinate access to discovery materials in Relativity.	0.3
04/18/2024	RHK	Review documents provided for investigation.	2.2
04/18/2024	RHK	Review public financial statements for investigation.	2.5
04/19/2024	LH	Access and organize documents uploaded to Relativity	1.7
04/19/2024	LH	Analyze board packages	2.5
04/19/2024	LH	Analyze pre-petition transactions	1.1
04/19/2024	LH	Internal call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: access to discovery	0.5
04/19/2024	RC	Internal call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: access to discovery	0.5
04/19/2024	RC	Review and comment on initial analysis of pre-petition transactions.	1.7
04/19/2024	RC	Review initial data productions in Relativity and develop investigation workplan.	1.6
04/19/2024	TGP	Review recently uploaded discovery documents re: board minutes	1.9
04/22/2024	LH	Analyze business plans	2.2
04/22/2024	LH	Analyze cash management	2.3
04/22/2024	RC	Review discovery produced by the Debtors.	1.2
04/22/2024	RHK	Review documents provided for investigation.	2.8
04/23/2024	CR	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.5
04/23/2024	CR	Review slides on pre-petition transactions.	1.9
04/23/2024	LH	Analyze pre-petition transactions	1.5
04/23/2024	LH	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.5
04/23/2024	LH	Internal call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: access to discovery	0.8
04/23/2024	LH	Review discovery productions	1.6
04/23/2024	MT	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.5
04/23/2024	RC	Internal call with R. Collura and L. Hill (AlixPartners) re: access to discovery	0.8
04/23/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.5
04/23/2024	RC	Review and analysis of documents produced by Debtors re: pre-petition transactions.	1.3
04/23/2024	RC	Review historical financial information produced by the Debtors.	0.9
04/23/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.5
04/23/2024	RHK	Review documents provided for investigation of historical transactions.	1.1
04/23/2024	TGP	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.5
04/23/2024	TGP	Research re: prepetition transactions	2.8



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/24/2024	LH	Analyze CAPEX forecasts	1.7
04/24/2024	LH	Analyze financial statements	2.1
04/24/2024	LH	Call with M. Cervi, L. Hill, C. Hood (AlixPartners) re: Relativity database document production	0.3
04/24/2024	MC	Call with M. Cervi, L. Hill, C. Hood (AlixPartners) re: Relativity database document production	0.3
04/24/2024	RC	Coordinate staffing for Enviva investigation workstreams.	0.3
04/24/2024	RC	Review materials related to historical stock prices and market capitalization.	1.2
04/24/2024	TGP	Research re: prepetition transactions	2.6
04/25/2024	CR	Review draft slides on pre-petition transactions.	1.3
04/25/2024	LH	Analyze pre-petition transactions	3.1
04/25/2024	LH	Review debt documents	2.8
04/25/2024	RC	Review public filings and update work plan related to investigation of pre-petition activity.	1.5
04/26/2024	CR	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6
04/26/2024	DJ	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6
04/26/2024	IE	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6
04/26/2024	IE	Review 2019 analyst reports	2.9
04/26/2024	IE	Review 2020 analyst reports	2.6
04/26/2024	LH	Analyze debt amendments/extensions	2.4
04/26/2024	LH	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6
04/26/2024	LH	Prepare industry analysis	2.7
04/26/2024	MT	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6
04/26/2024	RC	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6
04/26/2024	RC	Review and update analysis of pre-petition transactions.	1.4
04/26/2024	RC	Review materials related to pre-petition transactions.	0.6
04/26/2024	RC	Update pre-petition transaction timeline of events.	1.4
04/26/2024	RHK	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6
04/26/2024	TGP	Call with R. Collura, L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, C. Rubel, M. Toolan, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.6



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/26/2024	TGP	Research re: prepetition transactions	2.9
04/29/2024	IE	Review 2021 analyst reports	2.9
04/29/2024	IE	Review 2022 analyst reports	2.5
04/29/2024	IE	Review 2023 analyst reports	2.6
04/29/2024	LH	Updates to draft investigation summary	2.2
04/29/2024	RC	Review pre-petition transaction analysis and provide comments for additional updates.	1.9
04/29/2024	RC	Review public filings and provide comments to summary materials.	1.8
04/29/2024	RHK	Review investigation workstreams.	2.3
04/29/2024	TGP	Research re: prepetition transactions	2.6
04/30/2024	DM	Emails with R. Collura (AlixPartners) re: status of Enviva litigation support workstream	0.2
04/30/2024	DJ	Call with L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
04/30/2024	IE	Call with L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
04/30/2024	IE	Research for competitors / peers inside analyst reports and public filings	2.9
04/30/2024	IE	Research for valuation multiples and discount rates inside analyst reports and public filings	2.5
04/30/2024	IE	Review 2024 analyst reports	1.6
04/30/2024	LH	Call with L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
04/30/2024	LH	Review documentation from special Committee	2.8
04/30/2024	MC	Review email from R. Collura re: Investigation update	0.2
04/30/2024	RC	Provide comments to the pre-petition transaction summary materials.	2.0
04/30/2024	RHK	Call with L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
04/30/2024	RHK	Review historical dividends.	0.8
04/30/2024	RHK	Review significant contract for investigation.	2.6
04/30/2024	TGP	Analyze historical analyst reports from Truist Securities	2.1
04/30/2024	TGP	Call with L. Hill, R. Komendowski, T. Prince, D. Kapadia, I. Esteban (AlixPartners) re: investigation workstreams, priority tasks, and next steps	0.2
Total Professional Hours			<u><u>244.4</u></u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Litigation Support & Investigations
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.13

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	0.7	\$ 1,004.50
Richard Collura	\$1,320	43.2	57,024.00
Christopher Rubel	\$1,200	13.0	15,600.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	0.5	562.50
Loring Hill	\$960	78.6	75,456.00
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	47.3	45,408.00
Dhwani Kapadia	\$895	0.8	716.00
Ivan Esteban	\$800	21.3	17,040.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	17.8	14,240.00
Michael Toolan	\$640	21.2	13,568.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		244.4	\$ 240,619.00



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Claims Analysis
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.14

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/23/2024	MC	Review documents reeled to rejected customer contract	0.6
04/23/2024	MDG	Review diligence information to prepare analysis of Sumitomo claim	2.0
04/23/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' motion to reject Sumitomo contract	0.4
04/25/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' vendor negotiations report dated 4/19/24	0.3
04/26/2024	MDG	Review analysis of damage claim related to Sumitomo rejection	0.7
Total Professional Hours			<u>4.0</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Claims Analysis
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.14

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEES
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	0.6	\$ 675.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	2.7	2,767.50
Thomas G Prince	\$800	0.7	560.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		<u>4.0</u>	<u>\$ 4,002.50</u>



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Valuation and Solvency Analysis
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.15

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/15/2024	CR	Review market trading data and industry research reports.	2.4
04/19/2024	CR	Analyzed market data and reviewed industry research.	1.7
04/22/2024	RHK	Review public market data for solvency analysis.	2.6
04/23/2024	RHK	Review public bond data for solvency analysis.	2.1
04/24/2024	CR	Internal call with C. Rubel and D. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: solvency analysis.	0.3
04/24/2024	DJ	Internal call with C. Rubel and D. Kapadia (AlixPartners) re: solvency analysis.	0.3
04/24/2024	DJ	Internal call with D. Kapadia and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: solvency analysis	0.5
04/24/2024	RHK	Review banker decks for valuation analysis.	2.5
04/24/2024	RHK	Review documents provided for solvency analysis.	0.7
04/24/2024	RHK	Call with M. Gates, C. Rubel and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: customer contract due diligence	0.2
04/24/2024	RHK	Internal call with D. Kapadia and R. Komendowski (AlixPartners) re: solvency analysis	0.5
04/25/2024	DJ	Research related to solvency analysis.	2.2
04/25/2024	RHK	Review analyst reports for solvency analysis.	1.0
04/25/2024	RHK	Review historical financial for solvency analysis.	3.0
04/26/2024	CR	Review equity analyst reports.	1.4
04/26/2024	DJ	Review materials related to solvency analysis.	1.4
04/29/2024	DJ	Analyze historical financial performance of Enviva for solvency analysis	2.8
04/29/2024	DJ	Research related to dividend payments of Enviva for solvency analysis	2.9
04/30/2024	CR	Review equity analyst reports.	2.1
Total Professional Hours			<u>30.6</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Valuation and Solvency Analysis
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.15

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEEES
Christopher Rubel	\$1,200	7.9	\$ 9,480.00
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	12.6	12,096.00
Dhwani Kapadia	\$895	10.1	9,039.50
Total Professional Hours and Fees		30.6	\$ 30,615.50



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: RSA, Disclosure Statement & Plan of Reorganization
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.17

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/01/2024	DM	Analyze Enviva RSAs	1.2
04/01/2024	TGP	Analyze the restructuring support agreement	1.4
04/24/2024	MC	Review research related to Green bond professional fees	0.4
04/24/2024	TGP	Analyze email communications produced through discovery re: RSA	0.3
04/25/2024	KBM	Review information related to Green Bond RSA	0.6
Total Professional Hours			<u>3.9</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: RSA, Disclosure Statement & Plan of Reorganization
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.17

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	1.2	\$ 1,722.00
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	0.6	828.00
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	0.4	450.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	1.7	1,360.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		3.9	\$ 4,360.00



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Court Hearings and Status Conferences
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.18

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/11/2024	DM	Telephonic (partial) attendance of Enviva second day hearing	0.5
04/11/2024	KBM	Attend second day hearing	1.2
04/11/2024	MDG	Attend second day hearing (partial)	0.5
Total Professional Hours			<u>2.2</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Court Hearings and Status Conferences
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.18

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	0.5	\$ 717.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	1.2	1,656.00
Matthew D Gates	\$1,025	0.5	512.50
Total Professional Hours and Fees		<u>2.2</u>	<u>\$ 2,886.00</u>



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Retention Applications & Relationship Disclosures
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.19

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
03/29/2024	BF	Draft Enviva engagement documents	1.1
03/29/2024	ESK	Emails to/from D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: retention matters	0.8
03/29/2024	ESK	Prepare description of disclosure for retention pleadings	0.4
03/29/2024	KAS	Correspondence with B. Filler and L. Prohaska (both AlixPartners) re: retention application and relationship disclosures	0.4
03/29/2024	LP	Prepare parties in interest list for firm database	2.0
03/29/2024	LP	Review parties in interest list for disclosure purposes	0.5
03/30/2024	ESK	Review email from D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) to Akin re: retention	0.1
04/01/2024	DM	Emails with attachments with L. Bonito (AlixPartners) re: Enviva matter codes	0.6
04/01/2024	DM	Emails with E. Kardos (AlixPartners) re: retention and disclosures in Enviva	0.5
04/01/2024	KAS	Correspondence with J. Newdeck (Akin), B. Filler, L. Prohaska and S. Rosenfeld (all AlixPartners) re: retention application timing and parties in interest list	0.4
04/01/2024	LP	Continued to prepare parties in interest list for firm database	1.5
04/01/2024	LP	Prepare parties in interest list for firm database	2.9
04/02/2024	BF	Draft retention documents	2.6
04/02/2024	DM	Emails with E. Kardos and D. Orlofsky (AlixPartners) re: Enviva retention and related disclosures	0.3
04/02/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Ab-Ai	2.9
04/02/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Ai-An	2.0
04/02/2024	SR	Analyze local rules as they relate to employment and retention	0.3
04/02/2024	SR	Provide comments to AlixPartners' retention application	1.2
04/03/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Ba-Be	2.7
04/04/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Be-Bo	2.0
04/08/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Bo-Ce	2.9
04/08/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Ce-Cr	1.8
04/09/2024	BF	Updates to draft retention documents	0.3
04/09/2024	DM	Begin review of Enviva retention package	0.5
04/09/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Cr - D&D	2.0
04/10/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with D&D - En	2.9
04/10/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with En-Ga	2.8
04/11/2024	BF	Updates to draft retention documents	0.3
04/11/2024	KAS	Review draft retention documents	0.6
04/11/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Ga-Ha	2.5



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Retention Applications & Relationship Disclosures
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.19

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/11/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Ha-Hu	2.0
04/12/2024	BF	Edits to draft retention documents	0.8
04/12/2024	ESK	Revise Engagement Letter	0.4
04/16/2024	BF	Revise engagement letter	0.2
04/16/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Hu-Jo	2.9
04/16/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Jo-Ma	2.7
04/17/2024	KAS	Review updated AlixPartners' retention documents	0.9
04/17/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Ma-Ne	2.9
04/17/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Ne-No	1.2
04/17/2024	SR	Revise AlixPartners' retention documents	0.7
04/18/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with No-Po	2.9
04/18/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Po - Ro	2.7
04/18/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Ro-Tr	2.9
04/18/2024	SR	Revise AlixPartners' retention documents	0.2
04/19/2024	DM	Communication with E. Kardos re: Enviva retention issues	0.4
04/19/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with Tr-We	2.9
04/19/2024	LP	Draft disclosures to be included in retention documents for parties beginning with We-Zv	1.2
04/22/2024	SR	Revise AlixPartners' retention documents	0.9
04/23/2024	ESK	Consider issues re: Rule 2014 disclosures	0.5
04/23/2024	SR	Revise disclosures	2.0
04/24/2024	ESK	Email to/from L. Phaska, D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn (AlixPartners) re: resources and Chapter 11 matters	0.5
04/24/2024	ESK	Emails to/from D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: resources and Chapter 11 matters	0.3
04/24/2024	LP	Draft disclosures for new parties received on April 24, 2024 to be included in retention documents	2.5
04/24/2024	LP	Revise draft disclosures to be included in retention documents in response to comments from S. Rosenfeld (AlixPartners)	0.4
04/24/2024	SR	Revise AlixPartners' retention documents	0.7
04/25/2024	LP	Analyze connections to parties in interest list for disclosure purposes	0.6
04/26/2024	BF	Edits to draft retention documents	0.6
04/26/2024	DM	Communications with E. Kardos (AlixPartners) re: Enviva retention issues	0.5
04/26/2024	DM	Review draft Enviva retention application	1.6
04/26/2024	ESK	Emails to/from D. MacGreevey(AlixPartners) re: AlixPartners' retention issues	0.3



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Retention Applications & Relationship Disclosures
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.19

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/26/2024	KAS	Correspondence with E. Kardos and L. Prohaska (both AlixPartners) re: relationship disclosures	0.3
04/26/2024	KBM	Review communication re: retention documents	0.6
04/26/2024	LP	Analyze connections to parties in interest for disclosure purposes	0.4
04/26/2024	LP	Update draft disclosures to be included in retention documents pursuant to comments from B. Kardos (AlixPartners)	0.6
04/26/2024	LP	Update draft disclosures to be included in retention documents pursuant to comments from Sari. Rosenfeld (AlixPartners)	0.5
04/26/2024	SR	Revise AlixPartners' retention documents	0.4
04/29/2024	BF	Draft investor solicitation emails	0.4
04/29/2024	DM	Revise additional disclosures for Enviva retention	1.0
04/29/2024	JB	Compare schedule 1 to parties in interest list for disclosure purposes	1.9
04/29/2024	JB	Review parties in interest list for disclosure purposes	1.3
04/30/2024	BF	Revise disclosures to be included with retention application	1.3
04/30/2024	DM	Review revised schedule 2 to Enviva retention documents	0.5
04/30/2024	ESK	Finalize investor emails for 2014 disclosures	0.5
04/30/2024	JB	Analyze connections to parties in interest for disclosure purposes	2.2
04/30/2024	JB	Revise disclosures to be included in retention documents	2.9
04/30/2024	SR	Revise disclosures	1.2
Total Professional Hours			<u>97.1</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Retention Applications & Relationship Disclosures
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.19

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEES
David MacGreevey	\$1,435	5.9	\$ 8,466.50
Kathryn B McGlynn	\$1,380	0.6	828.00
Elizabeth S Kardos	\$900	3.8	3,420.00
Kaitlyn A Sundt	\$650	2.6	1,690.00
Sari Rosenfeld	\$625	7.6	4,750.00
Brooke Filler	\$575	7.6	4,370.00
Jennifer Braverman	\$535	8.3	4,440.50
Lauren Prohaska	\$525	60.7	31,867.50
Total Professional Hours and Fees		97.1	\$ 59,832.50



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Fee Applications & Fee Statements
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.20

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
03/28/2024	LMB	Review Court docket	0.2
03/28/2024	LMB	Prepare Fee Application procedures memorandum	0.4
03/31/2024	LMB	Email to D. MacGreevey (AlixPartners) re: fee application protocol	0.2
04/02/2024	CH	Internal call with T. Prince, L. Bonito, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: fee applications and timekeeping procedures	0.2
04/02/2024	LMB	Internal call with T. Prince, L. Bonito, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: fee applications and timekeeping procedures	0.2
04/02/2024	TGP	Internal call with T. Prince, L. Bonito, and C. Hood (all AlixPartners) re: fee applications and timekeeping procedures	0.2
04/14/2024	LMB	Review Interim Compensation Motion	0.2
Total Professional Hours			<u><u>1.6</u></u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Fee Applications & Fee Statements
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.20

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEEES
Thomas G Prince	\$800	0.2	\$ 160.00
Chase Hood	\$690	0.2	138.00
Lisa Marie Bonito	\$550	1.2	660.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		<u>1.6</u>	<u>\$ 958.00</u>



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/03/2024	RHK	Call with R. Komendowski, T. Prince (both AlixPartners) re: waterfall analysis and next steps	0.4
04/03/2024	RHK	Review documents for waterfall analysis.	1.2
04/03/2024	TGP	Call with R. Komendowski, T. Prince (both AlixPartners) re: waterfall analysis and next steps	0.4
04/04/2024	MC	Analyze intercompany analysis data in datrroom	1.4
04/04/2024	MC	Draft email to D. MacGreevey and K. McGlynn (both AlixPartners) re: intercompany analysis workstream	0.2
04/08/2024	CH	Review intercompany creditor agreements in relation to October 2023 transaction	0.5
04/08/2024	DL	Prepare Debtor entity mapping analysis for use in waterfall model	2.7
04/09/2024	DL	Prepare Debtor entity mapping for use in waterfall analysis	0.3
04/09/2024	TGP	Analyze intercompany balances	2.1
04/10/2024	DL	Research debt items for Enviva and compile the list of collateral for each piece of debt	3.3
04/10/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' intercompany balances	2.2
04/10/2024	TGP	Create waterfall model shell	2.7
04/11/2024	DL	Revise waterfall analysis for debt items and related collateral	0.5
04/11/2024	DL	Working session with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall model set up and analysis	0.9
04/11/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' intercompany balances	1.7
04/11/2024	TGP	Working session with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall model set up and analysis	0.9
04/12/2024	DL	Revise entity mapping analysis for most recent organization chart	2.7
04/12/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' corporate structure	1.1
04/12/2024	TGP	Review legal entity mapping	0.8
04/12/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model with supporting mapping tabs	1.8
04/15/2024	TGP	Analyze balance sheet data by legal entity as of December 2023	2.4
04/15/2024	TGP	Analyze balance sheet data by legal entity as of September 2023	1.3
04/16/2024	DL	Compare waterfall analysis from prior case for differences needed on new Enviva case	1.0
04/16/2024	DL	Prepare entity mapping analysis of subsidiaries and owners for Enviva waterfall	1.9
04/16/2024	DL	Research for the existence of mechanics liens for the Enviva waterfall analysis	0.7
04/16/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' corporate structure with respect to parent and subsidiary relationships	2.1
04/17/2024	DL	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall analysis set up	1.1
04/17/2024	DL	Compare waterfall analysis from prior case for differences needed on new Enviva case	1.5
04/17/2024	DL	Prepare analysis on debt items and related collateral used for Enviva waterfall set up	1.5
04/17/2024	DL	Research Debtor entity ownership structures for Enviva waterfall setup	1.2
04/17/2024	MT	Analyze inter company balance data by legal entity	2.8
04/17/2024	TGP	Analyze balance sheet data by legal entity as of December 2023	1.9
04/17/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' intercompany data as of September 2023	2.2
04/17/2024	TGP	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall analysis set up	1.1



Enviva, Inc.
 Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
 7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
 Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis
 Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/18/2024	DL	Analyze debt documents for encumbered assets for waterfall analysis	3.2
04/18/2024	TGP	Analyze balance sheet data by legal entity as of September 2023	2.6
04/18/2024	TGP	Review mapping of legal entities	0.7
04/19/2024	DL	Review debt documents uploaded to data room to evaluate assets for any encumbrment or rights	1.6
04/19/2024	DL	Revise waterfall analysis to tag specific assets to debt items	1.5
04/19/2024	TGP	Analyze balance sheet data by legal entity as of December 2023	2.3
04/19/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' intercompany data as of September 2023	2.7
04/22/2024	DL	Prepare allocation of value tab in waterfall analysis	3.3
04/22/2024	DL	Revise waterfall analysis for new debt documents uploaded to case data room	1.2
04/22/2024	MC	Review documents received vs. request list related to intercompany account balance	0.8
04/22/2024	TGP	Analyze the Debtors' capital structure	0.7
04/22/2024	TGP	Draft work plan re: waterfall model	0.6
04/22/2024	TGP	Review current status of waterfall model	0.9
04/23/2024	DL	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall analysis updates and next steps	0.6
04/23/2024	DL	Prepare allocation of value tab within waterfall analysis	1.6
04/23/2024	DL	Update waterfall analysis for balance sheet provided by Debtor	1.2
04/23/2024	TGP	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall analysis updates and next steps	0.6
04/24/2024	DL	Prepare waterfall allocation of value tab	2.5
04/24/2024	TGP	Analyze data available for potential methods of value allocation	2.3
04/24/2024	TGP	Review updates made to waterfall model	0.6
04/25/2024	CH	Research and analysis re: intercompany payment reporting requirements for comparable cases	1.7
04/25/2024	DL	Revise waterfall allocation of value tab based on AlixPartners team comments	1.3
04/25/2024	TGP	Analyze data available for potential methods of value allocation	2.1
04/25/2024	TGP	Analyze organizational documents with respect to Enviva Wilmington Holdings LLC	1.6
04/25/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model to incorporate recent analysis with respect to allocation of value	2.7
04/26/2024	DL	Review corporate documents on Enviva Wilmington entity for organizational structure	1.2
04/26/2024	TGP	Review recent updates made to waterfall model	0.8
04/29/2024	TGP	Analyze intercompany balances as of September 2023	2.2
04/29/2024	TGP	Review latest updates to waterfall model	1.8
04/29/2024	TGP	Update waterfall work plan	0.6
04/30/2024	DL	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall analysis updates and next steps	0.9
04/30/2024	DL	Revise claims tab within waterfall analysis based on AlixPartners team members edits	1.1
04/30/2024	TGP	Analyze organizational documents with respect to Enviva Wilmington Holdings LLC	0.8



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

<u>DATE</u>	<u>PROFESSIONAL</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
04/30/2024	TGP	Call with D. Lopresti, T. Prince (AlixPartners) re: waterfall analysis updates and next steps	0.9
04/30/2024	TGP	Update waterfall model value allocation methodologies	1.4
Total Professional Hours			<u>103.1</u>



Enviva, Inc.
Attn: Glenn T. Nunziata
7272 Wisconsin Avenue, Suite 1800
Bethesda, MD 20814

Re: Intercompany & Waterfall Analysis
Code: 20011190PA0001.1.22

PROFESSIONAL	RATE	HOURS	FEES
Mark Cervi	\$1,125	2.4	\$ 2,700.00
Ryan H Komendowski	\$960	1.6	1,536.00
Thomas G Prince	\$800	53.6	42,880.00
Chase Hood	\$690	2.2	1,518.00
Daniel Lopresti	\$690	40.5	27,945.00
Michael Toolan	\$640	2.8	1,792.00
Total Professional Hours and Fees		103.1	\$ 78,371.00