
 

 

ATTORNEY MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT COVER SHEET  
FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBER 1, 2025, THROUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2025 

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
DISTRICT OF NEW JERSEY 

 
 

In re CCA Construction, Inc.1 Applicant:  Debevoise & Plimpton LLP 

Case No. 24-22548 (CMG) Client:  Debtor and Debtor in Possession 

Chapter 11 Case Filed:  December 22, 2024 

COMPLETION AND SIGNING OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES A  
CERTIFICATION UNDER PENALTY OF PERJURY PURSUANT TO 28 U.S.C. § 1746. 

 
RETENTION ORDER ATTACHED. 

 
 
 /s/ M. Natasha Labovitz        February 6, 2026 

M. Natasha Labovitz          Date 
  

 
  

 
1  The last four digits of CCA’s federal tax identification number are 4862.  CCA’s service address for the purposes 

of this chapter 11 case is 445 South Street, Suite 310, Morristown, NJ 07960. 
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SECTION I 
FEE SUMMARY 

Summary of Amounts Requested for the Period 
November 1, 2025 through November 30, 2025 (the “Compensation Period”) 

Fee Total $1,035,665.10  
Disbursement Total $1,930.24 
Total Fees Plus Disbursements $1,037,595.34 

Summary of Amounts Requested for Previous Periods 

Total Previous Fees and Expenses Requested $10,550,335.71
Total Fees and Expenses Allowed to Date $9,129,892.11 
Total Retainer Remaining $0.00
Total Holdback $283,260.11
Total Received by Applicant $10,267,075.60 

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 685    Filed 02/06/26    Entered 02/06/26 15:02:15    Desc Main
Document      Page 2 of 84



Name of 
Professional and Title 

Year 
Admitted 

Hours Rate2 Fee 

M. Natasha Labovitz
Partner 

1997 85.5 $2,317.50 $198,146.25

Mark P. Goodman 
Partner 

1988 32.5 $2,317.50 $75,318.75

Sidney P. Levinson 
Partner 

1988 21.4 $2,317.50 $49,594.50

Erica S. Weisgerber 
Partner 

2009 23.4 $2,025.00 $47,385.00

Elie J. Worenklein 
Counsel 

2012 121.5 $1,620.00 $196,830.00

Michael C. Godbe 
Associate 

2018 18.4 $1,471.50 $27,075.60

Christopher R. Ceresa 
Associate 

2020 14.9 $1,458.00 $21,724.20

Xiaoxiao Zhou 
Associate 

2009 49.6 $1,458.00 $72,316.80

Alexander Costin 
Associate 

2021 7.7 $1,458.00 $11,226.60

Rebecca Zipursky 
Associate 

2021 31.0 $1,458.00 $45,198.00

Rory Heller 
Associate 

2022 87.2 $1,354.50 $118,112.40

Shefit Koboci 
Associate 

2024 54.0 $1,287.00 $69,498.00

Benjamin Mishkin 
Associate 

2025 72.0 $1,017.00 $73,224.00

Junho Park 
Paralegal 

n/a 57.5 $522.00 $30,015.00

TOTALS 676.6 $1,035,665.10

2 In accordance with the Retention Order [Exhibit A hereto] and the Applicant’s retention application 
[Docket No. 98], these rates reflect a 10% discount to Debevoise’s standard rates. 
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SECTION II 
SUMMARY OF SERVICES 

Services Rendered Hours Fee 
Business Operations 6.0 $13,486.50 
Case Administration 23.8 $30,754.35
Contested BMLP Matters 134.8 $209,308.50 
Corporate Governance & Board Matters 14.9 $24,686.10 
DIP Financing 4.4 $6,886.80
Employment & Fee Applications 38.6 $28,229.85 
Examiner 0.4 $927.00
Investigation of Causes of Action 0.3 $625.50
Mediation 452.0 $719,151.30
Reporting 1.4 $1,609.20
FEE TOTALS 676.6 $1,035,665.10 
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SECTION III 
SUMMARY OF DISBURSEMENTS 

Disbursement Category Amount 
Computer Assisted Legal Research  $79.36 
In-House Production $14.00
Travel  $1,588.34 
Working Meal  $248.54 
TOTAL $1,930.24 
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SECTION IV 
CASE HISTORY 

 
(1) Date case filed:  December 22, 2024 

(2) Chapter under which case commenced:  Chapter 11 

(3) Date of retention:  February 7, 2025, effective as of the Petition Date.  See Exhibit A. 

If limit on number of hours or other limitations to retention, set forth:  n/a. 

(4) Summarize in brief the benefits to the estate and attach supplements as needed3: 

(a) The Applicant provided services to the Debtor related to preparing for, and 
participating in, mediation with CSCEC Holding Company, Inc. (“CSCEC 
Holding”) and BML Properties, Ltd. (“BMLP”). Among other services provided, 
the Applicant prepared a mediation brief providing the co-mediators with 
background on the status of the chapter 11 case, the New York State litigation and 
the various disputes among the Debtor, certain of its affiliates, and BMLP, and 
advised the Debtor throughout the mediation itself. 

(b) The Applicant provided services to the Debtor with respect to negotiating, drafting, 
and executing the Mediation Settlement Term Sheet and Settlement Agreement 
among the Debtor, CSCEC Holding, BMLP, CCA Bahamas, Ltd., and CSCEC 
(Bahamas), Ltd. [Docket No. 591], which resolved a key gating issue in resolving 
the chapter 11 case and will enable the Debtor to promptly pursue plan 
confirmation. 

(c) The Applicant advised the Debtor with respect to the retention by BMLP of Quinn 
Emanuel Urquhart & Sullivan, LLP (“Quinn Emanuel”) as counsel, including 
analyzing the Debtor’s client case materials received from Quinn Emanuel and 
researching and drafting a motion to disqualify Quinn Emanuel from representing 
BMLP in the chapter 11 case. 

(d) The Applicant advised the Debtor and its financial advisor on legal issues relating 
to required bankruptcy disclosures including the monthly operating reports and 
coordinated various other reporting deliverables. 

(e) The Applicant addressed corporate governance matters, including preparing 
materials and providing updates to the board of directors. 

 
3  The following summary is intended to highlight the general categories of services the Applicant rendered on 

behalf of the Debtor and for the benefit of the estate; it is not intended to itemize each and every professional 
service which the Applicant performed. 
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(f) The Applicant advised on other matters concerning the administration of the 
chapter 11 case. 

(g) The Applicant rendered all other services set forth in the invoices attached hereto 
as Exhibit B.4 

(5) Anticipated distribution to creditors: 

(a) Administration expense:  100% of claims. 

(b) Secured creditors:  Agreed resolution. 

(c) Priority creditors:  100% of claims. 

(d) General unsecured creditors:  100% of claims. 

(6) Final disposition of case and percentage of dividend paid to creditors:  Unknown at this 
time. 

(7) This is the Applicant’s eleventh monthly fee statement.

 
4  The invoices attached hereto as Exhibit B contain detailed descriptions of the services rendered and expenses 

incurred by the Applicant during the Compensation Period. 
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Exhibit A 

Retention Order
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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
DISTRICT OF NEW JERSEY

Caption in Compliance with D.N.J. LBR 9004-
1(b)

DEBEVOISE & PLIMPTON LLP
M. Natasha Labovitz (admitted pro hac vice)
Sidney P. Levinson (admitted pro hac vice)
Elie J. Worenklein
Rory B. Heller (admitted pro hac vice)
66 Hudson Boulevard
New York, NY 10001
Telephone: (212) 909-6000
Facsimile: (212) 909-6836
nlabovitz@debevoise.com
slevinson@debevoise.com
eworenklein@debevoise.com
rbheller@debevoise.com

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.
Michael D. Sirota
Warren A. Usatine
Ryan T. Jareck
Felice R. Yudkin
Court Plaza North, 25 Main Street
Hackensack, NJ 07601
Telephone: (201) 489-3000
Facsimile: (201) 489-1536
msirota@coleschotz.com
wusatine@coleschotz.com
rjareck@coleschotz.com
fyudkin@coleschotz.com

Proposed Co-Counsel to the Debtor and Debtor in 
Possession

In re: 
CCA Construction, Inc.,1 

Debtor.

Case No. 24-22548 (CMG)

Chapter 11

Judge: Christine M. Gravelle

1 The last four digits of the Debtor’s federal tax identification number are 4864.  The Debtor’s service address for 
the purposes of this chapter 11 case is 445 South Street, Suite 310, Morristown, NJ 07960.

Order Filed on February 7, 2025 
by Clerk 
U.S. Bankruptcy Court 
District of New Jersey
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(Page | 2) 
Debtor: CCA Construction, Inc. 
Case No.: 24-22548 (CMG)
Caption of Order:  Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Debevoise &

Plimpton LLP as Bankruptcy Co-Counsel for the Debtor Effective
as of the Petition Date

2 

ORDER AUTHORIZING THE EMPLOYMENT AND 
RETENTION OF DEBEVOISE & PLIMPTON LLP AS BANKRUPTCY  

CO-COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTOR EFFECTIVE AS OF THE PETITION DATE 

The relief set forth on the following pages, numbered two (2) through six (6), is 

ORDERED. 

DATED: February 7, 2025
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(Page | 3) 
Debtor:   CCA Construction, Inc. 
Case No.:   24-22548 (CMG) 
Caption of Order:    Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Debevoise &  
    Plimpton LLP as Bankruptcy Co-Counsel for the Debtor Effective  
    as of the Petition Date 
 

3 

Upon CCA’s application [Docket No. 98] (the “Application”)2  for the entry of an order 

authorizing CCA’s employment and retention of Debevoise & Plimpton LLP (“Debevoise”) as 

bankruptcy co-counsel effective as of the Petition Date, pursuant to sections 327(a) and 330 of 

the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rules 2014(a) and 2016, and Local Rule 2014-1; and upon the 

Labovitz Declaration and the Wei Declaration; and the Court having jurisdiction to consider the 

Application and the relief requested therein pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334 and the 

Amended Standing Order of Reference to the Bankruptcy Court Under Title 11 of the United 

States District Court for the District of New Jersey, entered July 23, 1984, and amended on 

September 18, 2012 (Simandle, C.J.); and consideration of the Application and the relief 

requested therein being a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b); and venue being 

proper before this Court pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409; and the Court having reviewed 

the Application, the Labovitz Declaration and the Wei Declaration; and the Court being satisfied 

based on the representations made in the Application, the Labovitz Declaration and the Wei 

Declaration that (a) Debevoise does not hold or represent an interest adverse to CCA’s estate and 

(b) Debevoise is a “disinterested person” as defined in section 101(14) of the Bankruptcy Code 

and as required by section 327(a) of the Bankruptcy Code; and notice of the Application 

appearing to be adequate and appropriate under the circumstances; and any objections to the 

requested relief having been withdrawn or overruled on the merits; and after due deliberation and 

sufficient cause appearing therefor, it is hereby ORDERED that: 

 
2  Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein shall have the meanings ascribed to such terms in the 

Application. 

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 135    Filed 02/07/25    Entered 02/10/25 09:39:17    Desc Main
Document      Page 3 of 20

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 685    Filed 02/06/26    Entered 02/06/26 15:02:15    Desc Main
Document      Page 11 of 84



 
(Page | 4) 
Debtor:   CCA Construction, Inc. 
Case No.:   24-22548 (CMG) 
Caption of Order:    Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Debevoise &  
    Plimpton LLP as Bankruptcy Co-Counsel for the Debtor Effective  
    as of the Petition Date 
 

4 

1. The Application is granted as set forth herein. 

2. Pursuant to sections 327(a) and 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, CCA is authorized 

to employ and retain Debevoise as its attorneys in accordance with the terms and conditions set 

forth in the Application and that certain engagement letter attached hereto as Exhibit 1 (the 

“Engagement Letter”), effective as of December 22, 2024 (the “Petition Date”). 

3. Debevoise shall apply for (a) compensation for professional services rendered and 

(b) reimbursement of expenses incurred in connection with CCA’s chapter 11 case, in both cases 

subject to the Court’s approval and in compliance with the applicable provisions of the 

Bankruptcy Code (including, but not limited to, sections 331 and 330 of the Bankruptcy Code), 

the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules and any other applicable procedures or orders of the 

Court.  Debevoise shall make a reasonable effort to comply with the U.S. Trustee Guidelines, 

both in connection with the Application and the interim and final fee applications to be filed by 

Debevoise in the chapter 11 case.   

4. Notwithstanding anything in this Order to the contrary, Debevoise is also 

authorized to represent CCA and the non-Debtor defendants in connection with the Baha Mar 

Litigation and all fees incurred in connection with the Baha Mar Litigation shall be paid by the 

non-Debtor defendants, and not by CCA, and Court approval shall not be required for such 

related fees. 

5. In order to avoid any duplication of effort and provide services to CCA in the 

most efficient and cost-effective manner, Debevoise shall coordinate with Cole Schotz P.C. and 

any additional firms CCA retains regarding their respective responsibilities in the chapter 11 

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 135    Filed 02/07/25    Entered 02/10/25 09:39:17    Desc Main
Document      Page 4 of 20

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 685    Filed 02/06/26    Entered 02/06/26 15:02:15    Desc Main
Document      Page 12 of 84



 
(Page | 5) 
Debtor:   CCA Construction, Inc. 
Case No.:   24-22548 (CMG) 
Caption of Order:    Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Debevoise &  
    Plimpton LLP as Bankruptcy Co-Counsel for the Debtor Effective  
    as of the Petition Date 
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case. As such, Debevoise shall use its best efforts to avoid duplication of services provided by 

any of CCA’s other retained professionals in the chapter 11 case. 

6. Prior to any increases in Debevoise’s rates set forth in the Application, Debevoise 

shall file a supplemental affidavit with the Court and provide 10-days’ notice to CCA, the U.S. 

Trustee and any official committee appointed in the chapter 11 case.  All parties in interest retain 

their rights to object to any rate increase on all grounds, including the reasonableness standard 

set forth in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, and the Court retains the right to review any rate 

increase pursuant to section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code. 

7. Debevoise shall (i) only bill 50% for non-working travel; (ii) not seek the 

reimbursement of any fees or costs, including attorney fees and costs, arising from the defense of 

any filed objections to any of Debevoise’s fee applications in this chapter 11 case; (iii) use the 

billing and expense categories set forth in the U.S. Trustee Guidelines (Exhibit D-1 “Summary of 

Compensation Requested by Project Category”); and (iv) provide any and all monthly fee 

statements, interim fee applications, and final fee applications in “LEDES” format to the United 

States Trustee. 

8. Notwithstanding anything in the Application or the Labovitz Declaration to the 

contrary, Debevoise shall seek reimbursement from the Debtor’s estate for its engagement-

related expenses at the firm’s actual cost paid. 

9. Notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the Application or the Engagement 

Letter, to the extent that Debevoise uses the services of independent contractors or 

subcontractors (collectively, the “Contractors”) in this chapter 11 case, Debevoise (a) shall 
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Debtor:   CCA Construction, Inc. 
Case No.:   24-22548 (CMG) 
Caption of Order:    Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of Debevoise &  
    Plimpton LLP as Bankruptcy Co-Counsel for the Debtor Effective  
    as of the Petition Date 
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passthrough the cost of such Contractors to CCA at the same rate that it pays the Contractors; (b) 

shall seek reimbursement for actual out-of-pocket expenses only; (c) shall ensure that the 

Contractors submit the same connections disclosures as required of professionals by Bankruptcy 

Rule 2014; and (v) attach any such Contractor invoices to its monthly fee statements, interim fee 

applications and/or final fee applications filed in this case.  No agreement or understanding exists 

between Debevoise and any other person other than as permitted by Bankruptcy Code section 

504 to share compensation for services rendered in connection with this chapter 11 case, nor 

shall Debevoise share or agree to share compensation received for services rendered in 

connection with this case with any other person other than as permitted by Bankruptcy Code 

section 504.   

10. Notwithstanding Debevoise’s Terms of Engagement, the provision concerning fee 

disputes is null and void during the pendency of this Chapter 11 Case.  

11. To the extent the Application, the Labovitz Declaration, or any engagement 

agreement pertaining to this retention is inconsistent with this Order, the terms of this Order shall 

govern.  

12. CCA and Debevoise are authorized to take all actions necessary to effectuate the 

relief granted pursuant to this Order in accordance with the Application. 

13. Notwithstanding any Bankruptcy Rule or Local Rule to the contrary, the terms 

and conditions of this Order shall be immediately effective and enforceable upon its entry. 

14. The Court retains jurisdiction with respect to all matters arising from or related to 

the implementation of this Order. 
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EXHIBIT 1 

Engagement Letter 
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Exhibit B 

Invoices 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503508 Client Matter 27188.1012 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with BUSINESS 
OPERATIONS 

Fees $13,486.50  

Charges and Disbursements $0.00 

TOTAL $13,486.50  
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27188.1012 – BUSINESS OPERATIONS Invoice Number: 2503508 

Page 2

Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/24/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Draft email to FGS team re update on case (0.1); participate in 
weekly call with FGS re open workstreams (0.5). 

0.6 

11/25/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review BMLP's proposed press release (0.2); email with 
Debevoise team re CCA press release (0.6). 

0.8 

11/25/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review BMLP's proposed press statement (0.2); correspond 
with Debevoise team re same (0.3). 

0.5 

11/26/25 Goodman, Mark P. Email Debevoise team and FSG team re press release on 
settlement (0.2); review draft press materials provided by FGS 
Global (0.2); review press coverage of announcement of 
settlement (0.4). 

0.8 

11/26/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review BMLP press release (0.3); correspond with FGS team 
and Debevoise team re same and related communications 
materials (0.4); monitor press reports (0.2). 

0.9 

11/27/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review media coverage of settlement (0.2); email with 
Debevoise team re same (0.2). 

0.4 

11/27/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review Bahamian press reports (0.3); correspond with 
Debevoise team re same (0.1); correspond with Y. Wei [CCA] 
re same (0.2). 

0.5 

11/28/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review additional coverage of settlement. 0.2 

11/28/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review further press reports. 0.3 

11/29/25 Goodman, Mark P. Call with Y. Wei [CCA] re media coverage and related issues 
(0.3); review selected media coverage (0.4). 

0.7 

11/30/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review media coverage and email re same. 0.3 

Total Hours 6.0 
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27188.1012 – BUSINESS OPERATIONS  Invoice Number: 2503508 

 

  Page 3 
  

 

 
 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Partner Goodman, Mark P. 3.2 2,317.50 7,416.00 

 Labovitz, M. Natasha 2.2 2,317.50 5,098.50 

Partner Total 5.4  $12,514.50 

    
 Counsel Worenklein, Elie J. 0.6 1,620.00 972.00 

Counsel Total 0.6  $972.00 

    
 

Matter Total 6.0  $13,486.50 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503509 Client Matter 27188.1008 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with CASE 
ADMINISTRATION 

Fees $30,754.35  

Charges and Disbursements $1,930.24 

TOTAL $32,684.59  

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 685    Filed 02/06/26    Entered 02/06/26 15:02:15    Desc Main
Document      Page 33 of 84



27188.1008 – CASE ADMINISTRATION  Invoice Number: 2503509 

 

  Page 2 
  

 

Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/03/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Participate in weekly client update call with CCA team re 
upcoming workstreams. 

0.5 

11/03/25 Heller, Rory Coordinate with parties re upcoming hearings. 0.7 

11/03/25 Park, Junho Update docket files. 0.2 

11/04/25 Park, Junho Coordinate conference room setups for upcoming meeting 
between the parties. 

0.4 

11/05/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Coordinate with E. Worenklein re scheduling of upcoming 
hearings. 

0.1 

11/05/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Email with Debevoise team re scheduling omnibus hearings. 0.4 

11/05/25 Heller, Rory Correspond with Cole Schotz team re scheduling of future 
hearings. 

0.3 

11/05/25 Park, Junho Correspond with E. Worenklein re upcoming pre mediation 
meeting. 

0.2 

11/06/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Correspond with A. Milliaressis [Cole Schotz] re hearing 
timing. 

0.1 

11/06/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Mark up draft removal motion (0.7); mark up draft WIP report 
(0.6). 

1.5 

11/06/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Update WIP checklist. 1.5 

11/07/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review WIP report and critical date list (0.2); review updates 
from WIP call (0.2). 

0.4 

11/07/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Participate [partial] in weekly Debevoise team WIP meeting 
with E. Worenklein, M. Godbe, C. Ceresa [partial], R. Heller 
[partial], S. Koboci, B. Mishkin and J. Park. 

0.2 

11/07/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Join weekly team WIP meeting with E. Weisgerber [partial], M. 
Godbe, C. Ceresa [partial], R. Heller [partial], S. Koboci, B. 
Mishkin and J. Park. 

0.6 

11/07/25 Ceresa, Chris Participate [partial] in WIP meeting re pending workstreams 
with E. Weisgerber [partial], E. Worenklein, M. Godbe, R. 
Heller [partial], S. Koboci, B. Mishkin and J. Park. 

0.4 

11/07/25 Godbe, Michael C. Join WIP meeting with E. Weisgerber [partial], E. Worenklein, 
C. Ceresa [partial], R. Heller [partial], S. Koboci, B. Mishkin 
and J. Park. 

0.6 

11/07/25 Heller, Rory Participate [partial] in WIP meeting with E. Weisgerber [partial] 
E. Worenklein, M. Godbe, C. Ceresa, S. Koboci, B. Mishkin and 
J. Park. 

0.4 

11/07/25 Koboci, Shefit Participate in WIP meeting re workstreams with E. Weisgerber 
[partial], E. Worenklein, M. Godbe, C. Ceresa [partial], R. 
Heller [partial], B. Mishkin and J. Park. 

0.6 

11/07/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Prepare for WIP (0.1); participate in WIP meeting with E. 
Weisgerber [partial], E. Worenklein, M. Godbe, C. Ceresa 
[partial], R. Heller [partial], S. Koboci and J. Park (0.6). 

0.7 

11/07/25 Park, Junho Review WIP update (0.3); circulate updated critical date list to 
Debevoise group (0.3); participate in WIP meeting with E. 
Weisgerber [partial], E. Worenklein, M. Godbe, C. Ceresa 
[partial], R. Heller [partial], S. Koboci, and B. Mishkin (0.6). 

1.2 
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/08/25 Park, Junho Correspond with R. Heller re meeting attendee list (0.1); 
coordinate logistics re same (0.2); register guests for upcoming 
meeting (0.2). 

0.5 

11/09/25 Park, Junho Correspond with R. Heller and E. Worenklein re upcoming 
meeting (0.1); register additional guest re same (0.1). 

0.2 

11/10/25 Heller, Rory Schedule omnibus hearings. 0.4 

11/11/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Coordinate with team re hearing scheduling. 0.1 

11/11/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Meet with M. Godbe re case updates and mediation status. 0.9 

11/11/25 Godbe, Michael C. Meet with E. Worenklein re case update. 0.9 

11/12/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review status of motions for December 2 hearing. 0.2 

11/13/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Mark up weekly WIP report. 0.7 

11/13/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Update WIP checklist (1.0); further update checklist per E. 
Worenklein comments (0.5). 

1.5 

11/13/25 Park, Junho Circulate new omnibus hearing dates and deadlines (0.4); update 
critical date list (0.5). 

0.9 

11/14/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Attend WIP call [partial] with working team (0.5); review WIP 
report (0.2). 

0.7 

11/14/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Participate [partial] in weekly Debevoise team WIP call with N. 
Labovitz, E. Worenklein, C. Ceresa, R. Heller, B. Mishkin and 
J. Park. 

0.5 

11/14/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Join in weekly WIP call with N. Labovitz [partial], E. 
Weisgerber [partial], C. Ceresa, R. Heller, B. Mishkin and J. 
Park. 

0.6 

11/14/25 Ceresa, Chris Participate in WIP call with N. Labovitz [partial], E. Weisgerber 
[partial], E. Worenklein, R. Heller, B. Mishkin and J. Park. 

0.6 

11/14/25 Heller, Rory Participate in WIP call with N. Labovitz [partial], E. Weisgerber 
[partial], E. Worenklein, C. Ceresa, B. Mishkin and J. Park. 

0.6 

11/14/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Participate in WIP call with N. Labovitz [partial], E. Weisgerber 
[partial], E. Worenklein, C. Ceresa, R. Heller, and J. Park. 

0.6 

11/14/25 Park, Junho Participate in weekly WIP call with N. Labovitz [partial], E. 
Weisgerber [partial], E. Worenklein, C. Ceresa, R. Heller, and 
B. Mishkin (0.6); update docket files for attorney review (0.2). 

0.8 

11/17/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with S. Koboci re status of open workstreams. 0.5 

11/17/25 Koboci, Shefit Call with E. Worenklein to discuss various open workstreams. 0.5 

11/18/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Call with M. Godbe re status of open case items. 0.2 

11/18/25 Godbe, Michael C. Speak with E. Worenklein re WIP. 0.2 

11/21/25 Godbe, Michael C. Call with E. Worenklein re WIP. 0.2 

11/23/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with J. Park re case status, hearing, and next steps. 0.2 

11/23/25 Park, Junho Phone call with E. Worenklein re next steps in case. 0.2 

11/26/25 Park, Junho Correspond with E. Worenklein re upcoming December 2 
hearing. 

0.1 

 

  Total Hours 23.8 
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TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Partner Labovitz, M. Natasha 1.6 2,317.50 3,708.00 

 Weisgerber, Erica S. 0.7 2,025.00 1,417.50 

Partner Total 2.3  $5,125.50 

    
 Counsel Worenklein, Elie J. 6.1 1,620.00 9,882.00 

Counsel Total 6.1  $9,882.00 

    
 Associate Godbe, Michael C. 1.9 1,471.50 2,795.85 

 Ceresa, Chris 1.0 1,458.00 1,458.00 

 Heller, Rory 2.4 1,354.50 3,250.80 

 Koboci, Shefit 1.1 1,287.00 1,415.70 

 Mishkin, Benjamin 4.3 1,017.00 4,373.10 

Associate Total 10.7  $13,293.45 

    
 Legal Assistant Park, Junho 4.7 522.00 2,453.40 

Legal Assistant Total 4.7  $2,453.40 

    
 

Matter Total 23.8  $30,754.35 
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Page 6

CHARGES AND DISBURSEMENTS SUMMARY 

Description Amount 

Computer Assisted Legal Research $79.36 

In-House Production $14.00 

Travel $1,588.34 

Working Meal $248.54 

Matter Total $1,930.24 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503514 Client Matter 27188.1026 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with CONTESTED 
BMLP MATTERS 

Fees $209,308.50  

Charges and Disbursements $0.00 

TOTAL $209,308.50  
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/03/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Review additional BMLP bank discovery. 0.3 

11/04/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with X. Zhou re Quinn disqualification motion (0.2); 
review key documents products by Quinn to support motion 
(1.0). 

1.2 

11/04/25 Zhou, Xiaoxiao Call with E. Worenklein re Quinn client file (0.2); review Quinn 
client file re Baha Mar litigation and identify key documents 
(2.7). 

2.9 

11/06/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review client update re bank document productions. 0.2 

11/07/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review weekly cash reporting for BMLP. 0.1 

11/07/25 Koboci, Shefit Review weekly cash reporting (0.2); send same to BMLP team 
(0.2). 

0.4 

11/08/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Comment on draft sealing orders from BMLP. 0.4 

11/09/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Mark up draft disqualification motion. 2.4 

11/10/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Comment on BMLP sealing order (0.2); review summary of 
production on Quinn retention (0.6). 

0.8 

11/11/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with X. Zhou re Quinn motion. 0.7 

11/11/25 Zhou, Xiaoxiao Call with E. Worenklein re Quinn Emanuel disqualification. 0.7 

11/13/25 Zhou, Xiaoxiao Review client file produced by Quinn Emanuel (0.8); prepare 
motion to disqualify (2.3). 

3.1 

11/14/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review cash transfer reporting. 0.1 

11/14/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Email weekly cash flow to Gibbons team. 0.1 

11/14/25 Zhou, Xiaoxiao Further draft motion to disqualify. 5.7 

11/15/25 Zhou, Xiaoxiao Further draft legal arguments in motion to disqualify. 9.3 

11/16/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Comment on updated draft disqualification motion (4.3); phone 
call with B. Mishkin re same (0.3); comment on draft rider for 
disqualification motion from X. Zhou (1.6). 

6.2 

11/16/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Call with E. Worenklein re Quinn motion (0.3); review and 
revise Quinn motion (1.2). 

1.5 

11/16/25 Zhou, Xiaoxiao Review client file produced by Quinn Emanuel and incorporate 
into motion to disqualify. 

8.1 

11/17/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Correspond with S. Levinson re motion to disqualify Quinn 
(0.3); further correspond with Debevoise team re same (0.2). 

0.5 

11/17/25 Levinson, Sidney P. Exchange email with N. Labovitz re motion to disqualify (0.5); 
review legal and factual research and analysis re motion to 
disqualify (3.6); revise draft motion to disqualify (5.3); phone 
call with E. Worenklein re same (0.3); exchange correspondence 
with Debevoise team re motion to disqualify (0.4). 

10.1 

11/17/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with X. Zhou re disqualification motion (0.6); call 
with S. Levinson re same (0.3); further revise draft 
disqualification motion (4.4); review documents produced by 
CCA (0.6); phone call with X. Zhou re additional comments to 
motion (0.2); update draft disqualification motion and draft 
proposed order (1.3); call with J. Park motion to disqualify (0.2); 
review update from J. Park re same (0.6). 

8.4 
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/17/25 Zhou, Xiaoxiao Conduct research re legal issues on motion to disqualify (4.4); 
call with E. Worenklein re motion to disqualify (0.6); further 
call with E. Worenklein re motion to disqualify (0.2); review 
client file produced by Quinn and identify key documents (0.8). 

5.9 

11/17/25 Park, Junho Phone call with E. Worenklein re motion for disqualification 
(0.2); update motion for E. Worenklein review (0.9). 

1.1 

11/18/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review motion to disqualify Quinn (0.4); email with Debevoise 
team re same (0.1); coordinate with S. Levinson re same (0.1). 

0.6 

11/18/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review and comment on motion to disqualify (1.3); coordinate 
with S. Levinson re same (0.3); correspond with E. Abrams re 
same (0.2); correspond with Debevoise working team re edits 
and considerations (0.6); review revised brief pre-filing (0.5). 

2.9 

11/18/25 Levinson, Sidney P. Revise motion to disqualify (3.1); call with E. Worenklein re 
same (0.5); email Debevoise team re status of motion to 
disqualify (0.3); further revise motion to disqualify (1.8); 
exchange emails with Debevoise team re appeal brief (0.2); call 
with Y. Wei [CCA] and E. Worenklein re motion to disqualify 
(0.4); finalize motion to disqualify and S. Levinson declaration, 
and motion to seal (3.7). 

10.0 

11/18/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Further mark up draft disqualification motion (3.6); call with S. 
Levinson re same (0.5); phone call with Y. Wei [CCA] and S. 
Levinson re draft motion (0.4); meet with B. Mishkin re motion 
to seal (0.3); email with Cole Schotz team re same (0.2); 
comment on draft supporting declaration (0.3); mark up 
proposed redactions for motion (1.4); comment on draft motion 
to seal (1.2); update draft motion to disqualify to incorporate 
comments (3.2); further update proposed redactions (0.4); 
comment on draft declaration (0.8); further email with Cole 
Schotz team re filing (0.4); draft email to Quinn re service of 
motion (0.2). 

12.9 

11/18/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Meet with E. Worenklein re motion to seal Quinn motion (0.3); 
correspond with J. Park re motion to seal (0.2); draft motion to 
seal (4.2); review and revise motion to disqualify (1.4); finalize 
motion to seal and filings re motion to disqualify (3.3); 
coordinate with local counsel re filing (0.2); prepare versions of 
pleadings for sharing with client (0.3); send to client and internal 
team (0.2). 

10.9 

11/18/25 Zhou, Xiaoxiao Draft motion to disqualify Quinn and Levinson Declaration 
(12.3); coordinate filing of the same including associated 
exhibits (1.6). 

13.9 

11/18/25 Park, Junho Correspond with B. Mishkin re motion to seal (0.2); prepare 
sealing motion for B. Mishkin review (1.4); finalize exhibits for 
S. Levinson Declaration ISO of Disqualification Motion (1.9); 
prepare filing copies of redacted and unredacted of the same 
(3.3); transmit copies of same to client, E. Abrams, and Duane 
Morris (0.3). 

7.1 

11/19/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review filed Quinn disqualification motion. 0.3 

11/19/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Call with S. Levinson in follow up to motion to disqualify. 0.1 
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/19/25 Levinson, Sidney P. Meet with J. Park re partially unredacted motion and declaration 
(0.6); draft email to Quinn Emmanuel lawyers re same (0.2); 
call with N. Labovitz re same (0.1); review motion to disqualify 
(0.2). 

1.1 

11/19/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with C. Zhang [CCA] re motion to disqualify Quinn. 0.3 

11/19/25 Park, Junho Meet with S. Levinson re Quinn redactions for motion to 
disqualify (0.6); prepare redactions for Quinn transmission (0.7). 

1.3 

11/20/25 Koboci, Shefit Review BMLP Rule 2004 document productions from HSBC 
and Morgan Stanley (2.1); coordinate file share to CCA team 
(0.3). 

2.4 

11/21/25 Koboci, Shefit Review weekly cash reporting (0.2); send same to BMLP team 
(0.2). 

0.4 

11/28/25 Koboci, Shefit Review BDO report of weekly cash (0.2); send same to BMLP 
team (0.2). 

0.4 

 

  Total Hours 134.8 
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TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Partner Goodman, Mark P. 0.9 2,317.50 2,085.75 

 Labovitz, M. Natasha 3.9 2,317.50 9,038.25 

 Levinson, Sidney P. 21.2 2,317.50 49,131.00 

Partner Total 26.0  $60,255.00 

    
 Counsel Worenklein, Elie J. 33.6 1,620.00 54,432.00 

Counsel Total 33.6  $54,432.00 

    
 Associate Zhou, Xiaoxiao 49.6 1,458.00 72,316.80 

 Koboci, Shefit 3.6 1,287.00 4,633.20 

 Mishkin, Benjamin 12.5 1,017.00 12,712.50 

Associate Total 65.7  $89,662.50 

    
 Legal Assistant Park, Junho 9.5 522.00 4,959.00 

Legal Assistant Total 9.5  $4,959.00 

    
 

Matter Total 134.8  $209,308.50 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503510 Client Matter 27188.1009 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with CORPORATE 
GOVERNANCE & BOARD MATTERS 

Fees $24,686.10  

Charges and Disbursements $0.00 

TOTAL $24,686.10  

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 685    Filed 02/06/26    Entered 02/06/26 15:02:15    Desc Main
Document      Page 44 of 84



27188.1009 – CORPORATE GOVERNANCE & BOARD MATTERS  Invoice Number: 2503510 

 

  Page 2 
  

 

Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/04/25 Goodman, Mark P. Attend board call with board members, E. Blum [BDO], J. 
Schwartz [BDO], F. Yudkin [Cole Schotz], C. Zhang [CCA], J. 
Li [CCA], N. Labovitz [partial] and R. Heller. 

0.4 

11/04/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Prepare for board meeting (0.3); attend same [partial] (0.3). 0.6 

11/04/25 Heller, Rory Attend board call with board members, E. Blum [BDO], J. 
Schwartz [BDO], F. Yudkin [Cole Schotz], C. Zhang [CCA], J. 
Li [CCA], N. Labovitz [partial], M. Goodman. 

0.4 

11/17/25 Goodman, Mark P. Participate in board call with board members, BDO team, F. 
Yudkin [Cole Schotz], N. Labovitz, and R. Heller. 

0.3 

11/17/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Prepare for board call (0.3); attend board call with board 
members, BDO team, F. Yudkin [Cole Schotz], M. Goodman 
and R. Heller (0.3); follow up with E. Abrams (0.4). 

1.0 

11/17/25 Heller, Rory Participate in board call with M. Goodman, N. Labovitz, board, 
BDO team, and F. Yudkin [Cole Schotz]. 

0.3 

11/21/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Update board of directors re settlement (0.2); coordinate further 
board update (0.2). 

0.4 

11/22/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Outline topics for board meeting (0.3); provide guidance to S. 
Koboci re same (0.2). 

0.5 

11/22/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with N. Labovitz re board meeting outline. 0.2 

11/23/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Mark up draft board materials for 11/24 meeting (0.7); 
correspond with S. Koboci re presentation comments (0.2). 

0.9 

11/23/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Revise materials for board meeting. 0.4 

11/23/25 Koboci, Shefit Draft slides for board meeting (2.9); correspond with E. 
Worenklein re same (0.2); revise board presentation to reflect E. 
Worenklein comments (0.3). 

3.4 

11/24/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review deck for today's board meeting (0.1); review revised 
draft of deck (0.1); participate in CCA board of directors 
meeting with E. Blum [BDO], E. Abrams, F. Yudkin [Cole 
Schotz], N. Labovitz, S. Koboci and J. Park (0.6). 

0.8 

11/24/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review and comment on draft board materials (0.2); call with S. 
Koboci re same (0.1); attend board call with CCA board, BDO 
team, F. Yudkin, M. Goodman, S. Koboci and J. Park (0.6); 
follow up correspondence with E. Abrams (0.2). 

1.1 

11/24/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Send comments to S. Koboci re updated board presentation 
(0.2); further correspond with S. Koboci re same (0.2); email 
with CCA board re executed term sheet and board call (0.3). 

0.7 

11/24/25 Koboci, Shefit Send N. Labovitz board deck for board meeting (0.2); 
correspond with E. Worenklein re same (0.2); correspond with 
board re scheduling of board meeting (0.3); correspond with E. 
Worenklein re same (0.2); call with N. Labovitz re board 
meeting (0.1); revise board presentation to reflect N. Labovitz 
comments (0.9); participate in CCA board of directors meeting 
with E. Blum [BDO], E. Abrams, F. Yudkin [Cole Schotz], N. 
Labovitz, M. Goodman, and J. Park (0.6); draft notes of board 
call and send internally (0.4). 

2.9 

11/24/25 Park, Junho Present slides at board meeting. 0.6 
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Total Hours 14.9 
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TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Partner Goodman, Mark P. 1.5 2,317.50 3,476.25 

 Labovitz, M. Natasha 3.6 2,317.50 8,343.00 

Partner Total 5.1  $11,819.25 

    
 Counsel Worenklein, Elie J. 2.0 1,620.00 3,240.00 

Counsel Total 2.0  $3,240.00 

    
 Associate Heller, Rory 0.7 1,354.50 948.15 

 Koboci, Shefit 6.5 1,287.00 8,365.50 

Associate Total 7.2  $9,313.65 

    
 Legal Assistant Park, Junho 0.6 522.00 313.20 

Legal Assistant Total 0.6  $313.20 

    
 

Matter Total 14.9  $24,686.10 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503506 Client Matter 27188.1004 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with DIP FINANCING 

Fees $6,886.80  

Charges and Disbursements $0.00 

TOTAL $6,886.80  
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/03/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with M. Godbe re DIP issues list (0.2). 0.2 

11/03/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with A. Behlmann [Lowenstein] re invoices follow 
up. 

0.4 

11/05/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Correspond with S. Koboci re DIP invoices update. 0.1 

11/05/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with N. Labovitz re DIP issues list. 0.2 

11/07/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review materials re DIP budget and path forward. 0.2 

11/07/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Comment on monthly DIP reporting. 0.4 

11/07/25 Koboci, Shefit Review DIP downward adjustment and budget vs actual (0.4); 
correspond with BDO team re DIP reporting (0.2); send DIP 
reporting to Lowenstein team (0.2). 

0.8 

11/17/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with J. Schwarz [BDO] re DIP. 0.5 

11/25/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review DIP draw request and monitor necessary compliance 
steps. 

0.3 

11/25/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Review DIP draw request (0.1); email with S. Koboci re same 
(0.2). 

0.3 

11/25/25 Koboci, Shefit Review DIP borrowing notice (0.2); correspond with Y. Wei 
[CCA] re bringdown of reps (0.1); email with E. Worenklein re 
draw request (0.1); call with Lowenstein team re DIP borrowing 
notice and other matters (0.2); correspond with Lowenstein team 
re same (0.2). 

0.8 

11/26/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review DIP draw notice. 0.2 
 

  Total Hours 4.4 
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TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Partner Labovitz, M. Natasha 0.8 2,317.50 1,854.00 

Partner Total 0.8  $1,854.00 

    
 Counsel Worenklein, Elie J. 1.2 1,620.00 1,944.00 

Counsel Total 1.2  $1,944.00 

    
 Associate Koboci, Shefit 2.4 1,287.00 3,088.80 

Associate Total 2.4  $3,088.80 

    
 

Matter Total 4.4  $6,886.80 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503511 Client Matter 27188.1017 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with EMPLOYMENT & 
FEE APPLICATIONS 

Fees $28,229.85  

Charges and Disbursements $0.00 

TOTAL $28,229.85  
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/03/25 Goodman, Mark P. Email Debevoise team re Rule 2014 disclosure re mediators. 0.3 

11/03/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with M. Goodman re rule 2014 declaration. 0.3 

11/05/25 Park, Junho Update fee statement for October 2025. 1.3 

11/06/25 Park, Junho Prepare exhibits for October fee statement. 1.9 

11/07/25 Park, Junho Update October fee statement exhibits. 5.1 

11/08/25 Park, Junho Draft October 2025 fee statement. 0.8 

11/09/25 Park, Junho Revise October 2025 fee statement. 2.3 

11/11/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review and comment on updated Rule 2014 disclosure (0.3); 
review and comment on monthly fee statement (0.9). 

1.2 

11/11/25 Park, Junho Incorporate N. Labovitz comments to September 2025 fee 
statement. 

1.7 

11/12/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Correspond with E. Worenklein re further updates to Rule 2014 
declaration (0.1); final signoff on same (0.1). 

0.2 

11/12/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Meet with J. Park re monthly fee statement (0.3); correspond 
with N. Labovitz re further updates to Rule 2014 declaration 
(0.1). 

0.3 

11/12/25 Park, Junho Meet with E. Worenklein re supplemental declaration (0.3); 
finalize same (0.4); correspond with Cole Schotz team re filing 
(0.1); further revise exhibits for September 2025 fee statement 
(1.6); compile and send fee statement to B. Mishkin (0.4); 
correspond with E. Worenklein re fee statement (0.1); further 
update exhibits and cover sheet (0.4). 

3.2 

11/13/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Email F. Steele re OCP invoice (0.1); finalize review of 
September fee statement for N. Labovitz (0.5); send same to 
client (0.1); correspond with E. Worenklein re hourly rate 
increase (0.2). 

0.9 

11/13/25 Park, Junho Further update October 2025 fee statement (0.8); update October 
2025 fee statement coversheet (0.6). 

1.4 

11/17/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Final sign-off on September fee statement. 0.2 

11/17/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Review October fee statement. 3.1 

11/18/25 Park, Junho Finalize exhibits to September fee statement for filing. 0.4 

11/20/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Meet with J. Park re October fee statement. 0.4 

11/20/25 Park, Junho Meet with E. Worenklein re fee statements status and comments. 0.4 

11/21/25 Park, Junho Incorporate E. Worenklein comments re October fee statement 
exhibits. 

4.4 

11/24/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Sign off on filing September fee statement. 0.2 

11/24/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Compile filing version of September fee statement and send to 
Cole Schotz team for filing. 

0.2 

11/28/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Comment on draft supplemental declaration. 0.3 

11/28/25 Park, Junho Revise October fee statement exhibits. 3.2 

11/29/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Monitor fee statement status. 0.2 

11/29/25 Park, Junho Revise October fee statement cover. 0.4 
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Page 3

Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/30/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Draft October fee statement cover letter (0.6); review October 
fee statement (0.4); email N. Labovitz re same (0.1). 

1.1 

11/30/25 Park, Junho Further update exhibits for October fee statement (0.9); update 
cover sheet re same (1.2); circulate October fee statement for 
review (0.5); incorporate further comments from E. Worenklein 
(0.4); circulate compiled filing version to Debevoise team (0.2). 

3.2 

Total Hours 38.6 
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27188.1017 – EMPLOYMENT & FEE APPLICATIONS Invoice Number: 2503511 

Page 4

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Partner Goodman, Mark P. 0.3 2,317.50 695.25 

Labovitz, M. Natasha 2.0 2,317.50 4,635.00 

Partner Total 2.3 $5,330.25 

 Counsel Worenklein, Elie J. 1.0 1,620.00 1,620.00 

Counsel Total 1.0 $1,620.00 

 Associate Koboci, Shefit 0.3 1,287.00 386.10 

Mishkin, Benjamin 5.3 1,017.00 5,390.10 

Associate Total 5.6 $5,776.20 

 Legal Assistant Park, Junho 29.7 522.00 15,503.40 

Legal Assistant Total 29.7 $15,503.40 

Matter Total 38.6 $28,229.85 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503515 Client Matter 27188.1027 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with EXAMINER 

Fees $927.00  

Charges and Disbursements $0.00 

TOTAL $927.00  

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 685    Filed 02/06/26    Entered 02/06/26 15:02:15    Desc Main
Document      Page 55 of 84



27188.1027 – EXAMINER  Invoice Number: 2503515 

 

  Page 2 
  

 

Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/11/25 Goodman, Mark P. Email with N. Labovitz, E. Abrams, and M. Sirota re Examiner's 
budget request. 

0.2 

11/11/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Correspond with M. Goodman, M. Sirota and E. Abrams re 
Examiner fee request. 

0.2 

 

  Total Hours 0.4 
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TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Partner Goodman, Mark P. 0.2 2,317.50 463.50 

 Labovitz, M. Natasha 0.2 2,317.50 463.50 

Partner Total 0.4  $927.00 

    
 

Matter Total 0.4  $927.00 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503507 Client Matter 27188.1010 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with INVESTIGATION 
OF CAUSES OF ACTION 

Fees $625.50  

Charges and Disbursements $0.00 

TOTAL $625.50  
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/09/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Correspond with E. Worenklein re finalizing sealing orders. 0.2 

11/09/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Email N. Labovitz re sealing orders. 0.1 
 

  Total Hours 0.3 
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TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Partner Labovitz, M. Natasha 0.2 2,317.50 463.50 

Partner Total 0.2  $463.50 

    
 Counsel Worenklein, Elie J. 0.1 1,620.00 162.00 

Counsel Total 0.1  $162.00 

    
 

Matter Total 0.3  $625.50 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503516 Client Matter 27188.1028 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with MEDIATION 

Fees $719,151.30  

Charges and Disbursements $0.00 

TOTAL $719,151.30  
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/01/25 Goodman, Mark P. Email Debevoise team re mediation schedule and process. 0.2 

11/02/25 Goodman, Mark P. Email Debevoise team re mediation statement. 0.2 

11/02/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review list of questions for pre-mediation diligence. 0.4 

11/03/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review pre-mediation diligence material (0.2); participate in 
meeting re preparation for mediation with E. Abrams, BDO 
Team, F. Yudkin [Cole Schotz], M. Bauer [Duane Morris], N. 
Labovitz, R. Heller and S. Koboci (0.7). 

0.9 

11/03/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review BDO materials in preparation for call (0.3); attend call 
with E. Abrams, M. Bauer [Duane Morris], E. Blum and BDO 
team, M. Goodman, R. Heller and S. Koboci re preparation for 
mediation (0.7); follow up with R. Heller re same (0.1); further 
review diligence questions (0.3); correspond with M. Goodman 
re same (0.1); meet with E. Weisgerber re preparation for initial 
call with mediators (0.2). 

1.6 

11/03/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Conference with N. Labovitz re strategy and prep for mediation. 0.2 

11/03/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with E. Blum [BDO] re information for mediation 
(0.3); email with E. Blum [BDO] re same (0.1); review BDO 
analysis (0.3); email with various firms re meeting with 
mediators (0.2); email with S. Koboci re same (0.2). 

1.1 

11/03/25 Heller, Rory Participate in meeting re preparation for mediation with E. 
Abrams, BDO Team, F. Yudkin [Cole Schotz], M. Bauer 
[Duane Morris], M. Goodman, N. Labovitz, and S. Koboci 
(0.7); debrief with N. Labovitz re same (0.1); review valuations 
(1.5); arrange for all-hands meeting with CSCEC Holding (0.2). 

2.5 

11/03/25 Koboci, Shefit Review BDO analysis in preparation for potential inclusion in 
mediation documents (2.1); correspond with E. Worenklein re 
same (0.2); join call re mediation preparation with E. Abrams, 
BDO Team, F. Yudkin [Cole Schotz], M. Bauer [Duane 
Morris], M. Goodman, N. Labovitz, and R. Heller (0.7). 

3.0 

11/04/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Correspond with S. Koboci and E. Weisgerber re mediator care 
package (0.2); review BDO analyses for same (0.3); review 
documents received from E. Blum (0.2); correspond with E. 
Worenklein re kickoff email to mediators (0.1). 

0.8 

11/04/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Comment on draft outline for mediation statement. 0.9 

11/04/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with E. Weisgerber and N. Labovitz re BDO 
analysis for mediators (0.2); share same with E. Abrams, Cole 
Schotz and Duane Morris teams (0.3). 

0.5 

11/05/25 Goodman, Mark P. Correspond with N. Labovitz re mediation (0.1); call with E. 
Worenklein re preparation for mediation (0.3). 

0.4 

11/05/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Work to finalize list of questions for mediation for transmittal to 
co-counsel (0.4); correspond with M. Goodman re preparation 
of mediation statement (0.1); correspond with R. Heller and M. 
Bauer [Duane Morris] re upcoming meeting with CSCEC 
Holding (0.1). 

0.6 

11/05/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with S. Koboci re documents for mediators (0.2); 
review comments from E. Abrams re same (0.1); phone call 
with M. Goodman re mediation prep questions (0.3); draft email 
to Cole Schotz and Duane Morris re same (0.3). 

0.9 
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/05/25 Heller, Rory Organize all hands meeting with CSCEC Holding re mediation. 0.7 

11/05/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with E. Abrams re BDO analysis for potential 
production to mediators (0.4); correspond with J. Schwarz 
[BDO] re same (0.2); call with J. Schwarz [BDO] re same (0.4); 
correspond with A. Behlmann [Lowenstein] re valuations (0.3); 
draft additional disclosures at request of E. Abrams (0.9); call 
with E. Worenklein re same (0.2). 

2.4 

11/06/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review draft of mediation agreement (0.3); participate in initial 
call with mediators and party counsel (0.6); correspond with N. 
Labovitz re same (0.2); review Rule 9019 re mediation (0.2); 
call with E. Worenklein re revising mediation order and next 
steps (0.2); email re mediation (0.2); review mediation brief 
outline (0.2). 

1.7 

11/06/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Attend call with mediators (0.6); correspond with M. Goodman 
re preparation of mediation statement (0.2); supervise 
communications with CSCEC Holding and CCA parties re 
mediation statements (0.2); review and comment on revised 
mediation order (0.2); correspond with E. Abrams re mediation 
preparation and expectations (0.2); review background materials 
being prepared for mediation (0.2). 

1.6 

11/06/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Email with S. Koboci re mediation materials (0.2); meet [partial] 
with mediators and BMLP, CSCEC Holding, and CCA 
representatives re mediation procedures (0.5). 

0.7 

11/06/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Review research from litigation team (0.9); phone call with D. 
Harris [Cole Schotz] re prep for mediation (0.4); call with 
mediators re mediation logistics (0.6); recap of call with M. 
Goodman (0.2); draft summary of call for full team (0.8); further 
update mediation order (0.6); email with Cole Schotz team re 
mediation order (0.4); draft email to B. Mishkin re updates on 
mediation process (0.3). 

4.3 

11/06/25 Heller, Rory Review notes from call with mediators (0.1); organize all-hands 
meeting with CSCEC Holding (0.1). 

0.2 

11/06/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with E. Abrams re comments to BDO analyses for 
production to mediators (0.3); correspond with E. Weisgerber re 
mediation materials (0.2). 

0.5 

11/07/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review revised mediation order (0.1); email re same (0.1); call 
with Y. Wei [CCA] re same (1.0); review draft email re 
mediation order and mediation statements (0.1); participate in 
team call re mediation strategy with E. Worenklein, A. Costin, 
R. Zipursky and R. Heller [partial] (0.8); call with E. 
Worenklein re mediation statements (0.1); call with E. 
Weisgerber re mediation statement (0.2); email with E. 
Weisgerber re same (0.1); review updated draft of mediation 
statement outline (0.1). 

2.6 

11/07/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review and comment on updated mediation order (0.2); 
correspond with E. Worenklein, E. Weisgerber and R. Heller re 
mediation process and communication back to mediators (0.3); 
review outline re mediation statement (0.3); review questions 
and legal analysis in preparation for mediation (0.4). 

1.2 
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/07/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Call with E. Worenklein re CCA mediation order (0.2); call with 
M. Goodman re mediation submission (0.2); call with R. Heller 
and S. Koboci re mediation submission (0.4); revise mediation 
submission outline (0.6); correspond with N. Labovitz, E. 
Worenklein and R. Heller re mediation process (0.3). 

1.7 

11/07/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Email with Cole Schotz re mediation statements and mediation 
order (0.2); phone call with M. Goodman re same (0.1); draft 
email to CCA team re recap of call with mediators (0.2); draft 
email to mediation parties re mediation statement logistics (0.3); 
correspond with N. Labovitz, E. Weisgerber, and R. Heller re 
mediation process (0.3); attend internal team call with M. 
Goodman, A. Costin, R. Zipursky, and R. Heller [partial] re 
mediation strategy questions (0.8); phone call with M. Goodman 
re mediation (0.1); phone call with E. Weisgerber re mediation 
order (0.2); phone call with E. Blum [BDO] re update on 
mediation process (0.3); email with mediation parties re 
mediation order and mediation statements (0.3); correspond with 
R. Zipursky re legal questions (0.2); correspond with E. 
Worenklein re mediation brief (0.2). 

3.2 

11/07/25 Costin, Alexander Participate in team call re mediation strategy with M. Goodman, 
E. Worenklein, R. Zipursky, and R. Heller [partial]. 

0.8 

11/07/25 Heller, Rory Attend [partial] Debevoise team call re mediation strategy with 
M. Goodman, E. Worenklein, A. Costin, and R. Zipursky (0.5); 
correspond with S. Koboci re mediation statement (0.2); call 
with S. Koboci and E. Weisgerber re mediation statement (0.4); 
draft re same (2.3); correspond with N. Labovitz, E. Weisgerber, 
and E. Worenklein re mediation (0.3). 

3.7 

11/07/25 Koboci, Shefit Draft mediation brief (4.7); correspond with R. Heller re same 
(0.2); correspond with E. Worenklein re same (0.2); call with E. 
Weisgerber and R. Heller re same (0.4). 

5.6 

11/07/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Participate in Debevoise team call re mediation strategy with M. 
Goodman, E. Worenklein, A. Costin, R. Zipursky and R. Heller 
[partial] (0.8); confer with E. Worenklein re legal issues 
questions (0.5). 

1.3 

11/07/25 Park, Junho Circulate calendar events to Debevoise team re mediation. 0.3 

11/08/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Further review outline for mediation statement. 0.3 

11/08/25 Heller, Rory Further draft mediation statement. 2.5 

11/09/25 Goodman, Mark P. Call [partial] with N. Labovitz, E. Worenklein, R. Heller, R. 
Zipursky and A. Costin re mediation statement and preparation 
for tomorrow's meeting with CSCEC Holding. 

0.5 

11/09/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Call with M. Goodman [partial], R. Heller, R. Zipursky, A. 
Costin, and E. Worenklein re preparation for mediation and 
CSCEC Holding meeting (0.7); follow up with E. Worenklein 
and R. Heller re same (0.1); prepare for CSCEC Holding 
meeting (0.4); review draft talking points re same (0.2). 

1.4 
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/09/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Join meeting with A. Costin, R. Zipursky and R. Heller re 
mediation statement (0.3); comment on updated mediation 
outline (0.8); phone call with M. Goodman [partial], N. 
Labovitz, A. Costin, R. Zipursky and R. Heller re mediation 
statement strategy (0.7); email with R. Heller re updating 
settlement analysis (0.3); mark up talking points for meeting 
with CSCEC Holding (0.6); email with R. Heller re same (0.2). 

2.9 

11/09/25 Costin, Alexander Call with E. Worenklein, R. Zipursky, R. Heller re mediation 
strategy (0.3); meet with R. Zipursky, M. Goodman [partial], N. 
Labovitz, E. Worenklein, R. Heller re mediation brief strategy 
(0.7); draft mediation statement (1.9). 

2.9 

11/09/25 Heller, Rory Attend meeting with M. Goodman [partial], E. Worenklein, A. 
Costin, R. Zipursky, and N. Labovitz re mediation statement 
(0.7); meet with E. Worenklein, A. Costin, and R. Zipursky re 
same (0.3); correspond with E. Worenklein re settlement 
analysis (0.2); draft talking points for upcoming meeting with 
CSCEC Holding (1.4); update recovery analysis summary for 
same (1.9); correspond with E. Worenklein re talking points for 
meeting (0.1). 

4.3 

11/09/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Meet with E. Worenklein, A. Costin, and R. Heller re potential 
mediation (0.3); call with M. Goodman [partial], E. Worenklein, 
A. Costin, N. Labovitz, and R. Heller re mediation strategy 
(0.7). 

1.0 

11/10/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review materials and revised talking points in preparation for 
CSCEC Holding meeting (0.4); meet with Y. Wei [CCA] and N. 
Labovitz [partial] to prepare for meeting with CSCEC Holding 
(0.7); participate in meeting with CSCEC Holding (4.3). 

5.4 

11/10/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Prepare for pre-mediation meeting with CSCEC Holding (0.8); 
meet [partial] with M. Goodman and Y. Wei [CCA] re same 
(0.3); attend all-hands meeting with CSCEC Holding (4.3); 
correspond with E. Worenklein re follow-up analytical questions 
(0.4). 

5.8 

11/10/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Participate in in-person meeting with CCA and CSCEC Holding 
teams (4.3); meet with B. Mishkin re same (0.5); recap of 
meeting with R. Heller (0.3); research re client mediation 
strategy questions (0.4); comment on riders for mediation 
statement (1.1). 

6.6 

11/10/25 Costin, Alexander Revise litigation background section for mediation statement. 2.6 

11/10/25 Heller, Rory Attend CSCEC Holding meeting (4.3); prepare for same (0.6); 
further draft mediation statement (2.4); meet with E. Worenklein 
re CSCEC Holding meeting (0.3). 

7.6 

11/10/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Debrief meeting re mediation with E. Worenklein. 0.5 

11/10/25 Park, Junho Prepare rooms for pre-mediation meeting (0.4); partially attend 
mediation meeting with Lowenstein team, Y. Wei [CCA], Q. 
Zhou [CSCEC Holding], Debevoise team, E. Abrams, BDO 
team, and Cole Schotz team (0.9). 

1.3 

11/11/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Further refine asset roll-up analysis (0.4); correspond with E. 
Blum, E. Worenklein and R. Heller re same (0.2); coordinate 
with J. Park re preparation for mediation (0.1). 

0.7 
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11/11/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Draft responses to client mediation questions (0.4); phone call 
with E. Blum [BDO] re recap of strategy meeting (0.4); phone 
call with R. Zipursky re client questions (0.6); phone call with 
R. Heller and BDO team re settlement valuation questions (0.8); 
comment on draft mediation statement (2.1). 

3.3 

11/11/25 Ceresa, Chris Review and analyze value issues re mediation briefing (0.6); 
correspond with R. Heller re issues re same (0.3). 

0.9 

11/11/25 Heller, Rory Draft mediation statement (7.6); call with BDO and E. 
Worenklein re same (0.8); correspond with C. Ceresa re same 
(0.3). 

8.7 

11/11/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Draft talking points for mediation (2.6); confer with E. 
Worenklein re the same (0.6). 

3.2 

11/11/25 Park, Junho Finalize rooms for upcoming mediation (0.4); coordinate with 
N. Labovitz re same (0.1). 

0.5 

11/12/25 Goodman, Mark P. Email with N. Labovitz and CSCEC Holding re mediation (0.2); 
call with Y. Wei [CCA], N. Labovitz, E. Weisgerber, E. Abrams 
and R. Heller re mediation strategy and next steps (0.5); further 
email with N. Labovitz and E. Worenklein re mediation (0.2). 

0.9 

11/12/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Correspond with CSCEC Holding re updated proposal (0.2); 
correspond with E. Abrams re same (0.3); coordinate with R. 
Heller re mediation statement (0.1); review updated analysis re 
asset point (0.2); call with M. Goodman, E. Weisgerber, R. 
Heller, Y. Wei [CCA] and E. Abrams re preparation for 
mediation (0.5); correspond with R. Heller and E. Weisgerber re 
mediation (0.2); review draft of same (0.4); review analysis of 
possible mediation outcomes (0.3); correspond with E. 
Worenklein re same (0.2). 

2.4 

11/12/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Discuss strategy for upcoming mediation with E. Abrams, Y. 
Wei [CCA], N. Labovitz, M. Goodman, and R. Heller. 

0.5 

11/12/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Revise talking points for client's mediation questions (0.4); 
phone call with E. Blum [BDO] re valuation questions (0.3); 
email with Lowenstein re meeting (0.2); zoom meeting with J. 
Steimle [BDO] re valuation analysis for mediation (1.0); mark 
up initial mediation statement (3.9); phone calls with R. Heller 
re same (0.3); call with B. Mishkin re same (0.2); meet with R. 
Zipursky re same (0.4); follow up with E. Blum [BDO] re 
intercompany analysis (0.2). 

6.9 

11/12/25 Heller, Rory Discuss mediation strategy with E. Abrams, Y. Wei [CCA], N. 
Labovitz, M. Goodman, and E. Weisgerber (0.5); draft 
mediation statement (4.6); discuss same with E. Worenklein 
(0.3); schedule follow-up meeting with Lowenstein team (0.3). 

6.2 

11/12/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Review and revise mediation brief (0.6); call with E. 
Worenklein re same (0.2); draft rider to same (0.6). 

1.4 

11/12/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Research and draft talking points for settlement discussion (3.2); 
confer with E. Worenklein re the same (0.4); review and revise 
talking points in accordance with E. Worenklein edits (0.4). 

4.2 
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11/13/25 Goodman, Mark P. Call with E. Abrams, M. Shea [BRG], Debevoise, CCA, 
CSCEC Holding, Lowenstein, and Cole Schotz teams re 
settlement (1.1); review mediation statement (0.3); call with N. 
Labovitz re same and mediation statement (0.2); call with Y. 
Wei [CCA] re mediation status and strategy (0.3); correspond 
with N. Labovitz and R. Heller re revised draft of mediation 
statement (0.2). 

2.1 

11/13/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Prepare for call with CSCEC Holding (0.2); attend all-hands call 
with CSCEC Holding, Cole Schotz team, Debevoise team, 
Lowenstein team, CCA, E. Abrams, and M. Shea [BRG] in 
preparation for mediation (1.1); review updated analysis in 
preparation for mediation (0.2); call with Y. Wei [CCA] re 
mediation statement (0.2); call with M. Goodman re same (0.2); 
correspond with E. Abrams re same (0.1); review and comment 
on mediation statement (2.2); review and edit mediation talking 
points (0.3); call with A. Behlmann [Lowenstein] re CSCEC 
Holding position (0.2); further negotiations re same (0.4); 
further comment on revised mediation statement (0.7); 
correspond with M. Goodman and R. Heller re same (0.2). 

6.0 

11/13/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with R. Heller re recap of meeting (0.2); further 
revise draft mediation statement (2.2); incorporate comments to 
talking points for client mediation questions (0.3); email with 
team re revisions to mediation statement (0.6). 

3.3 

11/13/25 Heller, Rory Call with E. Abrams, M. Shea [BRG] and Debevoise, CCA, 
CSCEC Holding, Lowenstein, and Cole Schotz teams re 
settlement (1.1); incorporate comments to mediation statement 
(3.5); discuss same with E. Worenklein (0.2); distribute same to 
Cole Schotz Team and M. Bauer [Lowenstein] for review and 
comment (0.2). 

5.2 

11/13/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Call with E. Abrams, M. Shea and Debevoise, CCA, CSCEC 
Holding, Lowenstein, and Cole Schotz teams re mediation. 

1.1 

11/14/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review and revise mediation statement (0.8); call with E. 
Worenklein re same (0.2); review BMLP's mediation statement 
(0.3); call with B. Mishkin re same (0.1). 

1.4 

11/14/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review and edit multiple versions of mediation brief (3.6); 
correspond with Y. Wei [CCA] re same (0.2); review 
transmitted offer from CSCEC Holding (0.3); call with E. 
Abrams re same (0.2); forward BMLP statement to clients with 
preliminary comment (0.2); preliminary review of BMLP 
statement (0.6); confer with R. Heller re same (0.1). 

5.2 

11/14/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Review and revise draft mediation submission. 2.2 

11/14/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Further revise draft mediation statement prior to submission 
(1.9); call with M. Goodman re revisions to mediation statement 
(0.2); incorporate comments to mediation statement from Cole 
Schotz and client (0.5); phone call with B. Mishkin re same 
(0.2). 

2.8 

11/14/25 Heller, Rory Revise updated mediation statement (6.9); discuss same with N. 
Labovitz (0.1); submit same (0.1); coordinate transmittal of 
exhibits with J. Park (0.1). 

7.2 
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11/14/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Assist with final review and revisions to mediation brief (0.9); 
call with E. Worenklein re same (0.2); call with M. Goodman re 
same (0.1). 

1.3 

11/14/25 Park, Junho Update mediation statement for R. Heller review (0.6); 
correspond with R. Heller re exhibit transfers (0.1); coordinate 
secure data transfer to mediators re exhibits (0.3). 

1.0 

11/15/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Review final edits to mediation statement (0.3); review and 
analyze BMLP mediation statement (0.8); email with Debevoise 
team re same (0.3). 

1.4 

11/15/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Review and summarize mediation statement from BMLP. 1.3 

11/15/25 Park, Junho Set up secure data transfer re mediation exhibits for clients (0.3); 
transmit same to client (0.1). 

0.4 

11/16/25 Goodman, Mark P. Call re preparing for mediation with N. Labovitz, E. Weisgerber, 
E. Worenklein, R. Heller, and B. Mishkin. 

0.7 

11/16/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Further review mediation statement from BMLP (0.6); call with 
M. Goodman, E. Weisgerber, E. Worenklein, R. Heller and B. 
Mishkin re preparation for mediation (0.7); review materials in 
follow-up to same (0.3); correspond with R. Heller and E. 
Abrams re next steps (0.2). 

1.8 

11/16/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Call re preparing for mediation with N. Labovitz, M. Goodman, 
E. Worenklein, R. Heller, and B. Mishkin (0.7); exchange 
emails with B. Mishkin re follow-up research for mediation 
(0.4). 

1.1 

11/16/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Join team call re preparing for mediation with N. Labovitz, M. 
Goodman, E. Weisgerber, R. Heller, and B. Mishkin. 

0.7 

11/16/25 Heller, Rory Meet with N. Labovitz, M. Goodman, E. Weisgerber, E. 
Worenklein and B. Mishkin re mediation preparation. 

0.7 

11/16/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Review BMLP mediation brief (0.4); call re preparing for 
mediation with M. Goodman, N. Labovitz, E. Weisgerber, E. 
Worenklein and R. Heller (0.7); prepare notes from call (0.4); 
correspond with E. Weisgerber re research for mediation (0.3); 
conduct legal research re possible issues in mediation (2.8). 

4.6 

11/17/25 Goodman, Mark P. Call [partial] with E. Abrams, Cole Schotz team, Debevoise 
team, and M. Bauer [Duane Morris] re mediation (0.4); 
participate [partial] in follow-up call with E. Weisgerber, E. 
Worenklein, R. Heller and B. Mishkin re same (0.2). 

0.6 

11/17/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review materials for potential use in mediation (0.3); 
correspond with A. Costin and E. Weisgerber re same (0.2); 
correspond with E. Abrams re mediation prep (0.4); review and 
address correspondence from mediators (0.2). 

1.1 

11/17/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Analyze research re mediation issues (0.4); call re research in 
preparation for mediation with R. Heller, R. Zipursky, and B. 
Mishkin (0.5); participate in call with E. Abrams, Cole Schotz 
team, Debevoise team and M. Bauer [Duane Morris] re 
mediation (1.0); call [partial] with M. Goodman [partial], E. 
Worenklein, R. Heller and B. Mishkin re same (0.2). 

2.1 
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11/17/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Call with R. Zipursky re pending proceedings (0.4); join 
mediation prep session call with E. Abrams, Cole Schotz team, 
Debevoise team and M. Bauer [Duane Morris] (1.0); participate 
in meeting with M. Goodman [partial], E. Weisgerber [partial], 
R. Heller and B. Mishkin re same (0.3). 

1.7 

11/17/25 Costin, Alexander Correspond with N. Labovitz and E. Weisgerber re mediation 
preparation (0.3); analyze BMLP mediation statement (0.9); 
correspond with R. Zipursky re organizational chart (0.2). 

1.4 

11/17/25 Heller, Rory Schedule call with mediators (0.2); review BMLP's mediation 
statement (1.6); prepare mediation talking points (1.7); call re 
research in preparation for mediation with E. Weisgerber, R. 
Zipursky, and B. Mishkin (0.5); participate in call with E. 
Abrams, Cole Schotz team, Debevoise team and M. Bauer 
[Duane Morris] re mediation (1.0); call with M. Goodman 
[partial], E. Weisgerber [partial], E. Worenklein, and B. Mishkin 
re same (0.3). 

5.3 

11/17/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Call re mediation research with E. Weisgerber, R. Zipursky and 
R. Heller (0.5); conduct follow up research re same (5.5); join 
call with E. Abrams, Cole Schotz team, Debevoise team and M. 
Bauer [Duane Morris] re mediation (1.0); attend call with M. 
Goodman [partial], E. Weisgerber [partial], E. Worenklein and 
R. Heller re same (0.3). 

7.3 

11/17/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Research legal issues re settlement (2.9); call re research in 
preparation for mediation with E. Weisgerber, R. Heller and B. 
Mishkin (0.5); correspond with A. Costin re organizational chart 
(0.2); confer with E. Worenklein re pending proceedings (0.4). 

4.0 

11/17/25 Park, Junho Prepare and send secure data transfer to E. Abrams. 0.4 

11/18/25 Goodman, Mark P. Call with Y. Wei [CCA] re mediation issues and strategy (0.6); 
call with E. Weisgerber (0.5); review value demonstrative (0.1). 

1.2 

11/18/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Call with E. Abrams in preparation for mediation (0.4); review 
and comment on talking points for mediation (0.9). 

1.3 

11/18/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Participate in strategy call with M. Goodman re mediation (0.5); 
call to M. Sirota [Cole Schotz] re same (0.1); email with Cole 
Schotz and Debevoise teams re mediation strategy (0.4). 

1.0 

11/18/25 Heller, Rory Draft talking points for mediation (3.9); email with Cole Schotz 
and Debevoise team re same (0.6). 

4.5 

11/18/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Continue research re mediation issues (1.1); email Debevoise 
team and Cole Schotz team re same (0.2). 

1.3 

11/18/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Review and analyze legal issues for upcoming mediation. 1.2 

11/19/25 Goodman, Mark P. Participate in call with mediators, Debevoise team, Lowenstein 
team, Cole Schotz team, and M. Bauer [Daune Morris] (1.0); 
participate [partial] in mediation strategy call with Debevoise 
team (0.5); email with Debevoise team re final talking points for 
mediation (0.4). 

1.9 
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11/19/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Prepare for call with mediators (0.2); attend call with E. Chesler, 
Hon. V. Papalia, Debevoise team, Lowenstein, Cole Schotz and 
Duane Morris teams (1.0); coordinate with R. Heller re follow-
up on mediators' questions (0.2); mediation prep call with E. 
Abrams, CCA board, M. Bauer, Cole Schotz team, E. 
Weisgerber and B. Mishkin (0.8); call with E. Weisgerber re 
same (0.2); correspond with B. Mishkin re mediation (0.2); 
outline personal talking points for mediation, including 
reviewing mediation statement and past settlement proposals 
(0.8). 

3.4 

11/19/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Participate in call with CCA team, E. Abrams, M. Bauer [Duane 
Morris], Debevoise team, and Cole Schotz team to prepare for 
mediation (0.8); follow up with N. Labovitz re same (0.2); email 
with Debevoise team re prep for mediation and mediation 
talking points (0.4). 

1.4 

11/19/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Review update on call with mediators (0.4); comment on draft 
mediation talking points (0.6); call with J. Schwarz [BDO] re 
mediation prep (0.5); email with B. Theisen [Gibbons] re 
mediation logistics (0.2); call with S. Koboci re BDO slide 
decks (0.4); email with S. Koboci and R. Heller re questions 
from mediators (0.6). 

2.7 

11/19/25 Heller, Rory Call with mediators, Lowenstein team, Cole Schotz team, Duane 
Morris, and Debevoise team (1.0); draft and circulate summary 
of call (0.4); research question re court procedures (0.4); 
correspond with S. Koboci re settlement (0.2); call with S. 
Koboci re same  (0.2). 

2.4 

11/19/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with R. Heller re settlement  (0.3); call with R. 
Heller re same (0.2); review BDO slide decks re same (1.3); 
correspond with E. Worenklein re same (0.2); call with BDO 
team re same (0.4); correspond with R. Heller and E. 
Worenklein re stay of NYS action question (0.6); call with R. 
Zipursky re NYS action (0.6); draft summary of settlement 
issues for Debevoise team (1.1); call with E. Worenklein re 
same (0.4); draft further revised summary incorporating E. 
Worenklein comments (1.6). 

6.7 

11/19/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Participate in call with CCA Team, E. Abrams, M. Bauer 
[Duane Morris], Debevoise team, and Cole Schotz team (0.8); 
draft summary re same for internal team and send to N. Labovitz 
for review (0.5); correspond with Debevoise team re follow up 
to question from mediators (0.2). 

1.5 

11/19/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Confer with S. Koboci re NYS action. 0.6 

11/19/25 Park, Junho Correspond with Debevoise team re guest list for mediation 
(0.6); register guests (0.4); confirm mediation room setups and 
logistics with A. Asimakis [Debevoise] (1.8); circulate updated 
calendar event to Debevoise team (0.1). 

2.9 

11/20/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Lead meeting with CCA team in preparation for mediation (0.5); 
participate in mediation with BMLP and CSCEC Holding 
(11.5). 

12.0 
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11/20/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Attend meeting prior to mediation with Debevoise, Cole Schotz, 
Mo Bauer, Elizabeth Abrams, Yan Wei [CCA], C. Zhang [CCA] 
(0.5); participate [partial] in mediation with CCA, BMLP, and 
CSCEC Holding (8.3). 

8.8 

11/20/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with J. Schwarz [BDO] re status of mediation (0.4); 
confer with B. Mishkin re status of mediation (0.3). 

0.7 

11/20/25 Heller, Rory Participate in meeting with CCA team re mediation (0.5); 
participate in mediation with BMLP (11.5). 

12.0 

11/20/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Participate [partial] in mediation (10.5); meet with E. 
Worenklein re mediation status (0.3). 

10.8 

11/20/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Research legal issues re mediation. 0.8 

11/20/25 Park, Junho Set up for mediation (1.3); coordinate with security and internal 
teams for mediation (1.2). 

2.4 

11/21/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Participate in conference with CCA team, Q. Zhou [CSCEC 
Holding], Lowenstein team, E. Abrams, M. Bauer [Duane 
Morris], and Debevoise team re response to mediators' proposal 
(0.3); email with mediators re same (0.2); review and edit 
multiple drafts of settlement term sheet (2.5); email with 
Debevoise team and client re negotiations with CSCEC Holding 
and BMLP  (0.6); confer with R. Heller re term sheet (0.3); 
email with S. Levinson re mediation progress (0.2). 

4.1 

11/21/25 Levinson, Sidney P. Exchange emails with N. Labovitz re progress of mediation. 0.2 

11/21/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Email with Debevoise team and client CCA re settlement term 
sheet. 

0.5 

11/21/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Call with E. Blum [BDO] re status of mediation (0.3); 
participate in call re mediators’ proposal with CCA team, 
Lowenstein team, Debevoise team, E. Abrams, M. Bauer 
[Duane Morris] and Q. Zhou [CSCEC Holding] (0.3); phone call 
with R. Heller re term sheet (0.2); comment on multiple drafts of 
mediation term sheet (2.4). 

3.2 

11/21/25 Heller, Rory Participate in call re mediation with CCA team, Lowenstein 
team, Debevoise team, E. Abrams, M. Bauer [Duane Morris] 
and Q. Zhou [CSCEC Holding] (0.3); draft mediation term sheet 
(5.5); discuss same with N. Labovitz (0.3); discuss same with E. 
Worenklein (0.2). 

6.1 

11/21/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Join call re mediation with CCA team, Lowenstein team, 
Debevoise team, E. Abrams, M. Bauer [Duane Morris] and Q. 
Zhou [CSCEC Holding] (0.3); prepare signature pages for 
mediation term sheet (0.2). 

0.5 

11/22/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review emails re mediation, settlement and term sheet (0.6); 
review term sheet (0.3); call with Y. Wei [CCA] re mediation 
and stay of NY Court of Appeals motion for leave to appeal 
(0.1). 

1.0 

11/22/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review and analyze BMLP markup of settlement agreement 
(0.3); correspond with A. Behlmann [Lowenstein] and co-
counsel re same (0.3); send comments to Debevoise team re 
comments agreement in response to CSCEC Holding revision 
(0.3). 

0.9 
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11/22/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Draft questions for R. Heller re post-settlement strategy. 0.3 

11/22/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Review revised term sheet from BMLP and comment re same. 0.9 

11/22/25 Ceresa, Chris Review and analyze legal issues re draft 9019 motion to approve 
mediation settlement (0.5); comment on draft motion of same 
(1.8); correspond with Debevoise team re revisions (0.2). 

2.5 

11/23/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review revisions to term sheet (0.2); email Debevoise team re 
settlement (0.2); email with Debevoise team re pending court 
actions (0.2); review emails re Bahamian proceedings (0.2); 
monitor emails re settlement motion (0.2). 

1.0 

11/23/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Engage in ongoing negotiations re settlement term sheet (2.1); 
coordinate logistics with Debevoise team re pause of all pending 
court actions (0.6); finalize term sheet and provide instructions 
re execution and path forward (0.5); review and address 
questions re Bahamian proceedings (0.3); review status of 
settlement motion (0.2). 

3.7 

11/23/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Review BMLP revisions to draft term sheet (0.3); email with 
Debevoise team re same (0.3); email with Debevoise, BMLP, 
and CSCEC Holding teams re revisions to term sheet and 
settlement next steps (0.4). 

1.0 

11/23/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Research 9019 motion precedent (0.6); correspond with M. 
Godbe re same (0.2); call with A. Behlmann [Lowenstein] re 
9019 motion (0.2); revise term sheet (5.8); email with Debevoise 
team re same (0.4); call with Y. Wei [CCA] re same (0.2); call 
with C. Zhang [CCA] re same (0.3); call with R. Zipursky re 
term sheets (0.2); call with E. Winston [Quinn] re same (0.3). 

8.2 

11/23/25 Ceresa, Chris Review and comment on draft 9019 motion (1.6); correspond 
with Debevoise team re same (0.1). 

1.7 

11/23/25 Godbe, Michael C. Correspond with B. Mishkin re settlement motion precedent 
(0.2); correspond with E. Worenklein re same (0.2). 

0.4 

11/23/25 Koboci, Shefit Correspond with C. Ceresa re settlement motion (0.2); 
correspond with B. Mishkin re same (0.2); comment on draft of 
settlement motion (1.1). 

1.5 

11/23/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Correspond with M. Godbe re settlement motion precedent 
(0.2); draft settlement motion (4.9); correspond with S. Koboci 
re same (0.2); revise same (0.6). 

5.9 

11/23/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Review and comment on draft of term sheet (0.6); identify 
signers for same (0.6); call with E. Worenklein re same (0.2); 
finalize and coordinate signatures for CCAB and CSCECB on 
term sheet (2.8). 

4.2 

11/23/25 Park, Junho Coordinate signatures for term sheet (1.8); compile term sheet 
with signature pages (0.4). 

2.2 

11/24/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review final of term sheet (0.3); email with team re settlement 
(0.4); email Debevoise team re contacting NY Court of Appeals 
re motion for leave to appeal (0.2); review letter to NY Court of 
Appeals (0.1); email with mediators re settlement (0.1); review 
BMLP correspondence re amended mediation order (0.1); email 
with N. Labovitz re timing and next steps (0.2); review draft 
motion for order approving settlement (0.3). 

1.7 
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11/24/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Monitor and guide pause of court proceedings based on finalized 
settlement term sheet (0.4); respond to BMLP inquiries re same 
(0.2); begin work on settlement agreement (0.4); correspond 
with E. Weisgerber re same (0.1); correspond with F. Yudkin 
[Cole Schotz] re timing for settlement hearing (0.2); correspond 
with M. Goodman re timing and path forward (0.2); review 
comments from BMLP, Lowenstein and CCA on mediation 
motion and term sheet (0.9). 

2.4 

11/24/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Analyze precedent for settlement agreement (0.3); email with N. 
Labovitz re same (0.2); call with Bahamian counsel re 
settlement (0.2); email with Debevoise team re settlement and 
next steps (0.2). 

0.9 

11/24/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Call with C. Zhang [CCA] re settlement approval process (0.3); 
email exchanges with BMLP, Lowenstein and CCA re execution 
version of term sheet (1.2); phone call with A. Costin re letter to 
NYS Court of Appeals re settlement (0.2); comment on draft 
letter (0.3); phone call with R. Zipursky re coordination with 
Bahamian counsel (0.3); comment on draft settlement motion 
and sealing motion (1.2); email with J. Park re compiling term 
sheet (0.3). 

3.6 

11/24/25 Ceresa, Chris Revise and comment on multiple drafts of 9019 motion (0.8); 
revise and comment on drafts of application to shorten time 
(0.6); revise and comment on drafts of sealing motion (0.6); 
correspond with S. Koboci and Debevoise team re issues, 
application, and 9019 motion (0.4). 

2.4 

11/24/25 Koboci, Shefit Review C. Ceresa comments to settlement motion (1.1); further 
correspond with C. Ceresa re same (0.4); revise draft settlement 
motion (2.7); correspond with B. Mishkin re same (0.2); further 
revise settlement motion (0.6); ) incorporate N. Labovitz 
comments to settlement motion (1.3); correspond with B. 
Mishkin re same (0.2); revise draft settlement motion (1.7); 
correspond with R. Zipursky re litigation comments to 
settlement motion (0.2). 

8.4 

11/24/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Draft and revise 9019 motion, sealing motion and application 
for shortened time (5.1); correspond with S. Koboci re same 
(0.2); further revise 9019 motion (0.7); further correspond with 
S. Koboci re same (0.2); review sealing motion and application 
for shortened time (0.3). 

6.5 

11/24/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Meet with FGS re press release for mediation settlement (0.5); 
review and revise settlement agreement for S. Koboci (0.5); call 
with E. Worenklein re Bahamian counsel coordination (0.3). 

1.3 

11/24/25 Park, Junho Compile and circulate executed term sheet to team (0.4); 
circulate same to BMLP (0.2); correspond with E. Worenklein 
re same (0.4). 

1.0 

11/25/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review revised motion to approve settlement (0.4); email with 
Debevoise team re same (0.1); review comments on motion to 
approve settlement (0.2); review additional comments on motion 
to approve settlement (0.2). 

0.7 
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/25/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Correspond with S. Koboci, E. Worenklein and F. Yudkin [Cole 
Schotz] re motion timing and process (0.3); coordinate drafting 
of settlement agreement (0.2); review updates from Debevoise 
team and edit settlement motion (1.2); review and address 
motion comments from CCA, Lowenstein team and Cole Schotz 
team (0.5). 

2.2 

11/25/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Email with Debevoise team re settlement motion and settlement 
agreement draft models. 

0.4 

11/25/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with B. Theisen [Gibbons] re timing of settlement 
motion (0.2); comment on draft 9019 motion (1.7); call with F. 
Yudkin [Cole Schotz] re timing for application to shorten (0.2); 
phone call with M. Godbe re settlement agreement (0.5); 
correspond with R. Zipursky re BMLP press release (0.3);  
review Cole Schotz comments to draft motions (0.6); comment 
on FGS mediation statements (0.9); mark up draft settlement 
agreement with BMLP (2.1); call with M. Godbe re same (0.3). 

6.8 

11/25/25 Ceresa, Chris Comment on 9019 motion (0.9); email with S. Koboci re same 
(0.2); review and analyze comments to 9019 motion (0.7); email 
with Debevoise team re same (0.9). 

2.7 

11/25/25 Godbe, Michael C. Call with E. Worenklein re settlement agreement (0.5); review 
settlement materials (0.2); draft settlement agreement (1.9); call 
with E. Worenklein re same (0.3); further draft same (4.7). 

7.6 

11/25/25 Heller, Rory Incorporate comments to draft settlement motion. 1.4 

11/25/25 Koboci, Shefit Further revise draft settlement motion (1.2); share revised draft 
with C. Ceresa (0.2); correspond with B. Mishkin re settlement 
motion (0.2); further revise draft settlement motion to reflect C. 
Ceresa comments and share with N. Labovitz (1.2); share 
sealing motion and application to shorten time with Cole Schotz 
team (0.3); revise settlement motion (1.2); review Cole Schotz 
comments to settlement motion (0.5); share revised draft of 
settlement motion with Cole Schotz and Duane Morris team 
(0.2); share revised draft with Lowenstein team (0.2); share 
revised draft with CCA team (0.2); correspond with C. Zhang 
[CCA] re comments to settlement motion (0.2); review 
Lowenstein team comments to settlement motion (0.5); review 
Cole Schotz team comments to settlement motion (0.6); 
correspond with E. Abrams and M. Bauer [Duane Morris] re 
settlement motion (0.2); revise draft settlement motion (1.0); 
share revised draft settlement motion with BMLP team (0.2). 

8.1 

11/25/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Revise 9019 motion (2.0); further review and revise same and 
application to shorten time and motion to seal (1.8); call with R. 
Zipursky re Bahamian proceedings (0.1). 

3.8 

11/25/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Review BMLP press release (0.3); confer with FGS re same 
(0.2); confer with opposing counsel re press release (0.3); 
review and revise press statements packet for CCA and affiliates 
(1.0); correspond with E. Worenklein re same (0.3); confer with 
B. Mishkin re Bahamian proceedings (0.1). 

2.2 

11/26/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review email from Judge Papalia (0.1); comment on draft 
settlement agreement (0.4); review settlement motion (0.2). 

0.7 
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11/26/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review and address BMLP comments to settlement motion 
(0.5); finalize same and review multiple versions in preparation 
for filing (1.4); review motions to seal and shorten time (0.4); 
correspond with R. Zipursky re scope of releases (0.3); review 
and comment on initial draft of settlement agreement (0.7); 
review revised draft and coordinate distribution of same (0.4). 

3.7 

11/26/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with R. Zipursky re questions on settlement 
agreement (0.9); research precedent re settlement agreement 
provisions (0.3); email with S. Koboci and C. Ceresa re edits to 
settlement motion (0.6); phone call with R. Zipursky re press 
materials for settlement (0.3); email with FGS re same (0.4); call 
with C. Zhang [CCA] re settlement motion (0.4); phone call 
with B. Thiesen [BMLP] re same (0.2); further mark up draft 
settlement agreement and incorporate comments (0.8); 
correspond with S. Koboci re same (0.3); review and comment 
on final version of settlement motion prior to filing (0.4); 
coordinate with M. Godbe re distribution of settlement 
agreement (0.1); phone call with Cole Schotz team re filing 
settlement motion and upcoming hearing (0.3). 

5.0 

11/26/25 Ceresa, Chris Correspond with Debevoise team re 9019 motion, sealing 
motion, application to shorten time (1.1); review and revise 
same (0.9); coordinate filing same (0.5); correspond and calls 
with Debevoise team re same (0.6). 

3.1 

11/26/25 Godbe, Michael C. Revise settlement agreement (1.0); coordinate with E. 
Worenklein re distribution of same (0.1). 

1.1 

11/26/25 Heller, Rory Incorporate further comments to settlement agreement (2.3); 
correspond with E. Worenklein re same (0.3); update surety 
providers re settlement (0.3). 

2.9 

11/26/25 Koboci, Shefit Review BMLP comments to settlement motion (0.6); 
correspond with E. Worenklein re same (0.2); correspond with 
C. Ceresa re same (0.2); share revised draft of settlement motion 
with CCA team (0.3); revise and finalize settlement motion 
(1.3); share revised draft of settlement motion with Cole Schotz, 
special committee, and Duane Morris (0.3); call with M. Bauer 
[Duane Morris] re sign off (0.2); prepare filing version of 
motion (0.3). 

3.4 

11/26/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Finalize motion to seal and application for shortened time (0.3); 
email same to Cole Schotz team and Verita team (0.2); finalize 
and redact settlement motion (1.8); email Verita team re service 
of same (0.1); email Cole Schotz team re filing of same (0.1); 
prepare final versions of sealing and settlement motion orders 
(0.2). 

2.7 

11/26/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Confer with FGS repress release (0.9); revise terms of 
settlement re Bahamian proceedings (0.2); confer with client re 
press releases (0.3); call with E. Worenklein re same (0.3); 
revise settlement agreement terms re release (0.3); research 
ownership of BMLP for settlement agreement (1.3); call with E. 
Worenklein re same (0.9); confer with opposing counsel and 
FGS re press release (0.3); email N. Labovitz re releases (0.3). 

4.8 

11/28/25 Goodman, Mark P. Email with N. Labovitz re scope of releases. 0.2 
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11/28/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review and further edit draft settlement agreement (0.7); email 
with M. Goodman re releases (0.2); correspond with R. 
Zipursky re same (0.2); review and analyze factual/drafting 
issue (1.6); correspondence with M. Godbe re resolution to same 
(0.2); update litigation team re same (0.2). 

3.1 

11/28/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with M. Godbe re settlement agreement (0.2); call 
with R. Zipursky re same (0.1). 

0.3 

11/28/25 Ceresa, Chris Correspond with Debevoise team re next steps re 9019 motion 
(0.2); review and revise notice re settlement agreement (0.4). 

0.6 

11/28/25 Godbe, Michael C. Review settlement agreement re released party coverage (0.4); 
call with E. Worenklein re same (0.2); call with R. Zipursky re 
same (0.2); email N. Labovitz analysis re same (1.5); revise 
settlement agreement (0.5); correspond with client, Lowenstein, 
Duane Morris, and Cole Schotz re same (0.4). 

3.2 

11/28/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Prepare notice of settlement agreement filing. 0.5 

11/28/25 Zipursky, Rebecca Call with M. Godbe re settlement agreement (0.2); confer with 
E. Worenklein re same (0.1); correspond with N. Labovitz re 
same (0.2); review materials re settlement agreement (0.4). 

0.9 

11/29/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Further review of settlement agreement (0.4); review 
Lowenstein comments re same (0.3); correspond with M. Godbe 
and E. Worenklein re same (0.2). 

0.9 

11/29/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Review Lowenstein comments to settlement agreement (0.4); 
correspond with N. Labovitz and M. Godbe re same (0.1). 

0.5 

11/29/25 Godbe, Michael C. Correspond with Lowenstein re settlement agreement (0.1); 
review same (0.2) correspond N. Labovitz and E. Worenklein re 
same (0.1); coordinate call with client re same (0.1). 

0.5 

11/30/25 Goodman, Mark P. Review emails various parties’ comments to settlement 
agreement (0.2); review revised settlement agreement 
incorporating comments (0.2). 

0.4 

11/30/25 Labovitz, M. Natasha Review various parties' comments to settlement agreement (0.7); 
call with E. Worenklein, M. Godbe, Y. Wei [CCA] and C. 
Zhang [CCA] re same (0.6); review harmonizing edits to 
agreement (0.4); correspond with M. Godbe and E. Worenklein 
re same (0.2); monitor analysis re Bahamian enforcement of 
settlement agreement (0.2). 

2.1 

11/30/25 Weisgerber, Erica S. Email with Debevoise team re provisions of settlement 
agreement. 

0.2 

11/30/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Participate in call re settlement agreement with Y. Wei [CCA], 
C. Zhang [CCA], N. Labovitz, and M. Godbe (0.6); call with M. 
Godbe re same (0.4); further revise draft settlement agreement 
(0.9); correspond with N. Labovitz and M. Godbe re same (0.2); 
review comments from Cole Schotz re same (0.2); email with 
litigation team re draft settlement agreement (0.3); mark up draft 
notice for settlement agreement (0.2); call with C. Zhang [CCA] 
re settlement agreement (0.6); call with M. Godbe re same (0.1); 
email with Debevoise team re same (0.4); follow up call with C. 
Zhang [CCA] re settlement (0.3). 

4.2 
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11/30/25 Godbe, Michael C. Participate in call re settlement agreement with Y. Wei [CCA], 
C. Zhang [CCA], N. Labovitz, and E. Worenklein (0.6); call 
with E. Worenklein re settlement logistics (0.4); revise 
settlement agreement (1.9); correspond with N. Labovitz re 
same (0.2); correspond with Cole Schotz, Lowenstein, and 
Duane Morris re same (0.3); call with E. Worenklein re 
settlement (0.1); revise settlement agreement per client 
comments (0.2). 

3.7 

11/30/25 Mishkin, Benjamin Email E. Worenklein re notice of filing of settlement agreement 
(0.1); update same per feedback from E. Worenklein (0.1). 

0.2 

 

  Total Hours 452.0 
 

  

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 685    Filed 02/06/26    Entered 02/06/26 15:02:15    Desc Main
Document      Page 77 of 84



27188.1028 – MEDIATION  Invoice Number: 2503516 

 

  Page 18 
  

 

 
 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Partner Goodman, Mark P. 26.4 2,317.50 61,182.00 

 Labovitz, M. Natasha 71.0 2,317.50 164,542.50 

 Levinson, Sidney P. 0.2 2,317.50 463.50 

 Weisgerber, Erica S. 22.7 2,025.00 45,967.50 

Partner Total 120.3  $272,155.50 

    
 Counsel Worenklein, Elie J. 76.1 1,620.00 123,282.00 

Counsel Total 76.1  $123,282.00 

    
 Associate Godbe, Michael C. 16.5 1,471.50 24,279.75 

 Ceresa, Chris 13.9 1,458.00 20,266.20 

 Costin, Alexander 7.7 1,458.00 11,226.60 

 Zipursky, Rebecca 31.0 1,458.00 45,198.00 

 Heller, Rory 84.1 1,354.50 113,913.45 

 Koboci, Shefit 40.1 1,287.00 51,608.70 

 Mishkin, Benjamin 49.9 1,017.00 50,748.30 

Associate Total 243.2  $317,241.00 

    
 Legal Assistant Park, Junho 12.4 522.00 6,472.80 

Legal Assistant Total 12.4  $6,472.80 

    
 

Matter Total 452.0  $719,151.30 
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February 2, 2026 

Chenyue Zhang 
CCA Construction, Inc. 
445 South Street 
Suite 310 
Morristown, NJ  07960 

Invoice #: 2503513 Client Matter 27188.1024 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered through November 30, 2025 in connection with REPORTING 

Fees $1,609.20  

Charges and Disbursements $0.00 

TOTAL $1,609.20  
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Date Timekeeper Narrative Hours 

11/20/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Phone call with J. Schwarz [BDO] re MOR questions (0.2); 
correspond with J. Park re MOR budget (0.1). 

0.3 

11/20/25 Park, Junho Correspond with E. Worenklein re MOR budget and questions. 0.3 

11/21/25 Worenklein, Elie J. Comment on draft October MOR (0.2); correspond with J. Park 
re MOR question (0.1); phone call with BDO re same (0.2). 

0.5 

11/22/25 Park, Junho Send update to E. Worenklein re MOR question. 0.3 
 

  Total Hours 1.4 
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TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 
 

Title Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount 

 Counsel Worenklein, Elie J. 0.8 1,620.00 1,296.00 

Counsel Total 0.8  $1,296.00 

    
 Legal Assistant Park, Junho 0.6 522.00 313.20 

Legal Assistant Total 0.6  $313.20 

    
 

Matter Total 1.4  $1,609.20 
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Description of Disbursements for the Compensation Period 

Date Timekeeper 
Disbursement 

Category Narrative Amount 

9/3/2025 
Precost-New 
York, D&P PACER 

Vendor: Pacer Service Center-
PACER; Invoice#: 
DBDB0528SEPT2025; Date: 
9/1/2025 - Pacer $2.20

9/3/2025 
Precost-New 
York, D&P PACER 

Vendor: Pacer Service Center-
PACER; Invoice#: 
DBDB0528SEPT2025; Date: 
9/1/2025 - Pacer $8.80

9/8/2025 
Precost-New 
York, D&P PACER 

Vendor: Pacer Service Center-
PACER; Invoice#: 
DBDB0528SEPT2025; Date: 
9/1/2025 - Pacer $7.60

9/12/2025 
Precost-New 
York, D&P PACER 

Vendor: Pacer Service Center-
PACER; Invoice#: 
DBDB0528SEPT2025; Date: 
9/1/2025 - Pacer $5.40

9/16/2025 
Precost-New 
York, D&P PACER 

Vendor: Pacer Service Center-
PACER; Invoice#: 
DBDB0528SEPT2025; Date: 
9/1/2025 - Pacer $0.40

9/17/2025 
Precost-New 
York, D&P PACER 

Vendor: Pacer Service Center-
PACER; Invoice#: 
DBDB0528SEPT2025; Date: 
9/1/2025 - Pacer $0.20

9/20/2025 
Precost-New 
York, D&P PACER 

Vendor: Pacer Service Center-
PACER; Invoice#: 
DBDB0528SEPT2025; Date: 
9/1/2025 - Pacer $7.80

9/30/2025 
Precost-New 
York, D&P PACER 

Vendor: Pacer Service Center-
PACER; Invoice#: 
DBDB0528SEPT2025; Date: 
9/1/2025 - Pacer $0.70

9/30/2025 
Precost-New 
York, D&P PACER 

Vendor: Pacer Service Center-
PACER; Invoice#: 
DBDB0528SEPT2025; Date: 
9/1/2025 - Pacer $3.00

10/9/2025 
Goodman, 
Mark P. Travel 

Vendor: Leros Point to Point, Inc.; 
Invoice#: 83115; Date: 10/15/2025 - 
Taxi Invoice for Leros - 83115 - 
Taxi: 00140 - 10/9/2025: - 1127673 $359.12  
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Date Timekeeper 
Disbursement 

Category Narrative Amount 

10/9/2025 
Labovitz, M. 
Natasha Travel

Vendor: Leros Point to Point, Inc.; 
Invoice#: 83115; Date: 10/15/2025 - 
Taxi Invoice for Leros - 83115 - 
Taxi: 01083 - 10/9/2025: - 1127759 $299.88  

10/9/2025 Ceresa, Chris Travel 

Vendor: Leros Point to Point, Inc.; 
Invoice#: 83115; Date: 10/15/2025 - 
Taxi Invoice for Leros - 83115 - 
Taxi: 13917 - 10/9/2025: - 1127760 $364.35  

10/9/2025 
Weisgerber, 
Erica S. Travel 

Vendor: Leros Point to Point, Inc.; 
Invoice#: 83115; Date: 10/15/2025 - 
Taxi Invoice for Leros - 83115 - 
Taxi: 04794 - 10/9/2025: - 1127763 $176.20  

10/15/2025 
Mishkin, 
Benjamin Working Meal 

Vendor: Mishkin, Benjamin A. 
Invoice#: 7771459911060601 
Night/Weekend Working Meals; 
10/15/2025; Late Night Working 
Meal $33.94

10/16/2025 
Mishkin, 
Benjamin Travel 

Vendor: Mishkin, Benjamin A. 
Invoice#: 7771439411100603 Taxi; 
10/16/2025; Late Night Taxi $30.99  

10/18/2025 
Worenklein, 
Elie J. Travel 

Vendor: DialCar, Inc.; Invoice#: 
75123; Taxi: 10375 - 10/18/2025: - 
1128202 $89.98

10/21/2025 Park, Junho Travel 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7773020111110604 Taxi; 
10/21/2025; Late Night Taxi $82.51  

10/21/2025 Park, Junho Working Meal 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7817452911300603 Night/Weekend 
Working Meals;10/21/2025;Late 
Night Working Meal $40.00  

10/26/2025 Zhou, Xiaoxiao Research Westlaw $43.26  

11/5/2025 Park, Junho Travel 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7811197011260602 Taxi; 
11/05/2025; Late Night Taxi $23.94  

11/5/2025 Park, Junho Travel 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7811197011260602 Parking; 
11/05/2025; Park $10.00

11/5/2025 Park, Junho Working Meal 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7811197011260602 Night/Weekend 
Working Meals; 11/05/2025; Late 
Night Working Meal $14.97  
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Disbursement 
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11/6/2025 Park, Junho Working Meal 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7811197711260602 Night/Weekend 
Working Meals; 11/06/2025; Late 
Night Working Meal $20.00  

11/10/2025 Heller, Rory Travel 

Vendor: Rory B. Heller (#11934) 
Invoice#: 7806299011240606 Taxi; 
11/10/2025; Late Night Taxi $24.93  

11/10/2025 Park, Junho Travel 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7811198411260602 Taxi; 
11/10/2025; Late Night Taxi $30.49  

11/10/2025 Heller, Rory Working Meal 

Vendor: Rory B. Heller (#11934) 
Invoice#: 7806299011240606 
Night/Weekend Working Meals; 
11/10/2025; Late Night Working 
Meal $40.00

11/10/2025 Park, Junho Working Meal 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7811198411260602 Night/Weekend 
Working Meals; 11/10/2025; Late 
Night Working Meal $20.00  

11/11/2025 Heller, Rory Travel 

Vendor: Rory B. Heller (#11934) 
Invoice#: 7806318411240606 Taxi; 
11/11/2025; Late Night Taxi $22.80  

11/11/2025 Heller, Rory Working Meal 

Vendor: Rory B. Heller (#11934) 
Invoice#: 7806318411240606 
Night/Weekend Working Meals; 
11/11/2025; Late Night Working 
Meal $39.80

11/12/2025 Park, Junho Travel 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7811200711260602 Taxi; 
11/12/2025; Late Night Taxi $34.16  

11/12/2025 Park, Junho Working Meal 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7811200711260602 Night/Weekend 
Working Meals; 11/12/2025; Late 
Night Working Meal $20.00  

11/13/2025 Park, Junho Travel 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7811201711260602 Taxi; 
11/13/2025; Late Night Taxi $38.99  

11/13/2025 Park, Junho Working Meal 

Vendor: Park, Junho Invoice#: 
7810540811260602 Night/Weekend 
Working Meals; 11/13/2025; Late 
Night Working Meal $19.83  

11/18/2025 Pringle, James 
In house 
Reproduction Duplicating Services $14.00  
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