
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT DISTRICT 
OF NEW JERSEY 

 
FEE APPLICATION COVER SHEET FOR THE FIRST INTERIM FEE 

APPLICATION OF KURTZMAN CARSON CONSULTANTS, LLC DBA VERITA 
GLOBAL FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL 
SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF ACTUAL AND 

NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED DURING THE INTERIM FEE PERIOD 
FROM DECEMBER 22, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025 

 

 
 
 

In re CCA Construction, Inc.,1 Applicant: Kurtzman Carson Consultants, 
LLC dba Verita Global, Administrative 
Agent to the Debtor and Debtor in 
Possession 

Case No. 24-22548 (CMG)  
 

Client: Debtor and Debtor in Possession 

Chapter 11 Case Filed: December 22, 2024 
 

COMPLETION AND SIGNING OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES A CERTIFICATION 
UNDER PENALTY OF PERJURY PURSUANT TO 28 U.S.C. § 1746. 

 
RETENTION ORDER ATTACHED. 

 
 

 /s/ Sarah Harbuck                June 16, 2025      
SARAH HARBUCK              Date 
Assistant General Counsel 
Kurzman Carson Consultants, LLC 
dba Verita Global

 
1  The last four digits of CCA’s federal tax identification number are 4862. CCA’s service address for the purposes of this 

chapter 11 case is 445 South Street, Suite 310, Morristown, NJ 07960. 
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Summary of Amounts Requested for the Period 
December 22, 2024 through April 30, 2025 (the “Fee Period”) 

 
Total Previous Fees and Expenses Requested: $16,833.98 
Total Fees and Expenses Allowed to Date: $0.00 
Total Retainer Remaining: $25,000.00 
Total Holdback: $3,366.80  
Total Received by Applicant: $12,477.09  

 
 

SUMMARY BY TIMEKEEPER 
 

PROFESSIONAL HOURS RATE TOTAL FEES 
Daniel McSwigan 34.8  $     208.25   $   7,247.20  
Jonathan Thomson 14.3  $     208.25   $   2,978.03  

Sydney Reitzel 14.2  $     212.50   $   3,017.50  
William Gruber 16.9  $     212.50   $   3,591.25  

TOTAL 80.2  $16,833.98 
 

SUMMARY BY PROJECT CATEGORY 
 

Project Category Hours Total Fees 
Schedules and Statements of 
Financial Affairs 

80.2 $16,833.98 

TOTAL 80.2 $16,833.98 
 
 
 
 
 

SECTION I 
FEE SUMMARY 
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(1) Date cases filed: December 22, 2024 
 
(2) Chapter under which case commenced: Chapter 11 

 
(3) Date of retention: February 5, 2025, nunc pro tunc to December 22, 2024. See Exhibit A. 

 
If limit on number of hours or other limitations to retention, set forth: n/a 

 
(4) Summarize in brief the benefits to the estate and attach supplements as needed:1 

(a) Applicant assisted the Debtor and its professionals with the preparation of the 
Debtor’s Schedules and Statements and amended Schedules and Statements, 
including frequent communication regarding data, timelines, preparation status, 
and updates.  Application also gathered, organized, and tracked the Schedule and 
Statement data, prepared and updated multiple templates for and drafts of the 
Schedules and Statements. 

(b)  The Applicant rendered all other services set forth on the invoices attached hereto 
as Exhibit B.2 

(5) Anticipated distribution to creditors: 

(a) Administrative expense: Unknown at this time. 

(b) Secured creditors: Unknown at this time. 

(c) Priority creditors: Unknown at this time. 

(d) General unsecured creditors: Unknown at this time. 

(6) Final disposition of case and percentage of dividend paid to creditors: Unknown at this 
time. 

(7) This is the first interim fee statement. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

1  The following summary is intended to highlight the general categories of services the Applicant rendered on behalf 
of the Debtor and for the benefit of the estate; it is not intended to itemize each and every professional service which 
the Applicant performed. 

2  The invoice attached hereto as Exhibit B contains detailed descriptions of the services rendered and expenses 
incurred by Applicant during the Compensation Period. 

 
 

SECTION II 
CASE HISTORY 
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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
DISTRICT OF NEW JERSEY 

 
 

In re CCA Construction, Inc.,1 Applicant: Kurtzman Carson Consultants, 
LLC dba Verita Global, Administrative 
Advisor to the Debtor and Debtor in 
Possession 

Case No. 24-22548 (CMG)  
 

Client: Debtor and Debtor in Possession 

Chapter 11 Case Filed: December 22, 2024 
 

FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION OF KURTZMAN CARSON 
CONSULTANTS, LLC DBA VERITA GLOBAL FOR ALLOWANCE OF 
COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND  
FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES 

INCURRED DURING THE INTERIM FEE PERIOD FROM  
DECEMBER 22, 2024 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025 

 
TO: HONORABLE CHRISTINE M. GRAVELLE 

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE 
 

 Pursuant to sections 327, 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code, §§ 101-1532 

(the “Bankruptcy Code”), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure 

(the “Bankruptcy Rules”), and Rule 2016-1 of the Local Bankruptcy Rues for the District of New 

Jersey (the “Local Rules”), Kurtzman Carson Consultants, LLC dba Verita Global (“Verita”), 

administrative advisor for the above-captioned debtor and debtor-in-possession (the “Debtor”), 

hereby submits its first interim fee application (this “Fee Application”) for allowance of 

compensation for professional services provided in the amount of $16,833.98 for the period from 

December 22, 2024 through and including April 30, 2025 (the “Fee Period”).  In support of this 

Fee Application, Verita represents as follows: 

 

 
1  The last four digits of CCA’s federal tax identification number are 4862. CCA’s service address for the purposes 

of this chapter 11 case is 445 South Street, Suite 310, Morristown, NJ 07960. 
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JURISDICTION 

1. The United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of New Jersey (the “Court”) 

has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334 and the Standing Order of 

Reference to the Bankruptcy Court Under Title 11 dated as of September 18, 2012.  This matter is 

a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). 

2. Venue in this Court is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409. 

BACKGROUND 

3. On December 22, 2024 (the “Petition Date”), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition 

for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. 

4. On the Petition Date, the Debtor filed an application to employ Verita as its claims 

and noticing agent (in such capacity, the “Claims and Noticing Agent”) pursuant to 28 U.S.C. 

§ 156(c) [Docket No. 8] (the “Section 156(c) Application”), which was approved by the Court on 

December 23, 2024 [Docket No. 31] (the “Section 156(c) Order”). 

5. Given that the administration of these chapter 11 cases would require Verita to 

perform duties outside the scope of 28 U.S.C. § 156(c), the Debtor supplemented the Section 

156(c) Application with an application to retain Verita to perform certain services as the Debtor’s 

administrative advisor in these chapter 11 cases (in such capacity, the “Administrative Advisor”).  

On January 27, 2025, the Debtor filed the Debtor’s Application for Entry of an Order Authorizing 

the Debtor to Employ Kurtzman Carson Consultants, LLC dba Verita Global as Administrative 

Advisor Effective as of the Petition Date [Docket No. 96].  On February 5, 2025, the Court entered 

the Order Authorizing the Appointment of Kurtzman Carson Consultants, LLC dba Verita Global 

as Administrative Advisor Effective as of the Petition Date [Docket No. 115] (the “Retention 

Order”).  The Retention Order authorized the Debtor to compensate Verita in accordance with the 
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Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and any other applicable procedures 

and orders of the Court. 

6. The Retention Order authorizes Verita to provide the following services: 

(a) assist with, among other things, solicitation, balloting, and tabulation of 
votes, and prepare any related reports, as required in support of confirmation 
of a chapter 11 plan, and in connection with such services, process requests 
for documents from parties in interest, including, if applicable, brokerage 
firms, bank back-offices, and institutional holders; 

(b) prepare an official ballot certification and, if necessary, testify in support of 
the ballot tabulation results;  

(c) assist with the preparation of the Debtor’s schedules of assets and liabilities 
and statements of financial affairs and gather data in conjunction therewith;  

(d) provide a confidential data room, if requested;  

(e) manage and coordinate any distributions pursuant to a chapter 11 plan; and 

(f) provide such other processing, solicitation, balloting, and administrative 
services described in the Services Agreement, but not included in the 
Section 156(c) Order, as may be requested from time to time by the Debtor, 
this Court, or the Clerk of this Court. 

7. The amounts sought in this Application do not include any fees that may be payable 

by the Debtor for services provided by Verita under the Section 156(c) Order.  Procedures for the 

payment of such fees and disbursements are separately addressed in the Section 156(c) Order.  

Additionally, no fees and disbursements for services provided to the Debtor under the Retention 

Order are or will be sought to be paid under the Section 156(c) Order. 

8. On February 18, 2025, the Court entered the Administrative Fee Order Establishing 

Procedures for the Allowance and Payment of Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of 

Expenses of Professionals Retained by Order of this Court [Docket No. 178] (the “Interim 

Compensation Order”).  Pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, Professionals (as defined 

therein), are authorized to be paid eighty (80%) percent of fees and one-hundred (100%) percent 
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of expenses requested in monthly fee statements that are to be filed with the Court, subject to a 

fourteen-day objection deadline.  The Interim Compensation Order further provides that at four-

month intervals or such other intervals directed by the Court, Professionals (as defined therein) 

may file interim applications for allowance of compensation and reimbursement of expenses of 

the amount sought in the monthly fee statements, including the twenty (20%) percent holdback, 

pursuant to section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code. 

9. As disclosed in the Declaration of Evan J. Gershbein in Support of the Debtor’s 

Application for Entry of an Order Authorizing the Debtor to Employ Kurtzman Carson 

Consultants, LLC dba Verita Global as Administrative Advisor Effective as of the Petition Date 

[Docket No. 96, Exhibit B], Verita does not have any materially adverse connection to the Debtor, 

its creditors or other relevant parties and is a disinterested person as that term is defined in section 

101(14) of the Bankruptcy Code, as modified by section 1107(b) of the Bankruptcy Code.  Verita 

may have rendered and may continue to render services to certain of these creditors in matters 

unrelated to the chapter 11 case, either as vendors or in cases where Verita serves in a neutral 

capacity as a bankruptcy claims and noticing agent or class action settlement administrator. 

10. On May 1, 2023, funds affiliated with GCP Capital Partners LLC (“GCP”) 

indirectly acquired a controlling equity interest in Verita (the “Acquisition”).  Pursuant to the 

Acquisition, an indirect, non-controlling, beneficial minority interest in Verita was acquired by 

funds affiliated with J.P. Morgan Investment Management Inc. (“JPMIM”).  GCP is a 

middle-market private equity investment firm based in New York.  GCP has made investments in 

a number of industries, including tech-enabled business services, payments, and select financials.  

JPMIM is a U.S. registered investment adviser.  Designees of GCP are members of the Board of 

Managers (the “Board”) of Verita’s ultimate parent company, KCC Parent LLC dba Verita Parent 

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 372    Filed 06/16/25    Entered 06/16/25 23:01:53    Desc Main
Document      Page 7 of 55



(“Parent”).  Parent wholly owns Verita Intermediate, LLC, which in turn wholly owns Verita 

Global, LLC, which in turn wholly owns Verita Global Services, LLC, which in turn wholly owns 

Verita.  One representative of JPMIM is entitled to attend and observe (but not vote) at all meetings 

of the Board, but no designee of JPMIM is a member of the Board. 

11. Verita searched all entities listed in the list of Potential Parties in Interest against 

an internal database that includes (i) Verita’s parent entities, affiliates, and subsidiaries and (ii) 

GCP, GCP’s funds, and each such fund’s respective portfolio companies and investments as set 

forth in the list most recently provided to Verita by GCP.  Based solely on the foregoing search, 

Verita has determined, to the best of its knowledge, that there are no material connections.   

12. All services for which compensation is requested by Verita were performed on 

behalf of the Debtor. 

DISCLOSURE OF COMPENSATION AND REQUESTED AWARD 

13. By this Fee Application, Verita requests (a) an award of compensation for 

professional services provided in the amount of $16,833.98 for the Fee Period; and (b) payment of 

$4,356.89, which, as of the date hereof, is the total amount of fees for services rendered during the 

Fee Period for which Verita has not yet been paid.   

14. Verita prepared monthly fee applications as filed with this Court at Docket Nos. 

202 and 268 (each a “Monthly Fee Statement,” and collectively, the “Monthly Fee Statements”) 

for the months of January 2025 and March 2025.  The Monthly Fee Statements sought approval 

of fees in the aggregate amount of $16,833.98 and expenses in the aggregate amount of $0.00. 

15. The amount of time spent by each employee providing services to the Debtor for 

the Fee Period is detailed in line item listings of time entries and descriptive detail set forth herein 

and in the invoices attached to the Monthly Fee Statements.  These are Verita’s normal hourly 
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rates of compensation for work of this character.  The reasonable value of the services rendered 

by Verita for the Final Fee Period as Administrative Advisor to the Debtor in these chapter 11 case 

is $16,833.98.  Verita is not seeking reimbursement for any expenses in this Fee Application.  

Verita professionals expended 80.2 hours of work during the Fee Period at a blended hourly rate 

of $209.90. 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES2 

16. During the Fee Period, Verita professionals spent 80.2 hours assisting the Debtor 

and its professionals with the preparation of the Debtor’s Schedules and Statements and amended 

Schedules and Statements, including frequent communication regarding data, timelines, 

preparation status, and updates.  Verita also gathered, organized, and tracked the Schedule and 

Statement data, prepared and updated multiple templates for and drafts of the Schedules and 

Statements. 

17. Verita believes that the time entries included in Exhibit B are in compliance with 

the requirements of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, and any other 

applicable procedures and orders of the Court. 

18. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, 

Verita submits that the amount requested is fair and reasonable given (a) the complexity of these 

cases, (b) the time expended, (c) the nature and extent of services rendered, (d) the value of such 

services, and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under this title. 

BASIS FOR RELIEF 

19. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of 

 
2  This summary of services rendered during the Fee Period is not intended to be a detailed or exhaustive description 

of the work performed by Verita.  More detailed descriptions of the work performed in the Fee Period, categorized 
by subject matter, and those day-to-day services and the time expended in performing such services are set forth 
in the detailed time records attached hereto as Exhibit B. 
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professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code to 

govern the Court’s award of such compensation.  Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code provides 

that a court may award a professional employed under section 327 of the Bankruptcy Code 

“reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered . . . and reimbursement for 

actual, necessary expenses.”  11 U.S.C. § 327. 

20. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code contains two separate criteria, and before 

determining the reasonableness of the services rendered, the Court must make a threshold inquiry 

into its necessity.  See In re Engle, 190 B.R. 206, 209 (Bankr. D.N.J. 1995); see also In re Fleming 

Cos., 304 B.R. 85, 89 (D. Del. 2003) (discussing a two-tiered approach to determine whether 

compensation should be allowed–first “the court must be satisfied that the attorney performed 

actual and necessary services” and second, “the court must assess a reasonable value for those 

services.”).  The majority of courts that have interpreted section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code have 

held that an element of whether such services are “necessary” is whether they benefitted the 

bankruptcy estate.  Engel, 190 B.R. at 209.  Further, the test for determining necessity is objective, 

focusing on what services a reasonable lawyer would have performed under the same 

circumstances.  See In re APW Enclosure Sys., Inc., No. 06-11378 (MFW), 2007 WL 3112414, 

at *3 (Bankr. D. Del. 2007) (citing In re Ames Dep’t Stores, Inc., 76 F.3d 66, 72 (2d Cir. 1996)).  

This test does not rely on hindsight to determine the ultimate success or failure of the attorneys’ 

actions.  See id. (citing Keate v. Miller (In re Kohl), 95 F.3d 713, 714 (8th Cir. 1996)). 

21. Once the Court determines that the services were necessary, it also assesses the 

reasonable value of the services.  See 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3).  Specifically, section 330(a)(3) of the 

Bankruptcy Code sets forth the criteria for the award of such compensation and reimbursement.  

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the Court should consider 
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the nature, extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including: 

a. the time spent on such services; 

b. the rates charged for such services; 

c. whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the 
time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this 
title; 
 

d. whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time 
commensurate with the complexity, importance and nature of the problem, issue, 
or task addressed; 
 

e. with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or 
otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and 
 

f. whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation 
charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this 
title. 
 

11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3). 

22. In determining the reasonableness of fees, courts in this Circuit routinely “employ 

the twelve factors set forth in Johnson v. GA Highway Express, Inc., 488 F.2d 714, 717-19 (5th 

Cir. 1974).”  Staino v. Cain (In re Lan Assocs. XI, L.P.), 192 F.3d 109, 123 (3d Cir. 1999).  These 

factors include: (i) the time and labor required; (ii) the novelty and difficulty of the questions 

involved; (iii) the skill required to perform the legal service properly; (iv) the preclusion of 

employment by the attorney due to acceptance of the case; (v) the customary fee charged; 

(vi) whether the fee is fixed or contingent; (vii) time limitations imposed by the client or the 

circumstances; (viii) the amount involved and the results obtained; (ix) the experience, reputation 

and ability of the attorneys; (x) the undesirability of the case; (xi) the nature and length of the 

professional relationship with the client; and (xii) awards in similar cases.  Id. at 123 n.8. 

23. In the instant case, Verita respectfully submits that the services for which it seeks 

compensation in this Fee Application were necessary for and beneficial to the Debtor during the 
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pendency of this chapter 11 case.  Verita respectfully submits that the services rendered to the 

Debtor were performed economically, effectively and efficiently and the results obtained have 

benefited not only the Debtor, but also creditors and parties in interest as a whole.  Verita further 

submits that the compensation requested herein is reasonable in light of the nature, extent and 

value of such services to the Debtor. 

24. In sum, the services rendered by Verita were necessary and beneficial to the 

Debtor’s estate and were consistently performed in a timely manner commensurate with the 

complexity, importance, novelty and nature of the issues involved.  Accordingly, approval of the 

compensation sought herein is warranted. 

CONCLUSION 

25. The administrative services summarized by this Fee Application and rendered by 

Verita to the Debtor during the Fee Period were substantial, professional, and beneficial to the 

Debtor.  

26. As demonstrated throughout this Fee Application, the other factors typically 

considered in determining compensation – including complexity, results achieved, special 

expertise, magnitude of the matter, and professional standing – all militate toward the conclusion 

that the amount of compensation requested by Verita is necessary, fair, and reasonable. 

27. All services for which compensation is sought were performed for and on behalf of 

the Debtor.  Verita is charging its standard hourly rate for professionals performing services.  

Verita has not entered into any agreement, express or implied, with any other party in interest for 

the purpose of fixing or sharing fees or other compensation to be paid for professional services 

rendered in this chapter 11 case. 

WHEREFORE, Verita respectfully requests that this Court enter an order:  (a) awarding 
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compensation for professional services provided in the amount of $16,833.98 for the Fee Period; (b) 

authorizing payment of $4,356.89, which, as of the date hereof, is the total amount of fees for services 

rendered during the Fee Period for which Verita has not yet been paid; and (c) granting such other and 

further relief as this Court deems just and proper. 

Dated:  June 16, 2025 
 El Segundo, California 

 

 

 
 
 
 

 /s/ Sarah Harbuck        
SARAH HARBUCK            
Assistant General Counsel 
Kurzman Carson Consultants, LLC 
dba Verita Global
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Exhibit A 

Retention Order 
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Exhibit B 

Detailed Time Records 
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US-RESTR2709939 1 of 12

February 18, 2025

CCA Construction, Inc.
Chenyue Zhang 
445 South Street, Suite 310
Morristown NJ 07960
United States

Re: CCA Construction, Inc. 
USBC Case No. 24-22548

Dear Chenyue Zhang,

Enclosed please find Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC dba Verita Global invoice for the period January 1, 2025
to January 31, 2025 in the amount of $15,596.36 for the above referenced matter.
Pursuant to our services agreement, Verita's invoice is due upon receipt.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (310) 751-1803 or egershbein@kccllc.com.

Sincerely,
Verita Global LLC

Evan Gershbein
EVP Restructuring

Enclosures

Verita Global LLC 222 N Pacific Coast Hwy, El Segundo, CA, 90245 Phone 310-823-9000 Fax 310-823-9133 VeritaGlobal.com 
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US-RESTR2709939 2 of 12

2/18/2025

Contact Parties

Elie J. Worenklein

66 Hudson Boulevard

New York NY 10001

United States

Felice R. Yudkin

Court Plaza North, 25 Main Street

Hackensack NJ 07601

United States

Fran B. Steele

1085 Raymond Blvd, Suite 2100

Newark NJ 07102

United States

M. Natasha Labovitz

66 Hudson Boulevard

New York NY 10001

United States

Mei Lui

Strategic Capital

537 Greenwich St

New York NY 10013

United States

Michael D. Sirota

Court Plaza North, 25 Main Street

Hackensack NJ 07601

United States
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US-RESTR2709939 3 of 12

Peter J. DAuria

1085 Raymond Blvd, Suite 2100

Newark NJ 07102

United States

Rory B. Heller

66 Hudson Boulevard

New York NY 10001

United States

Ryan T. Jareck

Court Plaza North, 25 Main Street

Hackensack NJ 07601

United States

Savanna J. Bierne

1085 Raymond Blvd, Suite 2100

Newark NJ 07102

United States

Sidney P. Levinson

66 Hudson Boulevard

New York NY 10001

United States

Warren A. Usatine

Court Plaza North, 25 Main Street

Hackensack NJ 07601

United States

Case 24-22548-CMG    Doc 372    Filed 06/16/25    Entered 06/16/25 23:01:53    Desc Main
Document      Page 38 of 55



US-RESTR2709939 4 of 12

KCC (dba Verita Global)

Account Number Invoice Date February 18, 2025

Invoice Number US-RESTR2709939 Due Date Due upon receipt

CCA Construction, Inc.
Summary

Description Amount

Hourly Fees

Hourly Fees Charged $15,596.36

Total of Hourly Fees $15,596.36

Expenses

Expenses $0.00

Total Expenses $0.00

Invoice Subtotal $15,596.36

Sales and Use Tax $0.00

Total Invoice $15,596.36
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Verita Global LLC
1/1/2025 - 1/31/2025

Total Hourly Fees by Employee

Initial Employee Name Position Type Hours Rate Total
DPM Daniel McSwigan SOL 34.8 $208.25 $7,247.20

JTN Jonathan Thomson SOL 10.5 $208.25 $2,186.66

SYR Sydney Reitzel SOL 12.1 $212.50 $2,571.25

WRG William Gruber SOL 16.9 $212.50 $3,591.25
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Verita Global LLC
1/1/2025 - 1/31/2025

Time Detail

Date Employee Description Position Type Category Hours
1/2/2025 DPM Teleconference meeting with BDO, Verita team to discuss 

Schedule and SOFA Preparation
SOL Schedules & 

SOFA
0.4

1/2/2025 JTN Meeting with BDO and Cole Schotz regarding Schedules SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/2/2025 SYR Call with BDO & Cole Schotz regarding preparation of 
Schedules and Statements

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/2/2025 WRG Teleconference with BDO and Verita personnel regarding 
SOFA and Schedule preparation and timing

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/9/2025 DPM Teleconference call with BDO, Verita Team re: Schedule and 
SOFA preparation progress

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/9/2025 JTN Upload custom cover pages to Verita CaseView SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/9/2025 JTN Prepare for and participate in conference call with BDO re 
Statements and Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/9/2025 JTN Generate custom cover pages for Schedules and SOFA SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/9/2025 SYR Call with BDO & Cole Schotz regarding preparation of 
Schedules and Statements

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.2

1/9/2025 WRG Teleconference with Cole Schotz, BDO, and Verita personnel 
regarding SOFA and Schedule preparation

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.2

1/10/2025 JTN Perform quality review of Schedules and SOFAs for all 
Debtors to ensure accuracy and completeness

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/13/2025 DPM Prepare updates to Verita master templates with recent 
updates

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.8

1/13/2025 DPM Prepare Schedule G data for input into Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.1

1/13/2025 DPM Prepare SOFA 3 data for input into Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.1

1/13/2025 DPM Prepare SOFA 9 data for input into Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.8

1/13/2025 DPM Prepare SOFA 11 data for input into Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.8

1/13/2025 DPM Prepare SOFA 2 data for input into Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/13/2025 WRG Attention to email correspondence from BDO regarding 
updates to SOFA and Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

2.5

1/14/2025 DPM Perform quality review of Schedules and SOFAs data in 
Verita CaseView for all Debtors to ensure accuracy and 
completeness

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

2.4

1/14/2025 JTN Review Verita master file for SOFA and compare to source 
data from BDO to confirm accuracy of data

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.1

1/14/2025 JTN Meeting with case team re Schedules and SOFA review SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.8

1/14/2025 JTN Review Verita master file for Schedules and compare to 
source data from BDO to confirm accuracy of data

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.7

1/14/2025 SYR Coordinate with case team to review Schedules data in 
Verita CaseView to confirm data input into court forms

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.9
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Verita Global LLC
1/1/2025 - 1/31/2025

Time Detail

Date Employee Description Position Type Category Hours
1/14/2025 SYR Attention to master files for Schedules and SOFAs to confirm 

accuracy of data and formatting for upload to Verita 
CaseView

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.8

1/14/2025 SYR Coordinate with case team to review SOFA data in Verita 
CaseView to confirm data input into court forms

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.7

1/14/2025 WRG Review Verita CaseView data summaries for accuracy and 
completeness of recent updates to SOFA and Schedule

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.2

1/15/2025 DPM Generate and review Schedule and SOFA drafts SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.7

1/15/2025 JTN Review Verita master file for SOAL and compare to source 
data from BDO to confirm accuracy of data

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.9

1/15/2025 SYR Review Schedule and SOFA drafts (0.5); circulate comments 
along with potential updates to case team (0.2)

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.7

1/15/2025 WRG Prepare draft SOFA and Schedules with comments re open 
items

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.8

1/16/2025 DPM Attend teleconference call with BDO, Verita Team regarding 
schedule and SOFA preparation and updates

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/16/2025 JTN Prepare for and participate in conference call with BDO re 
Schedules and SOFA

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/16/2025 SYR Review parties on SOFA 29 and confirm noticing information 
in creditor matrix for former directors

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/16/2025 SYR Attention to correspondence with team regarding updates 
to master Schedules and SOFA data

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/16/2025 SYR Call with BDO team regarding status of Schedule and SOFA 
data, including comments and updates

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/16/2025 WRG Teleconference with BDO and Verita personnel regarding 
SOFA and Schedules preparation and timing

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/17/2025 WRG Attention to correspondence from BDO regarding updates 
to SOFA and Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/18/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA 4 data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.5

1/18/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA 3 data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.1

1/18/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA 26C data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.6

1/18/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA 7 data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/18/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA 29 data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/18/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA 28 data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/18/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA 2GB data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/18/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA 9 data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3
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Verita Global LLC
1/1/2025 - 1/31/2025

Time Detail

Date Employee Description Position Type Category Hours
1/18/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA 2 data in Verita CaseView per 

information received from BDO
SOL Schedules & 

SOFA
0.2

1/19/2025 DPM Prepare updates to Schedule A/B data in Verita CaseView 
per information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.5

1/20/2025 DPM Generate and review Schedule and SOFA drafts and prepare 
comments regarding open issues

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.4

1/20/2025 JTN Perform quality review of Schedules and SOFAs for all 
Debtors to ensure accuracy and completeness

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.2

1/20/2025 SYR Review comments from case team regarding updates to 
Schedule and SOFA drafts (0.6); circulate revisions to team 
(0.1)

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.7

1/20/2025 WRG Prepare and review draft SOFA and Schedules SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.6

1/20/2025 WRG Review Verita CaseView data summaries for accuracy and 
completeness of recent updates to SOFA and Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/20/2025 WRG Prepare draft SOFA and Schedules to incorporate revisions 
from case team

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.2

1/23/2025 WRG Prepare email correspondence to BDO regarding status of 
SOFA and Schedules preparation

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.2

1/24/2025 DPM Prepare Updates to SOFA data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.8

1/24/2025 DPM Perform quality review of Schedules and SOFAs data in 
Verita CaseView

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.7

1/24/2025 DPM Perform quality review of Schedules and SOFAs data in 
Verita CaseView to ensure accuracy and completeness

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.3

1/24/2025 DPM Generate and review Schedules, SOFA drafts (0.8); and 
prepare comments and updates regarding open issues (0.4)

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.2

1/24/2025 DPM Prepare updates to Schedule E/F Data in Verita CaseView 
per information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.0

1/24/2025 DPM Attention to emails received and added to Verita schedule 
email tracker

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.8

1/24/2025 DPM Prepare updates to Schedule G data in Verita CaseView per 
information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/24/2025 DPM Prepare for and participate in a conference call with 
Debevoise, BDO regarding Schedules and SOFA updates 
(0.1); review the data gathered thus far (0.1); and 
concurrently update the master tracking sheet with meeting 
notes and revisions (0.2)

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/24/2025 DPM Prepare updates to Schedule A/B data in Verita CaseView 
per information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/24/2025 DPM Generate and review Schedules, SOFA drafts and prepare 
comments and updates regarding open issues

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/24/2025 JTN Perform quality review of Schedules and SOFAs for all 
Debtors to ensure accuracy and completeness

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.1

1/24/2025 JTN Prepare for and participate in conference call with BDO re 
Statements and Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/24/2025 SYR Review revised drafts and masters following call with BDO, 
update formatting, circulate comments to team

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

2.3
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Verita Global LLC
1/1/2025 - 1/31/2025

Time Detail

Date Employee Description Position Type Category Hours
1/24/2025 SYR Review revised drafts from BDO, including comments on 

open items, and confirm accuracy of data and redactions
SOL Schedules & 

SOFA
0.8

1/24/2025 SYR Call with BDO & Cole Schotz regarding preparation of 
Schedules and Statements

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/24/2025 WRG Attention to email correspondence from BDO regarding 
updates to Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.1

1/24/2025 WRG Attention to correspondence from BDO regarding updates 
to SOFAs and Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.0

1/24/2025 WRG Review Verita CaseView data summaries for accuracy and 
completeness for recent updates to SOFA and Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/24/2025 WRG Prepare draft SOFA and Schedules to incorporate revisions 
from case team

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/24/2025 WRG Teleconference with Cole Schotz, BDO, and Verita personnel 
regarding SOFA and Schedules preparation

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/24/2025 WRG Attention to email correspondence from BDO regarding 
updates to Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/24/2025 WRG Prepare updated draft of SOFA and Schedules SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.2

1/27/2025 DPM Attention to pending updates and revisions in preparation 
for filing

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

4.5

1/27/2025 DPM Prepare updates to SOFA data per information received 
from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.6

1/27/2025 DPM Prepare updates to sofa data in Verita CaseView per 
discussions with Nova

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.6

1/27/2025 DPM Generate and review updated draft Schedule and SOFA data SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/27/2025 DPM Prepare updates to Schedule A/B data in Verita CaseView 
per information received from BDO

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/27/2025 DPM Generate and review Schedules, SOFA file ready version SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/27/2025 JTN Perform quality review of Schedules and SOFAs for all 
Debtors to ensure accuracy and completeness

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.8

1/27/2025 SYR Review revised PDF drafts of Schedule and SOFA data to 
confirm accuracy of input data and attachments, including 
redactions

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

1.3

1/27/2025 SYR Review data and confirm accuracy of Schedule and SOFA 
updates in Verita CaseView

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.8

1/27/2025 SYR Review final PDFs of Schedule and SOFA data to confirm 
accuracy of input data and attachments prior to filing

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.7

1/27/2025 SYR Review various correspondence with BDO regarding 
updates to Schedule and SOFA data prior to filing

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

1/27/2025 WRG Attention to potential updates to file-ready SOFA and 
Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

4.5

1/27/2025 WRG Prepare revised draft SOFA and Schedules SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5
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Verita Global LLC
1/1/2025 - 1/31/2025

Time Detail

Date Employee Description Position Type Category Hours
1/27/2025 WRG Attention to email correspondence from BDO regarding 

updates to SOFA question 4 and Schedule A/B
SOL Schedules & 

SOFA
0.4

1/27/2025 WRG Attention to email correspondence from BDO regarding 
updates to SOFA and Schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.4

1/27/2025 WRG Prepare updated draft SOFA and Schedules SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

1/27/2025 WRG Prepare email correspondence to BDO regarding SOFA and 
SOAL status

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.1
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Verita Global LLC
1/1/2025 - 1/31/2025

Expenses

Description Units Rate Amount
Printing and Mailing Expenses $0.00

Total Expenses $0.00
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Verita Global LLC
1/1/2025 - 1/31/2025

Printing and Mailing Expenses

Post Date Mailing Name Quantity Description Rate Total

Total Printing and Mailing Expenses $0.00
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April 14, 2025

CCA Construction, Inc.
Chenyue Zhang 
445 South Street, Suite 310
Morristown NJ 07960
United States

Re: CCA Construction, Inc. 
USBC Case No. 24-22548

Dear Chenyue Zhang,

Enclosed please find Kurtzman Carson Consultants LLC dba Verita Global invoice for the period March 1, 2025
to March 31, 2025 in the amount of $1,237.62 for the above referenced matter.
Pursuant to our services agreement, Verita's invoice is due upon receipt.

If you have any questions, please contact me at (310) 751-1803 or egershbein@kccllc.com.

Sincerely,
Verita Global LLC

Evan Gershbein
EVP Restructuring

Enclosures

Verita Global LLC 222 N Pacific Coast Hwy, El Segundo, CA, 90245 Phone 310-823-9000 Fax 310-823-9133 VeritaGlobal.com 
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4/14/2025

Contact Parties

Elie J. Worenklein

66 Hudson Boulevard

New York NY 10001

United States

Felice R. Yudkin

Court Plaza North, 25 Main Street

Hackensack NJ 07601

United States

Fran B. Steele

1085 Raymond Blvd, Suite 2100

Newark NJ 07102

United States

M. Natasha Labovitz

66 Hudson Boulevard

New York NY 10001

United States

Mei Lui

Strategic Capital

537 Greenwich St

New York NY 10013

United States

Michael D. Sirota

Court Plaza North, 25 Main Street

Hackensack NJ 07601

United States
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Peter J. DAuria

1085 Raymond Blvd, Suite 2100

Newark NJ 07102

United States

Rory B. Heller

66 Hudson Boulevard

New York NY 10001

United States

Ryan T. Jareck

Court Plaza North, 25 Main Street

Hackensack NJ 07601

United States

Savanna J. Bierne

1085 Raymond Blvd, Suite 2100

Newark NJ 07102

United States

Sidney P. Levinson

66 Hudson Boulevard

New York NY 10001

United States

Warren A. Usatine

Court Plaza North, 25 Main Street

Hackensack NJ 07601

United States
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KCC (dba Verita Global)

Account Number Invoice Date April 14, 2025

Invoice Number US-RESTR2710148 Due Date Due upon receipt

CCA Construction, Inc.
Summary

Description Amount

Hourly Fees

Hourly Fees Charged $1,237.62

Total of Hourly Fees $1,237.62

Expenses

Expenses $0.00

Total Expenses $0.00

Invoice Subtotal $1,237.62

Sales and Use Tax $0.00

Total Invoice $1,237.62
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Verita Global LLC
3/1/2025 - 3/31/2025

Total Hourly Fees by Employee

Initial Employee Name Position Type Hours Rate Total
JTN Jonathan Thomson SOL 3.8 $208.25 $791.37

SYR Sydney Reitzel SOL 2.1 $212.50 $446.25
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Verita Global LLC
3/1/2025 - 3/31/2025

Time Detail

Date Employee Description Position Type Category Hours
3/20/2025 JTN Prepare and format amended schedules for filing SOL Schedules & 

SOFA
1.9

3/20/2025 SYR Prepare updated court forms for amended Schedules E/F Pt 
2 and H

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.8

3/21/2025 JTN Prepare and format amended schedules for filing SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.7

3/21/2025 SYR Review schedule amendments prior to circulating to counsel 
and BDO for review

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.8

3/24/2025 JTN Prepare and send correspondence to client and counsel re 
amended schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.1

3/25/2025 JTN Prepare updates to amended schedules E/F Part 2 SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.6

3/25/2025 SYR Follow up with case team with comments to the amended 
schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.5

3/26/2025 JTN Prepare updates to amended schedules E/F Part 2 SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.3

3/26/2025 JTN Review and respond to correspondence from BDO, Cole 
Schotz and Debevoise re amended schedules

SOL Schedules & 
SOFA

0.2
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Verita Global LLC
3/1/2025 - 3/31/2025

Expenses

Description Units Rate Amount
Printing and Mailing Expenses $0.00

Total Expenses $0.00
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Verita Global LLC
3/1/2025 - 3/31/2025

Printing and Mailing Expenses

Post Date Mailing Name Quantity Description Rate Total

Total Printing and Mailing Expenses $0.00
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