

**UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI  
SOUTHEASTERN DIVISION**

In re:	)	
	)	Chapter 11
<b>BRIGGS &amp; STRATTON</b>	)	
<b>CORPORATION, et al.,</b>	)	Case No. <b>20-43597-399</b>
	)	
<b>Debtors.<sup>1</sup></b>	)	<b>(Jointly Administered)</b>
	)	
	)	<b>Obj. Deadline: March 31, 2021</b>

**COVER SHEETS FOR THE SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF  
ERNST & YOUNG LLP FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF  
EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM JULY 20, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 06, 2021**

Name of Applicant:	Ernst & Young LLP
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:	The above-captioned debtors and debtors-in-possession
Date of Retention:	August 24, 2020 (provisionally ordered on July 20, 2020)
Time period covered by this application:	July 20, 2020 through January 06, 2021
Total Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary in this Application:	\$7,120,122.39
Total Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary in this Application:	\$0.00
Total compensation approved by the First Interim Fee Application:	\$5,913,194.50
Total expenses approved by the First Interim Fee Application:	\$0.00
Total Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary for the Second Interim Period:	\$1,206,927.89
Compensation Sought in this Application That Was Already Paid But Not Yet Allowed for Second Interim Period:	\$499,344.80
Expense Reimbursement Sought in this Application That Was Already Paid But Not Yet Allowed for Second Interim Fee Period:	\$0.00
Compensation Sought in this Application Not Yet Paid or	\$707,583.09

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal tax identification number are: Briggs & Stratton Corporation (2330), Billy Goat Industries, Inc. (4442), Allmand Bros., Inc. (4710), Briggs & Stratton International, Inc. (9957), and Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC (2102). The address of the Debtors' corporate headquarters is 12301 West Wirth Street, Wauwatosa, Wisconsin 53222.



Allowed for Second Interim Fee Period:	
Blended Hourly Rate for Second Interim Fee Period:	\$606.33
Number of professionals included in this application	34

This is a(n):                    \_\_\_ Monthly        \_\_\_ Interim        \_\_\_X\_\_\_ Final Application

**COMPENSATION SUMMARY BY PROFESSIONAL  
NOVEMBER 1, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021<sup>2</sup>**

Name	Title	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Fees
Ficks, Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	18.80	\$ 940.00	\$ 17,672.00
Adams, James	Partner/Principal	0.20	900.00	180.00
Halloran, Michael	Partner/Principal	0.50	900.00	450.00
Kim, Dale Young	Partner/Principal	0.50	900.00	450.00
Puechner, Shawn P.	Partner/Principal	4.30	900.00	3,870.00
Ressler, Brad G.	Partner/Principal	0.30	900.00	270.00
Simon, John F	Partner/Principal	0.60	900.00	540.00
Guerino, Frank	Executive Director	0.80	850.00	680.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	61.90	850.00	52,615.00
French, Jason S	Executive Director	0.50	850.00	425.00
Mitchell, Traci R.	Executive Director	1.90	850.00	1,615.00
Wetherington, Trevor T	Executive Director	1.40	850.00	1,190.00
Xavier, Ronald	Executive Director	0.90	850.00	765.00
Branditz, Fred C	Senior Manager	1.50	725.00	1,087.50
Gatt, Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	13.90	725.00	10,077.50
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	204.60	795.00	162,657.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	160.30	795.00	127,438.50
Mills, Rebecca Hinson	Senior Manager	2.50	725.00	1,812.50
Porepa, Jodi	Senior Manager	13.70	795.00	10,891.50
Rule, Martin Daniel	Senior Manager	1.60	725.00	1,160.00
Sammons, John David	Senior Manager	1.30	725.00	942.50
Tajuddin, Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12.00	745.00	8,940.00
Weden, Marcus L.	Senior Manager	3.00	725.00	2,175.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	143.80	650.00	93,470.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	233.20	650.00	151,580.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	186.20	650.00	121,030.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	209.70	470.00	98,559.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	292.60	470.00	137,522.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	188.80	470.00	88,736.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	100.20	470.00	47,094.00

<sup>2</sup> A similar summary pertaining to EY LLP's engagement by Debtors during the First Interim Period is included in the First Interim Fee Application and is incorporated herein by this reference

Name	Title	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Fees
Risman,Alexander Harrison	Senior	4.10	475.00	1,947.50
Wright,Jermame L.	Senior	1.00	875.00	875.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	50.30	275.00	13,832.50
Sobers,Linsay	Staff	0.90	300.00	270.00
<b>Subtotal</b>				<b>1,162,820.00</b>
Sales and Use Tax Recovery Services - progress billing on Missouri sales and use tax refund claim is based on payment of half of the 35% finding based fee related to gross refunds of \$255,107.89 filed with Missouri Department of Revenue.				44,107.89
<b>Total Due</b>		<b>1,917.80</b>		<b>\$1,206,927.89</b>

**COMPENSATION SUMMARY BY PROJECT CATEGORY  
NOVEMBER 1, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021<sup>3</sup>**

<b>Time Category</b>	<b>Category Descriptions</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fees</b>
Analysis of leases and executory contracts	This category relates to the collation, review and analysis of the Debtor's executory contracts and leases to be rejected, assigned or assumed, and to determine any prepetition balances for cure and/or claim purposes.	142.40	80,345.50
Asset Analysis and Recovery	This category relates to the analysis of recoveries and/or potential inflows to the Estate, including associated with potential settlements for the benefit of the Estate and the final net working capital adjustment arising from the sale of the assets of the Debtors to the stalking horse bidder.	22.30	17,931.50
Board of Directors Matters	This category includes the preparation of materials for, and attendance at meetings with, the Board of Directors	8.70	7,221.00
Cash Monitoring	This category relates to the daily review of payment proposals, AP and cash disbursements to monitor compliance with first day motions, the cash flow forecast, the wind down budget and any covenants as described in the cash collateral motion and order.	94.40	70,799.50
Chapter 11 Process and Case Management	This category relates to organizing and managing the Debtors' resources to effectively and efficiently plan, coordinate and manage the chapter 11 post-petition process, including preparation of motions, support in filing of objections and other case related procedures	3.00	1,410.00
Claims Analysis and Administration	This category includes matters related to the identification of company data related to different claims categories, including 503(b)(9) and employee claims and reconciliation of claim amounts	1,192.00	686,958.00
Court Preparation & Attendance	This category relates to time incurred preparing for and attending telephonic court hearings.	18.30	14,954.50
Fee/Employment Applications	This category relates to planning and coordinating the professionals' time protocols, preparation of monthly fee statements, preparation of interim fee applications, invoices, and responding to inquiries	83.30	37,857.50

<sup>3</sup> A similar summary pertaining to EY LLP's engagement by Debtors during the First Interim Period is included in the First Interim Fee Application and is incorporated herein by this reference.

<b>Time Category</b>	<b>Category Descriptions</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fees</b>
Financial Analysis	Includes analysis of financial information of a general nature including analysis and consolidation of accounts receivable, inventory and accounts payable data for use in multiple other analyses or activities, intercompany accounting analysis, reconciliations, and analysis of operating results including gross and net revenues and related gross-to-net expenditures, and other financial analysis with multiple applications.	8.70	5,385.50
Meetings with Management	This category relates to meetings held with the Debtor's management.	16.50	12,668.00
Meetings with other Advisors	This category relates to meetings held with the Debtor's advisors, including the Debtor's counsel and investment banker, or other advisors not included in other meeting categories.	25.80	20,373.50
Plan and Disclosure Statement	This category includes time related to plan and disclosure issues. Time in this category includes communicating with Debtors' professionals regarding combined plan and disclosure statement structure and language issues; preparation of liquidation analysis; reviewing and revising draft plans / disclosure statements and analysis of creditor recoveries.	28.50	20,870.00
SOFA & SOALS	This category includes activities associated with the collection and analysis of information, preparation, reconciliation, analysis, review and updates of the Schedules of Assets and Liabilities and the Statement of Financial Affairs.	25.00	15,546.50
Tax Issues	Matters related to assessing the Debtor's current and future tax liability including assisting the Debtor's tax advisor with information requests, and assisting with the Debtor's potential tax liabilities arising from the sale of the assets, and the Debtor's potential benefit from a refundable tax credit.	110.50	88,461.50
UST Reporting and MOR	This category includes activities associated with the collection of information, preparation, reconciliation and review of the Initial Debtor Interview, the Monthly Operating Report, other UST reports including OCP and Critical Vendors and responding to requests from the US Trustee.	105.70	60,115.50
Vendor Issues	This category relates to advice and analysis related to the Debtor's vendors, including critical vendor negotiations, trade agreements, vendor cure notices and objections and certain processes related to accounts payable and disbursements.	19.70	11,485.50

<b>Time Category</b>	<b>Category Descriptions</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fees</b>
Support for Motion Materials	This category includes matters associated with reviewing and preparing motions to understand the specific requirements of the Debtor related to wages, taxation, insurance, cash management system, cash collateral motions/orders and cash collateral reporting, and critical vendors.	5.70	4,633.00
Wind Down Activities	This category relates to advice and analysis related to the Debtor's proposed wind down officer, and related operations of the Debtor post-close of the sale transaction.	7.30	5,803.50
<b>Subtotal</b>			<b>1,162,820.00</b>
Sales and Use Tax Recovery Services - progress billing on Missouri sales and use tax refund claim is based on payment of half of the 35% finding based fee related to gross refunds of \$255,107.89 filed with Missouri Department of Revenue.		N/A <sup>4</sup>	44,107.89
<b>Total</b>		<b>1,917.80</b>	<b>\$1,206,927.89</b>

---

<sup>4</sup> Pursuant to this Court's Order dated August 24, 2020 [D.I. 568] EY LLP need not record and submit detailed time entries with respect to the Sales and Use Tax Recovery Services, in which EY LLP will be compensated based on a percentage of the recoveries it is able to garner on the Debtors' behalf and not upon time and effort expended.

**SUMMARY OF EXPENSES**  
**NOVEMBER 1, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 6, 2021**

Expense Category	Expense Amount
<b>Total Expenses Due</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MISSOURI  
SOUTHEASTERN DIVISION

In re: )  
) Chapter 11  
**BRIGGS & STRATTON** )  
**CORPORATION, et al.,** ) Case No. **20-43597-399**  
)  
**Debtors.**<sup>1</sup> ) **(Jointly Administered)**  
)  
) **Obj. Deadline: March 31, 2021**

---

**SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL APPLICATION OF ERNST & YOUNG LLP FOR  
COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF  
EXPENSES INCURRED AS FINANCIAL AND TAX ADVISOR TO THE DEBTORS  
FOR THE PERIOD FROM JULY 20, 2020 THROUGH JANUARY 06, 2021**

Pursuant to Sections 330 and 331 of Title 11 of the United States Code (the “**Bankruptcy Code**”), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “**Bankruptcy Rules**”), and Pursuant to Sections 105(A) and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 2016(A) and Local Bankruptcy Rules 2016-1 and 2016-2, Establishing Procedures For Interim Monthly Compensation of Professionals, Ernst & Young LLP (“**EY LLP**”) hereby seeks the entry of an order for interim allowance of compensation for professional services performed for the Debtors in the amount of \$1,206,927.89 and for reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses in the amount of \$0.00 incurred for the time period commencing November 1, 2020 through and including January 6, 2021 (the “**Second Interim Period**”), and for the final allowance of compensation for professional services performed for the Debtors in the total amount of \$7,120,122.39 and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses in the total amount of \$0.00

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor’s federal tax identification number are: Briggs & Stratton Corporation (2330), Billy Goat Industries, Inc. (4442), Allmand Bros., Inc. (4710), Briggs & Stratton International, Inc. (9957), and Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC (2102). The address of the Debtors’ corporate headquarters is 12301 West Wirth Street, Wauwatosa, Wisconsin 53222.



incurred for the time period commencing July 20, 2020 through and including January 6, 2021 (the “**Compensation Period**”) with respect to its retention as Financial and Tax Advisors to the above-captioned Debtors. In support of this Application, EY LLP represents as follows:

### **Background**

1. On July 20, 2020 (the “**Petition Date**”), Debtors commenced their reorganization cases (the “**Chapter 11 Cases**”) by filing voluntary petitions for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. Since the Petition Date, Debtors have operated their businesses and managed their properties as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.

2. On July 21, 2020, this Court entered an order [Doc. 117], authorizing and directing the joint administration and procedural consolidation of Debtors’ Chapter 11 Cases pursuant to sections 105(a) and 342(c)(1) of the Bankruptcy Code, Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b), and Local Bankruptcy Rule 1015(b). No trustee or examiner has been appointed in Debtors’ Chapter 11 Cases.

3. On August 5, 2020, the United States Trustee for the Eastern District of Missouri (the “**U.S. Trustee**”) appointed an official committee of unsecured creditors (the “**Creditors’ Committee**”) pursuant to section 1102 of the Bankruptcy Code [Doc. 304].

4. On December 18, 2020, the Court entered *Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and Order Pursuant to Sections 1129(a) and (b) of the Bankruptcy Code and Rule 3020 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure Confirming Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton Corporation and Its Affiliated Debtors* [Doc. No. 1485] (the “**Confirmation Order**”) confirming the *Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Briggs & Stratton*

*Corporation and Its Affiliated Debtors* [Doc. No. 1434] (together with the plan supplement, all schedules, and exhibits thereto, and as may be modified, amended, or supplemented from time to time, the (“**Plan**”)). The Plan became effective on January 6, 2021 (the “**Effective Date**”).

5. Pursuant to Section 2.2(a) of the Plan, no later than sixty (60) days after the Effective Date, all entities seeking an award of Fee Claims (as defined in the Plan), including EY LLP, are required to file their final request for allowance of compensation for services rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred from the Petition Date through and including the Effective Date. [Doc. No. 1434-1 ¶ 2.2.]

### **Jurisdiction**

6. The Court has jurisdiction to consider this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b). Venue is proper before the Court pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

### **Retention of EY LLP**

7. On July 20, 2020, the Debtors filed the *Debtors’ Application for Entry of an Order (I) Authorizing Employment and Retention of Ernst & Young LLP as Financial and Tax Advisor to the Debtors, Effective as of the Petition Date, and (II) Modifying Certain Requirements Under Local Rule 2016-2* [D.I. 42] (the “**Retention Application**”). The Retention Application was approved effective as of July 20, 2020 pursuant to this Court’s Order dated August 24, 2020 [Doc. No. 568] (the “**Retention Order**”). The Retention Order authorizes EY LLP to be compensated for services rendered and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses.

8. Local Bankruptcy Rule 2016-2 adopted by this Court authorizes a debtor in a chapter 11 case to “pay 80% of a professional’s fees and 100% of the professional’s expenses on

a monthly basis in accordance with this Rule” and in compliance with the Court’s Guidelines for Compensation attached as an Appendix to its Procedures Manual. L.R. 2016-2(B).

9. On December 18, 2020, EY LLP filed its *First Interim Fee Application of Ernst & Young LLP for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Financial and Tax Advisor to the Debtors for the Period from July 20, 2020 through October 31, 2020* [Doc. No. 1491] (the “**First Interim Fee Application**”).

10. The First Interim Fee Application was approved by this Court by Order dated January 22, 2021 [Doc. No. 1590] (the “**First Interim Fee Order**”), authorizing the payment to EY LLP of compensation for professional services and reimbursement of expenses for the time period from July 20, 2020 through and including October 31, 2020 (the “**First Interim Period**”).

11. EY LLP files this Application seeking approval and payment of final fees and expenses. During the Compensation Period, in accordance with the procedural requirements set forth in Local Bankruptcy Rule 2016-2(B) and the Guidelines for Compensation establishing the rules for monthly billing statements related to compensation and reimbursement of expenses incurred by professionals retained by Debtors, EY LLP prepared statements for its fees and expenses incurred each month (the “**Monthly Fee Statements**”) and has served copies of such Monthly Fee Statements upon Debtors as well as those parties identified in the certain Master Service List identified with these Chapter 11 Cases (collectively, the “**Notice Parties**”).

12. EY LLP has received no objections from Notice Parties to any Monthly Fee Statements.

13. To date, EY LLP has received payments from the Debtors (the “**Monthly Fee Payments**”) made pursuant to the Monthly Fee Statements but not yet allowed by interim order, for the Second Interim Period of compensation in the amount of \$499,344.80 (representing 80%

of its total fees from 11/01/20 through 11/30/20) and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$0.00 (representing 100%), for a combined total of \$499,344.80. The balance due and payable to EY LLP for the Second Interim Period is in the total amount of \$707,583.09. The Monthly Fee Statements and Monthly Fee Payments for the Second Interim Period are summarized in detail as follows:

Monthly Fee Statements		Fees and Expenses Incurred for Each Month		Monthly Fee and Expense Amounts Requested		Monthly Fee Payments Paid by Debtors	Balance Due and Payable Thru Fee Application
Date Requested	Period Covered	Fees (100%)	Expenses (100%)	Fees (80%)	Expenses (100%)		
01/20/21	11/01/2020 through 11/30/20	\$624,181.00	\$0.00	\$499,344.80	\$0.00	\$499,344.80	\$124,836.20
02/22/21	12/1/2020 through 01/06/2021	\$582,746.89	\$0.00	\$466,197.51	\$0.00	\$0	\$582,746.89
	<b>TOTALS:</b>	<b>\$1,206,927.89</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$965,542.31</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$499,344.80</b>	<b>\$707,583.09</b>

14. In accordance with the procedural requirements set forth in Local Bankruptcy Rule 2016-2(C) and the Guidelines for Compensation establishing the rules for payment of interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses incurred by professionals retained by Debtors, EY LLP now submits its Application for approval of fees and expenses incurred during the Compensation Period, including approval of all payments made pursuant to EY LLP's Monthly Fee Statements, as well as for allowance of payment of the remaining 20% of compensation held back from the Monthly Fee Payments in the total amount of \$7,120,122.39 (including fees incurred during the Second Interim Period in the amount of \$1,206,927.89).

15. Consistent with the terms of Engagement Letter, the Retention Application, and the Monthly Fee Statements, EY LLP drew down on and fully exhausted its pre-petition retainer

before applying post-petition Monthly Fee Payments to the outstanding balance due from Debtors.

**Basis for Relief Requested**

16. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code that govern the Court's award of such compensation. See 11 U.S.C. § 331. Section 330 provides that the Court may award a professional employed under section 327 "reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services" and "reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses." 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1). Section 330(a)(3) also outlines specific criteria that the Court shall consider in determining the amount of reasonable compensation, including:

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed;
- (E) with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the bankruptcy field; and
- (F) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other

than cases under this title.

11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3)(A)-(F).

17. In addition to the factors set forth in Section 330(a)(3) of the Bankruptcy Code, in evaluating the reasonableness of professional fees, Local Rule 2016-1(B)(1) (by reference to the “Guidelines for Compensation” located in the Procedures Manual that accompanies the Local Bankruptcy Rules) requires that all professional fee applications analyze the 12 factors for allowance of compensation as set forth in *Johnson v. Georgia Highway Express*, 388 F.2d 714 (5th Cir. 1974) (the “**Johnson Factors**”); see also *P.A. Novelly v. Palans*, 960 F.2d 728 (8th Cir. 1992); see also *Chamberlain v. Kula*, 213 B.R. 729, 736-39 (B.A.P. 8th Cir. 1997).

18. EY LLP submits that its Application satisfies the Johnson factors, as outlined below:

- (A) *The time and labor required* – EY LLP’s representation of the Debtors has required extensive time and effort given the complexity of the Debtors’ cases.
- (B) *The novelty and difficulty of the questions* – The Debtors’ cases are multifaceted and involved a large number of creditors and parties in interest.
- (C) *The skill requisite to perform services properly* – EY LLP’s believes that its professionals possess the knowledge and have demonstrated the skills necessary for the vigorous representation of the Debtors’ interest in these cases.
- (D) *The preclusion of other employment by the attorney due to acceptance of the case* – Acceptance of these chapter 11 cases has not precluded EY

LLP from other employment.

- (E) The customary fee – The rates charged by EY LLP are commensurate with the rates it charges for similar clients on similar matters.
- (F) Whether the fee is fixed or contingent – The fees requested herein are requested on an hourly basis.
- (G) Time limitations imposed by the client or the circumstances – These cases have presented time limitations typical of a chapter 11 case of this size and complexity.
- (H) The amount involved and the results obtained – The fee requested is reasonable given the size and complexity of the chapter 11 cases and the results obtained. During the Compensation Period and as evidenced by the detailed time records, EY LLP has assisted in obtaining numerous favorable results for the Debtors and has been diligent in its representation.
- (I) The experience, reputation, and ability of the attorneys – EY LLP is widely recognized as one of the premier financial advisors in the country. EY LLP professionals working on this matter have substantial experience with high complex restructuring matters.
- (J) The “undesirability” of the case – EY LLP does not consider the Debtors’ bankruptcy cases to be undesirable. EY LLP is privileged to have had the opportunity to represent the Debtors.
- (K) The nature of the professional relationship with the client – EY LLP is representing the Debtors. In these matters, EY LLP’s professionals have

worked with the Debtors' management and other professionals and, as a result, have become well acquainted with the Debtors' history, business operations, capital and corporate structure and related matters.

(L) Awards in similar cases – The fees requested in this case are appropriate and comparable to Chapter 11 cases of similar size and nature.

19. The services for which EY LLP seeks compensation were necessary for, beneficial to, and in the best interests of the Debtors and their estates. EY LLP's fees are reasonable given the size and complexity of the Debtors' cases.

#### **Compensation Paid and its Source**

20. The Retention Order authorizes the Debtors to compensate and reimburse EY LLP in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Bankruptcy Rules, and any other applicable order or procedure of the Court. EY LLP, submits this Second Interim and Final Application, seeking approval and allowance of compensation in the amount of \$1,206,927.89, and actual and necessary expenses in the amount of \$0.00, incurred during the interim period from November 01, 2020 through January 06, 2021.

21. All services for which compensation is requested by EY LLP were performed for or on behalf of the Debtors.

22. During the Compensation Period, EY LLP has received no payment and no promises for payment from any source other than the Debtors for services rendered or to be rendered in any capacity whatsoever in connection with matters covered by this Application. There is no agreement or understanding for the sharing of compensation to be received for services rendered in these cases.



### **Supporting Detail**

The “Compensation by Project Category” table in the cover pages to this Application summarizes the services performed by EY LLP during the Compensation Period. The total time spent by EY LLP with respect to such services for the Debtors during the Compensation Period was approximately 1917.8 hours. The blended average hourly rate with respect to such services during the Compensation Period was approximately \$606.33. The supporting detail for this Second Interim Fee Application is attached hereto as Exhibits A through B. Exhibit A contains the daily time information for each EY LLP professional performing services during the Fee Period. Exhibit B contains the details of the expenses incurred by EY LLP professionals.

23. None of the professionals included in this Second Interim and Final Fee Application varied their hourly rate based on the geographical location of the bankruptcy case.

24. In accordance with section 504 of the Bankruptcy Code and Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2016(a), no agreement or understanding exists between EY LLP and any other person for the sharing of compensation received or to be received for services rendered in or in connection with this case.

25. No agreement or understanding prohibited by 18 U.S.C. § 155 has been or will be made by EY.

WHEREFORE, EY LLP respectfully requests that the Court enter an Order

- a. Granting this Application;
- b. Awarding EY LLP, on an interim basis, compensation for professional services rendered during the Second Interim Period in the amount of \$1,206,927.89 and reimbursement of actual, reasonable, and necessary expenses incurred during the Second Interim Period in the amount of \$0.00;

- c. Awarding EY LLP, on a final basis, compensation for professional services rendered during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$7,120,122.39 (which includes compensation of \$1,206,927.89 for the Second Interim Period) and reimbursement of actual, reasonable, and necessary expenses incurred during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$0.00;
- d. Authorizing and directing Debtors to remit or cause to be remitted payment to EY LLP of the sum of \$707,583.09, representing all unpaid amounts for the Second Interim Period that have not previously been paid;
- e. Authorizing and directing Debtors to remit or cause to be remitted payment to EY LLP for any and all other fees and expenses of EY LLP incurred during the Compensation Period that have not been previously paid; and
- f. For such other and further relief as this Court deems just and proper.

Dated: March 05, 2021

Respectfully submitted,

By: /s/ Jeffrey Ficks

Jeffrey Ficks  
Ernst & Young LLP

**Exhibit A – Time Detail**

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/1/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review and verification of selected disclosure statement numbers related to unsecured claims for S. Schnorrenberg at Weil	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Coordination with Weil regarding claim objection exhibits	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) to discuss claim reconciliation and objections related to Briggs and Stratton and Briggs and Stratton Tech claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY) to discuss claim reconciliation and objections related to Briggs and Stratton and Briggs and Stratton Tech claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Hess (EY) to discuss Open AP related to rejected contracts for claims estimation purposes	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY) to discuss Open AP related to rejected contracts for claims estimation purposes	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Updates to satisfied claims exhibit	1.20	650.00	780.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C Carpenter, C Hannon (EY) re: quantum and amount of unliquidated damages claims filed	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C Carpenter, C Hannon (EY) re: quantum and amount of unliquidated damages claims filed	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss preparation of match file for KCC to incorporate into master solicitation data	0.70	650.00	455.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY) to discuss preparation of match file for KCC to incorporate into master solicitation data	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: unliquidated damages claims related to asbestos	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: unliquidated damages claims related to asbestos	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.80	470.00	376.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.80	795.00	636.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.80	795.00	636.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.80	470.00	376.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss action items for drafting initial objection exhibits	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss action items for drafting initial objection exhibits	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss action items for drafting initial objection exhibits	0.50	470.00	235.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss action items for drafting initial objection exhibits	0.50	470.00	235.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss action items for drafting initial objection exhibits	0.50	470.00	235.00
Mills, Rebecca Hinson	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Tax Issues	Analyze employment tax considerations as a result of bankruptcy	1.50	725.00	1,087.50
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/2/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's contract assumption and claim reconciliation. Participants include J. Hess(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's contract assumption and claim reconciliation. Participants include J. Hess(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss trade claims review process and action items for the day/week regarding trade claims review; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), G Giordano, T Bradley (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss trade claims review process and action items for the day/week regarding trade claims review; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), G Giordano, T Bradley (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss trade claims review process and action items for the day/week regarding trade claims review; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), G Giordano, T Bradley (EY)	0.30	795.00	238.50
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss trade claims review process and action items for the day/week regarding trade claims review; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), G Giordano, T Bradley (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in working session to discuss updates to be made to master claims register; Participants: C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	1.00	470.00	470.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in working session to discuss updates to be made to master claims register; Participants: C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	1.00	470.00	470.00
Granel, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update Estate CFF Tracker	1.40	650.00	910.00
Granel, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze executive claims filed to date	2.40	650.00	1,560.00
Granel, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze new Mercer valuations and SERP related claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/2/2020	Vendor Issues	Analyze vendor statuses within the latest cure exhibit relating to specific vendors with claims/ cure issues	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/2/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze remaining cures for contracts which were not rejected or assumed.	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/2/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze the company's latest AP in order to understand proportion of AP which was for vendors with rejected contracts.	2.10	470.00	987.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin review of fifth batch of 503(b)(9) trade claims filed against the company	1.60	470.00	752.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin review of fifth batch of unsecured trade claims filed against the company	1.70	470.00	799.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/2/2020	Tax Issues	Correspondence with A. Martin (EY) on sales and use tax "applied for" registration options	0.40	850.00	340.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/2/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review September detail for monthly application	1.20	470.00	564.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/2/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Complete draft of updated critical vendor and shippers/ warehousemen payment matrices for the month of October	1.10	470.00	517.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspondence with D Hoehne (Weil) re: unliquidated litigation damages claims	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspondence with R Zaidman (BRG) re: contract rejection damages	0.10	795.00	79.50
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Prepare slides for board presentation	2.30	795.00	1,828.50
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Email correspondence with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: payment activity from Estate accounts and excluded assets	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Financial Analysis	Participate in calls with B. Marks (HL) re: HL transaction fee estimate	0.70	795.00	556.50
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Participate in calls with B. Marks (HL) re: slides for board presentation	0.40	795.00	318.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare claim review parameters for batch of filed vendor trade claims	1.20	650.00	780.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft agenda for claims objection call with Weil	1.10	650.00	715.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft template for B&S International claim objection exhibits	0.90	650.00	585.00
Granel, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.90	650.00	585.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of filed-to-scheduled claim matches for claims agent	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/2/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare schedule of contracts with contract IDs for counsel.	0.20	470.00	94.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/2/2020	Tax Issues	Reply to R. Sevalrud (Weil) on sales and use tax registration options for NewCo to access OldCo registration accounts	0.80	850.00	680.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of selected claims for objection	0.90	650.00	585.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research status of claims filed by "specific vendor"	0.40	650.00	260.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review / divide trade claims for trade claims team for guidance to be provided to the Company for reconciliation.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Accounts Payable claims against the company to determine action to be taken on each of the claims.	1.60	470.00	752.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and updating of board slide relating to claim estimates	0.40	650.00	260.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims against B&S International to provide reasoning for objecting to each claim.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims against B&S Tech to provide reasoning for objecting to each claim.	1.30	470.00	611.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and objections to resolve specific vendor issues for debtor	0.20	745.00	149.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register and updated summary of claims	1.20	795.00	954.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims to be reconciled	1.00	795.00	795.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/2/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review draft and draft correspondence to counsel with final draft of critical vendor and shippers/ warehousemen payment matrices for the month of October	0.60	470.00	282.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Financial Analysis	Review HL transaction fee estimate and all backup detail per K. Buono (Briggs) request	2.80	795.00	2,226.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest claims register for updates to filed trade claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Review of Board slides for update meeting with BOD and verify numbers for inclusion	0.70	795.00	556.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review of cash flow activity from prior week and identification of items requiring further update	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of partially satisfied claims exhibit and associated trade agreements for multiple vendors to determine exhibit updates	1.10	795.00	874.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of voting data received from KCC	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review potential matches between filed and scheduled claims	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review preliminary list of satisfied claims to be noticed	1.30	470.00	611.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Trade Agreements for potential fully satisfied claims on satisfied claims listing.	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review unliquidated litigation claims to address questions from counsel	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/2/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review updated Disclosure Statement, recovery analysis and comments	2.20	795.00	1,749.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise list of filed-to-scheduled claim matches for claims agent	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to include reconciliation updates received	1.10	470.00	517.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update company's trade claims tracking file to include claim review parameters for batch of claims	1.50	650.00	975.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, S. Hofner (EY) to prepare for claims objection call with Weil and discuss open claim items	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, S. Hofner (EY) to prepare for claims objection call with Weil and discuss open claim items	0.50	470.00	235.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: employee SERP claims and Mercer analysis	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: employee SERP claims and Mercer analysis	0.80	795.00	636.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: disclosure statement claim amount edits	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: disclosure statement claim amount edits	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: employee SERP claims and Mercer analysis	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: employee SERP claims and Mercer analysis	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY), B. Marks (HL) re: employee SERP claims	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY), B. Marks (HL) re: employee SERP claims	0.20	795.00	159.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) re: agenda for call with Weil regarding objection exhibits	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) re: agenda for call with Weil regarding objection exhibits	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Calls with R Zaidman (BRG) and C Hannon (EY) re: employee SERP claims and Mercer analysis and litigation claims	0.40	795.00	318.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss claims review process and preparation for call with client. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss claims review process and preparation for call with client. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.20	795.00	159.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's contract assumption and claim reconciliation. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Vendor Issues	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's contract assumption and claim reconciliation. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	745.00	223.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Financial Analysis	Participate in call with K. Buono (Briggs), J. Ficks, J. Henrich (EY) re: HL fee estimate	0.20	795.00	159.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/3/2020	Financial Analysis	Participate in call with K. Buono (Briggs), J. Ficks, J. Henrich (EY) re: HL fee estimate	0.20	940.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil to discuss priority of claims objections and action items on claims objections; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	1.10	650.00	715.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil to discuss priority of claims objections and action items on claims objections; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	1.10	650.00	715.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil to discuss priority of claims objections and action items on claims objections; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	1.10	470.00	517.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil to discuss priority of claims objections and action items on claims objections; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	1.10	470.00	517.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil to discuss priority of claims objections and action items on claims objections; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	1.10	795.00	874.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/3/2020	Tax Issues	Additional correspondence exchange with F. Brandtitz (EY) on employment tax deferral for claims estimate	0.30	850.00	255.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze employment tax considerations for Bankruptcy and data list required to make certain decisions	0.90	650.00	585.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze new Mercer valuations and SERP related claims	1.30	650.00	845.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Analyze objection of certain insurers to the disclosure statement for the joint Chapter 11 plan	1.40	470.00	658.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Analyze objection of United States Trustee to the disclosure statement for the joint Chapter 11 plan	1.20	470.00	564.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Attend Board of Directors meeting	0.70	795.00	556.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/3/2020	Financial Analysis	Begin analysis of reorganization gains as they relate to cure payments for the month of October	1.10	470.00	517.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Begin to update cure payment analysis file to include latest payment data received from company with cure payments through 11/2	1.40	470.00	658.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review of fifth batch of 503(b)(9) trade claims filed against the company	1.20	470.00	564.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review of fifth batch of unsecured trade claims filed against the company	1.30	470.00	611.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Edit liquidation analysis to align with change to recovery analysis	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Incorporate additional tax claims received from KCC related to B&S International into claims register	0.50	650.00	325.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Participate in call with S. Schnorrenberg (Weil) re: change to Disclosure Statement	0.10	795.00	79.50
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare claims listing related to B&S Tech and B&S International claims to separate into various claim exhibits for objection	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft exhibits related to Equity and Bondholder Claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft exhibits related to Wrong Debtor Claims, Non-Debtor Claims, Multi-Debtor Claims, Amended Claims, and No Liability Claims	2.40	650.00	1,560.00
Porepa, Jodi	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call with Weil to discuss priorities	1.00	795.00	795.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for claims call with counsel to discuss claim objection exhibits and related timing	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of next steps on claims process following call with counsel	0.90	470.00	423.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare response to M. Rodriguez(B&S) regarding several vendor trade claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepared analysis of all cure amounts for all contracts and their related dispositions depending on whether the contract was assumed, rejected or otherwise positioned.	2.80	470.00	1,316.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/3/2020	Tax Issues	Reply to S. Rugg (Briggs) inquiry regarding IRS claim notice and provide guidance on response	1.30	850.00	1,105.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research and download of sample objection exhibit formats to prepare claim exhibit drafts for review by counsel	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research specific MSC contract per request from S. Tajuddin.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/3/2020	Vendor Issues	Research Toyota vendors to facilitate with claims reconciliation.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Accounts Payable claims against the company to determine action to be taken on each of the claims.	1.80	470.00	846.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and summarize US Trustee's objection to Plan and insurer's objection to Plan	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review certain legal paid invoices for payment date and prepare proposal for invoices to be refunded to B&S.	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review certain vendor's filed claim and contracts to be assumed by company.	0.40	650.00	260.00
Tajuddin, Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and objections to resolve specific vendor issues for debtor	0.70	745.00	521.50
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims classified as allowed to determine if claims are correctly classified as complete & allowed.	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims filed against Briggs & Stratton International, Inc. to be included in objection exhibits	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims filed against Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC to be included in objection exhibits	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims with large variances to the company's books and records to determine if should be sent to company for reconciliation.	1.90	470.00	893.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims with small variances to the company's books and records to determine if claim is correctly classified or should be sent to company.	1.70	470.00	799.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft claim objection exhibits for Briggs & Stratton International, Inc.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft claim objection exhibits for Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC	0.80	470.00	376.00
Porepa, Jodi	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft exhibits for upcoming motion	0.90	795.00	715.50
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/3/2020	Tax Issues	Review employment tax deferral info from C. Wojtak (Briggs) and reply with request for exact pre and post-petition split	0.50	850.00	425.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Review full board presentation from Weil	0.70	795.00	556.50
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest master claims register to be discussed on internal call	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review list of filed-to-scheduled claims to be shared with the claims agent	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review list of open-items related to claims process for discussion with counsel	0.30	470.00	141.00



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims dashboard	1.10	795.00	874.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review updated draft of Disclosure Statement and provide comments to Weil	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review updated draft of Plan and provide comments to Weil	1.20	795.00	954.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/3/2020	Tax issues	Review Wisconsin state unemployment notice received from C. Wojtak (Briggs) and reply	0.40	850.00	340.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Update cure payment analysis file to include additional comments received from K. Lemke (company) and A. Golvach (company) on latest circulated version	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register for claims sent to the company for review with date sent to the company.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master registry for comments and decisions related to employee claims	2.30	650.00	1,495.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update exhibits related to satisfied and partially satisfied scheduled claims to circulate to counsel for review	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss trade claims updates for the master claims register; Participants: C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss trade claims updates for the master claims register; Participants: C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter and J. Granell (EY) to discuss updates to employee claim estimates, including SERP and severance claims	0.30	470.00	141.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter and J. Granell (EY) to discuss updates to employee claim estimates, including SERP and severance claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss cure amendments and related payments with respect to claim objections	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss cure amendments and related payments with respect to claim objections	0.30	470.00	141.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J. Porepa and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss open cure amounts associated with assumed contracts and payments made for claims reconciliation process	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Porepa and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss open cure amounts associated with assumed contracts and payments made to date for claims reconciliation process	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Porepa and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss open items related to draft claim objection exhibits	0.50	650.00	325.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J. Porepa and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss open items related to draft claim objection exhibits.	0.50	795.00	397.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review, satisfied claim exhibits, and initial objection exhibits	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review, satisfied claim exhibits, and initial objection exhibits	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review, satisfied claim exhibits, and initial objection exhibits	0.80	795.00	636.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review, satisfied claim exhibits, and initial objection exhibits	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review, satisfied claim exhibits, and initial objection exhibits	0.80	650.00	520.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review, satisfied claim exhibits, and initial objection exhibits	0.80	470.00	376.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review, satisfied claim exhibits, and initial objection exhibits	0.80	650.00	520.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Porepa (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), G. Giordano (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims review, satisfied claim exhibits, and initial objection exhibits	0.80	795.00	636.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Participate in call to discuss ordinary course professional payments reporting and legal payments. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss ordinary course professional payments reporting and legal payments. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.10	795.00	79.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/4/2020	Meetings with management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Porepa, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: update on case matters and next steps	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Meetings with management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Porepa, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: update on case matters and next steps	0.50	795.00	397.50
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Porepa, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: update on case matters and next steps	0.50	795.00	397.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Porepa, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: update on case matters and next steps	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/4/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Porepa, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) regarding update on case matters and next steps	0.50	650.00	325.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/4/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Porepa, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) regarding update on case matters and next steps	0.50	940.00	470.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in calls to discuss certain vendor claim and cure amendment. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in calls to discuss certain vendor claim and cure amendment. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	795.00	238.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/4/2020	Cash Monitoring	Working call with C Hannon, J Granell (EY) to update forecast cash utilization at Estate and discuss Remaining Estate Assets	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Cash Monitoring	Working call with C Hannon, J Granell (EY) to update forecast cash utilization at Estate and discuss Remaining Estate Assets	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Adjust summary report of all cures in cure analysis	0.70	470.00	329.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/4/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze listing of remaining assets prior to weekly update call with Briggs and Weil	0.40	650.00	260.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze responses from Weil regarding treatment of SERP related claims	0.20	650.00	130.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin review of sixth batch of 503(b)(9) claims filed against the company	1.20	470.00	564.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin review of sixth batch of unsecured trade claims filed against the company	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/4/2020	Vendor Issues	Prepare summary report of all cures in cure analysis.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/4/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Rugg (Briggs) regarding Request For Prompt Refund letter and transition services agreement provision on property tax	0.40	850.00	340.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/4/2020	Financial Analysis	Complete draft analysis of reorganization gains as they relate to cure payments for the month of October	0.90	470.00	423.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft correspondence responding to questions relating to October Critical Vendor/ Shippers payment matrices	1.00	470.00	470.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Draft correspondence to company financial team regarding cure payment data that did not match the latest cure exhibit	1.30	470.00	611.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/4/2020	Tax issues	Draft Request For Prompt Refund tax return cover letter per S. Rugg (Briggs) request	1.10	850.00	935.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Tax issues	Finalize estimate of sales tax imposed on asset sale	1.70	725.00	1,232.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Finalize Liquidation Analysis	2.30	795.00	1,828.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Finalize update to draft cure payment analysis file to include cure payment information received from the company for payment through 11/2	1.70	470.00	799.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/4/2020	Tax Issues	Follow-up email to S. Rugg (Briggs) on pre-petition property tax responsibility of OldCo vs NewCo for financial statement purposes	0.60	850.00	510.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/4/2020	Vendor Issues	Incorporate payment data into cure analysis.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare revised summary of claims to be discussed with the Company	1.30	470.00	611.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Meetings with management	Prepare update on numerous case workstreams for discussion with K. Buono (Briggs)	0.90	795.00	715.50
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Accounts Payable claims against the company to determine action to be taken on each of the claims.	2.10	470.00	987.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review additional claims provided by KCC on 10/28	1.30	470.00	611.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review batch of filed trade claims to assign claim review parameters to company	1.40	650.00	910.00
Tajuddin, Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and objections to resolve specific vendor issues for debtor	0.20	745.00	149.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims classified as "no liability" objections to determine if these claims should be classified as satisfied / cured claims.	1.10	470.00	517.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims classified as "reclassified" to determine if claims / claim amounts are correctly classified.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Porepa, Jodi	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims to be reconciled	0.70	795.00	556.50
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims to be sent to company to provide direction for each of the filed claims to be reviewed/confirmed with the company.	1.70	470.00	799.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review client's communication re: "specific vendor" claim and stipulation	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review communication from company regarding certain vendor claim and contract assumption status	0.70	650.00	455.00
Porepa, Jodi	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review cure amount summary	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review Estate bank account transaction activity to identify amounts owed to/from Newco under TSA; correspond with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: queries on transactions and update due to/due from analysis for discussion with company	2.80	795.00	2,226.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest claims register for updates to filed trade claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review objection to Plan filed by SEC	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of contract and cure files to assist in claims reconciliation process	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of cure amendments to identify satisfied claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Mitchell, Traci R.	Executive Director	11/4/2020	Tax issues	Review question from Weil on transfer taxes. Reach out to RETT team on state by state responsibility, email to N. Flagg (EY) with suggested approach.	1.10	850.00	935.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review SAP's filed claim and cure payment history to assist in company's claim reconciliation	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review trade claim estimates as of 11/3 in the master claims register	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated claims register analysis and draft email to K Buono (Briggs) and Weil re: one specific litigation settlement claim	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review updated draft of Disclosure Statement and provide comments to Weil	1.20	795.00	954.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise court claim numbers in master claims register	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise employee claim estimates as of 11/3 in the master claims register	1.20	470.00	564.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/4/2020	Tax Issues	Transfer tax updates and guidance to Briggs and EY teams	0.70	850.00	595.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update calendar / milestones document to include additional/updated court related deadlines / process timeline to be distributed among stakeholders.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/4/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update post sale unwind receipts and disbursements for week ending 10.16	1.30	650.00	845.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Updated decision criteria matrix related to employee claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Updates to claim objection exhibits for B&S International and B&S Tech debtors to forward for review	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update to satisfied and partially satisfied claims exhibit to circulate for review	1.10	650.00	715.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with P Dreschler, ML Compy (Briggs) C Hannon, J Silverwood, G Giordano (EY) re: specific vendor claims reconciliation issue and follow up	0.20	470.00	94.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with P Dreschler, ML Compy (Briggs) C Hannon, J Silverwood, G Giordano (EY) re: specific vendor claims reconciliation issue and follow up	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with P Dreschler, ML Compy (Briggs) C Hannon, J Silverwood, G Giordano (EY) re: specific vendor claims reconciliation issue and follow up	0.20	795.00	159.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss scheduled claim for specified trade vendor; Participants: C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss scheduled claim for specified trade vendor; Participants: C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss selected scheduled claim items related to Notice of Satisfied Claims Exhibit; Participants: C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss selected scheduled claim items related to Notice of Satisfied Claims Exhibit; Participants: C Carpenter (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, T. Bradley and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss selected scheduled claim items related to Notice of Satisfied Claims Exhibit	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, T. Bradley and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss selected scheduled claim items related to Notice of Satisfied Claims Exhibit	0.30	470.00	141.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, T. Bradley and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss selected scheduled claim items related to Notice of Satisfied Claims Exhibit	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with M Martir (Weil) and C Hannon (EY) re: specific vendor cure agreement and potential GUC remaining	0.20	795.00	159.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's contract assumption status and claim. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's contract assumption status and claim. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.20	795.00	159.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's cure and claim. Participants include J. Hess(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's cure and claim. Participants include J. Hess(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/5/2020	Vendor Issues	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's cure and claim. Participants include J. Hess(EY), J. Silverwood(EY), S. Tajuddin(EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Tajuddin, Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Vendor Issues	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's cure and claim. Participants include J. Hess(EY), J. Silverwood(EY), S. Tajuddin(EY)	0.30	745.00	223.50
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/5/2020	Vendor Issues	Participate in call to discuss select vendor's cure and claim. Participants include J. Hess(EY), J. Silverwood(EY), S. Tajuddin(EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of reviewed claims. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), G. Giordano(EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of reviewed claims. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), G. Giordano(EY)	0.10	470.00	47.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with P. Prickett (Briggs), T. Roth, L. Richards, D. Hoehne (Weil), C. Hannon, J.Porepa, J Granell (EY) re: employee related claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with P. Prickett (Briggs), T. Roth, L. Richards, D. Hoehne (Weil), C. Hannon, J.Porepa, J Granell (EY) re: employee related claims	0.60	795.00	477.00
Porepa, Jodi	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with P. Prickett (Briggs), T. Roth, L. Richards, D. Hoehne (Weil), C. Hannon, J.Porepa, J Granell (EY) re: employee related claims	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil and Houlihan Lokey to discuss issues / action items on claims review process; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), J Henrich (EY) C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil and Houlihan Lokey to discuss issues / action items on claims review process; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), J Henrich (EY) C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil and Houlihan Lokey to discuss issues / action items on claims review process; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), J Henrich (EY) C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil and Houlihan Lokey to discuss issues / action items on claims review process; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), J Henrich (EY) C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil and Houlihan Lokey to discuss issues / action items on claims review process; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), J Henrich (EY) C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.60	795.00	477.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil and Houlihan Lokey to discuss issues / action items on claims review process; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), J Henrich (EY) C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.60	795.00	477.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil and Houlihan Lokey to discuss issues / action items on claims review process; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), J Henrich (EY) C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Weil and Houlihan Lokey to discuss issues / action items on claims review process; EY Participants: J Porepa (EY), J Henrich (EY) C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.60	795.00	477.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze employee claims provided by KCC on 10/28	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze master registry for new employee claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between filed claims provided by KCC on 10/28 and scheduled claims	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze remaining claims provided by KCC on 10/28	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze trade claims provided by KCC on 10/28	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze variances between scheduled and filed claim population for updates to the Notice of Satisfied Claims Exhibit	0.60	470.00	282.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin to update litigation claims summary for latest received litigation claims and additional information as filed on the docket	1.20	470.00	564.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin updating company file of designated claims to clarify review status and review focus for company reviewers	2.80	470.00	1,316.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/5/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with C. Luster, M. Martir (Weil) to discuss HR related contracts	0.60	650.00	390.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review of sixth batch of 503(b)(9) claims filed against the company	1.50	470.00	705.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review of sixth batch of unsecured trade claims filed against the company	1.60	470.00	752.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Continue to review time detail in September monthly fee statement to ensure compliance with guidelines	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Cash Monitoring	Correspond with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: queries on Estate/LLC bank transactions and update due to/due from analysis	1.10	795.00	874.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Cash Monitoring	Correspond with K Buono (Briggs) re: IP registration costs and budget	0.10	795.00	79.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/5/2020	Tax Issues	Draft combined Request For Prompt Determination and Request For Prompt Refund tax return cover letter and send to Briggs S. Rugg with single Request For Prompt Refund letter	1.40	850.00	1,190.00
Kim,Dale Young	Partner/Principal	11/5/2020	Tax issues	Draft email with analysis to Weil regarding transfer tax analysis	0.50	900.00	450.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Tax issues	Draft email to Weil with analysis re: transfer tax analysis	0.90	725.00	652.50
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/5/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	October Fee App Preparation	2.70	470.00	1,269.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with J. Hersbeck (Briggs) to discuss claims review process	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft agenda/list of open items for claims call with Weil	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/5/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Prepare draft template for OCP exhibit filing.	1.10	650.00	715.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call to discuss employee related claims with Briggs and Weil	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/5/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare for call to discuss HR related contracts	0.40	650.00	260.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call with Weil to discuss priorities	1.20	795.00	954.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare guidance to address vendors 503b9 motion	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare updated objection exhibits for B&S Tech and B&S International claims and research of related multi-debtor claims	1.70	650.00	1,105.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/5/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepared list of contracts for "specific vendor" to facilitate with addressing the vendors response relating to the cure notice.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of payments to selected creditors for incorporation in partially and fully satisfied claim objection exhibits	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of selected claims for potential objection	0.70	650.00	455.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Accounts Payable claims against the company to determine action to be taken on each of the claims.	1.60	470.00	752.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and objections to resolve specific vendor issues for debtor	0.50	745.00	372.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review communications related to vendors pending administrative expense motion	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's claims tracking file for status of company reviewed claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/5/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review company's payment history to identify payments to ordinary course professionals.	1.90	650.00	1,235.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review court docket for claims related filings	0.20	650.00	130.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft exhibits for upcoming motion	0.30	795.00	238.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft Fully Satisfied Claims Exhibit in advance of filing	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft Partially Satisfied Claims Exhibit in advance of filing	0.80	470.00	376.00
Mitchell,Traci R.	Executive Director	11/5/2020	Tax Issues	Review emails related to Weil question on transfer taxes, evaluate imposition of tax, review sales tax spreadsheet.	0.80	850.00	680.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review filed claims amended by additional claims provided by KCC on 10/28	0.60	470.00	282.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/5/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review filing requirements of Ordinary Course Professionals motion.	0.50	650.00	325.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest AP data for specific vendors vs. scheduled claim amounts to determine remaining amounts to be satisfied for specific vendors.	1.20	470.00	564.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest claims file summary tabs for accurate and efficient representation of data	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/5/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review objections to the Disclosure statement	1.40	650.00	910.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review time detail in September monthly fee statement to ensure compliance with guidelines	2.80	795.00	2,226.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated claims dashboard	1.50	795.00	1,192.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/5/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review updated draft of Disclosure Statement	1.90	795.00	1,510.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to include additional claims provided by KCC on 10/28	0.70	470.00	329.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/5/2020	Tax Issues	Send IRS Publication 908 on Bankruptcy to Briggs S. Rugg to reference IRS rules for Request For Prompt Determination and Request for Prompt Refund	0.40	850.00	340.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update calendar / milestones document to include additional/updated court related deadlines / process timeline to be distributed among stakeholders.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with comments from reviewers regarding specific claims sent by other team members.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/5/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Updates to satisfied claims exhibit	0.90	650.00	585.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: schedule of SERP filed claims vs. Mercer analysis required for UCC	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: schedule of SERP filed claims vs. Mercer analysis required for UCC	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) re: Weil query on partially satisfied claims exhibit	0.10	650.00	65.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) re: Weil query on partially satisfied claims exhibit	0.10	795.00	79.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.60	650.00	390.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.60	470.00	282.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.60	795.00	477.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with T Bradley, C Hannon (EY) to reconcile partially satisfied trade agreements to partially satisfied claims exhibit	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with T Bradley, C Hannon (EY) to reconcile partially satisfied trade agreements to partially satisfied claims exhibit	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss meeting agenda for call with Weil. Participants include J. Silverwood (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss meeting agenda for call with Weil. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), S. Hofner(EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss payment history to specific vendor (FR Georgia). Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), S. Tajuddin(EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/6/2020	Vendor Issues	Participate in call to discuss payment history to specific vendor (FR Georgia). Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), S. Tajuddin(EY)	0.20	745.00	149.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss progress of claims review. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), T. Bradley(EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss progress of claims review. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), T. Bradley(EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze preliminary voting data from KCC to identify updates needed	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze updated employee claims made as at 11/6/2020	1.50	650.00	975.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/6/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Continue to review time detail in September monthly fee statement to ensure compliance with guidelines	1.70	795.00	1,351.50
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/6/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Continue to review October detail for the monthly application	2.90	470.00	1,363.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Coordination with counsel regarding updates to satisfied claim exhibits	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/6/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Correspondence with counsel regarding go-forward status of contract assumptions.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Finalize updated exhibits	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/6/2020	Vendor Issues	Additional updates to cure notice per request from counsel.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/6/2020	Vendor Issues	Call with C. Luster (Weil) to discuss process for final cure notice.	0.60	470.00	282.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare and distribute instructions for team member to assist in claims review.	0.20	650.00	130.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call to discuss status of claims review and initial objection exhibits	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare revised exhibit of fully satisfied scheduled claims	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare revised exhibit of partially satisfied scheduled claims	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare revised list of scheduled-to-filed claim matches for KCC	1.10	470.00	517.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare schedule to compare Mercer valuation with proof of claim received in order to provide to Briggs and Weil	2.20	650.00	1,430.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Remove claims with small variances from the Company's creditor claim reconciliation google sheet tracker.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/6/2020	Tax issues	Reply to C. Meilhan (Briggs) on sales and use tax refund process for OldCo	0.70	850.00	595.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/6/2020	Tax Issues	Reply to P. Prickett (Briggs) on estimated pre-petition and Administrative employment tax claims	0.60	850.00	510.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of claims for objection	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and categorization of new claims received for incorporation in claims register	2.80	650.00	1,820.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/6/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and objections to resolve specific vendor issues for debtor	0.60	745.00	447.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims vs. scheduled claims to match creditors in claims register to scheduled claims listing.	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review count of total filed claims for inclusion in motion to notice satisfied scheduled claims	0.80	470.00	376.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review court docket and agenda for November 9th hearing	0.10	650.00	65.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review detailed schedule of SERP filed claims vs. Mercer analysis required for UCC and draft email	0.60	795.00	477.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft voting class spreadsheet provided by KCC for solicitation process	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of claims register to determine voting status	1.10	650.00	715.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of solicitation procedures for discussion with KCC to coordinate voting materials	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review several communications relating to vendor claim reconciliations and motions to accelerate 503b9 payments to certain vendors. Review vendor payment history and prepare schedule of vendor payments.	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review specific vendor claims. Draft communication of claim issues observed for Weil. Schedule meeting with Weil to discuss specific claims related issues and questions.	1.80	650.00	1,170.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated exhibit for partially and fully satisfied claims	1.10	795.00	874.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review vendor-specific claims to support reconciliation of 503(b)(9) amounts owed	0.70	470.00	329.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/6/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Revise and update exhibit for Ordinary Course Professional filing	1.00	650.00	650.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/6/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K. Lemke regarding go-forward approach for contract assumption.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update the Company's creditor claim reconciliation google sheet tracker with additional claims to be reconciled by the Company.	1.60	470.00	752.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update the Company's creditor claim reconciliation google sheet tracker with direction for 50 claims to be reconciled by the Company.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/6/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Updates to draft satisfied and partially satisfied claim exhibits to circulate for review	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review internal communication about new filed claims and prepare response regarding deadline.	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete categorization of new claims for incorporation in claims register	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter (EY) to review and discuss open items related to additional claims and voting data received from KCC to facilitate solicitation process	1.20	650.00	780.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY) to review and discuss open items related to additional claims and voting data received from KCC to facilitate solicitation process	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of voting data received; comparison to claims register and scheduled claim data to verify voting amounts above \$3M	2.10	650.00	1,365.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of voting data received; comparison to claims register and scheduled claim data to verify voting amounts between \$300k to \$3M	2.40	650.00	1,560.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of voting data received and compared to claims register and scheduled data to verify voting amounts between \$100k to \$300k	2.30	650.00	1,495.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze new claims provided by KCC for incorporation in master claims register	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between filed claims provided by KCC on 11/6 and scheduled claims	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze filed claims amended by claims provided on 11/6	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise court claim numbers in master claims register to include updates from KCC	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze sub-claims created by KCC for matching purposes	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.80	470.00	376.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.80	650.00	520.00



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.80	470.00	376.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner, C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss status of claims notices and objections	0.80	795.00	636.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss additional review of voting data received from KCC for solicitation process	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY) to discuss additional review of voting data received from KCC for solicitation process	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and A. Nguyen (KCC) to discuss initial feedback on voting data and next steps for solicitation process	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and A. Nguyen (KCC) to discuss initial feedback on voting data and next steps for solicitation process	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and A. Nguyen (KCC) to discuss initial feedback on voting data and next steps for solicitation process	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss review of KCC's voting data for solicitation process	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), T. Bradley (EY), and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss review of KCC's voting data for solicitation process	0.50	470.00	235.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss review of claims. Participants include T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.50	650.00	325.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss review of claims. Participants include T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.50	470.00	235.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss review of Client's reconciliation of AP claims to date; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss review of Client's reconciliation of AP claims to date; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss review of Client's reconciliation of AP claims to date; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze Briggs responses to the 2nd Batch of employee related claims	1.30	650.00	845.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/9/2020	Financial Analysis	Analyze certain vendors within scheduled claims for intercompany status and remove those identified as intercompany invoices	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update Estate cash flow tracker	1.10	650.00	715.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/9/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze HR related contracts in order to respond to Weil's inquiries	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze specified scheduled claims associated with intercompany liabilities	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze updated claims register to identify recently filed trade claims	0.70	650.00	455.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze vendor-specific claims to support ongoing 503(b)(9) reconciliations	1.30	470.00	611.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze voting amounts worksheet	0.40	650.00	260.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/9/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) court hearing for Disclosure Statement	0.90	795.00	715.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/9/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) court hearing for Disclosure Statement	0.90	795.00	715.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin review of batch of trade claims reviewed by company	1.50	650.00	975.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/9/2020	Tax Issues	Call with N. Flagg, M. Weden, B. Ressler (EY) to discuss state-specific requirements for customer refund requests for purposes of providing Weil tax team with background information required to discuss OldCo responsibility for issuing such refunds in states with a vendor-direct refund requirement.	0.30	850.00	255.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Weden,Marcus L.	Senior Manager	11/9/2020	Tax Issues	Call with N. Flagg, M. Weden, B. Ressler (EY) to discuss state-specific requirements for customer refund requests for purposes of providing Weil tax team with background information required to discuss OldCo responsibility for issuing such refunds in states with a vendor-direct refund requirement.	0.30	725.00	217.50
Ressler,Brad G.	Partner/Principal	11/9/2020	Tax Issues	Call with N. Flagg, M. Weden, B. Ressler (EY) to discuss state-specific requirements for customer refund requests for purposes of providing Weil tax team with background information required to discuss OldCo responsibility for issuing such refunds in states with a vendor-direct refund requirement.	0.30	900.00	270.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/9/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with P. Prickett (Briggs) to discuss HR Related Contracts in order to determine whether to retain existing contracts in place	0.30	650.00	195.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete update to draft litigation claims summary for latest received litigation claims and additional information as filed on the docket	1.00	470.00	470.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Consolidate creditor ID with aggregated claim ID created by KCC to match aggregated claims with claims in claim register.	1.30	470.00	611.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Continue review of master voting file to update selected voting amounts	1.70	650.00	1,105.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspond with Client contacts to gather information on vendor matches between claims register and scheduled claims.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/9/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Draft correspondence and circulate latest cure payment analysis file to members of the team	0.40	470.00	188.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Identify claims in KCC voting register that are not included in Claims Register and are classified as Scheduled Only Claims.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Identify claims in KCC voting register that do not match claims in filed claims register to identify claims to review.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Identify claims in KCC voting register that may have been cured or paid through a trade agreement thus eliminating their vote.	1.10	470.00	517.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare open items for claims call with Weil to discuss claim objections	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare updates to voting amounts to send to A. Nguyen (KCC) for incorporation into master ballot file	1.10	650.00	715.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/9/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Prepare communication with guidance for client to complete Ordinary Course Professional schedule.	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft correspondence for KCC regarding claim register and voting updates	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/9/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare for call with P. Prickett (Briggs) re: HR Related Contracts	0.40	650.00	260.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/9/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Prepare for Court Hearing in case called upon for Liquidation Analysis	0.80	795.00	636.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of additional filed-to-scheduled claim matches for KCC	1.30	470.00	611.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of fully and partially satisfied claims for KCC to incorporate in voting list	0.90	470.00	423.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of trade claims reviewed to date	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research claim filed by vendor Pieper electric and distribute claim to client	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to selected claims to update register and master voting spreadsheet	1.90	650.00	1,235.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Briggs Voting Amount Spreadsheet provided by KCC to reconcile KCC voting records to claims register records.	1.10	470.00	517.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/9/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.60	745.00	447.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's claims tracking file to ensure claims guidance parameters are accurate	1.10	650.00	715.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review Estate bank account transaction activity to identify amounts owed to/from Newco under TSA;	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review KCC voting register that do not match claims in filed claims register to identify potential issues with unaccounted for voting records.	1.80	470.00	846.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of motion regarding satisfied scheduled claims and partially satisfied claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of selected claims to verify voting amounts against KCC data	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review post-petition admin claims provided by KCC on 11/6	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review proposed voting amount updates for KCC	0.80	470.00	376.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	1.70	470.00	799.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review scheduled claims to be excluded from voting class	0.90	470.00	423.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated claims register for accuracy and incorporation of latest received claims	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/9/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review updated draft of fee app for amendments	1.10	795.00	874.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updates to the master claims register to support solicitation process	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to include additional claims provided by KCC on 11/6	1.40	470.00	658.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/9/2020	Tax Issues	Send A. Arikat (Weil) information on customer sales and use tax refund requests and request call time with Weil team to discuss	0.70	850.00	595.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update cash flow tracker receipts and disbursements for week ending 10.16	1.40	650.00	910.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/9/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Update cure payment analysis file for comments received from company relating to data questions previously presented	1.10	470.00	517.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update draft litigation claims summary for additional comments received from counsel	0.80	470.00	376.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Draft action items for AP reconciliations that need additional information / need to be corrected by B&S.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss creditor-specific comments for updates to KCC's voting data; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY) and T. Bradley (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss creditor-specific comments for updates to KCC's voting data; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY) and T. Bradley (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss review of KCC's voting data and next steps; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), and T. Bradley (EY)	1.50	650.00	975.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss review of KCC's voting data and next steps; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), and T. Bradley (EY)	1.50	470.00	705.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss review of KCC's voting data and next steps; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), and T. Bradley (EY)	1.50	470.00	705.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) to discuss select trade payable claims and related stipulations for discussion with Weil	0.10	650.00	65.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner(EY) to discuss select trade payable claims and related stipulations for discussion with Weil	0.10	650.00	65.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood(EY) and G. Giordano(EY) to discuss status of claims reviewed by the company for next steps	0.40	650.00	260.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood(EY) and G. Giordano(EY) to discuss status of claims reviewed by the company for next steps	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call with N Flagg, A Risman, C Hannon (EY) re: sales tax refund requests from customers and potential implications for Estate and Newco	0.40	795.00	318.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call with N Flagg, A Risman, C Hannon (EY) re: sales tax refund requests from customers and potential implications for Estate and Newco	0.40	850.00	340.00
Risman,Alexander Harrison	Senior	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call with N Flagg, A Risman, C Hannon (EY) re: sales tax refund requests from customers and potential implications for Estate and Newco	0.40	475.00	190.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), D. Hoehne (Weil), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil) to discuss initial claim objection exhibits and voting items	0.70	650.00	455.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), D. Hoehne (Weil), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil) to discuss initial claim objection exhibits and voting items	0.70	650.00	455.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), D. Hoehne (Weil), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil) to discuss initial claim objection exhibits and voting items	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), D. Hoehne (Weil), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil) to discuss initial claim objection exhibits and voting items	0.70	470.00	329.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), D. Hoehne (Weil), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil) to discuss initial claim objection exhibits and voting items	0.70	795.00	556.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), D. Hoehne (Weil), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil) to discuss initial claim objection exhibits and voting items	0.70	795.00	556.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), D. Hoehne (Weil), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil) to discuss initial claim objection exhibits and voting items	0.70	470.00	329.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), D. Hoehne (Weil), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil) to discuss initial claim objection exhibits and voting items	0.70	650.00	455.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Participate in call with S Rugg, C Meilahn (Briggs), L Kutilek, D Hoehne, A Arikat, H Guthrie (Weil), N Flagg, C Hannon, J Henrich, M Weden, K Gatt, A Risman (EY) re: treatment of sales & use tax refunds from customers for legacy Estate sales and process for property tax payments	0.80	795.00	636.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Participate in call with S Rugg, C Meilahn (Briggs), L Kutilek, D Hoehne, A Arikat, H Guthrie (Weil), N Flagg, C Hannon, J Henrich, M Weden, K Gatt, A Risman (EY) re: treatment of sales & use tax refunds from customers for legacy Estate sales and process for property tax payments	0.80	795.00	636.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Participate in call with S Rugg, C Meilahn (Briggs), L Kutilek, D Hoehne, A Arikat, H Guthrie (Weil), N Flagg, C Hannon, J Henrich, M Weden, K Gatt, A. Rlsman (EY) re: treatment of sales & use tax refunds from customers for legacy Estate sales and process for property tax payments	0.80	850.00	680.00
Risman,Alexander Harrison	Senior	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Participate in call with S Rugg, C Meilahn (Briggs), L Kutilek, D Hoehne, A Arikat, H Guthrie (Weil), N Flagg, C Hannon, J Henrich, M Weden, K Gatt, A. Risman (EY) re: treatment of sales & use tax refunds from customers for legacy Estate sales and process for property tax payments	0.80	475.00	380.00
Weden,Marcus L.	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Participate in call with S Rugg, C Meilahn (Briggs), L Kutilek, D Hoehne, A Arikat, H Guthrie (Weil), N Flagg, C Hannon, J Henrich, M Weden, K Gatt, A Risman (EY) re: treatment of sales & use tax refunds from customers for legacy Estate sales and process for property tax payments	0.80	725.00	580.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Participate in call with S Rugg, C Meilahn (Briggs), L Kutilek, D Hoehne, A Arikat, H Guthrie (Weil), N Flagg, C Hannon, J Henrich, M Weden, K Gatt, A.Risman (EY) re: treatment of sales & use tax refunds from customers for legacy Estate sales and process for property tax payments	0.80	725.00	580.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Working call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: schedule of voting claims and impact of Objections on vote, and re: HR contracts to retain	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Working call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: schedule of voting claims and impact of Objections on vote, and re: HR contracts to retain	0.80	795.00	636.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze Briggs responses to the 2nd Batch of employee related claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze draft voting amounts for filed vendor claims in KCC's voting list	0.70	470.00	329.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze due to and due from amounts between LLC and the Estate	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze KCC's scheduled-only claims population	0.60	470.00	282.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze large, contested claim filed by specific vendor for the company in order to work towards a resolution and communicate the need to the company	1.30	470.00	611.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze latest batch of trade and 503(b)(9) claims and allocate the claims accordingly to the review team based on availability	0.60	470.00	282.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze master registry for new employee claims	1.30	650.00	845.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze preliminary decisions to Object to employee related claims in order to determine any necessary changes to voting spreadsheet	0.90	650.00	585.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze scheduled intercompany claims to be excluded from voting	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze variances between master claims register scheduled only claim amounts and scheduled-only voting amounts in KCC's draft voting list	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze vendor-specific scheduled-to-filed claim matches to address question from KCC	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze voting amounts for scheduled-only claims	0.60	470.00	282.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call from S. Rugg (Briggs) to discuss IRS questionnaire and discuss property tax payment process question	0.40	850.00	340.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss intercompany scheduled claims to be excluded from voting; EY participants: C. Carpenter, C. Hannon (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss intercompany scheduled claims to be excluded from voting; EY participants: C. Carpenter, C. Hannon (EY)	0.20	795.00	159.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review of subsequent batch of 503(b)(9) claims filed against the company	2.30	470.00	1,081.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review of subsequent batch of unsecured trade claims filed against the company	2.60	470.00	1,222.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/10/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Correspond with J. Granell (EY) regarding contracts for specific vendor.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/10/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft correspondence to company and internal contacts requesting necessary information for the October MOR	0.90	470.00	423.00
Gatt, Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY).	0.30	725.00	217.50
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY).	0.30	850.00	255.00
Sobers, Lindsay	Staff	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY).	0.30	300.00	90.00
Risman, Alexander Harrison	Senior	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY).	0.30	475.00	142.50
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Incorporate team members' review of unmatched claims between voting register and claims register into master file to be sent to KCC for review.	1.30	470.00	611.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/10/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Participate in call with G. Gauthier (Briggs) to discuss data required for Ordinary Course Professional disclosure	0.20	650.00	130.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare action items listing to be sent to company for follow up on specific AP reconciliations.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare amended exhibits related to fully and partially satisfied scheduled claims to circulate to counsel for review	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare communication to client regarding pending stipulation agreement with SAP	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare communication to request client review and analyze elements of Daihatsu claim	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft claim-specific voting comments for updates to KCC's voting list	0.40	470.00	188.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/10/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare for call on HR contracts and voting Objections	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for claims call with Weil	0.20	650.00	130.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of employee claims by subcategory to date	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare updated objection exhibits for B&S Tech and B&S International claims and circulate to counsel for review	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of specified claim classes from Disclosure Statement to identify any related claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to additional scheduled claims resolved through cure payments	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to specified claims for solicitation process	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and compilation of all additional voting updates and sent to KCC for review and incorporation in balloting process	1.20	650.00	780.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review batch of trade claims reviewed by company for accuracy and completeness	1.10	650.00	715.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.60	745.00	447.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim-specific voting amounts to address questions from KCC	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review court docket for recent filings relating to trade claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft exhibits for preliminary Tech, Intl objections	0.70	795.00	556.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft voting amounts for filed employee claims in KCC's voting list	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft voting amounts for filed unliquidated claims in KCC's voting list	1.30	470.00	611.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft voting amounts for foreign currency claims in KCC's voting list	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft voting amounts for the Pension Benefit Guaranty Corporation in KCC's voting list	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review field claim for specific vendor in response to client's request	0.30	650.00	195.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review final September fee application	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of claims report and outstanding issues related to voting amounts in preparation for call with counsel	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of revised Plan and Disclosure Statement regarding treatment/recovery of claims	1.90	650.00	1,235.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of voting spreadsheet and research related to voting amounts for selected creditors	0.60	650.00	390.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	1.20	470.00	564.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review sepecific vendor claim and draft claim conclusion	0.70	650.00	455.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review schedule of cure payments made to date	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Weil request to review specific vendor claim	0.50	650.00	325.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/10/2020	Tax Issues	Correspond re: customer sales and use tax refunds with Weil/Briggs/EY teams	0.40	850.00	340.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/10/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update due to/due from analysis and email to G Gauthier (Briggs)	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/10/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update professional fee schedule for week ending 10/3 - 10/25	0.70	650.00	455.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update trade claims action items file	0.40	650.00	260.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Draft action items for AP reconciliations that need additional information / need to be corrected by B&S.	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Continue review of master voting file to update selected voting amounts for KCC	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY) to discuss voting data to send updates to KCC	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss voting data to send updates to KCC	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the low-recovery scenario claims summary in advance of call with the Company; EY participants: C. Carpenter, C. Hannon, S. Hofner (EY)	0.20	795.00	159.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the low-recovery scenario claims summary in advance of call with the Company; EY participants: C. Carpenter, C. Hannon, S. Hofner (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the low-recovery scenario claims summary in advance of call with the Company; EY participants: C. Carpenter, C. Hannon, S. Hofner (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY) to discuss match issues for voting data	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss match issues for voting data	0.20	650.00	130.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss status of claim reconciliations and objections	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss status of claim reconciliations and objections	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss status of claim reconciliations and objections	0.60	650.00	390.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss status of claim reconciliations and objections	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss status of claim reconciliations and objections	0.60	470.00	282.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss status of claim reconciliations and objections	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G Giordano, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss status of claim reconciliations and objections	0.60	795.00	477.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss claims reviewed by the company for final designations/ next steps	0.40	650.00	260.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss claims reviewed by the company for final designations/ next steps	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Meetings with management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, D Hoehne, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Granell (EY) re: weekly update on case matters and next steps	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Meetings with Management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, D Hoehne, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Granell (EY) re: weekly update on case matters and next steps	0.30	795.00	238.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/11/2020	Meetings with Management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, D Hoehne, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Granell (EY) re: weekly update on case matters and next steps	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Meetings with Management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, D Hoehne, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Granell (EY) regarding weekly update on case matters and next steps	0.30	650.00	195.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: impact of potential claims objections on voting register/thresholds	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: impact of potential claims objections on voting register/thresholds	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, J Granell, C Hannon (EY) regarding impact of potential claims objections on voting register/thresholds	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Cash Monitoring	Calls with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: due to/due from analysis; intercompany activity between Billy Goat and Corp and legacy bank accounts	0.40	795.00	318.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze review parameters for claims to be reviewed by company	1.50	650.00	975.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze vendor-specific claims to be aggregated for solicitation	0.60	470.00	282.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin to analyze claims previously sent to the company for review that were not fully resolved by the company review	2.60	470.00	1,222.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/11/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Begin to update October MOR template for balance sheet received from P. Langelin (Briggs)	1.30	470.00	611.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/11/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Begin to update October MOR template for cash flow statement received from P. Langelin (Briggs)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/11/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Begin to update October MOR template for income statement received from P. Langelin (Briggs)	1.10	470.00	517.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with A. Nguyen (KCC) to discuss voting amounts and bondholder ballots	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, S. Hofner, and T. Bradley (EY) to discuss incorporation of claim transfers into claims register for reconciliation and distribution purposes	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, S. Hofner, and T. Bradley (EY) to discuss incorporation of claim transfers into claims register for reconciliation and distribution purposes	0.40	470.00	188.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, S. Hofner, and T. Bradley (EY) to discuss incorporation of claim transfers into claims register for reconciliation and distribution purposes	0.40	470.00	188.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/11/2020	Tax Issues	Form 945 resource research and request to EY S. Puechner for additional assistance	0.40	850.00	340.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare additional voting data updates for KCC	0.70	650.00	455.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call to discuss initial claim objection exhibits and voting items	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/11/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare list of contracts for specific vendor for company to pull	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare reconciliation of KCC scheduled-only voting amounts and claims register master scheduled-only claim amounts	0.60	470.00	282.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of trade claims reviewed to date to distribute to client	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of variances between KCC scheduled-only claims' voting amounts and claims master scheduled-only claim amounts	0.70	470.00	329.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare the third batch of employee related claims to be sent to Briggs for review	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Meetings with management	Prepare update on numerous case workstreams for discussion with K. Buono (Briggs)	0.60	795.00	477.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/11/2020	Tax Issues	Reply to S. Rugg (Briggs) on Cares Act employment tax deferral question from Weil and provide current pre and post petition employment tax deferral numbers for Briggs S. Rugg reply to Weil	0.90	850.00	765.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/11/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research specific vendor contracts	0.30	470.00	141.00
Mills,Rebecca Hinson	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Tax Issues	Review 2020 tax deferral with N. Flagg (EY) and respond to email and questions from N. Flagg	0.50	725.00	362.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/11/2020	Tax Issues	Review 2020 tax deferral with R. Hinson (EY)	0.40	850.00	340.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim and motion filed by specific vendor	0.50	650.00	325.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.60	745.00	447.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's claims tracking file for updates provided by company	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review internal communication about certain vendor claim	0.30	650.00	195.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest claims summary estimate and supporting details	1.70	795.00	1,351.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of claim transfer from docket	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of final voting/balloting spreadsheet received by KCC	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of milestones calendar to identify updates	0.30	650.00	195.00
Weden,Marcus L.	Senior Manager	11/11/2020	Tax Issues	Review of sales and use tax refunds from customers for legacy estate sales	1.90	725.00	1,377.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of voting spreadsheet to verify all B&S Tech and B&S International claims are identified for objection	0.50	650.00	325.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	1.70	470.00	799.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	2.20	470.00	1,034.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review voting amounts for claims filed against Briggs & Stratton International, Inc.	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review voting amounts for claims filed against Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise analysis of KCC's scheduled-only claims population	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise analysis of variances between master claims register scheduled only claim amounts and scheduled-only voting amounts in KCC's draft voting list	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise analysis of voting amounts for scheduled-only claims	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise low-recovery scenario claims summary in advance of call with the Company	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise summary footnotes in claims register in advance of internal claims call	0.30	470.00	141.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update action items listing to be sent to company for follow up on specific AP reconciliations with new action items following additional review.	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update calendar / milestones document to include additional/updated court related deadlines / process timeline to be distributed among stakeholders.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master registry for employee related claims that have been reconciled by the Company	2.10	650.00	1,365.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/11/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update September MOR template for October dates and available data	2.20	470.00	1,034.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update status tracking file of claims requiring further discussion	1.10	650.00	715.00



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Draft action items for AP reconciliations that need additional information / need to be corrected by B&S.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter and J. Granell (EY) to discuss employee related claims	0.40	470.00	188.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter and J. Granell (EY) to discuss employee related claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss October Monthly Operating Report	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss October Monthly Operating Report	0.50	795.00	397.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss October Monthly Operating Report	0.50	470.00	235.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J. Granell (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss cash data for October MOR	0.70	650.00	455.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J. Granell (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss cash data for October MOR	0.70	470.00	329.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to debrief on call with Weil. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	650.00	65.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Vendor Issues	Participate in call to debrief on call with Weil. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	745.00	74.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss specific vendor claim reconciliation. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss specific vendor claim reconciliation. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.50	745.00	372.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of various claim reconciliations and vendor court filings. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY), M. Martir(Weil), C. Luster(Weil)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of various claim reconciliations and vendor court filings. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY), M. Martir(Weil), C. Luster(Weil)	0.50	745.00	372.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze claim draft exhibits related to the wrong debtor and amended and superseded omnibus	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze reduced scheduled-only claims population to be reconciled by the Company	1.40	470.00	658.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) court hearing for Notice of Satisfied Claims	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) court hearing for Notice of Satisfied Claims	0.40	795.00	318.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss tracking of claim transfers and updates to the master claims register; participants: T. Bradley, C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss tracking of claim transfers and updates to the master claims register; participants: T. Bradley, C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with P. Prickett (Briggs), S. Margolis, D. Hoehne, R. Lauren, R. Tamara (Weil) to discuss employee related claims	0.50	650.00	325.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete analysis of claims previously sent to the company for review that were not fully resolved by the company review	1.90	470.00	893.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Complete update to October MOR template for balance sheet received from P. Langelin (company)	0.80	470.00	376.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Complete update to October MOR template for cash flow statement received from P. Langelin (company)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Complete update to October MOR template for income statement received from P. Langelin (company)	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Continue reviewing draft exhibits for preliminary Tech, Intl objections	0.70	795.00	556.50
Brandtitz,Fred C	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Tax Issues	Employment tax - CARES Act FICA deferral review of emails/background from client	0.50	725.00	362.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/12/2020	Tax Issues	Employment tax deferral information to EY team to prepare for call with client	0.40	850.00	340.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Generate updated exhibits related to partially satisfied and fully satisfied Scheduled Claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare analyses for call with Weil and Briggs to discuss employee related claims	1.10	650.00	715.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/12/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare responses to Weil's questions regarding HR contracts to retain	1.30	650.00	845.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Prepare summary of receipts and disbursements for the Monthly Operating Report	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare template for claim transfers to be recorded in master claims register	1.30	470.00	611.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Reconciliation of KCC master claims register to claims reconciliation file to account for all new claims	0.70	650.00	455.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/12/2020	Tax Issues	Reply to S. Rugg (Briggs) on Weil reply and questions regarding employment tax deferral	0.30	850.00	255.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Tax Issues	Research payroll tax deferral figures per email from S. Rugg (Briggs)	0.80	795.00	636.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to upcoming claim objections	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to voting amounts for specified creditors for solicitation process	1.40	650.00	910.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/12/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Researched leases of a specific vendor per request from counsel.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and categorization of new claims received for incorporation in claims register	2.60	650.00	1,690.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim conclusions prepared by company for batch of AP trade claims	2.80	650.00	1,820.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.60	745.00	447.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims reconciliation items requiring further review by the SWAT team	0.80	795.00	636.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's claim conclusion for a specific vendor claim	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review filed claims for Roger Brinner for possible equity claim treatment	0.40	650.00	260.00
Puechner,Shawn P.	Partner/Principal	11/12/2020	Tax Issues	Review of Form 945 matters	0.50	900.00	450.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review preliminary draft of MOR	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliation of KCC scheduled-only voting amounts and claims register master scheduled-only claim amounts	1.40	470.00	658.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	1.90	470.00	893.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated claims list from KCC to identify claim-specific revisions made	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review vendor-specific claim amendments to be discussed with KCC for potential voting amount updates	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise template for claim transfers to be recorded in master claims register	0.30	470.00	141.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Summarize debtors' objection to vendors filing for expedited payment of 503b9 claims	0.50	650.00	325.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update action items listing to be sent to company for follow up on specific AP reconciliations with new action items following additional review.	1.10	470.00	517.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update calendar / milestones document to include additional/updated court related deadlines / process timeline to be distributed among stakeholders.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft October MOR for preliminary bank balance information received from the company through normal cash reporting processes	1.10	470.00	517.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft October MOR for professional fee payment data for MOR-6	2.00	470.00	940.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update internal trade claims action items file	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/12/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update Ordinary Course Professional Exhibit to revise description for select professional	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/12/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update professional fee calendar for Estate and correspond with advisors on fees scheduled for payment in current week and correspond with Estate on associated payments scheduling	1.20	795.00	954.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Updates to draft objection exhibits and circulate to counsel for review	0.90	650.00	585.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/12/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Draft action items for AP reconciliations that need additional information / need to be corrected by B&S.	2.70	470.00	1,269.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with G. Giordano, C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY) and T. Bradley (EY) to discuss AP Trade Claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with G. Giordano, C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY) and T. Bradley (EY) to discuss AP Trade Claims	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with G. Giordano, C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY) and T. Bradley (EY) to discuss AP Trade Claims	0.30	795.00	238.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with G. Giordano, C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY) and T. Bradley (EY) to discuss AP Trade Claims	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon and S. Hofner (EY) regarding no liability claims for objection	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon and S. Hofner (EY) regarding no liability claims for objection	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with G Giordano, C Hannon (EY) to review draft MOR	0.60	795.00	477.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/13/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with G Giordano, C Hannon (EY) to review draft MOR	0.60	470.00	282.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss current status of claims process and next steps/action items for claims team; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), J Granell (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss current status of claims process and next steps/action items for claims team; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), J Granell (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss current status of claims process and next steps/action items for claims team; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), J Granell (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss current status of claims process and next steps/action items for claims team; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), J Granell (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss current status of claims process and next steps/action items for claims team; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), J Granell (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss current status of claims process and next steps/action items for claims team; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), J Granell (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss current status of claims process and next steps/action items for claims team; EY Participants: C Hannon (EY), J Silverwood (EY), S Hofner (EY), J Granell (EY), C Carpenter (EY), G Giordano (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss scheduled only claims and reconciliation process. Participants include C. Carpenter(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss scheduled only claims and reconciliation process. Participants include C. Carpenter(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims review, claims reconciliations and pending filings. Participants include C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), S. Hoffner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims review, claims reconciliations and pending filings. Participants include C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), S. Hoffner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims review, claims reconciliations and pending filings. Participants include C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), S. Hoffner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims review, claims reconciliations and pending filings. Participants include C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), S. Hoffner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.60	795.00	477.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims review, claims reconciliations and pending filings. Participants include C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), S. Hoffner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims review, claims reconciliations and pending filings. Participants include C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), S. Hoffner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims review, claims reconciliations and pending filings. Participants include C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), S. Hoffner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between filed and scheduled claims to identify additional matches for the claims register	1.40	470.00	658.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspond with legal counsel re: declaration required in support of objections	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Correspond with P Langelin (Briggs) re: MOR balance sheet	0.20	795.00	159.00
Branditz,Fred C	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Tax Issues	Employment tax - CARES Act FICA deferral review of emails/background from client	0.50	725.00	362.50
Branditz,Fred C	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Tax Issues	EY call with Briggs' Tax and Payroll representatives to finalize pre- and post-petition employment tax deferral amounts incurred to date by EstateCo with N. Flagg, K. Gatt, R. Mills, F. Branditz, J. Henrich (EY) and S. Rugg, C. Wojtak (Briggs).	0.50	725.00	362.50
Mills,Rebecca Hinson	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Tax Issues	EY call with Briggs' Tax and Payroll representatives to finalize pre- and post-petition employment tax deferral amounts incurred to date by EstateCo with N. Flagg, K. Gatt, R. Mills, F. Branditz, J. Henrich (EY) and S. Rugg, C. Wojtak (Briggs).	0.50	725.00	362.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/13/2020	Tax Issues	EY call with Briggs' Tax and Payroll representatives to finalize pre- and post-petition employment tax deferral amounts incurred to date by EstateCo with N. Flagg, K. Gatt, R. Mills, F. Branditz, J. Henrich (EY) and S. Rugg, C. Wojtak (Briggs).	0.50	850.00	425.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Tax Issues	EY call with Briggs' Tax and Payroll representatives to finalize pre- and post-petition employment tax deferral amounts incurred to date by EstateCo with N. Flagg, K. Gatt, R. Mills, F. Branditz, J. Henrich (EY) and S. Rugg, C. Wojtak (Briggs).	0.50	795.00	397.50
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Tax Issues	EY call with Briggs' Tax and Payroll representatives to finalize pre- and post-petition employment tax deferral amounts incurred to date by EstateCo with N. Flagg, K. Gatt, R. Mills, F. Branditz, J. Henrich (EY) and S. Rugg, C. Wojtak (Briggs).	0.50	725.00	362.50
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Tax Issues	EY call with Briggs' Tax Senior Director to discuss Tennessee sales and use tax audit resolution steps with N. Flagg, K. Gatt (EY) and S. Rugg (Briggs)	0.30	725.00	217.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/13/2020	Tax Issues	EY call with Briggs' Tax Senior Director to discuss Tennessee sales and use tax audit resolution steps with N. Flagg, K. Gatt (EY) and S. Rugg (Briggs)	0.30	850.00	255.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with M. Rodriguez (B&S) to discuss claims reviewed and updates to claims tracking file	0.20	650.00	130.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with T. Glatch (B&S) to discuss claims reviewed and updates to claims tracking file	0.20	650.00	130.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare a consolidated PDF of all claims being objected to be included with objection exhibits.	1.80	470.00	846.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare claim objection exhibits related to wrong debtor, amended, and no liability claims	1.80	650.00	1,170.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of reduced scheduled-only trade claims for reconciliation of invoice-level payments	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of open claim items to further update objection exhibits	0.60	650.00	390.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.70	745.00	521.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's claims tracking file for accuracy	2.00	650.00	1,300.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's claims tracking file for updates to reviewed claims.	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review court docket for recent claims related filings	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft objections, declarations, exhibits and individual claims in advance of 11/16 objection filing	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of all objection exhibits to master claims data to circulate to counsel for review	0.60	650.00	390.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review omnibus claims objection	0.80	795.00	636.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/13/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft October MOR (part 6(2)) to match current debt situation (no debt left at the estate)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/13/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft October MOR for cash receipts and disbursement data for the period	1.40	470.00	658.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/13/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft October MOR for payroll disbursements by debtor entity	1.30	470.00	611.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/13/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft October MOR with comments received from internal EY team	0.90	470.00	423.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update internal trade claims action items file	1.90	650.00	1,235.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/13/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update MOR-1a for final bank account balance information received from G. Gauthier at the company	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update the "no liability" objection exhibits	0.80	650.00	520.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare action items for AP reconciliations that need additional information / need to be corrected by B&S.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss objection exhibits for Briggs & Stratton International, Inc. and Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC claims; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), E. Berdini (Weil)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss objection exhibits for Briggs & Stratton International, Inc. and Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC claims; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), E. Berdini (Weil)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare updates to claim exhibits based on feedback received from counsel to date	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Generate updated exhibits related to No Liability, Wrong Debtor, and Amended Claims and circulate to counsel for review	1.20	650.00	780.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated and redline omnibus objections to verify claim objection exhibits match format of objections	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspond with counsel to verify number of final exhibits to be generated for claim objections and determine timing for receiving additional updates	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated objections and declaration drafts and correspond with legal counsel regarding edits	1.10	795.00	874.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss additional filed litigation claims and next steps to coordinate counsel's review; Participants: G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss additional filed litigation claims and next steps to coordinate counsel's review; Participants: G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss objection exhibit follow-ups and progress on claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss objection exhibit follow-ups and progress on claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss objection exhibit follow-ups and progress on claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss objection exhibit follow-ups and progress on claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss objection exhibit follow-ups and progress on claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss objection exhibit follow-ups and progress on claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss objection exhibit follow-ups and progress on claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/16/2020	Tax Issues	Access and review employment tax deferral file from C. Wojtak (Briggs) and distribute info to EY team	0.70	850.00	595.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Add unresolved claims from previous batches to a file to be circulated to the company for further review	1.80	470.00	846.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze claim variances between various AP aging reports for reduced scheduled-only creditors	1.20	470.00	564.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/16/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update Estate cash flow tracker	0.90	650.00	585.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze final versions of claim objection exhibits	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze invoice descriptions in AP aging reports for reduced scheduled-only creditors	1.70	470.00	799.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze master registry decisions related to employee claims	1.10	650.00	715.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/16/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Begin reconciliation across various cash data points within the October MOR draft	2.10	470.00	987.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/16/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with G Gauthier (Briggs) to discuss certain cash transactions	0.30	795.00	238.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review of additional batch of trade claims on 11/16 received by the company	2.30	470.00	1,081.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Continue review of employee late-filed claims for potential objection	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/16/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Correspondence with counsel regarding future contract assumption notices.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/16/2020	Chapter 11 Process and Case Management	Correspondence with counsel regarding new PIIL draft.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/16/2020	Tax Issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY).	0.30	725.00	217.50
Sobers,Linsay	Staff	11/16/2020	Tax Issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY).	0.30	300.00	90.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/16/2020	Tax Issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY).	0.30	850.00	255.00
Risman,Alexander Harrison	Senior	11/16/2020	Tax Issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY).	0.30	475.00	142.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Generate final objection exhibits for claim objections - B&S International and B&S Tech	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Identify claim issues to discuss proposed treatment with counsel and related objections	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for and participate in call with J. Champe(B&S) to discuss specific vendor claims reconciliation(IH Source)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare response to M. Rodriguez (B&S) regarding creditor's claim.	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to claim inquiries	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and prepare summaries of outstanding invoices from a specific trade vendor	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and prepare summaries of outstanding invoices from a specific freight vendor	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/16/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review cash activity for the prior week and update due to/due from analysis	1.20	795.00	954.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.30	745.00	223.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's claims tracking file for status of claims reviewed by company	1.00	650.00	650.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review court docket for recent claims related filings	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of filed claim objections and verification of exhibits	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of late-filed claims to identify for possible objection	2.10	650.00	1,365.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/16/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review updated draft of Monthly Operating Report and cash reconciliation	0.90	795.00	715.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updates to list of no liability claim objections for filing	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updates to list of wrong debtor claim objections for filing	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise analysis of claim variances between various AP aging reports for reduced scheduled-only creditors	1.30	470.00	611.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/16/2020	Tax Issues	Update C. Wojtak (Briggs) on employment tax deferral file access issue	0.30	850.00	255.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/16/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update October MOR draft for latest payroll disbursement data	0.70	470.00	329.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/16/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update payroll disbursements for the Monthly Operating Report	1.70	650.00	1,105.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/16/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update professional fee calendar for Estate including correspond with advisors on fees scheduled for payment in current week	0.60	795.00	477.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss next steps for amendments to Schedule E/F Part 2; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call to discuss next steps for amendments to Schedule E/F Part 2; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY)	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss next steps for amendments to Schedule E/F Part 2; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY)	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss trade claim reconciliation updates for the master claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.70	650.00	455.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss trade claim reconciliation updates for the master claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.70	650.00	455.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss trade claim reconciliation updates for the master claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss trade claim reconciliation updates for the master claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss trade claim reconciliation updates for the master claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss upcoming omnibus hearing, filed administrative claims, and revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: D. Hoehne (Weil), E. Blechman (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), B. Marks (Houlihan), S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss upcoming omnibus hearing, filed administrative claims, and revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: D. Hoehne (Weil), E. Blechman (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), B. Marks (Houlihan), S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss upcoming omnibus hearing, filed administrative claims, and revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: D. Hoehne (Weil), E. Blechman (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), B. Marks (Houlihan), S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.90	795.00	715.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss upcoming omnibus hearing, filed administrative claims, and revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: D. Hoehne (Weil), E. Blechman (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), B. Marks (Houlihan), S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.90	795.00	715.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss upcoming omnibus hearing, filed administrative claims, and revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: D. Hoehne (Weil), E. Blechman (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), B. Marks (Houlihan), S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.90	650.00	585.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss upcoming omnibus hearing, filed administrative claims, and revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: D. Hoehne (Weil), E. Blechman (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), B. Marks (Houlihan), S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.90	650.00	585.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss upcoming omnibus hearing, filed administrative claims, and revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: D. Hoehne (Weil), E. Blechman (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), B. Marks (Houlihan), S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.90	470.00	423.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss upcoming omnibus hearing, filed administrative claims, and revisions to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: D. Hoehne (Weil), E. Blechman (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), B. Marks (Houlihan), S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY),c.J. Henrich (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C Hannon, S Hofner (EY) re: asbestos litigation claims and amended admin claims filed	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C Hannon, S Hofner (EY) re: asbestos litigation claims and amended admin claims filed	0.30	650.00	195.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), K. Buono (Company), M. Schwertfeger (Company) and P. Langelin (Company) to review draft of October MOR	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), K. Buono (Company), M. Schwertfeger (Company) and P. Langelin (Company) to review draft of October MOR	0.40	795.00	318.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), K. Buono (Company), M. Schwertfeger (Company) and P. Langelin (Company) to review draft of October MOR	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: OCP payments	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: OCP payments	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K Lemke (Briggs), M Martir, C Luster (Weil), J Hess, C Hannon (EY) re: additional updates for assumption of contracts	1.00	795.00	795.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/17/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K Lemke (Briggs), M Martir, C Luster (Weil), J Hess, C Hannon (EY) re: additional updates for assumption of contracts	1.00	470.00	470.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss review of claims and updating claims register. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), T. Bradley(EY)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss review of claims and updating claims register. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), T. Bradley(EY)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze FICA deferral data to determine pre vs post petition liability	2.40	795.00	1,908.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze master registry decisions related to employee claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with A. Nguyen to discuss claim objections, admin claims received, and amended schedules	0.60	650.00	390.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Complete reconciliation across various cash data points within the October MOR draft	1.80	470.00	846.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspondence with KCC regarding additional claims and updates to schedules	0.20	650.00	130.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft correspondence to company tax team to confirm accuracy and relevancy of tax attestation within October MOR	0.70	470.00	329.00



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft redline of October MOR global notes compared to the previous month's global notes to streamline the review process	0.60	470.00	282.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Participate in call with B. Marks (HL) re: FICA analysis	0.20	795.00	159.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare response to claims question on specific land lease claim	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of 10/26 AP aging invoices that impact scheduled-only claim amounts	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of 8/19 AP aging invoices for scheduled-only claim amounts reduced by subsequent AP aging reports	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare agenda related to claims call with counsel	0.80	650.00	520.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare spreadsheet to compile EY team's review of company reconciliations.	1.80	470.00	846.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/17/2020	Chapter 11 Process and Case Management	Prepared new version of PIIL to include various parties per direction from Weil.	2.80	470.00	1,316.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review / divide trade claims for trade claims team for guidance to be provided to the Company for reconciliation.	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review analysis of reduced scheduled-only claims	0.60	470.00	282.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review and analyze Ordinary Course Professional payment history provided by company	1.80	650.00	1,170.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review asbestos litigation claims to address questions from counsel	0.60	470.00	282.00
Tajuddin, Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.40	745.00	298.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's claims tracking file for updates to reviewed claims.	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review intercompany claim data for amendments to Schedule E/F Part 2	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review invoice-level variances between 8/19 and 10/26 for reduced scheduled-only claims	1.60	470.00	752.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review Monthly Operating Report prior to working call with Briggs	1.30	650.00	845.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review of Ordinary Course Professionals report and underlying data	0.90	795.00	715.50
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/17/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review of proposed schedule amendments	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review of updates to Schedule F for amendment to intercompany liabilities	0.90	795.00	715.50
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	1.80	470.00	846.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review trade agreement data for creditors who were flagged in the Company's data base as having a trade agreement.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Revise intercompany claims in Briggs & Stratton Corporation's Schedule E/F Part 2	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/17/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Revise remaining debtors' intercompany claims in Schedule E/F Part 2	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update calendar / milestones document to include additional/updated court related deadlines / process timeline to be distributed among stakeholders.	0.60	470.00	282.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/17/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update cash flow tracker for week ending 11.13	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft Ordinary Course Professional exhibit for company provided payment information	1.20	650.00	780.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Working call with C. Hannon, J. Granell, G. Giordano (EY) to update October MOR2 in order to reflect comments from K. Buono (Briggs)	0.40	795.00	318.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Working call with C. Hannon, J. Granell, G. Giordano (EY) to update October MOR2 in order to reflect comments from K. Buono (Briggs)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/17/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Working call with C. Hannon, J. Granell, G. Giordano (EY) to update October MOR2 in order to reflect comments from K. Buono (Briggs)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss amendments to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss amendments to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss amendments to scheduled intercompany claims; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule amendments and status of claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.80	650.00	520.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule amendments and status of claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule amendments and status of claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.80	470.00	376.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule amendments and status of claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.80	470.00	376.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule amendments and status of claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.80	650.00	520.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule amendments and status of claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call to discuss Schedule amendments and status of claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.80	795.00	636.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call to discuss timeline for amended Schedules; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call to discuss timeline for amended Schedules; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss vendors with AP balances associated with trade agreements to support claims process; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss vendors with AP balances associated with trade agreements to support claims process; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, T. Bradley, and S. Hofner (EY) regarding updates to claim register and summary reports related to administrative claims and pending claim objections.	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, T. Bradley, and S. Hofner (EY) regarding updates to claim register and summary reports related to administrative claims and pending claim objections.	0.50	470.00	235.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, T. Bradley, and S. Hofner (EY) regarding updates to claim register and summary reports related to administrative claims and pending claim objections.	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Meetings with management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: weekly update on case matters and next steps	0.60	795.00	477.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Meetings with Management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: weekly update on case matters and next steps	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) regarding weekly update on case matters and next steps	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Participate in call to discuss payment cutoff of Ordinary Course Professional payments. Participants include J. Silverwood (EY), C. Hannon (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Participate in call to discuss payment cutoff of Ordinary Course Professional payments. Participants include J. Silverwood (EY), C. Hannon (EY)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Participate in call to review draft of Ordinary Course Professionals exhibit and discuss claims review. Participants include J. Silverwood (EY), C. Hannon (EY)	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Participate in call to review draft of Ordinary Course Professionals exhibit and discuss claims review. Participants include J. Silverwood (EY), C. Hannon (EY)	0.70	795.00	556.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with P. Prickett (Briggs), T. Roth, L. Richards, S. Margolis, D. Hoehne (Weil), C. Hannon, J Granell (EY) re: employee related claims	0.90	650.00	585.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with P. Prickett (Briggs), T. Roth, L. Richards, S. Margolis, D. Hoehne (Weil), C. Hannon, J Granel (EY) re: employee related claims	0.90	795.00	715.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Meetings with other advisors	Participate in call with R Zaidman (BRG), J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: workers compensation insurance	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with R Zaidman (BRG), J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: workers compensation insurance	0.30	795.00	238.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze claim estimates provided by the Briggs tax team	0.40	470.00	188.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze master registry decisions related to employee claims	0.90	650.00	585.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze specific vendor with multiple vendor numbers and amounts in AP trade claim to assist company in verifying claim amounts	0.90	470.00	423.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) Court Hearing	1.20	795.00	954.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) Court hearing re: early 503(b)(9) and lifting stay re: certain asbestos and insurance proceedings	1.20	795.00	954.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin initial review of filed administrative claims against the debtors	1.40	470.00	658.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Begin to update draft October MOR per comments received from counsel	2.20	470.00	1,034.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Calculate amounts paid to specific OCP vendor in August and September	0.80	650.00	520.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft updated redline against September MOR global notes after comments from counsel were incorporated	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Final review and circulation of proposed updated Schedules to Weil for review.	0.30	650.00	195.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with R Zaidman (BRG) re: follow up on workers compensation insurance	0.20	795.00	159.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare communication to team members regarding specific parts vendor and specific freight vendor invoices	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare correspondence for Company regarding filed tax claims	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Prepare draft amended Schedule E/F Part 2 for Billy Goat Industries, Inc.	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Prepare draft amended Schedule E/F Part 2 for Briggs & Stratton Corporation	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Prepare draft amended Schedule E/F Part 2 for Briggs & Stratton International, Inc.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Prepare draft amended Schedule E/F Part 2 for Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC	0.40	470.00	188.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/18/2020	Cash Monitoring	Prepare extended version of post sale unwind forecast	0.80	650.00	520.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call to discuss employee claims with Weil and Briggs	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Prepare summary comparison of Ordinary Course Professionals exhibits.	0.80	650.00	520.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of employee claims by subcategory to date	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of vendors with AP balances associated with trade agreements to support claims process	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare updated list of filed tax claims for the Company's reconciliation	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/18/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepared list of all contracts for vendors for whom updates would be made to the next cure exhibit in order to facilitate the update process.	2.70	470.00	1,269.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Reconcile intercompany receivables to master file	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/18/2020	Vendor Issues	Research specific vendor cures per request from S. Tajuddin (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/18/2020	Vendor Issues	Research specific vendor cure amount per request from A. Golvach (Briggs).	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review additional AP claims provided by KCC to assess whether or not they replace claims already reviewed by the company.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review additional batch of claims that have already been reviewed by the company to ensure the notes and responses provided satisfy requirements to grant a completed status	1.30	470.00	611.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and identification of admin claims from those received 10/23, 10/28, and 11/6 from KCC	2.40	650.00	1,560.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim filed by certain insurance provider to address questions from counsel	0.20	470.00	94.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.50	745.00	372.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register for updated trade claims information	0.50	650.00	325.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review sales and use tax statements for OCP payment.	0.70	650.00	455.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review OCP Monthly statement	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of late-filed claims to identify items for possible objection	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/18/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review of proposed amended schedule EF for four debtor entities	0.80	650.00	520.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review scheduled and filed claims for certain supplier to identify amounts owed by the Debtors	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review tax claims filed to date	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/18/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Revise intercompany claims in Schedule E/F Part 2 to provide draft amendments to counsel	0.90	470.00	423.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Revise Ordinary Course Professionals exhibit for payments made near cutoff date	1.10	650.00	715.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with AP claims reconciled by the Company.	2.70	470.00	1,269.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims registry for employee related claims to reflect discussions with Weil on proposed subcategory treatment	1.30	650.00	845.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/18/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update Ordinary Course Professionals Exhibit to include specific OCP payments	0.40	650.00	260.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Write action items for AP reconciliations that need additional information / need to be corrected by B&S.	1.70	470.00	799.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter (EY) regarding admin claim and ballot amounts for selected claimants	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY) regarding admin claim and ballot amounts for selected claimants	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss admin claims and updates to register	0.70	650.00	455.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S. Hofner (EY) to discuss admin claims and updates to register	0.70	470.00	329.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J Silverwood, C Hannon (EY) re: OCP payments and updates to report following legal review	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J Silverwood, C Hannon (EY) re: OCP payments and updates to report following legal review	0.40	795.00	318.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss identification of Administrative Claims and volume of claims. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), C. Carpenter(EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss identification of Administrative Claims and volume of claims. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), C. Carpenter(EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss process to update claims register. Participants include T Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss process to update claims register. Participants include T Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss section 503/507 claims. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), G. Giordano(EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss section 503/507 claims. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), G. Giordano(EY)	0.10	470.00	47.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	Meetings with other advisors	Participate in call with R Berkovich, A Fliman, A Paddock (Weil), J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: workers compensation and litigation issues	0.70	795.00	556.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with R Berkovich, A Fliman, A Paddock (Weil), J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: workers compensation and litigation issues	0.70	795.00	556.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze claims provided by KCC following admin. bar date order to identify claims filed using an administrative expense proof of claim	1.10	470.00	517.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze sections 503 and 507 of the US bankruptcy code as they relate to the debtors' businesses and draft summaries for the company claims reviewers to use as a reference while reviewing administrative claims	2.70	470.00	1,269.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze voting amounts for certain creditors to identify voting list updates for KCC	1.10	470.00	517.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with C. Hannon, N Flagg (EY) regarding specific tax related Ordinary Course Professional invoice	0.30	850.00	255.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with C. Hannon, N Flagg (EY) regarding specific tax related Ordinary Course Professional invoice	0.30	795.00	238.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Complete update to draft October MOR per comments received from counsel	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete updates to new claim information received and forwarded for incorporation in claims register	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Continue review of late-filed claims to identify items for possible objection	1.70	650.00	1,105.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/19/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Corresponded with company regarding adding contracts to OnBase.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/19/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare report of all contract changes and change categories for upcoming cure notice update.	3.10	470.00	1,457.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft correspondence to company reviewers of the October MOR draft laying out the changes since the previous version and requesting final approval/ signatures	0.80	470.00	376.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Prepare communication to B&S employees regarding contacting specific tax related OCP	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of comments for KCC regarding voting amounts for superseded amended claims	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of comments for KCC regarding voting amounts for superseded scheduled claims	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/19/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare list of contracts for specific vendor for the Company to pull for Weil's review.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/19/2020	Tax issues	Provide time options for claim review meeting to S. Rugg (Briggs) and team	0.30	850.00	255.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/19/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Research related to format of amended schedules for E. District of Missouri to begin preparation of draft summary of amended items by debtor	1.00	650.00	650.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and summarize action items for claims reviewed by T. Glatch(B&S)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.20	745.00	149.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims provided by KCC on 11/11 to identify further updates needed for voting	1.20	470.00	564.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register to identify Administrative Expense Claims	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review communications from Weil regarding Ordinary Course Professional exhibit and prepare response.	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review court docket for recent claims related filings	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Review Exmark litigation settlement proposal and correspond with Weil re: liquidity impact of same	0.40	795.00	318.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/19/2020	Tax issues	Review files for specific tax ordinary course professional prior approvals and information and provide to EY C. Hannon	1.30	850.00	1,105.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review list of new claims provided by KCC on 11/18	0.80	470.00	376.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Review litigation settlement and related analysis	0.90	795.00	715.50
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review master claims register to fix errors caused by reclassification of claims.	1.90	470.00	893.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review new court claim numbers provided by KCC on 11/18	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of new claims report received from KCC to categorize new claims	1.90	650.00	1,235.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/19/2020	Tax issues	Review property tax allocation spreadsheet provided by C. Meilhan (Briggs) and comment	1.10	850.00	935.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	1.80	470.00	846.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review schedule of ordinary course payment history provided by client	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review updated draft of OCP report	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review updated draft of wind down budget and cash flow forecast	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review updated drafts of MOR report and legal comments	0.90	795.00	715.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review updated OCP Monthly statement	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/19/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review updates from legal counsel required for cure cost exhibit	0.40	795.00	318.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/19/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review contract updates received from Weil and correspond with related notes and questions.	2.90	470.00	1,363.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise claims register master to include identification of administrative expense proof of claim forms for review	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/19/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Transform update data received from Weil into a format appropriate for an update to the Access Database.	1.30	470.00	611.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update action items listing to be sent to company for follow up on specific AP reconciliations with new action items following additional review.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft October MOR for additional comments received from counsel	1.60	470.00	752.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/19/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with information provided by reconciliations performed by the company for AP claims.	2.80	470.00	1,316.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update Ordinary Course Professional exhibit footnotes	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/19/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update Ordinary Course Professional exhibit to reflect additional payment sources.	2.30	650.00	1,495.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims provided by KCC on 11/19; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims provided by KCC on 11/19; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/20/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call to discuss amendments to Schedule E/F Part 2; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call to discuss amendments to Schedule E/F Part 2; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss initial analysis of administrative expense claims and status of ongoing claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss initial analysis of administrative expense claims and status of ongoing claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss initial analysis of administrative expense claims and status of ongoing claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss initial analysis of administrative expense claims and status of ongoing claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss initial analysis of administrative expense claims and status of ongoing claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss initial analysis of administrative expense claims and status of ongoing claim reviews; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Hannon (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/20/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call to discuss next steps to file amended Schedule E/F Part 2; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), E. Blechman (Weil)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call to discuss next steps to file amended Schedule E/F Part 2; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), E. Blechman (Weil)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: insurance offer to settle litigation claims	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: insurance offer to settle litigation claims	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: NWC summary from LLC	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: NWC summary from LLC	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, C Hannon (EY) re: updated cure cost exhibit for filing	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/20/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, C Hannon (EY) re: updated cure cost exhibit for filing	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with R Berkovich (Weil), J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: insurance offer to settle litigation claims	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with R Berkovich (Weil), J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: insurance offer to settle litigation claims	0.20	795.00	159.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss Administrative Expense claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss Administrative Expense claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Participate in call with R Berkovich, H Guthrie, A Kim (Weil), K Buono (Estate), J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: NWC summary from LLC	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Participate in call with R Berkovich, H Guthrie, A Kim (Weil), K Buono (Estate), J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: NWC summary from LLC	0.40	795.00	318.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with S Margolis, D Hoehne (Weil), J Henrich, C Hannon, J Granell (EY), P Prickett (Briggs) re: Officers Supplemental Life Insurance Plan claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with S Margolis, D Hoehne (Weil), J Henrich, C Hannon, J Granell (EY), P Prickett (Briggs) re: Officers Supplemental Life Insurance Plan claims	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with S Margolis, D Hoehne (Weil), J Henrich, C Hannon, J Granell (EY), P Prickett (Briggs) re: Officers Supplemental Life Insurance Plan claims	0.30	795.00	238.50
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze claim amendments provided on 11/18 to identify superseded claims	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze claims provided on 11/18 to identify duplicate claims	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Analyze final closing statement associated with purchase	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between filed claims provided 11/18 and scheduled claims	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze variances between withdrawn claims and accounts payable aging report	0.60	470.00	282.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin to update Litigation claims summary for latest information received from the company and counsel during the week ending 11/20	1.40	470.00	658.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/20/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call with A. Nguyen (KCC) regarding preparation and timing regarding filing of amended schedules.	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with R Zaidman (BRG) re: insurance offer to settle certain litigation claims	0.20	795.00	159.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review of initial list of filed administrative claims against the debtors	1.70	470.00	799.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Continue review of late-filed claims to identify items for objection	2.60	650.00	1,690.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/20/2020	Vendor Issues	Prepare draft exhibit for upcoming cure notice update based on feedback from counsel.	1.90	470.00	893.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/20/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare list of contract for specific vendor to assist with having the company pull the contracts from OnBase.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/20/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare new draft of assumed contract listing incorporating changes from upcoming cure notice.	1.90	470.00	893.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/20/2020	Vendor Issues	Prepare new draft of cure notice exhibit including new updates from Weil.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/20/2020	Tax issues	EY team call to discuss tax status, open items and next steps. Attendees: S. Puechner, JD. Sammons, J. Simon, K. Gatt, N. Flagg (EY)	0.40	850.00	340.00
Puechner, Shawn P.	Partner/Principal	11/20/2020	Tax issues	EY team call to discuss tax status, open items and next steps. Attendees: S. Puechner, JD. Sammons, J. Simon, K. Gatt, N. Flagg (EY)	0.40	900.00	360.00
Gatt, Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Tax issues	EY team call to discuss tax status, open items and next steps. Attendees: S. Puechner, JD. Sammons, J. Simon, K. Gatt, N. Flagg (EY)	0.40	725.00	290.00
Sammons, John David	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Tax issues	EY team call to discuss tax status, open items and next steps. Attendees: S. Puechner, JD. Sammons, J. Simon, K. Gatt, N. Flagg (EY)	0.40	725.00	290.00
Sammons, John David	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Tax issues	EY team call to discuss tax status, open items and next steps. Attendees: S. Puechner, JD. Sammons, J. Simon, K. Gatt, N. Flagg (EY)	0.40	725.00	290.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Initial review of NWC summary from LLC	2.20	795.00	1,749.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Participate in call with B. Marks (HL) re: NWC adjustment	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of updates to claims register and forwarded to C. Carpenter for review	1.80	650.00	1,170.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare communication to L. Pokorny(B&S) regarding identifying individuals to review payment status of vendor invoices	0.20	650.00	130.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary update for claims check-in call	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/20/2020	Vendor Issues	Prepare reconciliation from previous cure notice to new cure notice draft to ensure accuracy in updates and assist with reporting on magnitude/nature of changes.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare response to J. Champet(B&S) regarding creditor's claim against multiple entities.	0.20	650.00	130.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare response to M. Rodriguez(B&S) regarding creditor's claim against multiple entities.	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims filed by New Market Tax Credit lenders to address questions from counsel	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review court docket for recent claims related filings	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of docket items related to amended omnibus objections and claim withdrawals	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of late-filed claims to identify items for potential objection	0.80	650.00	520.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	1.70	470.00	799.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review summary prepared by team member of sections 503 and 509 of the code.	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/20/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review updated draft of cure assumption notices	0.90	795.00	715.50
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/20/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Reviewed counsel notes on pending updates and corresponded with counsel for answers to related questions.	2.30	470.00	1,081.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise claims register to identify scheduled claims superseded by filed claims provided on 11/18	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise claims register to include additional filed claims provided on 11/18	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise claims register to include updated court claim numbers provided on 11/18	0.30	470.00	141.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/20/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft October MOR for further comments received from counsel late on 11/19 prior to sending the updated copy to the company for signature	0.80	470.00	376.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with information provided by reconciliations performed by the company for AP claims.	2.40	470.00	1,128.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update the Company's creditor claim reconciliation google sheet tracker with direction for claims to be reconciled by the Company.	1.30	470.00	611.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/20/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	analyze and identify items for AP reconciliations that need additional information / need to be corrected by B&S.	1.60	470.00	752.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/22/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review and reconciliation of draft amended schedules received	1.30	650.00	845.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of revised draft amended schedule summary updates by debtor for review by counsel	1.10	650.00	715.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss Administrative Expense claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY), T. Bradley(EY).	0.30	650.00	195.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss Administrative Expense claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY), T. Bradley(EY).	0.30	470.00	141.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss claims review and update of claims register. Participants include J. Silverwood(EY), T. Bradley(EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with G. Giordano (EY) re: current status of litigation claims	0.40	795.00	318.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with J. Henrich (EY) re: current status of litigation claims	0.40	470.00	188.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Analyze NWC summary from LLC	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete update to Litigation claims summary for latest information received from the company and counsel during the week ending 11/20	1.20	470.00	564.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Continue to analyze NWC summary from LLC	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/23/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Coordinate with Weil regarding schedule amendments	0.40	650.00	260.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Participate in call with B Marks (HL) re: NWC summary from LLC	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Participate in call with R Berkovich (Weil) re: NWC summary from LLC	0.10	795.00	79.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Participate in call with R Zaidman (BRG) re: NWC summary from LLC	0.10	795.00	79.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of claims resolved on the docket	1.10	650.00	715.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of claims review process for internal review	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review cash activity for the prior week and update due to/due from analysis	2.40	795.00	1,908.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's claims tracking file for updates to reviewed claims.	1.00	650.00	650.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review court docket for recent claims related filings	0.20	650.00	130.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review cure exhibit and related analysis	1.30	795.00	1,033.50



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review debtor's objection to UFP Technologies motion for administrative claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review debtor's omnibus objection to vendors motion for 503b9 claims	0.50	650.00	325.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/23/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review draft of updated cure exhibit to ensure all changes from the previous exhibit	1.50	470.00	705.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review October fee application for compliance with requirements and identify edits	1.90	795.00	1,510.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of Peabody amended schedules and sent related schedule updates to KCC for preparation of Amended Schedule Drafts	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review reconciliations of AP claims performed by the Company to confirm the company reconciled the amounts, confirmed the debtor, provided notes on each claim.	1.60	470.00	752.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Tax issues	Review tax claims listing and establish template tracker	0.70	725.00	507.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/23/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review time detail in September monthly fee statement to ensure compliance with guidelines	2.20	795.00	1,749.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updates to reconciled claims within claims register	2.00	650.00	1,300.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update claims action item file to include necessary claims for the company to review further based on latest reviewed set of claims	1.60	470.00	752.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update claims action items file	0.90	650.00	585.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register high scenario summary sheets to break out claims in which an objection is contemplated.	2.80	470.00	1,316.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register high scenario summary sheets to exclude filed objections from the objections summary.	2.10	470.00	987.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with information provided by reconciliations performed by the company for AP claims.	2.10	470.00	987.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update summary of claims that require attorney guidance	1.00	650.00	650.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims withdrawn to date for updates to master claims register; Participants: J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims withdrawn to date for updates to master claims register; Participants: J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss incorporation of omnibus objections in master claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss incorporation of omnibus objections in master claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items for claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims summary; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items for claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims summary; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items for claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims summary; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items for claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims summary; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items for claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims summary; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items for claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims summary; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.60	795.00	477.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items for claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims summary; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Granell (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY).	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule E/F amendments and admin claims received to date; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Henrich (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule E/F amendments and admin claims received to date; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Henrich (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule E/F amendments and admin claims received to date; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Henrich (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule E/F amendments and admin claims received to date; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Henrich (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule E/F amendments and admin claims received to date; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Henrich (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule E/F amendments and admin claims received to date; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Henrich (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss Schedule E/F amendments and admin claims received to date; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), J. Henrich (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Hannon (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and E. Blechman (Weil)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to master claims register for inclusion of omnibus objections; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to master claims register for inclusion of omnibus objections; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/24/2020	Tax issues	Call with Briggs tax team (S.Rugg, C.Meilahn, L.Kelly, S.Vang) to bankruptcy tax claims resolution process and approach, including analysis of PA, Butler County, MO claims filed and tax classification considerations. Call included N.Flagg, K.Gatt, C. Carpenter, S.Hofner (EY).	1.00	850.00	850.00
Gatt, Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Tax issues	Call w/ Briggs tax team (S.Rugg, C.Meilahn, L.Kelly, S.Vang) to bankruptcy tax claims resolution process and approach, including analysis of PA, Butler County, MO claims filed and tax classification considerations. Call included N.Flagg, K.Gatt, C. Carpenter, S.Hofner (EY).	1.00	725.00	725.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Tax issues	Call w/ Briggs tax team (S.Rugg, C.Meilahn, L.Kelly, S.Vang) to bankruptcy tax claims resolution process and approach, including analysis of PA, Butler County, MO claims filed and tax classification considerations. Call included N.Flagg, K.Gatt, C. Carpenter, S.Hofner (EY).	1.00	470.00	470.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Tax issues	Call w/ Briggs tax team (S.Rugg, C.Meilahn, L.Kelly, S.Vang) to bankruptcy tax claims resolution process and approach, including analysis of PA, Butler County, MO claims filed and tax classification considerations. Call included N.Flagg, K.Gatt, C. Carpenter, S.Hofner (EY).	1.00	650.00	650.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss litigation claims summary and update	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with G. Giordano (EY) to discuss litigation claims summary and update	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with G. Giordano (EY) to discuss SAPA and disclosure schedule language as it relates to trade payables and accounts payable	0.90	650.00	585.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) to discuss SAPA and disclosure schedule language as it relates to trade payables and accounts payable	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) re: contract rejection damages claims	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) regarding contract rejection damages claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with B&S Claims Swat Team to discuss claim reconciliation issues and status of claims reconciliation process; EY Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	0.10	470.00	47.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/24/2020	Cash Monitoring	Working call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: comparison of disbursements to wind down/waterfall budgets	1.70	650.00	1,105.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Cash Monitoring	Working call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: comparison of disbursements to wind down/waterfall budgets	1.70	795.00	1,351.50
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze and highlight SAPA for relevant language related to excluded liabilities and administrative claims	1.60	470.00	752.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze claims filed with administrative expense claim form to identify amounts asserted duplicative of non-administrative claims	1.10	470.00	517.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze disclosure schedule as it relates to excluded assets and liabilities and the SAPA to assist in determination of claims handling	2.10	470.00	987.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/24/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update Estate cash flow tracker	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with G Gauthier (Briggs) to discuss specific cash transactions in prior week	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Continue to analyze components of NWC summary from LLC	2.90	795.00	2,305.50
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Additional analysis of NWC summary from LLC	2.80	795.00	2,226.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Continue to review time detail in September monthly fee statement to ensure compliance with guidelines	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/24/2020	Tax issues	Email to A Arikat (Weil) regarding IRS pre-petition claim treatment of employment tax deferral and provide claim copy	0.70	850.00	595.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare agenda for claims call with counsel	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Prepare updates to amended schedule exhibits to circulate to KCC	0.60	650.00	390.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/24/2020	Cash Monitoring	Prepare comparison of receipts and disbursements to wind down and the waterfall forecast	2.40	650.00	1,560.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare preliminary summary of administrative expense claims received as of 11/18	1.10	470.00	517.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of claims review process for internal review	0.10	650.00	65.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of claims withdrawn to date	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/24/2020	Cash Monitoring	Prepare summary of pro fee transfers	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/24/2020	Vendor Issues	Prepared new exhibit for cure notice to reflect changes filed on 11/24.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research regarding specified admin claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to environmental settlements included on Statement of Financial Affairs	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research whether specific vendor claim was received by claims agent	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review admin claims filed to date to address questions from counsel	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review budget comparison summary prepared for UCC and correspond with BRG regarding same	0.90	795.00	715.50
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim filed by certain trade vendor to determine non-admin portion asserted	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims included in initial omnibus objection claims to determine updates to the master claims register	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review of amended schedule drafts	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of order regarding rejection of contracts to determine bar date for contract rejection damage claims	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review of schedule updates	0.30	650.00	195.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of selected tax claims	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/24/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review of additional updates related to Schedule Amendments	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review SAPA to determine what liabilities were assumed by buyer for review of administrative expense claims	0.90	650.00	585.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review Schedule E/F amendments prepared by KCC to address intercompany claim revisions	1.30	470.00	611.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/24/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review summary of Schedule E/F intercompany claim amendments	0.90	470.00	423.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/24/2020	Tax issues	Review tax claim listing, review Alabama, Mississippi, Georgia, Pennsylvania, IRS, Denton County, Butler County claims / incorporate claim detail	1.90	725.00	1,377.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/24/2020	Tax issues	Review tax proofs of claim to be discussed on today's call in advance of call	0.70	850.00	595.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	11/24/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update cash flow tracker for week ending 11.20	2.10	650.00	1,365.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update claims issues tracking file	0.40	650.00	260.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register low scenario summary sheets to break out claims in which an objection has been filed with the court.	2.30	470.00	1,081.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register low scenario summary sheets to exclude filed objections from the objections summary.	1.90	470.00	893.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with information provided by reconciliations performed by the company for AP claims.	1.80	470.00	846.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update resolved claims tracking file	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to claims register summaries, including objections for Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC and Briggs & Stratton International, Inc.; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to claims register summaries, including objections for Briggs & Stratton Tech, LLC and Briggs & Stratton International, Inc.; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call with C. Hannon, S. Hofner and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss schedule amendments related to intercompany claims	0.10	470.00	47.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/25/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call with C. Hannon, S. Hofner and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss schedule amendments related to intercompany claims	0.10	650.00	65.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/25/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Call with C. Hannon, S. Hofner and C. Carpenter (EY) to discuss schedule amendments related to intercompany claims	0.10	795.00	79.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze deferred compensation claims filed with administrative expense claim forms to support preparation of admin claims summary	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze pension claims filed with administrative expense claim forms to identify prospective objections	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze tax claims filed with administrative expense claim forms to support preparation of admin claims summary	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze trade claims filed with administrative expense claim forms to identify claims being double-counted	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze workers' compensation claims filed with administrative expense claim forms to identify prospective objections	0.60	470.00	282.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/25/2020	Tax issues	Calculate and respond to A. Arikat (Weil) inquiry on wage amounts related to the IRS claims for employment tax deferral	2.20	850.00	1,870.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/25/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with R Zaidman (BRG) re: performance to date vs. wind down budget	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare correspondence related to amended schedules to forward to counsel for review	0.70	650.00	455.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of open questions for preparation of administrative expense claims summary	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare revised summary of administrative expense claims filed as of 11/18	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/25/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Reconciliation of amended Schedule EF drafts received to forward to counsel for review	1.80	650.00	1,170.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of 503(b)(9) claim inquiry	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of creditor claim inquiries	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to amended schedule items with respect to intercompany claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review amendments to the claim scheduled for Billy Goat Industries, Inc.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/25/2020	Tax issues	Review bankruptcy tax claims best practices email to Briggs team	0.70	725.00	507.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim register updates related to filed omnibus objections	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/25/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review draft amended schedules EF proposed for filing	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/25/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of new claims filed received from KCC; identification and categorization of new claims	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/25/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update performance to date vs. wind down budget summary in response to request from UCC	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/29/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze new claims provided by KCC on 11/24 for incorporation in master claims register	1.30	470.00	611.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/29/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between filed claims provided by KCC on 11/24 and scheduled claims	1.20	470.00	564.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/29/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze filed claims amended by claims provided on 11/24	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/29/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise court claim numbers in master claims register to include 11/24 updates from KCC	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/29/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between filed administrative expense claims provided by KCC on 11/24 and prior non-admin filed claims	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss consolidated and debtor-level claim scenario summaries and next steps; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	650.00	455.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss consolidated and debtor-level claim scenario summaries and next steps; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss consolidated and debtor-level claim scenario summaries and next steps; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss preliminary draft administrative expense claims summary and claim-specific questions; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	1.00	650.00	650.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss preliminary draft administrative expense claims summary and claim-specific questions; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	1.00	470.00	470.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss claims review progress and outstanding items. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), G. Giordano(EY), T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	650.00	130.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss claims review progress and outstanding items. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), G. Giordano(EY), T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss claims review progress and outstanding items. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), G. Giordano(EY), T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	795.00	159.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss claims review progress and outstanding items. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), G. Giordano(EY), T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	470.00	94.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss progress of updating claims register. Participants include T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	650.00	65.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss progress of updating claims register. Participants include T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	470.00	47.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Additional analysis of NWC detail from LLC	2.20	795.00	1,749.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/30/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze specific vendor numbers and source data to assist the company with cure payment processing and validation	1.70	470.00	799.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Cash Monitoring	Correspondence with K Buono and G Gauthier (Briggs) re: pro fees due for payment in current week and associated escrow account transfers	0.60	795.00	477.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Prepare summary proposal for Final Purchase Price and Escrow release amounts to present to Buyer	0.40	795.00	318.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Distribute follow up action items to B&S Swat team members to finalize certain trade claim reviews	2.30	650.00	1,495.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	11/30/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft updated critical vendor and shippers/ warehousemen payment matrices for the month of November	2.10	470.00	987.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	11/30/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Draft list of contracts and statuses per request from Weil.	1.30	470.00	611.00
Sobers,Linsay	Staff	11/30/2020	Tax issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY)	0.30	300.00	90.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/30/2020	Tax issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY)	0.30	850.00	255.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Tax issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY)	0.30	725.00	217.50
Risman,Alexander Harrison	Senior	11/30/2020	Tax issues	EY team call to discuss Briggs open tax items and next steps required to address. Attendees: K. Gatt, N. Flagg, A. Risman and L. Sobers (EY)	0.30	475.00	142.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Participate in call with B Marks (HL) re: NWC summary from LLC	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Participate in call with R Zaidman (BRG) re: NWC summary from LLC	0.10	795.00	79.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare footnotes for summary of administrative expense claims filed through the administrative bar date	1.30	470.00	611.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare initial list of claims with insufficient support to be reviewed by the Company prior to objections	0.90	470.00	423.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare response to M. Rodriquez(B&S) regarding request for specific vendor claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of administrative expense claims filed through the administrative bar date	1.30	470.00	611.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Cash Monitoring	Prepare summary update on disbursements vs. wind down budget and correspond with Weil regarding same	0.60	795.00	477.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel for specific vendor	0.50	745.00	372.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims filed with both administrative expense and non-administrative claim forms	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims high and low scenario summaries to identify updates needed	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review employee census to identify additional data needed from the Company for claims reconciliation	0.70	470.00	329.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review LLC's TSA invoice and supporting documentation	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of admin claims received and related summary report of claim exposure	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of various claim summary reports to discuss adjustments to claims reconciliation progress reporting	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review summary of Admin Claims filed	0.80	795.00	636.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review trade claims action items file	1.70	650.00	1,105.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	11/30/2020	Tax issues	Review updated property tax payment spreadsheet from C. Meilhan (Briggs) and comment	0.70	850.00	595.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to include filed claims provided by KCC on 11/24	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise scheduled-only claims population to include additional matches with filed claims received 11/24	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update due to/due from analysis and correspond with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: queries on transactions	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register for claims included in omnibus objections.	2.60	470.00	1,222.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register summary sheets to remove double counting of omnibus objections in objections summary.	2.10	470.00	987.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with information provided by reconciliations performed by the company for AP claims.	2.90	470.00	1,363.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/30/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update professional fee schedule and correspond with advisors regarding objections	2.60	795.00	2,067.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	11/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update resolved claims tracking file.	2.60	650.00	1,690.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/3/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Review slides in preparation for BOD meeting	0.50	940.00	470.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/3/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Attend Board of Directors meeting	0.70	940.00	658.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/6/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review updated draft of Disclosure Statement	1.90	940.00	1,786.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/9/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) court hearing for Disclosure Statement	0.90	940.00	846.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/12/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) court hearing for Notice of Satisfied Claims	0.40	940.00	376.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review objections and declaration drafts for 11/16 filing	1.90	940.00	1,786.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/16/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review draft of Monthly Operating Report	0.90	940.00	846.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/18/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) Court hearing re: early 503(b)(9) and lifting stay re: certain asbestos and insurance proceedings	1.20	940.00	1,128.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/24/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Review summary analysis of NWC adjustment from LLC	1.40	940.00	1,316.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	11/24/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review summary of cash performance vs. wind down budget for UCC	0.60	940.00	564.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/2/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review the September detail	3.30	275.00	907.50
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/3/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Continue to review the September detail	2.60	275.00	715.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/4/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review additional detail for the September application	1.90	275.00	522.50
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/4/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Call with J. Porepa (EY), D Neziroski (EY), and C. Hannon (EY) regarding updates to the September application	1.00	275.00	275.00
Porepa,Jodi	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Call with J. Porepa (EY), D Neziroski (EY), and C. Hannon (EY) regarding updates to the September application	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	11/4/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Call with J. Porepa (EY), D Neziroski (EY), and C. Hannon (EY) regarding updates to the September application	0.50	795.00	397.50
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/5/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Prepare September application	3.60	275.00	990.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/6/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Make additional changes to the September monthly application	1.70	275.00	467.50
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/16/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Check email for October time detail submitted for Brigs and add to file	0.80	275.00	220.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/16/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review October detail	0.80	275.00	220.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/17/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Continue to review the October detail	2.30	275.00	632.50
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/18/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review October detail for the monthly application	3.20	275.00	880.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	11/19/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review additional detail received for the October monthly application	2.90	275.00	797.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Cash Monitoring	Additional updates to due to/due from analysis based on additional transaction information	1.20	795.00	954.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze additional filed litigation claims provided by KCC	0.60	470.00	282.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze approved claim amounts for specific vendors and ensure the proper backup for each is available to the company	1.60	470.00	752.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/1/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update cash flow tracker	0.70	650.00	455.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze IRS claims and preliminary decisions related to pre petition employment tax deferral	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze list of litigation claims provided to counsel	1.10	470.00	517.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze specific vendor claim follow up received by EY vendor management team from the company	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims, reduced scheduled claims, and ongoing review of filed claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims, reduced scheduled claims, and ongoing review of filed claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims, reduced scheduled claims, and ongoing review of filed claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims, reduced scheduled claims, and ongoing review of filed claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims, reduced scheduled claims, and ongoing review of filed claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims, reduced scheduled claims, and ongoing review of filed claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims, reduced scheduled claims, and ongoing review of filed claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss admin claims, reduced scheduled claims, and ongoing review of filed claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	795.00	238.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss employee claims filed with administrative expense claim forms; Participants: J. Granell (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss employee claims filed with administrative expense claim forms; Participants: J. Granell (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss list of reduced scheduled-only claim invoices for the Company to reconcile; Participants: J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss list of reduced scheduled-only claim invoices for the Company to reconcile; Participants: J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss review of administrative expense claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss review of administrative expense claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register and draft summary of administrative expense claims Participants: C. Hannon (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY). Left early	0.60	650.00	390.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register and draft summary of administrative expense claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register and draft summary of administrative expense claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register and draft summary of administrative expense claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	795.00	556.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register and draft summary of administrative expense claims; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	650.00	455.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), J. Granell (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: payroll reconciliation	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: payroll reconciliation	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/1/2020	Vendor Issues	Correspond with A. Golvach (Briggs) regarding cure payment amounts and supporting information.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/1/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Draft correspondence to the company relaying latest cure exhibit and changes since the previously fired version	0.70	470.00	329.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/1/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Draft correspondence with the company's cure payment team to provide certain requested vendor agreements and amendments	0.50	470.00	235.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call J Henrich (EY), J Granell (EY) re: employee related claims status update	0.70	650.00	455.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call J Henrich (EY), J Granell (EY) re: employee related claims status update	0.70	795.00	556.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss PBGC's assumption of pensions. Participants include S. Hofner(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss PBGC's assumption of pensions. Participants include S. Hofner(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims register. Participants include J. Granell(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims register. Participants include J. Granell(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims register. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.10	470.00	47.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of claims register. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of invoice payment confirmation with D. Stringham(B&S), L. Pokorny(B&S)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of open items for call with Weil to discuss claims and case management deadlines	0.90	650.00	585.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of filed administrative expense claims for counsel	0.90	470.00	423.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review admin expense claim filed by specific vendor	0.40	650.00	260.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel	0.40	745.00	298.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Debtor's Administrative Expense motion.	0.90	650.00	585.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Initial review of employee claims "Batch 1" from P. Prickett (Briggs) review	1.20	795.00	954.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Initial review of employee claims "Batch 2" from P. Prickett (Briggs) review	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review employee claims master file and related detail	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of admin claims summary and detail reports prior to circulation to counsel	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of employee census files to compile master roster	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of selected admin claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated Admin Claims summary and specific claim forms	1.10	795.00	874.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review sections 503 and 507 of bankruptcy code to determine claims qualifying for administrative expense status	0.80	650.00	520.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review SERP claims backup detail file	0.80	795.00	636.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review settled litigation claims	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise administrative expense claim summary to include additional prospective employee claim objections	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with information provided by reconciliations performed by the company for AP claims.	7.30	470.00	3,431.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master registry for employee related claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/1/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update schedule of invoices supporting scheduled only claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/1/2020	Tax Issues	Correspondence with counsel regarding sales and use tax reviews for EstateCo	0.40	850.00	340.00
Wetherington,Trevor T	Executive Director	12/1/2020	Tax Issues	Draft and send email re: modifications that should be made to client's draft claim.	0.20	850.00	170.00
Puechner,Shawn P.	Partner/Principal	12/1/2020	Tax Issues	EY tax team call with S. Rugg (Briggs) to review 1120X carryback form filing methodology and Request For Prompt Refund Cover letter; Briggs attendee: S. Rugg; EY attendees: N. Flagg, K. Gatt, S. Puechner, T. Wetherington (EY)	0.50	900.00	450.00
Wetherington,Trevor T	Executive Director	12/1/2020	Tax Issues	EY tax team call with S. Rugg (Briggs) to review 1120X carryback form filing methodology and Request For Prompt Refund Cover letter; Briggs attendee: S. Rugg; EY attendees: N. Flagg, K. Gatt, S. Puechner, T. Wetherington (EY)	0.50	850.00	425.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/1/2020	Tax Issues	EY tax team call with S. Rugg (Briggs) to review 1120X carryback form filing methodology and Request For Prompt Refund Cover letter; Briggs attendee: S. Rugg; EY attendees: N. Flagg, K. Gatt, S. Puechner, T. Wetherington (EY)	0.50	850.00	425.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	12/1/2020	Tax Issues	EY tax team call with S. Rugg (Briggs) to review 1120X carryback form filing methodology and Request For Prompt Refund Cover letter; Briggs attendee: S. Rugg; EY attendees: N. Flagg, K. Gatt, S. Puechner, T. Wetherington (EY)	0.50	725.00	362.50
Wetherington,Trevor T	Executive Director	12/1/2020	Tax Issues	Research question of proper procedure to submit claim to IRS on behalf of estate, focussing on Rev Proc. 2010-27 andf IRS bankruptcy publication 908,	0.50	850.00	425.00
Wetherington,Trevor T	Executive Director	12/1/2020	Tax Issues	Review draft Form 1102X and accompanying letter	0.20	850.00	170.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	12/1/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Prepare the October monthly application	1.30	275.00	357.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/2/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze Assumption Schedule	0.50	650.00	325.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze due to and due from amounts between LLC and the Estate	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze filed litigation claims to determine next steps for reconciliation	0.70	470.00	329.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin analysis of preliminary grouping of administrative claims filed against the company	1.90	470.00	893.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims received; Participants: J. Ficks, J. Henrich, C. Hannon, S. Hofner, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G. Giordano, and C. Carpenter (EY); J. Myers, M. Martir and E. Blechman (Weil); and B. Marks (Houlihan)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims received; Participants: J. Ficks, J. Henrich, C. Hannon, S. Hofner, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G. Giordano, and C. Carpenter (EY); J. Myers, M. Martir and E. Blechman (Weil); and B. Marks (Houlihan)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims received; Participants: J. Ficks, J. Henrich, C. Hannon, S. Hofner, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G. Giordano, and C. Carpenter (EY); J. Myers, M. Martir and E. Blechman (Weil); and B. Marks (Houlihan)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims received; Participants: J. Ficks, J. Henrich, C. Hannon, S. Hofner, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G. Giordano, and C. Carpenter (EY); J. Myers, M. Martir and E. Blechman (Weil); and B. Marks (Houlihan)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims received; Participants: J. Ficks, J. Henrich, C. Hannon, S. Hofner, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G. Giordano, and C. Carpenter (EY); J. Myers, M. Martir and E. Blechman (Weil); and B. Marks (Houlihan)	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims received; Participants: J. Ficks, J. Henrich, C. Hannon, S. Hofner, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G. Giordano, and C. Carpenter (EY); J. Myers, M. Martir and E. Blechman (Weil); and B. Marks (Houlihan)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims received; Participants: J. Ficks, J. Henrich, C. Hannon, S. Hofner, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G. Giordano, and C. Carpenter (EY); J. Myers, M. Martir and E. Blechman (Weil); and B. Marks (Houlihan)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims received; Participants: J. Ficks, J. Henrich, C. Hannon, S. Hofner, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G. Giordano, and C. Carpenter (EY); J. Myers, M. Martir and E. Blechman (Weil); and B. Marks (Houlihan)	0.60	795.00	477.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process, including Schedule amendments and admin claims received; Participants: J. Ficks, J. Henrich, C. Hannon, S. Hofner, J. Silverwood, J. Granell, T. Bradley, G. Giordano, and C. Carpenter (EY); J. Myers, M. Martir and E. Blechman (Weil); and B. Marks (Houlihan)	0.60	940.00	564.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss specific trade creditor issues to be resolved by company personnel; Participants: J. Silverwood, T. Bradley, C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss specific trade creditor issues to be resolved by company personnel; Participants: J. Silverwood, T. Bradley, C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss specific trade creditor issues to be resolved by company personnel; Participants: J. Silverwood, T. Bradley, C. Carpenter (EY) (Partial Attendance)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: return of LC cash collateral	0.10	795.00	79.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/2/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: cash update and contracts to be assumed	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: cash update and contracts to be assumed	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: utility deposits	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: utility deposits	0.30	795.00	238.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Carpenter, C Hannon (EY) re: admin claims summaries	0.30	470.00	141.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Carpenter, C Hannon (EY) re: admin claims summaries	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Carpenter, C Hannon (EY) re: admin claims summaries	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) re: admin claims summaries and comparison to full claims listing	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) re: admin claims summaries and comparison to full claims listing	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Continue preparation of open claim issues list for Weil to circulate for review and response	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Emails with A Golvach and G Gauthier (Briggs) re: return of LC cash collateral	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Emails with K Buono (Briggs) re: amended schedules for intercompany updates	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Follow-up related to amended schedules with K. Buono (Briggs)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Locate specific vendor trade claims to provide to company	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss recording of intercompany payables. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), and J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	795.00	159.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss recording of intercompany payables. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), and J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	650.00	130.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of updating claims register for trade payable claims and review of administrative expense claims. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY), G. Giordano	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of updating claims register for trade payable claims and review of administrative expense claims. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY), G. Giordano	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of updating claims register for trade payable claims and review of administrative expense claims. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY), G. Giordano(EY)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: update on case matters and next steps	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Meetings with management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: update on case matters and next steps	0.50	795.00	397.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: update on case matters and next steps	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) regarding update on case matters and next steps.	0.50	650.00	325.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Wind down Activities	Participate in call with P. Langelin (Briggs) re: accounting systems needed for the Estate	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Perform docket review to locate claim transfers and withdrawals	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Preparation of amended schedule files and forwarded to K. Buono (Briggs) for review	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for claims call with counsel; review of claims register and identification of key issues for discussion	1.20	650.00	780.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of administrative claims filed with general claim forms that are being reconciled	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/2/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare list of all contracts, current, and historical cure dispositions for KPS to use for future cure notice updates.	2.80	470.00	1,316.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Meetings with management	Prepare summary information for update call with K Buono (Briggs) and Weil	1.10	795.00	874.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of all administrative claims filed to date, including general and admin. expense claim forms	1.40	470.00	658.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Reconcile balance of cash collateral returned to Estate	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/2/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research contracts poised for assumption by estate and added document IDs where appropriate.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review administrative claims filed on administrative expense claim forms	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review administrative claims filed on general claim forms	1.40	470.00	658.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review amended Schedules and provide comments	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's conclusions for batch of trade claims within claims register for accuracy and reasonableness	1.50	650.00	975.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review contract assumption file provided by Weil	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review late-filed claims in advance of call with counsel	0.40	470.00	188.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest claims estimate summaries and supporting detail	1.20	795.00	954.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of revised admin claim file incorporating all admin components of filed claims to review claim exposure	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review population of claims filed after the general bar date	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review specified trade claims to determine next steps for reconciliation	0.90	470.00	423.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review vendor payment history to identify any payments made to select intercompany accounts	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise database in master claims register for preparation of additional claim summaries	1.10	470.00	517.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update calendar / milestones document to include additional/updated court related deadlines / process timeline to be distributed among stakeholders.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update litigation claims summary for comments received from EY team on 12/2	1.30	470.00	611.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with information provided by reconciliations performed by the company for AP claims.	6.40	470.00	3,008.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update post sale unwind for items discussed with C. Hannon	0.60	650.00	390.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/2/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update post sale unwind receipts and disbursements for week ending 11.20	2.10	650.00	1,365.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/2/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master registry for employee related claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/2/2020	Tax Issues	Email to A. Arikat (Weil) to request guidance on filing process for 1120X return with Request for Prompt Refund	0.90	850.00	765.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/2/2020	Tax Issues	Draft response to S. Rugg (Briggs) on Georgia Jobs Tax Credit question	0.60	850.00	510.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/2/2020	Tax Issues	Prepare response to C. Meilhan (Briggs) on Missouri Poplar Bluff property tax payment timing	0.50	850.00	425.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	12/2/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Continue to prepare the October monthly application	3.40	275.00	935.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze and update employee related claims	2.70	650.00	1,755.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze AP and add outstanding AP balances to estate assumption notice per request from Weil.	2.30	470.00	1,081.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze creditor-specific inquiry to determine correct liability	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze latest company provided cure payment data and update summary file accordingly	1.30	470.00	611.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/3/2020	Financial Analysis	Analyze latest pre and post-petition accounts payable received from the company on 12/3	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including admin claims summary, reconciliation progress to date and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.70	795.00	556.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including admin claims summary, reconciliation progress to date and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including admin claims summary, reconciliation progress to date and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.70	650.00	455.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including admin claims summary, reconciliation progress to date and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.70	650.00	455.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including admin claims summary, reconciliation progress to date and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.70	795.00	556.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including admin claims summary, reconciliation progress to date and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including admin claims summary, reconciliation progress to date and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including admin claims summary, reconciliation progress to date and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register; Participants: J. Granell (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to the master claims register; Participants: J. Granell (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: select contracts proposed for assumption by the Estate	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: select contracts proposed for assumption by the Estate	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: updated contract assumption schedule for filing	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: updated contract assumption schedule for filing	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) and S. Hofner (EY) regarding documentation related to additional partially satisfied scheduled claims.	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) and S. Hofner (EY) regarding documentation related to additional partially satisfied scheduled claims.	0.30	650.00	195.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir, C Luster, A Fliman (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, J Hess (EY) re: contracts to be assumed by the Estate	1.00	650.00	650.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir, C Luster, A Fliman (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, J Hess (EY) re: contracts to be assumed by the Estate	1.00	795.00	795.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir, C Luster, A Fliman (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, J Hess (EY) re: contracts to be assumed by the Estate	1.00	470.00	470.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir, C Luster, A Fliman (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, J Hess (EY) re: contracts to be assumed by the Estate	1.00	795.00	795.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with P Prickett (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, J Hess (EY) re: HR related contracts to be assumed by the Estate	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with P Prickett (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, J Hess (EY) re: HR related contracts to be assumed by the Estate	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with P Prickett (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, J Hess (EY) re: HR related contracts to be assumed by the Estate	0.40	470.00	188.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with P Prickett (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, J Hess (EY) re: HR related contracts to be assumed by the Estate	0.40	795.00	318.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete analysis of preliminary grouping of administrative claims filed against the company	2.10	470.00	987.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Correspond with company regarding contracts to be added to OnBase.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Detailed review of HR related contracts in potential assumption list	2.40	795.00	1,908.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Draft list of contracts to be assumed by estate per direction from company.	2.10	470.00	987.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prep for call with K Buono (Briggs) to discuss contracts to be assumed by the Estate	0.30	650.00	195.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prep for call with P Prickett (Briggs) to discuss HR related contracts to be assumed by the Estate	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of creditor claim inquiries received by KCC	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research specific contracts in OnBase per request from counsel	0.40	470.00	188.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review and provide edits to contract assumption schedule	2.20	795.00	1,749.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim transfer provided by KCC	0.40	470.00	188.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel	0.70	745.00	521.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register for trade claims to ensure	2.00	650.00	1,300.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register for updated trade claims information	1.80	650.00	1,170.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company analysis of scheduled invoices partially satisfied by payment	0.40	795.00	318.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's conclusions for batch of trade claims within claims register for accuracy and reasonableness	2.20	650.00	1,430.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review draft Estate contract assumption exhibit and make amendments	0.70	795.00	556.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review employee claim updates incorporated in master claims register	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review estate assumption contract listing and group into diffemet categories in order to analyze outstanding payables.	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of admin claim breakdown and waterfall to identify claim exposure and amounts to be further reconciled	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of claim reconciliation documentation received for selected claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of invoice documentation related to partially satisfied scheduled claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review of sample declarations provided by counsel to facilitate review/edit of declaration of J. Ficks in support of confirmation	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/3/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review of voting report received from claims agent	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review omnibus updates incorporated in master claims register	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review schedule of invoices company has paid which satisfy scheduled claims	1.00	650.00	650.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review select contracts proposed for assumption by the Estate in advance of call with Briggs and Weil	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review summary analysis of admin claims filed under admin form vs. other admin claims filed	0.80	795.00	636.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review trade claim updates incorporated in master claims register	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updates for KCC regarding claim-specific admin. amount	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review vendor-specific balances in latest AP aging to identify creditor-specific liabilities	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Vendor Issues	Transform and format listing of employee agreements for cure notice.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Update draft of contracts to be assumed per additional direction from Weil.	1.00	470.00	470.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register to include omnibus objection IDs for claims that were included in omnibus objections.	1.70	470.00	799.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/3/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with information provided by reconciliations performed by the company for AP claims.	2.30	470.00	1,081.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Cash Monitoring	Working call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: review and edit contracts list proposed for assumption by the Estate following meetings throughout the day	1.10	795.00	874.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/3/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Working call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: review and edit contracts list proposed for assumption by the Estate following meetings throughout the day	1.10	795.00	874.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/3/2020	Tax Issues	Email to C. Hannon (EY) to inquire about Section 1129 language in Plan of Liquidation and whether property tax payments should be paid in full or installments	0.70	850.00	595.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/3/2020	Tax Issues	Email to P. Naumoff (EY) for GA Jobs Tax Credit information requested by Briggs S. Rugg	0.30	850.00	255.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/3/2020	Tax Issues	Prepare response Briggs C. Meilhan (Briggs) on Missouri Poplar Bluff property tax potential installment payment per potential Section 1129 language in Plan	0.60	850.00	510.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/3/2020	Tax Issues	Property tax payment follow-up with C. Hannon (EY) regarding Poplar Bluff Missouri	0.30	850.00	255.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/3/2020	Tax Issues	Receive Amended Plan Draft from C. Hannon (EY) and review for Section 1129 language	0.60	850.00	510.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/3/2020	Tax Issues	Request wage info from C. Wojtak (Briggs) in support of pre-petition employment tax deferrals	0.60	850.00	510.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	12/3/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Amend the October application	2.90	275.00	797.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analysis of specific invoices to determine appropriate cure cost treatment	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with B Olsson (Briggs) and C Hannon (EY) re: specific IT vendor cure cost and contract	0.20	795.00	159.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J Granell (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: updated info for MOR	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J Granell (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: updated info for MOR	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: 401k payment plan	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: 401k payment plan	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: contract assumption exhibit updates	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: contract assumption exhibit updates	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: contract assumption list	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: contract assumption list	0.30	795.00	238.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY) to discuss employee priority claims in order to prepare for call with Briggs	0.20	650.00	130.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY) to discuss employee priority claims in order to prepare for call with Briggs	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Myers (Weil) to discuss amended schedules	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with M Martir (Weil) and J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: specific vendor contract assumption	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with M Martir (Weil) and J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: specific vendor contract assumption	0.20	795.00	159.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with P Prickett (Briggs), J Henrich (EY), J Granell (EY) re: employee claim reconciliation	0.60	650.00	390.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with P Prickett (Briggs), J Henrich (EY), J Granell (EY) re: employee claim reconciliation	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/4/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Continue to review sample declarations provided by counsel to help review/edit declaration of J. Ficks in support of confirmation	0.60	650.00	390.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Detail review of latest AP Aging	2.30	795.00	1,828.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Document claims requiring further support to substantiate disallowed conclusions	2.30	650.00	1,495.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft and send correspondence to company contacts in preparation for drafting the November MOR attestation and questionnaire	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft and send correspondence to company contacts in preparation for updating MOR-1a for November	0.50	470.00	235.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft correspondence to company contacts in preparation for drafting the financial statements in the November MOR	0.50	470.00	235.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Email communication with R. Zaidman (BRG) re: questions on cure costs	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/4/2020	Vendor Issues	Make additional updates to cure notice.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Meeting with M. Martir and C. Luster (Weil), K. Lemke (BASCO), C. Hannon (EY) and J. Hess (EY) to discuss future KPS assumption notice. (Partial Attendance)	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Meeting with M. Martir and C. Luster (Weil), K. Lemke (BASCO), C. Hannon (EY) and J. Hess (EY) to discuss future KPS assumption notice.	0.70	470.00	329.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with C. Carpenter (EY) and J. Siverwood (EY) to discuss progress of claims review	0.10	650.00	65.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with C. Carpenter (EY) and J. Siverwood (EY) to discuss progress of claims review	0.10	470.00	47.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with J. Silverwood (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss progress of claims review	0.10	650.00	65.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with J. Silverwood (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss progress of claims review	0.10	470.00	47.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with M. Rodriguez (B&S) to discuss claims reviewed	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of draft exhibit related to additionally partially satisfied scheduled only claims	2.10	650.00	1,365.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of finalized versions of amended schedules for filing; circulation to counsel for final review and filing	0.40	650.00	260.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call with Briggs to discuss specific employee related claims	0.50	650.00	325.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare redline of changes from previous draft of contract assumption notice to current.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Prepare summary of Bank balances and pro fee accruals for the month of November	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary overview of trade claims reviewed to date	2.00	650.00	1,300.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research contract in OnBase per request from counsel.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research contract per request from Weil.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and categorization of new claims received for incorporation in claims register	0.60	650.00	390.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review and provide edits to amended contract assumption schedule	1.10	795.00	874.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review claims register updates	1.20	795.00	954.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review company's conclusions for select claims to ensure conclusion is accurate and substantiated	3.00	650.00	1,950.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review contracts of specific vendor to determine which contract cure amount should fall under and whether Estate must assume that specific contract	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review correspondence with Briggs re: specific IT vendor contracts for assumption/assignment and correspond with B Olsson (Briggs) re: queries on same	0.30	795.00	238.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft notice of amended Schedules prepared by Weil	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review notice of amendment to schedules E/F	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/4/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review of Disclosure Statement order and Plan to review guidelines with respect to voting, claims and distributions	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/4/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review of Notice of Amendment to schedules to provide comments/feedback to counsel	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of selected admin claims for estimated outstanding claims population	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review of updated bank balance info and fee accrual for MOR update	0.70	795.00	556.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review 'other' claims falling into the trade payable category on the claims register to discuss next steps	1.40	470.00	658.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review specific employee claim and detailed backup	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review updated contract assumption exhibit and amendments to prior version	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/4/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Update draft of estate assumption contracts with additional changes per discussions with company.	1.20	470.00	564.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/4/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims registry to reflect discussions with P. Prickett (Briggs)	1.40	650.00	910.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/4/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update MOR template to include latest bank balance information for the month of November	1.10	470.00	517.00
Puechner,Shawn P.	Partner/Principal	12/4/2020	Tax Issues	Edit existing agreements to be approved by Plan Administrator for ongoing indirect tax work	0.50	900.00	450.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/4/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner, JD Sammons, M. Halloran, and N. Flagg (EY) regarding Tax open items	0.50	850.00	425.00
Sammons,John David	Senior Manager	12/4/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner, JD Sammons, M. Halloran, and N. Flagg (EY) regarding Tax open items	0.50	725.00	362.50
Puechner,Shawn P.	Partner/Principal	12/4/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner, JD Sammons, M. Halloran, and N. Flagg (EY) regarding Tax open items	0.50	900.00	450.00
Halloran,Michael	Partner/Principal	12/4/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner, JD Sammons, M. Halloran, and N. Flagg (EY) regarding Tax open items	0.50	900.00	450.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	12/4/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Make additional amendments to the October application.	2.10	275.00	577.50
Neziroski,David	Staff	12/4/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Begin to prepare the interim application	3.40	275.00	935.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/5/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review final October fee application	2.30	795.00	1,828.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze employee related claims.	2.10	650.00	1,365.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze insurance-related claims filed to date to determine next steps for reconciliation	1.20	470.00	564.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/7/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze latest company provided cure payment data and update summary file accordingly with payments through 12/4	2.10	470.00	987.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between filed claims provided by KCC on 12/4 and scheduled claims	0.90	470.00	423.00



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/7/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze specific vendor questions for company management related to cure payments	0.90	470.00	423.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin review of insurer claims against the company	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and open items; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and open items; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.70	650.00	455.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss other trade payable claims and next steps	0.10	470.00	47.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss other trade payable claims and next steps	0.10	650.00	65.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss reconciliation of trade claims and specified claims with 503(b)(9) and reclamation assertion components	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood (EY) and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss reconciliation of trade claims and specified claims with 503(b)(9) and reclamation assertion components	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/7/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Build up schedule of AP invoices for specific vendor to assist with cure payment.	1.10	470.00	517.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/7/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Make additional updates to listing of contracts to be assumed by the Estate per counsel's request.	0.70	470.00	329.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss reconciliation of select vendor's claim. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.30	650.00	195.00
Tajuddin, Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss reconciliation of select vendor's claim. Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.30	745.00	223.50
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss updates to claims register. Participants include C. Carpenter(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	470.00	47.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss updates to claims register. Participants include C. Carpenter(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	650.00	65.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss updates to claims register. Participants include T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	470.00	94.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss updates to claims register. Participants include T. Bradley(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare master list of insurance-related claims to be reconciled	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to administrative claim with reclamation component	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research related to executory contracts for specific vendor	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/7/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research specific contract per request from the claims administration team.	1.20	470.00	564.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review batch one of employee claims reviewed by P. Prickett (Briggs)	2.80	795.00	2,226.00
Tajuddin, Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel	0.60	745.00	447.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review KCC's plan voting report as of 12/4	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review new claims provided by KCC on 12/4	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review objection of party providing litigation/workers comp bonds	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of claims reconciliation status for selected claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	SOFA & SOALS	Review of Notice of Schedule Amendments and complete Amended Schedule E/F for B&S Corp, Billy Goat, B&S International, and B&S Tech	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review of Plan Supplement to review Plan Administrator Agreement and schedule of assumed contracts	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of status of select insurance claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated claims report and insurance claims report	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of voting report received from claims agent	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated claims register analysis and specific vendor claim	1.70	795.00	1,351.50
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/7/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review updated exhibit for contracts to be assumed by estate and adjustments for specific IT vendor	0.40	795.00	318.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to include additional claims provided by KCC on 12/4	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to include new court claim numbers provided by KCC on 12/4	0.30	470.00	141.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to include preliminary objections to specified insurance claims	1.10	470.00	517.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with information provided by reconciliations performed by the company for AP claims.	1.80	470.00	846.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/7/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update Estate cash flow tracker file	0.80	650.00	520.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	12/7/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Begin to compile the detail for the November monthly application	3.40	275.00	935.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze Professional Fees Payable	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze vendor-specific stipulation to determine impact on claims	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation progress and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation progress and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation progress and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation progress and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation progress and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation progress and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation progress and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation progress and outstanding items; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/8/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with B Marks (HL) re: fee payments timing and applications	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: voting update from KCC	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: voting update from KCC	0.20	650.00	130.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review of insurer claims against the company	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspondence with counsel related to solicitation process and voting related to unsecured notes	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspondence with KCC regarding voting reports received and ballots for selected claimants	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss claims register and claims reconciliation. Participants include C. Carpenter(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	470.00	94.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss claims register and claims reconciliation. Participants include C. Carpenter(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	650.00	130.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss post petition payment of certain vendor's invoices (Slidematic). Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	650.00	65.00
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss postpetition payment of certain vendor's invoices (Slidematic). Participants include S. Tajuddin(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	745.00	74.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to PBGC ballots	0.20	650.00	130.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/8/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research Sears contracts per request from counsel.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review additional claim transfer filed for updates to claims register	0.20	470.00	94.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review batch two of employee claims reviewed by P. Prickett (Briggs)	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12/8/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel	0.20	745.00	149.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review communications relating to specific vendor's claim reconciliation	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of docket to locate stipulations and claim withdrawals	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of selected claims to determine proposed treatment	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of voting report received from claims agent	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/8/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Plan voting report as of 12/08	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/8/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update cash flow information for MOR-1 to include latest payroll cash disbursements by entity for the month of November	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/8/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update due to/due from analysis and correspondence with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: specific transactions	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/8/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update Monthly Operating Report for November	0.80	650.00	520.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/8/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update MOR-2 to include the latest income statement received from the company's finance team	0.60	470.00	282.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/8/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update MOR-3 to include the latest balance sheet received from the company's finance team for November MOR	0.70	470.00	329.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/8/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update Notes to MOR-2 to include the latest income statement support received from the company's finance team	0.50	470.00	235.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/8/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update Notes to MOR-3 to include the latest income statement support received from the company's finance team for November MOR	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/8/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update professional fee schedule and correspond with advisors regarding objections	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	12/8/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Continue to work on the interim fee application	1.00	275.00	275.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analysis of updated cash flow information and comparison to wind down/waterfall budgets	0.90	795.00	715.50
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and analyze employee related claims.	1.00	650.00	650.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update cash flow tracker	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J Granel (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: MOR cash reconciliation	0.80	795.00	636.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/9/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J Granel (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: MOR cash reconciliation	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Granel (EY), C Hannon (EY) to review updated cash flow analysis	0.50	795.00	397.50
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Granel (EY), C Hannon (EY) to review updated cash flow analysis	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: litigation/workers comp bonds objection and claims	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich (EY), C Hannon (EY) re: litigation/workers comp bonds objection and claims	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: pro fee payments	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: pro fee payments	0.20	795.00	159.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/9/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J. Granel (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss cash data for November MOR	0.40	470.00	188.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/9/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Call with J. Granel (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to discuss cash data for November MOR	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with R Berkovich, A Fliman, A Paddock, E Berdini (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Ficks (EY) re: Zurich objection	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with R Berkovich, A Fliman, A Paddock, E Berdini (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Ficks (EY) re: Zurich objection	0.20	795.00	159.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with R Berkovich, A Fliman, A Paddock, E Berdini (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Ficks (EY) re: Zurich objection	0.20	940.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) re: outstanding claims issues to be addressed	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/9/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) regarding outstanding claims issues to be addressed	0.30	650.00	195.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review and provide comments to interim fee application	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Finalize draft open items list	0.30	650.00	195.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss reconciliation of significant decreases in filed versus allowed claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss reconciliation of significant decreases in filed versus allowed claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Meetings with management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman, S Margolis (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: update on case matters, voting and next steps	0.50	795.00	397.50
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman, S Margolis (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: update on case matters, voting and next steps	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/9/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman, S Margolis (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) regarding update on case matters, voting and next steps	0.50	650.00	325.00
Ficks, Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	12/9/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman, S Margolis (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) regarding update on case matters, voting and next steps	0.50	940.00	470.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/9/2020	Meetings with Management	Participate in call with K Buono (Briggs), D Hoehne, M Martir, E Blechman, S Margolis (Weil), C Hannon, J Ficks, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) regarding update on case matters, voting and next steps	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of comprehensive open claim issues and agenda items to discuss with Plan Administrator	1.90	650.00	1,235.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Meetings with management	Preparation of summary materials for update call with K Buono (Briggs)	1.10	795.00	874.50
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare consolidated low scenario claim summary by claim type for weekly call with the Debtors	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare consolidated low scenario claim summary by entity for weekly call with the Debtors	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hess, Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/9/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare latest vendor master with master mappings included per request from claims team.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/9/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Prepare summary of November receipts and disbursements (including payroll by department) for the Monthly Operating Report	1.30	650.00	845.00
Tajuddin, Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel	0.20	745.00	149.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review draft MOR for November	1.10	795.00	874.50
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review information and related research in preparation of specific vendor objection discussion	1.70	795.00	1,351.50
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of employee wage motion to cross reference against employee roster files to reconcile employee population	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of most recent voting report	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of Zurich Objection to Exmark Settlement	0.20	650.00	130.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update calendar / milestones document to include additional/updated court related deadlines / process timeline to be distributed among stakeholders.	0.20	470.00	94.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register to include the latest accounts payable aging data provided by the Client.	2.40	470.00	1,128.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register with transfer of claims for claims being transferred to another creditor.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/9/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update MOR template to include cash inflows and outflows for the month of November	2.10	470.00	987.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/9/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update MOR-1a with November ending bank balances based on cash activity for the month	1.10	470.00	517.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/9/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update post sale unwind receipts and disbursements for week ending 11.20	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/9/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update employee roster file	0.90	650.00	585.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/9/2020	Tax Issues	Follow-up with C. Wojtak (Briggs) on wage information requested by Weil for IRS employment tax deferral claim	0.40	850.00	340.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/9/2020	Tax Issues	Call from S. Rugg and H. Spencer (Briggs) to discuss IRS questions, Georgia Jobs Tax credits and New York Transfer Taxes	0.60	850.00	510.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/9/2020	Tax Issues	Send wage calculation for employment tax deferral to S. Rugg (Briggs)	0.30	850.00	255.00
Neziroski, David	Staff	12/9/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Amend interim application	1.30	275.00	357.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze due to and due from amounts between LLC and the Estate	0.40	650.00	260.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/10/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Analyze Monthly Operating Report for November	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with R Zaidman (BRG) re: details of specific secured claim	0.10	795.00	79.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Coordination regarding updates to high/low claim summaries	0.40	650.00	260.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/10/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft blackline comparing global notes of October to November MOR to assist company management in their review	0.70	470.00	329.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/10/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft cash reconciliation across cash and debt items to address comments received from company management and ensure accuracy of November MOR	1.60	470.00	752.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss cure exhibit preparation process and updates to be made for filing cure exhibit. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Hess (EY).	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss cure exhibit preparation process and updates to be made for filing cure exhibit. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Hess (EY).	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/10/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare contract pull request for specific vendor.	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/10/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare data package to assist in transition of assumption notice workstream.	3.40	470.00	1,598.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft consolidated high recovery scenario claim summaries	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft consolidated low recovery scenario claim summaries	1.30	470.00	611.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/10/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Refresh listing of all contracts in preparation for filing of SAPA updates.	1.90	470.00	893.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to specific vendor claims and related settlement	0.60	650.00	390.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review batch three of employee claims reviewed by P. Prickett (Briggs)	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
Tajuddin,Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12/10/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel	0.20	745.00	149.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/10/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review draft of interim fee application and provide comments	0.90	795.00	715.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/10/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Review Ficks declaration in support of plan and provide internal comments	1.10	795.00	874.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest claims register update	1.20	795.00	954.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of current WIP list to identify open items	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of docket for claim objection responses	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/10/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review of Draft Affidavit in Support of Joint Plan	0.80	650.00	520.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of Plan Administrator agreement to prepare questions for discussion with Plan Administrator	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of Plan and Disclosure Statement to prepare open item list for discussion with Plan Administrator	1.30	650.00	845.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of voting report received from claims agent	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review stipulation associated with the withdrawal of specific secured claim and correspond with R Zaidman (BRG) regarding same	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/10/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review updated draft of MOR prior to circulation to management	0.40	795.00	318.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated footnotes in draft claim summaries	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/10/2020	Financial Analysis	Review/ analyze latest post and pre-petition AP balances for the estate	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to include high-scenario claim estimates according to latest creditor-specific stipulations	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/10/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise prospective objection footnotes in draft claim summaries	0.80	470.00	376.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/10/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft MOR template for the November date ranges on all pages where applicable	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/10/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update due to/due from analysis for transaction activity between LLC and Estate and correspond with K Buono (Briggs) and Treasury regarding same	0.40	795.00	318.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner (EY) and N. Flagg (EY) on EstateCo open tax items	0.40	850.00	340.00
Puechner,Shawn P.	Partner/Principal	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner (EY) and N. Flagg (EY) on EstateCo open tax items	0.40	900.00	360.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner, J. Ficks, N Flagg, and J. Simon (EY) and EY counsel to discuss open EstateCO issues	0.60	850.00	510.00
Puechner,Shawn P.	Partner/Principal	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner, J. Ficks, N Flagg, and J. Simon (EY) and EY counsel to discuss open EstateCO issues	0.50	900.00	450.00
Simon,John F	Partner/Principal	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner, J. Ficks, N Flagg, and J. Simon (EY) and EY counsel to discuss open EstateCO issues	0.60	900.00	540.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Ficks, Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Puechner, J. Ficks, N Flagg, and J. Simon (EY) and EY counsel to discuss open EstateCO issues	0.60	940.00	564.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Email to K. Buono (Briggs) team regarding EstateCO foreign entities and projects in process	0.70	850.00	595.00
Wright, Jermane L.	Senior	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Research Georgia Desk question re: whether excess jobs credits (to be used against withholding) can be transferred	1.00	875.00	875.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Georgia Tax Credit information to J. Adams (EY) with request to provide additional tax credit information	0.40	850.00	340.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/10/2020	Tax Issues	Information request to S. Rugg (Briggs) on Georgia Job Credit and email to J. Adams (EY) for assistance with information on how to monetize the credit applicable to OldBriggs	0.40	850.00	340.00
Neziroski, David	Staff	12/10/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review November detail	3.50	275.00	962.50
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze impact of SERP claims on the consolidated claim summaries	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze impact of tax claims on the consolidated claim summaries	0.30	470.00	141.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updated claims summary and high/low estimates for distribution to UCC; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updated claims summary and high/low estimates for distribution to UCC; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updated claims summary and high/low estimates for distribution to UCC; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updated claims summary and high/low estimates for distribution to UCC; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updated claims summary and high/low estimates for distribution to UCC; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updated claims summary and high/low estimates for distribution to UCC; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updated claims summary and high/low estimates for distribution to UCC; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with A Halperin, J Goldberg (Plan Administrator); J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: introductory call and discussion of case issues pertinent to Plan Administrator	1.00	795.00	795.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with A Halperin, J Goldberg (Plan Administrator); J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: introductory call and discussion of case issues pertinent to Plan Administrator	1.00	795.00	795.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C Hannon, C Carpenter (EY) re: updated high/low claims analysis scenarios for UCC	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C Hannon, C Carpenter (EY) re: updated high/low claims analysis scenarios for UCC	0.30	795.00	238.50
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/11/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with P Prickett (Briggs), C Hannon, J Granell, (EY), M Martir (Weil) re: HR related contracts for assumption and specific healthcare vendor queries	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with P Prickett (Briggs), C Hannon, J Granell, (EY), M Martir (Weil) re: HR related contracts for assumption and specific healthcare vendor queries	0.20	795.00	159.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspond with Weil / the Company to confirm the inclusion of employee non-disclosure agreements in updated cure exhibit.	0.80	470.00	376.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/11/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft and send correspondence with members of company finance team regarding the status of certain bank accounts listed on MOR-1a	0.70	470.00	329.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/11/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft correspondence to company management/ reviewers with the latest draft of the November MOR	0.80	470.00	376.00
Granel, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prep for call to discuss claims summary high/low estimates and answer questions related to employee claims	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of redline to draft affidavit in support of Plan to circulate for review	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare revised high scenario claim summaries to address feedback	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of variances between 10/28 and 12/11 high recovery scenario claim estimates	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of variances between 10/28 and 12/11 low recovery scenario claim estimates	0.40	470.00	188.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Provide additional information to the Company for review of contracts to be included in the updated cure exhibit.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/11/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Reconcile ending cash balances for November within MOR-1a with latest information received from company	1.00	470.00	470.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research paid invoice relating to specific vendor's claim	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and categorization of new claims received for incorporation in claims register	1.10	650.00	715.00
Tajuddin, Salman Naveed	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Vendor Issues	Review claims and disputes in response to question posed by counsel	0.20	745.00	149.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims being reclassified from one class to another to identify impact on claim summaries	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims being reclassified from one debtor to another to identify impact on claim summaries	0.80	470.00	376.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims summary for filed accounts payable claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft consolidated claim type summaries	0.60	470.00	282.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Support for motion materials	Review draft of J. Ficks Declaration in support of the Plan	0.80	795.00	636.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review high claim summary sheets to be sent to BRG updated for changes made to trade payable claims.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review high claim summary sheets to be sent to BRG.	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review low claim summary sheets to be sent to BRG.	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of court docket for responses to claim objections	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/11/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review of Draft Affidavit in Support of Joint Plan	1.00	650.00	650.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of revised claim report and high low recovery estimates prior to distribution to UCC	0.70	650.00	455.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated claims register and master file	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated high/low claims analysis scenarios for UCC	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Bradley, Trenton	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated low claim summary sheets to be sent to BRG updated for changes made to trade payable claims.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review variances for employee claim estimates between 10/28 and 12/11	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review variances for trade claim estimates between 10/28 and 12/11	0.20	470.00	94.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Reviews low and high claims scenario analysis	1.70	795.00	1,351.50
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise objection-specific footnotes in consolidated high scenario summaries	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise vendor claim estimates for consolidated high scenario claim summaries	0.80	470.00	376.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/11/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update cash reconciliation across MOR items with the updated bank balance information received	0.60	470.00	282.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/11/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update claims register to reflect changes to accounts payable claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/11/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update MOR-1a to include a note clarifying the status of certain bank accounts listed on MOR-1a	0.90	470.00	423.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/11/2020	Tax Issues	Call with Briggs team to discuss the necessary wage information needed regarding employment tax deferrals to be provided to Weil team. EY Attendees: A. Risman, N. Flagg, and K. Gatt (EY)	0.30	850.00	255.00
Gatt, Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	12/11/2020	Tax Issues	Call with Briggs team to discuss the necessary wage information needed regarding employment tax deferrals to be provided to Weil team. EY Attendees: A. Risman, N. Flagg, and K. Gatt (EY)	0.30	725.00	217.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Risman,Alexander Harrison	Senior	12/11/2020	Tax Issues	Call with Briggs team to discuss the necessary wage information needed regarding employment tax deferrals to be provided to Weil team. EY Attendees: A. Risman, N. Flagg, and K. Gatt (EY)	0.30	475.00	142.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/11/2020	Tax Issues	Email to F. Guerino (EY) for New York transfer tax review resource and availability	0.30	850.00	255.00
Neziroski,David	Staff	12/11/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Amend interim application per feedback received	2.20	275.00	605.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss cure exhibit changes to be confirmed with Weil and preparing SAPA notice to be filed prior to confirmation hearing. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Hess (EY).	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/13/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss cure exhibit changes to be confirmed with Weil and preparing SAPA notice to be filed prior to confirmation hearing. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Hess (EY).	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/13/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review data for new contracts entered into OnBase in order to understand if contracts with NewCo and OldCo were differentiated in any way.	2.10	470.00	987.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/13/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare listing of all rejected contracts to assist in preparing SAPA disclosure listing.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/13/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Correspond with T. Bradley (EY) regarding SAPA transferred contracts listing.	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/13/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Correspond with counsel regarding specific contract updates to ensure correct updates were being made.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/13/2020	Tax Issues	Emails to F. Guerino, J. Adams and R. Xavier (EY) to set New York sales and use tax and Georgia jobs credit calls with S. Rugg (Briggs)	0.50	850.00	425.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze additional filed claims provided by KCC on 12/11	1.30	470.00	611.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze contracts listing in order to understand to which contracts NewCo, OldCo, or both were parties.	2.40	470.00	1,128.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/14/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update cash flow tracker	0.70	650.00	455.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/14/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Analyze November Monthly Operating Report	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between filed claims provided by KCC on 12/11 and scheduled claims	0.80	470.00	376.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze specific vendor requests regarding status of cure payment disbursements	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process and updates to claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	1.60	470.00	752.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss open items regarding claims process and updates to claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to claim summaries and tracking of claim transfers; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to claim summaries and tracking of claim transfers; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss updates to claim summaries and tracking of claim transfers; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss payment of specific IT vendor cure and adjustment of remaining unsecured claim and related accounting implications	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss payment of specific IT vendor cure and adjustment of remaining unsecured claim and related accounting implications	0.20	650.00	130.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Hannon (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss payment of specific IT vendor cure and adjustment of remaining unsecured claim and related accounting implications	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: Estate bank accounts and process for setting up Plan Administrator with access	0.40	795.00	318.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Hess, C Hannon, T Bradley (EY) to discuss follow up actions on SAPA transfer schedule and assumption exhibit	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, C Hannon, T Bradley (EY) to discuss follow up actions on SAPA transfer schedule and assumption exhibit	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, C Hannon, T Bradley (EY) to discuss follow up actions on SAPA transfer schedule and assumption exhibit	0.20	470.00	94.00



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Hess, C Hannon, T Bradley (EY) to review updates to contract assumption exhibit	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, C Hannon, T Bradley (EY) to review updates to contract assumption exhibit	0.90	795.00	715.50
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, C Hannon, T Bradley (EY) to review updates to contract assumption exhibit	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood and S. Hofner (EY) regarding reconciliation of select 503(b)(9) claim and related documentation provided	0.20	650.00	130.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J. Silverwood and S. Hofner (EY) regarding reconciliation of select 503(b)(9) claim and related documentation provided	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K Lemke, L Glick, T Doering (Briggs), J Hess, T Bradley, C Hannon (EY), M Martir (Weil) re: list of contracts for SAPA transfer schedule	0.90	795.00	715.50
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K Lemke, L Glick, T Doering (Briggs), J Hess, T Bradley, C Hannon (EY), M Martir (Weil) re: list of contracts for SAPA transfer schedule	0.90	470.00	423.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with K Lemke, L Glick, T Doering (Briggs), J Hess, T Bradley, C Hannon (EY), M Martir (Weil) re: list of contracts for SAPA transfer schedule	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Coordinate with team regarding changes to assumption notice.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Follow-up with counsel related to specific claim inquiry	0.30	650.00	195.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Incorporate changes from Weil to be included in Cure Exhibit changes file.	2.40	470.00	1,128.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Incorporate changes from Weil to be included in exhibit which includes a summary of all contracts with the Company.	3.10	470.00	1,457.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss select claims. Participants include J. Granell(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	650.00	130.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss select claims. Participants include J. Granell(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	650.00	130.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/14/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Participate in call with K. Buono (company), P. Langelin (company), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to review draft of the November MOR.	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Participate in call with K. Buono (company), P. Langelin (company), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY) and G. Giordano (EY) to review draft of the November MOR.	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of open claim items prior to discuss with C. Carpenter (EY)	1.20	650.00	780.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare list of post-close agreements for company to review for SAPA schedule.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare listing of specific vendor contracts to be pulled per request from counsel.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary file to show the changes made in the Cure Exhibit changes file for Weil to sign off on.	1.60	470.00	752.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research and correspond with company regarding landfill contract which was not previously included in contracts listing.	1.30	470.00	611.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research and respond to claim inquiries and review of related reconciliation status	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research history of certain wire payment relating to specific vendor's filed claim	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research payment status of invoices relating to specific vendor's filed claim	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Research specific contracts which were entered into OnBase pre-close but were effective post-close to ensure correct contracts were being included in SAPA schedule.	0.80	470.00	376.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Support for motion materials	Review and provide edits to draft of J. Ficks Declaration in support of the Plan	2.30	795.00	1,828.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review batch of largest AP value changes to ensure they are accounted for accurately within the claims register	2.20	470.00	1,034.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim amendments provided by KCC on 12/11	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim withdrawals provided by KCC on 12/11	0.20	470.00	94.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims for specific vendor in relation to its objection	1.10	795.00	874.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims with issues flagged by EY team to provide context / support for treatment of claims.	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review employee-specific claims to determine proposed objection adjustments	0.70	470.00	329.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review final draft of Interim Fee Application prior to sending to counsel	0.80	795.00	636.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review master claims register to identify updates needed	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review master claims registry for employee related claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review master list of open items for discussion with counsel and Plan Administrator	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of docket for claim and plan objections	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of final voting report	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review prior week cash activity and update due to/due from transactions analysis	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review trade vendor-specific claims to determine proposed objection adjustments	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/14/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review updated contract assumption exhibit	2.40	795.00	1,908.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updates made to claims register for transferred claims to confirm they are accurately reflected for transferor / transferee.	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/14/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to include additional claims provided by KCC on 12/11	1.20	470.00	564.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/14/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update post sale unwind receipts and disbursements for week ending 12.11.2020	1.20	650.00	780.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/14/2020	Tax Issues	Review C. Wojtak (Briggs) employment tax deferral report and reply with questions	1.30	850.00	1,105.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/14/2020	Tax Issues	Research and reply to S. Rugg (Briggs) on W-2 issue	0.40	850.00	340.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/15/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Address additional questions from company reviewers on the latest draft of the November MOR	0.40	470.00	188.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze Master Registry related to employee claims from the 1st batch of company reviewed claims and claims that are currently 'On Hold' status	1.80	650.00	1,170.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze scheduled-only severance claims to determine next steps for reconciliation of distribution amounts	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze variances between the KCC claims list and the master claims register	0.90	470.00	423.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss ongoing claims process; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss ongoing claims process; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss ongoing claims process; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss ongoing claims process; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss ongoing claims process; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss ongoing claims process; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss ongoing claims process; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss ongoing claims process; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.60	795.00	477.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss transferred claims as well as updates to claims summaries; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss transferred claims as well as updates to claims summaries; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Call with D Hoehne (Weil) to discuss upcoming court requirements	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, C Hannon (EY) re: updated SAPA contracts transfer schedule	0.80	795.00	636.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, C Hannon (EY) re: updated SAPA contracts transfer schedule	0.80	470.00	376.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Hess, T Bradley, C Hannon (EY) to review amendments to contract assumption exhibit	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, T Bradley, C Hannon (EY) to review amendments to contract assumption exhibit	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, T Bradley, C Hannon (EY) to review amendments to contract assumption exhibit	0.40	470.00	188.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Support for motion materials	Call with J. Ficks, J. Henrich (EY) re: Declaration in support of the Plan	0.70	795.00	556.50
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	12/15/2020	Support for motion materials	Call with J. Ficks, J. Henrich (EY) re: Declaration in support of the Plan	0.70	940.00	658.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Correspond with counsel regarding specific contracts with B&S Malaysia which should not be included in the assumption notice.	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspondence to counsel regarding open items for claims call	0.60	650.00	390.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/15/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft correspondence to counsel and company reviewers highlighting the changes from the previous draft to the current draft and circulating the updated November MOR draft	1.20	470.00	564.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/15/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft correspondence to K. Buono (Briggs) with proposed final draft of the November MOR for finalization purposes	0.30	470.00	141.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Incorporate additional changes / edits from Weil to be included in Cure Exhibit changes file.	3.70	470.00	1,739.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Incorporate additional changes / edits from Weil to be included in exhibit which includes a summary of all contracts with the Company.	3.10	470.00	1,457.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of certain vendor's prepetition invoices. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss status of certain vendor's prepetition invoices. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation for claims call with Weil	0.90	650.00	585.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare consolidated low scenario claim summary by claim type for weekly call with the Debtors	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare consolidated low scenario claim summary by entity for weekly call with the Debtors	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare list of all prepetition contracts newly added to OnBase for company to review for possible assumption.	1.80	470.00	846.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of claim-specific open items for discussion	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare list of postpetition contracts for SAPA disclosure for company to pull if counsel needs to review.	1.10	470.00	517.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare listing of postpetition contracts to be transferred via the SAPA disclosure for counsel to review.	2.90	470.00	1,363.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of claim inquiries	0.70	650.00	455.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research prepetition invoices of certain vendor in response to B&S employee's request	0.50	650.00	325.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review additional batch of largest AP value changes to ensure they are accounted for accurately within the claims register	1.30	470.00	611.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review analysis of scheduled-only severance claims	0.60	470.00	282.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review certain elements of bankruptcy Plan and communicate same to team	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review counterparty-specific settlement to update allowed claim amount	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review draft of assumption notice updates in preparation for delivery to counsel.	1.10	470.00	517.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review final voting report	0.40	795.00	318.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review final voting report provided by KCC	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest cure payments file to determine impact on claims	0.70	470.00	329.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Support for motion materials	Review latest draft of J. Ficks Declaration in support of the Plan	1.20	795.00	954.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of additional revisions to declaration in support of confirmation	0.30	650.00	195.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of amended disclosure statement	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of docket to locate stipulations and claim withdrawals	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review of revised Affidavit in Support of Confirmation	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of treatment of claim transfers	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review of Voting Certification	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of WIP for current action items / timelines	0.20	650.00	130.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review Second Amended Plan and provide comments to Weil	2.10	795.00	1,669.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review updated contract cure schedule and reconciliations to prior versions	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Review updated MOR following incorporation of comments from Weil	0.20	795.00	159.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review vendor-specific claim filed multiple times to clarify payment information	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review vendor-specific filed and scheduled claims to identify superseding claim amounts	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to incorporate preliminary allowances and objections for transferred claims	0.80	470.00	376.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/15/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft of November MOR for additional comments received from counsel on the latest circulated draft	0.50	470.00	235.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/15/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft of November MOR for comments received from company reviewers on the latest circulated draft	1.40	470.00	658.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/15/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Update draft of November MOR for comments received from counsel on the latest circulated draft	1.10	470.00	517.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/15/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update Master Registry for employee related claims related to the third batch reviewed by the Company	2.80	650.00	1,820.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/15/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update professional fee schedule and correspond with advisors regarding objections	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/15/2020	Tax Issues	Correspondence with S. Pfister (EY) with expatriot W-2 question from S. Rugg (Briggs)	0.30	850.00	255.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/15/2020	Tax Issues	Set Georgia jobs credit discussion for S. Rugg (Briggs) with J. Adams and R. Xavier (EY)	0.30	850.00	255.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze differences between master registry from 10.28 to 12.11	0.90	650.00	585.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/16/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Analyze latest cure payment data received from company including disbursements through 12/16 to vendors	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze Master Registry for rebate and executive claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/16/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze Professional Fees Calendar and include into Estate cash flow tracker	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze proposed allowed administrative amounts to be included in the schedule for discussion with the Plan Administrator	1.30	470.00	611.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze variances for secured trade claim estimates between 10/28 and 12/11	0.30	470.00	141.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) Court Hearing	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) Court Hearing	0.40	795.00	318.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss employee claim variances between 10/28 and 12/11; Participants: J. Granell (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.10	470.00	47.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss employee claim variances between 10/28 and 12/11; Participants: J. Granell (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss requested schedule of 503(b)(9) claims; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss requested schedule of 503(b)(9) claims; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY), J. Silverwood (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss requested schedule of 503(b)(9) claims; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss requested schedule of 503(b)(9) claims; Participants: C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Call with B Marks (HL) J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: impact of changes in proceeds and claims on recovery analysis	0.40	795.00	318.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Asset Analysis and Recovery	Call with B Marks (HL) J Henrich, C Hannon (EY) re: impact of changes in proceeds and claims on recovery analysis	0.40	795.00	318.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon, C Carpenter (EY) re: summary of admin claims reconciled	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon, C Carpenter (EY) re: summary of admin claims reconciled	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon, C Carpenter (EY) re: summary of admin claims reconciled	0.20	795.00	159.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Hess, T Bradley, C Hannon (EY) to review SAPA transfer schedule	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, T Bradley, C Hannon (EY) to review SAPA transfer schedule	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/16/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with J Hess, T Bradley, C Hannon (EY) to review SAPA transfer schedule	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/16/2020	Meetings with Management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir, D Hoehne, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) regarding case update and next steps	0.50	650.00	325.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/16/2020	Meetings with management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir, D Hoehne, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: case update and next steps	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Meetings with management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir, D Hoehne, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: case update and next steps	0.50	795.00	397.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Meetings with Management	Call with K Buono (Briggs), R Berkovich, M Martir, D Hoehne, E Blechman (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, J Granell, S Hofner (EY) re: case update and next steps	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Coordination regarding payments due as of the Effective Date	0.40	650.00	260.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/16/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Finalize draft of November MOR with signature pages and final comments from company and counsel	1.20	470.00	564.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss validation of certain claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	650.00	65.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss validation of certain claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.10	470.00	47.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Perform docket review for orders and stipulations impacting claims	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Meetings with management	Preparation of summary materials for update call with K Buono (Briggs)	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare and analyze fourth batch of claims to be sent to Briggs for review	0.90	650.00	585.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/16/2020	UST Reporting and MOR	Prepare clean excel version of the as-filed November MOR and circulate to counsel	0.70	470.00	329.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare creditor address listing for KCC to notice creditors of contract change exhibit.	1.90	470.00	893.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft claims summaries requested by Houlihan Lokey	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft schedule of admin. claims in advance of the Plan's effective date	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/16/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare final list of transferred contracts.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare packet for weekly call with Briggs and Weil	0.70	650.00	455.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of prospective objections to administrative claims filed to date	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review admin. claims to prepare requested schedule for discussion with the Plan Administrator	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft claims summaries requested by Houlihan Lokey	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review employee address data to confirm it is in correct mailing order format.	2.90	470.00	1,363.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest claims file with summaries and supporting analysis	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest claims register and larger file for consistency and accuracy across tabs	1.10	470.00	517.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of claim stipulations and payment terms for specified claims	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of final revisions to Declaration in support of confirmation.	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review SAPA transfer schedule	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review status of batch of filed trade claims to validate completed review status	2.80	650.00	1,820.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/16/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update schedule of vendor claims resolved on the docket	3.00	650.00	1,950.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Xavier,Ronald	Executive Director	12/16/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion regarding Georgia Jobs Tax Credit options for Briggs going forward. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, K. Gatt, A. Risman, R. Xavier, J. Adams (EY)	0.20	850.00	170.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/16/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion regarding Georgia Jobs Tax Credit options for Briggs going forward. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, K. Gatt, A. Risman, R. Xavier, J. Adams (EY)	0.20	850.00	170.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	12/16/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion regarding Georgia Jobs Tax Credit options for Briggs going forward. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, K. Gatt, A. Risman, R. Xavier, J. Adams (EY)	0.20	725.00	145.00
Risman,Alexander Harrison	Senior	12/16/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion regarding Georgia Jobs Tax Credit options for Briggs going forward. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, K. Gatt, A. Risman, R. Xavier, J. Adams (EY)	0.20	475.00	95.00
Adams,James	Partner/Principal	12/16/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion regarding Georgia Jobs Tax Credit options for Briggs going forward. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, K. Gatt, A. Risman, R. Xavier, J. Adams (EY)	0.20	900.00	180.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/16/2020	Tax Issues	Update property tax review of Butler county claim and reply to C. Meilhan (Briggs) on merits of claim payout in installments	1.90	850.00	1,615.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/16/2020	Tax Issues	Review IRS claim and reply to H. Spencer (Briggs) on potential offset of custom tariff refunds	0.70	850.00	595.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/16/2020	Tax Issues	Calculate pre-petition employment tax deferral on an estimated priority and general unsecured classification basis per A. Arikat (Weil) request and reply to A. Arikat (Weil)	1.90	850.00	1,615.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze administrative claims reconciled to identify claims ready for payment	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze administrative claims reconciled to identify claims requiring objections	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss analysis of variances between KCC's claims data and master claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss analysis of variances between KCC's claims data and master claims register; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claim-specific questions for revisions to draft schedule of admin claims; Participants: J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	470.00	141.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claim-specific questions for revisions to draft schedule of admin claims; Participants: J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss draft schedule of admin claims for discussion with the Plan Administrator; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss draft schedule of admin claims for discussion with the Plan Administrator; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss draft schedule of admin claims for discussion with the Plan Administrator; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C Hannon, S Hofner (EY) re: reconciliation status of selected tax claims	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C Hannon, S Hofner (EY) re: reconciliation status of selected tax claims	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss updated schedule of allowed admin claims for distribution	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss updated schedule of allowed admin claims for distribution	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, J. Silverwood, and S. Hofner (EY) regarding admin/503(b)(9) claim reconciliation/reporting	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, J. Silverwood, and S. Hofner (EY) regarding admin/503(b)(9) claim reconciliation/reporting	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with C. Carpenter, J. Silverwood, and S. Hofner (EY) regarding admin/503(b)(9) claim reconciliation/reporting	0.50	650.00	325.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with counsel to discuss allowed 503(b)(9) claims to date and outstanding claim issues; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and D. Hoehne (Weil)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with counsel to discuss allowed 503(b)(9) claims to date and outstanding claim issues; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and D. Hoehne (Weil)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with counsel to discuss allowed 503(b)(9) claims to date and outstanding claim issues; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and D. Hoehne (Weil)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with counsel to discuss allowed 503(b)(9) claims to date and outstanding claim issues; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and D. Hoehne (Weil)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with counsel to discuss allowed 503(b)(9) claims to date and outstanding claim issues; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and D. Hoehne (Weil)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with counsel to discuss allowed 503(b)(9) claims to date and outstanding claim issues; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and D. Hoehne (Weil)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with counsel to discuss allowed 503(b)(9) claims to date and outstanding claim issues; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and D. Hoehne (Weil)	0.50	795.00	397.50
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with counsel to discuss allowed 503(b)(9) claims to date and outstanding claim issues; Participants: J. Henrich (EY), C. Hannon (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY), J. Myers (Weil), M. Martir (Weil), and D. Hoehne (Weil)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Call with D Hoehne, C Berman (Weil) J Ficks (EY), J Henrich (EY) and C Hannon (EY) to discuss preparation for plan confirmation hearing	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Call with D Hoehne, C Berman (Weil) J Ficks (EY), J Henrich (EY) and C Hannon (EY) to discuss preparation for plan confirmation hearing	0.30	795.00	238.50
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	12/17/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Call with D Hoehne, C Berman (Weil) J Ficks (EY), J Henrich (EY) and C Hannon (EY) to discuss preparation for plan confirmation hearing	0.30	940.00	282.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: payments made by LLC on behalf of the Estate	0.20	795.00	159.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon, C Carpenter, S Hofner (EY) re: summary of admin claims reconciled	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon, C Carpenter, S Hofner (EY) re: summary of admin claims reconciled	0.60	795.00	477.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon, C Carpenter, S Hofner (EY) re: summary of admin claims reconciled	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich, C Hannon, C Carpenter, S Hofner (EY) re: summary of admin claims reconciled	0.60	650.00	390.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with M Martir, C Luster (Weil) C Hannon, J Hess, T Bradley (EY) re: SAPA transfer schedule finalization	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with M Martir, C Luster (Weil) C Hannon, J Hess, T Bradley (EY) re: SAPA transfer schedule finalization	0.30	795.00	238.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/17/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with M Martir, C Luster (Weil) C Hannon, J Hess, T Bradley (EY) re: SAPA transfer schedule finalization	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Claims review and identification of updates to master claims register to forward to KCC	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Discussion with J. Silverwood (EY) and S. Hofner (EY) regarding AP claims reconciliation related to 503(b)(9) and admin components	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Discussion with J. Silverwood (EY) and S. Hofner (EY) regarding AP claims reconciliation related to 503(b)(9) and admin components	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss validation of certain claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.40	650.00	260.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss validation of certain claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.40	470.00	188.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss validation of certain claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hess,Jonathan Lucas	Senior	12/17/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Prepare list of addresses to be noticed in relation to contracts assumed by estate.	1.20	470.00	564.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of reconciled administrative claims ready for near-term payment in advance of Plan Administrator call	1.30	470.00	611.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of admin. claims by claim category	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of admin. claims by form type	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of admin. claims by reconciliation status	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of administrative claims for near-term payment in advance of Plan Administrator call	1.10	470.00	517.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of validated trade claims relying on accounts' payable balances	2.00	650.00	1,300.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review administrative claims requiring further reconciliation	0.40	470.00	188.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review AP trade claims to verify treatment of claims / decide if claims need to be sent to company for reconciliation.	2.10	470.00	987.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review certain schedule of 503(b)(9) claims to validate which claims are ready for payment	1.00	650.00	650.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register to validate accuracy of select vendor trade claims	2.90	650.00	1,885.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft schedule of admin. claims	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of admin/503(b)(9) claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of Confirmation Brief, Proposed Confirmation Order and Declaration of Jeffrey Ficks prior to Plan Confirmation Hearing	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review of payment listing for Estate payments handled through LLC AP	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/17/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated admin claims summary	0.40	650.00	260.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/17/2020	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Review updated cure exhibit draft files in preparation of filing	1.80	470.00	846.00
Puechner,Shawn P.	Partner/Principal	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Reissuance of existing agreements to be approved by Plan Administrator for ongoing indirect tax work	1.00	900.00	900.00
Xavier,Ronald	Executive Director	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Call to Georgia Dept of Revenue on an anonymous basis to review Briggs fact pattern for purposes of the Georgia Jobs Credit	0.40	850.00	340.00
Guerino,Frank	Executive Director	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion with S. Ruggs and C. Meilahn (Briggs) regarding New York sales tax exemption for items used in the manufacturing process. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, A. Risman, K. Gatt, F. Guerino (EY)	0.80	850.00	680.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion with S. Ruggs and C. Meilahn (Briggs) regarding New York sales tax exemption for items used in the manufacturing process. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, A. Risman, K. Gatt, F. Guerino (EY)	0.80	850.00	680.00
Risman,Alexander Harrison	Senior	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion with S. Ruggs and C. Meilahn (Briggs) regarding New York sales tax exemption for items used in the manufacturing process. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, A. Risman, K. Gatt, F. Guerino (EY)	0.80	475.00	380.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion with S. Ruggs and C. Meilahn (Briggs) regarding New York sales tax exemption for items used in the manufacturing process. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, A. Risman, K. Gatt, F. Guerino (EY)	0.80	725.00	580.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion with S. Ruggs and C. Meilahn (Briggs) regarding open tax items and general next steps. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, A. Risman, K. Gatt (EY)	0.70	850.00	595.00



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Risman,Alexander Harrison	Senior	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion with S. Ruggs and C. Meilahn (Briggs) regarding open tax items and general next steps. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, A. Risman, K. Gatt (EY)	0.70	475.00	332.50
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Discussion with S. Ruggs and C. Meilahn (Briggs) regarding open tax items and general next steps. EY Attendees: N. Flagg, A. Risman, K. Gatt (EY)	0.70	725.00	507.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Follow-up email with S. Pfister (EY) for expatriot tax issue information	0.30	850.00	255.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Employment tax deferral amount updates to C. Hannon (EY)	0.40	850.00	340.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/17/2020	Tax Issues	Reply to S. Rugg (Briggs) with expatriot tax information from S. Pfister (EY)	0.40	850.00	340.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze list of claim-related stipulations provided by counsel	0.90	470.00	423.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/18/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) Confirmation Hearing	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/18/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Attend (virtually) Confirmation Hearing	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin to review batch of 50 claims that have previously been reviewed by the company but do not have clear or consistent designations on shared file	1.90	470.00	893.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich and C Hannon (EY) to discuss next steps following coordination call with Plan Administrator	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Henrich and C Hannon (EY) to discuss next steps following coordination call with Plan Administrator	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Executory contract research related to specified claims	0.70	650.00	455.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/18/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), R Berkovich, D Hoehne (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Ficks (EY) re: Plan Administrator coordination	2.00	795.00	1,590.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/18/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), R Berkovich, D Hoehne (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Ficks (EY) re: Plan Administrator coordination	2.00	795.00	1,590.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/18/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), R Berkovich, D Hoehne (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Ficks (EY) regarding Plan Administrator coordination and transition	2.00	650.00	1,300.00
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	12/18/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), R Berkovich, D Hoehne (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Ficks (EY) regarding Plan Administrator coordination and transition	2.00	940.00	1,880.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of summary materials for Plan Administrator	0.80	795.00	636.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/18/2020	Court Preparation & Attendance	Prepare for Confirmation Hearing	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare revised listing of filed tax claims received to date	0.80	470.00	376.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/18/2020	Cash Monitoring	Reconcile Estate Cash Tracker to bank balances for week ending 12.11.2020	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research payment history of certain vendor's invoices	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to specific admin claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to specified assumed contracts	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research related to specified claims	0.80	650.00	520.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review additional AP trade claims to verify treatment of claims / decide if claims need to be sent to company for reconciliation.	2.90	470.00	1,363.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review agenda for Plan Administrator call	0.60	470.00	282.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and categorization of new claims received for incorporation in claims register	0.70	650.00	455.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and circulate stipulations relating certain vendor allowed admin expenses	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register to confirm reviewed status of select trade claims	1.40	650.00	910.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review court docket for stipulation agreements	0.30	650.00	195.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review cure data to identify status of counterparty-specific claim	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review Exmark settlement order to identify impact on claims	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review filed tax claims received to date	0.30	470.00	141.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest master claims register to determine updates needed for Plan Administrator transition	1.30	470.00	611.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review list of administrative claims for potential near-term payments in advance of Plan Administrator call	0.90	470.00	423.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of orders related to omnibus objections to update claims register	0.60	650.00	390.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review summary of claim conclusions prepared by colleague	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review vendor-specific administrative claims to identify next steps for reconciliation	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review/edits to agenda for Plan Administrator Meeting	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/18/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise list of administrative claims for potential near-term payments in advance of Plan Administrator call	1.20	470.00	564.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/18/2020	Cash Monitoring	Working call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: Estate Cash Tracker for week ending 12.11.2020	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/18/2020	Cash Monitoring	Working call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: Estate Cash Tracker for week ending 12.11.2020	0.60	795.00	477.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/18/2020	Tax Issues	Determine status of open tax items for transition to bankruptcy plan effective date	0.90	850.00	765.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/18/2020	Tax Issues	Review post-effective retention requirements with EY Tax Quality team	0.70	850.00	595.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/20/2020	Tax Issues	Respond to A. Arikat (Weil) on impact to employment tax deferral of potential tax refund offsets	0.30	850.00	255.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze additional filed claims provided by KCC on 12/18	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between filed claims provided by KCC on 12/18 and scheduled claims	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze stipulation-related updates to the master claims register	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/21/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Attend Board of Directors meeting to debrief on impact of plan confirmation and next steps. EY attendees J Ficks, J Henrich, C Hannon (EY)	0.90	795.00	715.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/21/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Attend Board of Directors meeting to debrief on impact of plan confirmation and next steps. EY attendees J Ficks, J Henrich, C Hannon (EY)	0.90	795.00	715.50
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	12/21/2020	Board of Directors Matters	Attend Board of Directors meeting to debrief on impact of plan confirmation and next steps. EY attendees J Ficks, J Henrich, C Hannon (EY)	0.90	940.00	846.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin review of subsequent batch of 50 claims that have previously been reviewed by the company but do not have clear or consistent designations on shared file	2.20	470.00	1,034.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete review batch of initial batch of 50 claims that have previously been reviewed by the company but do not have clear or consistent designations on shared file	1.70	470.00	799.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss potential duplicate filed Accounts Payable trade claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss potential duplicate filed Accounts Payable trade claims. Participants include G. Giordano(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss review status of Accounts Payable filed trade claims. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss review status of Accounts Payable filed trade claims. Participants include C. Hannon(EY), J. Silverwood(EY).	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of correspondence related to additional claims to be reconciled by the company	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of additional trade claims to be reconciled with the Company	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of administrative expense trade claims for reconciliation with the Company	0.70	470.00	329.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review batch four of employee claims reviewed by P. Prickett (Briggs)	2.30	795.00	1,828.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim amendments provided by KCC on 12/18	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim summaries to identify updates needed in anticipation of initial claim payments	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review insurance claims that require further follow-up for reconciliation	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review list of trade claims that require further follow-up with the Company for reconciliation	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of additional AP claims for reconciliation	2.60	650.00	1,690.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/21/2020	Plan and Disclosure Statement	Review of Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law, and Order Confirming Second Amended Ch 11 Plan	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review omnibus objection-related updates to the master claims register	0.60	470.00	282.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/21/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review prior week cash activity and update due to/due from transactions analysis	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review sustained omnibus objections for updates to the master claims register	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/21/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review tax payments and other transactions made on behalf of the Estate by LLC and reconcile taxes to SAPA allocation methodology	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review team member's analysis of potential duplicate filed trade claims	0.40	650.00	260.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review team member's analysis of trade claims potentially satisfied by cure payments or trade agreements	0.40	650.00	260.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update claims filed listing for objections sustained.	0.60	470.00	282.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/21/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register to reflect omnibus objections filed / omnibus objections sustained in the summary sheet for high / low recovery scenarios.	1.60	470.00	752.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/21/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update professional fee schedule and correspond with advisors regarding objections	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/21/2020	Tax Issues	Estimate net present value of Butler County Missouri claim and reply to C. Meilhan (Briggs) with installment and lump sum options	0.70	850.00	595.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/21/2020	Tax Issues	Further Butler County claim updates to C. Meilhan (Briggs) and C. Hannon (EY)	0.40	850.00	340.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin in depth review of previously reviewed administrative expense claims to ensure no duplicative or out of place claims pertaining to 503(b)(9) status are in the existing file	1.70	470.00	799.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including next steps with plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.90	470.00	423.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including next steps with plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.90	470.00	423.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including next steps with plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including next steps with plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.90	795.00	715.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including next steps with plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including next steps with plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.90	650.00	585.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims process including next steps with plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), and S. Hofner (EY) J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY)	0.90	470.00	423.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Wind down Activities	Call with A. Halperin (Plan Administrator) re: effective date preparation	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with T. Bradley, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss updates to claim summaries to reflect stipulations and distributions	0.50	650.00	325.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with T. Bradley, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss updates to claim summaries to reflect stipulations and distributions.	0.50	470.00	235.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with T. Bradley, C. Carpenter, and S. Hofner (EY) to discuss updates to claim summaries to reflect stipulations and distributions.	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Calls with J Henrich and C Hannon (EY) re: preparation for effective date	0.60	795.00	477.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Calls with J Henrich and C Hannon (EY) re: preparation for effective date	0.60	795.00	477.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Wind down Activities	Calls with J. Myers (Weil) re: utility deposits	0.30	795.00	238.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Giordano, Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Complete in depth review of previously reviewed administrative expense claims to ensure no duplicative or out of place claims pertaining to 503(b)(9) status are in the existing file	2.30	470.00	1,081.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspond with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: preparation for effective date	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), R Berkovich, D Hoehne (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Ficks (EY) re: Plan Administrator coordination	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Henrich, Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), R Berkovich, D Hoehne (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Ficks (EY) re: Plan Administrator coordination	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/22/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), R Berkovich, D Hoehne (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Ficks (EY) re: Plan Administrator coordination and transition	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Ficks, Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	12/22/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), R Berkovich, D Hoehne (Weil), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner, J Ficks (EY) re: Plan Administrator coordination and transition	1.60	940.00	1,504.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of summary information for coordination call with Plan Administrator	2.60	650.00	1,690.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare consolidated claims presentation to support discussions with the Plan Administrator	1.20	470.00	564.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft presentation slide summarizing claims population to support discussions with the Plan Administrator	1.40	470.00	658.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for claims call by review/update list of outstanding items for discussion	0.90	650.00	585.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of open items to discuss on claims call	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare schedule of 503(b)(9) invoices to be paid on effective date	2.70	650.00	1,755.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare slide with open questions for Plan Administrator	2.20	650.00	1,430.00
Silverwood, James	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of trade claims identifying how those claims were analyzed and resolved	1.30	650.00	845.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims summary slides providing overview of claims process to date for Plan Administrator and provide edits	1.10	795.00	874.50
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review list of initial planned claim payments	0.40	470.00	188.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review OCP related receipts and correspond with K Buono (Briggs) re: update on refunds	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of agenda and discussion items for call with Plan Administrator	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner, Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of docket for orders impacting claims	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updates to the claims presentation	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updates to the master claims register	1.80	470.00	846.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise draft presentation slide summarizing claims population to support discussions with the Plan Administrator	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter, Christina Maria	Senior	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to incorporate filed claims provided by KCC on 12/18	1.90	470.00	893.00
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/22/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims registry for employee related claims	2.10	650.00	1,365.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/22/2020	Tax Issues	Reply to C. Meilhan (Briggs) question on how OldCo and NewCo would share an installment claim payout	0.60	850.00	510.00
Flagg, Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/22/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Rugg (Briggs) and R. Xavier, K. Gatt, N. Flagg (EY) to provide information on Georgia job credit recapture options for both OldCo and NewCo	0.30	850.00	255.00
Gatt, Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	12/22/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Rugg (Briggs) and R. Xavier, K. Gatt, N. Flagg (EY) to provide information on Georgia job credit recapture options for both OldCo and NewCo	0.30	725.00	217.50
Xavier, Ronald	Executive Director	12/22/2020	Tax Issues	Call with S. Rugg (Briggs) and R. Xavier, K. Gatt, N. Flagg (EY) to provide information on Georgia job credit recapture options for both OldCo and NewCo	0.30	850.00	255.00
Neziroski, David	Staff	12/22/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review November detail for monthly application	1.70	275.00	467.50
Granell, Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/23/2020	Cash Monitoring	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update cash flow tracker	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hannon, Colm	Senior Manager	12/23/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Call with A Halperin, J Goldberg (Plan Administrator), G Gauthier (Briggs) re: effective date payments and bank account operation	1.10	795.00	874.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/23/2020	Cash Monitoring	Call with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: effective date payments and bank account transition	0.20	795.00	159.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Silverwood(EY), C Hannon (EY) re: payments due on effective date and reconciliation of invoices	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Silverwood(EY), C Hannon (EY) re: payments due on effective date and reconciliation of invoices	0.30	795.00	238.50
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss updates to be made for AP trade claims in the master claims register. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.90	470.00	423.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call to discuss updates to be made for AP trade claims in the master claims register. Participants include T. Bradley (EY), J. Silverwood(EY)	0.90	650.00	585.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/23/2020	Cash Monitoring	Preparation of summary information for weekly update with K Buono (Briggs)	1.10	795.00	874.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare communication with questions for certain vendor invoices to be paid on effective date	0.30	650.00	195.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare packet for weekly call with Briggs and Weil	0.40	650.00	260.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim stipulation chart received from counsel as it relates to specific 503(b)(9) payments and claims	1.30	470.00	611.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review invoice level information and reconciliations for payments due on the effective date	0.80	795.00	636.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review invoices to be paid for certain vendors to be paid on effective date	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of docket for claim transfers, withdrawals, and stipulations to update register	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of Plan related to Effective Date Payments and note holder distributions	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated cure cost file to aid in claims reconciliation process	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated master claims register received	0.40	650.00	260.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	12/23/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated claims register to ensure recent changes are reflected accurately and flowing through to the summary tabs	1.50	470.00	705.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/23/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update post sale unwind receipts and disbursements for week ending 12.18.2020	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	12/24/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare communications about payments necessary to be made on effective date	0.30	650.00	195.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/27/2020	Tax Issues	Inventory and prioritize open tax items and next steps for tomorrow's call with S. Rugg (Briggs) and A. Halperin (Plan Administrator)	1.60	850.00	1,360.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Call to discuss open tax and finance items for Estate. Attendees: C Hannon, N Flagg (EY), A Citron (Weil)	0.40	795.00	318.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/28/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Call to discuss open tax and finance items for Estate. Attendees: C Hannon, N Flagg (EY), A Citron (Weil)	0.40	850.00	340.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Wind down Activities	Call with A. Halperin, J Goldberg (Plan Administrator) re: effective date preparation	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Tax Issues	Call with N Flagg and C Hannon (EY) re: expected future tax payments	0.40	795.00	318.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/28/2020	Tax Issues	Call with N Flagg and C Hannon (EY) re: expected future tax payments	0.40	850.00	340.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspond with Weil, K Buono (Briggs) and Plan Administrator re: payments due on effective date	0.20	795.00	159.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Tax Issues	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), A Citron, S Goldring, A Arikat (Weil), N Flagg, J Henrich, K Gatt (EY), S Rugg (Briggs), K Buono (Estate), O Lashko (Brown Rudnick) re: Plan Administrator tax coordination	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/28/2020	Tax Issues	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), A Citron, S Goldring, A Arikat (Weil), N Flagg, J Henrich, K Gatt (EY), S Rugg (Briggs), K Buono (Estate), O Lashko (Brown Rudnick) re: Plan Administrator tax coordination	1.30	850.00	1,105.00
Gatt,Katherine Lee	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Tax Issues	Participate in call with Plan Administrator (A Halperin, J Goldberg), A Citron, S Goldring, A Arikat (Weil), N Flagg, J Henrich, K Gatt (EY), S Rugg (Briggs), K Buono (Estate), O Lashko (Brown Rudnick) re: Plan Administrator tax coordination	1.30	725.00	942.50

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, E Blechman (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, E Blechman (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Wind down Activities	Review and provide edits to Wind Down Budget	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/28/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register to identify claims associated with specified governmental entity per counsel request	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review closing checklist for effective date and provide comments	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update wind down budget for actuals to date, pro fee estimates and miscellaneous items	1.50	795.00	1,192.50
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/28/2020	Tax Issues	Update and provide active tax claim spreadsheet to A. Citron (Weil) for providing to Plan Administrator	1.40	850.00	1,190.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/28/2020	Tax Issues	Provide EY Employment Tax team with information on insurance policy surrender and request response on taxation and withholding issues per E. Berdini (Weil) request	0.70	850.00	595.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/28/2020	Tax Issues	Summarize and provide employment tax deferral summary discussed on today's call to A. Citron (Weil) for providing to Plan Administrator	1.30	850.00	1,105.00
Rule,Martin Daniel	Senior Manager	12/28/2020	Tax Issues	Research, review and preparation of summary regarding nine executive split dollar life insurance arrangements and the related tax, withholding and compliance requirements.	1.60	725.00	1,160.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	12/29/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claim filed by specified vendor to identify potential 503b9 assertion per counsel request	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/29/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Call with A Citron, E Blechman (Weil) and C Hannon (EY) re: pro fee escrow account requirements	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/29/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Coordination with KCC to update master register to reflect satisfied claims and ordered stipulations	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/29/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Call with A. Citron, R. Berkovich, E. Blechman, M. Martir (Weil); K. Buono (Briggs); C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY) to discuss timing and preparation for Effective Date	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/29/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Call with A. Citron, R. Berkovich, E. Blechman, M. Martir (Weil); K. Buono (Briggs); C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY) to discuss timing and preparation for Effective Date	0.50	795.00	397.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/29/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Call with A. Citron, R. Berkovich, E. Blechman, M. Martir (Weil); K. Buono (Briggs); C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), S. Hofner (EY) to discuss timing and preparation for Effective Date	0.50	795.00	397.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/29/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research and follow-up relating claim inquiries	0.60	650.00	390.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/29/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Review time detail in November monthly fee statement to ensure compliance with guidelines	2.30	795.00	1,828.50
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update cash flow tracker	1.00	650.00	650.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with R Zaidman (BRG) re: update on claims status	0.50	795.00	397.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/30/2020	Fee/Employment Applications	Continue to review time detail in November monthly fee statement to ensure compliance with guidelines	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Docket review and download of claim transfer	0.20	650.00	130.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/30/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with B. Marks (HL) re: wind down budget for bond holder questions	0.40	795.00	318.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/30/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	795.00	238.50
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	12/30/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/30/2020	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) regarding closing checklist for effective date	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	12/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Provide documentation to KCC related to allowed claim amounts to update claim register	0.20	650.00	130.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/30/2020	Cash Monitoring	Review cash transaction activity for prior week and update wind down budget	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	12/30/2020	Cash Monitoring	Update due to/from analysis and correspond with K Buono and G Gauthier (Briggs) re: associated transfer requirements	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
Granel,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	12/30/2020	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update post sale unwind receipts and disbursements for week ending 12.18.2020	0.40	650.00	260.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/30/2020	Tax Issues	Review information on tax aspects of life insurance policy surrender from H. Stecker and M. Rule (EY) and comment	0.90	850.00	765.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/30/2020	Tax Issues	Compile and reply to E. Berdini (Weil) with tax withholding information response per her request regarding life insurance policy surrenders	1.30	850.00	1,105.00
Flagg,Nancy A.	Executive Director	12/31/2020	Tax Issues	Review EstatCo tax issue tracker file provided by S. Rugg (Briggs) and comment	1.30	850.00	1,105.00
French,Jason S	Executive Director	12/31/2020	Tax Issues	Review response re: Split Life insurance from National and preparing next steps.	0.50	850.00	425.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze employee-specific claims to determine prospective wrong debtor objections	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze filed claims provided by KCC on 12/31 that amend prior claims	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze initial draft proof of claim estimates for claims procedures motion	0.60	470.00	282.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze new filed claims provided by KCC on 12/31	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze overlap between new filed claims provided on 12/31 and scheduled claims	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze partial transfer of certain vendor claim to understand impact on claims register	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze stipulation order vacating certain orders disallowing specific claims to determine impact on claims process	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze variances between official court claim numbers provided by KCC on 10/1 and 12/31	1.10	470.00	517.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss review of claims with debtor variances; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss review of claims with debtor variances; Participants: T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with bondholder to address inquiries related to distribution on GUCs and unsecured noteholder claim	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/4/2021	Cash Monitoring	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) to discuss claim estimates for Weil POC motion	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/4/2021	Cash Monitoring	Call with S Hofner, C Hannon (EY) to discuss claim estimates for Weil POC motion	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Continue review and categorization of new claims received for incorporation in claims register	1.40	650.00	910.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Discussion with S. Hofner (EY) and C. Carpenter (EY) regarding changes to court claim numbers in claims file from KCC	0.20	650.00	130.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Discussion with S. Hofner (EY) and C. Carpenter (EY) regarding changes to court claim numbers in claims file from KCC	0.20	470.00	94.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	1/4/2021	UST Reporting and MOR	Draft updated critical vendor and shippers/ warehousemen payment matrices for the month of December	2.00	470.00	940.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/4/2021	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/4/2021	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	650.00	195.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/4/2021	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of claim estimates for Claim Procedures Motion	1.20	650.00	780.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare batch of administrative expense claims and review parameters for company review	2.80	650.00	1,820.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare batch of trade claims and review parameters for company review	2.90	650.00	1,885.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare list of matches between new filed claims provided on 12/31 and scheduled claims	0.40	470.00	188.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare listing of trade payable claims to be sent to company for reconciliation.	0.70	470.00	329.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare presentation material related to employee claims for the Plan Admin	1.80	650.00	1,170.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of variances between court claim numbers as of 10/1 and 12/31 for discussion with KCC	0.70	470.00	329.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Reconciliation of court claim numbers from KCC to master file	0.60	650.00	390.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims for which there are multiple debtors to decide how each claim should be resolved.	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims report provided by KCC on 12/31	1.10	470.00	517.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest master claims register in advance of updates for the Plan Administrator	0.40	470.00	188.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review list of individual claims that include invoices for multiple debtors	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review new filed claims provided on 12/31 by claim category	0.90	470.00	423.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of claims report received from KCC and categorization of new claims for incorporation in register	1.80	650.00	1,170.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of docket to locate orders vacating and continuing omnibus objections	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/4/2021	Cash Monitoring	Review of pro fee escrow estimates and correspond with G Gauthier, K Buono (Briggs) re: required account transfers	0.30	795.00	238.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review omnibus orders vacated for updates to the master claims register	0.80	470.00	376.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/4/2021	Wind down Activities	Review professional fee estimates for escrow account	0.20	795.00	159.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/4/2021	Cash Monitoring	Update due to/from analysis, including payments from LLC on behalf of the Estate	1.90	795.00	1,510.50
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims register summary sheets to break out continued objections separately.	1.70	470.00	799.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update master claims registry for employee related claims	1.10	650.00	715.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/4/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update schedule of vendors to be paid on effective date for certain vendors claim	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze variances between KCC's current filed claim amounts and the master claims register original filed claim amounts	1.40	470.00	658.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze variances between KCC's current scheduled claim amounts and the master claims register's scheduled claim amounts	0.90	470.00	423.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze variances between original and proposed scheduled claim amounts	1.40	470.00	658.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Begin to update litigation claims summary file to include comments received from counsel and for additional filed claims	1.20	470.00	564.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss additional claims provided by KCC on 12/31; Participants: J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	470.00	94.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss additional claims provided by KCC on 12/31; Participants: J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.20	650.00	130.00
Giordano,Gregory Ernest	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and preparation of claims file for plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.80	470.00	376.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and preparation of claims file for plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.80	795.00	636.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and preparation of claims file for plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.80	795.00	636.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and preparation of claims file for plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.80	470.00	376.00



Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and preparation of claims file for plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and preparation of claims file for plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.80	470.00	376.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and preparation of claims file for plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.80	650.00	520.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss claims reconciliation process and preparation of claims file for plan administrator; Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), T. Bradley (EY), G. Giordano (EY), and S. Hofner (EY)	0.80	650.00	520.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss draft claims register for the Plan Administrator; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.10	470.00	47.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss draft claims register for the Plan Administrator; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.10	650.00	65.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss variances between KCC's current filed claim amounts and the master register's original filed claim amounts; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss variances between KCC's current filed claim amounts and the master register's original filed claim amounts; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	470.00	235.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call to discuss variances between KCC's current filed claim amounts and the master register's original filed claim amounts; Participants: S. Hofner (EY), T. Bradley (EY), C. Carpenter (EY)	0.50	650.00	325.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Cash Monitoring	Call with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: effective date payments	0.20	795.00	159.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: workers compensation claims	0.60	650.00	390.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Granell, C Hannon (EY) re: workers compensation claims	0.60	795.00	477.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Correspondence with A. Nguyen (KCC) regarding claims report	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review docket to locate stipulations, orders impacting claims	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), J Ficks, C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), J Ficks, C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	650.00	195.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), J Ficks, C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	795.00	238.50
Ficks,Jeffrey Lee	Partner/Principal	1/5/2021	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in daily call with R Berkovich, A Citron, M Martir, (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), J Ficks, C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: closing checklist for effective date	0.30	940.00	282.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation for call to discuss claims reconciliation process	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Preparation of revised claim estimates for Claim Procedures Motion and forwarded to counsel for review	0.60	650.00	390.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft claims register for discussion with the Plan Administrator	1.20	470.00	564.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare draft presentation slide summarizing claims population with latest claims data	1.20	470.00	564.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare internal summary of trade claims to be sent to company for review	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare revised draft claims presentation for call with the Plan Administrator	0.40	470.00	188.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare revised filed claims estimates to be used by counsel in the claims procedures motion	0.70	470.00	329.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare summary of variances between KCC's current filed claim amounts and the master claims register original filed claim amounts	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review and reconcile additional trade claims provided by KCC	2.80	650.00	1,820.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims information for which additional company input is required	0.90	795.00	715.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register file for provision to Plan Administrator	1.70	795.00	1,351.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Cash Monitoring	Review closing DIP payoff letter and correspond with legal counsel on same	0.70	795.00	556.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review filed claims estimates for the claims procedures motion	0.60	470.00	282.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review latest claims master file	1.20	795.00	954.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Wind down Activities	Review LLC's TSA invoice and supporting documentation	0.80	795.00	636.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Fee/Employment Applications	Review November fee app for compliance with local requirements and identify amendments	1.10	795.00	874.50
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of current WIP list to identify open items related to claims and cures	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of revised claims report format received from KCC and detail regarding proposed amounts	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of revised Plan Administrator outline received from Weil	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of selected claim stipulation to incorporate in Effective Date payments and update claims register	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated claims register and proposed amounts	0.40	650.00	260.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated claims register to provide to Plan Administrator for review	0.20	650.00	130.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of variances in estimates between working claims register with KCC claims report	0.70	650.00	455.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Wind down Activities	Review updated wind down forecast	0.60	795.00	477.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise master claims register to incorporate filed claims provided by KCC on 12/31	1.70	470.00	799.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update batch of trade claims and review parameters for company review	1.20	650.00	780.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update Claims registry for SERP related claims to reconcile to 10/30 Mercer reconciliation	2.60	650.00	1,690.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Cash Monitoring	Update effective date payments information and circulate to Weil, Briggs and Plan Administrator	0.30	795.00	238.50
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update presentation material related to employee claims for the Plan Administrator	1.10	650.00	715.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/5/2021	Cash Monitoring	Update professional fee schedule and review new invoices	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update schedule of payments to be made on effective date for certain vendor invoices	0.50	650.00	325.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/5/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update summary of trade claims to be sent to plan administrator	0.60	650.00	390.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/6/2021	Cash Monitoring	Analyze domestic daily cash, international cash and checks outstanding in order to update cash flow tracker	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze filed claims to identify rejection damages claims per counsel request	0.80	470.00	376.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Analyze latest tax claims file to determine updates needed for reconciliation by the Company	0.30	470.00	141.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Cash Monitoring	Call with G Gauthier (Briggs) re: effective date payments update	0.40	795.00	318.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Granell, J Silverwood, C Hannon (EY) re: specific workers compensation claim	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Granell, J Silverwood, C Hannon (EY) re: specific workers compensation claim	0.30	795.00	238.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Call with J Granell, J Silverwood, C Hannon (EY) re: specific workers compensation claim	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Analysis of leases and executory contracts	Call with M Martir, C Luster (Weil) C Hannon, J Hess, (EY) re: contract schedule and go forward requirements	0.30	795.00	238.50
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Cash Monitoring	Make updates to effective date payment list and correspond with relevant parties (Weil, Briggs, Plan Administrator) re: same	0.40	795.00	318.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Meeting with Plan Administrator team (A. Halperin, J. Goldberg, D. Cohen) to discuss status of claims process and next steps; EY Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	1.60	470.00	752.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Meeting with Plan Administrator team (A. Halperin, J. Goldberg, D. Cohen) to discuss status of claims process and next steps; EY Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Meeting with Plan Administrator team (A. Halperin, J. Goldberg, D. Cohen) to discuss status of claims process and next steps; EY Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	1.50	795.00	1,192.50
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Meeting with Plan Administrator team (A. Halperin, J. Goldberg, D. Cohen) to discuss status of claims process and next steps; EY Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Meeting with Plan Administrator team (A. Halperin, J. Goldberg, D. Cohen) to discuss status of claims process and next steps; EY Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Meeting with Plan Administrator team (A. Halperin, J. Goldberg, D. Cohen) to discuss status of claims process and next steps; EY Participants: C. Hannon (EY), J. Henrich (EY), J. Granell (EY), J. Silverwood (EY), C. Carpenter (EY), S. Hofner (EY)	1.60	650.00	1,040.00
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator team (A Halperin, J Goldberg, D Cohen), R Berkovich, D Hoehne, M Martir, A Citron, A Holt (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), and C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: Effective Date of Plan	0.80	795.00	636.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in call with Plan Administrator team (A Halperin, J Goldberg, D Cohen), R Berkovich, D Hoehne, M Martir, A Citron, A Holt (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), and C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: Effective Date of Plan	0.80	650.00	520.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Meetings with other Advisors	Participate in call with Plan Administrator team (A Halperin, J Goldberg, D Cohen), R Berkovich, D Hoehne, M Martir, A Citron, A Holt (Weil), K Buono (Briggs), and C Hannon, J Henrich, S Hofner (EY) re: Effective Date of Plan	0.80	795.00	636.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in working session to make updates to trade claims in master claim register. Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	1.90	470.00	893.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Participate in working session to make updates to trade claims in master claim register. Participants: J Silverwood (EY), T Bradley (EY)	1.90	650.00	1,235.00
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call with Plan Administrator	1.30	650.00	845.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare communications about payments necessary to be made on effective date	0.30	650.00	195.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for call with Plan Administrator	0.30	650.00	195.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare for claims call with Plan Administrator and team	0.50	650.00	325.00
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare outline of weekly claims register update process for further incorporation of new claims	0.80	470.00	376.00
Bradley,Trenton	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Prepare tax listing to show new tax claims data provided by KCC.	1.20	470.00	564.00
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Research of specified outstanding claim items	0.70	650.00	455.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Wind down Activities	Review and make edits to presentation for call with Plan Administrator	0.80	795.00	636.00
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Wind down Activities	Review claims register file to be sent to Plan Administrator	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register sent to the Plan Administrator in advance of discussion	0.40	470.00	188.00
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review claims register to claim conclusions of certain batch of cured vendors	1.20	650.00	780.00

Name	Title	Date of Service	Project Category	Description	Time	Hourly Rate	Total Individual Fees	
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review correspondence with insurance broker re: premium payments and correspond with K Buono (Briggs) and Weil regarding premium finance claim filed	0.40	795.00	318.00	
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review draft claims presentation in advance of call with the Plan Administrator	0.80	470.00	376.00	
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review KCC claim reports for further updates to the claims register	0.70	470.00	329.00	
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review litigation claims analysis provided by counsel	0.60	470.00	282.00	
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of claims register for rejection damages claims filed since order rejecting executory contracts	1.30	650.00	845.00	
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of litigation claim updates received from counsel and facilitated incorporation into claims register	0.40	650.00	260.00	
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated list of Effective Date Payments to be made	0.30	650.00	195.00	
Hofner,Shannon Nicole	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review of updated Plan Administrator outline	0.40	650.00	260.00	
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Wind down Activities	Review outline for Plan Administrator from Weil	0.70	795.00	556.50	
Henrich,Jonathan Robert	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Wind down Activities	Review payments to be made upon order of effective date	0.30	795.00	238.50	
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review schedule of vendor cures to confirm certain vendor was cured	0.30	650.00	195.00	
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Review updated claims summary slides and claims register in preparation for overview call with Plan Administrator	1.10	795.00	874.50	
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise draft claims presentation in advance of call with the Plan Administrator	0.70	470.00	329.00	
Carpenter,Christina Maria	Senior	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Revise final draft claims presentation for discussion with the Plan Administrator	0.80	470.00	376.00	
Hannon,Colm	Senior Manager	1/6/2021	Cash Monitoring	Update info files for Plan Administrator re: pro fee escrow, wind down budget and professional fee calendar and correspond regarding same	0.40	795.00	318.00	
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/6/2021	Cash Monitoring	Update post sale unwind receipts and disbursements for week ending 01.01.2021	0.90	650.00	585.00	
Granell,Jeffrey Thomas	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update presentation material related to employee claims for the Plan Admin	0.60	650.00	390.00	
Silverwood,James	Manager	1/6/2021	Claims Analysis and Administration	Update schedule of trade claims to be sent to plan administrator for specific vendor insurance claim	0.20	650.00	130.00	
<b>Progress billing on Missouri sales and use tax refund claim for the period covering August 2010 through May 2018. Progress billing is based on a 35% finding based fee related to gross refunds filed with Missouri Department of Revenue.</b>								44,107.89
<b>Total Due</b>					<b>1,917.80</b>		<b>1,206,927.89</b>	

**Exhibit B – Expense Detail**

**(None)**